



---

## THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS

*Chair*, GAIL REGAN  
President, Cara Holdings Ltd.

*President*, PATRICIA ADAMS  
MAX ALLEN  
Producer, IDEAS, CBC Radio  
ANDREW COYNE  
Columnist, National Post

GLENN FOX  
Professor of Economics, University of Guelph  
IAN GRAY  
President, St. Lawrence Starch Co.  
CLIFFORD ORWIN  
Professor of Political Science, University of Toronto

*Secretary/Treasurer*, ANNETTA TURNER  
ANDREW ROMAN  
Barrister & Solicitor, Miller Thomson  
ANDREW STARK  
Rotman School of Management, University of Toronto  
GEORGE TOMKO  
Resident Expert, PSI Initiative, University of Toronto  
MICHAEL TREBILCOCK  
Chair, Law & Economics, University of Toronto  
MARGARET WENTE  
Columnist, The Globe and Mail

March 8, 2016

BY EMAIL & BY COURIER

Ms. Kirsten Walli  
Board Secretary  
Ontario Energy Board  
2300 Yonge St, Suite 2701  
Toronto ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli:

**Board File No. EB-2014-0116**  
**Toronto Hydro-Electric System Limited 2015 Rates**  
**Energy Probe – Costs Submission**

Pursuant to the Decision and Rate Order, issued March 1, 2016, please find attached the Costs Submission of Energy Probe Research Foundation (Energy Probe) in respect of the Toronto Hydro-Electric System Limited 2015 CIR proceeding, for consideration of the Board.

Energy Probe found the proceeding to be most complicated. We were fortunate to have both Dr. Higgin and Mr. Faye to divide the review of the application to avoid duplication. Also, Energy Probe wishes to commend Mr. Shepherd, counsel for the School Energy Coalition, for assisting intervening parties to minimize duplication of effort throughout the proceeding.

Should you require additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours truly,

David S. MacIntosh  
Case Manager

cc: Amanda Klein, Toronto Hydro (By email)  
Daliana Coban, Toronto Hydro (By email)  
Crawford Smith, Torys LLP (By email)  
Roger Higgin, Consultant to Energy Probe (By email)  
Peter Faye, Consultant to Energy Probe (By email)  
Interested Parties (By email)

---

**Energy Probe Research Foundation** 225 BRUNSWICK AVE., TORONTO, ONTARIO M5S 2M6

Phone: (416) 964-9223 Fax: (416) 964-8239 E-mail: [EnergyProbe@nextcity.com](mailto:EnergyProbe@nextcity.com) Internet: [www.EnergyProbe.org](http://www.EnergyProbe.org)



**Ontario Energy Board**  
**COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS**



**Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

File # EB- 2014-0116 Process: Toronto Hydro 2015 CIR Proceeding

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundation

**Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

|                             |           |                  |
|-----------------------------|-----------|------------------|
| Legal/consultant/other fees | \$        | 74,120.00        |
| Disbursements               | \$        | -                |
| HST                         | \$        | 4,817.80         |
| <b>Total Cost Claim</b>     | <b>\$</b> | <b>78,937.80</b> |

**Payment Information**

Make cheque payable to: Energy Probe Research Foundation

Send payment to this address: 225 Brunswick Avenue  
Toronto, Canada M5S 2M6  
Attention: David MacIntosh  
\_\_\_\_\_

# Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



## Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

|                                                                           |                                                                                                  |
|---------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| File # EB- <u>2014-0116</u>                                               | Process: <u>Toronto Hydro 2015 CIR Proceeding</u>                                                |
| Party: <u>Energy Probe Research Foundation</u>                            | Service Provider Name: <u>Roger Higgin</u>                                                       |
| <b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE</b> (check one)                                  | Year Called to<br>Bar                                                                            |
| Legal Counsel <input type="checkbox"/>                                    | <input type="text"/>                                                                             |
| Articling Student/Paralegal <input type="checkbox"/>                      | <input type="text"/>                                                                             |
| Consultant <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>                            | Completed Years<br>Practising/Years of Relevant<br>Experience<br><input type="text" value="30"/> |
| Analyst <input type="checkbox"/>                                          | Hourly Rate: <input type="text" value="\$330"/>                                                  |
| For Consultant/Analyst: <input type="checkbox"/> CV attached              | HST Rate Charged (enter %): <input type="text" value="6.5%"/>                                    |
| <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> CV provided within previous 24 months |                                                                                                  |

### Statement of Fees Being Claimed

|                                    | Hours | Hourly Rate | Subtotal            | HST                | Total               |
|------------------------------------|-------|-------------|---------------------|--------------------|---------------------|
| <b>Pre-hearing Conference</b>      |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
| Preparation                        |       | \$ 330.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| Attendance                         |       | \$ 330.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| <b>Technical Conference</b>        |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
| Preparation                        | 4.00  | \$ 330.00   | \$ 1,320.00         | \$ 85.80           | \$ 1,405.80         |
| Attendance                         |       | \$ 330.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| <b>Interrogatories</b>             |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
| Preparation                        | 8.00  | \$ 330.00   | \$ 2,640.00         | \$ 171.60          | \$ 2,811.60         |
| Responses                          |       | \$ 330.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| <b>Issues Conference</b>           |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
| Preparation                        | 4.00  | \$ 330.00   | \$ 1,320.00         | \$ 85.80           | \$ 1,405.80         |
| Attendance                         | 4.00  | \$ 330.00   | \$ 1,320.00         | \$ 85.80           | \$ 1,405.80         |
| <b>ADR - Settlement Conference</b> |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
| Preparation                        | 7.00  | \$ 330.00   | \$ 2,310.00         | \$ 150.15          | \$ 2,460.15         |
| Attendance                         | 17.50 | \$ 330.00   | \$ 5,775.00         | \$ 375.38          | \$ 6,150.38         |
| Proposal Preparation               |       | \$ 330.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| <b>Argument</b>                    |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
| Preparation                        | 39.00 | \$ 330.00   | \$ 12,870.00        | \$ 836.55          | \$ 13,706.55        |
| <b>Oral Hearing</b>                |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
| Preparation                        | 12.00 | \$ 330.00   | \$ 3,960.00         | \$ 257.40          | \$ 4,217.40         |
| Attendance                         | 18.00 | \$ 330.00   | \$ 5,940.00         | \$ 386.10          | \$ 6,326.10         |
| <b>Other Conferences</b>           |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
| Preparation                        |       | \$ 330.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| Attendance                         |       | \$ 330.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| <b>Case Management</b>             |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
|                                    |       | \$ 170.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| <b>TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES</b> |       |             | <b>\$ 37,455.00</b> | <b>\$ 2,434.58</b> | <b>\$ 39,889.58</b> |

**Ontario Energy Board**  
**COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS**



**Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB- 2014-0116

Process: Toronto Hydro 2015 CIR Proceeding

Party: Energy Probe Research Found

Service Provider Name: Roger Higgin

**Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed**

|                             |  | Net Cost | HST  | Total |
|-----------------------------|--|----------|------|-------|
| Scanning/Photocopy          |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Printing                    |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Courier                     |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Telephone/Fax               |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Transcripts                 |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Travel: Air                 |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Travel: Car                 |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Travel: Rail                |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Travel (Other):             |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Parking                     |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Taxi                        |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Accommodation               |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Meals                       |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Other:                      |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Other:                      |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Other:                      |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| <b>TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:</b> |  | \$ -     | \$ - | \$ -  |



# SPA Inc

15 Malabar Place  
Don Mills, Toronto, Ontario M3B 1A4  
(416) 391-0738 fax (416) 391-0738

Invoice No. 2016-EP-07

## INVOICE

### Customer

Name Energy Probe Research Foundation  
Address 225 Brunswick Avenue  
City Toronto Province Ont P.C. M5S 2M6  
Attn Mr. David MacIntosh

Date 05/03/2016  
Project No EB-2014-0116  
Title Toronto Hydro Rates 2015-2019

| Hours        | Description Of Services | Unit Price                                           | TOTAL               |
|--------------|-------------------------|------------------------------------------------------|---------------------|
| 4.00         | Oct 2 2014              | Prepn Review Application and prepare Case Notes      | \$330.00 \$1,320.00 |
| 4.00         | Oct 12 2014             | Prepn Prepare IRS and Integrate with PF lrs          | \$330.00 \$1,320.00 |
| 4.00         | Nov 20 2014             | Prepn Prepare Technical Conference Questions         | \$330.00 \$1,320.00 |
| 4.00         | Nov 24 2014             | Preparation Review TCQ Responses                     | \$330.00 \$1,320.00 |
| 4.00         | Nov 27 2014             | Attendance Issues Conference and Day                 | \$330.00 \$1,320.00 |
| 2.00         | Dec 20 2014             | Prepn Draft Motion for TC Response J1.2-EP-49        | \$330.00 \$660.00   |
| 1.00         | Jan14 2015              | Prepn, THESL Resp to Motion Draft letter re withdraw | \$330.00 \$330.00   |
| 4.00         | Jan 20 2014             | Prepn Review Evidence IRRS and notes for ADR         | \$330.00 \$1,320.00 |
| 6.00         | Jan 22 2015             | Attendance Settlement Conference                     | \$330.00 \$1,980.00 |
| 7.50         | Jan 23 2015             | Attendance Settlement Conference                     | \$330.00 \$2,475.00 |
| 4.00         | Jan 27 2015             | Attendance Settlement Conference                     | \$330.00 \$1,320.00 |
| 6.00         | Feb 15 2015             | Prepn X exam & Exhibits Panel 2 and PEG              | \$330.00 \$1,980.00 |
| 6.00         | Feb 19 2015             | Attend Oral Hearing Panel 2                          | \$330.00 \$1,980.00 |
| 6.00         | Feb 20 2015             | Attend Oral Hearing PEG                              | \$330.00 \$1,980.00 |
| 6.00         | Mar 1 2015              | Prepn X exam Panel 5                                 | \$330.00 \$1,980.00 |
| 6.00         | Mar 3 2015              | Attend Oral Hearing Panel 5                          | \$330.00 \$1,980.00 |
| 4.00         | Mar 6 2014              | Prepn Outline for Argument                           | \$330.00 \$1,320.00 |
| 3.00         | Mar 20 2015             | Prepn Review THESL AIC                               | \$330.00 \$990.00   |
| 6.00         | Mar 21 2015             | Prepn Draft Sections of EP Argument                  | \$330.00 \$1,980.00 |
| 4.00         | Mar 24 2015             | Prepn Draft First Draft of EP Argument               | \$330.00 \$1,320.00 |
| 6.00         | Mar 27 2015             | Prepn Drafts Argument #3-5                           | \$330.00 \$1,980.00 |
| 6.00         | Apr 2 2015              | Prepn Final Draft Argument to Client                 | \$330.00 \$1,980.00 |
|              |                         | <b>Subtotal Hearing 103.5 hours</b>                  | <b>\$34,155</b>     |
| 4.00         | Jan 25 2016             | Review Decision and Draft Rate Order                 | \$330.00 \$1,320.00 |
| 6.00         | Feb 4 2016              | Prepn Submissions on Draft Rate Order                | \$330.00 \$1,980.00 |
| <b>113.5</b> | <b>Total</b>            |                                                      | <b>\$37,455.00</b>  |

SubTotal \$37,455.00

\$0.00

Taxes HST \$4,869.15

PST

**TOTAL \$42,324.15**

### Payment Details

- Cash
- Cheque
- Other

Name SPA INC

Date

HST NUMBER 88413 6714 RT0001

Thank you for your Business

# Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



## Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

|                                                                           |                                                                                          |
|---------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| File # EB- <u>2014-0116</u>                                               | Process: <u>Toronto Hydro 2015 CIR Proceeding</u>                                        |
| Party: <u>Energy Probe Research Foundation</u>                            | Service Provider Name: <u>David MacIntosh</u>                                            |
| <b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE</b> (check one)                                  | Year Called to Bar                                                                       |
| Legal Counsel <input type="checkbox"/>                                    | <input type="text"/>                                                                     |
| Articling Student/Paralegal <input type="checkbox"/>                      | <input type="text"/>                                                                     |
| Consultant <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>                            | Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience: <input type="text" value="16"/> |
| Analyst <input type="checkbox"/>                                          | Hourly Rate: <input type="text" value="\$290"/>                                          |
| For Consultant/Analyst: <input type="checkbox"/> CV attached              | HST Rate Charged (enter %): <input type="text" value="6.5%"/>                            |
| <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> CV provided within previous 24 months |                                                                                          |

### Statement of Fees Being Claimed

|                                    | Hours | Hourly Rate | Subtotal            | HST              | Total               |
|------------------------------------|-------|-------------|---------------------|------------------|---------------------|
| <b>Pre-hearing Conference</b>      |       |             |                     |                  |                     |
| Preparation                        |       | \$ 290.00   | \$ -                | \$ -             | \$ -                |
| Attendance                         | 6.50  | \$ 290.00   | \$ 1,885.00         | \$ 122.53        | \$ 2,007.53         |
| <b>Technical Conference</b>        |       |             |                     |                  |                     |
| Preparation                        | 2.00  | \$ 290.00   | \$ 580.00           | \$ 37.70         | \$ 617.70           |
| Attendance                         | 11.00 | \$ 290.00   | \$ 3,190.00         | \$ 207.35        | \$ 3,397.35         |
| <b>Interrogatories</b>             |       |             |                     |                  |                     |
| Preparation                        | 4.75  | \$ 290.00   | \$ 1,377.50         | \$ 89.54         | \$ 1,467.04         |
| Responses                          | 1.75  | \$ 290.00   | \$ 507.50           | \$ 32.99         | \$ 540.49           |
| <b>Issues Conference</b>           |       |             |                     |                  |                     |
| Preparation                        |       | \$ 290.00   | \$ -                | \$ -             | \$ -                |
| Attendance                         |       | \$ 290.00   | \$ -                | \$ -             | \$ -                |
| <b>ADR - Settlement Conference</b> |       |             |                     |                  |                     |
| Preparation                        | 2.50  | \$ 290.00   | \$ 725.00           | \$ 47.13         | \$ 772.13           |
| Attendance                         |       | \$ 290.00   | \$ -                | \$ -             | \$ -                |
| Proposal Preparation               |       | \$ 290.00   | \$ -                | \$ -             | \$ -                |
| <b>Argument</b>                    |       |             |                     |                  |                     |
| Preparation                        | 7.50  | \$ 290.00   | \$ 2,175.00         | \$ 141.38        | \$ 2,316.38         |
| <b>Oral Hearing</b>                |       |             |                     |                  |                     |
| Preparation                        | 1.00  | \$ 290.00   | \$ 290.00           | \$ 18.85         | \$ 308.85           |
| Attendance                         |       | \$ 290.00   | \$ -                | \$ -             | \$ -                |
| <b>Other Conferences</b>           |       |             |                     |                  |                     |
| Preparation                        | 2.00  | \$ 290.00   | \$ 580.00           | \$ 37.70         | \$ 617.70           |
| Attendance                         | 4.75  | \$ 290.00   | \$ 1,377.50         | \$ 89.54         | \$ 1,467.04         |
| <b>Case Management</b>             |       |             |                     |                  |                     |
|                                    | 2.25  | \$ 170.00   | \$ 382.50           | \$ 24.86         | \$ 407.36           |
| <b>TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES</b> |       |             | <b>\$ 13,070.00</b> | <b>\$ 849.55</b> | <b>\$ 13,919.55</b> |

**Ontario Energy Board**  
**COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS**  
**Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**



File # EB- 2014-0116

Process: Toronto Hydro 2015 CIR Proceeding

Party: Energy Probe Research Found

Service Provider Name: David MacIntosh

**Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed**

|                             |  | Net Cost | HST  | Total |
|-----------------------------|--|----------|------|-------|
| Scanning/Photocopy          |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Printing                    |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Courier                     |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Telephone/Fax               |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Transcripts                 |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Travel: Air                 |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Travel: Car                 |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Travel: Rail                |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Travel (Other):             |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Parking                     |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Taxi                        |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Accommodation               |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Meals                       |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Other:                      |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Other:                      |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Other:                      |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| <b>TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:</b> |  | \$ -     | \$ - | \$ -  |



**Time Sheet for D. MacIntosh**  
**Board File: EB-2014-0116 Toronto Hydro 2015 CIR Rates Application**

**Summary: Hours**

|                 |              |
|-----------------|--------------|
| Preparation     | <b>33.25</b> |
| Attend. Tech.   | <b>11.00</b> |
| Attend. ADR     | <b>0.00</b>  |
| Attend. Hearing | <b>0.00</b>  |
| Argument Prep.  | <b>0.00</b>  |
| Case Mngt. (CM) | <b>2.25</b>  |
| <b>Total</b>    | <b>46.50</b> |

**Date Hours Note**

|              |              |                                                                        |
|--------------|--------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| 11-Feb-14    | 6.50         | prep - Attend THESL Stakeholder Consultation, Bob Betts facilitator    |
| 08-Sep-14    | 1.75         | prep - Prefiled Evidence of Toronto Hydro, Initial Review              |
| 09-Sep-14    | 0.50         | prep - Draft Notice of Intervention                                    |
| 21-Sep-14    | 1.50         | prep - Prepare for Intervenor Meeting, Review Emails                   |
| 22-Sep-14    | 2.25         | prep - Attend Intervenor Coordination Meeting, Review Emails           |
| 29-Sep-14    | 0.75         | prep - Review Toronto Hydro Evidence, 23 September 2014 Update         |
| 13-Oct-14    | 1.00         | prep - Draft Interrogatories                                           |
| 14-Oct-14    | 0.75         | prep - Draft Interrogatories                                           |
| 11-Nov-14    | 1.75         | prep - Review IR Responses of Applicant Prior to Technical Conference  |
| 12-Nov-14    | 1.00         | prep - Draft Letter re Areas of Clarification for Technical Conference |
| 15-Nov-14    | 0.50         | prep - Prepare for Technical Conference                                |
| 16-Nov-14    | 0.50         | prep - Prepare for Technical Conference                                |
| 22-Dec-14    | 0.75         | prep - Draft Energy Probe Notice of Motion                             |
| 13-Jan-15    | 0.50         | prep - Discussions With Dr. Higgin re Energy Probe Motion              |
| 15-Jan-15    | 0.50         | prep - Draft Ltr OEB re Energy Probe Notice of Motion                  |
| 21-Jan-15    | 0.75         | prep - Preparation for ADR, Emails With Dr. Higgin                     |
| 27-Jan-15    | 0.50         | prep - ADR, Many Emails re Outcome With Dr. Higgin and Others          |
| 10-Feb-15    | 0.50         | prep - Prepare For Intervenor Coordination Meeting                     |
| 10-Feb-15    | 2.50         | prep - Attend Intervenor Coordination Meeting                          |
| 14-Feb-15    | 0.50         | prep - Outlining Energy Probe Estimated Hearing Plan for Ms. Helt      |
| 22-Feb-15    | 0.50         | prep - Revising Energy Probe Estimated Hearing Plan for Ms. Helt       |
| 07-Mar-15    | 1.25         | prep - Draft Energy Probe Argument                                     |
| 14-Mar-15    | 1.00         | prep - Draft Energy Probe Argument                                     |
| 27-Mar-15    | 0.75         | prep - Draft Energy Probe Argument                                     |
| 02-Apr-15    | 1.25         | prep - Finalize Energy Probe Argument                                  |
| 29-Dec-15    | 1.00         | prep - Review the Decision and Order                                   |
| 06-Feb-16    | 1.25         | prep - Review the Decision on Draft Rate Order                         |
| 04-Mar-16    | 1.00         | prep - Review the Decision and Rate Order                              |
| <b>Total</b> | <b>33.25</b> | <b>Preparation</b>                                                     |

| <b>Date</b>  | <b>Hours</b> | <b>Note</b>                               |
|--------------|--------------|-------------------------------------------|
| 17-Nov-14    | 4.00         | Attend Technical Conference, Day 1        |
| 18-Nov-14    | 7.00         | Attend Technical Conference, Day 2        |
| <b>Total</b> | <b>11.00</b> | <b>Attendance - Technical Conferences</b> |

| <b>Date</b>  | <b>Hours</b> | <b>Note</b>                                                         |
|--------------|--------------|---------------------------------------------------------------------|
| 09-Sep-14    | 0.50         | CM - File Intervention ltr & Notice                                 |
| 15-Oct-14    | 0.25         | CM - Check and File Interrogatories to Applicant                    |
| 12-Nov-14    | 0.25         | CM - File Letter re Areas of Clarification for Technical Conference |
| 22-Dec-14    | 0.25         | CM - File Energy Probe Notice of Motion                             |
| 23-Dec-14    | 0.25         | CM - Check and File Interrogatories in respect of PEG               |
| 15-Jan-15    | 0.25         | CM - File Ltr to OEB re Energy Probe Notice of Motion               |
| 03-Apr-15    | 0.25         | CM - File Energy Probe Final Argument                               |
| 05-Feb-16    | 0.25         | CM - File Energy Probe Comments Draft Rate Order                    |
| <b>Total</b> | <b>2.25</b>  | <b>Case Management</b>                                              |

# Ontario Energy Board

## COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



### Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

|                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  |                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                    |
|----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| File # EB- <u>2014-0116</u>                                                                                                                                                                                                      | Process: <u>Toronto Hydro 2015 CIR Proceeding</u>                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  |
| Party: <u>Energy Probe Research Foundation</u>                                                                                                                                                                                   | Service Provider Name: <u>Peter Faye</u>                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                           |
| <b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE</b> (check one)<br><input type="checkbox"/> Legal Counsel<br><input type="checkbox"/> Articling Student/Paralegal<br><input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Consultant<br><input type="checkbox"/> Analyst | Year Called to Bar: <input style="width: 50px;" type="text"/><br>Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience: <input style="width: 100px; text-align: center; value: 30;" type="text"/><br>Hourly Rate: <input style="width: 80px; text-align: center; value: \$330;" type="text"/><br>For Consultant/Analyst: <input type="checkbox"/> CV attached <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> CV provided within previous 24 months<br>HST Rate Charged (enter %): <input style="width: 80px; text-align: center; value: 6.5%" type="text"/> |

#### Statement of Fees Being Claimed

|                                    | Hours | Hourly Rate | Subtotal            | HST                | Total               |
|------------------------------------|-------|-------------|---------------------|--------------------|---------------------|
| <b>Pre-hearing Conference</b>      |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
| Preparation                        | 0.50  | \$ 330.00   | \$ 165.00           | \$ 10.73           | \$ 175.73           |
| Attendance                         | 4.75  | \$ 330.00   | \$ 1,567.50         | \$ 101.89          | \$ 1,669.39         |
| <b>Technical Conference</b>        |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
| Preparation                        | 1.50  | \$ 330.00   | \$ 495.00           | \$ 32.18           | \$ 527.18           |
| Attendance                         |       | \$ 330.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| <b>Interrogatories</b>             |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
| Preparation                        | 20.25 | \$ 330.00   | \$ 6,682.50         | \$ 434.36          | \$ 7,116.86         |
| Responses                          |       | \$ 330.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| <b>Issues Conference</b>           |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
| Preparation                        |       | \$ 330.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| Attendance                         |       | \$ 330.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| <b>ADR - Settlement Conference</b> |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
| Preparation                        |       | \$ 330.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| Attendance                         |       | \$ 330.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| Proposal Preparation               |       | \$ 330.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| <b>Argument</b>                    |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
| Preparation                        |       | \$ 330.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| <b>Oral Hearing</b>                |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
| Preparation                        | 12.00 | \$ 330.00   | \$ 3,960.00         | \$ 257.40          | \$ 4,217.40         |
| Attendance                         | 29.50 | \$ 330.00   | \$ 9,735.00         | \$ 632.78          | \$ 10,367.78        |
| <b>Other Conferences</b>           |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
| Preparation                        | 0.50  | \$ 330.00   | \$ 165.00           | \$ 10.73           | \$ 175.73           |
| Attendance                         | 2.50  | \$ 330.00   | \$ 825.00           | \$ 53.63           | \$ 878.63           |
| <b>Case Management</b>             |       |             |                     |                    |                     |
|                                    |       | \$ 170.00   | \$ -                | \$ -               | \$ -                |
| <b>TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES</b> |       |             | <b>\$ 23,595.00</b> | <b>\$ 1,533.68</b> | <b>\$ 25,128.68</b> |

**Ontario Energy Board**  
**COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS**  
**Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**



File # EB- 2014-0116

Process: Toronto Hydro 2015 CIR Proceeding

Party: Energy Probe Research Found

Service Provider Name: Peter Faye

**Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed**

|                             |  | Net Cost | HST  | Total |
|-----------------------------|--|----------|------|-------|
| Scanning/Photocopy          |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Printing                    |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Courier                     |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Telephone/Fax               |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Transcripts                 |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Travel: Air                 |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Travel: Car                 |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Travel: Rail                |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Travel (Other):             |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Parking                     |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Taxi                        |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Accommodation               |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Meals                       |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Other:                      |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Other:                      |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| Other:                      |  |          |      | \$ -  |
| <b>TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:</b> |  | \$ -     | \$ - | \$ -  |

**Peter T. Faye, P.Eng, MBA**

**INVOICE**

42 Eastwood Cres  
Markham, Ontario, L3P 5Z7  
Phone 905-294-2013

**DATE: March 2, 2016**

**Bill To:**  
Energy Probe Research Foundation  
225 Brunswick Ave.  
Toronto ON M5S 2M6  
Attn: David MacIntosh - Case Manager

**For:**  
Consultant to Energy Probe Research Foundation  
EB-2014-0116  
Toronto Hydro Electric System Ltd.  
2015 CIR Application

| DESCRIPTION                                           | HOURS | RATE     | AMOUNT            |
|-------------------------------------------------------|-------|----------|-------------------|
| Jul 2-14 Preparation for Stakeholder session          | 0.5   |          |                   |
| Jul 3-14 Attend Stakeholder session                   | 4.75  |          |                   |
| Sep 30-14 Review Evidence, Prep IRs                   | 2.0   |          |                   |
| Oct 2-14 Review Evidence, Prep IRs                    | 2.5   |          |                   |
| Oct 3-14 Review Evidence, Prep IRs                    | 3.5   |          |                   |
| Oct 6-14 Review Evidence, Prep IRs                    | 2.0   |          |                   |
| Oct 9-14 Review Evidence, Prep IRs                    | 3.5   |          |                   |
| Oct 10-14 Review Evidence, Prep IRs                   | 2.75  |          |                   |
| Oct 12-14 Review Evidence, Prep IRs                   | 2.0   |          |                   |
| Oct 13-14 Review Evidence, Prep IRs                   | 2.0   |          |                   |
| Nov 11-14 Review IRRs for Technical Conference        | 1.5   |          |                   |
| Feb 10-15 Preparation for Intervenor Coordination Mtg | 0.5   |          |                   |
| Feb 10-15 Attend Intervenor Coordination Mtg          | 2.5   |          |                   |
| Feb 16-15 Preparation for Hearing Day 1               | 1.5   |          |                   |
| Feb 17-15 Attend Hearing Day 1                        | 6.0   |          |                   |
| Feb 22-15 Prepare Cross Panel 1                       | 4.0   |          |                   |
| Feb 23-15 Attend Hearing Day 4                        | 6.0   |          |                   |
| Feb 23-15 Prep for Hearing Day 5                      | 1.5   |          |                   |
| Feb 24-15 Attend Hearing Day 5                        | 6.0   |          |                   |
| Feb 24-15 Prep for Hearing Day 6                      | 1.5   |          |                   |
| Feb 25-15 Attend Hearing Day 6                        | 6.0   |          |                   |
| Feb 26-15 Prep for Hearing Day 8                      | 2.5   |          |                   |
| Feb 27-14 Prep for Hearing Day 8                      | 1.0   |          |                   |
| Feb 27-14 Attend Hearing Day 8                        | 5.5   |          |                   |
| Total hours billed                                    | 71.5  | \$330.00 | \$23595.00        |
| HST (registration # 826908766RT0001)                  |       | 13%      | 3067.35           |
| <b>TOTAL</b>                                          |       |          | <b>\$26662.35</b> |

Please make cheque to **Peter T. Faye**