

**PROJECT TIME SHEET #1**

Project Title	OPG Inc. 2017-2021 Payment Amounts Application
Project File	EB-2016-0152
Authority	Ontario Energy Board
For/Behalf of	Quinte Manufacturers Association Belleville, Ontario

DATE	WORK DESCRIPTION	ACTIVITY	HOURS
16-08-2016	Review OPG Application/Evidence + PO#1 & Draft Issues	Preparation	4.5
25-08-2016	QMA Steering Team Mtg. - Review case & coordination	Preparation	1.0
26-08-2016	Review OPG Application/Evidence + determination of relevant issues	Preparation	3.25
30-08-2015	Review OPG Application/Evidence	Preparation	2.50
31-08-2016	Review OPG Application/Evidence	Preparation	5.0
			<b>16.25</b>
01-09-2016	Attend OPG Application video presentation - on line	Attendance	2.0
07-09-2016	Review OPG Application/Evidence + background decisions	Preparation	2.75
09-09-2016	Review OPG Application/Evidence + background decisions	Preparation	3.5
20-09-2016	Review OPG Application/Evidence	Preparation	1.0
21-09-2016	Review background decisions & Tech Conf Prep + Questions	Preparation	3.25
23-09-2016	Attend un-transcribed Technical Conference - DRP/RSDA	Attendance	5.0
26-09-2016	Review OPG Evidence and TC notes	Preparation	1.0
			<b>18.5</b>
02-11-2016	Review IR Responses	Preparation	5.5
03-11-2016	Review IR Responses	Preparation	4.0
10-11-2016	Case Presentation to QMA Reps. + Q&A	Preparation	.75
14-11-2016	Attend Technical Conference (Day 1- in person)	Attendance	5.75
15-11-2016	Attend Technical Conference (Day 2 - in person)	Attendance	5.0
16-11-2016	Attend Technical Conference (Day 3 - teleconference)	Attendance	3.75
22-11-2016	Review transcripts	Preparation	2.0
24-11-2016	Review & Consider OEB Staff/Intervenor Evidence	Preparation	3.5
25-11-2016	Review & Consider OEB Staff/Intervenor Evidence	Preparation	2.5
			<b>32.75</b>
Every Friday AM	Con-call with QMA Steering Team - Case Update/Discussion	Preparation	N/C
<b>Total Hours</b>			<b>67.5</b>

0200-EB

# Michael D. McLeod

Energy Consulting and Advisory Service

1838 County Road 3

Carrying Place, ONTARIO K0K 1L0

## PROJECT TIME SHEET #2

Project Title	OPG Inc. 2017-2021 Payment Amounts Application
Project File	EB-2016-0152
Authority	Ontario Energy Board
For/Behalf of	Quinte Manufacturers Association Belleville, Ontario

DATE	WORK DESCRIPTION	ACTIVITY	HOURS	Rate*
02-12-2016	Review & Consider OEB Staff/Intervenor Evidence	Preparation	2.5	
06-12-2016	Review & Consider OEB Staff/Intervenor Evidence	Preparation	3.25	
15-12-2016	Review IR Responses	Preparation	1.25	
19-12-2016	Review Motions Day Transcript	Preparation	0.75	
22-12-2016	Review N1 Impact Statement + related evidence	Preparation	4.5	
			<b>12.25</b>	
04-01-2017	Review materials for Settlement Conference	Preparation	2.5	
09-01-2017	Attend Settlement Conference (in person)	Attendance	6.0	
10-01-2017	Attend Settlement Conference (via teleconference on-line)	Attendance	4.5*	4.5
18-01-2017	Review draft Settlement Proposal	Preparation	1.0	
27-01-2017	Review final Settlement Proposal, comments + sign-off	Preparation	0.5	
			<b>14.5</b>	
07-02-2017	Determine cross-examination areas and time estimates	Preparation	1.25	
14-02-2017	Review and consider new and refiled evidence	Preparation	2.5	
16-02-2017	Review and consider new and refiled evidence + TC trans	Preparation	1.5	
24-02-2017	Review new and refiled evidence, IR responses + Cross X	Preparation	5.5	
27-02-2017	Attend hearing day 1 at OEB in Toronto (in person)	Attendance	6.0	
28-02-2017	Attend hearing day 2 at OEB in Toronto (in person)	Attendance	6.5	
			<b>23.25</b>	
02-03-2017	Attend hearing day 3 at OEB in Toronto (in person)	Attendance	6.0	
03-03-2017	Attend hearing day 4 (via teleconference on-line)	Attendance	5.5*	5.5
06-03-2017	Attend hearing day 5 (via teleconference on-line)	Attendance	5.25*	5.25
07-03-2017	Attend hearing day 6 (via teleconference on-line)	Attendance	6.0*	6.0
09-03-2017	Attend hearing day 7 (via teleconference on-line)	Attendance	5.25*	5.25
10-03-2017	Attend hearing day 8 (via teleconference on-line)	Attendance	4.5*	4.5
20-03-2017	Attend hearing day 9 at OEB in Toronto (in person)	Attendance	4.0	
23-03-2017	Attend hearing day 11 (via teleconference on-line)	Attendance	5.0*	5.0
24-03-2017	Attend hearing day 12 (via teleconference on-line)	Attendance	3.0*	3.0
27-03-2017	Attend hearing day 13 (via teleconference on-line)	Attendance	5.0*	5.0
28-03-2017	Attend hearing day 14 (via teleconference on-line)	Attendance	3.0*	3.0
30-03-2017	Attend hearing day 15 at OEB in Toronto (in person)	Attendance	6.0	
			<b>58.5</b>	
<b>Total Hours</b>			<b>108.75</b>	<b>47.0</b>
0201-EB				

\* = Discounted rate/hour @65.00 for hearing hours participation via on-line teleconference from office.

# INVOICE

Date: September 1, 2017  
Invoice # 0200-EB

*Michael D. McLeod*

Michael D. McLeod  
1838 County Road 3  
Carrying Place, Ontario  
K0K 1L0

TO GH Gunther Huetlin Manufacturing Inc.  
Attn: Ms. K. Egan, EVP & CFO  
101 Petrie Place  
Belleville, Ontario  
K8N 4Z6

e-mail: [mdmcl@kos.net](mailto:mdmcl@kos.net)  
(c) 613-847-5563

*Via e-mail only*

SALESPERSON	JOB	PAYMENT TERMS	DUE DATE
M. McLeod	Energy Consulting Services EB-2016-0152	Due on receipt	

HOURS	DESCRIPTION	RATE PER HOUR	AMOUNT
67.5	Consulting services for the period of August 30, 2016 to November 30, 2016 on matters concerning an Application by Ontario Power Generation Inc. to the Ontario Energy Board for Payment Amounts for the Period from January 1, 2017 to December 31, 2021  Time Sheet Attached	\$130.00	\$8,775.00
		<b>SUBTOTAL</b>	\$8,775.00
		<b>(HST) SALES TAX</b>	\$1,140.75
		<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>\$9,915.75</b>

Please make all checks payable to Michael McLeod

**Thank you for your business!**

# INVOICE

*Michael D. McLeod*

Date: September 1, 2017  
Invoice # 0201-EB

Michael D. McLeod  
1838 County Road 3  
Carrying Place, Ontario  
K0K 1L0

TO GH Gunther Huettlin Manufacturing Inc.  
Attn: Ms. K. Egan, EVP & CFO  
101 Petrie Place  
Belleville, Ontario  
K8N 4Z6

e-mail: [mdmcl@kos.net](mailto:mdmcl@kos.net)  
(c) 613-847-5563

*Via e-mail only*

SALESPERSON	JOB	PAYMENT TERMS	DUE DATE
M. McLeod	Energy Consulting Services for Ontario Energy Board proceeding EB-2016-0152 on behalf of the Quinte Manufacturers Association	Due on receipt	

HOURS	DESCRIPTION	RATE PER HOUR	AMOUNT
61.75	Consulting services for the period of December 12, 2016 to March 30, 2017 on matters concerning an Application by Ontario Power Generation Inc. to the Ontario Energy Board for Payment Amounts for the Period from January 1, 2017 to December 31, 2021	\$130.00	\$8,027.50
47.0	Consulting services - discounted rate for hearing attendance and related hearing work via teleconference	\$65.00	\$3,055.00
	Time Sheet Attached - Total hours = 108.75		

<b>SUBTOTAL</b>	\$11,082.50
<b>(HST) SALES TAX</b>	\$1,440.73
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>\$12,523.23</b>

Please make all checks payable to **Michael McLeod**

**Thank you for your business!**

# INVOICE

*Michael D. McLeod*

Date: July 27, 2017  
 Invoice # 0202-EB

Michael D. McLeod  
 1838 County Road 3  
 Carrying Place, Ontario  
 K0K 1L0

TO GH Gunther Huettlin Manufacturing Inc.  
 Attn: Ms. K. Egan, EVP & CFO  
 101 Petrie Place  
 Belleville, Ontario  
 K8N 4Z6

e-mail: [mdmcl@kos.net](mailto:mdmcl@kos.net)  
 (c) 613-847-5563

*Via e-mail only*

SALESPERSON	JOB	PAYMENT TERMS	DUE DATE
M. McLeod	Disbursements for Energy Consulting Services for Ontario Energy Board proceeding EB-2016-0152 on behalf of the Quinte Manufacturers Association	Due on receipt	

DISTANCE	DESCRIPTION	RATE	AMOUNT
Kilometers	Travel by car to and from hearing at OEB hearing room located at 2300 Yonge Street, Toronto. All trips are round trips from Carrying Place to Toronto and return or Carrying Place - Markham (overnight at family home) - Toronto and return.	\$0.40/km	
364	OPG Technical Conference 23/09/2016	.40	145.60
453	OPG Technical Conference 14-15/11/2016	.40	181.20
445	OPG Technical Conference 9-10/01/2017	.40	178.00
457	Hearing Attendance 27/02/2017	.40	182.80
390	Hearing Attendance 02/03/2017	.40	156.00
463	Hearing Attendance 20-21/03/2017	.40	185.20
372	Hearing Attendance 30/03/2017	.40	148.80
368	Hearing Attendance 06/04/2017	.40	147.20
			1324.80
	Day Parking @ Yonge - Eglinton Centre (OEB Office)	4 x \$17.70	70.80
	407 ETR Toll		32.03
	407 ETR Toll		24.65
	407 ETR Toll		60.06
			187.54
	Courier - Filings to OEB	2 x \$13.65	27.30
		<b>SUBTOTAL</b>	1539.64
		<b>(HST) SALES TAX</b>	200.15
		<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>1739.79</b>

Please make all checks payable to **Michael McLeod**

**Thank you for your business!**

