

BY EMAIL and RESS

March 5, 2010 Our File No. 2090477

Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street 27th Floor Toronto, Ontario M4P 1E4

Attn: Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary

Dear Ms. Walli:

Re: EB-2009-0326 - MicroFIT Consultation

We are counsel for the School Energy Coalition. We enclose the cost claim for School Energy Coalition with respect to the above-mentioned proceeding, together with docket detail. There are no disbursements. The signed original of the Affidavit will be delivered to the Board with the hard copies of the claim.

All of which is respectfully submitted.

Yours very truly, **JAY SHEPHERD P. C.**

Jay Shepherd

cc: Wayne McNally, SEC (email)
Interested parties (email)

APPENDIX "B"

FORM 3

AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF COST CLAIM

Board File Number		Party Name
Items Claimed excluding GST		
Legal/Consultant Fees + \$	Disbursements = \$	
Goods and Services Tax		
Full Registrant Unregistered (GST at 5%) Other GST at %		ng Non-Profit (GST at 2.5%) npt (no GST)
Total Cost Claim		
Net Sub-Total + Total GST Clai	Tota	al Cost Claim
I, (name), (County, Regional Municipality, etc. SAY:	of the (City, Town, ec.) of	etc.)in the, MAKE OATH AND
-	e noted party (the "party"	') and as such have knowledge of the matters
of its intervention in the Ontario l	only costs incurred direc Energy Board process (th	mentation in support of it. otly and necessarily by the party for the purpose the file number of which is set out above). I for work done, or time spent, by employees or
		ard's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.
	_, in the (County, Re	y, Town, etc.) of gional Municipality, etc.) of
COMMISSIONER for taking Aff	fidavits Sign	nature of Deponent

Appendix "B" FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS - CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL A separate form is required for each consultant or legal counsel

			Total								
Party Name	Law Firm	Consultant Firm	GST								rrency
Party			Sub-total								and country of initial currency
	f Call	ant Experience nust be attached)	Hourly Rate								,
	Year of Call	Years of Relevant Experience (curriculum vitae must be attached)	Hours								ole, state exchange ra
Board File Number	Legal Counsel Name	Consultant Name		Preparation	Attendance - Technical Conference	Attendance - Settlement Conference	Attendance - Oral Hearing	Argument	Case Management	TOTALS	Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate

MicroFIT Consultation

Date	Docket Details	Preparation	Argument	Hours
	Draft and file comments on issues list and Notice of Intervention	0.4	1.0	1.4
11-Oct-09	Review filings, Review Board letter	0.9		0.9
10-Nov-09	Review proposals	0.8		0.8
11-Nov-09	Review proposals, Background review on ALASI, Draft and file interrogatories, Many emails	5.2		5.2
	Review interrogatories from other parties and Staff	0.8		0.8
	Various emails	0.1		0.1
	Various emails	0.1		0.1
23-Nov-09	Review CME letter	0.1		0.1
26-Nov-09	Review interrogatory responses	0.5		0.5
27-Nov-09	Review additional interrogatory responses	0.6		0.6
7-Dec-09	Various emails	0.1		0.1
8-Dec-09	Review BOMA submissions, Review IR responses	1.3	1.0	2.3
9-Dec-09	Complete evidence review, Draft submissions, Review PWU submissions	0.2	3.5	3.7
10-Dec-09	Revise and file submissions, Review submissions of others, Many emails	0.4	1.3	1.7
14-Dec-09	Review revised submissions, Various emails		0.1	0.1
15-Dec-09	Various emails, Review Board letter	0.1		0.1
16-Dec-09	Many emails	0.1		0.1
23-Dec-09	Review ALASI submission	0.2		0.2
23-Feb-10	Review Board report/decision	1.0		1.0
Total		12.9	6.9	19.8
TULAI		12.9	0.9	19.8