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Appendix “B”
FORM 2

SUMMARY OF DISBURSEMENTS

EB-2009-0139 School Energy Coalition

Board File Number Party Name

Shibley Righton LLP
Party or Group that made the disbursement

Net Cost GST
Photocopies $0.7¢ N/A
Printing N/A
Fax $0.0C N/A
Courier $32.4C N/A
Telephone $0.0C N/A
Postage $0.0C N/A
Transcripts
Travel: Air $0.0C
Travel: Car $0.0C N/A
Travel: Rail
Travel: Other ( ) $0.0C
Taxi or Airport Limo $0.0C
Accommodation $0.0C
Meals $0.0C
Other ( ParkingFees ) $0.0C N/A | Grand Total
Sub-totals $33.1¢ N/A $33.1¢

Notes 1. All claims for disbursements must include receipts where practicable.
2. All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable state exchange rate _ _and country of initial currency

-11-





		c1: 

		gt1: 33.15

		gst216: N/A

		nc16: 33.15

		gst215: N/A

		nc15: 0

		gst214: 

		nc14: 00

		gst213: 

		nc13: 0

		gst212: 

		nc12: 0

		gst211: 

		nc11: 0

		gst210: 

		nc10: 

		gst29: N/A

		nc9: 0

		gst28: 

		nc8: 0

		gst27: 

		nc7: 

		gst26: N/A

		nc6: 0

		gst25: N/A

		nc5: 0.

		gst24: N/A

		nc4: 32.40

		gst23: N/A

		nc3: 0.00

		gst22: N/A

		nc2: 

		gst21: N/A

		nc1: .75

		ig10: Shibley Righton LLP

		inventor name: School Energy Coalition

		board file number: EB-2009-0139


		Other: Parking Fees






APPENDIX “B”
FORM 3

AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF COST CLAIM

EB-2009-0139 School Energy Coalition
Board File Number Party Name

Items Claimed excluding GST

Legal/Consultant Fees + Disbursements = Net Sub-Total
$36,533.00 $33.15 $36,566.15

Goods and Services Tax

..... Full Registrant ..... Qualifying Non-Profit (GST at 2.5%)
..... Unregistered (GST at 5%) ..... Tax Exempt (no GST).....
Other GST at %

Total Cost Claim

Net Sub-Total  + Total GST Claimed = Total Cost Claim

$ 36,566.15 $ $ 36,566.15

I, (name) Jay Shepherd , of the (City, Town, etc.) Toronto in the

(County, Regional Municipality, etc.) of , MAKE OATH AND

SAY:

1. | am a representative of the above noted party (the “party”) and as such have knowledge of the matters
attested to herein.

2. I have examined the above Cost Claim and all of the documentation in support of it.

3. The above Cost Claim represents only costs incurred directly and necessarily by the party for the purpose
of its intervention in the Ontario Energy Board process (the file number of which is set out above).

4. The above Cost Claim does not include any costs incurred for work done, or time spent, by employees or

officers of the party as described in section 6.05 of the Board’s Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

SWORN (OR AFFIRMED) BEFORE ME at the (City, Town, etc.) of
Toronto , in the (County, Regional Municipality, etc.) of
on (date) May 2010

COMMISSIONER for taking Affidavits Signature of Deponent






		Board File Number: EB-2009-0139

		Party Name: School Energy Coalition

		undefined: 36,533.00

		undefined_2: 33.15

		undefined_3: 36,566.15

		Other: 

		GST at: 

		undefined_4: 36,566.15

		undefined_5: 

		undefined_6: 36,566.15

		I name: Jay Shepherd

		of the City Town etc: Toronto

		County Regional Municipality etc of: 

		in the County Regional Municipality etc of: Toronto

		undefined_7: 

		on date: May     , 2010

		COMMISSIONER for taking Affidavits: 
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		init currency: 

		exch rate: 

		total8: 1058

		gst8: N/A

		st8: 1058

		r8: $230.00

		h8: 4.6

		total7: 

		gst7: 

		st7: 

		r7: 

		h7: 

		total6: 0

		gst6: N/A

		st6: 0

		r6: $230.00

		h6: 0.0

		total5: 0

		gst5: N/A

		st5: 0

		r5: $230.00

		h5: 0

		total4: 0

		gst4: N/A

		st4: 0

		r4: $230.00

		h4: 00

		total3: 0

		gst3: N/A

		st3: 0

		r3: $230.00

		h3: 0.0

		total2: 0

		gst2: N/A

		st2: 0

		r2: $230.00

		h2: 0.0

		total1: 1058

		gst1: N/A

		st1: 1058

		r1: $230.00

		h1: 4.6

		consultant:  

		relevent exp:  

		conusltant name: 

		law firm: Shibley Righton LLP

		yearofcall: 2003

		counsel name: John De Vellis

		boardfilenumber2: School Energy Coalition

		boardfilenumber: EB-2009-0139






Sheet1

						Toronto 2010 Rates

				Date		Docket Details		Prep		ADR		Oral		Argument		Hours

				28-Sep-09		Review NOA; many emails;		0.2								0.2

				9-Oct-09		Review evidence;		0.4								0.4

				10-Oct-09		Review evidence;		2.7								2.7

				11-Oct-09		Review evidence;		1.0								1.0

				12-Oct-09		Review evidence;		1.3								1.3

				17-Oct-09		Review evidence;		3.0								3.0

				19-Oct-09		Review PO 1;		0.5								0.5

				26-Oct-09		Draft and send issues list submissions; review submissions of others; many emails;		1.1								1.1

				30-Oct-09		Review reply submissions;		0.4								0.4

				4-Nov-09		Review evidence		2.0								2.0

				6-Nov-09		Review evidence		1.0								1.0

				7-Nov-09		Review evidence		1.0								1.0

				9-Nov-09		Review evidence		1.6								1.6

				10-Nov-09		Review Staff IRs 		0.9								0.9

				11-Nov-09		Review evidence, Prep IRs, Many emails		2.6								2.6

				12-Nov-09		Review of evidence, Research, Drafting IRs 		6.1								6.1

				13-Nov-09		Drafting, revising and filing interrogatories, Many emails, Review interrogatories of others		4.5								4.5

				16-Nov-09		Letters, Many emails		0.4								0.4

				17-Nov-09		Many emails		0.1								0.1

				19-Nov-09		Revise interrogatories and file		1.1								1.1

				20-Nov-09		Revised interrogatories, Many emails		0.6								0.6

				1-Dec-09		Many emails		0.3								0.3

				5-Dec-09		Review further evidence		2.0								2.0

				7-Dec-09		Prep for ADR		4.6								4.6

				8-Dec-09		Attend at ADR (7.0), Prep, Review, Many emails		1.0		7.0						8.0

				9-Dec-09		Attend at ADR (4.0), Prep, Many emails		0.4		4.0						4.4

				10-Dec-09		Attend at ADR (3.5), Many emails, Review counter offer		0.6		3.5						4.1

				11-Dec-09		Many emails, Telephone conversation with Julie Girvan		0.0		1.2						1.2

				12-Dec-09		Many emails, Review calculations		0.0		0.8						0.8

				13-Dec-09		Many emails		0.0		1.5						1.5

				15-Dec-09		Attend at ADR (3.1), Prep, Many emails, Review PP motion		1.0		3.1						4.1

				16-Dec-09		Report to client		0.0		1.0						1.0

				17-Dec-09		Meet with client re instructions, many emails		0.0		0.8						0.8

				18-Dec-09		Attend at ADR (2.0), Many emails, Many phone calls, Position email		1.2		2.0						3.2

				22-Dec-09		Review decision, Report to client, Many emails, Rescheduling		0.7								0.7

				30-Dec-09		Review SSMWG evidence, Review Irs, Review PP Motion materials, Many emails		1.6								1.6

				3-Jan-10		Research re past valuations, etc.		1.7								1.7

				8-Jan-10		Review PP submissions, Many emails, Review draft agreement		0.2		1.0						1.2

				11-Jan-10		Review draft agreement, Many emails		0.0		0.3						0.3

				12-Jan-10		Review draft agreement,		0.0		1.0						1.0

				13-Jan-10		Detailed comments on agreement, Revise and send, Many emails		0.0		2.4						2.4

				14-Jan-10		Review VECC comments, Many emails, Review bill impacts		0.0		2.3						2.3

				15-Jan-10		Many emails		0.2								0.2

				16-Jan-10		Many emails		0.2								0.2

				19-Jan-10		Many emails		0.4								0.4

				20-Jan-10		Review and revise settlement agreement, Many emails		0.0		2.7						2.7

				21-Jan-10		Many emails		0.3								0.3

				22-Jan-10		ADR conference call (1.2), Prep for meeting, Telephone conversation with John, Review new draft, Many emails		0.0		2.9						2.9

				26-Jan-10		Various emails		0.1								0.1

				28-Jan-10		Many emails, Review update		0.2								0.2

				29-Jan-10		Many emails		0.4								0.4

				31-Jan-10		Prep for hearing		1.7								1.7

				1-Feb-10		Many emails		0.1								0.1

				2-Feb-10		Review additional Materials, many emails		0.5								0.5

				3-Feb-10		Review evidence, Prep for cross on cost of capital, Review VECC material, Many emails, Review PP material		2.8								2.8

				4-Feb-10		Attend at hearing (1.6), Many emails, Review transcript, Prep questions		1.1				1.6				2.7

				5-Feb-10		Attend at hearing (1.0), Review further evidence, Review transcript		0.2				1.0				1.2

				12-Feb-10		Review THESL argument		0.0						1.4		1.4

				16-Feb-10		Review argument in chief, Meeting with Randy Aiken and Roger Higgin		0.0						1.2		1.2

				18-Feb-10		Review staff submission, Drafting argument, Many emails		0.0						1.2		1.2

				19-Feb-10		Draft, Revise and finalize argument, Many emails, Review arguments of others		0.0						4.1		4.1

				20-Feb-10		Many emails		0.3								0.3

				9-Apr-10		Review decision  		1.0								1.0

				20-Apr-10		Various emails		0.1								0.1

				21-Apr-10		Review draft rate order, Various emails		1.1								1.1

				23-Apr-10		Review DRO, Draft and file comments, Review BOMA comments		0.8								0.8

				26-Apr-10		Review responding submission		0.2								0.2





				Total				59.5		37.5		2.6		7.9		107.5
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		init currency: 

		exch rate: 

		total8: 35475

		gst8: N/A

		st8: 35475

		r8: $330.00

		h8: 107.5

		total7: 

		gst7: 

		st7: 

		r7: 

		h7: 

		total6: 0

		gst6: N/A

		st6: 0

		r6: $330.00

		h6: 0.0

		total5: 2607

		gst5: N/A

		st5: 2607

		r5: $330.00

		h5: 7.9

		total4: 858

		gst4: N/A

		st4: 858

		r4: $330.00

		h4: 2.6

		total3: 12375

		gst3: N/A

		st3: 12375

		r3: $330.00

		h3: 37.5

		total2: 0

		gst2: N/A

		st2: 0

		r2: $330.00

		h2: 0

		total1: 19635

		gst1: N/A

		st1: 19635

		r1: $330.00

		h1: 59.5

		consultant:  

		relevent exp:  

		conusltant name: 

		law firm: Jay Shepherd P.C.

		yearofcall: 1980

		counsel name: Jay Shepherd (JS)

		boardfilenumber2: School Energy Coalition

		boardfilenumber: EB-2009-0139






TORONTO HYDRO-ELECTRIC SYSTEM

EB-2009-0139

		DATE

		DESCRIPTION

		LYR.

		PREP.

		TECHNICAL

		ARGUMENT

		SETTLEMENT

		ORAL

		TIME



		28-AUG-2009

		Review re letter from applicant;

		JD

		0.4

		

		

		

		

		0.4



		31-AUG-2009

		Began reviewing application;

		JD

		2.0

		

		

		

		

		2.0



		18-SEP-2009

		Prepared Notice Of Intervention;

		JD

		0.3

		

		

		

		

		0.3



		28-SEP-2009

		Email from company; email to Jay Shepherd;

		JD

		0.2

		

		

		

		

		0.2



		29-SEP-2009

		Review re email from company; email to Jay Shepherd;

		JD

		0.3

		

		

		

		

		0.3



		19-OCT-2009

		Review Procedural Order #1;

		JD

		0.2

		

		

		

		

		0.2



		23-OCT-2009

		Review re comments on issues list;

		JD

		0.1

		

		

		

		

		0.1



		03-FEB-2010

		Review re capital gains issue; various emails to Mike Buonaguro and Jay Shepherd re cost of capital issues;

		JD

		0.6

		

		

		

		

		0.6



		09-APR-2010

		Review re Board decision;

		JD

		0.5

		

		

		

		

		0.5






Jay Shepherd

Professional Corporation
120 Eglinton Avenue East
Suite 500

Toronto, Ontario M4P 1E2

BY EMAIL and RESS

Ontario Energy Board
2300 Yonge Street
27" Floor

Toronto, Ontario
M4P 1E4

Attn: Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary

Dear Ms. Wallli:

Re: EB-2009-0139 — Toronto 2010 Rates

May 3, 2010
Our File No. 2090425

We are counsel for the School Energy Coalition. We enclose the cost claim for School Energy
Coalition with respect to the above-mentioned proceeding, together with docket and
disbursement details. The signed original of the Affidavit will be delivered to the Board with the

hard copies of the claim.

We note that School Energy Coalition was actively involved in all aspects of this proceeding,
including interrogatories, successful ADR, oral hearing, final argument and review of the draft

rate order.
All of which is respectfully submitted.

Yours very truly,
JAY SHEPHERD P. C.

-~
b A -

-""\.]ay Shepherd

ccC: Wayne McNally, SEC (email)
Interested parties (email)

(416) 804-2767
jay.shepherd@canadianenergylawyers.com

www.canadianenergylawyers.com






