PETER C.P. THOMPSON direct tel.: (613) 787-3528 e-mail: pthompson@blgcanada.com

August 23, 2010

Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board P.O. Box 2319 2300 Yonge Street 27<sup>th</sup> floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms Walli,

Union Gas Limited ("Union")

**Dawn to Dawn-TCPL Interconnect** 

**Board File No.:** 

EB-2010-0207

Our File No.:

339583-000078

Pursuant to the Board's Decision and Order dated August 12, 2010, please find enclosed the Cost Claim of our client, Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters ("CME").

A copy of this Cost Claim has been sent to Union as instructed.

Please contact me if you have any questions or require any additional information.

Yours very truly

Peter C.P. Thompson.

\slc

enclosure

E. Karen Hockin (Union)
Paul Clipsham (CME)

OTT01\4163703\1

**IN THE MATTER OF** the *Ontario Energy Board Act*, 1998, S.O. 1998, c. 15, Schedule B;

AND IN THE MATTER OF an Application by Union Gas Limited for an order or orders amending or varying its approved C1 rate schedule to accommodate a firm transportation service from Dawn to the Dawn-TCPL interconnect.

### **COST CLAIM OF**

## **CANADIAN MANUFACTURERS & EXPORTERS ("CME")**

August 23, 2010

Peter C. P. Thompson, Q.C. Borden Ladner Gervais LLP World Exchange Plaza 100 Queen Street Suite 1100 Ottawa ON K1P 1J9

Telephone (613) 237-5160 Facsimile (613) 230-8842 Counsel for CME

## **TABLE OF CONTENTS**

<u>Description</u>	<u>Tab Nos.</u>
Form 3 – Affidavit in Support of Cost Claim	1
Cost Claim of Peter C.P. Thompson	2
<ul> <li>Form 1 – Summary of Statement of Hours</li> </ul>	
<ul> <li>Form 2 – Summary of Disbursements</li> </ul>	

OTT01\4159867\1

## FORM 3 AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF COST CLAIM

Board File No.:	EB-2010-0207			
Party Name / Intervenor:	Canadian Manufac	cturers & Exporters (	("CME")	)
Items Claimed excluding GST a	and HST:			
Legal / Consultant Fees	+ Disbursements	=		Net Sub-Total
\$ 2,013.00	\$ 50.50	=		\$ 2,063.50
(Peter C.P. Thompson)	(Peter C.P. Tho	mpson)		
Goods and Services Tax ("GST	") prior to July 1, 2	2010:		
Full Registrant (Claiming Unregistered (Claiming Countries)  X Other (Claiming GST at	GST at 5%)	Qualifying No		t (Claiming GST at 2.5%) ng no GST)
Total GST Claim	ed			\$ 15.70
BLG GST Registration No. 8690969 CME GST Registration No. 10807 5				
Harmonized Sales Tax ("HST")	effective July 1, 20	)10:		
Claiming HST at 13% on Fee	s & Taxable Disburs	ements on or after.	July 1, 2	2010
Total HST Claime	ed			\$ 227.44
Total of Cost Claim:	***************************************	***************************************		
Net Sub-Total + Total GS	ST Claimed +	Total HST Claimed	=	Total Cost Claim
\$ 2,063.50 \$ 15.70	Э	\$ 227.44	=	\$ 2,306.64
I, Peter C.P. Thompson, Q.C., of the	City of Ottawa, in the	Province of Ontario, N	VAKE O	ATH AND SAY:
<ol> <li>I am a representative of the a attested to herein.</li> </ol>	bove-noted party (the	"party") and as such	have kr	nowledge of the matters
2. I have examined the above Co	ist Claim, and all of the	e documentation in su	pport of	it.
3. The above Cost Claim represe of its intervention in the Ontario				
4. The above Cost Claim does no officers of the party as describe				
SWORN BEFORE ME at the City of  Mm Junuan	Ottawa, in the Provinc	e of Ontario on the 23	19th day of	f August, 2010.
COMMISSIONER for taking Affidavit	s, etc.	Peter C.	P. Thor	mpson

#### FORM 1

### SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS - CONSULTANT AND LEGAL COUNSEL

A separate form is required for each consultant or legal counsel

<b>EB-2010-0207</b> Board File No.	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters ("CME") Party Name / Intervenor		
Peter C.P. Thompson Legal Counsel Name	1967 Year of Call	····	Borden Ladner Gervais LLP Law Firm
N/A Consultant Name	N/A Years of Relev (curriculum vitae n	ant Experience nust be attached)	N/A Consultant Firm

	Hours	Hourly Rate	Sub-Total	GST	HST	Total
Preparation (Prep) prior to July 1/10	0.8	\$330.00	264.00	13.20	0.00	277.20
Preparation (Prep) after July 1/10	5.3	\$330.00	1,749.00	0.00	227.37	1,976.37
Attendance Settlement Conference (Attend SC) after July 1/10	0.0	\$330.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
Attendance Oral Hearing (Attend OH)	0.0	\$330.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
Argument (Argument)	0.0	\$330.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
Case Management (CM)	0.0	\$330.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
TOTALS:	6.1		\$2,013.00	\$ 13.20	\$ 227.37	\$2,253.57

DETAILED STATEMENT OF HOURS - Peter C.P. Thompson				
Date	Description of Services	Time	Allocation	
24-Jun-10	Reviewing Union Application and Notice of Application and Written Hearing, and e-mails from various intervenor representatives	0.8	Prep	
2-Jul-10	Reviewing pre-filed evidence; drafting and dictating Interrogatories to Union	1.5	Prep	
2-Jul-10	Letter to the Board and to interested parties	0.1	Prep	
7-Jul-10	Considering Mr. Smith's letter to the Board	0.1	Prep	
15-Jul-10	Reviewing Union's revised Application and its Responses to Interrogatories	0.5	Prep	
29-Jul-10	Reviewing evidence, Interrogatory Responses, and Union's Submissions; drafting, revising and finalizing Submissions	2.8	Prep	
9-Aug-10	Reviewing Union's Reply Submissions	0.1	Prep	
12-Aug-10	Reviewing Board Decision and Order	0.2	Prep	
	TOTAL HOURS:	6.1		

# FORM 2 SUMMARY OF DISBURSEMENTS

Board File No.:	EB-2010-0207
Party Name / Intervenor:	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters ("CME")
Party or Group that made the disbursement:	Borden Ladner Gervais – Peter C.P. Thompson

	NET COST	GST	нѕт	
Photocopies	0.50	0.00	0.07	,
LPIC Levy Surcharge	50.00	2.50	0.00	
Other:	0.00	0.00	0.00	`
·				GRAND TOTAL
SUB-TOTAL:	50.5	2.50	0.07	\$ 53.07