IN THE MATTER OF the *Ontario Energy Board Act*, 1998, S.O. 1998, c. 15, Schedule B;

AND IN THE MATTER OF an Application by Enbridge Gas Distribution Inc., pursuant to section 36(1) of the Ontario Energy Board Act, 1998, for an order or orders approving or fixing just and reasonable rates and other charges for the sale, distribution, transmission, and storage of gas as of January 1, 2008.

COST CLAIM OF INDUSTRIAL GAS USERS ASSOCIATION ("IGUA")

April 14, 2008

Peter C. P. Thompson, Q.C. Borden Ladner Gervais LLP 100 Queen Street Suite 1100 Ottawa, ON K1P 1J9

Telephone (613) 237-5160 Facsimile (613) 230-8842 Counsel for IGUA

TABLE OF CONTENTS

Description	<u>Tab Nos.</u>
Form 3 – Affidavit in Support of Cost Claim	1
Cost Claim of Peter C.P. Thompson	2
 Form 1 – Summary of Statement of Hours 	
 Form 2 – Summary of Disbursements 	

OTT01\3432996\1

TAB 1

FORM 3

AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF COST CLAIM

Board File No.:	EB-2007-0932	And the grown was a second company, and	
Party Name / Intervenor:	Industrial Gas Users Ass	sociation ("IGUA")	
Items Claimed excluding GST: Legal / Consultant Fees \$ 2,871.00 (Peter C.P. Thompson)	+ Disbursements \$ 76.38 (Peter C.P. Thompson	= =	Net Sub-Total \$ 2,947.38
Goods and Services Tax:X Full Registrant (Claiming Commons) Unregistered (Claiming Commons) Claiming Goods Total GST Registration No. 869096974 (B	SST at 5%) ST at 5%) al GST Claimed	Qualifying Non-P Tax Exempt (Clai	rofit (Claiming GST at 2.5%) iming no GST) \$ 0.00
Total of Cost Claim: Net Sub-Total	+ Total GST Claimed	=	Total Cost Claim
\$ 2,947.38	\$ 0.00	=	\$ 2,947.38
I, Peter C.P. Thompson, of the Cit	y of Ottawa, in the Provin	ce of Ontario, MA	KE OATH AND SAY:
1. I am a representative of the matters attested to herein.	above-noted party (the "pa	arty") and as such	have knowledge of the
2. I have examined the above (Cost Claim, and all of the	documentation in	support of it.
 The above Cost Claim repre purpose of its intervention in above). 	sents only costs incurred the Ontario Energy Board	directly and neces d process (the file	ssarily by the party for the number of which is set out
SWORN BEFORE ME at the City of COMMISSIONER for taking Affidavits		of Ontario on the Peter C.P.	day of April, 2008. Thompson

TAB 2

FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS - CONSULTANT AND LEGAL COUNSEL

A separate form is required for each consultant or legal counsel

EB-2007-0932 Board File No. Industrial Gas User Party Name / Intervenor		strial Gas Users Association ("IGUA") Name / Intervenor
Peter C.P. Thompson Legal Counsel Name	1967 Year of Call	Borden Ladner Gervais LLP Law Firm
N/A Consultant Name	N/A Years of Relevant Expe	N/A Consultant Firm

		Hours	Hourly Rate	Sub-Total	GST	Total
Preparation						
reparation	(Prep)	8.7	\$330.00	2,871.00	0.00	2,871.00
Attendance - Technical Conference	(Attend TC)	0.0	\$330.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference	(Attend SC)	0.0	\$330.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing	(Attend OH)	0.0	\$330.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
Argument	(Argument)	0.0	\$330.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
Case Management	(CM)	0.0	\$330.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
TOTALS:		8.7	.,,,,	\$2,871.00		\$2,871.00

	3
Note: All claims must be in Constituted to	
Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, sta	te exchange rate: and country of initial
	te exchange rate:; and country of initial currency:

	DETAILED STATEMENT OF HOURS - Peter C.P. Thompson		
Date	Description of Services	Time	Allocation
26-Feb-08	Drafting and dictating letter to Mr. Newton	0.5	
05-Mar-08	Reviewing EGD's responses to Board Staff Interrogatories	0.8	Prep
10-Mar-08	Organize Application Brief		Prep
12-Mar-08	Reviewing EGD Argument-in-Chief	0.4 0.5	Prep Prep
12-Mar-08	E-mail to Mr. Newton	0.1	,
17-Mar-08	Reviewing prior TS Decisions and TS Methodology materials filed by EGD; drafting outline of IGUA submissions	3.0	Prep Prep
18-Mar-08	Dictate draft letter to OEB re: EGD's TS Methodology amendment requests	1.2	Dran
25-Mar-08	Considering and responding to e-mail from Mr. Newton	0.3	Prep
25-Mar-08	Considering e-mail from Mr. Newton	0.3	Prep
26-Mar-08	Reviewing OEB references and finalizing letter to OEB		Prep
26-Mar-08	Reviewing Board Staff submissions	1.0	Prep
03-Apr-08	Considering e-mail from OEB	0.2	Prep
09-Apr-08	Reviewing EGD's Reply Argument	0.1	Prep
09-Apr-08	Considering EGD's Transactional Services Report	0.4	Prep
·	200 o Handetional Gervices Report	0.1	Prep
	TOTAL HOURS:		
		8.7	

Management of the control of the con

performance manufactures of the second control of the second contr

FORM 2

SUMMARY OF DISBURSEMENTS

Board File No.:	EB-2007-0932		
Party Name / Intervenor:	Industrial Gas Users Association ("IGUA")		
Party or Group that made the disbursement:	Borden Ladner Gervais – Peter C.P. Thompson		
	NET COST		
Photocopies	8.10		
Fax (long distance)	0.00		
Courier	18.28		
Telephone long distance	0.00		
Postage	0.00		
Transcripts	0.00		
Travel: air	0.00		
Travel: train	0.00		
Travel: taxis	0.00		
Travel: other	0.00		
Travel: accommodation	0.00		
Travel: meals	0.00		
Other: LPIC Levy Surcharge	50.00		
SUB-TOTAL:	\$ 76.38	GRAND TOTAL:	\$ 76.38