

THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS

Chair, GAIL REGAN President, Cara Holdings Ltd. President, PATRICIA ADAMS Secretary Treasurer, ANNETTA TURNER MAX ALLEN ANDREW ROMAN Barrister & Solicitor, Miller Thon Producer, IDEAS, CBC Radio ANDREW COYNE ANDREW STARK Columnist, National Post Rotman School of Management, University of Toronto GLENN FOX GEORGE TOMKO Professor of Economics, University of Guelph Resident Expert, PSI Initiative, University of Toronto IAN GRAY MICHAEL TREBILCOCK Chair, Law & Economics, University of Toronto MARGARET WENTE President, St. Lawrence Starch Co. CLIFFORD ORWIN Professor of Political Science, University of Toronto Columnist, The Globe and Mail

November 15, 2012

BY FAX & BY COURIER

Ms Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge St, Suite 2701 Toronto ON M4P 1E4

Ms Walli:

Board File No. EB-2011-0120 Canadian Distributed Antenna Systems Coalition Energy Probe – Costs Submission

Pursuant to Procedural Order No. 13, issued November 6, 2012, please find attached the Costs Submission of Energy Probe Research Foundation (Energy Probe) in the EB-2011-0120 proceeding for the Board's consideration.

Should you require additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours truly,

David the the

David S. MacIntosh Case Manager

cc. Lawrence Schwartz, Consultant to Energy Probe (By email)

Energy Probe Research Foundation 225 BRUNSWICK AVE., TORONTO, ONTARIO M5S 2M6

0

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are present in the document to assist with the calculation of the cost claim.

- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.

Country:

- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each consultant or lawyer/articling student/paralegal. However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.

- A CV for each consultant must be attached unless, for a given consultant, a CV has been provided to the Board in another process within the last 24 months.

- Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

Rate:

File # EB-			Process: Canadian Distributed Antenna Systems Coalition		
Party:			Affiant's Name: Annetta Turner		
HST Numbe				HST Rate Ontario: 6.50%	
		Full Registrant Unregistered Other		Qualifying Non-Profit Tax Exempt	

		Affidav	/it		
I,	Annetta Turner	, of the	e City/Town of	Toronto	
in the Province/State o	f (Ontario, Canada	-	, swear or affirm that:	

1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.

2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".

3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.

4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

Signature of Affiant

Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of ______, on ______, on ________, date)

Commissioner for taking Affidavits

File # EB- 2011-0120

Process: Canadian Distributed Antenna Systems Coalitio

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundation

	Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed	
Legal/consultant fees	\$66,379.40	
Disbursements	\$80.25	
HST	\$4,314.66	
Total Cost Claim	\$70,744.31	

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2011-0120		Process:	Canadian Distribu	uted Antenn	a Systems Coalition
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundation		Name:	Dr. Lawrence P. S	chwartz	
				Completed Yo Practising/Years of experience	f relevant	
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal:					
	Consultant:	\checkmark		30+		
	CV attached:		CV r	not required:	\checkmark	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed							
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total		
Preparation	118.68	\$330.00	\$39,164.40	\$2,545.69	\$41,710.09		
Attendance - Technical Conference	9.00	\$330.00	\$2,970.00	\$193.05	\$3,163.05		
Attendance - Settlement Conference	9.75	\$330.00	\$3,217.50	\$209.14	\$3,426.64		
Attendance - Oral Hearing	13.00	\$330.00	\$4,290.00	\$278.85	\$4,568.85		
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES			\$49,641.90	\$3,226.72	\$52,868.62		

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed					
		Net Cost	HST	Total	
Photocopies			\$0.00	\$0.00	
Printing			\$0.00	\$0.00	
Fax			\$0.00	\$0.00	
Courier			\$0.00	\$0.00	
Telephone			\$0.00	\$0.00	
Postage			\$0.00	\$0.00	
Transcripts			\$0.00	\$0.00	
Travel: Air			\$0.00	\$0.00	
Travel: Car			\$0.00	\$0.00	
Travel: Rail			\$0.00	\$0.00	
Travel (Other):			\$0.00	\$0.00	
Parking			included	\$0.00	
Taxi or Airport Limo			\$0.00	\$0.00	
Accommodation			\$0.00	\$0.00	
Meals			\$0.00	\$0.00	
Other:			\$0.00	\$0.00	
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	

Time Sheet for L. Schwartz Board File: EB-2011-0120 CANDAS July, August and September 2011

Description	
Preparation Attend. Tech. Attend. ADR Attend. Hearing Argument Prep. Case Mngt. (CM)	48.93 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Total

Date

Hours Note

48.93

27-Jul-11	2.00	Review of CANDAS application, April 21/11
28-Jul-11	2.00	Review CANDAS evidence: Boron, Larsen, O'Shaughnessy, Vinyard
	0.15	E-mail communication with EPFR, case manager
28-Jul-11	1.00	Review CANDAS evidence: LYA Report
29-Jul-11	2.00	Research re: THSEL/THSEI; review appendicies of app.; prepare IRs
30-Jul-11	2.00	Research re: THSEL/THSEI; review appendicies of app,; prepare IRs
01-Aug-11	2.00	Review of evidence; preparation of interrogatories
03-Aug-11	2.50	Review of evidence; preparation of interrogatories
		Review of August 3/11 Board decision in EB-2009-0180,0181,0182,0183
		Review THESL response dated June 10, 2011 to CANDAS' application,
09-Aug-11	0.25	Preparation of e-mail memo to case manager
10-Aug-11	1.00	Review CEA interrogatories
11-Aug-11	1.50	Review CEA interrogatories
12-Aug-11	0.75	Review EDA, Hydro Ottawa interrogatories
15-Aug-11	1.00	Review Board Staff, VECC interrogatories and report to case manager
16-Aug-11	0.25	Review CCC interrogatories and report to case manager
17-Aug-11	1.50	Review THESL interrogatories and report to case manager
18-Aug-11	3.00	Review CANDAS replies to THESL interrogatories
21-Aug-11	0.50	Review CANDAS replies to Board Staff interrogatories
22-Aug-11	1.50	Review CANDAS replies to Board Staff interrogatories
24-Aug-11	1.50	Review CANDAS replies to CEA interrogatories
29-Aug-11	0.45	Review CANDAS replies to EDA interrogatories
30-Aug-11	1.50	Review CANDAS replies to Hydo Ottawa, EPRF, CCC and VECC IRs
31-Aug-11	0.25	Review CANDAS supplementary replies; interrogatory of Newmarket-Tay
06-Sep-11	0.33	Review Extenet/Thesl e-mail correspondence
08-Sep-11	1.50	Review CEA evidence (LCC Report); THESL, CANDAS & Board corresp.
09-Sep-11	0.50	Review THESL Notice of Motion
10-Sep-11	1.00	Review THESL Notice of Motion and related correspondence
10-Sep-11	2.00	Review Starkey affidavit
11-Sep-11	0.25	Review Attachments A-L, Starkey Affidavit, vol. 1
11-Sep-11	0.50	Review NGEIR decision, Exhibit 4, vol 2 Starkey affidavit
11-Sep-11	0.25	Review other exhibits in vol's 2-3, Starkey Affidavit
11-Sep-11	1.50	Review Yatchew affidavit
11-Sep-11	0.50	Review Byrne exhibit and attachments

12-Sep-11 5.00 Drafting interrogatories 0.25 Review CANDAS Sept 14 letter and and advise case manager 14-Sep-11 14-Sep-11 2.00 Review economic literature on essential facilities doctrine 15-Sep-11 1.00 Review (1) CANDAS IRs on THESL general evidence and (2) Board Staff IRs on intervenor evidence 16-Sep-11 1.00 Review CANDAS interrogatories on Yatchew and CEA reports 16-Sep-11 1.00 Review CANDAS interrogatories on Starkey Affidavit 1.50 Review CANDAS interrogatories on Starkey and Byrne Affidavits 19-Sep-11 0.25 Review VECC, EDA and CCC interrogatories on THESL evidence 19-Sep-11 Total 48.93 Preparation

Time Sheet for L. Schwartz Board File: EB-2011-0120 CANDAS October, November, December 2011

Summary:	Hours
Preparation Attend. Tech. Attend. ADR Attend. Hearing Argument Prep. Case Mngt. (CM)	45.75 9.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Total

Date

Hours Note

54.75

06-Oct-11	1.25	Review CEA responses to CANDAS interrogatories
12-Oct-11	1.25	Review THESL responses to CANDAS interrogatories
12-Oct-11	0.50	Review THESL responses to CANDAS interrogatories of M. Starkey
14-Oct-11	3.00	Review THESL responses to CANDAS interrogatories of M. Starkey
17-Oct-11	0.50	Review THESL responses to CANDAS interrogatories of M. Starkey
18-Oct-11	0.25	Communications with case manager and e-mail to legal adviser
18-Oct-11	3.00	Review THESL responses to CANDAS interrogatories of M. Starkey
21-Oct-11	3.00	Review CANDAS reply evidence and draft interrogatories
21-Oct-11	1.00	Review intervenors' interrogatories on CANDAS' reply evidence
24-Oct-11	1.75	Review THESL responses to CANDAS interrogatories of A. Yatchew
24-Oct-11	1.00	Review FCC report FCC-11-50A1 cited by Yatchew
25-Oct-11	1.00	Review discussion of pole access rates for wireless in report FCC-11-50A1
26-Oct-11	1.50	Review THESL responses to CANDAS interrogatories of M. Byrne
27-Oct-11	2.00	Review CANDAS responses to intervenors' IRs on CANDAS' reply evidence
28-Oct-11	2.00	Review THESL responses to interrogatories of EDA, VECC, Energy Probe
28-Oct-11	0.50	Review THESL responses to interrogatories of CCC
28-Oct-11	0.50	Drafted preliminary assessment of main issues via e-mail to case manager
31-Oct-11	0.50	Review motion of Consumers' Coalition of Canada
01-Nov-11	2.00	Draft guestions for Technical Conference
02-Nov-11	5.00	Draft questions for Technical Conference
03-Nov-11	2.00	Draft questions for Technical Conference and review with case manager
07-Nov-11	0.50	Review Transcript of Technical Conference
07-Nov-11	0.50	Review Revised Transcript of Technical Conference
07-Nov-11	0.50	Review CANDAS Notice of Motion, November 3, 2011
08-Nov-11	0.25	Review Second Revised Transcript of Technical Conference
08-Nov-11	0.50	Review Board Letter, Sept. 14, communicate with case manager and legal
09-Nov-11	0.25	Review CANDAS Amended Notice of Motion, November 8, 2011
09-Nov-11	0.25	Review Board Staff Technical Conference Questions
09-Nov-11	0.25	Review CANDAS Written Submissions, Novembver 9, 2011
09-Nov-11	0.25	Review 2nd Revised Trans.t of Tech. Conf., line 156+, for omitted exchange
		with McLorg and communication thereof with case manager
09-Nov-11	0.25	Review Submissions of the Consumers Council of Canada, November 9, 20
	-	re: Notice of Motion, October 31, 2011
16-Nov-11	0.25	Review THESL Responding Submissions, November 15, 2011
	0.20	

17-Nov-11	0.25	Review CANDAS letter of September 9, 2011 and advise case manager
17-Nov-11	0.25	Review Affidavit of Ivano Labricciosa, appendix Nov. 15, 2011
18-Nov-11	0.25	Review CANDAS_Ex_JTC1_1-3_TC_Response_20111116[1]
21-Nov-11	0.50	Review THESL_SUB_Ware_and report to case manager
		on implications for EPRF questioning
21-Nov-11	0.25	Review EB-2011-0120_THESL_Responses to Board Staff
23-Nov-11	0.50	Review Amended Reply Sub. of CCC to THESL Responding Sub
24-Nov-11	0.75	Review CANDAS_ReplySUB_Motion_20111122
24-Nov-11	0.20	Review THESLResponseReCCCReplySubmissions_20110022
24-Nov-11	0.05	Review CCC Letter to Board, EB-2011-0120-Ltr[1], November 23, 2011
29-Nov-11	0.25	Review THESL Correction Letter re: Tech. Conf.; CANDAS Correction Lette
29-Nov-11	0.25	Review CANDAS Nov 28 Letter to Board re: Ward conflict
02-Dec-11	0.25	Review THESL_AdditionallRswCover and THESL_ReplySUB
06-Dec-11	0.25	Review Decision and Procedural Order No. 6, December 6, 2011
09-Dec-11	0.25	Review Board Decision and Order December 9, 2011
26-Dec-11	2.00	Review Kravtin Reply Report and prepare interrogatories
27-Dec-11	2.00	Draft interrogatories
28-Dec-11	0.25	Review THESL Notice of Motion Dec 22, 2011 & advise case manager
Total	<i>4</i> 5 75	Preparation
TOtal	40.70	Treparation
Date	Hours	Note
04-Nov-11	9.00	Attend technical conference
	0.00	
Total	9.00	Attendance - Technical Conference

Time Sheet for L. Schwartz Board File: EB-2011-0120 CANDAS January, February, March, April, May, June, July 2012

Summary:	Hours
Preparation Attend. Tech. Attend. ADR Attend. Hearing Argument Prep. Case Mngt. (CM)	19.00 0.00 9.75 13.00 0.00 0.00
Total	41.75

Date	Hours	Note
04-Jan-12 09-Jan-12 23-Jan-12 24-Jan-12 26-Jan-12 26-Jan-12 26-Jan-12 26-Jan-12 18-Jul-12 18-Jul-12	0.50 1.00 0.50 3.00 0.75 0.75 0.50 1.00 1.75 0.25	Review THESL written submissions January 3, 2012 Review IRs of THESL, Board Staff, VECC, & CCC on Kravtin affidavit Review and report, CANDAS sub. re THESL's motion for further answers Review CANDAS replies on IRs of Energy Probe, Board Staff and VECC Review CANDAS replies on IRs of CCC, THESL Review CANDAS written sub. re THESL Motion; prepare advice to Client Review THESL letter, Jan 11/12; THESL Reply Submissions Jan 13/12; Review THESL letter Jan 19/12; CCC and CANDAS letters Jan 20/12; Review THESL Additional Responses Jan 20/12; Procedural Order #8 Review parties' Preliminary Issues materials Review correspondence among parties and Board
25-Jul-12	1.00	Review Joint Written Statement regarding policy and economic issues
26-Jul-12 30-Jul-12 30-Jul-12 30-Jul-12 31-Jul-12	1.00 2.00 2.00	Review New Confidential Information provided by THESL Review Yatchew sub. on market power to Market Surveillance Panel, Yatchew publications and teaching materials; literature on market power v. monopoly power in presence of fixed costs Review Market Surveillance Monitoring Document re: exercise and
31-Jul-12		abuse of market power
Total	19.00	Preparation
Date	Hours	Note
05-Mar-12 22-Jun-12	5.25 4.50	Attend Settlement Conference Attend Reconvened Settlement Conference

Total 9.75 Attendance - Settlement Conference

Date Hours Note

06-Feb-12	5.50	Attend hearing on Confidentiality & Privilege Matters
-----------	------	---

23-Jul-12 7.50 Attend hearing on Preliminary Issue

Total 13.00 Attendance - Hearing

Time Sheet for L. Schwartz Board File: EB-2011-0120 CANDAS August, September, October 12

Summary:	Hours
Preparation Attend. Tech. Attend. ADR Attend. Hearing Argument Prep. Case Mngt. (CM)	5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total	5.00

Date	Hours	Note
08-Aug-12	1.00	Review transcript of hearing re: Preliminary Issue
09-Aug-12	1.00	Review materials on US essential facilities doctrine
24-Sep-12	1.00	Review written submissions re: costs
28-Sep-12	1.00	Draft Energy Probe reply submission on costs
03-Oct-12	1.00	Review written reply submissions on Cost Issues
Total	5.00	Preparation

Time Sheet for L. Schwartz Board File: EB-2011-0120 CANDAS Sum of Timesheets

Summary:	Hours	
Preparation Attend. Tech. Attend. ADR Attend. Hearing Argument Prep. Case Mngt. (CM)	118.68 9.00 9.75 13.00 0.00 0.00	
Total	150.43	
Date	Hours	Note
15-Nov-12 15-Nov-12 15-Nov-12 15-Nov-12 Total	48.93 45.75 19.00 5.00 118.68	July, August, September 2011 October, November, December 2011 January to July 2012 August to October 2012 Preparation
Date	Hours	Note
15-Nov-12	9.00	Technical Conference 4 November 2011
Total	9.00	Attendance - Technical Conference
Date	Hours	Note
15-Nov-12 15-Nov-12	5.25 4.50	ADR 5 March 2012 ADR 22 June 2012
Total	9.75	Attendance - ADR

Date	Hours	Note
15-Nov-12 15-Nov-12		Oral Hearing 6 February 2012 Oral Hearing 23 July 2012

Total 13.00 Attendance - Hearing

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2011-0120	Process	Canadian Distributed Antenna Systems Coalition
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundation	Name	e: David MacIntosh
			Completed Years Practising/Years of relevant experience
Counse	l/Articling Student/Paralegal: [
	Consultant:	7	13
	CV attached:	cv	not required:

Statement of Fees Being Claimed							
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total		
Preparation	36.00	\$290.00	\$10,440.00	\$678.60	\$11,118.60		
Attendance - Technical Conference	7.75	\$290.00	\$2,247.50	\$146.09	\$2,393.59		
Attendance - Settlement Conference	8.50	\$290.00	\$2,465.00	\$160.23	\$2,625.23		
Attendance - Oral Hearing	4.00	\$290.00	\$1,160.00	\$75.40	\$1,235.40		
Argument	0.00	\$290.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Case Management	2.50	\$170.00	\$425.00	\$27.63	\$452.63		
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES			\$16,737.50	\$1,087.94	\$17,825.44		

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed					
	Net Cost	HST	Total		
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00		
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00		
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00		
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00		
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00		
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00		
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00		
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00		
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00		
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00		
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00		
Parking	\$80.25	included	\$80.25		
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00		
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00		
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00		
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00		
		-			
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	: \$80.25	\$0.00	\$80.25		

Time Sheet for D. MacIntosh Board File: EB-2011-0120 CANDAS Proceeding

		Hours	
	Preparation Attend. Tech. Attend. ADR Attend. Hearing Argument Prep. Case Mngt. (CM)	36.00 7.75 8.50 4.00 0.00 2.50	
	Total	58.75	
	Date	Hours	Note
	25-May-11	2.75	prep - Review Prefiled Evidence .
	25-May-11	0.50	prep - Draft Notice of Intervention
	14-Jun-11	0.50	prep - Review Parties Correspondence on Costs & Procedural Order # 1
	28-Jul-11	1.50	prep - Review CANDAS Supplementary Evidence
1	03-Aug-11	1.25	prep - Draft Interrogatories re CANDAS
:	27-Aug-11	1.50	prep - Review CANDAS Interrogatory Responses
	07-Sep-11	2.75	prep - Review THESL Notice of Motion and Related Evidence Exhibits
	10-Sep-11	0.25	prep - Review THESL Letter re Motion
	10-Sep-11	1.00	prep - Review THESL Motion Evidence Exhibits
	12-Sep-11	0.75	prep - Draft Interrogatories re THESL & CEA
	14-Sep-11	0.75	prep - Review Correspondence of Parties & OEB Reply re Process
	17-Oct-11	1.50	prep - Review THESL & CEA Interrogatory Responses
	17-Oct-11	1.25	prep - Review CANDAS Reply Evidence
	18-Oct-11	0.50	prep - Draft Interrogatories re CANDAS Reply Evidence
	28-Oct-11	0.75	prep - Review CANDAS Interrogatory Responses
	01-Nov-11	0.50	prep - Review CCC Motion to Compel Complete Responses from THESL
	03-Nov-11	0.75	prep - Review CANDAS Motion to Compele Responses from THESL
	03-Nov-11	1.50	prep - Prepare for Technical Conference
,	07-Nov-11	0.50	prep - Draft Email to OEB Secretary re Errors in Tech Conf Transcript
	09-Dec-11	0.50	prep - Review PO No. 5 & 6 plus Decision and Order issued December 9
	13-Dec-11	0.25	prep - Review THESL Ltr re Decision and Order issued December 9
	19-Dec-11	1.00	prep - Review CANDAS Reply Evidence, Kravtin
	23-Dec-11	1.25	prep - Review THESL Motion Disputed Interrogatories
	28-Dec-11	0.75	prep - Draft IRs on CANDAS Reply Evidence, Kravtin
	06-Jan-12	0.50	prep - Review THESL Submissions on its Motion
	14-Jan-12	0.50	prep - Review CANDAS Reply to THESL Motion & THESL Reply
	22-Jan-12	0.50	prep - Review Decision on Motion & Procedural Order # 8
	24-Jan-12	1.25	prep - Review CANDAS Interrogatory Responses
	23-Feb-12	0.50	prep - Review Decision and Order, Confidentiality & Privilege
	02-Mar-12	1.25	prep - Prepare for Settlement Conference
	21-Mar-12	0.50	prep - Review Corresp. & Board Letter on Suspending ADR
	29-May-12	0.50	prep - Review Corresp. & Procedrural Order # 10 Suspending ADR
	21-Jun-12	1.25	prep - Prepare for Reconvened Settlement Conference
	19-Jul-12	1.50	prep - Review CANDAS Book of Authorities

21-Jul-12 14-Sep-12 22-Sep-12 02-Oct-12	0.75	prep - Prepare for Hearing prep - Review Decision on Preliminary Issue and Order prep - Draft Submissions Round One on Cost Issues prep - Draft Submissions Round Two on Cost Issues
Total	36.00	Preparation
Date	Hours	Note
04-Nov-11	7.75	Attend Technical Conference
Total	7.75	Attendance - Technical Conference
Date	Hours	Note
05-Mar-12 22-Jun-12		Attend Settlement Conference Attend Reconvened Settlement Conference
Total	8.50	Attendance - Settlement Conference
Date	Hours	Note
06-Feb-12 23-Jul-12		Attend Oral Hearing - Confidentiality & Privilege Matters Attend Oral Hearing - Preliminary Issue
Total	4.00	Attendance - Oral Hearing
Date	Hours	Note
25-May-11 05-Aug-11 12-Sep-11 18-Oct-11 07-Nov-11 04-Jan-12 20-Jul-12 24-Sep-12 03-Oct-12		 CM - File Notice of Intervention & Cover Letter CM - File Interrogatories on CANDAS Evidence CM - File Interrogatories on THESL & CEA Evidence CM - File Interrogatories on CANDAS Reply Evidence CM - Check & File Email to OEB Secretary re Transcript Errors CM - File Interrogatories on CANDAS Reply Evidence, Kravtin CM - File Request Letter to THESL re Additional Evidence CM - File Round One Submissions on Cost Issues CM - File Round Two Submissions on Cost Issues
Total	2.50	Case Management

FORM 2

SUMMARY OF DISBURSEMENTS

EB-2011-0120 C Board File Num		David MacIntosl Party Name	1	
	esearch Foundation that made the Disbursem	ent		
		Net Cost	GST	
	Photocopies	-		
External	Printing			
Larconner	Fax			LL
	Courier		Sanda Robertani, en el production de la constante de	
	Telephone			
	Postage			
	Transcripts		54)	
	Travel: Air			
	Travel: Car			
	Travel: Rail Travel: Other ()			
	Taxi or Airport Limo			
	Accommodation			
	Meals	1		
Parking	Other ()	80.25	Inc.	80.25
	Sub-totals	\$80.25	Inc. Grand Total	\$80.25
	Matao			
RECEIPT Yonge & Eglinton Ctr	RECEIPT	CAR PA		RECEIPT
Paystation 4 23/07/12 01:23P	CAR PARK: Yonge & Eglinton Ct: DEVICE: Paystation S	5 PAIDi	Paystation 4 .05/03/12 03:16P	CAR PARK: Yonge & Eglintor DEVICE: Paystat
153019	PAID: 22/06/12 02:36	SHORT	TERM 139461	PAID: 04.11.110
23/07/12 09:18A 23/07/12 01:23P	SHORT TERM 150323 ENTRY: 22/06/12 09:24	A EXIT	05/03/12 09:22A 05/03/12 03:17P	SHORT TERM 12 ENTRY: 04 11/11 00
TION: 000 04:04	EXIT: 22/06/12 02:39 PARKING DURATION: 000 05:11		DURATE :: 000 05:54	EXIT: 04 11/11/0 PARKING DUPATION: 000 (
TION: 000 02:20 CAD18.00	CHARGED DURATION: 0000 02:20	PAID:	CAD18.00	Charged Duratic's 000 (
CAD15.93	PAID: Cad18.00 Tax Free Cad15.93	tax, fre	ECAD15,93	PAID: CAD TAX_FREECAD
CAD2.07 S: CAD20.00	V.A.T. 13% : CAD2.07	CASH PP	STIDE FOR	V.R.T. 13% : CRI
S; CAD20.00 CAD2.00	CASH PAYMENTS, CAD20.00	GIVEN	CAD2.MA	CASH PRYMENTS: CAD
	GIVEN CAD2.000			given CA

1

. •

838387