
David I. Poch Barrister                                            tel. (613) 264-0055   fax (613) 264-2878 

 
 

 
1649 Old Brooke Road, Maberly, Ontario K0H 2B0                                  e-mail: dpoch@eelaw.ca 
 

20 March 2013 
 
Ontario Energy Board  
2300 Yonge St., 27th Floor 
Toronto, ON 
M4P 1E4 
 
Attn: Ms Kirsten Walli 
Board Secretary 
 
 
By electronic filing and e-mail 
 
Dear Ms Walli: 
 

Re: EB-2012-0037 Union Gas Industrial DSM 2013-14 --  GEC Costs  
 
Attached please find GEC’s cost claim in this matter. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
 
David Poch 
 
Cc: Union Gas 





Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements 

 

File # EB-2012-0337     Process: Union Gas 2013-14 Industrial DSM 

Party: GEC 

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed 

Legal/Consulting fees   $56,716.60 

Disbursements    $2762.76 

HST     $3905.46 

Total Cost Claim   $63,384.82   
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Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB‐ Process: 

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:
Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly 
rate

Subtotal HST

18.70 $170.00 $3,179.00 $413.27
$0.00 $0.00

1.00 $170.00 $170.00 $22.10
7.00 $170.00 $1,190.00 $154.70
1.50 $170.00 $255.00 $33.15

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$4,794.00 $623.22

HSTNet Cost Total

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$3,592.27Preparation
Attendance ‐ Technical Conference
Attendance ‐ Settlement Conference

Total

$0.00
$192.10

Attendance ‐ Oral Hearing
Argument

$1,344.70
$288.15

$0.00Case Management

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

$5,417.22

>20

2012‐0337 Union Gas Industrial DSM Program

Green Energy Coalition Kai Millyard

Completed Years 
Practising/Years of relevant 

experience

HST
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

Travel (Other): $0.00
included

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

Net Cost

Parking $0.00
$0.00
$0.00

Total

$0.00

Taxi or Airport Limo
Accommodation

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

$0.00

Photocopies
Printing
Fax
Courier
Telephone
Postage   
Transcripts

$0.00

Travel: Air
Travel: Car
Travel: Rail

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
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ACCOUNT 

 

 

Date: 07 March 2013 

 

To:  GEC 

 

Re:  EB-2012-0337 Union Gas Large Customer DSM 2013-13  

 

 

For services rendered on behalf of GEC in this matter (see dockets attached)    

 

Fees at OEB tariff for purposes of costs request: 

 

Fees 72.4 hrs. @ $330.00 (see docket) $23,892.00 

Disbursements (see summary)    $1,356.00 

Subtotal       $25,248.00 

HST        $3,282.24 

Total Costs       $28,530.24 

 

This is my account E&OE 

 

 

 

 

David Poch 

 

HST# 11020 1506 

 

 



A B C D E F G

Time Docket for David Poch: EB-2012-0337 Union Gas 2013-14 Industrial DSM

Date Description of work prep hrg tech ADR arg

Aug 31, 2012 Review applic., correspond experts 0.75

Oct 10 review evid., draft Irs 1.25

30

review IRRs, confer Neme. And board staff and 

Ian Mondrow re dates etc., correspond re 

scope of evidence 2.75

Nov 29 t/c Neme re content of evidence, correspond 0.6

Dec 4 confer Neme, review partial draft 0.75

5 review further draft 0.25

14 meet KM 0.5

17 review APPRO evid. And draft Irs 2.75

20

review ED Irs, CN Draft IRS and edit draft GEC 

Irs 0.75

Jan 7, 2013 review GEC draft responses and edits 0.3

10

review final version of responses, read US 

report 0.5

11

review APPrO IRRS, confer CN, draft and file 

Motion, prep for ADR 6

14

prep for ADR, confer KM and CN, correspond 

re motion, confer M. Miller re process 3.25

15

meet re mtion and attend ADR, confer Env. 

Defence 0.75 1

16 correspond re motion, prep cross 1.75

17

prep cross, confer Mondrow re settlement 

potential, confer Neme re: same 2.5

18

prep, confer CN re cross strategy and 

questions 3

23

review updated APPrO IRRS and correspond 

experts, revise cross 1

28

prep cross, confer CN, prep reference book, 

confer counsel for Union, corespond Neme 6

29 prepare written argument 6.25

30 prep, meet Millyard and C Neme 3.5

31

meet Neme, attend, confer other counsel, meet 

Km and Neme re: cross of LDE and Navigant 

etc. 4.25 5.5

Feb 1

confer Neme and other counsel, attend, draft 

argument 0.75 3.5 2

2 review transcript, prep arg 5.5

5

monitor oral arguments, finalize argument and 

submit 4.25

12 reaview Union reply arg, report 0.5

TOTAL HOURS  72.4 44.4 9 1 18



Disbursements David Poch - GEC File: EB-2012-0337

excl HST unless noted

Category Date Description Amount Net of GST

Air/Train Jan 14-2013 Airfare Ottawa-Toronto 89.12

15 Airfare Toronto-Ottawa 398.12

Jan 30-Feb 1 Rail fare Kingston-Toronto ret. 182

669.24

Mileage @.4 Jan 14-15 Maberly-Ottawa airport ret 200km 80

incl HST Jan 30-Feb 1 Maberly-Kingston ret 200km 80

160

Parking Jan 14-15 at Ottawa Airport 16.81

Jan 30-Feb 1 at Via Kingston 15.93

32.74

Taxis/limos Jan 14 Airport to hotel 29.25

incl HST Jan 31 from meeting w. experts 11.5

subtotal 40.75 36.06

Accomodation Jan 14 116.99

Jan 30-Feb 1 279.98

396.97

Meals (@ max8.75/11.25/20)

incl HST Jan 15 10.72

Jan 30-Feb 1 11.25

20

6.95

20

subtotal 68.92 60.99

TOTAL NET OF HST 1,356.00

















Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Green Energy Coalition Invoice # 627

Attn: David Poch Invoice Date: November 4, 2012

dpoch@eelaw.ca
Invoice Period: October 1-31, 2012

Job Name: Union Large Industrials
2013-14

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours Amount

Chris Neme 1014 00 00 $270 9.00 2,430.00$

-$

Subtotal Labor only 9.00 2,430.00$

Item Code Miles Rate Amount

Chris Neme 1014 00 00 0 0.555$ -$

Chris Neme 1014 00 00 -$

-$

Subtotal Expenses/Mileage only -$

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE USD 2,430.00$

Invoice



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 627

Job Code: 1014

Job Name: Union Large Industrials 2013-14

Period: October 1-31, 2012

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

10/01/12 00 00 0.50 review Union large industrials proposal, discuss w/GEC

10/08/12 00 00 3.75 Review Union large industrials filing and historic materials, draft interrogatories

10/09/12 00 00 1.50 Finalize Union interrogatories, GEC communications on strategy

10/11/12 00 00 1.00 Review other data requests, GEC communications

10/26/12 00 00 0.75 Review Union interrogatory responses

10/30/12 00 00 1.50 Research, GEC discussions on testimony

Total 9.00

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Green Energy Coalition Invoice # 650

Attn: David Poch Invoice Date: December 4, 2012

dpoch@eelaw.ca
Invoice Period: November 1-30, 2012

Job Name: Union Large Industrials
2013-14

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours Amount

Chris Neme 1014 00 00 $270 6.50 1,755.00$

-$

Subtotal Labor only 6.50 1,755.00$

Item Code Miles Rate Amount

Chris Neme 1014 00 00 0 0.555$ -$

Chris Neme 1014 00 00 -$

-$

Subtotal Expenses/Mileage only -$

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE USD 1,755.00$

Invoice



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 650

Job Code: 1014

Job Name: Union Large Industrials 2013-14

Period: November 1-30, 2012

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

11/26/12 00 00 1.50 work on Union testimony

11/27/12 00 00 2.00 review Union evidence, work on testimony

11/28/12 00 00 2.00 work on Union testimony

11/29/12 00 00 1.00 work on Union testimony

Total 6.50

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Green Energy Coalition Invoice # 672

Attn: David Poch Invoice Date: January 7, 2013

dpoch@eelaw.ca
Invoice Period: December 1-31, 2012

Job Name: Union Large Industrials
2013-14

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours Amount

Chris Neme 1014 00 00 $270 41.00 11,070.00$

-$

Subtotal Labor only 41.00 11,070.00$

Item Code Miles Rate Amount

Chris Neme 1014 00 00 0 0.555$ -$

Chris Neme 1014 00 00 -$

-$

Subtotal Expenses/Mileage only -$

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE USD 11,070.00$

Invoice



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 672

Job Code: 1014

Job Name: Union Large Industrials 2013-14

Period: December 1-31, 2012

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

12/03/12 00 00 5.50 work on Union testimony

12/04/12 00 00 8.50 work on Union testimony

12/05/12 00 00 8.00 work on Union testimony

12/06/12 00 00 6.50 work on Union testimony

12/07/12 00 00 7.50 work on Union testimony

12/14/12 00 00 1.25 final testimony review/revisions

12/19/12 00 00 2.00 Review APPrO evidence, draft interrogatories

12/20/12 00 00 1.75 finalize interrogatories for APPrO, review other interrogatories

Total 41.00

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Green Energy Coalition Invoice # 695

Attn: David Poch Invoice Date: February 6, 2013

dpoch@eelaw.ca
Invoice Period: January 1-31, 2013

Job Name: Union Large Industrials
2013-14

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours Amount

Chris Neme 1014 00 00 $280 30.00 8,400.00$

-$

Subtotal Labor only 30.00 8,400.00$

Item Code Miles Rate Amount

Chris Neme 1014 00 00 220 0.565$ 124.30$

Chris Neme 1014 00 00 1,282.46$

-$

Subtotal Expenses/Mileage only 1,406.76$

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE USD 9,806.76$

Invoice



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 695

Job Code: 1014

Job Name: Union Large Industrials 2013-14

Period: January 1-31, 2013

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

01/02/13 00 00 0.50 research on multi-year approaches to self-direct

01/03/13 00 00 1.50 research on multi-year approaches to self-direct

01/07/13 00 00 1.00 Draft interrogatory responses, communications w/GEC

01/11/13 00 00 3.50

review APPRO IR responses, discuss follow up w/GEC, assist with prep for cross and
settlement

01/15/13 00 00 1.00 follow up with GEC on ADR discussions

01/23/13 00 00 0.50 Review APPrO revised IR responses, GEC communications

01/28/13 00 00 1.00 prep for standing cross

01/29/13 00 00 2.50 prep for standing cross

01/30/13 00 00 9.00 prep for standing cross, assist with prep for GEC cross of other witnesses & argument

01/31/13 00 00 9.50 prep for cross, stand cross, help prep for cross of APPRO witnesses

Total 30.00

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 695

Job Number: 1014

Job Name: Union Large Industrials 2013-14 Note: Canadian Expenses were not converted to US Dollars since the two

currencies were close to par.
Period: January 1-31, 2013

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Miles Rate Amount Task Description

01/30/13 00 00 220.00 0.565 124.30$ travel to/from Montreal airport (for flight to Toronto)

01/30/13 00 00 - 0.000 4.57$ breakfast during travel to Toronto

01/30/13 00 00 - 0.000 32.00$ taxi from Toronto airport to Best Western Roehampton hotel

01/30/13 00 00 - 0.000 20.00$ working dinner (prep for cross)

01/31/13 00 00 - 0.000 20.00$ working dinner (prep for cross)

02/01/13 00 00 - 0.000 316.38$ hotel (2 nights)

02/01/13 00 00 - 0.000 30.00$ taxi to Toronto airport

02/01/13 00 00 - 0.000 60.00$ montreal airport parking

01/30/13 00 00 - 0.000 799.51$ montreal-toronto roundtrip airfare

Total 220 1,406.76$

Expense Description











Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Green Energy Coalition Invoice # 720

Attn: David Poch Invoice Date: March 6, 2013

dpoch@eelaw.ca
Invoice Period: February 1-28, 2013

Job Name: Union Large Industrials
2013-14

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours Amount

Chris Neme 1014 00 00 $280 13.00 3,640.00$

-$

Subtotal Labor only 13.00 3,640.00$

Item Code Miles Rate Amount

Chris Neme 1014 00 00 0 0.565$ -$

Chris Neme 1014 00 00 -$

-$

Subtotal Expenses/Mileage only -$

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE USD 3,640.00$

Invoice



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 720

Job Code: 1014

Job Name: Union Large Industrials 2013-14

Period: February 1-28, 2013

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

02/01/13 00 00 9.00 assist in prep for cross of APPrO, participate in hearing, follow up on argument

02/04/13 00 00 4.00 edits/additions to draft GEC argument

Total 13.00

Task Description



Kai Millyard
72 Regal Road, Toronto, ON, M6H 2K1 

kai@web.ca
GST# R134260793RT00001

416 651-7141

STATEMENT       

Date: March 11, 2013

Invoice# E12-337

To: GEC, c/o  David Poch

Re: Time on Union Gas Industrial DSM Filing

Item Amount
                                                                                                                                                          
28.5 hours, Case Management & Analyst services
See docket attached. 

@$170/h    $ 4,794.00
                                                                                                                                                          
SubTotal $ 4,794.00

13% HST:  $ 623.22

TOTAL: $ 5,417.22

Please make cheque payable to “Kai Millyard”.

Mail to address above.

Thank you.



Time Docket
for Kai Millyard EB-2012-0337

Union Industrial DSM Program

Date Prep Research Attend Arg Item
05-Dec-12 3.4         assist Neme
09-Dec-12 1.6         review evidence draft
11-Dec-12 2.5         finalize & file evidence
15-Dec-12 0.4         review evidence
21-Dec-12 2.0         finalize & file IRs
10-Jan-13 2.5         finalize & file IR replies
14-Jan-13 0.3         ADR prep
15-Jan-13 1.5         1.0         ADR 
30-Jan-13 3.2         hearing prep
31-Jan-13 0.3         7.0         Hearing Day 1
02-Feb-13 1.5         review & comment draft arg

1.0         Review Decision
TOTAL 13.7            5.0              8.0              1.5              28.2                                                                   
@$170/h 2,329.00$   850.00$      1,360.00$   255.00$      4,794.00$                                                          



Résumé

Mr. Kai Millyard
72 Regal Road 
Toronto, ON
M6H 2K1
416-651-7141    Fax: 416-651-4659    Email: kai@web.ca

Kai Millyard is an independent energy and environmental consultant.

EXPERIENCE Since 1991, President, Kai Millyard Associates.

Mr Millyard is a leader in energy efficiency policy and program design in
Canada.  With extensive experience of over 25 years working for
governments, utilities and non-government organizations, Mr Millyard’s
strengths span the full range from broad policy to detailed implementation  

PROJECTS & ACCOMPLISHMENTS

In 2011 Project Manager of a team developing energy audits, manuals,
software and training materials and program for the Ontario Power
Authority’s Home Assistance Program. This electric utility energy
efficiency program will provide audits and retrofits for low income single
family homes and apartments throughout Ontario. 

From 1998 to 2008 Quality Assurance Manager for Green Communities
Canada supporting their EnerGuide for Houses home auditing service. 
Oversight over energy auditor training, technical support, quality
assurance, database design and management, consumer incentive
authorizations. 

In January 2010 designed and oversaw implementation of an online
application to streamline Ecoenergy auditor submissions for quality
assurance for Green Communities Canada.  Application improved quality
of files, speed of submission and significantly reduced labour time. 

Selected as a member of the Demand Side Management Audit and
Evaluation Committees of both Enbridge Gas Distribution in 2008 and
Union Gas 2008-present. The Committees oversee audits of energy
savings programs and advise on evaluation projects and program design
improvements.  

In 2006 and 2007 led a team at Green Communities Canada that designed,
pilot tested and evaluated an energy efficiency program providing audits
and retrofits of houses of low income families in Ontario for the Ontario
Power Authority. 

Has served since 1993 as Case Manager and analyst for the Green Energy
Coalition in many gas and electric utility rate cases before the Ontario
Energy Board.  The primary issues addressed are energy efficiency policy
and the utilities’ energy efficiency programs. 

Technical Advisor for the Clean Air Consumer Guide in 2002 through
2006.  Published annually by the Clean Air Partnership of the City of
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Toronto, the Guide was distributed to hundreds of thousands of
households with advice on energy efficiency products and services. 

At Natural Resources Canada’s request, reviewed early Quality Assurance
guidelines for Energuide for Houses advisors and prepared a full QA
Protocol which has been used for many years to oversee the quality of all
Energuide for Houses (later EcoEnergy) audits across Canada.

In 2003 advised Natural Resources Canada on the design of its homeowner
incentive program based on the EnerGuide for Houses rating system.  This
followed Mr Millyard having designed the system for Green Communities
Canada in an earlier pilot project.  The system was adopted by the federal
government for use in meeting Canada’s Kyoto objectives. 

Director of Home Performance Services, Green Communities Association.
Led the development of the EnerGuide for Houses home energy rating
system business throughout Ontario on behalf of Ontario's Green
Communities.  Included building relationships with utilities, municipalities,
governments and private companies.  Green Communities are non-profit,
community based multi-stakeholder organizations offering environmental
conservation services to households and communities throughout Canada. 

September 1996: Completed a Ventilation & Draftproofing training
protocol document for Green$aver assessors that explains the building
science of air movement, draftproofing opportunities and how to determine
when a house requires additional mechanical ventilation.

In 1995 led a team which produced a training manual for the Ontario
Ministry of the Environment for Green Community auditors, which is an
extensive catalogue of backgrounders on the application criteria, costs and
benefits of the many measures assessors may recommend in homes.

Participated in the 1994 Conservation Strategies Consortium project for the
City of Toronto designing an energy and water conservation pilot program
which became Toronto’s Better Buildings Partnership.

In spring 1994 completed a design for a non-profit water and energy
conservation retrofit service for the residential sector in Toronto, which
became Green$aver.  Completed projects for Green$aver on areas
including monitoring & evaluation, utility bill analysis, database design,
advisor training, measures development, and new business development. 
In 1997 served as the General Manager during a transitional period.

Policy Advisor and Case Manager for the Coalition of Environmental
Groups in the Ontario Energy Board case over Least-Cost Integrated
Resource Planning for Ontario's gas utilities in 1991/92.  This hearing
process established the framework for the gas utilities energy conservation
programs which continue today.

Policy Advisor and project manager to Friends of the Earth for 3 years in
its intervention in the Environmental Assessment Board's hearings into
Ontario Hydro's Demand/Supply Plan.  This involved commissioning and
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overseeing ~50 studies reviewing electricity system planning issues.

Developed an automobile feebate policy simulation model in 1992.  This
model simulates how applying differing fees and rebates to sales of new
cars based on fuel economy will modify purchasing patterns, increase
average auto fleet fuel economy, reduce gasoline use and CO2 emissions,
and change net government tax revenues.

Completed a Preliminary CO2 Emissions Inventory for the City of Ottawa
in 1992.  The project included a survey of municipal energy policy options
for reducing emissions.

January-June 1991: Policy Advisor to the Ontario Global Warming
Coalition project which prepared Degrees of Change: Steps Towards an
Ontario Global Warming Strategy, published by the Ontario Ministry of
Energy June 1991.

1986-1995: Vice-Chairman of the Ontario government's MISA Advisory
Committee which advised the Minister of the Environment on proposed
water pollution regulations.

At Friends of the Earth:

! As Policy Director for 5 years, developed and launched
the organization's Global Warming and Energy program. 
The program included projects analyzing both regulatory
and fiscal policy options for dealing with automobile
energy efficiency, commercial and residential building
energy efficiency and utility demand management
policy.

! Mr. Millyard also developed and launched Global
ReLeaf in 1990, a program that promoted urban forestry
solutions to global warming.  Research and education
activities included studying and promoting the energy
conservation potential and benefits of urban tree
planting.

At Pollution Probe:

! National Affairs Researcher in Ottawa in 1988, and
Researcher in Toronto from 1982 to 1987.

! Developed policies on a wide variety of environmental
issues, including acid rain, hazardous waste, municipal
waste management, and various water quality issues. 
Managed legal interventions and other activities in New
York State pertaining to protection of the Niagara River.

! Published policy papers, articles and briefs on these
subjects, and appeared before federal and provincial
legislative committees.
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BOARDS & COMMITTEES 

! Board member of the Ontario Clean Air Alliance 2008-
present.

! Founding member and Director of the Canadian Energy
Efficiency Alliance, established in 1995 as a multi-
stakeholder organization promoting the efficient use of
energy in Canada.

! Appointed by the Ontario Government in November
1986 to the MISA Advisory Committee, appointed Vice-
Chairman 1989.

! Board of Governors of the Canadian Coalition on Acid
Rain (1982-87).  

! Board Member of the Urban Environment Centre, a non-
profit community organization, which owns and operates
Green$aver, Toronto’s residential energy and water
conservation service (1993-2003).

! Founding member and served on the Board of Great
Lakes United, an international coalition dedicated to
protecting the Lakes (1982-87).  

SELECTED PUBLICATIONS

Final Report, The Ontario Power Authority’s Low Income Single Family Homes Retrofit Pilot
Project, February 2008, for Green Communities Canada.
Shareholder Incentives for Gas DSM: Experience with One Canadian Utility, with Chris Neme,
2004 Proceedings of ACEEE Summer Study of Energy Efficiency in Buildings, Asilomar,
California.
Enbridge Consumers Gas F2000 DSM Audit SSM Replication, Final Report, July 2002, for Audit
Committee of Enbridge Consumers Gas.  Supporting the annual savings audit at Enbridge was an
annual assignment in 2003, 2004, 2005 and 2006. In 2007 Mr Millyard changed roles and was
selected to be a member of the Audit and Evaluation Committee, supervising the annual energy
savings audit.  He has been selected to serve in the same capacity in supervising the audits of
Union Gas DSM results since 2007 as well.  
Home Performance Rewards Pilot Project, Final Report, March 2002, Evaluated the Peterborough
Pilot project which provided homeowner incentives using the EnerGuide for Houses system.  For
Ontario Ministry of Environment, and Enbridge Gas. 
Mega-EA Hearings: Thoughts from the front... July 1993. This report, for the Canadian
Environmental Law Association, was based on the experiences of citizens and their lawyers in
long hearings, and about how Ontario's Environmental Assessment hearings might be kept
shorter.
A Preliminary CO2 Inventory for the City of Ottawa, February 1992, for the Department of
Engineering and Works.
A Preliminary Assessment of the Impact of Proposed Changes to the Ontario Tax for Fuel
Conservation, for the Ontario Global Warming Coalition, April 1992.
The Heat Trap: The threat posed by rising levels of greenhouse gases, Friends of the Earth,
120pp. November 1989.  Editor. 
Lead in 1988: More Urgent than Ever, Canadian Coalition for Lead-Free Gasoline, June 1988.
This brief persuaded the federal government to remove lead from gasoline by 1990.
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Up the Stack, and into the foodbasket; dioxins and incineration, Pollution Probe Foundation, May
1986.
Down the Pipe: A Review of Water Pollution Control in Ontario, Pollution Probe Foundation,
July 1986.
Optical Flashes in Perseus, Astrophysical Journal, University of Chicago Press, August  1986.
The Acid Rain Primer, revision, Pollution Probe, 1985.

FORMAL EDUCATION

University of Toronto 1979-80.  
Courses included Environmental Geography, Life on Other Worlds (astrophysics/biology), fourth
year Environmental Research - finished top of class.

October 2011


