Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

			Instruct	ions		
- Required d	ata input is	indicated by yellow-shaded fi	elds. Formulas are pr	esent in the document to	assist with the calculation	of the cost claim.
- All claims n	nust be in (Canadian dollars. If applicable,	state exchange rate a	and country of intial curre	encv.	
			Rate:	and document of metal carry	Country:	
- A separate	"Detail of I	Fees and Disbursements Being	Claimed" (comprising	a "Statement of Fees Be		nent of
		laimed" is required for each co				
Disbursemen	nts" coveri	ng the whole of the party's cos	claim should be prov	vided.		
		e supported by a completed Af		[10][[[[[[[]]]]][[[[]]][[[]]][[[]][[]][[
	n consultar	nt must be attached unless, for	a given consultant, a	CV has been provided to	the Board in another proc	ess within the last
24 months Except as p	rovided in	section 7.03 of the Practice D	irection on Cost Awa	rds, itemized receipts m	ust he provided	
					ast se provided.	
File # EB-	2012-00	031		Process: Applica	tion - Hydro One Netw	orks Inc.
Party:	Consum	ners Council of Canada		Affiant'	s Name: Robert B. Wa	rren
HST Numb	er:	140609165	Walter Hall		HST Rate Ontario:	13
		Full Registrant		Q	ualifying Non-Profit	
		Unregistered			Tax Exempt	
		Other				
			Affida	vit		
l,		Robert B. Warren	of the City of		Toront	to
in the Provi	nce/State	of Ontario		, swear o	or affirm that:	
1. I am a rep	resentativ	e of the above-noted party (the	e "Party") and as such	have knowledge of the	matters attested to herein.	
2. I have exa	mined all	of the documentation in suppo	rt of this cost claim, in	ncluding the attached "Si	ummary of Fees and Disbur	sements Being
) of Fees being Claimed" and "				
		ary of Fees and Disbursements				
		only costs incurred and time s	pent directly for the p	ourposes of the Party's pa	articipation in the Ontario E	nergy Board
A This cost		ove. not include any costs for work	done or time spent	by a norson that is an om	anloyed or officer of the Da	rtu as dasseibad in
		of the Board's Practice Direction		by a person that is an en	ipioyee or officer of the Pa	rty as described in
()	/		ii oii cost Awarus.			
1 Cul	M121	lu				
Signature of	of Affiant	i .				
Sworn or a	ffirmed l	pefore me at the City/Tow	n of	Toronto		
in the Prov			Ontario	, on	14-Jun-13	
					(date) .	
	. A					
	p	val L:				
Commissio	ner for t	aking Affidavits		*		

FARAH MALIK

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements



File # EB-	2012-0031		Process: Application - Hydro One Networks Inc.
Party:	Consumers Council of	Canada	_
		Summary of Fees and Disburse	ements Being Claimed
Legal/cons	sultant fees	\$56,529.00	
Disbursem	ents	\$0.00	
HST		\$7,348.77	
Total Cost	Claim	\$63,877.77	-

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS Detail of Fees and Disbursements being Claimed



File # EB-	2012-0031		Application - Hydro One N	letworks Inc.	
Party:	Consumers Council of Canada		Name: Robert B. Warren, WeirFo	oulds LLP	
			Completed Year Practising/Years of re experience		
Cour	nsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:	7	35		
	Consultant:				
	CV attached:		CV not required:	v	

	Stat	ement of I	Fees Being Claim	ned	
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total
Preparation	63.5	\$330.00	\$20,955.00	\$2,724.15	\$23,679.15
Attendance - Technical conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference	5.3	\$330.00	\$1,749.00	\$227.37	\$1,976.37
Attendance - Oral Hearing		\$330.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Argument		\$330.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES			\$22,704.00	\$2,951.52	\$25,655.52

		Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies			\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing			\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax			\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier			\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone			\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage			\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts			\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air			\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car			\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail			\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other)	:		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking			included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airpor	t Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodati	on		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals			\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:	Cerlox Binding (in house)		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBUR	RSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS Detail of Fees and Disbursements being Claimed



File # EB-	EB-2012-0033		Process: Application - Hydro One N	Networks Inc.	
Party:	Consumers Council of Canada		Name: Julie Girvan, J.E. Girvan Enterprises		
			Completed Year Practising/Years of re experience		
Cou	nsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:				
	Consultant:	\square	20+		
	CV attached:		CV not required:	Ø	

	Stat	ement of	Fees Being Claim	ed	
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total
Preparation	70.00	\$330.00	\$23,100.00	\$3,003.00	\$26,103.00
Attendance - Technical conference	0.00	\$330.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference	15.00	\$330.00	\$4,950.00	\$643.50	\$5,593.50
Attendance - Oral Hearing	5.00	\$330.00	\$1,650.00	\$214.50	\$1,864.50
Argument	12.50	\$330.00	\$4,125.00	\$536.25	\$4,661.25
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES			\$33,825.00	\$4,397.25	\$38,222.25

		Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies			\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing (bindi	ng)		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax			\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier			\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone			\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage			\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts			\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air			\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car			\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail			\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):			\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking			included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport	Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation	on		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals			\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:	Online legal research		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBUR	SEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.0

INVOICE

TO: Consumers Council of Canada

201-1920 Yonge Street

Toronto, ON M4S 3E2

FROM:

Julie E. Girvan J. E. Girvan Enterprises 62 Hillsdale Avenue East Toronto, Ontario M4S 1T5

GST # 135678944

FOR:

Consulting Services Regarding the Ontario Energy Board Proceeding – Hydro One Networks Inc. – Transmission Revenue Requirement – 2013-2014, EB-2012-0031

DATE:

June 13, 2013

DATE	DESCRIPTION OF ACTIVITY	HOURS	P/AT/AR
July 17	Reviewing evidence	4.5	Р
July 20	Reviewing evidence	5	Р
July 25	Reviewing evidence	2.5	Р
Aug 24	Reviewing evidence/historical materials	6	Р
Aug 28	Reviewing evidence	2	Р
Aug 29	Reviewing updates	3	P
Aug 31	Reviewing evidence	2	Р
Sept 3	Drafting interrogatories	4	Р
Sept 4	Drafting interrogatories	3	Р
Sept 5	Drafting interrogatories	4	Р
Oct 8	Reviewing evidence	2.5	Р
Oct 9	Reviewing answers	6	Р

Oct 16	Reviewing TC transcript	3	Р
Oct 17	Preparing for ADR	4	Р
Oct 19	Preparing for ADR	4	Р
Oct 22	Preparing for ADR	2	Р
Oct 23	Attendance at ADR	6	AT-ADR
Oct 24	Attendance at ADR	6.5	AT-ADR
Oct 26	Attendance at ADR	2.5	AT-ADR
Nov 1	Reviewing agreement/notes	1.5	Р
Nov 2	Reviewing comments	1	Р
Jan18	Reviewing ETS evidence and joint statement/notes	4.5	Р
Feb 20	Reviewing evidence/notes for hearing	4	Р
Feb 24	Reviewing evidence and notes for hearing	1.5	Р
Feb 25	Attendance at hearing	5	AT-H
March 6	Reviewing transcripts	3	AR
March 7	Reviewing transcripts/outline for argument	2.5	AR
March 15	Reviewing evidence for argument / discussions with intervenors	3.5	AR
March 19	Argument	1.5	AR
March 22	Argument	2	AR
0	TOTAL HOURS	102.5	

P - 70 AT-ADR - 15 AT- H - 5 AR - 12.5

 102.5 x \$330/hour
 \$33,825.00

 plus 13 % HST
 \$ 4,397.25

 TOTAL AMOUNT DUE:
 \$38,222.25

Worked between 06/15/2012 thru 06/14/2013

		Description Notes				Hours Rate
Date Worked Work Status	Entry No.	Codes				Dollars
Warren, Robert: 4 10606: Consumers Council Of Canada 10606.00047: Hydro One Transmission 06/28/2012	1					
6/28/2012 3:32:51 PM	1616975	Review notice of application,	prepare and file	letter of intervention	n;	0.10
						330.00
						33.00
Total For 06/28/2012			Hours	0.10	Dollars	33.00
08/15/2012						
8/15/2012 Billed 11:20:12 AM	1501311	Review evidence updates				2.10
						330.00 693.00
Total For 08/15/2012			Hours	2.10	Dollars	693.00
08/16/2012			riours	2.10	Dollars	033.00
8/16/2012 Billed	1501731	Review pre-filed evidence;				3.10
11:20:12 AM	177.11.7					0.10
						330.00
						1,023.00
Total For 08/16/2012 08/17/2012			Hours	3.10	Dollars	1,023.00
8/17/2012 Billed 11:20:12 AM	1501738	Review pre-filed evidence;				1.80
						330.00
						594.00
Total For 08/17/2012			Hours	1.80	Dollars	594.00
08/20/2012	4504740	D- i 61-1 i1				4.00
8/20/2012 Billed 11:20:12 AM	1501743	Review pre-filed evidence;				1.90
						330.00
						627.00
Total For 08/20/2012			Hours	1.90	Dollars	627.00
08/21/2012	4504750	Davis and Filed and Income				
8/21/2012 Billed 11:20:12 AM	1501750	Review pre-filed evidence;				1.10
						330.00
						363.00
Total For 08/21/2012			Hours	1.10	Dollars	363.00
08/22/2012 8/22/2012 Billed 11:20:12 AM	1501754	Review pre-filed evidence;				1.50
9000 573 D. S. 6 6 75 (5 6 6 6 6 7).						330.00
						495.00

Worked between 06/15/2012 thru 06/14/2013

		Description Notes				Hours Rate
Date Worked Work Status	Entry No.	Codes				Dollars
Warren, Robert: 4 10606: Consumers Council Of Canada 10606.00047: Hydro One Transmission 08/22/2012						
Total For 08/22/2012			Hours	1.50	Dollars	495.00
08/28/2012 8/28/2012 Billed 11:32:22 AM	1499516	Review pre-filed evidence;				2.20
						330.00
						726.00
Total For 08/28/2012			Hours	2.20	Dollars	726.00
08/29/2012						
8/29/2012 Billed 11:32:22 AM	1499557	Review pre-filed evidence;				1.90
						330.00
						627.00
Total For 08/29/2012			Hours	1.90	Dollars	627.00
08/30/2012						
8/30/2012 Billed 11:20:12 AM	1501766	Review pre-filed evidence;				3.50
						330.00 1,155.00
T-1-1 F 00/00/0040						
Total For 08/30/2012			Hours	3.50	Dollars	1,155.00
08/31/2012 8/31/2012 Billed 11:20:12 AM	1501773	Review pre-filed evidence;				2.50
						330.00
						825.00
Total For 08/31/2012			Hours	2.50	Dollars	825.00
09/07/2012						
9/7/2012 Billed 11:26:08 AM	1512786	Review pre-filed evidence;				3.20
						330.00
						1,056.00
Total For 09/07/2012			Hours	3.20	Dollars	1,056.00
09/29/2012						
9/29/2012 Billed 11:26:08 AM	1512789	Review IR responses;				2.30
						330.00
						759.00
Total For 09/29/2012			Hours	2.30	Dollars	759.00
09/30/2012						

Worked between 06/15/2012 thru 06/14/2013

		Description Notes				Hours Rate
Date Worked Work Status	Entry No.	Codes				Dollars
Warren, Robert: 4						
10606: Consumers Council Of Canada 10606.00047: Hydro One Transmission 09/30/2012						
9/30/2012 Billed 11:26:08 AM	1512798	Review interrogatory responses;				2.60
						330.00
						858.00
Total For 09/30/2012			Hours	2.60	Dollars	858.00
10/01/2012						
10/1/2012 Billed 10:33:16 AM	1517441	Review responses to interrogato	ries;			3.50
						330.00
						1,155.00
Total For 10/01/2012			Hours	3.50	Dollars	1,155.00
10/02/2012						
10/2/2012 Billed 10:33:16 AM	1517436	Review pre-filed evidence;				3.50
						330.00
						1,155.00
Total For 10/02/2012			Hours	3.50	Dollars	1,155.00
10/03/2012						
10/3/2012 Billed 10:33:16 AM	1517433	Review interrogatory responses;				3.90
						330.00
						1,287.00
Total For 10/03/2012			Hours	3.90	Dollars	1,287.00
10/04/2012		<u> </u>				
10/4/2012 Billed 10:33:16 AM	1517428	Review interrogatory responses;				3.90
						330.00
						1,287.00
10/4/2012 Billed 10:33:16 AM	1517429	Review intervenor evidence;				0.20
						330.00
						66.00
Total For 10/04/2012			Hours	4.10	Dollars	1,353.00
10/05/2012						
10/5/2012 Billed 10:33:16 AM	1517416	Review interrogatory responses;				4.50
						330.00
						1,485.00

Worked between 06/15/2012 thru 06/14/2013

Date worked		Description				Hours
D. W. L. W. L.		Notes				Rate
Date Worked Work Status	Entry No.	Codes				Dollars
Warren, Robert: 4 10606: Consumers Council Of Canada 10606.00047: Hydro One Transmission						
10/05/2012 10/5/2012 Billed	1517419	Review intervenor evidence	e;			1.50
10:33:16 AM						330.00
						495.00
Total For 10/05/2012			Hours	6.00	Dollars	1,980.00
10/08/2012						
10/8/2012 Billed 10:34:48 AM	1517401	Review interrogatory response	onses;			3.90
						330.00
						1,287.00
Total For 10/08/2012			Hours	3.90	Dollars	1,287.00
10/09/2012						
10/9/2012 Billed 11:27:27 AM	1525793	Review pre-filed evidence conference; e-mail to D. R	and interrogatory resogers;	sponses for technic	al	1.10
						330.00
						363.00
Total For 10/09/2012 10/10/2012			Hours	1.10	Dollars	363.00
10/10/2012 10/10/2012 Billed 11:27:27 AM	1525798	Review pre-filed evidence conference;	dence and interrogatory responses for technical			2.10
						330.00
						693.00
Total For 10/10/2012			Hours	2.10	Dollars	693.00
10/11/2012 10/11/2012 Billed	1525801	Email from D. Rogers re: to	echnical conference	questions:		0.10
11:27:27 AM	1020001	Email from B. Rogoro To. R	sommour comercine	questions,		0.10
						330.00
						33.00
Total For 10/11/2012			Hours	0.10	Dollars	33.00
10/18/2012 10/18/2012 Billed	1525780	Email to and from D. Roge	re re: technical conf	oronco guestions:		0.30
11:27:27 AM	1323760	Email to and nom D. Noge	is re. tecimical com	erence questions,		0.30
						330.00
						99.00
Total For 10/18/2012			Hours	0.30	Dollars	99.00
10/19/2012 10/19/2012 Billed 11:27:27 AM	1525782	Review transcript of techni	cal conference;			1.10
The same for the first NATA						330.00
						363.00
						505.00

Worked between 06/15/2012 thru 06/14/2013

Dute nonett		D				
		Description Notes				Hours
Date Worked Work Status	Entry No.					Rate Dollars
Warren, Robert: 4						Donurs
10606: Consumers Council Of Canada						
10606.00047: Hydro One Transmission						
10/19/2012 Total For 10/19/2012			Harrie	4.40	_	
			Hours	1.10	Dollars	363.00
10/22/2012 10/22/2012 Billed	1524850	Review of technical conferer	and transprint: pro	paration for authorities		2.00
10:44:19 AM	1324030	conference;	ice transcript, pre	paration for settlen	ient	2.90
						330.00
						957.00
Total For 10/22/2012			Hours	2.90	Dollars	957.00
10/23/2012						
10/23/2012 Billed 10:44:19 AM	1524859	Attend settlement conference	e;			5.30
						330.00
						1,749.00
Total For 10/23/2012			Hours	5.30	Dollars	1,749.00
01/16/2013						
1/16/2013 Work-In-Process 12:00:00 AM	1561488	Review of joint experts state	ment;			1.00
						330.00
						330.00
Total For 01/16/2013			Hours	1.00	Dollars	330.00
01/22/2013						
1/22/2013 Work-In-Process 12:00:00 AM	1561511	Letter to Ontario Energy Boa	ara re: procedure	for witness panel o	f experts;	0.20
						330.00
						66.00
Total For 01/22/2013			Hours	0.20	Dollars	66.00
Total For 10606.00047: Hydro One Tran	smission		Hours	68.80	Dollars	22,704.00
Total For 10606: Consumers Council O	f Canada		Hours	68.80	Dollars	22,704.00
Total For Warren, Robert: 4			Hours	68.80	Dollars	22,704.00
Report Totals			Hours	68.80	Dollars	22,704.00