
 

 

Association of Major Power Consumers in Ontario 
www.ampco.org 

372 Bay Street, Suite 1702 P. 416-260-0280 

Toronto, Ontario M5H 2W9 F. 416-260-0442 

  

June 15, 2013 

 

Ms. Kirsten Walli 

Board Secretary 

Ontario Energy Board 

P.O. Box 2319, 27th Floor 

2300 Yonge Street 

Toronto, ON  M4P 1E4 

 

Re:  Hydro One Networks Inc. 

  2013-2014 Transmission Rates Application 

  AMPCO Cost Claim 

  Board File No. EB-2012-0031 

 

Dear Ms. Walli: 

 

Attached please find AMPCO’s cost claim in the above proceeding.  AMPCO acknowledges the filing date for 

cost claims was June 14, 2013, and respectfully asks that the Board please accept its cost claim.   

 

Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have any questions or require further information. 

 

Sincerely yours, 

 

(ORIGINAL SIGNED) 

 

Adam White 

President 

Association of Major Power Consumers in Ontario 

 

Copy to:  Hydro One Networks Inc. 

 



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Rate: Country:

File #  EB- Process: 

Party: Affiant's Name:

13.00%

Full Registrant Qualifying Non-Profit
Unregistered Tax Exempt

Other

I, , of the City/Town of

in the Province/State of , swear or affirm that:

    

Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of ,

in the Province/State of , on .

   

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost 

claim.  Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other 

parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order.  Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is 

signed and sworn or affirmed.

Toronto

- Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are present in the document to assist with the calculation of the 

cost claim.

Instructions

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party. 

- All claims must be in Canadian dollars.   If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.

Affidavit

1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.

Toronto

R137667424

AMPCO

Adam White

2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements 

Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".

Ontario

- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of 

Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each consultant or lawyer/articling student/paralegal.  However, only one  

Hydro One Networks Inc. 2013 & 2014 Tx Rates

HST Rate Ontario:

EB-2012-0031

"Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.

HST Number:

Adam White

- A CV for each consultant must be attached unless, for a given consultant, a CV has been provided to the Board in another process 

within the last 24 months.

4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as 

described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

Ontario
(date)

Commissioner for taking Affidavits

Signature of Affiant

3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of 

Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the 

Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.
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COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS  
Final Summary of Fees and Disbursements  
 
File # EB-2012-0031 Process: Hydro One Networks Inc.  

2013 & 2014 Transmission Rates 
Party: AMPCO (D. Crocker, S. Robicheau, P. Punjabi, W. Clark, S. Grice) 

 
Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed 
Legal/consultant fees $76,995.50 
Disbursements $     927.22 
HST $10,129.96 
Total Cost Claim $88,052.68 
 



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB- Process: 

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly 

rate
Subtotal HST

48.40 $330.00 $15,972.00 $2,076.36

6.50 $330.00 $2,145.00 $278.85

22.20 $330.00 $7,326.00 $952.38

2.50 $330.00 $825.00 $107.25

4.00 $330.00 $1,320.00 $171.60

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$27,588.00 $3,586.44

HST

$1.37

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$3.87

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Travel (Other): $2.30

included

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.16

$7.70

2012-0031 Hydro One Networks Inc. 2013 & 2014 Tx Rates

AMPCO David Crocker Davis LLP

Completed Years 

Practising/Years of relevant 

experience

38

Taxi $20.00

$0.00

$0.00

$11.87

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

$31,174.44

$0.00

$0.00

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone

Postage   

$29.80

Transcripts

Photocopies

Attendance - Oral Hearing

Argument

$932.25

$1,491.60

$0.00Case Management

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$18,048.36Preparation

Attendance - Technical Conference

Attendance - Settlement Conference

Total

$2,423.85

$8,278.38

$0.00

$1.41

$146.60

Meals

Binding

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other: $1.25

$138.90

Parking $79.65

$0.00

$0.00

Total

$33.67

Taxi or Airport Limo

$79.65

Accommodation

$17.70

Net Cost

$10.50

1 of 1



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB- Process: 

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly 

rate
Subtotal HST

24.90 $170.00 $4,233.00 $550.29

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

17.90 $170.00 $3,043.00 $395.59

12.70 $170.00 $2,159.00 $280.67

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$9,435.00 $1,226.55

HST

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Travel (Other): $0.00

included

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

2012-0031 Hydro One Networks Inc. 2013 & 2014 Tx Rates

AMPCO Sarah Robicheau

Completed Years 

Practising/Years of relevant 

experience

2

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

$10,661.55

$0.00

$0.00

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone

Postage   

Transcripts

Photocopies

Attendance - Oral Hearing

Argument

$3,438.59

$2,439.67

$0.00Case Management

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$4,783.29Preparation

Attendance - Technical Conference

Attendance - Settlement Conference

Total

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

$0.00

Parking $0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Total

$0.00

Taxi or Airport Limo

Accommodation

Net Cost

1 of 1









Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB- Process: 

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly 

rate
Subtotal HST

0.70 $100.00 $70.00 $9.10

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$70.00 $9.10

HST

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Travel (Other): $0.00

included

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Net Cost

Parking $0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Total

$0.00

Taxi or Airport Limo

Accommodation

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

$0.00

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$79.10Preparation

Attendance - Technical Conference

Attendance - Settlement Conference

Total

$0.00

$0.00

Photocopies

Attendance - Oral Hearing

Argument

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00Case Management

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone

Postage   

Transcripts

$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

$79.10

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

2012-0031 Hydro One Networks Inc. 2013 & 2014 Tx Rates

AMPCO Pooja Punjabi (Articling Student)

Completed Years 

Practising/Years of relevant 

experience

0

1 of 1















































Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB- Process: 

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly 

rate
Subtotal HST

64.00 $330.00 $21,120.00 $2,745.60

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

11.50 $330.00 $3,795.00 $493.35

18.50 $330.00 $6,105.00 $793.65

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$31,020.00 $4,032.60

HST

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$89.86

$0.00

Travel (Other): $0.00

included

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$89.86

Net Cost

Parking $69.50

$0.00

$0.00

Total

$0.00

Taxi or Airport Limo

$69.50

Accommodation

$0.00

$0.00

$850.56

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

$760.70

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$23,865.60Preparation

Attendance - Technical Conference

Attendance - Settlement Conference

Total

$0.00

$0.00

Photocopies

Attendance - Oral Hearing

Argument

$4,288.35

$6,898.65

$0.00Case Management

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone

Postage   

Transcripts

$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

$35,052.60

$781.06

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$691.20

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

2012-0031 Hydro One Networks Inc. 2013 & 2014 Tx Rates

AMPCO Wayne Clark, P. Eng.

Completed Years 

Practising/Years of relevant 

experience

35

1 of 1



Invoice

Invoice Date 11/06/2013

Invoice # 384

Bill To:

AMPCO
Attn:  A. White
1702-372 Bay Street
Toronto, Ontario
M5H 2W9

25 Priest Avenue
RR#3
Minesing, Ontario
L0L 1Y3

P.O. Number:

Due Date 11/07/2013

Case:

GST/HST No. 869376327

Phone #

705-728-3284

E-mail

c.w.clark@sympatico.ca
Balance Due

Payments/Credits

Description Qty Rate Amount

OEB Board File EB-2012-0031 (Hydro One Transmission COS)
for the period July 2012 to March 2013

94 330.00 31,020.00

Mileage 1,728 0.40 691.20
Parking 1 69.00 69.00
HST (ON) on sales 13.00% 4,131.43

$35,911.63

$0.00



File: EB-2012-0031

HONI 2013-2014 Tx Rates Mileage Rate $0.40

Date Time Activity Mileage (km)Parking

Labour Rate $330.00

July 20, 2012 2.5 Project Setup, Review Issues List

July 23, 2012 2 Issues, review

July 30, 2012  

August 1, 2012 0.75 Interrogatory Development

August 2, 2012 1.5 Interrogatory Development

August 3, 2012 2.5 Interrogatory Development

August 10, 2012 0.5 Interrogatory Development

August 16, 2012 1.75 Interrogatory Development

August 27, 2012 1.5 MTg w Counsel, AMPCO 220 $14.00

August 30, 2012 3 Interrogatory Development

August 31, 2012 1 Interrogatory Development

October 2, 2012 2.25 Preparation - tech conf

October 3, 2012 2 Preparation - tech conf

October 4, 2011 2.75 Preparation - tech conf

October 5, 2012 1.5 Preparation - tech conf

October 9, 2012 1.5 HQ interrogatories.

October 10, 2012 2 Tech Prep, HQEM interrogatory mtg 220  

October 15, 2012 0.25 Review Tech conf

October 19, 2012 2 Client consultation 220  

October 22, 2012 1 Preparation - tech conf

October 29,2012 0.75 Conf calls

October 30, 2012 1.5 Mtg w/HONI re Tx Connection 220 $11.25

October 31, 2012 0.25 Client Consultation

November 1, 2012 3.75 Export Tariff Cross Prep

November 2, 2012 2.25 Export Tariff Cross Prep, client mtg 220 $14.00

November 4, 2012 4.5 Export Tariff Cross Prep

January 17, 2013 0.5 ETS cross prep

January 18, 2013 0.5 ETS cross prep

January 19, 2013 0.5 ETS Cross - Conf Call

January 23, 2013 5.5 ETS cross prep

January 24, 2013 4 ETS cross prep

Feb 3,2013 0.25 Proc re ETS

February 15, 2013 2 Mtg re ETS cross 220 $11.25

February 22, 2013 1.5 Dev Cross

February 23, 2013 4 Dev Cross

February 25, 2013 6.5 Attendance 204 $9.50

February 26, 2013 5 Attendance 204 $9.50



March 1, 2013 0.5 Submission on ETX

March 4, 2013 5.5 Submission on ETX

March 5, 2013 4 Submission on ETX

March 6, 2013 2 Submission on ETX

March 7, 2013 1 Submission on ETX

March 10, 2013 1 Submission on ETX

March 11, 2013 1 Submission on ETX

March 13, 2011 2.5 Submission on IESO submission

March 19, 2013 0.5 Conf call

March 23, 2013 0.5 Final review

Totals 94 1728 $69.50





Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB- Process: 

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly 

rate
Subtotal HST

33.00 $190.00 $6,270.00 $815.10

6.25 $190.00 $1,187.50 $154.38

7.50 $190.00 $1,425.00 $185.25

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$8,882.50 $1,154.73

HST

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Travel (Other): $0.00

included

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

14

2012-0031 Hydro One Networks Inc. 2013 & 2014 Tx Rates

AMPCO Shelley Grice, P. Eng.

Completed Years 

Practising/Years of relevant 

experience

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

$10,037.23

$0.00

$0.00

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone

Postage   

Transcripts

Photocopies

Attendance - Oral Hearing

Argument

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00Case Management

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$7,085.10Preparation

Attendance - Technical Conference

Attendance - Settlement Conference

Total

$1,341.88

$1,610.25

$0.00

$0.00

$40.25

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

$40.25

Parking $40.25

$0.00

$0.00

Total

$0.00

Taxi or Airport Limo

$40.25

Accommodation

Net Cost

1 of 1



Shelley Grice, P. Eng.
46 Scarborough Road, Toronto ON M4E 3M5

416-694-3917, shelley.grice@rogers.com

INVOICE # 258

May 15, 2013

AMPCO

Thomson Building

65 Queen Street West, Suite 1510

Toronto, Ontario M5H 2M5

Attention: Mr. Adam White, President

Re: Hydro One Networks Inc.  EB-2012-0031

2013 & 2014 Transmission Rate Application

Description Charge Type Hours Rate Amount

Professional Services of 

Shelley Grice Preparation 33.00 $190.00 $6,270.00

Attendance – TC 6.25 $190.00 $1,187.50

Attendance – SC 7.50 $190.00 $1,425.00

Argument

Case Management $170.00

Sub-Total $8,882.50

HST on Services $1,154.73

Disbursements 35.62

HST on Disbursements 4.63

GST # 817042757RT0001 46.75 TOTAL $10,077.48

Details are included in the attached time sheet.

Please make cheque payable to Shelley Grice.

Sincerely,

Shelley Grice, P. Eng.



Shelley Grice, P. Eng.

PROJECT TIME SHEET DATE INVOICE

Hydro One Networks Inc 2013-05-15 #258

2013 & 2014 Transmission Rate Application

PROJECT TIME SHEET
DATE TASK DESCRIPTION CHARGE Hours

2012-05-31 Review application, discuss AMPCO's involvement 

w/client

Preparation 0.50

2012-07-13 Review & consider PO#1;  Review application; 

scheduling

Preparation 1.00

2012-07-20 Review & discuss Issues List & AMPCO Issues w/client 

& team; Emails

Preparation 0.50

2012-07-23 Review comments on Draft Issues List; Call w/W. 

Clark, Prepare & File AMPCO Letter

Preparation 0.75

2012-07-24 Emails w/AW re: Goldcorp Issue & AMPCO position Preparation 0.25

2012-07-27 Review intervenor comments on Goldcorp Issue (SEC, 

Board Staff, VECC), Discuss w/client, Prepare & File 

AMPCO Letter

Preparation 1.00

2012-08-16 Review evidence update; review correspondence; 

emails

Preparation 0.50

2012-08-22 Prepare briefing on key points of application for 

client; Emails 

Preparation 1.25

2012-08-24 Review evidence; Review Board Guidelines; Prepare 

interrogatories

Preparation 1.75

2012-08-27 Mtg w/D. Crocker, W. Clark re: Case, AMPCO interest 

& IRs

Preparation 1.75

2012-09-03 Review application, prepare interrogatories; discuss 

w/W. Clark

Preparation 1.50

2012-09-04 Review application, prepare interrogatories; discuss 

w/W. Clark

Preparation 1.25

2012-09-05 Finalize & file interrogatories Preparation 1.00

2012-09-17 Status update w/client Preparation 0.25

2012-09-20 Prepare presentation to AMPCO Board of Directors 

re: status of Hydro One Tx application & Key Issues

Preparation 0.75

2012-09-22 Attend AMPCO BOD & brief Board on application; 

discuss AMPCO position & Board input

Preparation 0.50

2012-09-23 Review interrogatory responses Preparation 2.00



2012-09-28 Review APPrO Notice of Motion to provide full 

responses to IRs; Review Hydro One letter re: Interim 

Rates; Review other correspondence

Preparation 0.25

2012-10-02 Review PO#3; Review evidence filed Oct 1; call D. 

Crocker; emails

Preparation 0.50

2012-10-05 Meeting w/D. Crocker, W. Clark, A. White; Prepare 

AMPCO questions for Technical Conference; Review 

intervenors questions; Review Hydro One updates to 

interrogatory responses

Preparation 2.00

2012-10-09 Questions to W. Clark, D. Crocker re: Tariff meeting; 

Prepare draft AMPCO IRs on evidence

Preparation 1.00

2012-10-10 Meeting w.D. Crocker & W, Clark prep Technical 

Conference; Finalize & file AMPCO IRs on Evidence; 

Review Hydro One Letter re: Technical Conference; 

Review SEC email; emails

Preparation 2.50

2012-10-12 Attend Technical Conference Attendance 6.25

2012-10-17 Review interrogatory responses on evidence; Review 

SEC Notice of Motion

Preparation 0.50

2012-10-21 Prepare briefing notes for settlement conference; 

Review Hydro One undertakings from Technical 

Conference; Review interrogatories

Preparation 1.25

2012-10-22 Conference call w. D. Crocker & W. Clark to prep for 

Settlement Conference; preparation; emails

Preparation 1.75

2012-10-23 Attend OEB Hearing/Settlement Conference Attendance 7.50

2012-10-25 Conference Call; emails Preparation 1.50

2012-10-26 Call in re: HONI Settlement; follow-up w/D. Crocker Preparation 0.50

2012-11-01 Prepare briefing notes on intervenor evidence for 

meeting; Review Settlement Agreement; Emails

Preparation 1.50

2012-11-02 Meeting w/D. Crocker, W. Clark, A. White re: strategy; 

Review Hydro One letter; Review Hearing Plan

Preparation 2.00

2012-11-15 Client briefing Preparation 0.50

2012-12-05 Review correspondence re: interim ETS rate; Prepare 

AMPCO submission; Review w/client

Preparation 0.75

Total 46.75
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