

THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS

Chair, GAIL REGAN President, Cara Holdings Ltd.

President, PATRICIA ADAMS
MAX ALLEN
Producer, IDEAS, CBC Radio
ANDREW COYNE
Columnist, National Post
GLENN FOX
Professor of Economics, University of Guelph
IAN GRAY
President, St. Lawrence Starch Co.
CLIFFORD ORWIN
Professor of Political Science, University of Toronto

July 31, 2013

BY FAX & BY COURIER

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge St, Suite 2701 Toronto ON M4P 1E4

Ms. Walli:

Board File No. EB-2013-0061 --- Ontario Power Generation Inc. Thunder Bay Reliability Must-Run Agreement Energy Probe – Costs Submission

Pursuant to the Decision and Order, issued on July 25, 2013, please find attached the Costs Submission of Energy Probe Research Foundation (Energy Probe) in the EB-2013-0061 proceeding for consideration by the Board.

Should you require additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours truly,

David S. MacIntosh

Swidt to the

Case Manager

cc. Andrew Barrett, Ontario Power Generation Inc. (By email)

Carlton Mathais, Ontario Power Generation Inc. (By email)

Fred Cass, Aird & Berlis LLP (By email)

Norm Rubin, Senior Consultant to Energy Probe (By email)

Lawrence Schwartz, Economic Consultant to Energy Probe (By email)

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

		Instructions			
cost claim.	is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Canadian dollars. If applicable, stat				with the calculation of the
Disbursements Being ("Summary of Fees and - The cost claim must - A CV for each consul within the last 24 mor	Fees and Disbursements Being Clair Claimed") is required for each consu d Disbursements" covering the whole be supported by a completed Affida tant must be attached unless, for a g	med" (comprising Itant or lawyer/a e of the party's co vit signed by a re given consultant,	rticling student, ost claim should presentative of a CV has been p	of Fees Being Cla /paralegal. How be provided. the party. provided to the I	vever, only one Board in another process
File # EB- 2013-0	061	Process:	OPG Thund	der Bay RMR A	pplication
Party: Ener	gy Probe Research Foundation	Affia	nt's Name:	Annetta Tu	rner
HST Number: 1	0730 5146 RT0001	nonmeratuumod om/w	HST R	ate Ontario:	6.50%
	Full Registrant			Non-Profit Fax Exempt	
		Affidavit		r ej	
1,	Annetta Turner	, of the Cit	y/Town of _		Toronto
in the Province/St	ate of Ontario, o	Canada	,	swear or affir	m that:
2. I have examined all Being Claimed", "State 3. The attached "Sum Disbursements Being Ontario Energy Board 4. This cost claim doe	ve of the above-noted party (the "Pa of the documentation in support of ement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and mary of Fees and Disbursements Bei Claimed" include only costs incurred process referred to above. s not include any costs for work done 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice	this cost claim, in I "Statement(s) on ng Claimed", "Statement of and time spent of e, or time spent,	ncluding the att Disbursement: tement(s) of Fe directly for the by a person tha	ached "Summar s Being Claimed' ees Being Claime purposes of the	y of Fees and Disbursements '. 'd" and "Statement(s) of Party's participation in the
Signature of Affia	nt				
Sworn or affirmed	d before me at the City/Town	of			,
in the Province/St			, on	(date)	*
				(date)	

Commissioner for taking Affidavits

File # EB-	2013-0061	Process:	OPG Thunder Bay RMR Application
Party:	Energy Probe Research	Foundation	
	1,111,1	ry of Fees and Disbursem	ents Being Claimed
Legal/con	sultant fees	11,242.50	
Disbursen	nents		
HST		730.76	
Total Cost	t Claim	\$11,973.26	

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2013-0061	Process:	OPG Thunder Bay RMR Application	/
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundation	Name:	Dr. Lawrence Schwartz	
			Completed Years Practising/Years of relevant experience	
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal: Consultant:		30+	
	CV attached:	CV n	ot required:	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

20 Programme Anna Control of the Con					
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total
Preparation	5.75	\$330.00	\$1,897.50	\$123.34	\$2,020.84
Attendance - Technical Conference		\$330.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference		\$330.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing		\$330.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Argument	18.50	\$330.00	\$6,105.00	\$396.83	\$6,501.83
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES			\$8,002.50	\$520.16	\$8,522.66

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

Time Sheet for L. Schwartz

Board File: EB-2013-0061 OPG RMR Agreement Thunder Bay Generating Station

Summary:	Hours
Preparation	5.75
Attend. Tech.	0.00
Attend. ADR	0.00
Attend. Hearing	0.00
Argument Prep.	18.50
Case Mngt. (CM)	0.00
Total	24.25

Date	Hours	Note
22 Apr	0.50	Review Notice of Application & PO1
23-Apr		• •
24-Apr	1.00	Review OPG Application and Schedules
24-Apr	0.25	Review materials & intervenor submissions re: Issues List
25-Apr	2.00	Draft interrogatories
26-Apr	1.00	Draft interrogatories;review with case manager
23-May	1.00	Review interrogatories and responses
Total	5.75	Preparation

Date	Hours	Note
03-Jun	1.00	Review literature on avoidable cost test
04-Jun	3.00	Draft Energy Probe submissions
05-Jun	6.00	Draft Energy Probe submissions
06-Jun	8.00	Draft Energy Probe submissions
09-Jun	0.50	Review submissions of Board staff & intervenors
Total	18.50	Argument prep.

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2013-0061	_ Process:	OPG Thunder Bay RMR Application	
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundation	Name:	David MacIntosh	
			Completed Years Practising/Years of relevant experience	
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal: Consultant:		14	
	CV attached:	CV n	ot required:	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total
Preparation	6.75	\$290.00	\$1,957.50	\$127.24	\$2,084.74
Attendance - Technical Conference		\$290.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference		\$290.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing		\$290.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Argument	3.25	\$290.00	\$942.50	\$61.26	\$1,003.76
Case Management	2.00	\$170.00	\$340.00	\$22.10	\$362.10
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES			\$3,240.00	\$210.60	\$3,450.60

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

Time Sheet for D. MacIntosh

Board File: EB-2013-0061 OPG RMR Agreement Thunder Bay Generating Station

Summary:	Hours	
Preparation Attend. Tech. Attend. ADR Attend. Hearing Argument Prep. Case Mngt. (CM)	6.75 0.00 0.00 0.00 3.25 2.00	
Total	12.00	
Date	Hours	Note
04-Apr-13 04-Apr-13 16-Apr-13 20-Apr-13 25-Apr-13 08-May-13 22-May-13 27-May-13	1.50 0.50 1.50 0.25 1.00 0.50 0.50 0.25 0.75	prep - Preliminary Review of Prefiled Evidence prep - Draft Notice of Intervention prep - Obtain, Review Prior RMR Decisions, Consultant Communication prep - Review Board Intervenor Status Decision prep - Draft Interrogatories prep - Finalize Interrogatories prep - Draft Reply Submission on Issues List prep - Review Board Decision on Issues List prep - Draft Information Request Letter to OPG Preparation
Date	Hours	Note
05-Jun-13 06-Jun-13 07-Jun-13 26-Jul-13	1.00 1.00 0.75 0.50 3.25	Draft Submissions Draft Submissions Finalize Submissions Review Decision and Order Argument prep.
Date	Hours	Note
04-Apr-13 27-Apr-13 27-Apr-13 08-May-13 27-May-13 07-Jun-13	0.50 0.25 0.25 0.25 0.25 0.25 0.25	CM - File Intervention Itr & Notice. CM - Check & File Interrogatories to OPG CM - Check & File Interrogatories to IESO CM - File Reply Submission Issues List CM - File Information Request Letter to OPG CM - Circulate Submissions to OPG & IESO (Problem at OEB Website) CM - File Final Submissions
Total	2.00	Case Management