

### Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

Celebrating Over 65 Years of Service

DIRECT LINE: John A. Cyr (807) 625-8880 EMAIL: jcyr@wmnlaw.com

G. Bernard Weiler Q.C., LSM, K.C.S.G. (1910-1996) August 1, 2013

File #57695

Ross B. Judge (Counsel)
Certified Specialist (Real Estate Law)

VIA MAIL AND EMAIL BoardSec@ontarioenergyboard.ca

Frederick J. W. Bickford Certified Specialist (Labout Law) Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street, 27<sup>th</sup> Floor Toronto ON M4P 1E4

Directions on Cost Awards.

B. Paul Jasiura

Attention: Ms. Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary

John A. Cyr Certified Specialist (Corporate and Commercial Law)

Dear Ms. Walli

Brian A. Babcock

Re: Application by Ontario Power Generation (OPG) for approval of a Reliability Must-Run Agreement for the Thunder Bay Generating Station between the OPG and the Independent Electricity Systems Operator (IESO) – EB-2013-0061

Garth A. O'Neill Certified Specialist (Labour Law)

We are solicitors representing the Northwestern Ontario Associated Chamber of Commerce (NOACC), The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay (the "City"), the Northwestern Ontario Municipal Association ("NOMA"), and Common Voice Northwest (CVNW) (hereinafter referred to as the "NOACC Coalition"), in the above noted proceeding. Pursuant to the Board's Decision and Order dated July 25, 2013 we are pleased to file with the Ontario Energy Board NOACC's cost claim prepared according to section 10 of the Board's Practice

Deborah A. Humphreys

Nick Melchiorre

Bradley A. Smith

Fhara Pottinger

Jennifer M. Lohuis

Sarah B. Manilla

AnnMarie Stilla

Mark P. Mikulasik

The Board's Decision and Order dated July 25, 2013 provides NOACC the opportunity to seek costs in relation to the OPG's application for approval of a Reliability Must Run Agreement for the Thunder Bay Generating Station. NOACC's time and disbursement for this cost claim predominantly relate to the preparation and filing of Comments in relation to the Issues List on April 24, 2013, Interrogatories on April 29, 2013, Submissions on June 7, 2013, and the review and following of emails and position statements of the OPG, the IESO and other intervenors.

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Fax: (807) 623-4947

Toll-free: 1-866-WEILERS

Internet: www.weilers.ca



In determining the amount of costs awarded to NOACC we ask the Board to consider:

- NOACC has, and will continue to provide comments, questions and submissions in relation to not only issues related to energy but also to environmental and other social imperatives, including but not limited to social imperatives that are peculiar to the geographical, economic and commercial needs of the Northwest Region. NOACC will continue to be a proponent of coordinated, comprehensive planning, development and support of electricity infrastructure and policy changes in the Northwest as a Region.
- 2. NOACC is careful to keep attendances by additional counsel and consultants at a minimum.
- 3. NOACC represents the member businesses of the individual Chambers of Commerce throughout the Northwest Region and as such, understands and can speak to the direct commercial and business interests of the business and commercial ratepayers in the Northwest Region (population approximately 250,000). Those ratepayers are often dependent on a single industrial employer in a town. The viability of a single industrial plant can be essential to the livelihood of an entire community. Reliability of power supply in the Northwest region specifically, and Ontario more generally, has a direct bearing on that viability.
- 4. NOACC represents persons with a significant interest in land that is, or may be, affected by the approval of the Reliability Must Run Agreement for the Thunder Bay Generating Station. That interest in very general and indirect terms is related to the economy of the Northwest region as a whole and, in some instances, may be a private interest, but in every case represents an overriding public interest.
- 5. NOACC has access to the information about, and the analysis of, electrical and power system needs in the Northwest Region that has been developed by the Energy Task Force (ETF). The ETF is an informal regional research committee of interested and experienced individuals who by living and working in the northwest are keenly aware of the geographical and technical issues relating to electricity generation, transmission and distribution in the Northwest Region, including reliability issues.
- 6. NOACC is keenly aware, therefore, of the geographical, technical and policy issues relating to electricity generation, transmission and distribution in the Northwest Region, including issues faced by its membership in relation to the importance of the Thunder Bay Generating Station on the supply of electricity to the Northwest region and Ontario more generally. As such, NOACC is well suited to provide important and unique perspectives in relation to the Thunder Bay Generating Station and the Reliability Must Run Agreement.

Phone: (807) 623-1111 Fax: (807) 623-4947

Toll-free: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca



### Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

- 7. There has been continual co-operation by NOACC with the Energy Task Force, to collect relevant information and consult with relevant stakeholders in the Northwest Region, including First Nations, and large and small industry, business consumers.
- 8. Many issues that the RMR proceeding presents to the Northwest region are technical in nature and therefore only a limited review of literature and research on complex topics such as power reliability and quality has been undertaken. Furthermore, NOACC had to review all documents on the public record, to ensure the interests of NOACC were appropriately communicated to the Board.

Please contact the undersigned or Mr. Mark Mikulasik should further information or clarification regarding this cost claim be required.

Respectfully submitted,

Yours very truly,

WEILER, MALONEY, NELSON

Per:

John A. Cyr,

Counsel in this instance for

**NOACC** 

JAC/mm

Encls.



### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Fo	rmulas are present in the document to assist with the calculation of the
cost claim.	
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state	·
Rate	
	d" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of
Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each consulta	
"Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole o	·
- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit	signed by a representative of the party.  en consultant, a CV has been provided to the Board in another process
within the last 24 months.	on consultant, a cv has been provided to the board in another process
- Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction	on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided
= 1.00 provided in section, 7.03 of the Fladdisc Birection	ron cost Anaras, remited receipts must be provided.
File # EB- 2013-0061	Process: OPG RMR - Thunder Bay Generating Station
Party: NOACC	Affiant's Name: Mark P. Mikulasik
HST Number: 122004658RT	HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%
Full Posistront	Qualifying Nan Brafit
Full Registrant	Qualifying Non-Profit
Unregistered	Tax Exempt
Other	
	Affidavit
I, Mark P. Mikulasik	_ , of the City/Town of Thunder Bay
in the Province/State of Ontario	, swear or affirm that:
2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of th Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "S	(") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. is cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".  Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of
	nd time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the
Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.	
4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or	or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as
described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice D	rection on Cost Awards.
M. Matalas	
Signature of Affiant	
Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of	Thunder Bay
in the Province/State of Ontario	on August-01-13
Jef Roher	(date)
Commissioner for taking Affidavits	

JENNIFER LOHUIS



### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

File # EB-	2013-0061	Process: OPG RMR - Thunder Bay Generating Station
Party:	NOACC	
		Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed
Legal/con	sultant fees	\$7,722.00
Disbursen	nents	\$222.65
HST		\$1,032.80
Total Cost	t Claim	\$8,977.45



### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2013-0061	Process: OPG RMR - Thunder Bay Generating Station
Party:	NOACC	Name: John A. Cyr
		Completed Years Practising/Years of relevant experience
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal: Consultant:	32
	CV attached:	CV not required:

**Statement of Fees Being Claimed** 

	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total
Preparation	23.40	\$330.00	\$7,722.00	\$1,003.86	\$8,725.86
Attendance - Technical Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES		\$7,722.00	\$1,003.86	\$8,725.86
-----------------------------	--	------------	------------	------------

### Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies	\$176.20	\$22.91	\$199.11
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier	\$20.00	\$2.60	\$22.60
Telephone	\$15.60	\$2.03	\$17.63
Postage	\$10.85	\$1.41	\$12.26
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$222.65	\$28.94	\$251.59



#### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

				iisti actioni	•			
	ata input is indicate	ed by yellow-shade	ed fields. For	mulas are p	resent in the docur	nent to assist	with the calc	ulation of the
cost claim.			-11	-b				
- All claims m	nust be in Canadiar	i dollars. It applic	able, state ex 	cnange rate N/A	e and country of in	Country:		nada
- A separate	"Detail of Fees and	Disbursements Be		" (comprisin	g a "Statement of			
	nts Being Claimed")							
	f Fees and Disburse							
	im must be suppo						Poard in ano	thar process
	ch consultant must st 24 months.	be attached unie	ss, for a giver	n consultant	., a CV has been pri	ovided to the	board in and	ther process
	rovided in section	7.03 of the Practi	ce Direction	on Cost Aw	ards, itemized rec	eipts must be	provided.	
File# EB-	2013-0061			Process:	OPG RMR - Thu	nder Bay Ger	nerating Sta	tion
Party:	NOACC			Aff	iant's Name: <u>M</u> a	rk P. Mikula:	sik	
HST Numbe	er: <u>12200465</u>	8RT			HST Rat	e Ontario: _	13.00%	
	F	ull Registrant	<b>/</b>		Qualifying N	lon-Profit		
		Inregistered				x Exempt	$\overline{\Box}$	
		Other				•		
				Affidavit				
l,	Ma	rk P. Mikulasik		, of the C	ity/Town of	Т	hunder Ba	У
in the Prov	ince/State of	0	ntario		, s\	wear or affi	rm that:	
1 Lamaren	resentative of the	above-noted party	(the "Party"	') and as suc	h have knowledge	of the matter	rs attested to	herein.
	mined all of the do							
	ed", "Statement(s)							
	ned "Summary of F							
	nts Being Claimed"		incurred and	d time spen	t directly for the pu	irposes of the	Party's parti	cipation in the
	rgy Board process		بم مسملة باسما		bus parson that	is an amplaya	o or officer o	f the Party as
	claim does not inclusions sections 6.05 and					is an employe	e or officer o	Title Party as
described in	manus o.os and	-1	S FIACTICE DII	ection on c	ost Awarus.			
1	H. Myla	lazi						
Signature	of Affiant							
	affirmed before				Thunder			
in the Prov	vince/State of		Ontario		_, on	August-0		
<b>ن</b> د	111					(date)		
	1/11							
([v]	nons				₽)			
Commissi	oner for taking	Affidavits						

Page 1 of 2

JENNIFER LOHUIS



### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

File # EB- 2013-0061		Process: OPG RMR - Thunder Bay Generating Station	
Party:	NOACC		
		Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed	
Legal/con	sultant fees	\$2,898.00	
Disbursen	nents	\$0.00	
HST		\$376.74	
<b>Total Cost</b>	t Claim	\$3,274.74	



### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2013-0061		Process:	OPG RMR - Thur	nder Bay Ger	nerating Station
Party:	NOACC		Name:	Nick Melchiorre		
				Completed \ Practising/Years of experien	of relevant	
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal:	<b>J</b>		9		
	Consultant:					
	CV attached:		CV r	not required:	<b>✓</b>	

**Statement of Fees Being Claimed** 

	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total
Preparation	12.60	\$230.00	\$2,898.00	\$376.74	\$3,274.74
Attendance - Technical Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference	1		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES		\$2,898.00	\$376.74	\$3,274.74
-----------------------------	--	------------	----------	------------

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00



### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required da	ata input is ind	icated by yellow-shad	ded fields. For	mulas are p	resent in the	document to assist v	with the calculation of	the
cost claim.								
- All claims m	nust be in Cana	dian dollars. If appli	cable, state e	xchange rat	e and countr	y of initial currency.		
A ========	D-4-:  - f E	10:1	Rate:			Country:		
- A separate	Detail of Fees	and Disbursements E	Being Claimed	l" (comprisir	ng a "Stateme	ent of Fees Being Clai	med" and a "Statemen	t of
Ulsbursemer	its Being Claim	ed") is required for ea	ach consultan	it or lawyer/	articling stud	dent/paralegal. Howe	ever, only one	
- The cost cla	i rees and Disp	ursements" covering pported by a complet	the whole of	tne party's	cost claim sh	ould be provided.		
- A CV for ear	ch consultant n	nust be attached unle	eu Amuavit s ess for a give	n consultant	epresentativ	e or the party. Sen provided to the B	oard in another proces	e.c
	st 24 months.	inder be distablished diffe	233, 101 a Bive	ii consultani	i, a cv mas pe	cen provided to the b	oard in another proces	35
		tion 7.03 of the Pract	ice Direction	on Cost Aw	ards, itemize	ed receints must be r	provided	
					a. a.,	receipts must be p	, origed.	
File # EB-	2013-0061			Process:	OPG RMR	- Thunder Bay Gene	erating Station	
Party:	NOACC			-		e: Mark P. Mikulasi		
HST Numbe	er: 12200	4658RT		•		T Rate Ontario:	13.00%	
	-			•		****		
		Full Registrant			Qualify	ing Non-Profit		
		Unregistered				Tax Exempt		
		Other						
-				Affidavit				
I,		Mark P. Mikulasik		, of the C	ity/Town o	fTh	under Bay	
in the Prov	ince/State o	of O	ntario			, swear or affirm	n that:	
1 Lamaren	resentative of t	he above-noted part	v /tha "Dartu"	'\ and as sue	h hava kaa			
2. I have example 2.	mined all of the	documentation in si	γ (life Party upport of this	) allu as suc	n nave know including the	leage or the matters	attested to nerein. of Fees and Disbursen	
Beine Claime	d" "Statement	c(s) of Fees Being Clair	med" and "St	atement(c)	of Dichurcom	onte Poing Claimed"	of rees and Dispursen	ients
							I" and "Statement(s) of	F
							arty's participation in t	
Ontario Ener	gy Board proce	ess referred to above.			un compression s	are purposes of the f	arty 5 participation in t	
				r time spent	, by a person	that is an employee	or officer of the Party	as
described in	sections 6.05 a	nd 6.09 of the Board'	s Practice Dir	ection on Co	ost Awards.	. ,	,	
,	m In	A A						
	41 Mich	ulas						
Signature	of Affiant				-			
Sworn or a	affirmed bef	<b>ore me</b> at the City			Thu	nder Bay		
in the Prov	ince/State o	f	Ontario		, on	August-01-	-13	
	S 58				T.(	(date)		
1	1 //	,						
[k]	rich	+						
Commissio	ner for taki	ng Affidavits			es .			

JENNIFER LOHUIS



### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

File # EB-	2013-0061	Process: OPG RMR - Thunder Bay Generating Station	n
Party:	NOACC		
		Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed	
Legal/con	sultant fees	\$6,555.00	
Disbursen	nents	\$0.00	
HST		\$852.15	
<b>Total Cost</b>	t Claim	\$7,407.15	



### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2013-0061		Process:	OPG RMR - Thu	nder Bay Ge	nerating Station
Party:	NOACC		Name:	Mark P. Mikulas	sik	
				Completed Practising/Years experien	of relevant	
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal: Consultant:	✓ □		1		
	CV attached:		CV r	not required:	<b>V</b>	

**Statement of Fees Being Claimed** 

	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total
Preparation	43.70	\$150.00	\$6,555.00	\$852.15	\$7,407.15
Attendance - Technical Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES		\$6,555.00	\$852.15	\$7,407.15
-----------------------------	--	------------	----------	------------

### Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

		Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies			\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing			\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax			\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier			\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone			\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage			\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts			\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air			\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car			\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail			\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):			\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking			included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo			\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation			\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals			\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:			\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEME	NTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00



### WEILER, MALONEY, NELSON

The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay 500 Donald Street East Thunder Bay ON P7E 5V3 30 April 2013

Our file #: 57695 Account #: 20614

Re: Long Term Energy Plan

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above matter during the period from 28 March 2013 to 30 April 2013:

28 Mar 13	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Mikulasik re: Update on Energy File re Reliability Must Run	NM	.1	24.00
	Review email from Mr. Cyr re: Update on Energy File re Reliability Must Run	MPM	.1	15.00
	Review email article from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force; review lengthy email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus re RMR	NM	.2	48.00
29 Mar 13	Review email article from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force; review lengthy email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus re: RMR	MPM	.2	30.00
	Review email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Bosch and Mr. Angus re: RMR	NM	.1	24.00

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

01 Apr 13	Review email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Bosch and Mr. Angus re: RMR	MPM	.1	15.00
04 Apr 13	Review briefly associate's summary of Procedural Order #1 in Must Run Application for TBGS	JAC	.1	33.00
	Review Notice of Application re RMR; draft email to Mr. John Cyr re same; review IESO intervention request	MPM	.6	90.00
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: TBGS Reliability Must Run	NM	.1	24.00
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Bosch and Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus re: Notice of Application and Written	NM	.4	96.00
	Hearing: OPG Review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Greenway, Mr. Harris, Mr. Vezina, Mr. Mason, Mr. Hebert, Mr. Bosch and Mr. Thorburn; review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review further email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert re: Reliability Must Run	NM	.3	72.00
	Email to Mr. Cyr re: TBGS	MPM	.1	15.00
	Reliability Must Run Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Bosch and Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Cyr to	MPM	.4	60.00
C				D1 (007

	Mr. Angus re: Notice of Application and Written Hearing: OPG			
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Reliability Must Run.	MPM	.1	15.00
	Review email from Mr. Greenway to Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Reliability Must Run	MPM	.2	30.00
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Greenway, Mr. Harris, Mr. Vezina, Mr. Mason, Mr. Hebert, Mr. Bosch and Mr. Thorburn; review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review further email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert re: Reliability Must Run	MPM	.3	45.00
	Attend to extensive review of draft Application Letter for Intervenor status in the RMR Proceeding including review of associates memos on law and email to ETF co-chairs for guidance; email to ETF consulting group of draft for comment	JAC	3.9	1287.00
08 Apr 13	Brief teleconference with Ms. Nadia Koltun re: RMR Application	JAC	.1	33.00
	Brief teleconference with Ms. Nadia Koltun re: RMR Application	NM	.1	24.00
	Brief teleconference with Ms. Nadia Koltun re: RMR Application	MPM	.1	15.00
	Review previous RMR Applications; set up sub file; review other intervenor requests; begin draft of intervenor request of NOACC	MPM	2.1	315.00

09 Apr 13	Review OEB case law re intervenor status; review previous RMR applications and decisions; draft email to Mr. John Cyr re same;	MPM	2.2	330.00
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: OPG RMR (EB-2013-0061)	NM	.1	24.00
	Email to Mr. Cyr re: OPG RMR (EB-2013-0061)	MPM	.1	15.00
10 Apr 13	Review associate Memo of Law (in email) and begin revisions to Letter for Intervenor status	JAC	1.2	396.00
11 Apr 13	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: OPG RMR (EB-2013-0061)	NM	.1	24.00
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert; review further email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Cyr re: Intervenor Status in the RMR Proceeding	NM	.4	96.00
	Review email from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Cyr, Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Vezina re: Intervenor Status in the RMR Proceeding	NM	.3	72.00
	Email to Mr. Cyr re: OPG RMR (EB-2013-0061)	MPM	.1	15.00
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert; review further email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert;	MPM	.4	60.00

	review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Cyr re: Intervenor Status in the RMR Proceeding Review email from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Cyr, Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Vezina re: Intervenor Status in the RMR	MPM	.3	45.00
	Proceeding Review Procedural rules for submissions re OPG Intent; review LCD's in NW Ontario; draft email to Mr. John Cyr re same	MPM	1.1	165.00
12 Apr 13	Review email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Hebert re: Intervenor Status in the RMR Proceeding	NM	.1	24.00
	Review email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Hebert re: Intervenor Status in the RMR Proceeding	MPM	.1	15.00
14 Apr 13	Review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Hebert and Council and review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Hebert re: Intervener Status in the RMR Proceeding	NM	.2	48.00
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Hebert and Council and review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Hebert re: Intervener Status in the RMR Proceeding	MPM	.2	30.00
15 Apr 13	Revise final draft of Letter Board on RMR and instructions on file to associate and revise further on further comment from ETF; draft further revision in final edit and instructions on file as to follow-up on	JAC	2.9	957.00

interrogatories issues and submissions			
Review and revise OPG Intent to participate; incorporate changes identified by ETF; draft email to Mr. John Cyr re same	MPM	1.2	180.00
Further review and revision of OPG intent; review OEB document naming conventions; instructions on file; send to OEB	MPM	1.6	240.00
Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Mikulasik; review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr; review further emails from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Mikulasik; review further emails from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: RMR Application	NM	.6	144.00
Review email from OEB Board Secretary re: Confirmation of Supporting Document Submission for NOACC	NM	.1	24.00
Instructions on file from Mr. Mikulasik to Ms. Swerdlyk re: Request for Intervenor Status EB-2013-0061	NM	.1	24.00
Review as-sent version of City of Thunder Bay, NOMA, NOACC and CVNW Intervention and Cost Eligibility Request from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert re: OPG Reliability Must Run Application EB-2013-0061	NM	.1	24.00
Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Melchiorre; email to Mr. Cyr; review further emails from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Melchiorre; review further emails from Mr. Melchiorre to Mr. Cyr re: RMR	MPM	.6	90.00

	Application Review email from OEB Board Secretary re: Confirmation of Supporting Document Submission for	MPM	.1	15.00
	NOACC Instructions on file to Ms. Swerdlyk re: Request for Intervenor Status EB-2013- 0061	MPM	.1	15.00
	Email as-sent version of City of Thunder Bay, NOMA, NOACC and CVNW Intervention and Cost Eligibility Request to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert re: OPG Reliability Must Run Application EB-2013-0061	MPM	.1	15.00
16 Apr 13	Review IESO Thunder Bay Deregistration re OPG RMR; draft email to Mr. Cyr re same - OPG RMR	MPM	1.7	255.00
	Review email from Mr. Greg Towstego at OPG; review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: OPG RMR Application EB-2013-0061	NM	.2	48.00
	Review email from Mr. Greg Towstego at OPG; email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre re: OPG RMR Application EB-2013-0061	MPM	.2	30.00
17 Apr 13	Instructions on file to associate - RMR	JAC	.1	33.00
	Further review of IESO Thunder Bay Deregistration re OPG RMR; draft email to Mr. Cyr re same	MPM	.8	120.00
	OPG RMR - determine how issues list is determined, and what if any would be a relevant addition to the issues list; review all previous RMR decisions, and orders, 2005, 2006, 2007, and 2008; draft email to Mr. Cyr re same	MPM	1.8	270.00

19 Apr 13	Review email re meetings and tracking concept development with Mr. Mikulasik; attending Energy Task Force committee meetings - RMR	JAC	.2	66.00
	Review Board Order on Costs and instructions on file - RMR	JAC	.3	99.00
22 Apr 13	Review lengthy email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: Issues List - OPG RMR (EB-2013-0061)	NM	.1	24.00
	Lengthy email to Mr. Melchiorre and Mr. Cyr re: Issues List - OPG RMR (EB-2013-0061)	MPM	.1	15.00
23 Apr 13	Review filings on EB-2013- 0061 related to issues list; draft letter to Board supporting clarifications being sought by Power Workers Union - RMR	JAC	.5	165.00
	Review email from OEB Board Secretary re: Confirmation of Supporting Document Submission for Northwestern Ontario Associated Chambers of Commerce	NM	.1	24.00
	Review email final letter from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: OPG Must Run - EB- 2013-0061	NM	.1	24.00
	Review email from OEB Board Secretary re: Confirmation of Supporting Document Submission for Northwestern Ontario Associated Chambers of Commerce	MPM	.1	15.00
	Email final letter to Mr. Melchiorre and Mr. Cyr re: OPG Must Run - EB-2013- 0061	MPM	.1	15.00
24 Apr 13	Review PO No. 1; draft and	MPM	.6	90.00
G 14 201				D1 (907

	send supporting letter re Cdn Manufacturers; draft and send supporting letter re Power Workers Union - RMR			
	Review email from Mr. Thompson at BLG; review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Mikulasik and review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Ms. Swerdlyk re: EB-2013-0061 CME IRs to PG and IESO	NM	.3	72.00
	Review email from OEB Board Secretary re: Confirmation of Supporting Document Submission for Northwestern Ontario Associated Chambers of Commerce	NM	.1	24.00
	Review email from Mr. Thompson at BLG; review email from Mr. Cyr and email to Ms. Swerdlyk re: EB-2013-0061 CME IRs to PG and IESO	MPM	.3	45.00
28 Apr 13	Review possible interrogatories and issues re RMR application; begin draft of Coalition interrogatories; draft email to Mr. John Cyrre: same	MPM	1.1	165.00
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: RMR	NM	.1	24.00
	Email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre re: RMR	MPM	.1	15.00
29 Apr 13	Continue to draft interrogatories of Coalition re: RMR application	MPM	.8	120.00
	Create draft letter to OEB re RMR interrogatories; draft email to IESO and OPG re: same; review Procedural Order No. 1 re: naming conventions and parties to be	MPM	1.7	255.00
Suite 201				Phone: (807

served			
Review OPG generating	MPM	.6	90.00
licence re: reliability and			
security of IESO controlled			
grid; draft email to Mr. Cyr			
re: same			
Review Lennox RMR	NM	2.2	528.00
Applications to determine the			
criteria required in Thunder			
Bay Generating Station -			
RMR			
Office conference with Mr.	NM	.3	72.00
Mikulasik re: interrogatories			
to OEB re: RMR			
Office conference with Mr.	MPM	.3	45.00
Melchiorre re: interrogatories			
to OEB re: RMR		_	
Office conference with Mr.	JAC	.3	99.00
Melchiorre re: further			
revisions to interrogatories to			
OEB re: RMR drafted by Mr.			
Mikulasik	3.73.6		<b></b> 00
Office conference with Mr.	NM	.3	72.00
Cyr re: further revisions to			
interrogatories to OEB re:			
RMR drafted by Mr.			
Mikulasik	) T) (	4	06.00
Review and revise final draft	NM	.4	96.00
of RMR interrogatories to			
OEB	NIN #	0	102.00
Review lengthy email from	NM	.8	192.00
Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr;			
review email from Mr. Cyr to			
Mr. Mikulasik; review further			
lengthy email from Mr.			
Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr; email to Mr. Mikulasik and Mr.			
Cyr; review further emails			
from Mr. Cyr to Mr.			
Mikulasik and review email			
from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr.			
Cyr re: RMR			
Email to Mr. Mikulasik re:	NM	.1	24.00
Energy Task Force Meeting	- 1414	• •	200
Details – Reliability Must			
Run			
<del></del>			

	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik; review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Ms. Swerdlyk re: EB-2013-0061 - NOACC-NOMA Interrogatories - OPG Inc. Reliability Must-Run Agreement for TB	NM	.2	48.00
	Generating Station Lengthy email to Mr. Melchiorre and Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Cyr; further lengthy email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre; review email from Mr. Melchiorre; review further emails from Mr. Cyr and email to Mr. Cyr re: RMR	MPM	.8	120.00
	Review email from Mr. Melchiorre re: Energy Task Force Meeting Details re Reliability Must Run	MPM	.1	15.00
	Email to Mr. Melchiorre and Mr. Cyr and email to Ms. Swerdlyk re: EB-2013-0061 - NOACC-NOMA Interrogatories - OPG Inc. Reliability Must-Run Agreement for TB Generating Station	MPM	.2	30.00
	Review and revise associate's Draft of Interrogatories; review email from colleague and discuss further revisions as to timeframe for the requested modeling (i.e. to a post - December 31, 2013) - RMR	JAC	3.5	1155.00
30 Apr 13	Review Board Staff Interrogatories; Review Interrogatories of Power Workers Union	MPM	.8	120.00
	Review email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Greenway, Mr. Harris, Mr. Angus, Mr. Mason, Mr. Hebert, Mr.	NM	.1	24.00
Suite 201				Phone: (807)

e: re				
Mr.	NI	M	.1	24.00
orce				
Mr.	MP	PM	.1	15.00
Mr.				
Mr.				
Mr.				
re:				
Mr.	MP	PM	.1	15.00
orce				
	NI	M	.1	24.00
2				
Mr.	MP	PM	.1	15.00
13.1	@	330.00	=	\$4,323.00
25.0	@	150.00	=	\$3,750.00
9.0	@	240.00*	=	\$2,160.00
47.1				10,233.00
				ŕ
ees to				
	Mr. orce Mr. Mr. Mr. re: Mr. orce in dility Mr. 13.1 25.0 9.0	Mr. MP Mr. MP Mr. Mr. re: Mr. MP orce in ility NP 13.1 @ 25.0 @ 9.0 @ 47.1	Mr. NM orce  Mr. MPM Mr. Mr. Mr. re:  Mr. MPM orce in ility NM  Mr. MPM  13.1 @ 330.00 25.0 @ 150.00 9.0 @ 240.00*  47.1	Mr. NM .1 orce  Mr. MPM .1 Mr. Mr. Mr. re:  Mr. MPM .1 orce in ility NM .1  Mr. MPM .1  13.1 @ 330.00 = 25.0 @ 150.00 = 9.0 @ 240.00* = 47.1

To our fee 10,233.00

### **DISBURSEMENTS**

Photocopies	150.80	T
Long Distance Charges	14.52	T
Postage	1.34	T
Courier (Purolator)	20.00	T

Total disbursements 186.66

Total Fees and Disbursements 10,419.66

#### **TOTAL TAXES**

HST on 10,233.00 fees HST on 186.66 disbursements HST (Registration #: 122004658RT) 1330.29 24.27

1,354.56

**Total Bill** 

\$11,774.22

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

Fax: (807) 623-4947

Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

J.A. Cyr E.& O.E.

This account is due when rendered. Please pay promptly to avoid interest charges. Interest will be charged in accordance with the Solicitors Act of Ontario.



### WEILER, MALONEY, NELSON

The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay 500 Donald Street East Thunder Bay ON P7E 5V3 30 May 2013

Our file #: 57695 Account #: 20963

Re: Long Term Energy Plan

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above matter during the period from 24 April 2013 to 30 May 2013:

24 Apr 13	Review CME request re issues list and draft letter of support - RMR	JAC	.4	132.00
04 May 13	Review email re: RMR	NM	.3	72.00
<b>y</b>	Review emails re: RMR	MPM	.3	45.00
06 May 13	Review emails re: RMR	NM	.2	48.00
•	Review emails re: RMR	MPM	.2	30.00
07 May 13	Review email re: RMR	NM	.1	24.00
	Review email re: RMR	MPM	.1	15.00
09 May 13	Review OPG response to additions to	MPM	.3	45.00
	issues list and cover letter			
	Compare response to additions list with	MPM	1.4	210.00
	previous RMR application; Draft email			
	to Mr. John Cyr re same			
	Review emails re: RMR	NM	.2	48.00
	Review emails re: RMR	MPM	.2	30.00
13 May 13	Review IESO response to Coalition's	JAC	.4	132.00
	Interrogatories - RMR			
	Begin review of OPG interrogatories and	MPM	1.1	165.00
	IESO Interrogatories			
14 May 13	Continue review IESO and OPG	MPM	2.1	315.00
	Response to Interrogatories of all			

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

15 May 13	intervenors Review OPG Responses Interrogatories; review associate's note and draft email to Co-Ch Energy Task Force for NOM. NOACC - RMR	search airs of	JAC	.7	231.00
	Continue review of IESO and response to interrogatories; draft e Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre re RMR	mail to	MPM	1.8	270.00
	Review emails re: RMR		NM	.2	48.00
	Review email re: RMR		MPM	.2	30.00
17 May 13	Review email re: RMR		NM	.1	24.00
•	Review email re: RMR		NM	.4	96.00
	Review email re: RMR		MPM	.1	15.00
	Review email re: RMR		MPM	.4	60.00
19 May 13	Review email re: RMR		NM	.1	24.00
•	Review email re: RMR		MPM	.1	15.00
21 May 13	Review cost of converting compare with RMR interroresponses; draft email to Mr. same	ogatory	MPM	.9	135.00
	Review Procedural Order No. 2 email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchi same		MPM	.4	60.00
	Review email re: RMR		NM	.1	24.00
	Review email re: RMR		MPM	.1	15.00
	J.A. Cyr 1.5	@ 330.00	=	495.00	
	<b>3</b>	<pre>@ 150.00</pre>		1,455.00	
		@ 240.00*		408.00	
	Total hours 12.9			2,358.00	
	*Adjusted in Details of Fees to \$230/hr				

To our fee 2,358.00

### **DISBURSEMENTS**

Photocopies	14.20	T
Long Distance Charges	1.08	T
Postage	4.39	T

Total disbursements 19.67

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

Total Fees and Disbursements		2,377.67
TOTAL TAXES		
HST on 2,358.00 fees	306.54	
HST on 19.67 disbursements HST (Registration #: 122004658RT)	2.56	309.10

2,686.77

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

Fax: (807) 623-4947

Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

**Total Bill** 

47

J.A. Cyr E.& O.E.

This account is due when rendered. Please pay promptly to avoid interest charges. Interest will be charged in accordance with the Solicitors Act of Ontario.



### WEILER, MALONEY, NELSON

The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay 500 Donald Street East Thunder Bay ON P7E 5V3 25 June 2013

Our file #: 57695 Account #: 21180

Re: Long Term Energy Plan

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above matter during the period from 29 May 2013 to 25 June 2013:

29 May 13	Review emails re: RMR	NM	.4	96.00
	Review emails re: RMR	MPM	.4	60.00
30 May 13	Review Letter from Energy Probe re follow up questions; review OPG response to follow up questions of Energy Probe; review OPG Interrogatory response correction	MPM	.5	75.00
	Review Letter from Energy Probe re follow up questions; review OPG response to follow up questions of Energy Probe; review OPG Interrogatory response correction; draft email to Mr. John Cyr re same	MPM	.8	120.00
31 May 13	Draft email to Mr. John Cyr re RMR application; review applicable documents and previous emails in relation to same	MPM	1.1	165.00
04 Jun 13	Review email re: RMR	NM	.1	24.00
	Review email re: RMR	MPM	.1	15.00

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

06 Jun 13	Review emails re: RMR Review emails re: RMR Review NOMA submission - RMR	NM MPM MPM	.3 .3 .3	72.00 45.00 45.00
	Review email from Mr. John Cyr re incentive effects; research same; draft response email to Mr. John Cyr re same	MPM	1.6	240.00
07 Jun 13	Review materials and draft Submissions for RMR Application	JAC	3.5	1155.00
	Review materials in part as background for Submissions to be drafted	JAC	4.1	1353.00
	Final editing of Submissions and instructions on file - RMR	JAC	.5	165.00
	Review emails re: RMR	NM	.8	192.00
	Review emails re: RMR	MPM	.8	120.00
	Set up draft letter re June 7 Submission; research ETF position re load forecast; draft email to Mr. John Cyr re same	MPM	1.9	285.00
	Review and revise letter and submission re RMR; submit via RESS portal	MPM	.9	135.00
11 Jun 13	Review memo from Energy Task Force Co-Chair Angus; draft proposed revision; send copy of RMR submission of June 17, 2013 - RMR	JAC	.7	231.00
12 Jun 13	Review emails re: RMR Review emails re: RMR	NM MPM	.3 .3	72.00 45.00
	J.A. Cyr 8.8  Mark Mikulasik 9.0  Nick Melchiorre 1.9  Total hours 19.7	<ul><li>@ 330.00</li><li>@ 150.00</li><li>@ 240.00*</li></ul>	= = =	2,904.00 1,350.00 456.00 4,710.00

\*Adjusted in Details of Fees to \$230/hr

To our fee 4,710.00

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

Fax: (807) 623-4947

#### **DISBURSEMENTS**

Photocopies 11.20 T Postage 5.12 T

Total disbursements 16.32

Total Fees and Disbursements 4,726.32

#### **TOTAL TAXES**

 HST on 4,710.00 fees
 612.30

 HST on 16.32 disbursements
 2.12

HST (Registration #: 122004658RT) 614.42

Total Bill 5340.74

#### Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

J.A. Cyr E.& O.E.

This account is due when rendered. Please pay promptly to avoid interest charges. Interest will be charged in accordance with the Solicitors Act of Ontario.

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

Fax: (807) 623-4947