

Direct Dial: 416.862.4829 File: 6176

Sent by Email, RESS Filing and Courier

August 23, 2013

Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street 27<sup>th</sup> Floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Attention: Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary

Dear Ms. Walli:

#### Re: EB-2011-0140 East West Tie Transmission Line Proceedings

In accordance with the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards, Ojibways of Pic River First Nation ("PRFN") hereby applies for cost awards for its contribution in this proceeding.

We enclose the cost claims on behalf of PRFN from the period commencing on November 19, 2012 and ending August 7, 2013. Claims are included for:

- 1 Harrison Pensa from November 19, 2012 to March 22, 2013 and its consultant within the same period; and
- 2 Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP from March 22, 2013 to August 7, 2013.

#### VALUE TO THE PROCEEDING

PRFN is an active participant in many electricity projects and transmission developments. PRFN has extensive experience with consultation, participation and economic partnership in these projects. PRFN has engaged in the duty to consult both as a proponent and as a First Nation impacted by a project. PRFN brings a unique and deep understanding of the issues faced by the East-West Tie.

PRFN was the only First Nation to intervene and prepare submissions and arguments at each opportunity of the proceeding.



PRFN was required to do extensive research and submissions not required by other parties. The responsibility fell to PRFN to explain the origins and purpose of the Duty to Consult. PRFN was also responsible for explaining the difference between Aboriginal Consultation and Aboriginal Participation, a relatively new concept at the Ontario Energy Board. PRFN's submissions were integral to shaping the Board and the Applicants understanding on these issues. PRFN's submissions were cited and relied on in a number of the Applicant's submissions.

As you may recall, we were retained by PRFN part of the way through the proceeding. This required significant additional time in order to familiarize ourselves with all proceeding matters that had taken place since the commencement of the proceeding, including but not limited to review of decisions, Applicant submissions and interrogatories.

We enclose the Cost Claim of PRFN and respectfully request that its contribution be acknowledged in this proceeding.

Yours truly,

Cherie Brant

Encl.

cc: Client



### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

signed and s	sworn or affirmed.					
			Instructions			
- Required c	data input is indicated b	y yellow-shaded field			ent to assist with	the calculation of the
- All claims r	must be in Canadian dol	lars. If applicable, st	ate exchange rate	and country of init	ial currency.	
			Rate:		Country:	
Disburseme "Summary c - The cost cl - A CV for ea within the la	"Detail of Fees and Disl nts Being Claimed") is re of Fees and Disbursemer aim must be supported ach consultant must be a ast 24 months.	equired for each cons nts" covering the who by a completed Affic attached unless, for a	ultant or lawyer/a ble of the party's c avit signed by a re given consultant,	orticling student/pa ost claim should be presentative of the a CV has been pro	ralegal. However provided. party. vided to the Boar	, only one d in another process
File # EB-	2011-0140		Process:	East West Tie Lin	e Designation	•
Party:	Ojibways of Pic Rive	er First Nation	Affia	ant's Name: Cher	ie Brant (Willm:	s & Shier Environmen
HST Numb	er:		;	HST Rate	Ontario:	
	Full R	legistrant $\Box$		Qualifying No	on-Profit	
		gistered $\square$			Exempt	<b>√</b>
		Other				
			Affidavit			
l,	CHERI	E BRANT	, of the Cit	cy/Town of	TOR	ONTO
in the Pro	vince/State of	ONTARI	O	, sw	ear or affirm tl	nat:
2. I have exa Being Claime 3. The attach Disbursemer Ontario Ener 4. This cost o	oresentative of the above the mined all of the documed", "Statement(s) of Fee hed "Summary of Fees and Being Claimed" including Board process referedaim does not include a sections 6.05 and 6.09 of Affiant	entation in support of es Being Claimed" ar and Disbursements Bo de only costs incurre red to above. ny costs for work do	of this cost claim, in d "Statement(s) o eing Claimed", "Sta d and time spent me, or time spent,	ncluding the attach f Disbursements Be atement(s) of Fees directly for the pur by a person that is	ed "Summary of I eing Claimed". Being Claimed" ar poses of the Party	Fees and Disbursements  nd "Statement(s) of  I's participation in the
Sworn or a	affirmed before me	at the City/Towr	of	Toronto	)	
in the Prov	vince/State of	Ontario	)	. on <i>P</i>	August 22, 201	3

Page 1 of 2

(date)



### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

**Commissioner for taking Affidavits** 

File # EB- 2011-0140 Process: East West Tie Line Designation

Party: Ojibways of Pic River First Nation

	Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed								
Legal/consultant fees	\$133,964.00								
Disbursements	\$751.24								
HST	\$0.00								
Total Cost Claim	\$134,715.24								



## **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2011-0140		Process:	East West Tie Lir	ne Designati	on
Party:	Ojibways of Pic River First Nation		Name:	Cherie Brant (Wi	illms & Shie	r Environmental Lawy
			ır	Completed Y Practising/Years of experience	of relevant	
Counse	I/Articling Student/Paralegal:	$\checkmark$		10 years	5	
	Consultant:					V21
	CV attached:		CV r	ot required:	<b>V</b>	

**Statement of Fees Being Claimed** 

Statement of Fees being claimed								
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total			
Preparation	187.90	\$290.00	\$54,491.00	\$0.00	\$54,491.00			
Attendance - Technical Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00			
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00			
Attendance - Oral Hearing	14.00	\$290.00	\$4,060.00	\$0.00	\$4,060.00			
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00			
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00			
		191						

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES	\$58,551.00	\$0.00	\$58,551.00

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies	\$580.25	\$0.00	\$580.25
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier	\$26.64	\$0.00	\$26.64
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking	-	included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$606.89	\$0.00	\$606.89



## **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2011-0140		Process:	East West Tie Li	ne Designat	tion
Party:	Ojibways of Pic River First Nation		Name:	Joanna Vince (V	Villms & Shi	er Environmental Lawy
				Completed Practising/Years experien	of relevant	
Counse	l/Articling Student/Paralegal:	V		2 years	s	
	Consultant:		3			
	CV attached:		CV r	ot required:	<b>V</b>	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed										
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total					
Preparation	130.90	\$170.00	\$22,253.00	\$0.00	\$22,253.00					
Attendance - Technical Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00					
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00					
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00					
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00					
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00					
	- v	V/////////////////////////////////////			400.000.00					
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES			\$22,253.00	\$0.00	\$22,253.00					

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage	14	\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):	0.0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation	:87	\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

ate En	try #	Fee / Time Explanation	Work	Aug 7/201 ing Lawyer		Hours	Amount	Inv#	Billing Status
684		Ojibways of Pic River First Nation							
61	76	Re: EB2011-0140 East West Tie Transmissi	C						
		Lawyer: 49 4.20 Hrs X 290.00				4.20	1218.00		Unbilled
		instructions from client; lengthy conference	call	l and brie	fing from client a			rmer leg	
		Lawyer: 49 5.00 Hrs X 290.00	49	- CHERIE	BRANT	5.00	1450.00		Unbilled
		consider background materials;							
		Lawyer: 48 2.20 Hrs X 170.00	48	- JOANNA	VINCE	2.20	374.00		Unbilled
		instructions to obtain interrogatories and r						C. Brant	
		Lawyer: 49 4.40 Hrs X 290.00					1276.00		Unbilled
		consider proceedings materials; lengthy meet						ize effi	
pr I,	/2013	Lawyer: 49 2.00 Hrs X 290.00	49	- CHERIE	BRANT	2.00	580.00		Unbilled
		consider materials;	4.0	AUDD TO	BRANT	0.00	222 00		11-1-111-1
		Lawyer: 49 0.80 Hrs X 290.00 meet with Joanna Vince;	49	- CHEKIE	BRANT	0.80	232.00		Unbilled
			10	- JOANNA	MINCE.	6.60	1122.00		Unbilled
		review responses to interrogatories by all i						addross	
		Lawyer: 49 6.60 Hrs X 290.00				6.60	1914.00	address	Unbilled
		prepare outline; conference call with client					1311.00		onbilica
		Lawyer: 49 3.00 Hrs X 290.00				3.00	870.00		Unbilled
		outline preparation; telephone call with Jen					0,000		0110111100
		Lawyer: 48 4.80 Hrs X 170.00				4.80	816.00		Unbilled
		review whether policy frameworks are binding						ic River	
		Lawyer: 49 11.00 Hrs X 290.00				11.00	3190.00		Unbilled
		consider submissions; prepare outline; follo	w up	with clie:	nt;				
						0.60	174.00		Unbilled
13	45923	revise outline; memo to client;							
or 10,	/2013	Lawyer: 49 0.60 Hrs X 290.00 revise outline; memo to client; Lawyer: 48 1.00 Hrs X 170.00	48	- JOANNA	VINCE	1.00	170.00		Unbilled
тЭ,	402/4	review miada case on aboriginal consultation	L #						
		Lawyer: 49 4.50 Hrs X 290.00	49	- CHERIE	BRANT	4.50	1305.00		Unbilled
13	46509	prepare submission;							
		1		- JOANNA		1.80	306.00		Unbilled
13	46616	review outline for oral argument and discuss							
		Lawyer: 48 3.40 Hrs X 170.00			VINCE	3.40	578.00		Unbilled
		prepare oral argument on duty to consult bac							
		1		- CHERIE	BRANT	3.00	870.00		Unbilled
		conference call with client; consider materi	.als;			0.00			1 1 3 3 3
or 15,	/2013	Lawyer: 48 2.80 Hrs X 170.00	48	- JOANNA	VINCE	2.80	476.00		Unbilled
		prepare oral arguments for Chief Michano re							
		Lawyer: 49 1.80 Hrs X 290.00	49	- CHERIE	BRANT	1.80	522.00		Unbilled
13	46994	revise outline;	4.0	7071111	********	2 00	476 00		17-1-211-4
		Lawyer: 48 2.80 Hrs X 170.00				2.80	476.00		Unbilled
		review consultation plans and participation				3.00	870.00	,	Unbilled
12) DE 17/	01060	Lawyer: 49 3.00 Hrs X 290.00 consider MNO submissions; consider Board Sta	49 .ff C1	- CHERIE	on Phase Is inst			Winco:	OUDITIEG
10 n= 10	/2012	Lawyer: 48 4.20 Hrs X 170.00	10 (TT 2)	VINITSSTOUS	VINCE		714.00	vince,	Unbilled
13) 13)	50644	review transmitter applications for Aborigin	ובו כנ	neultatio	vince n and narticination			elevant	
				- JOANNA		6.00	1020.00	CICVAIIC	Unbilled
13	50767	locate letter from MNO to the Ministry and r						by MNO:	
		Lawyer: 49 4.60 Hrs X 290.00	49	- CHERTE	BRANT	4.60	1334.00	21 11107	Unbilled
13	50856	consider arguments in chief; prepare submiss	ion:	CHBRID	Diumi	1.00	2001.00		011022200
or 22/	/2013	Lawyer: 49 6.00 Hrs X 290.00	49	- CHERIE	BRANT	6.00	1740.00		Unbilled
		prepare submission;		*					
or 23/	/2013	Lawyer: 48 1.20 Hrs X 170.00	48	- JOANNA	VINCE	1.20	204.00		Unbilled
13	52042	locate and review Board Staff submissions on	cons	sideration	of and weighting	of Aborigi	nal part	icipatio	on; locate
		Lawyer: 49 8.00 Hrs X 290.00	49	- CHERIE	BRANT	8.00	2320.00	-	Unbilled
		review arguments in chief; prepare submissio							
or 24/	/2013	Lawyer: 48 2.00 Hrs X 170.00	48			2.00	340.00		Unbilled
		prepare first draft of written argument focu				required o	content t	o design	nate a tr <mark>a</mark> n
or 24/	/2013	Lawyer: 49 10.00 Hrs X 290.00		- CHERIE		10.00	2900.00		Unbilled
		prepare submissions;							
pr 25/	/2013	Lawyer: 48 1.40 Hrs X 170.00		- JOANNA		1.40	238.00		Unbilled
		review and revise written arguments on Board						ples and	
		Lawyer: 49 10.00 Hrs X 290.00	49	- CHERIE	BRANT	10.00	2900.00		Unbilled
		draft submission;					200		
		Lawyer: 48 1.80 Hrs X 170.00		- JOANNA		1.80	306.00		Unbilled
		meet with C. Brant to discuss draft oral arg			-				
		-	49	- CHERIE	RKWI.	5.50	1595.00		Unbilled
		prepare submission;	4.0	CHERTE	DDANIM	0 00	2220 00	6.7	IInhill-1
			49	- CHERIE	BRANT	8.00	2320.00		Unbilled
		prepare submission;	/ D	_ TOBBIE	VINCE	3 20	5// 00		IInhillo-
				- JOANNA		3.20	544.00	mmento	Unbilled on discrimi
		review RES and AltaLink arguments in chief f Lawyer: 49 13.00 Hrs X 290.00				13.00	on and co	www.ciif2 (	Unbilled
		-	47	- CUEKIE	DIVANT	13.00	5110.00		ountited
		prepare written submission;	10	- JOANNA	VINCE	2.80	476.00		Unbilled
		Lawyer: 48 2.80 Hrs X 170.00 review draft oral argument and provide addit						Particir	
		Lawyer: 48 2.00 Hrs X 170.00		- JOANNA		2.00	340.00	- UT CTCTF	Unbilled
131	52884	research and review case law on Aboriginal P						al parti	
		Lawyer: 49 8.00 Hrs X 290.00	49	- CHERIE	BRANT	8.00	2320.00	purc	Unbilled
		prepare written submission;		JIIIII					
		Lawyer: 48 2.80 Hrs X 170.00	48	- JOANNA	VINCE	2.80	476.00		Unbilled
T 307									
	53137	research on Aboriginal Participation; prepar	e tak	ole compar	ing Aboriginal Pai	rticipation	i and Abc	riginal	Consultati
135				ole compar. - CHERIE		6.00	1740.00	tidingi	Unbilled

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawvers LLP Client Fees Listing To Aug 7/2013 Billing Amount Inv# Fee / Time Working Lawyer Hours Entry # Explanation Status Unbilled 48 - JOANNA VINCE May 1/2013 Lawyer: 48 1.80 Hrs X 170.00 1.80 306.00 review articles on aboriginal participation, aboriginal title and land claims; 1353319 12.00 3480.00 Unbilled 1/2013 Lawver: 49 12.00 Hrs X 290.00 49 - CHERIE BRANT Mav hearing preparation; meeting with client; revise submission; travel to Thunder Bay 1353786 48 - JOANNA VINCE 476.00 2.80 Unbilled May 2/2013 Lawyer: 48 2.80 Hrs X 170.00 review and revise oral argument; expand on points about aboriginal participation and add information about Daniel 1353430 2/2013 Lawyer: 49 10.00 Hrs X 290.00 49 - CHERIE BRANT 10.00 2900.00 Unbilled May hearing preparation; meeting with client; attend hearing; revise submission; debrief meeting; 1353787 Unbilled 49 - CHERIE BRANT 4.00 1160.00 3/2013 Lawyer: 49 4.00 Hrs X 290.00 1353788 meeting with client; attend hearing; debrief meeting; 3/2013 Lawyer: 48 6.40 Hrs X 170.00 48 - JOANNA VINCE 6.40 1088.00 Unbilled Mav review transcripts from Thursday May 2, 2013 and highlight relevant arguments for expansion and/or counter argume 1391070 48 - JOANNA VINCE 2.00 340.00 Unbilled 4/2013 Lawyer: 48 2.00 Hrs X 170.00 review oral submissions from May 3, 2013 and highlight sections that require counter arguments or that support Pi 1391071 48 - JOANNA VINCE 2.40 408.00 Unbilled 5/2013 Lawyer: 48 2.40 Hrs X 170.00 May begin to prepare counter arguments to MNO oral submission, including characterization of consultation, accommodat 1391072 49 - CHERIE BRANT 1.40 406.00 Unbilled 6/2013 Lawyer: 49 1.40 Hrs X 290.00 prepare written submission; meeting with Joanna Vince on case law matters; emails to client; 1353792 1836.00 Unbilled Lawyer: 48 10.80 Hrs X 170.00 - JOANNA VINCE 10.80 6/2013 48 May discuss arguments made during oral hearings in Thunder Bay; identify those intervenors that had a common approach 1353949 49 - CHERIE BRANT 14.00 4060.00 Unbilled Lawyer: 49 14.00 Hrs X 290.00 7/2013 prepare written submission; conference call with client; instructions to Joanna Vince; 1354332 812.00 Unbilled Lawyer: 49 2.80 Hrs X 290.00 49 - CHERIE BRANT 2.80 7/2013 Mav revise submission; instructions to Joanna Vince; 1391073 48 - JOANNA VINCE Unbilled Lawyer: 48 10.10 Hrs X 170.00 1717.00 7/2013 May review Carrier Sekani Court of Appeal decision; review Rio Tinto Supreme Court of Canada decision re jurisdiction 1391150 Unbilled 3770.00 Lawyer: 49 13.00 Hrs X 290.00 49 - CHERIE BRANT 13.00 8/2013 Mav prepare and revise written submission; conference call with client; instructions to Joanna Vince; 1354331 Lawyer: 48 11.00 Hrs X 170.00 48 - JOANNA VINCE 11.00 1870.00 Unbilled May 8/2013 review case law on reciprocal duty of Aboriginal communities to engage in consultation; prepare write up on same 1354436 8.00 1360.00 Unhilled 48 - JOANNA VINCE May 9/2013 Lawyer: 48 8.00 Hrs X 170.00 review revise and finalize written arguments; receipt of comments from client on written submission; telephone ca 1354666 Unbilled Lawyer: 49 4.00 Hrs X 290.00 49 - CHERIE BRANT 4.00 1160.00 9/2013 May revise submission; lengthy conference calls with client; instructions to Joanna Vince; 1391074 1.80 May 10/2013 48 - JOANNA VINCE Lawyer: 48 1.80 Hrs X 170.00 review submissions from intervenors and highlight positions on Aboriginal Participation and Aboriginal Consultati 1354916 48 - JOANNA VINCE 6.10 1037.00 Unbilled May 26/2013 Lawyer: 48 6.10 Hrs X 170.00 summarize MNO arguments re Aboriginal participation and Aboriginal consultation and compare to Pic River's positi 1391102 870.00 Unbilled 3.00 - CHERIE BRANT May 29/2013 Lawyer: 49 3.00 Hrs X 290.00 49 1362887 review memo; Lawyer: 49 0.50 Hrs X 290.00 145.00 Unbilled May 30/2013 - CHERIE BRANT 0.50 49 1362888 meeting with Joanna Vince; 5.00 850.00 Unbilled - JOANNA VINCE May 31/2013 Lawyer: 48 5.00 Hrs X 170.00 48 review submissions from all intervenors for points of agreement with Pic River; summarized consultation and parti 1391108 68.00 Unbilled Lawyer: 48 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 48 - JOANNA VINCE 0.40 Jun 4/2013 receipt and initial review of reply submissions from applicants; 1365849 348.00 Unbilled 49 - CHERIE BRANT 1.20 Jun 11/2013 Lawyer: 49 1.20 Hrs X 290.00 revise memo to client to seek instructions; 1368337 Unbilled - CHERIE BRANT 2,60 754.00 Lawyer: 49 2.60 Hrs X 290.00 49 Jun 12/2013 revise memo to client; 1368450 2.40 408.00 Unbilled Lawyer: 48 2.40 Hrs X 170.00 48 - JOANNA VINCE Jun 12/2013 review reply arguments from applicants, focusing on aboriginal participation and aboriginal consultation; prepare 1368508 255,00 Unbilled 1.50 Lawyer: 48 1.50 Hrs X 170.00 48 - JOANNA VINCE Jun 14/2013 review submission from UCT and send brief summary to client; MOVE TO NEW FILE: prepare intervenor request for Ont 1369675 48 - JOANNA VINCE 1.60 272.00 Unbilled Lawyer: 48 1.60 Hrs X 170.00 Jun 17/2013 review applicant reply arguments and summarize for client; 1369863 551.00 Unbilled 1.90 49 - CHERIE BRANT Jun 18/2013 Lawyer: 49 1.90 Hrs X 290.00 review applicant responses; receive instructions to prepare response; revise memo; 1391112 238.00 Unbilled Lawyer: 48 1.40 Hrs X 170.00 48 - JOANNA VINCE 1.40 Jun 18/2013 review and finalize summary of Applicants' reply arguments; 1391116 0.30 87.00 Unbilled Lawyer: 49 0.30 Hrs X 290.00 49 - CHERIE BRANT Jun 25/2013 instructions to Joanna Vince; 1373121 Lawyer: 48 0.80 Hrs X 170.00 0.80 136.00 Unbilled. 48 - JOANNA VINCE Jun 25/2013 discuss preparation of letter to the Energy Board to correct the record based on NextBridge's reply and misstatem 1383584 0.80 232.00 Unbilled Jun 26/2013 Lawyer: 49 0.80 Hrs X 290.00 49 - CHERIE BRANT 1373113 revise clarification of record letter; Unbilled Lawyer: 48 1.00 Hrs X 170.00 48 - JOANNA VINCE 1.00 170.00 Jun 26/2013 prepare draft letter to correct the record based on NextBridge's reply submission; 1373195 48 - JOANNA VINCE 0.40 68.00 Unbilled Jun 27/2013 Lawyer: 48 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 revise letter to the Board correcting the record based on NextBridges assertions about Pic River; 1373899 Unbilled. 49 - CHERIE BRANT 0.40 116.00 Jun 28/2013 Lawyer: 49 0.40 Hrs X 290.00 revise letter; 1374035 0.40 68.00 Unbilled Lawyer: 48 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 48 - JOANNA VINCE Jun 28/2013 review letter to Board to clarify concerns with NextBridge's submission; 1374701 290.00 Unbilled 1.00 - CHERIE BRANT Lawyer: 49 1.00 Hrs X 290.00 49 7/2013 1391119 review decision; 332.80 80804.00 Unbilled: 0.00 Billed: 0.00 332.80 80804.00 Total:

Percent Billed:

0.00

0.00

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Costs Journal

			Client Costs To Aug				
Date Entry#	Paid To Explanation	Sourc	e Matter	Client Name	Ref# G/L Acc	ct	Amount
Apr 1/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
1347249 Apr 1/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	53.50
1347276 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	1.75
1347310 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.75
1347311 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.50
1347313 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.50
1347314 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
1347315 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	1.25
1347316 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	11.50
1347317	Photocopies						
Apr 1/2013 1347318	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	4.75
Apr 1/2013 1347321	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
Apr 1/2013 1347322	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.50
Apr 1/2013 1347323	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.50
Apr 1/2013 1347324	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	1.75
Apr 1/2013 1347325	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	1.25
Apr 1/2013 1347326	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	2.75
Apr 1/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	5.75
1347328 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
1347329 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	1.00
1347330 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.50
1347331 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	2.00
1347332 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	1.75
1347333 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	2.00
	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	1.50
	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	2.25
	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
1347338	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
Apr 1/2013 1347339	Photocopies						23.50
Apr 1/2013 1347341	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	
	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	58.25
Apr 1/2013 1347355	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	58.50
Apr 1/2013 1347410	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	7.25
Apr 1/2013 1347411	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.50
Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	29.50
Apr 1/2013 1347417	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	38.00
Apr 1/2013 1347427	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	19.25
Apr 1/2013	-	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	21.00
Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	17.25
Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	40.75
1347431 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	40.75
Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	13.00
1347568 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	9.50
1347569 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	8.50
	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	7.75
1/2013		CLIN		-3			

#### Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Costs Journal

			Client Cost: To Aug			
Date Entry#	Paid To Explanation	Sourc	ce Matter	Client Name	Ref# G/L Acct	Amount
1347573						
Apr 1/2013	-	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	0.50
1347574 Apr 1/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	0.25
1347575	Photocopies			3 1		
Apr 1/2013 1347576	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	23.50
Apr 1/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	10.25
1347578	Photocopies Total for Apr 1/2013:	527.50				
Apr 4/2013 1348178	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	1.50
Apr 10/2013	Total for Apr 4/2013 :	1.50 CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	0.75
1349236	Photocopies Total for Apr 10/2013	0.75				
Apr 12/2013 1349551	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	0.75
Apr 12/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	1.50
1349363	Photocopies Total for Apr 12/2013:	2.25				
Apr 17/2013 1350494	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	0.25
	Total for Apr 17/2013 :	0.25	(17)	Odikusus of Ris Ri	E170 DECOVEDY	0 50
Apr 19/2013 1351528	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	8.50
Apr 19/2013 1351529	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	11.00
Apr 19/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	34.50
1351530 Apr 19/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	0.75
1351639 Apr 19/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	0.75
1351661	Photocopies		02.0			
Apr 22/2013	Total for Apr 19/2013 :	<b>55.50</b> CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	2.00
1351789	-	2.00				
Apr 24/2013	Total for Apr 22/2013 :	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	16.25
1356615	Photocopies Total for Apr 24/2013	16.25				
Apr 26/2013	- 31	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	3.25
1357213 Apr 26/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	4.00
1357225 Apr 26/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	3.50
1357227	Photocopies					
Apr 26/2013 1357244	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	1.00
Apr 26/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	1.00
Apr 26/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	2.25
1357247 Apr 26/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	0.50
1357254	Photocopies			Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	4.00
Apr 26/2013 1357275	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Fic Ki	5170 - RECOVERY	
Apr 26/2013 1357290	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	3.25
	Total for Apr 26/2013 :	22.75				
Apr 27/2013 1357336	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	2.00
	Total for Apr 27/2013 :	2.00	C17.C	Oddhumum of Die Di	5170 - RECOVERY	1 25
Apr 28/2013 1357346	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri		1.25
Apr 28/2013 1357347	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	0.50
Apr 28/2013 1357348	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	1.75
Apr 28/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	0.25
1357349 Apr 28/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	0.75
1357350 Apr 28/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	0.50
1357351	Photocopies					0.50
Apr 28/2013 1357352	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	
Apr 28/2013 1357357	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	1.00
Apr 28/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	2.75
1357359 Apr 28/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	2.75
1357360 Apr 28/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	6.75
1357361	Photocopies					
Apr 28/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170 - RECOVERY	2.75

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Costs Journal

				Client Cost To Aug				
Date	Entry#	Paid To Explanation	Source	ce Matter	Client Name	Ref# G/L Acc	t	Amount
	Ditty	Total for Apr 28/2013 :	21.50					
-	30/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	3.75
Т	1357654	Photocopies Total for Apr 30/2013:	3.75					
	6/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	13.25
	6/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	11.00
1	1358789	Photocopies	CER	0170	Ojibwaya of fic ki	3170	- RECOVERT	11.00
	6/2013 1358791	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	3.50
		Total for May 6/2013 :	27.75					
_	7/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5096	- PHOTOCOPY	3.25
	7/2013	rnococopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	36.00
	7/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	_ DECOVEDY	0.75
	.359172	Photocopies	CER	0170	Olipways of Fic Ki	3170	- RECOVERY	0.75
Mau	8/2013	Total for May 7/2013 :	40.00 CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- PECOVERY	1 00
	.359288	Photocopies	CER	01/0	Olipways of Fig Ki	3170	- RECOVERY	1.00
	8/2013 .359290	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	3.00
Мау	8/2013	Thotocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	18.75
1	.359421	Photocopies	00.75					
Мау	9/2013	Total for May 8/2013 :	<b>22.75</b> CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	10.25
	.359550 9/2013	Photocopies	ann.	6176	0111	E170	ADGGUDDU.	05.50
_	359603	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	25.50
	9/2013	Photogonico	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	16.25
	.359608 <b>9/2013</b>	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	24.50
	359652	Photocopies	277	6176		5170		10.05
	9/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	12.25
	9/2013	Photography	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
	.3 <b>59655</b> 9/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
1	359656	Photocopies			-			
May 1	0/2013	Total for May 9/2013 :	<b>89.25</b> CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	7.25
1	359692	Photocopies		6186		5180		
-	.0/2013 .359701	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	5.75
	0/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	1.50
	.0/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
1:	359706	Photocopies	277	6176		5170		12.05
	0/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	13.25
	0/2013	Photography	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
	359714 0/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	1.00
13	359715	Photocopies						
	0/2013 359719	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	16.50
	0/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	12.25
	359721 0/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	8.00
13	359724	Photocopies						
-	0/2013 359727	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
May 1	0/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	2.25
	359728 0/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	4.50
13	359730	Photocopies						
	0/2013 359733	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	7.25
		Total for May 10/2013 :	80.25					
	3/2013 359878	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	7.50
		Total for May 13/2013 :	7.50					
_	7/2013 360991	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	2.25
		Total for May 17/2013 :	2.25					17
	4/2013 366705	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	13.00
Jun 4	4/2013	-	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	26.50
	366711 4/2013	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	32.75
13	366719	Photocopies						
	4/2013 366721	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	16.00
Jun 4	4/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	5.00
	366725	Photocopies						
	4/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways of Pic Ri	5170	<ul> <li>RECOVERY</li> </ul>	11.50

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP
Client Costs Journal
To Aug 7/2013

				To A	lug 7/2013				
Dat	e Entry#	Paid To Explanation	Sour	ce Matter	Client No	ame	Ref# G/L A	cct	Amount
		Total for Jun 4/2013 :	104 75						
Jun	7/2013	10tal for Jun 4/2013 :		6176	Otibusus	of Dio Di	5170	DECOMEDY	10.05
Vui	1367835	Photocopies	CER	01/6	Ojibways	of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	10.25
	130,000	Total for Jun 7/2013:	10.05				2		
מנוד	14/2013	10tal 101 buil 7/2013 :	10.25 CER	6176	Odibusus	of Pic Ri	5170	DEGOVERNY	0.50
oun	1370163	Photocopies	CER	01/0	Olinways	OI PIC RI	3170	- RECOVERY	0.50
Jun	14/2013	Thotocopies	CER	- 6176	Odibusua	of Dia Di	5170	- DECOURDY	0.50
oun	1370164	Photocopies	CER	01/0	Olipwaya	of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.50
Jun	14/2013	rnococopies	CER	6176	Odibuava	of Pic Ri	5170	DECOVERY	2.00
0 411	1370171	Photocopies	CER	0170	Olipways	OI PIC KI	3170	- RECOVERY	2.00
	10,01,1	Total for Jun 14/2013 :	3.00		300				
Jun	17/2013	10001 101 001 14/2015 .	CER	6176	Oddburgue	of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	4.75
0411	1370333	Photocopies	CER	0170	Olinways	OI FIC KI	3170	- RECOVERI	4.75
	20.000	Total for Jun 17/2013 :	4.75						19
Jun	18/2013	10001 202 000 17,2020 .	CER	6176	Oiihways	of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	2.00
	1370858	Photocopies	0211	-0270	0)15"475	OI LIC KI	3170	TODOO V DICT	2.00
Jun	18/2013	•	CER	6176	Olibways	of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	1.25
	1370964	Photocopies			-33-		02/0		1.20
Jun	18/2013	•	CER	6176	Oiibways	of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	1.25
	1371040	Photocopies			-3-434			1,20012112	1.20
Jun	18/2013	-	CER	6176	Ojibwavs	of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	1.50
	1371086	Photocopies							
Jun	18/2013	-	CER	6176	Ojibways	of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	1.50
	1371088	Photocopies							
Jun	18/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways	of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	1.50
	1371089	Photocopies						1000	
		Total for Jun 18/2013:	9.00						
Jun	19/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways	of Pic Ri	5170	<ul> <li>RECOVERY</li> </ul>	1.00
	1371122	Photocopies							
Jun	19/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways	of Pic Ri	5170	<ul> <li>RECOVERY</li> </ul>	1.50
	1371126	Photocopies							41 11
Jun	19/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways	of Pic Ri	5170	<ul> <li>RECOVERY</li> </ul>	12.25
	1371229	Photocopies							
_	07/0010	Total for Jun 19/2013:	14.75						
Jun	27/2013	Dhat seed as	CER	6176	Ojibways	of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	2.00
	1374242	Photocopies							
Tun	28/2013	Total for Jun 27/2013 :	2.00	6176	0445	-6 ni- ni	5170	PEGOMERIA	1 00
Juli	1374554	Photocopies	CER	6176	Ojibways	of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	1.00
	13/4334	Total for Jun 28/2013:	1 00						
Jun	30/2013	A & B COURIER	1.00 AP	6176	Odibusus	of Dia Div	38926 5065	- DELIVERY	13.32
oun	1374687	Deliveries	Nr.	0170	Olipwdia	OI FIG KIV	30920 3003	- DEDIVERT	13.32
	2011001	Total for Jun 30/2013 :	13.32						
Jul	3/2013		CER	6176	Oiibways	of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.75
	1376028	Photocopies	5211	02.0	0)25	01 110 111	01,0	REGOVERE	0.75
Jul	3/2013		CER	6176	Oiibways	of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.75
	1376040	Photocopies			1975	.0	*		30
Jul	3/2013	•	CER	6176	Ojibways	of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.50
	1376069	Photocopies			, ,				.,
Jul	3/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways	of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	0.50
	1376156	Photocopies	1.3						
		Total for Jul 3/2013:	2.50	171					
Jul	10/2013		CER	6176	Ojibways	of Pic Ri	5170	- RECOVERY	2.50
	1378944	Photocopies							
		Total for Jul 10/2013 :	2.50						
Jul		A & B COURIER	AP	6176	Ojibways	of Pic Riv	39168 5065	- DELIVERY	13.32
	1380157	Deliveries							
	21 /0212	Total for Jul 15/2013 :	13.32						
Jul	31/2013	adjusted sharing cost of	photocopies CER	6176	Ojibways	of Pic Ri	D6867 5096	- PHOTOCOPY	-500.00
	1391168	Photocopies	F00 11						
		Total for Jul 31/2013:	-500.00						

\*\*\* Client Costs Journal - G/L Account Summary \*\*\*

G/L Ac	count	Debit	Credit
1210	- CLIENT DISBRECOV.	606.89	
5065	- DELIVERY CHARGES		26.64
5096	- PHOTOCOPY RECOVERY		-496.75
5170	- RECOVERY - LASER CO		1077.00
	Total:	606.89	606.89



### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2011-0140		Process:	East West Tie Li	ne Designatio	on	
Party:	Ojibways of Pic River First Nation		Name:	Carol L. Godby (	Harrison Pen	sa)	
				Completed Practising/Years experien	of relevant		
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal:	<b>✓</b>		20 year	's		
	Consultant:						ü
	CV attached:		CV r	not required:	<b>V</b>		

#### **Statement of Fees Being Claimed** Hourly Total Hours Subtotal **HST** rate \$26,810.00 \$0.00 \$350.00 \$26,810.00 Preparation 76.60 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 Attendance - Technical Conference \$0.00 Attendance - Settlement Conference \$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 Attendance - Oral Hearing \$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 Argument \$0.00 \$170.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 Case Management TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES \$26,810.00 \$26,810.00 \$0.00

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies	\$106.75	\$0.00	\$106.75
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier	\$12.21	\$0.00	\$12.21
Telephone	\$23.74	\$0.00	\$23.74
Postage	\$1.66	\$0.00	\$1.66
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car	F:	\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$144.36	\$0.00	\$144.36



## **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2011-0140		Process:	East West Tie Line De	esignation	
Party:	Ojibways of Pic River First Nation		Name:	Steven Teal (Harrison	Pensa)	
				Completed Years Practising/Years of rele experience	vant	
Counse	l/Articling Student/Paralegal:	$\checkmark$		3 years		
	Consultant:		w			W.
	CV attached:		CV r	not required:	]	

#### **Statement of Fees Being Claimed** Hourly Hours Subtotal **HST** Total rate \$540.00 \$540.00 2.40 \$0.00 Preparation \$225.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 Attendance - Technical Conference \$0.00 \$0.00 Attendance - Settlement Conference \$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 Attendance - Oral Hearing \$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 Argument \$0.00 \$170.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 Case Management

 TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES
 \$540.00
 \$0.00
 \$540.00

 Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

 Net Cost
 HST
 Total

 Photocopies
 \$0.00
 \$0.00

 Printing
 \$0.00
 \$0.00

 Fax
 \$0.00
 \$0.00

 Courier
 \$0.00
 \$0.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	
			\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier	5	\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00



## **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2011-0140		Process:	East West Tie Line Designation			
Party:	Ojibways of Pic River First Nation		Name:	Brad Adams (Har	rison Pensa)		
				Completed You Practising/Years of experience	f relevant		
Counse	l/Articling Student/Paralegal:	V		1 year			
	Consultant:		19				
	CV attached:		CV r	not required:	<b>▽</b>		

Statement of Fees Being Claimed							
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total		
Preparation	8.80	\$100.00	\$880.00	\$0.00	\$880.00		
Attendance - Technical Conference		0	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES			\$880.00	\$0.00	\$880.00		

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail	U.	\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation	10	\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00



Telephone: (519) 679 9660 Facsimile: (519) 667 3362

Ojibways of the Pic River First Nation P.O. Box 193 Heron Bay, ON POT 1R0 April 19, 2013 Invoice #: 132041

File #: 151373/Carol L. Godby RE: East West Tie- In Intervention

#### SUMMARY OF THIS INVOICE

Total Fees		\$	28,230.00
Reduction Made On Your Behalf		\$	-4,000.00
Total Net Fees		\$	24,230.00
Total Disbursements		\$	144.36
Total Tax		\$	0.00
TOTAL	25	\$	24,374.36
APPLIED FROM TRUST		\$	0.00
TOTAL THIS INVOICE TOTAL PRIOR OUTSTANDING INVOICES		\$ \$	24,374.36 0.00
TOTAL DUE AND OWING:		\$_	24,374.36

#### PLEASE REMIT WITH PAYMENT TO HARRISON PENSA LLP

GST\HST REGISTRATION NO: R867630543
Interest of 1.3% is charged based on the Courts of Justice Act at time of billing on all invoices over 30 days.

HARRISON PENSA
450 Talbot Street
P.O. Box 3237
LONDON ON N6A 4K3

Telephone: (519) 679 9660 Facsimile: (519) 667 3362

Ojibways of the Pic River First Nation P.O. Box 193 Heron Bay, ON POT 1R0 April 19, 2013 Invoice #: 132041

File #: 151373/Carol L. Godby RE: East West Tie- In Intervention

#### TO ALL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above-noted matter, including:

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	LAWYER
19-Nov-12	REview and exchange correspondence with potential experts; TA with same for OEB intervention	1.00	CLG
20-Nov-12	Review and exchange correspondence with potential experts; client	.40	CLG
27-Nov-12	TA with William Teiser re potential expertise in OEB proceeding; review CV and rates; email to client	.80	CLG
30-Nov-12	Meeting with Prof. Zohdi at UC. Berkeley re potential engagement in OEB proceeding; meeting with Scott Williams, Berkey Williams re energy experts, transmission economics familiar with Indian land/law issues	4.00	CLG
4-Dec-12	TA with Phil Hanser; TA with Steve Moss, M. Cubed regarding potential engagement for expertise in the OEB proceeding emails to client regarding recommendations	2.50	CLG
7-Jan-13	Organize and Review Transmitter Applications	3.00	CLG
8-Jan-13	Review Tranmitter Applications, prepare categories for interrogatories; prepare comparative matrix	4.00	CLG
9-Jan-13	Teleconference with client and Brattle group regarding Applications filed, key issues and strategy for proceeding	1.00	CLG
9-Jan-13	Review Applications from Transmitters	3.00	CLG
10-Jan-13	Review Applications, prepare interrogatories and comparative matrix; review matrices from client and incorporate	2.00	CLG
11-Jan-13	Review Applications, draft interrogatories and prepare comparative matrix	3.50	CLG
13-Jan-13	Review Applications and Draft Interrogatories and comparative matrix	2.50	CLG
14-Jan-13	Review submissions re confidentiality request by RES	.50	CLG

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	LAWYER
14-Jan-13	Review emails from client re draft interrogatories	1.00	CLG
15-Jan-13	Review email from MNO filed with Minister Of Energy, copied to Board, discuss same with client, discuss strategies for addressing. Review further matrix prepared by client; review letters filed with Board on confidentiality issue.	3.00	CLG
16-Jan-13	Reveiew Applications and draft interrogatories and comparative matrix	3.00	CLG
16-Jan-13	Reviewing documentation uploaded to OEB web poral; email with CLG re: procedural order #5 and letter from Metis; interoffice correspondence re: matter proceeding and research relating to assertions made by Metis.	.40	SMT
17-Jan-13	Review Applications, draft interrogatories, review MNO letter with associate for review and research; prepare comparative matrix	2.00	CLG
18-Jan-13	Teleconference with client and Expert re Transmitter Applications and key issues to pursue in interrogatories	1.00	CLG
18-Jan-13	Review Applications; Draft Interrogatories and Matrix for comparison; review correspondence from RES	3.50	CLG
18-Jan-13	Providing instructions for research to be completed in relation to Metis and their comments in the January 2013 letter filed with the OEB.	.10	SMT
19-Jan-13	Review Notes from client; Brattle Group; review Applications and draft interrogatories	2.60	CLG
21-Jan-13	Review Applications and Draft Interrogatories	4.30	CLG
23-Jan-13	Review Applications, draft interrogatories and comparative matrix	5.50	CLG
23-Jan-13	Interoffice discussion re: research results in relation to Metis rights in Robinson-Superior Treaty area.	.20	SMT
23-Jan-13	Research re Metis rights	1.20	BJA
25-Jan-13	Research and memo re Metis and EWT	1.60	BJA
26-Jan-13	Review applications, draft IR's review input from experts, amend IR	3.50	CLG
28-Jan-13	TA with client; TA with expert; review draft interrogatories and amend	3.00	CLG
29-Jan-13	Review input from experts and incorporate changes into draft IR's;	4.00	CLG
30-Jan-13	TA with client x 2; review IRs, and amend	5.00	CLG
4-Feb-13	TA with client; review email; review IRs filed by parties in proceeding	2.00	CLG
6-Feb-13	TA with Byron; review IR's review MNO research re claims and provide email response re IR's	2.00	CLG
7-Feb-13	REview IRs filed and research re claims in R-S Treaty area	3.00	CLG
26-Feb-13	Reviewing letters from Metis; Reviewing research re: Metis rights;	.60	SMT

DATE	DESCRIPTION			НС	URS	LAWYER
27-Feb-13	Discussing research and pand revisions;	ch	.20	SMT		
6-Mar-13	Research re Metis and EV	VT			1.80	ВЈА
13-Mar-13	Reviewing and revising n research and proceeding;	nemo on Metis; Int	erossice email re:		.60	SMT
15-Mar-13	Discussion on research; E	mails on research;			.20	SMT
19-Mar-13	Researched cases applying	g Powley test in O	ntario		3.80	BJA
20-Mar-13	Discussion re: Metis resea	urch and matter pro	ceeding.		.10	SMT
22-Mar-13	Finalized research memo				.40	ВЈА
Total F	ees:		15		\$	24,230.00
Plus GS Plus HS	nents made in your favour: T: T: ees (INCL. TAX)	HOURS 76.60 2.40 8.80		,230.00 ,000.00 <u>0,00</u> <u>0.00</u>	<u>\$</u>	24,230.00 AMOUNT \$26,810.00 \$540.00 \$880.00
Courier B&W Photocopie Long Distance Co	harges on-Taxable Disbursements	<u>.</u>	***************************************	\$12.21 \$106.75 \$23.74 \$1.66 \$144.36	\$	144.36
TOTAL DUE &	OWING				<u>\$</u>	24,374.36

#### THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN

HARRISON PENSA LLP

Per:\_\_\_\_\_\_Carol L. Godby

E. & O.E.

GST \ HST REGISTRATION NO: R867630543
Interest of 1.3% is charged based on the Courts of Justice Act at time of billing on all invoices over 30 days.



## **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2011-0140		Process:	East West Tie Li	ne Designa	tion	
Party:	Ojibways of Pic River First Nation		Name:	Philip Q. Hanse	r (The Bratt	le Group)	
				Completed Practising/Years experier	of relevant	e:	9
Counse	l/Articling Student/Paralegal:			33 year	rs	• 6	
	Consultant:	$\checkmark$					
	CV attached:		CV r	not required:	V		

**Statement of Fees Being Claimed** 

	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total
Preparation	6.00	\$450.00	\$2,700.00	\$0.00	\$2,700.00
Attendance - Technical Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES	\$2,700.00	\$0.00	\$2,700.00

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation	v)	\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00



## **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2011-0140	Process:	East West Tie Line Designa	ation
Party:	Ojibways of Pic River First Nation	Name:	R. Lee Gresham (The Bratt	le Group)
			Completed Years Practising/Years of relevant experience	ı
Counse	l/Articling Student/Paralegal: Consultant:		7 years	-
	CV attached:	CV r	not required:	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total
Preparation	71.50	\$290.00	\$20,735.00	\$0.00	\$20,735.00
Attendance - Technical Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
	v/////////////////////////////////////			40.00	420 725 00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES	\$20,735.00	\$0.00	\$20,735.00

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals	2	\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00



### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2011-0140		Process:	East West Tie L	ine Designat	tion	
Party:	Ojibways of Pic River First Nation		Name:	Quincy Liao (Th	ne Brattle Gr	oup)	
	*		»	Completed Practising/Years experie	of relevant		
Counse	l/Articling Student/Paralegal:			2 year	rs		
	Consultant:	$\checkmark$					
	CV attached:		CV r	not required:	<b>V</b>		t.

#### **Statement of Fees Being Claimed** Hourly Hours Subtotal **HST** Total rate \$1,495.00 \$230.00 \$1,495.00 \$0.00 Preparation 6.50 \$0.00 \$0.00 Attendance - Technical Conference \$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 Attendance - Settlement Conference \$0.00 \$0.00 Attendance - Oral Hearing \$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 Argument \$0.00 \$170.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 Case Management \$1,495.00 TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES \$1,495.00 \$0.00

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed **HST Net Cost** Total \$0.00 \$0.00 **Photocopies** \$0.00 \$0.00 **Printing** \$0.00 \$0.00 Fax \$0.00 \$0.00 Courier \$0.00 \$0.00 Telephone \$0.00 \$0.00 Postage \$0.00 \$0.00 Transcripts Travel: Air \$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 Travel: Car \$0.00 Travel: Rail \$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 Travel (Other): \$0.00 included \$0.00 Parking \$0.00 \$0.00 Taxi or Airport Limo \$0.00 \$0.00 Accommodation \$0.00 \$0.00 Meals \$0.00 \$0.00 Other: \$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 **TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:** 

#### CAMBRIDGE

## The Brattle Group

SAN FRANCISCO

Washington

BRUSSELS

April 26, 2013

In Account With:

Ms. Carol Godby Esq. Harrison Pensa LLP PO Box 3237 450 Talbot Street London, ON N6A 4K3 Canada Invoice Number

TOTAL LABOR & EXPENSES

029005

ProjectID

CL-03964

Page

Loft

LONDON

MADRID

For Professional Services Rendered Through January 31, 2013

<b>5</b>				
		Hows	Rate	Amount
<u>Principals</u> Philip Q Hanser		6.00	450.00	2,700.00
Associates R. Lee Gresham		71.50	290.00	20,735,00
Research Analysts Quincy Liao		6.50	230,00	1,495,00
		Total La	ıbor	\$24,930.00
	*			

Payable upon receipt in US Dollars to: The Brattle Group (FID 04-3254813)

Finance Charge of 1.5% per month (18% APR) will be added to overdue invoices.

Remit To:

The Brattle Group, Inc. 44 Brattle Street Cambridge, MA 02138-3736 Wire Instructions:

Citizens Bank of Massachuseus SWIFT No.: CTZIUS33 ABA No.: 011500120

In favor of Checking Acct No.: 1315926927

ACILInstructions:

Citizens Bank of Alassachusetts SBIFT No.; CTZIUS33 ABA No.; 211070175

In favor of Checking Acet No.: 1315926927

## Project 3964

## Time Log for Philip Hanser

## January 01 to January 31, 2013

Date	Description of Activity/Tasks	Hours
1/18/2013	Prepared IR.	1.00
1/24/2013	Had conference call; prepared IR.	3.00
1/28/2013	Had conference call; prepared testimony.	2.00
TOTAL	3	6.00

## Project 3964

## Time Log for Lee Gresham

### January 01 to January 31, 2013

Date	Description of Activity/Tasks	
1/8/2013	Researched and developed transmission project proposal impact matrix.	
1/9/2013	Had call with Phil Hanser, Carol Godby, and Byron Leclair.  Reviewed and analyzed transmission project proposals' participation and consultation sections.	
1/11/2013	Had call with Phil Hanser and Carol Godby.  Reviewed and analyzed transmission project proposals' participation and consultation sections.	
1/16/2013	Reviewed and analyzed transmission project proposals' participation and consultation sections.	4.00
1/17/2013	Reviewed and analyzed of transmission project proposals' participation and consultation sections.  Prepared generic interrogatories.	4.00
1/18/2013	Reviewed and analyzed transmission project proposals' participation and consultation sections.  Prepared generic interrogatories.	3,00
1/24/2013	Reviewed and prepared interrogatories for East-West Tie line applications.	
1/25/2013	Reviewed and prepared interrogatories for East-West Tie line applications.	
1/26/2013	Reviewed and prepared interrogatories for East-West Tie line applications.	3.00
1/27/2013	Reviewed and prepared interrogatories for East-West Tie line applications.	12.00
1/28/2013	Reviewed and prepared interrogatories for East-West Tie line applications.	12.00
1/29/2013	Reviewed and prepared interrogatories for East-West Tie line applications.	8.00
1/30/2013	Reviewed interrogatories before they were submitted to the Ontario Energy Board.	1.50
TOTAL		71.50

## Project 3964

## Time Log for Xuefeng (Quincy) Liao

## January 01 to January 31, 2013

Date	Description of Activity/Tasks	Hours
1/8/2013	Researched power projects on tribal land.	3.00
1/9/2013	Created power project impact matrix.	3.50
TOTAL		6.50