

Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

Celebrating Over 65 Years of Service

DIRECT LINE: John A. Cyr (807) 625-8880 EMAIL: jcyr@wmnlaw.com

G. Bernard Weiler Q.C., LSM, K.C.S.G. (1910-1996)

August 28, 2013

Frederick J. W. Bickford (Counsel) Certified Specialist (Labour Law)

File #57695

B. Paul Jasiura

VIA MAIL AND RESS BoardSec@ontarioenergyboard.ca

John A. Cyr

Certified Specialist (Corporate and Commercial Law)

Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street, 27th Floor

Toronto ON M4P 1E4

Brian A. Babcock

Attention: Ms. Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary

Garth A. O'Neill

Certified Specialist (Labour Law)

- and -

Deborah A. Humphreys

Canadian Niagara Power Inc. 1130 Bertie St., P.o. Box 1218

Bradley A. Smith

Fort Erie ON L2A 5Y2

Nick Melchiorre

Mr. Douglas Bradbury, Director and Mr. Scott **Attention:** Hawkes, Vice President, Corporate Services and General Counsel

Fhara A. Pottinger

- and -

Jennifer M. Lohuis

Five Nations Energy Inc. 70-C Mount Joy St. N

Suite 421

AnnMarie Stilla

Sarah B. Manilla

Timmins, ON, P4N 4V7

Mark P. Mikulasik

Attention: Mr. Joe Gaboury

- and -

Great Lakes Power Transmission LP

2 Sackville Rd

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

Fax: (807) 623-4947

Toll-free: 1-866-WEILERS

Internet: www.weilers.ca

Sault Ste. Marie ON P6B 6J6

Attention: Mr. Gary Gazankas, Manager, Transmission System Planning

- and -

Hydro One Networks Inc.

483 Bay Street 8th Floor - South Tower Toronto ON M5G 2P5

Attention: Mr. Pasquale Catalano, Regulatory Coordinator

Dear Ms. Walli et Al

Re: <u>EB-2011-0140</u> - Designation of A Transmitter to Carry Out Development Work for The East-West Tie Line – Phase 2 Cost Submission

We are solicitors representing the Coalition of The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay (the "City"), the Northwestern Ontario Municipal Association ("NOMA") and the Northwestern Ontario Associated Chamber of Commerce ("NOACC"), (hereinafter the "Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition" or the "Coalition"). The members of the Coalition are Intervenor parties in the above-noted proceedings.

Pursuant to the Board's Decision on Intervention and Cost Award Eligibility, dated March 30, 2012, and the Board's Phase 2 Decision and Order dated August 7, 2013, we are pleased to file with the Ontario Energy Board, and serve Canadian Niagara Power Inc., Five Nations Energy Inc., Great Lakes Power Transmission LP and Hydro One Networks Inc. with the Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition's cost claim. Attached please find 6 Cost Claim for Hearing Forms prepared according to section 10 of the Board's Practice Directions on Cost Awards and corresponding detailed account summaries.

The Board's Decision on Intervention and Cost Award Eligibility, dated March 30, 2012 provides the Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition the opportunity to seek costs in relation to the Board's Proceeding to Designate a Transmitter to Carry Out Development Work For the East-West Tie Line. The Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition's time and disbursements to date for the above noted proceeding related predominantly to the preparation and filing of interrogatories, preparation for and attendance at oral hearings held on May 2nd and 3rd, 2013, submissions on May 9, 2013, and the review and following of e-mails, position statements, applications,

Fax: (807) 623-4947

Toll-free: 1-866-WEILERS

Internet: www.weilers.ca



interrogatories, responses to interrogatories, arguments and reply arguments of the proponent transmitters and other parties.

In determining the amount of costs awarded to the Coalition we ask the Board to consider various distinguishing features of the Northwest Region.

- 1. Northwestern Ontario is by far the largest of the geographical regions in Ontario comprising some 45% to 50% of the entire land mass of the province.
- 2. The Northwest Region has a population of approximately 250,000 (less than 3% of the population of Ontario) in an area into which southern Ontario would fit five times over.
- 3. The City of Thunder Bay represents the direct interests of approximately 110,000 of its own population comprising about 45% of the population of the whole of the Northwest Region. The City is the major municipal centre for northwestern Ontario. It is the largest city centre in Ontario west of Sudbury.
- 4. It must not be assumed, therefore, that analyses that are applicable in the densely populated southern region of the province are appropriate for the challenges that face the Northwest Region.
- 5. The City of Thunder Bay is the westerly terminus of the Proposed East West Tie Line.
- 6. The Thunder Bay Generating Station is the source of 306 MW of dispatachable power generation.
- 7. NOACC represents the direct interest of the associated Chambers of Commerce in their capacity as forums for small commercial and business consumers, throughout the Northwest Region. Those consumers are often dependent on a single industrial employer in a town. The viability of a single industrial plant can be essential to the livelihood of an entire community. Reliability of power supply has a direct bearing on that viability.
- 8. NOACC and NOMA, through their Energy Task Force, have created a regional research committee of interested and experienced individuals who by living and working in the Northwest Region are keenly aware of the geographical and technical issues relating to electricity generation, transmission and distribution of power in the Region.
- 9. The Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition is directly familiar with the unique requirements relating to electricity generation, transmission and

Fax: (807) 623-4947

Toll-free: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca



distribution in the Northwest Region, and as such can provide important perspectives in selection of the most qualified and cost-effective electricity transmitter to develop the East-West Tie Line.

- 10. The Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition represent persons with a significant interest in land that is, or may be, affected by the East-West Tie Line. That interest in very general and indirect terms is related to the economy of the Northwest Region as a whole and, in some instances, may be a private interest, but in every case represents an overriding public interest.
- 11. There has been continual co-operation by the Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition through their Energy Task Force in the collection of information and consultation with relevant stakeholders in the Northwest Region, including First Nations, large industry and municipalities.
- 12. Many issues the East-West Tie Line presents to the northwest are technical in nature and therefore a review of literature and research on complex topics such as power reliability and quality has been undertaken. Furthermore, the amount of documentation flowing from various other Intervenors to the Ontario Energy Board has been, and continues to be, extensive. The Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition had to review all documents on the public record, to ensure the interests of the Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition were appropriately communicated to the Board.
- 13. In light of costs associated with the representation of the many parties who form the Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition, the Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition pleads and relies on section 8.01 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards so that the Board may recognize the collaboration involved in the Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition's efforts in preparing and presenting submissions and written comments.
- 14. Collaboration of the City of Thunder Bay with NOMA and NOACC.
 - (a) The Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition prepared interrogatories (January 30, 2013), presentations (May 2nd and 3rd, 2013), submissions (May 9, 2013) that described the concerns of the Coalition as well as the rationale for these concerns. The Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition submits that the submissions will assist the Board, OPA and other Intervenors to better understand the position of the Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition and help create a more useful and focused record.

Fax: (807) 623-4947

Toll-free: 1-866-WEILERS

Internet: www.weilers.ca



Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

- (b) The Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition shared technical and legal advice resources so as to minimize the cost to prepare, review, and gather information for submissions.
- 15. Personal attendance at the Oral Hearing on May 2nd and 3rd, 2013 was limited to only one representative (Nick A. Melchiorre) on behalf of the Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition.
- 16. The Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition provide their collective questions, submissions and argument in relation to issues not only related to energy infrastructure but also to the broader environmental and other social imperatives important to the Northwest Region, including but not limited to the geographic challenges as well as the economic and commercial needs and well being of the Northwest Region.
- 17. The City, NOACC and NOMA have been and will continue to be proponents of regionally based coordinated, comprehensive, and transparent planning of electricity infrastructure in the Northwest.

Please contact the undersigned, Mr. Nick Melchiorre or Mr. Mark Mikulasik should further information or clarification be required.

Respectfully submitted,

Yours very truly,

WEILER, MALONEY, NELSON

Per:

John A. Cyr, Counsel in this instance for the City of Thunder Bay

JAC/mm Encls.



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

	ata inp	ut is indicated by	yellow-shaded	fields. For	mulas are present ii	n the document to a	assist with t	ne calculation of the
cost claim.								
- All claims n	nust be	in Canadian dolla	irs. If applicat			ountry of initial curr		Canada
- A separate	"Detail	of Fees and Dish	ırsements Rei	Rate: ng Claimed ⁱ	N/A " (comprising a "Sta	Count tement of Fees Rei		' and a "Statement of
Disbursemer "Summary o - The cost cla - A CV for ea within the la	nts Beir f Fees a aim mu ch con st 24 n	ng Claimed") is red and Disbursement ist be supported b sultant must be at nonths.	quired for each s" covering the y a completed ttached unless	consultant whole of Affidavit si , for a giver	t or lawyer/articling the party's cost clai igned by a represen n consultant, a CV h	student/paralegal. m should be provid Itative of the party.	However, ed.	only one in another process
zneept as p		a in section 7.05	or the Process	Direction				
File # EB-	2011	-0140			Process: East-V	Vest Tie Designati	on Process	s - Phase 2
Party:	City,	NOMA and NO	ACC Coalition	1	Affiant's N	lame: Mark P. Mi	kulasik	
HST Numbe	er:	122004658RT				HST Rate Ontar	io: 13.0	00%
			egistrant gistered Other		Qu	alifying Non-Pro Tax Exem		
					Affidavit			
l,		Mark P.	Mikulasik		, of the City/Tov	wn of	Thund	ler Bay
in the Prov	vince/	State of	Ont	ario		, swear or	affirm th	at:
2. I have exa Being Claime 3. The attach Disbursemer Ontario Ener 4. This cost of	mined ed", "St ned "Su nts Beir rgy Boa claim de	all of the docume ratement(s) of Fee ammary of Fees are Claimed" includered process referrences not include are	ntation in sup or Being Claime and Disburseme de only costs in and to above. By costs for wo	oort of this ed" and "Sta nts Being C curred and rk done, or	cost claim, including atement(s) of Disbu laimed", "Statemer I time spent directly	rsements Being Claint(s) of Fees Being Conference of the purposes of the purpose of the p	mmary of Fe imed". :laimed" and of the Party!	ees and Disbursements
Signature	of Aff	iant						
Sworn or a	affirm	ed before me	at the City/1	own of		Thunder Bay		,
in the Prov	/ince/	State of		ntario	, on		st-28-13 (date)	·
Commission	oner f	or taking Affid		7		e Ronald Paul, a Co of Thunder Bay for	mmissioner,	etc.,

Weiler, Maloney, Nelson, Barristers and Solicitors

Page 1 of 2 Expires February 5, 2014



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB-	2011-0140	Process:	East-West Tie Designation Process - Phase 2
Party:	City, NOMA and NOACC Coalition		
	Summary of Fees	and Disburse	ements Being Claimed
Legal/con	sultant fees	\$40,326.00	
Disbursen	nents	\$0.00	
HST		\$5,242.38	3
Total Cost	Claim	\$45,568.38	<u> </u>



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2011-0140	Process:	East-West Tie Designation Process - Phase 2			
Party:	City, NOMA and NOACC Coalition	Name:	John A. Cyr			
				Completed Practising/Years experier	of relevant	
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal: Consultant:	✓		33		
	CV attached:		CV ı	not required:	V	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Statement of Lees being damica						
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total	
Preparation	122.20	\$330.00	\$40,326.00	\$5,242.38	\$45,568.38	
Attendance - Technical Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES	\$40,326.00	\$5,242.38	\$45,568.38
-----------------------------	-------------	------------	-------------

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

	out is indicated by yell	ow-shaded fields. Fo	ormulas are present in the de	ocument to assist with	the calculation of the
cost claim.					
- All claims must b	e in Canadian dollars.		exchange rate and country o		0 1-
A	: - f r D! -	Rate	e: N/A d" (comprising a "Statement	Country:	Canada
Disbursements Bei "Summary of Fees - The cost claim m - A CV for each cor within the last 24 i	ing Claimed") is require and Disbursements" c ust be supported by a nsultant must be attack months.	ed for each consulta overing the whole o completed Affidavit hed unless, for a give	nt or lawyer/articling studen f the party's cost claim shou signed by a representative o en consultant, a CV has been n on Cost Awards, itemized	nt/paralegal. However, ild be provided. of the party. n provided to the Board	only one
File # EB- 201	1-0140		Process: East-West Ti	e Designation Proces	ss - Phase 2
Party: City	, NOMA and NOACO	Coalition	Affiant's Name:	Mark P. Mikulasik	
HST Number:	122004658RT		_ HST	Rate Ontario: 13	.00%
	Full Regis	trant 🗸	Qualifyir	ng Non-Profit	
	Unregist		Quanty.	Tax Exempt	Ä
	•	ther		ran Exempe	
			Affidavit		,
l,	Mark P. Mi	kulasik	_ , of the City/Town of		der Bay
in the Province	/State of	Ontario		, swear or affirm th	nat:
2. I have examined Being Claimed", "S 3. The attached "S Disbursements Bei Ontario Energy Bo 4. This cost claim of described in section	d all of the documentar statement(s) of Fees Be ummary of Fees and D ing Claimed" include o ard process referred to does not include any co ons 6.05 and 6.09 of th	tion in support of the eing Claimed" and "S isbursements Being nly costs incurred are above. osts for work done, o	y") and as such have knowle is cost claim, including the a statement(s) of Disbursemer Claimed", "Statement(s) of nd time spent directly for the or time spent, by a person thirection on Cost Awards.	ttached "Summary of F nts Being Claimed". Fees Being Claimed" ar e purposes of the Party	ees and Disbursements od "Statement(s) of 's participation in the
Signature of Af	fiant				
Sworn or affirm	ned before me at t	he City/Town of	Thun	der Bay	,
in the Province	/State of	Ontario	, on	August-28-13	·
Commissioner	Lacry for taking Affidavi		Towanaa Doggla	(date) I Paul, a Commissioner, (etc.
		17.7°	ierrance kondic	radi, a Continuasionel,	010.1

District of Thunder Bay for
Weiler, Maloney, Nelson, Barristers and Solicitors
Page 1 of 2Expires February 5, 2014



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB-	2011-0140	Process: East-West Tie Designation Process - Phase 2
Party:	City, NOMA and NOACC Coalition	
	Summary of Fees	and Disbursements Being Claimed
Legal/con	sultant fees	\$10,016.00
Disbursen	nents	\$388.64
HST		\$1,352.60
Total Cost	: Claim	\$11,757.24



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2011-0140	Process: East-West Tie Designation Process - Ph			Process - Phase 2	
Party:	City, NOMA and NOACC Coalition	Name:	John A. Cyr			
				Completed Practising/Years experier	of relevant	
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal:	V		33		
	Consultant:					
	CV attached:		CV r	not required:	V	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total
Preparation	31.30	\$320.00	\$10,016.00	\$1,302.08	\$11,318.08
Attendance - Technical Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES	\$10,016.00	\$1,302.08	\$11,318.08
-----------------------------	-------------	------------	-------------

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

	Net Cost	HST	Total	
Photocopies	\$351.00	\$45.63	\$396.63	
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00	
Fax	\$2.00	\$0.26	\$2.26	
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00	
Telephone	\$22.47	\$2.92	\$25.39	
Postage	\$13.17	\$1.71	\$14.88	
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00	
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00	
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00	
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00	
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00	
Parking		included	\$0.00	
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00	
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00	
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00	
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00	
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$388.64	\$50.52	\$439.16	



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

	Instructions
- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields.	Formulas are present in the document to assist with the calculation of the
cost claim.	
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, sta	
	ate: N/A Country: Canada med" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of
	Iltant or lawyer/articling student/paralegal. However, only one
"Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole	
- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affida	
- A CV for each consultant must be attached unless, for a	given consultant, a CV has been provided to the Board in another process
within the last 24 months.	
- Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direct	tion on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.
File # EB- 2011-0140	Process: East-West Tie Designation Process - Phase 2
Party: City, NOMA and NOACC Coalition	Affiant's Name: Mark P. Mikulasik
HST Number: 122004658RT	HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%
Full Registrant	Qualifying Non-Profit
Unregistered	Tax Exempt
Other	Tax Exempt
Other	
	Affidavit
I, Mark P. Mikulasik	, of the City/Town of Thunder Bay
in the Province/State of Ontario	, swear or affirm that:
1 Lam a representative of the above-noted party (the "Pa	arty") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.
	this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements
Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and	Property Professional State (Contract Contract C
	ing Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of
Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred	and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the
Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.	
	e, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as
described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice	Direction on Cost Awards.
All. Mahaland	
Signature of Affiant	
Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town	of
in the Province/State of Ontario	, on August-28-12
	(date)
Levy bauf	Terrance Ronald Paul, a Commissioner, etc., <u>District of</u> Thunder Bay for
Commissioner for taking Affidavits	Weiler, Maloney, Nelson, Barristers and Solicitors

Expires February 5, 2014



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB-	2011-0140	Process: East-West Tie Designation Process - Phase 2
Party: City, NOMA and NOACC Coalition		
	Summary of Fees	s and Disbursements Being Claimed
Legal/con	sultant fees	\$17,733.00
Disbursen	nents	\$0.00
HST		\$2,305.29
Total Cost	Claim	\$20,038.29



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2011-0140		Process:	East-West Tie D	esignation I	Process - Phase 2	
Party:	City, NOMA and NOACC Coalition		Name:	Nick Melchoirre	<u> </u>		
				Completed Practising/Years experier	of relevant		
Counse	l/Articling Student/Paralegal:	V		9			
	Consultant:						
	CV attached:		CV r	not required:	7		

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Statement of Fees being Claimed							
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total		
Preparation	68.30	\$230.00	\$15,709.00	\$2,042.17	\$17,751.17		
Attendance - Technical Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Attendance - Oral Hearing	8.80	\$230.00	\$2,024.00	\$263.12	\$2,287.12		
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		

		100	
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES	\$17,733.00	\$2,305.29	\$20,038.29

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are present in the document to assist with the calculation of the								
cost claim.								
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state ex	change rate and country of initial currency.							
Rate:	N/A Country: Canada							
	(comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of							
Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each consultant								
"Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of								
- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit si								
- A CV for each consultant must be attached unless, for a given consultant, a CV has been provided to the Board in another process								
	within the last 24 months.							
- Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction	on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.							
File # EB- 2011-0140	Process: East-West Tie Designation Process - Phase 2							
Party: City, NOMA and NOACC Coalition	Affiant's Name: Mark P. Mikulasik							
HST Number: 122004658RT	HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%							
Full Dogistrant	Qualifying Non-Profit							
Full Registrant								
Unregistered	Tax Exempt							
Other \square								
	Affidavit							
I, Mark P. Mikulasik	, of the City/Town of Thunder Bay							
I, Mark P. Mikulasik in the Province/State of Ontario	, of the City/Town of Thunder Bay, swear or affirm that:							
in the Province/State of Ontario	, swear or affirm that:							
in the Province/State of Ontario 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party"	, swear or affirm that:) and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.							
in the Province/State of Ontario 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party" 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this	, swear or affirm that: and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements							
in the Province/State of Ontario 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party" 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement".	, swear or affirm that:) and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements atement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".							
in the Province/State of Ontario 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party" 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed".	, swear or affirm that:) and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements atement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". laimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of							
in the Province/State of Ontario 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party" 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and	, swear or affirm that:) and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements atement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".							
in the Province/State of Ontario 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party" 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.	, swear or affirm that:) and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements atement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". laimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the							
in the Province/State of Ontario 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party" 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or	, swear or affirm that:) and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements atement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". laimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of I time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as							
in the Province/State of Ontario 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party" 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.	, swear or affirm that:) and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements atement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". laimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of I time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as							
in the Province/State of Ontario 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party" 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Sta 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Dire	, swear or affirm that:) and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements atement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". laimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of I time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as							
in the Province/State of Ontario 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party" 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Sta 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Dire	, swear or affirm that:) and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements atement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". laimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of I time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as							
in the Province/State of 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party" 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Directions Administration of the Board's Practice Direction of the Board's Practice Dir	, swear or affirm that:) and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements atement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". laimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of I time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as							
in the Province/State of 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party" 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Sta 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Directions M. M. M. M. Signature of Affiant Signature of Affiant	, swear or affirm that: and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements atement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". laimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as ection on Cost Awards.							
in the Province/State of 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party" 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Directions Signature of Affiant Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of	, swear or affirm that: and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements atement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". laimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as a section on Cost Awards. Thunder Bay							
in the Province/State of 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party" 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Directions Signature of Affiant Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of	, swear or affirm that: and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements atement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". laimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of I time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as a section on Cost Awards. Thunder Bay Thunder Bay August-28-12 (date)							
in the Province/State of 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party" 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Directions Signature of Affiant Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of	, swear or affirm that: and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements atement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". laimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of I time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as a section on Cost Awards. Thunder Bay , on August-28-12 (date) Terrance Ronald Paul, a Commissioner, etc.,							
in the Province/State of 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party" 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" and "Statements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Directions Signature of Affiant Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of	, swear or affirm that: and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements atement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". laimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of I time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as a section on Cost Awards. Thunder Bay Thunder Bay August-28-12 (date)							



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2011-0140		Process: East-West Tie Designation Process - Phase 2
Party:	City, NOMA and NOACC Coalition	
	Summary of Fees	and Disbursements Being Claimed
Legal/con	sultant fees	\$8,492.00
Disbursen	nents	\$0.00
HST		\$1,103.96
Total Cos	t Claim	\$9,595,96



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2011-0140		Process:	East-West Tie Designation Process - Phase 2			
Party:	City, NOMA and NOACC Coalition		Name:	Nick Melchoirre		
				Completed Y Practising/Years of experience	of relevant	
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal: Consultant:	✓		9		
	CV attached:		CV ı	not required:	V	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total
Preparation	38.60	\$220.00	\$8,492.00	\$1,103.96	\$9,595.96
Attendance - Technical Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES	\$8,492.00	\$1,103.96	\$9,595.96

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. For	rmulas are present in the document to assist with the calculation of the
cost claim.	
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state e	
Rate:	
	d" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of
Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each consultan "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of	
- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit s	
A CONTROL OF THE PROPERTY OF T	en consultant, a CV has been provided to the Board in another process
within the last 24 months.	
- Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction	on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.
File # EB- 2011-0140	Process: East-West Tie Designation Process - Phase 2
Party: City, NOMA and NOACC Coalition	Affiant's Name: Mark P. Mikulasik
HST Number: 122004658RT	HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%
Full Registrant	Qualifying Non-Profit
Unregistered	Tax Exempt
Other	Tax Exempt
Other	
	Affidavit
I, Mark P. Mikulasik	, of the City/Town of Thunder Bay
in the Province/State of Ontario	, swear or affirm that:
2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "St 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Dir Signature of Affiant Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of in the Province/State of Ontario	Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of d time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as
Commissioner for taking Affidavits	Terrance Ronald Paul, a Commissioner, etc., District of Thunder Bay for Weiler, Maloney, Nelson, Barristers and Solicitors Expires February 5, 2014



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB-	2011-0140	Process: East-West Tie Designation Process - Phase 2
Party:	City, NOMA and NOACC Coalition	
	Summary of Fees	and Disbursements Being Claimed
Legal/con	sultant fees	\$18,300.00
Disbursen	nents	\$0.00
HST		\$2,379.00
Total Cost	t Claim	\$20.679.00



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2011-0140			Process:	East-West Tie D	esignation P	rocess - Phase 2
Party:	City, NOMA and NOACC Coalition		Name:	Mark P. Mikulas	iik	
				Completed ' Practising/Years o experien	of relevant	
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal: Consultant:	□		1		
	CV attached:	V	CV r	not required:		

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total
Preparation	122.00	\$150.00	\$18,300.00	\$2,379.00	\$20,679.00
Attendance - Technical Conference		·	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES	\$18,300.00	\$2,379.00	\$20,679.00

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required da	ata input is indicat	ed by yellow-shade	d fields. For	mulas are p	resent in the	document to assist	with the calc	ulation of the
cost claim.								
- All claims m	nust be in Canadia	n dollars. If applica	ble, state ex	xchange rate	e and country	y of initial currency.		
			Rate:			Country:		nada
- A separate	"Detail of Fees an	d Disbursements Be	ing Claimed	" (comprisin	g a "Stateme	ent of Fees Being Cla	imed" and a	"Statement of
Disbursemen	nts Being Claimed") is required for eac	h consultan	t or lawyer/	articling stud	dent/paralegal. How	vever, only on	ie
"Summary of	f Fees and Disburs	ements" covering th	ne whole of	the party's	cost claim sh	ould be provided.		
- The cost cla	im must be suppo	rted by a complete	d Affidavit s	igned by a r	epresentativ	e of the party.		
- A CV for each	ch consultant mus	t be attached unles	s, for a giver	n consultant	, a CV has be	en provided to the	Board in anot	her process
within the la	st 24 months.							
- Except as p	rovided in section	7.03 of the Practic	e Direction	on Cost Aw	ards, itemize	ed receipts must be	provided.	
File # EB-	2011-0140	ANEX -2/1007 SPECIFIC ACTION		Process:	East-West	Tie Designation P	rocess - Phas	se 2
Party:		d NOACC Coalitio	n					
i di cy.	city, North an	a Nonce country	<u>'</u>		iant 5 mann	- Ivian Cir. Ivincara.		
HST Numbe	er: 1220046	58RT		e.	HS	T Rate Ontario: _	13.00%	
	7	Full Registrant			Qualify	ing Non-Profit		
					Quality		H	
	J					rax Exempt		
		Other						
			* V 1	Affidavit				
l,	Ma	rk P. Mikulasik		, of the C	ity/Town o	of T	hunder Bay	/
in the Prov	ince/State of	On	itario			, swear or affin	m that:	
						_		
								Disbursements
								.() (
Disbursemer	nts Being Claimed'	include only costs i	incurred and	d time spent	directly for	the purposes of the	Party's partic	ipation in the
4. This cost of	laim does not incl	ude any costs for w	ork done, or	r time spent	, by a person	that is an employed	e or officer of	the Party as
described in	sections 6.05 and	6.09 of the Board's	Practice Dir	ection on C	ost Awards.			
	an a	111						
	HH-111	July						
Signature	of Affiant				-			
Sworn or a	affirmed befor	I of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of nog Claimed") is required for each consultant or lawyer/articling student/paralegal. However, only one and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided. In the provided of the party's cost claim should be provided. It is be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party. It is be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party. It is be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party. It is be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party. It is be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party. It is be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the Board in another process on the Board in another process of the Board in another process of the Board in another process of the Party's participation in the Board in section on Cost Awards. I set be supported by a complete afficient of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" in another process of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. I set be supported by a complete and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Board process referred to above. I set be supported to be board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. I set be supported to the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. I set be supported to the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.						
	vince/State of	5.0					8-12	
in the FIO	vince/state of		Tital 10		-, 011		<u> </u>	
			2 .					
	-	un hi	211				missioner, etc.	••
					- Weiler M	Tinunder Bay for Maloney, Nelson, Barri	store and Salla	itore
Campaiasi	anar far taldea	A ffidavite			Tresited IV	reneries, recisori, bulli	aidia di la adila	AII O I O

Expires February 5, 2014

Commissioner for taking Affidavits



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB-	2011-0140	Process: East-West Tie Designation Process - Phase 2
Party:	City, NOMA and NOACC Coalition	
	Summary of Fees	and Disbursements Being Claimed
Legal/con	sultant fees	\$8,150.00
Disbursen	nents	\$0.00
HST		\$1,059.50
Total Cost	Claim	\$9,209.50



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2011-0140		Process:	East-West Tie Designation Process - Phase 2			
Party:	City, NOMA and NOACC Coalition		Name:	Mark P. Mikulas	sik	
				Completed \ Practising/Years of experien	of relevant	
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal:	V		1		
	Consultant:		CV			
	CV attached:	<u> </u>	CV r	not required:		

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total
Preparation	65.20	\$125.00	\$8,150.00	\$1,059.50	\$9,209.50
Attendance - Technical Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

Ľ	TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES	\$8,150.00	\$1,059.50	\$9,209.50

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00



WEILER, MALONEY, NELSON

The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay 500 Donald Street East Thunder Bay ON P7E 5V3 31 July 2012

Our file #: 57695 Account #: 17178

Re: Long Term Energy Plan

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above matter during the period from 28 June 2012 to 31 July 2012:

28 Jun 12	Review preliminary issues re EWT	JAC	.2	64.00	EWT
	Review Order in Phase 1; continue drafting of Executive	JAC	5.7	1824.00	EWT
29 Jun 12	Summary – EWT Review emails 2 to 13 from Mr. Catalano at Hydro One to Distribution Group re: EB- 2011-0140 - OEB East West Tie - Hydro One Networks redacted Documents	NM	1.2	264.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Dyck at Torys re: EB-2011-0140 - East West Tie Designation Proceedings - Declarations and Undertakings of EWT LP's External Counsel; review email from Ms. O'Reilly at Fraser Milner re: EB-2011-0140; RES Canada	NM	.4	88.00	EWT

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

	Transmission LP; Counsels' Declaration and Undertaking; review email from Ms. O'Reilly at Fraser Milner re: EB-2011-0140; RES Canada Transmission LP; Counsels' Declaration and Undertaking for Andrew Salem; review email from Mr. Madden at JTM Law re: EB-2011-0140 - MNO Declaration and Undertaking for Jason Madden				
	Review EWT Phase 1	MM	.6	75.00	EWT
03 Jul 12	Decision and Order Review email from Mr. Monem re: EB-2011-0140 - MNO Declaration and Undertaking for Alex Monem; review email from Mr. Teal re: EB-2011-0140 - PRFN Declaration and Undertaking for Carol Godby and Steven Teal; review email from Ms. O'Reilly re: RES Canada Transmission LP; Counsel's Declaration and Undertakings; Board File No. EB-2011-0140 Review email from Mr. Manning to Board Secretary at	NM NM	.3	66.00 22.00	EWT
09 Jul 12	OEB re: EB-2011-0140 - NCO Declaration and Undertaking Attending to review email; instructions on file from Mr. Mikulasik; attending to format draft letter to Ms. Walli at OEB; email to Mr. Andrew Scribilo at NOACC and Mr.	DL	.6	84.00	EWT
10 Jul 12	Harold Wilson; attending to fax letter to Mr. Scribilo; email from Mr. Wilson Review cover letter from Hydro One Networks covering extensive production EWT Review documents on Ontario	JAC JAC	.1 .6	32.00 192.00	EWT EWT
	Power Generation	JAC	.0	192.00	EWI
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 623	2_1111

	Review letter from OEB to HONI and GLPT EWT	MM	.3	37.50	EWT
12 Jul 12	declarations and undertakings Review email from Ms. Susi Vogt at OEB re: Decision and Order for EB-2012-0180 Hydro One Networks Inc.; review email from Ms. Mona Habashy at OEB re: EB-2011- 0140 Ontario Energy Board	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
13 Jul 12	Decision and Order Phase 1 Review EWT Phase 1 Decision and Order; Draft lengthy email to Mr. John Cyr re same	MM	1.3	162.50	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: OEB has issued Phase 1 Decision and Order re EWT	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
16 Jul 12	Review student's summary of participants' comments; begin review of Board's Order on Phase 1	JAC	1.8	576.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr and email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Mikulasik re: cost of various	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
17 Jul 12	sources of generation Further drafting of Executive Summary - EWT	JAC	2.5	800.00	EWT
	Review OPA materials regarding costs of various types of generation in Ontario	NM	.9	198.00	EWT
	Review cost and intent letters from Thunder Bay coalition, prepare documents for strategy meeting re same	MM	1.6	200.00	EWT
	Review EB-2011-0180 decision and Order of July 12, 2012	MM	.7	87.50	EWT
	Attend meeting with Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre re: cost applications for EWT	MM	.5	62.50	EWT
	Attend office conference with Mr. Cyr and Mr. Mikulasik re EWT	NM	.5	110.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 62	R_1111

	Attend office conference with Mr. Melchiorre and Mr. Mikulasik re EWT	JAC	.5	160.00	EWT
	Further drafting on Executive Summary - EWT	JAC	.8	256.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Mikulasik re: EWTcost submissions	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mikulasik re: EB-2011-0140 EWT Phase 1 Decision and Order - EWT	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Mikulasik re: cost of various sources of generation	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
18 Jul 12	Review letter from Board re: objections to release of non- redacted versions of reports	JAC	.1	32.00	EWT
	Further analysis and revision of text in Executive Summary	JAC	3.9	1248.00	EWT
	Begin assembling information for Cost Submissions for EWT	DL	1.0	140.00	EWT
	Review email letter from Mr. Robert Warren at Weir Foulds to OEB Board Secretary re: EB-2011-0140 - East West Tie	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
19 Jul 12	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: Order of Cost Award	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Catalano at Hydro One re: EB- 2012-0180 - Hydro One networks Inc. Request for an Accounting Order to Establish as Incumbent Transmitter Deferral Account - Draft Rate Order - EWT	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
20 Jul 12	Review email from Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Mikulasik re: Draft Executive Summary for Ms. Koltun and others; review email from Mr. Cyr to Ms. Koltun and Mr.	NM	.7	154.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 62	3_1111

	Commisso; review further email from Ms. Koltun to Mr. Cyr; review further email from Mr. Cyr to Ms. Koltun re:				
21 Jul 12	Executive Summary Final edits and proofreading of Executive summary and draft transmittal to Ms. Koltun and Mr. Commisso	JAC	1.9	608.00	EWT
22 Jul 12	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik re: draft of EWT Cost Award Submission - EWT	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Draft cost award submission re: EWT	MM	1.7	212.50	EWT
	Review plans for meeting to update City CAO, Acting City Solicitor and Councillors' Hebert, Angus and Virdiramo	JAC	.3	96.00	EWT
23 Jul 12	Review email from Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Mikulasik; review further email from Mr. Cyr and review further email from Mr. Cyr and review further email from Mr. Mikulasik re: EWT Cost Award Submission	NM	.4	88.00	EWT
	Review draft cost submission and revise cover letter arguments by student	JAC	1.2	384.00	EWT
	Review OEB Practice Direction on Cost Awards re Cost claim	MM	1.9	237.50	EWT
	Review and revise cost award submission re: EWT	MM	2.2	275.00	EWT
	Review and revise Submissions to OEB and client billings for Bill of Costs	NM	2.0	440.00	EWT
	Office conference with Mr. Mikulasik re: revisions to Submissions	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
	Review and revise further Submission to OEB re: costs	NM	.8	176.00	EWT
24 Jul 12	Review Order of July 11, 2012 and cost issue; review Student's draft and revise	JAC	1.9	608.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 62	R_1111

	cover letter in part				
	Prepare for and attend discussion with City Manager and Acting City Solicitor,	JAC	1.8	576.00	EWT
	Councillor Angus and Councillor Hebert (Co-Chairs of Energy Task Force) and				
	Councillor Virdiramo				
	Further revision, collecting	MM	.6	75.00	EWT
	documentation, calculating				
	hours for Cost award submission re: EWT				
	Prepare for meeting with	NM	1.0	220.00	EWT
	clients; review current OPA	_ ,			
	Planning papers on Northwest and EWT				
	Revise Student draft of transmittal letter further	JAC	.8	256.00	EWT
25 Jul 12	Review and revise EWT cost claim	MM	4.1	512.50	EWT
	Review and revise into final	NM	.5	110.00	EWT
	format the East-West Tie Cost				
	Submission	NTN (1	22.00	
	Office meeting with Mr. Mikulasik re: revisions	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
26 Jul 12	Revise transmittal related to	JAC	1.7	544.00	EWT
	Application for recovery of costs				
	Review and revise EWT cost	MM	2.3	287.50	EWT
	claim letter to Board Secretary				
	and calculations	MM	2.4	425.00	EWT
	Review time entries for proper cost submission, scan and	IVIIVI	3.4	425.00	EWT
	collate documents, send cost				
	claim				
	Review email from Mr.	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Mikulasik to OEB Board Secretary re: Cost Claim for				
	Phase 1 of the Designation				
	Proceeding EB-2011-0140 -				
	Thunder Bay, NOMA and				
25.7.1.12	NOACC Coalition Cost Claim	ъ.		7 < 0.0	
27 Jul 12	Attending to review email instructions on file re: EWT	DL	.4	56.00	EWT
	Cost Submission; attending to				
Suite 201	cost suching to			Phone: (807) 62	R-1111

	print and collate Cost Cl documents; prepare lette Ms. Walli at Ontario End Board enclosing documen Review email from Mr. Cy Mr. Fralick re: Meeting 12 noon, Tuesday, July 24, 2 at Weilers	r to ergy ts yr to 2:00	NM	[.1	22.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Ca at Willms Shier to OEB Bo Secretary re: EB-2012-0 HONI EWTL Defo Account - Northwatch O Claim - EWT	oard 180 erral	NM		.1	22.00	EWT
	Review email from Habashy at OEB to Bo Secretary at OEB re: EB-20 0140 Ontario Energy Boa Procedural Order #4	oard 011-	NM		.1	22.00	EWT
	Mikulasik to Board Secre at OEB re: EB-2011-014 Thunder Bay, NOMA	and Cost rom Mr. was mail EB- Bay,	NM		.3	66.00	EWT
30 Jul 12	Review Procedural Order 4 - EWT	No.	MM	I	.4	50.00	EWT
	J.A. Cyr Nick Melchiorre D. Lafferty Mark Mikulasik Total hours	25.8 11.0 2.0 21.6 60.0	@ @ @ @	320.00 220.00 140.00 125.00	= = = =	8,256.00 2,420.00 280.00 2,700.00 13,528.00	
	To our fee						13,656.00

DISBURSEMENTS

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

Photocopies	181.10	T
Long Distance Charges	.42	T
Facsimile	2.00	T
Postage	11.88	T

Total disbursements 195.40

Total Fees and Disbursements

13,851.40

Phone: (807) 623-1111 Fax: (807) 623-4947

Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS

Internet: www.weilers.ca

TOTAL TAXES

HST on 13,656.00 fees	1,775.28
HST on 195.40 disbursements	25.40

HST (Registration #: 122004658RT) 1,800.68

Total Bill 15,652.08

Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

J.A. Cyr

E.& O.E.

This account is due when rendered. Please pay promptly to avoid interest charges. Interest will be charged in accordance with the Solicitors Act of Ontario.



WEILER, MALONEY, NELSON

31 August 2012

The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay 500 Donald Street East Thunder Bay ON P7E 5V3

Our file #: 57695 Account #: 17512

Re: Long Term Energy Plan

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above matter during the period from 19 July 2012 to 31 August 2012:

19 Jul 12	Further drafting; analysis; editing and revision	JAC	5.5	1760.00	EWT
01 Aug 12	Review email from Mr. Dyck at Torys to Board Secretary at OEB re: EB-2011-0140 - EWT Designation Proceeding - EWT LP Compliance with Phase 1 Decision and Order - EWT	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Mason to Mr. Fralick and review email from Ms. Logan to Mr. Cyr re: Major Exploration Program in NWO	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
02 Aug 12	Review email from Ms. Habashy at OEB re: EB-2011-0140 cost claim; email to Mr. Mikulasik re: cost claim; review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Ms. Habashy at OEB re: EB-2011-0140 attaching Thunder Bay, NOMA and NOACC Coalition's cost claim; review email from Ms. Habashy at	NM	.5	110.00	EWT

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

	OEB acknowledging receipt; review email from Ms. Vogt at OEB re: Accounting Order for EB-2012-0180 Hydro One Networks Inc.				
03 Aug 12	Review email from Ms. Logan at TBayTel re: Update - Thunder Bay GS Conversion	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
10 Aug 12	Review email from Ms. Calvo at Willmsshier to OEB re: EB-2011-0140 Northwatch Cost Claim; review email from Board Secretary at OEB to Ms. O'Reilly at Fraser Milner re: confirmation of supporting document submission for OEB; review email from Ms. O'Reilly at Fraser Milner to Board Secretary at OEB re: EB-2011-0140 - RES Canada Transmission - Declaration and Undertaking	NM	.3	66.00	EWT
13 Aug 12	Review email from OEB Board Secretary to Ms. O'Reilly at Fraser Milner re: electronic submission to OEB has been received; review further email from Ms. O'Reilly attaching cover letter to Ms. Walli at OEB	NM	.3	66.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. O'Reilly at Fraser Milner to Board Secretary at OEB re: RES Canada Transmission - Declaration and Undertaking - have successfully filed on OEB Portal	NM	.3	66.00	EWT
20 Aug 12	Review email from Ms. Reilly at Hydro One re: EB-2011-0140 - OEB EWT Bid - Hydro One Cost Claim Objection Letter	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
21 Aug 12	Review email from Ms. Vogt at OEB re: Decision and Order on Cost Awards for EB-	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 623	3-1111

1001 William Street
Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

	2012-0180 Hydro	One					
29 Aug 12	Networks Review email letter from Kaiser at Torys to OEB Secretary re: EB-2011-0 EWT Designation Proceed- EWT LP Compliance Board Phase 1 Decision Order	Board 0140 - edings with	NM .1		22.00	EWT	
	J.A. Cyr	5.5	@	320.00		1,760.00	
	Nick Melchiorre Total hours	2.1 7.6	@	220.00	=	462.00 2,222.00	
	Total nours	7.0				2,222.00	
	To our fee						2,222.00
DISBURSEM	<u>IENTS</u>						
	Photocopies					7.80 T	
	Total disbursements						7.80
	Total Fees and Disburse	ements					2,229.80
TOTAL TAX	<u>IES</u>						
	HST on 2,222.00 fees					288.86	
	HST on 7.80 disburseme		ртν			1.01	200.07
	HST (Registration #: 12	ZUU4038:	KI)				289.87
	T (1 D 11)						A E 1 0 6 E

Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

I A Cyr

Total Bill

J.A. Cyr E.& O.E.

This account is due when rendered. Please pay promptly to avoid interest charges. Interest will be charged in accordance with the Solicitors Act of Ontario.

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1 Phone: (807) 623-1111 Fax: (807) 623-4947 Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

2,519.67



WEILER, MALONEY, NELSON

The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay 500 Donald Street East Thunder Bay ON P7E 5V3 28 September 2012

Our file #: 57695 Account #: 17877

Re: Long Term Energy Plan

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above matter during the period from 5 August 2012 to 28 September 2012:

03 Sep 12	Review in more detail parts of SNC Lavalin Final Report (August 2009) on transmission	JAC	.7	231.00	EWT
04 Sep 12	line concept re EWT Further review of detail in the SNC Lavalin transmission study re EWT	JAC	.7	231.00	EWT
18 Sep 12	Review email from Ms. Habashy to OEB Board Secretary and review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re Order on Cost Awards - EWT	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
	Review Board Cost Award Order - EWT	MM	.6	75.00	EWT
20 Sep 12	Review Order on Costs, earlier Procedural Order #1 on Phase 1; develop explanation for City Solicitor and Advisory Chairs of ETF requesting instruction	JAC	3.4	1122.00	EWT
	Review and draft email re EWT cost award	MM	.5	62.50	EWT
21 Sep 12	Review email from Mr. Cyr to	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
Suite 201			Phone: (807) 623-1111		

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

	Ms. Koltun and Mr. Commisso re EWT Cost Award Order				
	Revise draft explanation of Cost Decision and request for instruction	JAC	2.2	726.00	EWT
25 Sep 12	Review email and further Order re costs - EWT	JAC	.2	66.00	EWT
	Review PowerPoint in preparation for presentation to NOACC re EWT	JAC	1.2	396.00	EWT
	Review and revise Mr. Cyr's presentation to NOACC and NOMA	MM	1.5	187.50	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Vegh's office attaching Declarations and Undertakings filed on behalf of TransCanada Power Transmission	NM	.3	66.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Mona Habashy at OEB re: EB-2011- 0140 OEB Decision and Order	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
26 Sep 12	Review research and issues re PowerPoint for NOACC	JAC	.3	99.00	EWT
	Attend immediate preparation and extended Questions and Answers to present seminar to NOACC	JAC	1.3	429.00	EWT
	Review and revise Mr. Cyr's NOMA presentation	MM	1.3	162.50	EWT
	Review and revise NOACC presentation; prepare for conference	MM	.9	112.50	EWT
	Further review of issues and presentation to annual meeting of NOACC	JAC	1.4	462.00	EWT
27 Sep 12	Final review and revision re NOACC presentation re EWT	MM	1.3	162.50	EWT
	Attend NOACC conference re mining report; attend Mr. Cyr's energy presentation to NOMA	MM	2.1	262.50	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr, Ms. Koltun and Mr. Commisso re: EB-2011- 0140 EWT Cost Award Order	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
G 1: 007				DI (005) (1	

J.A. Cyr	11.4	@	330.00	=	3,762.00
Nick Melchiorre	.8	@	220.00	=	176.00
Mark Mikulasik	8.2	@	125.00	=	1,025.00
Total hours	20.4				4,963.00

To our fee 4,963.00

DISBURSEMENTS

Photocopies	.10	T
Long Distance Charges	3.77	T

Total disbursements	3.88

Total Fees and Disbursements 4,966.88

TOTAL TAXES

HST on 4,963.00 fees	645.19	
HST on 3.88 disbursements	.50	
HST (Registration #: 122004658RT)		645.69

Total Bill 5,612.57

Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

J.A. Cyr

E.& O.E.

This account is due when rendered. Please pay promptly to avoid interest charges. Interest will be charged in accordance with the Solicitors Act of Ontario.

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

Fax: (807) 623-4947



WEILER, MALONEY, NELSON

31 October 2012

The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay 500 Donald Street East Thunder Bay ON P7E 5V3

Our file #: 57695 Account #: 18213

Re: Long Term Energy Plan

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above matter during the period from 21 September 2012 to 31 October 2012:

02 Oct 12	Review email from Ms. Habashy at OEB attaching letter from OEB; email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Mikulasik re: OEB letter - access to data room	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
09 Oct 12	Review email questioning whether OPG was on record as being against East-West Tie; analysis; telephone call to Mr. Fralick at Thunder Bay Generating Station; further analysis and drafting in reply as to status of East-West Tie and Thunder Bay Generating Station	JAC	1.5	495.00	EWT
	Review Web data room for EWT; research same; review profess for username and password re same	MM	1.6	200.00	EWT

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

15 Oct 12	Review email from Mr. Bill Kennedy to Mr. Cyr re: EWT	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
16 Oct 12	consultant Review email letter from Ms. Mary Sibenik at Stikeman Elliott to Board Secretary at OEB re: EB-2011-0140 EWT Transmitter Designation Process file with the OEB	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
19 Oct 12	Review email letter from Ms. Habashy at OEB re: EB-2011- 0140 OEB - Board Letter - Board re: Declaration and Undertakings	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
23 Oct 12	Telephone call from Acting Mayor re: 2014 and East West Tie	JAC	.2	66.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr and review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert re: East-West Tie	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
25 Oct 12	Telephone discussion with OPG and review issues re: meeting with City and Resolute Forest Products re: East-West Tie	JAC	.7	231.00	EWT
	Review email and issues re East-West Tie conversion; telephone call to colleague and email follow-up	JAC	.3	99.00	EWT
26 Oct 12	Attend brainstorming session with Energy Task Force Co-Chairs and Mr. Virdiramo and Mr. Doug Murray, Plant Manager, Resolute Forest Products re EWT	JAC	1.0	330.00	EWT
28 Oct 12	Review cost recoveries on East-West Tie	JAC	1.9	627.00	EWT
	Review further issue of cost recovery and reply further to discrepancy between recovery on costs submitted and actual costs	JAC	1.7	561.00	EWT
29 Oct 12	Draft email to Mr. Cyr re:	MM	1.1	137.50	EWT
Suite 201 1001 William Str Thunder Bay, Ol				Phone: (807) 623 Fax: (807) 623 Tollfree: 1-866-WEI	1-4947 LERS

Internet: www.weilers.ca

East-West Tie Cost claim; further research re: EWT cost incurred to date and cost recovery

J.A. Cyr	7.3	@	330.00	=	2,409.00
Nick Melchiorre	.8	@	220.00	=	176.00
Mark Mikulasik	2.7	@	125.00	=	337.50
Total hours	10.8				2,922.50

To our fee 2,922.50

DISBURSEMENTS

Photocopies	15.20	T	
Postage	1.29	T	
Total disbursements			16.49
Total Fees and Disbursements			2,938.99

TOTAL TAXES

HST on 2,922.50 fees	379.93	
HST on 16.49 disbursements	2.14	
HST (Registration #: 122004658RT)		382.07

3,321.06

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

Fax: (807) 623-4947

Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

Total Bill

401

J.A. Cyr

E.& O.E.

This account is due when rendered. Please pay promptly to avoid interest charges. Interest will be charged in accordance with the Solicitors Act of Ontario.



WEILER, MALONEY, NELSON

The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay 500 Donald Street East Thunder Bay ON P7E 5V3

30 November 2012

Our file #: 57695 Account #: 18694

Re: Long Term Energy Plan

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above matter during the period from 29 October 2012 to 3 December 2012:

31 Oct 12	Review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert re: EWT	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
01 Nov 12	Draft analysis as to possible research needs on East-West Tie	JAC	.3	99.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus, Mr. Hebert and Mr. Bosch and review email from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Cyr re: EWT	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Hebert and review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Cyr re: Fact Sheet re: East-West Tie	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
04 Nov 12	Analysis of the possible positions to be taken in EWT with respect to the OPA denial of the gas purchase contract	JAC	6.8	2244.00	EWT
	Review further email re: the OPA denial of power purchase	JAC	.3	99.00	EWT

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

	contract and impact on EWT Review emails from Mr. Angus to Mr. Doug Murray; review email from Mr. Murray to Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Murray denial of power purchase contract and impact on EWT	NM	.4	88.00	EWT
	Review lengthy email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert denial of power purchase contract and impact on EWT	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr and review reply email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus re: denial of power purchase contract and impact on EWT	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
05 Nov 12	Review email from Mr. Ron Nelson to Mr. Bosch and Mr. Murray; review further email from Mr. Ron Nelson to Mr. Doug Murray and Mr. Bosch; review email from Mr. Doug Murray to Mr. Bosch and review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Nelson re: denial of power purchase contract and impact on EWT	NM	.5	110.00	EWT
07 Nov 12	Review email from Ms. Thomas at McCarthy Tetrault to Distribution Group re: EB-2011-0140 - TPT Revised Request re: Declaration and Undertakings	NM	.3	66.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Mace to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert re: OEB Working Groups	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
08 Nov 12	Review email from Mr. Vegh; review data spreadsheets for Mr. Angus, Co-Chair of Energy Task Force	JAC	.6	198.00	EWT
	Review email re: relationship between East-West Tie and the	JAC	.9	297.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 623	B-1111

	Thunder Bay Generating Station; draft response to				
	Chair of NOMA Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus re: Review of EWT	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Energy Data Review lengthy email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Nelson, Mr. Bosch and Mr. Murray; review email from Mr. Virdiramo to Mr. Cyr, Mr. Nelson, Mr. Bosch and Mr. Murray; review email from Mr. Commisso to	NM	.5	110.00	EWT
	Mr. Virdiramo, Mr. Cyr, Mr. Nelson, Mr. Bosch and Mr. Murray and review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Commisso re: Review of EWT Energy Data				
09 Nov 12	Instructions on file from Mr. Cyr; attending to review file for issues list	DL	.2	28.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Commisso and Mr. Angus and review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr re: EWT	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
10 Nov 12	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus re: EWT	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
11 Nov 12	Review lengthy email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Mel Stewart and review email from Mr. Stewart to Mr. Cyr re: Follow up on energy policy issues of mutual interest	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Angus, Mr. Bosch, Mr. Vezina, Mr. Cyr and Mr. Fralick; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Hebert, Mr. Bosch, Mr. Vezina, Mr. Cyr and Mr. Fralick and review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus, Mr. Hebert, Mr. Bosch, Mr. Vezina and Mr.	NM	.4	88.00	EWT
Suite 201	•			Phone: (807) 623	3-1111

12 Nov 12	Fralick re: Next to Final Draft of Speaking Notes Review further email re: impact of East-West Tie; follow up with arrangements for discussion with First	JAC	.6	198.00	EWT
	Nation representatives Review email from Mr. Mace to Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Mace and review further email from Mr. Mace to Mr. Cyr re: OEB Working Groups	NM	.3	66.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Stewart re: Energy policy issues of mutual interest	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Swerdlyk re: message from Mr. Bob Betts at NextBridge re: East-West Tie Line	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
13 Nov 12	Review email from Ms. Swerdlyk re: Mr. Betts would like to meet with Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Cyr re: telephone call from Mr. Betts, consultant	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Review lengthy email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus, Mr. Hebert, Mr. Virdiramo, Mayor Hobbs, Mr. Commisso and Mr. Nelson re: Mr. Bob Betts re: OEB - East-West Tie Line	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Review email and telephone call to Mr. Betts; discussion with colleague; draft lengthy email outlining possible position re EWT	JAC	3.2	1056.00	EWT
14 Nov 12	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Stewart; review email from Mr. Stewart to Mr. Cyr and review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Stewart re: Follow up on energy policy issues of mutual interest re EWT	NM	.3	66.00	EWT
Suite 201	Review email from Mr. Betts	NM	.1	22.00 Phone: (807) 62	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 623	0-1111

	re: follow-up to our telephone call Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus, Mr. Hebert, Mr. Virdiramo, Mayor Hobbs, Mr. Commisso and Mr. Nelson re: Bob Betts re OEB - East-West Tie Line	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Review email letter from Ms. Dragic at OEB to Hydro One re: OEB Lt HONI - East-West Tie Proceeding - Declaration	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
15 Nov 12	and Undertakings Review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr and review lengthy email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus re: Bob Betts re OEB -	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
	East-West Tie Line Review email from Ms. Habashy at OEB to Hydro One re: OEB Lt HONI - East-West Tie Proceeding - Declaration	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	and Undertakings Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: EWT meeting	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Review email re: meeting with proponent and draft reply to Mr. Angus' concerns as to regional planning by transmitters in respect of the East-West Tie; review follow up email as to meeting with proponent transmitter	JAC	2.1	693.00	EWT
	Review email from representative of a proponent transmitter and draft follow up email to Mr. Angus, Mr. Hebert, Mr. Virdiramo and CAO, Mr. Commisso, and Mayor Nelson	JAC	.7	231.00	EWT
	Review OEB letter to HONI re undertaking and redacted information	MM	.4	50.00	EWT
16 Nov 12	Research NextBridge, Upper	NM	.3	66.00	EWT
Suite 201 1001 William Str			,	Phone: (807) 623 Fax: (807) 623	3-4947

Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

	Canada Transmission and consultant, Bob Betts				
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus re: OEB Policy - East-West Tie Project	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Review email correspondence from Mr. John Vellone to Kirsten Walli at OEB re: East- West Tie Designation - EB- 2011-0140	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
	Attend conference call with consultant, Mr. Bob Betts	JAC	.4	132.00	EWT
	Attend conference call with consultant, Mr. Bob Betts	NM	.4	88.00	EWT
17 Nov 12	Review email and document from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Meeting Details	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Bosch to Energy Task Force re: OPA document on the East- West Tie	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Review Long Term Electricity Outlook for the Northwest and Context for the East-West Tie Expansion	NM	2.0	440.00	EWT
18 Nov 12	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force; review emails from Mr. Vezina to Energy Task Force; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus and review email from Mr. Thorburn to Mr. Bosch and Mr. Angus re: OEB Filed Documents relative to the East-West	NM	.5	110.00	EWT
	Review OPA report to OEB on need for East-West Tie; draft email to client re same	JAC	1.4	462.00	EWT
19 Nov 12	Review email instructions on file from Mr. Melchiorre; review file for modelling runs; brief meeting with Mr. Melchiorre	DL	.3	42.00	EWT
	Review draft analysis and research request to Articling	JAC	3.4	1122.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 62.	3-1111

Suite 201				Phone: (807) 623	3-1111
	West Tie Review email from Mr. Garry	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
	Review correspondence and documents pertaining to East-	NM	2.1	462.00	EWT
	Review student's memo; instructions on file for clarification; review email re: anomalies on suppression in electrical in East-West Tie	JAC	1.1	363.00	EWT
20 Nov 12	Email to Mr. Betts; review email from Mr. Bosch and review email from Mr. Betts re: conference call Friday, November 16, 2012	NM	.3	66.00	EWT
20 N 12	Mr. Mikulasik; re: OEB Filed Documents relative to the East-West Tie	NIM (2	<i>(</i> (,00	
	email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Hebert and Mr. Thorburn re: OEB Filed Documents relative to the East-West Review email from Mr. Cyr to	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Force Review email from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Thorburn and review	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
	John Cyr Draft issues list re: EWT presentation to Energy Task	MM	.9	112.50	EWT
	standards; IESO feasibility study re: Northwestern Ontario and the EWT; draft lengthy research response to				
	research and review numerous and highly technical NERC standards, including reliability, stability and security Further review of NERC	MM	3.4	425.00	EWT
	Student; further email and quick scan of parts of IESO 2011 study on feasibility of East-West Tie; review further email from Energy Task Force re: East-West Tie Review email from John Cyr re NERC research required;	MM	3.4	425.00	EWT

	McKinnon to Distribution Group; review email from Mr. Mike Lewis to Mr. McKinnon re: OPA document on the East-West Tie Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Cyr, Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert re: OEB Filed Documents relative to the	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
21 Nov 12	East-West Tie Office conference with Mr. Melchiorre and Mr. Mikulasik re: Energy Task Force Meeting	JAC	.5	165.00	EWT
	Office conference with Mr. Cyr and Mr. Mikulasik re: Energy Task Force Meeting and potential options for client	NM	.5	110.00	EWT
	Office conference with Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre re: Energy Task Force Meeting	MM	.5	62.50	EWT
	Prepare for meeting with City Energy Task Force	NM	.4	88.00	EWT
	Lengthy discussion on First Nations and energy issues with advisor to Grand Chief Beardy	JAC	1.7	561.00	EWT
	Review email correspondence from Ms. Habashy at OEB to Distribution Group re: EB- 2011-0140 East-West Tie	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
22 Nov 12	Review letter from Board re scheduling for Phase II of Designation Proceeding and draft of letter to Board as to regional planning re EWT	JAC	.8	264.00	EWT
	Prepare for Energy Task Force meeting	NM	.4	88.00	EWT
	Prepare for Energy Task meeting	JAC	.4	132.00	EWT
	Attend Energy Task Force Meeting	JAC	2.0	660.00	EWT
Suite 201	Attend Energy Task Force	NM	2.0	440.00 Phone: (807) 62	EWT

	Meeting				
	Attend Energy Task Force	MM	2.0	.00	EWT
	Meeting (not posted to fee) Review email re: request for extension on Proponent file and review Mr. Angus' calculation of generating capacity NWO	JAC	.3	99.00	EWT
	Draft letter to OEB re: East- West Tie Interrogatories and regional planning	MM	.2	25.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Energy Data Analysis; review further email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: revise load and supply database	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Betts re: meeting on November 26, 2012	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
23 Nov 12	Review email from Mr. Betts; review email from Ms. Swerdlyk; email to Mr. Bob Betts; email to Mr. Angus, Mr. Hebert and Mr. Bosch; review email from Mr. Angus; review further email from Mr. Betts and reply email to Mr. Betts re: meeting on November 26, 2012	NM	.7	154.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Energy data analysis	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
24 Nov 12	Further analysis of load and supply match in the Northwest with the East-West Tie	JAC	2.1	693.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus Energy Task Force; review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: New Analysis of Load vs Supply	NM	.4	88.00	EWT
25 Nov 12	Review lengthy email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Angus; review	NM	.6	132.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 62.	3-1111

	email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Bosch; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Bosch re: New Analysis of Load vs Supply with new EWT				
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Hebert and Mr. Bosch; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Bosch; review email from Mr. Thorburn to Energy Task Force; review email from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Angus and Mr. Bosch; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Hebert and Mr. Bosch; review email from Mr. Bosch; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus re: New Analysis of Load vs Supply with new EWT	NM	.6	132.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Hydro One Outage for East- West Tie	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
26 Nov 12	Prepare for meeting with NextBridge representatives	NM	1.3	286.00	EWT
	Office conference with Mr. Mark Mikulasik re: questions to ask NextBridge representatives	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
	Office conference with Mr. Nick Melchiorre re: questions to ask NextBridge	MM	.2	25.00	EWT
	Meeting with NextBridge representatives	NM	2.1	462.00	EWT
	Memo to file	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Thorburn to Energy Task Force re: New Analysis of Load vs Supply	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Betts re: follow- up to teleconference	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 62.	3-1111

27 Nov 12	Review email from Mr. H to Mr. Mikulasik Summarizing Yester Meeting	re:	NM	[.1	22.00	EWT
28 Nov 12	Review email from Mr. I Yeomans to Mr. Angu Information on Elect Generation in Northwe Ontario	s re: trical	NM		.1	22.00	EWT
29 Nov 12	Review email from Mr. B and reply re: meeting November 26, 2012		NM	[.2	44.00	EWT
	Review email from Mikulasik to Mr. Heber Summarizing Yester Meeting		NM	[.1	22.00	EWT
	J.A. Cyr	29.6	@	330.00	=	9,768.00	
	Nick Melchiorre	22.9	@	220.00	=	5,038.00	
	D. Lafferty	.5	@	140.00	=	70.00	
	Mark Mikulasik	9.0	@	125.00	=	1,125.00	
	Total hours	62.0				16,00.00	

DISBURSEMENTS

To our fee

Photocopies	109.60	T
Long Distance Charges	11.29	T

Total disbursements 120.89

Total Fees and Disbursements 16,121.89

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1 Phone: (807) 623-1111 Fax: (807) 623-4947 Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

16,001.00

TOTAL TAXES

 HST on 16,001.00 fees
 2,080.13

 HST on 120.89 disbursements
 15.72

 HST (Registration #: 122004658RT)

2,095.85

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

Fax: (807) 623-4947

Total Bill 18,217.74

Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

J.A. Cyr E.& O.E.

This account is due when rendered. Please pay promptly to avoid interest charges. Interest will be charged in accordance with the Solicitors Act of Ontario.



Weiler, Maloney, Nei

The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay 500 Donald Street East Thunder Bay ON P7E 5V3

Our file #: 57695 Account #: 18960

Re: Long Term Energy Plan

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above matter during the period from 30 November 2012 to 28 December 2012:

30 Nov 12	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik re: draft email to Mr. Hebert - summary of meeting with NextBridge and Enabler Lines	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Review Enabler Cost Responsibility research for incorporation into new EWT; draft email to Mr. Hebert re: same	MM	1.6	200.00	EWT
	Review enabler cost research and incorporation into new EWT; draft email to Mr. Nick Melchiorre re: same	MM	.6	75.00	EWT
03 Dec 12	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Mikulasik re: draft summary of meeting	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
06 Dec 12	Review news article on commission on LDC amalgamation	JAC	.1	33.00	EWT
	Attend to telephone call with OEB re: payment of costs to City, NOMA and NOACC	MM	.5	62.50	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Vogt at OEB re: Decision and Order on Motion to Review	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
07 Dec 12	Review letter from George	MM	.3	37.50	EWT
Suite 201	_			Phone: (807) 623	B-1111

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1 Phone: (807) 623-1111 Fax: (807) 623-4947 Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

28 December 2012

	Wash to OED				
11 Dec 12	Vegh to OEB Review email letter from Ms. Habashy at OEB re: EB-2011-	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
12 Dec 12	O140 OEB correspondence Review email letter from Ms. Habashy at OEB re: EB-2011- 0140 OEB re: UCT	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
13 Dec 12	Declaration and Undertaking Review further email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Excerpts Report	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Bill Kennedy to Mr. Cyr and reply email to Mr. Kennedy re: East-	MM	.2	25.00	EWT
	West Tie Project Review further email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Excerpts from Report	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
18 Dec 12	Draft letter to Ms. Nadia Koltun re: Cost Eligibility (EWT)	DL	.3	42.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Cyr and review email from Mr. Cyr re: EWT Cost Awards	MM	.2	25.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Cyr and review reply email from Mr. Cyr re: EWT Cost Awards	MM	.2	25.00	EWT
19 Dec 12	Revise draft transmittal letter to Ms. Koltun re: transmittal	JAC	.2	66.00	EWT
	of costs awarded Instructions on file; email to Ms. Nadia Koltun attaching Mr. Cyr's letter dated December 19, 2012 re OEB Cost Awards - EWT	DL	.2	28.00	EWT
	Review email letter from Mr. Rahimtoola at OEB re: Board Letter - PRFN - Declaration and Undertaking - Board File #EB-2011-0140	NM	.2	44.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Lafferty to Ms. Koltun re: OEB Cost Awards	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Ms. Lafferty re: OEB Cost	NM	.1	22.00	EWT
Suita 201	•			Dhamar (907) (22	1111

	ards						
	view email letter from		MN	1	.2	25.00	EWT
	nimtoola at OEB re: Bo						
	ter - PRFN - Declarat						
	Undertaking - Board	File					
	3-2011-0140			_		10.70	
		Ms.	MN	1	.1	12.50	EWT
	ferty to Ms. Koltun	re:					
	B Cost Awards		3.43	•	1	12.50	
	view email from Mr. An	_	MN	1	.1	12.50	EWT
	Ms. Lafferty re: OEB C	Cost					
AW	ards						
J.A	. Cyr	.3	@	330.00	=	99.00	
Nic	k Melchiorre	1.0	@	220.00	=	220.00	
D. 1	Lafferty	.5	@	140.00	=	70.00	
Ma	rk Mikulasik	4.1	@	125.00	=	512.50	
Tot	al hours	5.9				901.50	
То	our fee						901.50
10	our rec						701.50
DISBURSEMENT	<u>rs</u>						
Tot	al disbursements						0.00
Tot	al Fees and Disburseme	ents					901.50
TOTAL TAVES							
TOTAL TAXES							
HS'	T on 901.50 fees					117.20	
HS'	T on 0.00 disbursement	S				0.00	
HS	Γ (Registration #: 1220	04658	RT)				117.20
Tot	al Bill						1,018.70
100	····						1,010.70

Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

J.A. Cyr E.& O.E.

This account is due when rendered. Please pay promptly to avoid interest charges. Interest will be charged in accordance with the Solicitors Act of Ontario.

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1



Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay 500 Donald Street East Thunder Bay ON P7E 5V3 31 January 2013

Our file #: 57695 Account #: 19365

Re: Long Term Energy Plan

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above matter during the period from 27 December 2012 to 31 January 2013:

04 Jan 13	Review email from Ms.	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	O'Reilly at FMC to Board				
	Secretary at OEB re: RES				
	Canada Transmission LP;				
	East-West Tie Line				
	Designation Application; EB-				
	2011-0140				
	Review email from Ms.	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	O'Reilly at FMC to Board				
	Secretary at OEB re: RES				
	Canada Transmission LP;				
	East-West Tie Line				
	Designation Application; EB-				
	2011-0140				
07 Jan 13	Review email from Board	JAC	1.5	495.00	EWT
	regarding six Applications;				
	review of possible consultants				
	preliminary comments and				
	draft email to client with				
	background and need for				

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

	further analysis by consultant East-West Tie				
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: Summarizing Yesterday's Meeting	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Rahimtoola at OEB to All Parties; review email from Mr. Cyr to Ms. Koltun, Mr. Hebert and Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Cyr to Ms. Koltun, Mr. Hebert and Mr. Angus and review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr re: East- West Tie Proceedings - Board File # EB-2011-0140	NM	.4	96.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Cyr re: Summarizing Yesterday's Meeting	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Rahimtoola at OEB to All Parties; review email from Mr. Cyr to Ms. Koltun, Mr. Hebert and Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Cyr to Ms. Koltun, Mr. Hebert and Mr. Angus and review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr re: East- West Tie Proceedings - Board File # EB-2011-0140	MM	.4	50.00	EWT
08 Jan 13	Review and analysis of the issues in the East- West Tie and present to client the merit in engaging a consultant	JAC	5.1	1683.00	EWT
	Review AltaLink Ontario L.P. Application	NM	1.6	384.00	EWT
	Review Canadian Niagara Power Inc. Application	NM	1.5	360.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Cyr, Ms. Koltun and Mr. Angus; email to Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Cyr; further email to Mr. Cyr and review email from Mr.	NM	.5	120.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 62	23-1111

	Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: East- West Tie Project				
	Review email letter from Mr. Robert Caputo at OEB re: Data Room Filing, East-West Tie Designation Proceeding (EB-2011-0140)	NM	.2	48.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Cyr, Ms. Koltun and Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Cyr; review further email from Mr. Melchiorre to Mr. Cyr and email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre re: East-West Tie Project	MM	.5	62.50	EWT
	Review email letter from Mr. Robert Caputo at OEB re: Data Room Filing, East-West Tie Designation Proceeding (EB-2011-0140)	MM	.2	25.00	EWT
09 Jan 13	Review, edit and proofread analysis of issues for client with a view to engaging a consultant	JAC	2.2	726.00	EWT
	Provide list of subjects for chart and comparisons of each Application	NM	.8	192.00	EWT
	Begin review of proponent transmitter applications	MM	1.1	137.50	EWT
	Review lengthy email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Hebert and Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Cyr, Ms. Koltun and Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr; review further emails from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Cyr, Ms. Koltun and Mr. Angus Re: Meeting - East-West Tie Project	NM	.5	120.00	EWT
	Review Procedural Order No. 5 dated January 8, 2013	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr re: East-West Tie	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 6	23-1111

	Proceeding - Board File # EB- 2011-0140				
	Review lengthy email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Hebert and Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Cyr, Ms. Koltun and Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr; review further emails from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Cyr, Ms. Koltun and Mr. Angus Re: Meeting - East-West Tie Project	MM	.5	62.50	EWT
	Review Procedural Order No. 5 dated January 8, 2013	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr re: East-West Tie Proceeding - Board File # EB- 2011-0140	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Prepare for East-West Tie meeting with Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre	MM	.8	100.00	EWT
	Review approach to be taken with respect to proponent Applications and discuss with colleagues re East West Tie Applications	JAC	.7	231.00	EWT
	Meeting with Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre re East West Tie Applications	MM	.7	87.50	EWT
	Meeting with Mr. Cyr and Mr. Mikulasik re East West Tie Applications	NM	.7	168.00	EWT
10 Jan 13	Review email exchange re: meetings on East-West Tie; review criteria for spreadsheet for six applicants	JAC	.4	132.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus re: Internal Meeting - East-West Tie Project	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email letter from Ms. O'Reilly at FMC to OEB Board Secretary re: RES Canada Transmission LP, East-West Tie Line	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 6	23-1111

	Designation Application,				
	Board File No. EB-2011-0140	NTN #	1	24.00	
	Email to Mr. Mikulasik re: Chart for East-West Tie	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Applications Last West The				
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Mr. Angus re: Internal				
	Meeting - East-West Tie Project				
	Review email letter from Ms.	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	O'Reilly at FMC to OEB				
	Board Secretary re: RES				
	Canada Transmission LP, East-West Tie Line				
	Designation Application,				
	Board File No. EB-2011-0140				
	Review email from Mr.	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Melchiorre re: Chart for East- West Tie Applications				
11 Jan 13	Review of RES East-West Tie	MM	3.4	425.00	EWT
	application for designated				
	transmitter; draft chart re				
	same; review Nextbridge Infrastructure application for				
	designation; revise chart re:				
	same; review Iccon and				
	TransCanada Power				
	Transmission application for designation; revise chart re:				
	same				
	Review East-West Tie LP	MM	1.1	137.50	EWT
	application for designation;				
	update summary chart Review email from Ms.	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Habashy at OEB to	1 11/1	.1	21.00	DW 1
	Distribution Group re: EB-				
	2011-0140 Ontario Energy				
	Board - Board Reply Letter to RES				
	Review email from Ms.	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Habashy at OEB to				
	Distribution Group re: EB-				
	2011-0140 Ontario Energy Board - Board Reply Letter to				
	RES				
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 6	23-1111

14 Jan 13	Further review of East-West Tie LP Application for designation; review and revise chart summarizing applications; draft email to Mr. Cyr re: questions to be asked	MM	3.4	425.00	EWT
	in interrogatories Review email letter from Mr. Vellone at BLG to Ms. Walli at OEB re: Correspondence re: East-West Tie Designation (EB-2011-0140)	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: Research Memo - EWT	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email letter from Mr. Vellone at BLG to Ms. Walli at OEB re: Correspondence re: East-West Tie Designation (EB-2011-0140)	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Email to Mr. Cyr re: Research Memo - EWT	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
15 Jan 13	Review letter to Minister of Energy from Metis Nation of Ontario; draft email to Mr. Cyr re same	MM	.3	37.50	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik re: Chart of Applications	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Mikulasik re: East-West Tie Summary of Applications	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email letter from Mr. Madden to Ms. Habashy at OEB re: EB-2011-0140 - MNO Lt to Minister Bentley January 15, 2013	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Rubenstein to OEB Board Secretary re: EB-2011-0140 - EWT Phase 2 - SEC Confidentiality Submission	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Dyck at Torys to OEB Board Secretary re: EB-2011-0140	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 6	23-1111

Suite 201				Phone: (807) 6	23-1111
	accordingly; review application of Niagara Power and review summary chart accordingly Further review and revision to application summary chart;	MM	.9	112.50	EWT
	Objections; review email and letter EB-2011-0140 - East-West Tie Designation Proceeding - EWT LP Objection to RES's Confidentiality Request Review designation application of Atla Link; revise summary chart	MM	3.8	475.00	EWT
16 Jan 13	Secretary re: EB-2011-0140 EWT Designation Proceeding EWT LP Objection to RES's Confidentiality Request Review email and letter Re: EB-2011-0140 – RES Confidentiality – SEC	MM	.7	87.50	EWT
	Rubenstein to OEB Board Secretary re: EB-2011-0140 - EWT Phase 2 - SEC Confidentiality Submission Review email from Mr. Dyck at Torys to OEB Board	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Madden to Ms. Habashy at OEB re: EB-2011-0140 - MNO Lt to Minister Bentley January 15, 2013 Review email from Mr.	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Melchiorre re: EWT Summary of Applications Review email letter from Mr.	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Chart of Applications Review email from Mr.	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr re: Energy Presentation Slide Deck Email to Mr. Melchiorre re:	NM MM	.1	24.00 12.50	EWT EWT
	EWT Designation Proceeding EWT LP Objection to RES's Confidentiality Request				

draft email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre re: same Email to Mr. Mikulasik and review email from Mr. Mikulasik re: EWT Summary	NM	.2	48.00	EWT
of Applications Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: Chart of Applications	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr; review further email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and review further email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr re: Energy Presentation Slide Deck - Questions re EWT	NM	.4	96.00	EWT
Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus re: Robustness	NM	.2	48.00	EWT
Instructions on file and review research on "robustness"	JAC	.3	99.00	EWT
Review reply email from Mr. Angus and review, revise and draft transmittal comment on draft of proposed questions	JAC	1.8	594.00	EWT
Review email from Mr. Melchiorre and email to Mr. Melchiorre re: EWT Summary of Applications	MM	.2	25.00	EWT
Email to Mr. Cyr re: Chart of Applications	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr; review further email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and review further email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr re: Energy Presentation Slide Deck - EWT	MM	.4	50.00	EWT
Email to Mr. Cyr and review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus re: Robustness	MM	.2	25.00	EWT

17 Jan 13	Review Questions re EWT; draft email to John Cyr re	MM	.5	62.50	EWT
18 Jan 13	Review lengthy email from Mr. Angus to ETF, NOMA, NOACC and City of Thunder	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Bay re: EWT Review lengthy email from Mr. Thorburn to ETF and review further email from Mr. Thorburn to ETF re: EWT	NM	.2	48.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to ETF re: Notes from ETF re EWT	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from ETF on EWT slide deck; assess issues and draft email comment on implications of planning and East-West Tie	JAC	1.6	528.00	EWT
	Review email from Energy Task Force Co-Chair, Mr. Angus and draft reply re: East- West Tie issue	JAC	.8	264.00	EWT
	Review lengthy email from Mr. Angus to ETF, NOMA, NOACC re EWT	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Review lengthy email from Mr. Thorburn to ETF and review further email from Mr. Thorburn to ETF re: EWT	MM	.2	25.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to ETF re: EWT	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Review email from Ms. O'Reilly at FMC to OEB Board Secretary re: RES Canada LP; EWT Line Designation Application; Reply Submission on Confidential Filing; EB-2011- 0140	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Greenway to Mr. Thorburn re: EWT	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
19 Jan 13	Review email from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Angus; review email	MM	.4	50.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 6	23-1111

1001 William Street
Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

	from Mr. Hebert to Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Hebert; review email from Mayor Hobbs to Mr. Hebert and Mr. Angus re: EWT				
20 Jan 13	Review various emails re: Minister's visit and discussions re EWT	JAC	.4	132.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Vezina to Energy Task Force; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Vezina re: EWT	MM	.2	25.00	EWT
21 Jan 13	Review email from Mr. Harris to Mr. Bosch and review email from Mr. Greenway to Mr. Harris re: EWT	MM	.2	25.00	EWT
22 Jan 13	Review issues for Energy Task Force meeting and prepare excerpts from Electricity Act and Regulations	JAC	1.3	429.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Slide Deck for NOMA Board Meeting and Energy Task Force Meeting re EWT	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
23 Jan 13	Review email from Ms. Habashy at OEB and OEB Decision and Order re: EB- 2011-0140 OEB Decision and Order on request for confidentiality from RES Canada Transmission	NM	.2	48.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Habashy at OEB and OEB Decision and Order re: EB- 2011-0140 OEB Decision and Order on request for confidentiality from RES Canada Transmission	MM	.2	25.00	EWT
25 Jan 13	Review email from Mr. Dyck to Board Secretary at OEB re: EB-2011-0140 Non-Financial Information Filed by RES Canada Transmission L.P.	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 6	23-1111

	Review email from OEB Board Secretary Office re: Account Information for Log On	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. O'Reilly to Board Secretary at OEB re: RES Canada Transmission LP - East West Tie Line Designation - EB- 2011-0140	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Dyck to Board Secretary at OEB re: EB-2011-0140 Non-Financial Information Filed by RES Canada Transmission L.P.	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Review email from OEB Board Secretary Office re: Account Information for Log On	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Review email from Ms. O'Reilly to Board Secretary at OEB re: RES Canada Transmission LP - East West Tie Line Designation - EB- 2011-0140	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
26 Jan 13	Review email from Ms. Girvan to Ms. Habashy at OEB re: EB-2011-0140 OEB PO Number 5	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Email to Ms. Young re: EWT Interrogatories due January 30, 2013	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Girvan to Ms. Habashy at OEB re: EB-2011-0140 OEB PO Number 5	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Melchiorre to Ms. Young re: EWT Interrogatories due January 30, 2013	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
27 Jan 13	Review draft letter from Energy Task Force et al; analysis of impact of East- West Tie and edit extensively; draft transmittal with	JAC	2.3	759.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 6	23-1111

	explanation of proposed revisions				
28 Jan 13	Review email from Ms. Habashy at OEB to Mr. Keizer at Tory's; email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Mikulasik; review email from Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Mikulasik and email to Mr. Mikulasik re: EB-2011-0140 Ontario Energy Board - Board Reply Letter to ELP	NM	.5	120.00	EWT
	Review email letter from Ms. Habashy at OEB re: EB-2011- 0140 Ontario Energy Board Letter	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Habashy at OEB to Mr. Keizer at Tory's; review email from Mr. Melchiorre to Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Cyr; email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre and review email from Mr. Melchiorre re:EB-2011-0140 Ontario Energy Board - Board Reply Letter to ELP	MPM	.5	75.00	EWT
	Review email letter from Ms. Habashy at OEB re: EB-2011- 0140 Ontario Energy Board Letter	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review Consumer Council of Canada EWT letter dated January 25, 2013; review Decision and Order on Request for Confidentiality from RES Canada Transmission LP dated January 23, 2013; review letter from Charles Keizer to Mrs Walli dated January 25, 2013; review latest procedural order - EWT	MPM	.7	105.00	EWT
	Research load forecasts in EWT designation applications; review summary chart of same	MPM	1.6	240.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 6	23_1111

	Review issue on instructions and finish draft of letter to Ms. Koltun; review plan for preparation of the interrogatories for Phase II of	JAC	1.5	495.00	EWT
	the Designation Proceeding Finish review of documents and drafting of letter to Ms. Koltun with attachments	JAC	2.4	792.00	EWT
	Review editorial changes further and draft edits in document re effect of East- West Tie	JAC	.6	198.00	EWT
29 Jan 13	Review letter from OEB dated January 28-12 East-West Tie; review Long Term Electricity Outlook for Northwest and Context for the Expansion (Exhibit O.1.2) and IESO Feasibility Study: An assessment of the Westward transfer capacity of various options for reinforcing the EWT (Exhibit P.1)	MPM	.8	120.00	EWT
	Proofread and edit document - EWT	JAC	.5	165.00	EWT
	Review various email comments on draft letter on East-West Tie	JAC	.3	99.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force; review email from Mr. Thorburn to Energy Task Force; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus; review further email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Thorburn; review email from Mr. Greenway	NM	.5	120.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Mikulasik and review further email from Mr. Cyr re: EB-2011-0140 OEB Board - Board Reply letter to ELP	NM	.3	72.00	EWT
G 4. 201	Review email from Mr.	MPM	.5	75.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 6	73-1111

	Thorburn to Mr. Bosch; review email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Thorburn and Mr. Bosch; review further email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Thorburn and Mr. Bosch; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Grannway rev EWT.				
	to Mr. Greenway re: EWT Review email from Mr. Cyr; email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre and review further email from Mr. Cyr re: EB- 2011-0140 OEB Board - Board Reply letter to ELP	MPM	.3	45.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus; re: EWT	MPM	.2	30.00	EWT
	Attend meeting with Nick Melchiorre re draft EWT interrogatories	MPM	.5	75.00	EWT
	Further review of EWT designation applications; begin draft of email re interrogatories to Mr. Cyr	MPM	1.3	195.00	EWT
30 Jan 13	Review student research on various points regarding Bill 75 and role of OEB - EWT	JAC	.5	165.00	EWT
	Revise questions as to East- West Tie	JAC	1.5	495.00	EWT
	Review colleague's draft of Interrogatories; revise and edit	JAC	1.9	627.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Mikulasik; review further email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: EB-2011-0140 OEB - Board reply letter to ELP	NM	.3	72.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: Draft EWT Interrogatories	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: EWT	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 6	23-1111

Route				
Email to Mr. Cyr and Mr.	MPM	.3	45.00	EWT
Melchiorre; review email from				
Mr. Cyr to Mr. Melchiorre;				
further email to Mr.				
Melchiorre and Mr. Cyr re: EB-2011-0140 OEB - Board				
reply letter to ELP				
Email to Mr. Melchiorre and	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
Mr. Cyr re: Energy Task Force	1711 171	.1	13.00	LWI
Meeting Follow up				
Review email from Mr. Angus	MPM	.3	45.00	EWT
to Energy Task Force; review	1/11 1/1		12.00	2,,,1
email from Mr. Cyr to Mr.				
Angus and Mr. Hebert; review				
further email from Mr. Angus				
to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert re:				
EWT				
Email to Mr. Cyr and Mr.	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
Melchiorre re: Draft EWT				
Interrogatories				
Review and revise EWT	MPM	4.4	660.00	EWT
Interrogatories; draft letter to				
OEB re same; review				
proponent transmitter				
applications to ensure				
interrogatories have not				
already been addressed) (D) (1.6	240.00	
Review and revise email to	MPM	1.6	240.00	EWT
Mr. Cyr EWT	MDM	1	15.00	EWIT
Email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre re: EWT Route	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
Review OPA and IESO report	MPM	2.4	360.00	EWT
re reference route, draft email	1711 171	2.4	300.00	LWI
to John Cyr re same; review				
emails re dynamic flow, flow				
reduction and load shedding;				
draft email to John Cyr re				
EWT				
Review email from Ms.	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
Roszell at Paliare Roland re				
RB-2011-0140 EWT LP -				
Interrogatories of PWU				
submitted January 30, 2013				
Review email letter from Mr.	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
			Dhama. (907)	(22 1111

	Madden to OEB Board Secretary re: EB-2011-0140 - EWT LP Interrogatories of Metis Nation of Ontario				
	Review email from OEB Board Secretary re: Confirmation of Supporting Document Submission for NOACC	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Greenway to Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus re: EWT letter	NM	.3	72.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus re: EWT letter	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Roszell at Paliare Roland re RB-2011-0140 EWT LP - Interrogatories of PWU submitted January 30, 2013	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review email letter from Mr. Madden to OEB Board Secretary re: EB-2011-0140 - EWT LP Interrogatories of Metis Nation of Ontario	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review email from OEB Board Secretary re: Confirmation of Supporting Document Submission for NOACC	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Greenway to Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus re: EWT Letter	MPM	.3	45.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus re: EWT letter	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
13	Review and revise memo re enabler cost responsibility issues in EWT; final review re Bill 75; draft email to Mr. Cyr re same	MPM	1.8	270.00	EWT
1				Phone: (807) 62	23-1111

31 Jan

Review interrogatories MNO and PWU	of	MPN	М	.2	30.00	EWT
Review email from Mr. Ar to ETF; review email from Bosch to ETF; review en from Mr. McKinnon to Ereview email from Mr. He to Mr. Angus; review en from Mr. Angus; review en from Mr. Angus to Mr. He and review further email f Mr. McKinnon to Mr. He and Mr. Angus; review en from Mr. Bosch to McKinnon, Mr. Hebert ad Angus and review email f Mr. Hebert to Mr. McKin EWT Letter	Mr. mail TTF; bert mail bert rom bert mail Mr. Mr.	NM	[.9	216.00	EWT
Review email from Mr. And to ETF; review email from Bosch to ETF; review endiform Mr. McKinnon to Ereview email from Mr. He to Mr. Angus; review endiform Mr. Angus to Mr. He and review further email for Mr. McKinnon to Mr. He and Mr. Angus; review endiform Mr. Ang	Mr. mail TTF; bert mail bert rom bert mail Mr. Mr.	MPM	M	.9	135.00	EWT
Revise extensively the draft letter regarding planning for the North Region in relation to the West Tie	the west	JAC		5.1	1683.00	EWT
J.A. Cyr Mark Mikulasik Nick Melchiorre Mark Mikulasik Total hours	32.7 19.4 13.3 22.9 88.3	@ @ @	330.00 150.00 240.00 125.00	= =	10,791.00 2,910.00 3,192.00 2,862.50 19,755.50	

To our fee 19,755.50

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

DISBURSEMENTS

	Total disbursements		0.00
	Total Fees and Disbursements		19,755.50
TOTAL TAX	<u>XES</u>		
	HST on 19,755.50 fees HST on 0.00 disbursements	2,568.21 0.00	
	Total Rill		22 323 71

Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

J.A. Cyr E.& O.E.

This account is due when rendered. Please pay promptly to avoid interest charges. Interest will be charged in accordance with the Solicitors Act of Ontario.

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

Fax: (807) 623-4947



The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay 500 Donald Street East Thunder Bay ON P7E 5V3

Account #: 19756

28 February 2013

Our file #: 57695 Re: Long Term Energy Plan

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above matter during the period from 23 January 2013 to 28 February 2013:

23 Jan 13	Review draft revisions and draft reply to Mr. Angus of Energy Task Force re impact of East-West Tie	JAC	.2	66.00	EWT
31 Jan 13	Review OEB clarification January 28, 2013 letter on design qualifications for East-West Tie must meet	JAC	.4	132.00	EWT
	Westbound requirements Review email from Mr. Mikulasik re: Energy Task Force Meeting with NextBridge Infrastructure	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert re: EB-2011-0140 OEB Board Letter	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre re: Energy Task Force Meeting with NextBridge Infrastructure	MM	.1	12.50	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert re: EB-2011-0140 OEB	MM	.1	12.50	EWT

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

	Board Letter Review various emails among Energy Task Force - EWT	JAC	1.4	462.00	EWT
01 Feb 13	Instructions on file from Mr. Mikulasik; attending to forward two copies of the EWT Interrogatories to OEB Board Secretary	DL	.1	14.00	EWT
	Review SNC MRS 6-0; compare to summary sheet re EWT designation application; draft email to Mr. Cyr re same	MPM	1.5	225.00	EWT
6 Feb 13	Review RES Canada Transmission non- confidential information dated February 6, 2013; draft email to Mr. Cyr re same	MPM	.5	75.00	EWT
22 Feb 13	Review Metis Nation of Ontario letter to OEB; Greenstone Council letter to OEB; Superior North Shore Metis Council letter to OEB and Thunder Bay Metis Council letter to OEB	MPM	.3	45.00	EWT
	Review email letter from Mr. Madden to OEB re: EB- 2011-0140 - Letter re: MNO Intervention	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email letter from Mr. Madden to OEB re: EB- 2011-0140 - Letter re: MNO Intervention	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	J.A. Cyr 2.0	@ 330.00		660.00	
	Mark Mikulasik 2.4	@ 150.00 @ 240.00*		360.00	
	Nick Melchiorre .3 Mark Mikulasik .2	@ 240.00*@ 125.00		72.00 25.00	
	D. Lafferty .1	@ 140.00		14.00	
	Total hours 5.0			1,131.00	

^{*=} revised in Cost Claim to \$230 per hour

To our fee 1,131.00

DISBURSEMENTS

Total disbursements

Total Fees and Disbursements 1,131.00

0.00

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

Fax: (807) 623-4947

TOTAL TAXES

HST on 1,131.00 fees	147.03	
HST on 0.00 disbursements	0.00	
HST (Registration #: 122004658RT)		147.03
	•	

Total Bill 1,278.03

Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

J.A. Cyr

E.& O.E.

This account is due when rendered. Please pay promptly to avoid interest charges. Interest will be charged in accordance with the Solicitors Act of Ontario.



WEILER, MALONEY, NELSON

The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay 500 Donald Street East Thunder Bay ON P7E 5V3 28 March 2013

Account #: 20219

Our file #: 57695 Re: Long Term Energy Plan

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above matter during the period from 25 February 2013 to 28 March 2013:

04 Mar 13	Begin review of Procedural Order #6	JAC	.5	165.00	EWT
	Review Board Procedural Order No. 6; diarize dates as	MPM	.6	90.00	EWT
	appropriate				
	Review email from Ms. Habashy at OEB	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Habashy at OEB re: EB-2011-	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	0140 Ontario Energy Board				
	PO No. 6 and IRs				
06 Mar 13	Review Energy Task Force reports on meetings re EWT	JAC	.8	264.00	EWT
	Finish review of Procedural Order #6; draft email to Co-	JAC	1.2	396.00	EWT
	Chairs of Energy Task Force				
	Review Energy Task Force reports on meetings re the East-West Tie and draft short	JAC	2.3	759.00	EWT
	opinion to Energy Task Force				

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

	Co-Chairs on importance of the security piece Review email report from Mr. Angus to Mr. Bosch and Mr. Hebert re: Report on meeting	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	with Minister of Energy Review email report from Mr. Angus to Mr. Bosch and Mr. Hebert rev Bonort EWT	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Hebert re: Report EWT Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert; review further email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert re: EB-2011-0140 Ontario Energy Board PO No. 6 and IRs	NM	.3	72.00	EWT
	Review email report from Mr. Angus to Mr. Bosch and Mr. Hebert re: Report on meeting with Minister of Energy	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review email report from Mr. Angus to Mr. Bosch and Mr. Hebert re: Report on meeting with re EWT	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert; review further email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert re: EB-2011-0140 Ontario Energy Board PO No. 6 and IRs	MPM	.3	45.00	EWT
07 Mar 13	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Angus, Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert; review further email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Angus, Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert re: EWT Report	NM	.4	96.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to	MPM	.4	60.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 6	23-1111

	Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Angus, Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert; review further email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Angus, Mr. Cyr and Mr. Angus, Mr. Cyr and Mr.				
8 Mar 13	Hebert re: EWT report. Review EWT Orders for cost recovery in relation to experts; review possible experts; draft	MPM	2.3	345.00	EWT
12 Mar 13	email to Mr. John Cyr re same Review email from Ms. Habashy at OEB re: EB-2011- 0140 Ontario Energy Board - Clarification of Interrogatory	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	22 from IESO Review email from Ms. Habashy at OEB re: EB-2011- 0140 Ontario Energy Board - Clarification of Interrogatory	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
15 Mar 13	22 from IESO Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: EWT - May 2 and 3 Meeting in	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Thunder Bay Email to Mr. Cyr re: EWT - May 2 and 3 Meeting in Thunder Bay	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Research EWT Presentation in Thunder Bay, requirements and purpose; draft email to John Cyr re same	MPM	1.1	165.00	EWT
	Draft questions to ETF re April EWT presentation and email to Mr. Cyr re same	MPM	.9	135.00	EWT
18 Mar 13	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Bosch re: Applications re Designated Transmitter to Develop EWT	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Lea at OEB re: Procedural Order #6; email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Mikulasik; review email from Mr. Cyr; review email from	NM	.5	120.00	EWT
a					

	Mr. Cyr to Ms. Lea at OEB; review email from Ms. Lea to Mr. Cyr re: East-West Tie Designation Proceeding -				
	Thunder Bay oral sessions Email to Mr. Bosch re: Applications re Designated Transmitter to Develop EWT	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review applications for designation and draft email to Rod Bosch re Applications for Designation	MPM	.5	75.00	EWT
	Review associate's spreadsheet data summary for proponents	JAC	1.2	396.00	EWT
	Review emails on East-West Tie	JAC	.5	165.00	EWT
10.15 12	Review email from Ms. Lea at OEB re: Procedural Order #6; review email from Mr. Melchiorre to Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Cyr to Ms. Lea at OEB; review email from Ms. Lea to Mr. Cyr re: East-West Tie Designation Proceeding - Thunder Bay oral sessions	MPM	.5	75.00	EWT
19 Mar 13	Email to Mr. Cyr re: East- West Tie Designation Proceedings - Thunder Bay Oral Sessions	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Cyr re: East- West Tie Designation Proceedings - Thunder Bay Oral Sessions	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
20 Mar 13	Researching OEB filings for EWT Submissions	NM	.4	96.00	EWT
	Review EWT research; draft mini analysis and plan of action for Energy Task Force Co-Chairs;	JAC	1.4	462.00	EWT
	Review of issues in relation to East-West Tie designation applicants; develop issues	JAC	1.0	330.00	EWT
	Review of issues in relation to	NM	1.0	240.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807)	623-1111

	East-West Tie designation applicants; develop issues Review of issues in relation to East-West Tie designation	MPM	1.0	150.00	EWT
	applicants; develop issues Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Energy Task Force Macting Task Force	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Meeting – re EWT Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Energy Task Force Meeting EWT	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
21 Mar 13	Review email from Ms. Habashy at OEB re: East- West Tie EB-2011-0140 - Clarification regarding	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Interrogatories 30, 31 and 25 Review email from Ms. Habashy at OEB re: East- West Tie EB-2011-0140 - Clarification regarding	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
22 Mar 13	Interrogatories 30, 31 and 25 Conference call with Mr. Melchiorre and Mr. Doug	JAC	.2	66.00	EWT
	Cunningham, lawyer for NAN Conference call with Mr. Cyr and Mr. Doug Cunningham, lawyer for	NM	.2	48.00	EWT
	Instructions on file to provide Mr. Cunningham background information on East-West Tie	NM	.2	48.00	EWT
	Prepare for Energy Task Force meeting and review East-West Tie Application	NM	.8	192.00	EWT
Review email fr Mikulasik to M Cunningham re:	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Doug Cunningham re: Chart of Applications	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Energy Task Force Meeting EWT	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Energy Task Force	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
~					

	Meeting EWT Email to Mr. Doug	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Cunningham re: Chart of Applications			-5100	
	Review and revise EWT applications chart; draft email to Mr. John Cyr and Mr. Nick Melchiorre re same	MPM	1.2	180.00	EWT
24 Mar 13	Review consulting opinion (Doran) re: East-West Tie Final revision of associate's draft; review explanation of combined cycle gas turbine compared to gas conversion and result of conversion of TBGS on reliability of power and need for EWT	JAC	4.1	1353.00	EWT
25 Mar 13	Review Mr. Mikulasik's memo to Mr. Hebert and review notes of NextBridge meeting and Application	NM	.4	96.00	EWT
	Attend Energy Task Force Meeting for review of East- West Tie and possible positions for May 2-3, 2013 attendance at OEB in Thunder Bay	JAC	2.5	825.00	EWT
	Attend Energy Task Force Meeting for review of East- West Tie and possible positions for May 2-3, 2013 attendance at OEB in Thunder Bay	NM	2.5	600.00	EWT
	Attend Energy Task Force Meeting for review of East- West Tie and possible positions for May 2-3, 2013 attendance at OEB in Thunder Bay	MPM	2.5	375.00	EWT
	Instructions on file to associate for follow up	JAC	.1	33.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Mike Belmore to Energy Task Force and email to Ms. Swerdlyk re: Link to IESO Report on East-West Tie	NM	.2	48.00	EWT

	Feasibility Study	NIM	1	24.00	
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re:	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Enabler Meeting with				
	NextBridge Infrastructure				
	Review email from Mr.	NM	.2	48.00	EWT
	Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr and				
	review email from Mr.				
	Mikulasik to Mr. Angus re: Summary of East-West Tie				
	Applications				
	Review email from Mr. Mike	MPM	.2	30.00	EWT
	Belmore to Energy Task				
	Force and email to Ms.				
	Swerdlyk re: Link to IESO				
	Report on East-West Tie				
	Feasibility Study Further email to Mr. Cyr re:	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Meeting with NextBridge	1411 141	.1	13.00	LWI
	Infrastructure				
	Email to Mr. Cyr and review	MPM	.2	30.00	EWT
	email to Mr. Angus re:				
	Summary of East-West Tie				
OCM 12	Applications	MDM	1	15.00	
26 Mar 13	Review email from Mr. Cyr re: Meeting with NextBridge	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Infrastructure				
27 Mar 13	Review email correspondence	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	from Ms. Sebastian at Willms				
	Shier to OEB re: EB-2011-				
	0140 - East-West Tie				
	Designation	NIN (4	06.00	
	Review email from Ms. Lea	NM	.4	96.00	EWT
	to Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Angus to Ms. Jennifer				
	Lea and Mr. Cyr; review				
	further email from Mr. Angus				
	to Ms. Lea; review email from				
	Mr. Angus to Ms. Lea and				
	Mr. Cyr re: East-West Tie				
	Designation - Thunder Bay				
	Oral Sessions Review email correspondence	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	from Ms. Sebastian at Willms	1411 141	• 1	15.00	1.77 1
	Shier to OEB re: EB-2011-				
	0140 - East-West Tie				
G 14 207				DI (007)	22 1111

	Designation Review email from Ms. Lea to Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Angus to Ms. Jennifer Lea and Mr. Cyr; review further email from Mr. Angus to Ms. Lea; review email from Mr. Angus to Ms. Lea and Mr. Cyr re: East-West Tie Designation - Thunder Bay Oral Sessions		.4	60.00	EWT
28 Mar 13	Review Feasibility Study of IESO provided by Energy Task Force	NM	1.1	264.00	EWT
	Review email re Energy Task Force instructions and strategy logistics re submissions to the Board May 2-3, 2013 and prepare draft response to Ms. Jennifer Lea, OEB counsel for review by those to be involved		1.5	495.00	EWT
	J.A. Cyr 17.3 Mark Mikulasik 13.5 Nick Melchiorre 9.9 Total hours 40.7	@ 150.0	0 =	5,709.00 2,025.00 2,376.00 10,110.00	
	*Adjusted to \$230/hr in Cost Claim				
	To our fee				10,110.00
DISBURSEN	MENTS				
	Photocopies Long Distance Charges			7.20 T 6.99 T	
	Total disbursements				44.19

Total Fees and Disbursements

Phone: (807) 623-1111 Fax: (807) 623-4947 Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

10,154.19

TOTAL TAXES

HST on 10,110.00 fees
HST on 44.19 disbursements
HST (Registration #: 122004658RT)

Total Bill

1,314.30

1,320.04

Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

J.A. Cyr E.& O.E.

This account is due when rendered. Please pay promptly to avoid interest charges. Interest will be charged in accordance with the Solicitors Act of Ontario.

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

Fax: (807) 623-4947



WEILER, MALONEY, NELSON

The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay 500 Donald Street East Thunder Bay ON P7E 5V3 30 April 2013

Our file #: 57695 Account #: 20614

Re: Long Term Energy Plan

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above matter during the period from 28 March 2013 to 30 April 2013:

28 Mar 13	Email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Mikulasik; review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Mikulasik re: East-West Tie Designation Proceeding - Thunder Bay Oral Sessions	NM	.2	48.00	EWT
	Review email from OEB re: Chapter 5 CDSP Filing	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Requirements Review email from Mr. Barber at CN Power re: CNPI - Interrogatory Responses - EB-2011-0140	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Vellone at BLG to OEB Board Secretary re: EB-2011- 0140 ATL IRRs - OEB	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review emails from Mr. Zacher at Stikeman re: EB- 2011-0140 - IR Responses of	NM	.2	48.00	EWT

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

Iccon/TPT				
Review email from Ms.	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
Proctor at BLG to OEB				
Board Secretary re: EB-2011-				
0140 Interrogatory Responses				
ATL IRRs				
Review emails from Ms.	NM	.4	96.00	EWT
Kneteman at Torys to OEB				
Board Secretary; review				
further emails from Ms.				
Kneteman re: EWT LP				
Responses to OEB Interrogatories - EB-2011-				
0140 (Parts 1 and 2)				
Review further email from	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
Mr. Zacher at Stikeman re:	1 11/1	•1	24.00	LWI
IR Responses of Iccon/TPT -				
EB-2011-0140 OEB				
Review email from Ms.	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
Galler at Gowlings re: EB-				
2011-0140 - Electricity				
Transmission Infrastructure -				
EWT Line				
Review email from Mr. Cyr	MPM	.1	15.00	Other
re: Update on Energy File				
from Energy Task Force	1 (D) (20.00	
Review email from Mr.	MPM	.2	30.00	EWT
Melchiorre to Mr. Cyr;				
review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Melchiorre re: East-West				
Tie Designation Proceeding -				
Thunder Bay Oral Sessions				
Review email from Mr.	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
Barber at CN Power re:	1711 171	••	12.00	2,11
CNPI - Interrogatory				
Responses - EB-2011-0140				
Review email from Mr.	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
Vellone at BLG to OEB				
Board Secretary re: EB-2011-				
0140 ATL IRRs - OEB				
Review emails from Mr.	MPM	.2	30.00	EWT
Zacher at Stikeman re: EB-				
2011-0140 - IR Responses of				
Iccon/TPT	N A DON A	1	15.00	T-13.70
Review email from Ms.	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
Proctor at BLG to OEB				

	Board Secretary re: EB- 02011-0140 Interrogatory Responses ATL IRRs				
	Review emails from Ms. Kneteman at Torys to OEB Board Secretary; review further emails from Ms. Kneteman Re: EWT LP Responses to OEB Interrogatories - EB-2011- 0140 (Parts 1 and 2)	MPM	.4	60.00	EWT
	Review further email from Mr. Zacher at Stikeman re: IR Responses of Iccon/TPT - EB-2011-0140 OEB	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Galler at Gowlings re: EB- 2011-0140 - Electricity Transmission Infrastructure - EWT Line	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
01 Apr 13	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Ms. Lea at OEB re: East- West Tie Designation Proceeding - Thunder Bay Oral Sessions	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Ms. Lea at OEB re: East- West Tie Designation Proceeding - Thunder Bay Oral Sessions	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
02 Apr 13	Telephone message from Ms. Newland re: RES Applicant; review RES LLP composition; review Dentons; return call and draft email to Energy Task Force Co-Chairs for explaining request for meeting with Mr. Jerry Vaninetti, President of RES	JAC	.8	264.00	EWT
	Review email and draft reply proposing response to counsel for RES	JAC	.2	66.00	EWT

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Fax: (807) 623-4947 Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

	Review emails of past meeting requested by Applicant; review Energy Task Force email; draft email to counsel for RES	JAC	1.4	462.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Lea at OEB to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Pickernell re: East-West Tie Designation Proceeding - Thunder Bay Oral Sessions	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Angus, Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert re: RES E/W Tie	NM	.5	120.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Lea at OEB to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Pickernell re: East-West Tie Designation Proceeding - Thunder Bay Oral Sessions	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Vezina to Mr. Angus, Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Bosch to Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert re: RES E/W Tie	MPM	.5	75.00	EWT
03 Apr 13	Review Energy Task Force NOMA energy presentation; review and research National Transportation Safety Board Report re Wawa triangle; review re EWT	MPM	.8	120.00	EWT
Suita 201				Phone: (207) 62	2 1111

	Review Energy Task Force instructions re May 3 Presentation/Submission; draft email to Mr. Cyr re	MPM	.5	75.00	EWT
	same Review Procedural Order 6 re response to Interrogatories; begin review of NextBridge EWT response to Interrogatories; draft email to Mr. John Cyr re same	MPM	.9	135.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr Meeting with NextBridge Infrastructure	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review lengthy email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: May 3rd Presentation/Submission	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Cyr to Ms. Newland at Dentons; review email from Ms. Newland to Mr. Cyr re: RES E/W Tie	NM	.3	72.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Cyr re: Bill 75 and Meeting with NextBridge Infrastructure	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Cyr re: May 3rd Presentation/Submission	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Cyr to Ms. Newland at Dentons; review email from Ms. Newland to Mr. Cyr re: RES E/W Tie	MPM	.3	45.00	EWT
04 Apr 13	Review email and reply re: Energy Task Force Steering Committee; consider leak with Watayrickneyap Power; review further email from Co-Chair	JAC	.6	198.00	EWT
Suite 201				Phone: (807) 623	3-1111

	Further review of NextBridge Response to Interrogatories; review Atlalink Response to Interrogatories	MPM	1.1	165.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: 13 First Nations and Goldcorp Incorporate	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Electricity Transmission Co. Review email from Mr. Greenway to Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Wayyetay Power	NM	.2	48.00	EWT
	Wawatay Power Review email from Mr. Vaninetti at RES to Mr. Cyr re: E/W Tie RES Applicant	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Vaninetti at RES to Mr. Cyr re: E/W Tie RES Applicant	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
05 Apr 13	Attend informational meeting with RES and Co-Chairs, Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert	JAC	1.5	495.00	EWT
	Attend informational meeting with RES and Co-Chairs, Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert	NM	1.5	360.00	EWT
	Attend informational meeting with RES and Co-Chairs, Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert	MPM	1.5	225.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Vaninetti to Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr, Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Mikulasik, Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert re: OEB Thunder Bay Meetings	NM	.4	96.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Angus re: RES Handout Regarding Project Schedules for Each Applicant	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Vaninetti to Mr. Cyr; review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr.	MPM	.4	60.00	EWT

	Angus and Mr. Hebert; email to Mr. Cyr, Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Hebert re: OEB Thunder Bay Meetings				
	Review email from Mr. Melchiorre to Mr. Angus re: RES Handout Regarding Project Schedules for Each Applicant	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review Response to Interrogatories of RES	MPM	.6	90.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Mikulasik re: East- West Tie	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr re: East-West Tie	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
06 Apr 13	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Draft Mining Readiness Strategy Energy Section April 6th	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Comparison between Submissions on East-West Tie re schedule	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Draft Mining Readiness Strategy Energy Section April 6th	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Comparison between Submissions on East-West Tie re schedule	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
07 Apr 13	Review email and draft cautionary comment re: additional Intervenors May 3rd	JAC	.7	231.00	EWT
	Review further email and draft reply to Co-Chairs emphasizing impact of common voice and need to	JAC	.5	165.00	EWT
C:4- 201				D1 (007)	22 1111

	avoid any impression to contrary				
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Power Schedule from	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Mining Readiness Strategy Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Power Schedule from	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
08 Apr 13	Mining Readiness Strategy Discussion with colleagues re: EWT Presentation on May 2 and 3, 2013	JAC	.6	198.00	EWT
	Discussion with colleagues re: EWT Presentation on May 2 and 3, 2013	NM	.6	144.00	EWT
	Discussion with colleagues re: EWT Presentation on May 2 and 3, 2013	MPM	.6	90.00	EWT
	draft letter from Coalition to EWT applicants; draft email to Mr. John Cyr re same	MPM	.3	45.00	EWT
	Review emails from Ms. Lea at OEB and email to Ms. Lea re: East-West Tie Transmission Line EB-2011-0140	NM	.3	72.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: EWT - Board Staff Submission	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review emails from Ms. Lea at OEB to Mr. Melchiorre and review email from Mr. Melchiorre to Ms. Lea re: East-West Tie Transmission Line EB-2011-0140	MPM	.3	45.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Cyr re: EWT - Board Staff Submission	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: Draft Letter to Applications re: Meeting with Coalition	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Cyr re: Draft Letter to Applications re: Meeting with Coalition	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT

09 Apr 13	review Board Staff submission re Phase 2 of	MPM	.6	90.00	EWT
11 Apr 13	EWT Designation Proceeding Review email from Ms. Habashy at OEB re: EB- 2011-0140 OEB Updated Intervention List	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Habashy at OEB re: EB- 2011-0140 OEB Updated Intervention List	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Continue review of EWT LP response to interrogatories	MPM	1.0	150.00	EWT
15 Apr13	Begin review of Iccon/TransCanada response to Interrogatories	MPM	1.1	165.00	EWT
16 Apr 13	Begin review of Iccon/TransCanada response to Interrogatories; draft email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre re summary of interrogatories - EWT	MPM	1.5	225.00	EWT
	Begin Draft of May 3 EWT presentation	MPM	1.1	165.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: EWT Responses to Interrogatories	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Melchiorre and Mr. Cyr re: EWT Responses to Interrogatories	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
17 Apr 13	Continue drafting of May 3 EWT Presentation	MPM	1.4	210.00	EWT
	Draft email to Mr. John Cyr and Mr. Nick Melchiorre re Summary of Board Staff Letter re Phase 2 EWT as Evidence for May 3 presentation	MPM	.7	105.00	EWT

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Fax: (807) 623-4947 Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

		T . G		22.00	
	Instructions on file to associate - EWT	JAC	.1	33.00	EWT
	Review lengthy email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: Board Staff Submission EWT Phase 2	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Lengthy email to Mr. Melchiorre and Mr. Cyr re: Board Staff Submission EWT Phase 2	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
18 Apr 13	Review email and instructions on file to associate re Rod's report on storm load re East-West Tie; review email about committee meetings and need to develop issues for May 3rd Submission and follow-up on instruction	JAC	1.1	363.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force; review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus, Mr. Hebert and Ms. Koltun; review further emails from Mr. Angus to Mr Cyr, Mr. Hebert and Ms. Koltun; review further email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus re: Energy Task Force Meeting April 30th	NM	.5	120.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Ivy Lee at Stikeman Elliott re: EB-2011-0140 - Argument- in-Chief of Iccon Transmission/TransCanada	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Hawkes at Fortis Ontario re: EB-2011-0140 - CNPI Argument-in-Chief	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. O'Reilly at Dentons to OEB Board Secretary re: East- West Tie Line Designation Application - EB-2011-0140 - Argument-in-Chief	NM	.1	24.00	EWT

Review email letter from Mr. Vellone at BLG to OEB Board Secretary re: EB- 2011-0140 - Alta-Link Ontario L.P.	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
Review email from Ms. Kneteman to OEB Board Secretary re: EB-2011-0140 - EWT LP Argument in Chief	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
Review email from Ms. Galler to OEB Board Secretary re: EB-2011-0140 - Electricity Transmission Infrastructure - East-West Tie	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force; review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus, Mr. Hebert and Ms. Koltun; review further emails from Mr. Angus to Mr Cyr, Mr. Hebert and Ms. Koltun; review further email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Angus re: Energy Task Force Meeting April 30th	MPM	.5	75.00	EWT
Review email from Ms. Ivy Lee at Stikeman Elliott re: EB-2011-0140 - Argument- in-Chief of Iccon Transmission/TransCanada	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
Review email from Mr. Hawkes at Fortis Ontario re: EB-2011-0140 - CNPI Argument-in-Chief	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
Review email from Ms. O'Reilly at Dentons to OEB Board Secretary re: East- West Tie Line Designation Application - EB-2011-0140 - Argument-in-Chief	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
Review email letter from Mr. Vellone at BLG to OEB Board Secretary re: EB- 2011-0140 - Alta-Link Ontario L.P.	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT

	Review email from Ms. Kneteman to OEB Board Secretary re: EB-2011-0140 -	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	EWT LP Argument in Chief Review email from Ms. Galler to OEB Board Secretary re: EB-2011-0140 - Electricity Transmission Infrastructure - East-West Tie	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
19 Apr 13	Review Iccon argument in chief; begin review of UTC argument in chief	MPM	2.2	330.00	EWT
22 Apr 13	Prepare Submissions to OEB re East-West Tie; review Mr. Mikulasik's draft and proponent applications	NM	2.9	696.00	EWT
23 Apr 13	Review Interrogatories of proponents to prepare for submissions to OEB	NM	1.4	336.00	EWT
	Continue review of UCT argument in Chief; review EWT LP argument in chief; begin review of RES argument in chief	MPM	3.2	480.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Angus to Mr. Mikulasik re: Energy Task Force Meeting - April 30, 2013	NM	.2	48.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Angus; review email from Mr. Angus re: Energy Task Force Meeting - April 30, 2013	MPM	.2	30.00	EWT
24 Apr 13	Telephone call to Mr. Doug Cunningham re: meeting May 2, 2013 re submissions	NM	.4	96.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Mikulasik re: conversation with Mr. Doug Cunningham	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from OEB Board Secretary re: Confirmation of Supporting Document Submission for Northwestern Ontario Associated Chambers of	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT

	Commerce Review email from Mr. Melchiorre to Mr. Cyr re: conversation with Mr. Doug Cunningham	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
25 Apr 13	Draft Coalition Presentation re: reliability and quality of EWT - for May 3rd Presentation	MPM	2.9	435.00	EWT
26 Apr 13	Review letter to the Board from Metis Nation of Ontario re Extension of time to file May 6, 2013 submissions	MPM	.2	30.00	EWT
	Continue to draft Coalition Presentation re: reliability and quality of EWT - for May 3rd Presentation	MPM	2.1	315.00	EWT
	Continue Review of RES argument in chief	MPM	1.1	165.00	EWT
	Review various previous procedural orders and interrogatories; draft email to Mr. Cyr re: same	MPM	1.1	165.00	EWT
	Prepare submissions to OEB re: East-West Tie proponents; including review of each proponent materials and evidence filed	NM	3.3	792.00	EWT
	Review email letter from Mr. Madden at PST Law re: EB- 2011-0140 - MNO Lt re PO No. 6	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email letter from Mr. Madden at PST Law re: EB- 2011-0140 - MNO Lt re PO No. 6	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
27 Apr 13	Continuation of OEB submissions re: East-West Tie; review studies re: forced outages along the East-West Tie	NM	1.6	384.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Angus to Energy Task Force re: Energy Task Force Meeting Details	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr.	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT

29 Apr13	Angus to Energy Task Force re: Energy Task Force Meeting Details Further review and revision of NOACC May 3rd presentation; draft email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre re: same	MPM	2.3	345.00	EWT
	Review Procedural Order No. 7; revise schedule accordingly - EWT	MPM	.2	30.00	EWT
	Review draft submission to OEB from Mr. Mikulasik taken from client's materials and presentations on load and generation in Northwest region	NM	.9	216.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Mikulasik to Mr. Cyr re: May 3, 2013 EWT Presentation	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email copy of Procedural Order Number 7 from Ms. Habashy	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Jennifer Lea at OEB; review email from Ms. Lea; email to Mr. Cyr; email to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert and review email from Mr. Angus re: OEB Sessions in Thunder Bay	NM	.5	120.00	EWT
	Email to Mr. Cyr re: May 3, 2013 EWT Presentation	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review email copy of Procedural Order Number 7 from Ms. Habashy	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review email from Ms. Jennifer Lea at OEB; review email from Ms. Lea; review email from Mr. Melchiorre to Mr. Cyr; email to Mr. Angus and Mr. Hebert and review email from Mr. Angus re: OEB Sessions in Thunder Bay	MPM	.5	75.00	EWT

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

Fax: (807) 623-4947

	Review various emails related to Applicants and the May 3rd submissions to OEB	JAC	.7	231.00	EWT
30 Apr 13	Prepare for ETF meeting re working groups and EWT	MPM	.8	120.00	EWT
	Revise (in part) associate's first draft of proposed submission to the Board for May 3rd - EWT	JAC	2.4	792.00	EWT
	Attend EWT Meeting Day 2	NM	3.4	816.00	EWT
	Attend EWT Meeting Day 2	MPM	3.4	510.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Mikulasik; review further email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Mikulasik; review email to Mr. Cyr to Mr. Mikulasik; email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Mikulasik re: May 3 EWT Presentation	NM	.4	96.00	EWT
	Email to Ms. Jennifer Lea at OEB; review email from Ms. Lea re: OEB Sessions in Thunder Bay	NM	.2	48.00	EWT
	Review email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Melchiorre; review further email from Mr. Cyr to Mr. Melchiorre; review further email to Mr. Cyr to Mr. Melchiorre; review email from Mr. Melchiorre to Mr. Cyr re: May 3 EWT Presentation	MPM	.4	60.00	EWT
	Review Mr. Melchiorre's email to Ms. Jennifer Lea at OEB; review email from Ms. Lea re: OEB Sessions in Thunder Bay	MPM	.2	30.00	EWT

Phone: (807) 623-1111 Fax: (807) 623-4947 Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS

Internet: www.weilers.ca

J.A. Cyr	10.6	@	330.00	=	3,498.00
Mark Mikulasik	40.6	@	150.00	=	6,090.00
Nick Melchiorre	23.6	@	240.00*	=	5,664.00
Total hours	74.8				15,252.00

*Adjusted to 230/hr in Cost Claim

To our fee 15,252.00

DISBURSEMENTS

Total disbursements 0.00

Total Fees and Disbursements 15,252.00

TOTAL TAXES

HST on 15,252 fees 1,982.76 HST on 0.00 disbursements 0.00

HST (Registration #: 122004658RT) 1,982.76

Total Bill 17,234.76

Weiler, Maloney, Nelson

J.A. Cyr E.& O.E.

This account is due when rendered. Please pay promptly to avoid interest charges. Interest will be charged in accordance with the Solicitors Act of Ontario.

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

Fax: (807) 623-4947



WEILER, MALONEY, NELSON

The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay 500 Donald Street East Thunder Bay ON P7E 5V3 30 May 2013

Our file #: 57695 Account #: 20963

Re: Long Term Energy Plan

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above matter during the period from 24 April 2013 to 30 May 2013:

01 May 13	Memo to Mr. Doug Cunningham, NAN lawyer, regarding OPA evidence filed for consultation on East-West Tie	NM	.4	96.00	EWT
	Review and revise OEB oral Submission, including reviewing filed Applications and evidence filed in support	NM	2.7	648.00	EWT
	Revise associate's and colleague's draft of Submission to OEB for May 3rd proceeding day - EWT	JAC	4.8	1584.00	EWT
	Attend meeting with Mr. Melchiorre and Mr. Mikulasik	JAC	.5	165.00	EWT
	Attend meeting with Mr. Cyr and Mr. Mikulasik	NM	.5	120.00	EWT
	Attend meeting with Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre	MPM	.5	75.00	EWT
	Brief meeting with Mr. Mikulasik	NM	.3	72.00	EWT
	Brief meeting with Mr. Melchiorre	MPM	.3	45.00	EWT
	Review issues re: EWT	NM	.1	24.00	EWT

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

	Review issues re: EWT Review Procedural Order 6;	MPM MPM	.1 1.6	15.00 240.00	EWT EWT
	review draft presentation to OEB - EWT				
	Begin draft OEB slide presentation re EWT May 3	MPM	1.7	255.00	EWT
02 May 13	Attend OEB hearing at Valhalla Inn; meeting with Mr. Doug Cunningham, counsel for NAN to discuss and review each others presentation; meeting with various representatives of the transmitters	NM	6.5	1560.00	EWT
	Review, revise and prepare presentation to the OEB	NM	2.9	696.00	EWT
	Review email and advisor (Rod Bosch) comments on draft submission for May 3rd - EWT	JAC	.4	132.00	EWT
	Office conference with Mr. Mikulasik to prepare actual Powerpoint presentation and amending presentation as per client's instructions	NM	1.4	336.00	EWT
	Office conference with Mr. Melchiorre to prepare actual Powerpoint presentation and amending presentation as per client's instructions	MPM	1.4	210.00	EWT
	Review email and conference with associate and colleague as to Mr. Bosch's comments and close to final outstanding issues for OEB May 3rd presentation - EWT	JAC	.4	132.00	EWT
	Review issues re: EWT	NM	.6	144.00	EWT
	Review issues re: EWT	MPM	.6	90.00	EWT
	Prepare for OEB Day 1 - EWT	MPM	.9	135.00	EWT
	Attend telephone call with Mr. Melchiorre and Mr. Cyr re May 3 EWT presentation	MPM	.4	60.00	EWT
	Review and revise draft presentation to OEB May 3 - EWT	MPM	.8	120.00	EWT

	Review email and conference with associate and colleague as to Mr. Bosch's comments and close to final outstanding issues for OEB May 3rd	NM	.4	96.00	EWT
03 May 13	presentation Attend hearing at Valhalla Inn and provide submissions to the Board	NM	2.3	552.00	EWT
	Attend meeting with various representatives of the transmitters	NM	3.7	888.00	EWT
	Attend meeting with various representatives of the transmitters	MPM	3.7	555.00	EWT
	Review v3 of draft presentation for final editing	JAC	1.2	396.00	EWT
	Office conference with Mr. Melchiorre and Mr. Mikulasik to discuss results of the hearings and meetings and preparation of written submissions	JAC	.2	66.00	EWT
	Office conference with Mr. Cyr and Mr. Mikulasik to discuss results of the hearings and meetings and preparation of written submissions	NM	.2	48.00	EWT
	Office conference with Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre to discuss results of the hearings and meetings and preparation of written submissions	MPM	.2	30.00	EWT
	Review issues re: EWT	NM	.3	72.00	EWT
	Review issues re: EWT	MPM	.3	45.00	EWT
	Prepare for Day 2 OEB hearing in Thunder Bay - EWT	MPM	.8	120.00	EWT
	Attend and assist with NOACC-NOMA-City presentation to OEB	MPM	1.0	150.00	EWT
06 May 13	Begin review and revision of EWT oral hearing notes	MPM	1.8	270.00	EWT
	Review email re: EWT	NM	.4	96.00	EWT
	Review emails re: EWT	MPM	.4	60.00	EWT
07 May 13	Continue review of RES	MPM	1.6	240.00	EWT

	Argument in Chief; review Canadian Niagara Power Inc. Argument in chief - EWT				
	Begin drafting of May 9 Submission - EWT	MPM	2.9	435.00	EWT
08 May 13	Review and revise May 9 Submission - EWT	MPM	.9	135.00	EWT
	Further review and revise EWT oral hearing ntoes	MPM	1.3	195.00	EWT
09 May 13	Review and extract relevant segments from Northwestern Ontario Preparing For Change: NORTHWESTERN ONTARIO ECONOMIC FACILITATOR REPORT, Robert Rosehart, 2008; Mining in Northwestern Ontario: Opportunities and Challenges; Technical Assessment following OPG's request to de-register the Thunder Bay coal fired generation station located in Ontario's Northwest zone; The Growth Plan for Northern Ontario; and February 2011 Supply Mix Directive to the OPA to incorporate into client's submissions for applications	NM	2.9	696.00	EWT
	for designation - EWT Review and revise EWT May 9 submission, review various supporting material, incorporate into submission; draft email to John Cyr and Nick Molebiogrape same	MPM	3.2	480.00	EWT
	Nick Melchiorre re same Office conference with Mr. Melchiorre and Mr. Mikulasik to govern submissions to OEB - EWT	JAC	1.0	330.00	EWT
	Office conference with Mr. Cyr and Mr. Mikulasik to govern submissions to OEB - EWT	NM	1.0	240.00	EWT
	Office conference with Mr.	MPM	1.0	150.00	EWT

	Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre to govern submissions to OEB - EWT				
	Office conference with Mr. Mikulasik to revise the OEB submissions into final format - EWT	NM	.4	96.00	EWT
	Office conference with Mr. Melchiorre to revise the OEB submissions into final format - EWT	MPM	.4	60.00	EWT
	Draft final changes in Submissions and edit - EWT	JAC	2.5	825.00	EWT
	Review emails re: EWT	NM	1.6	384.00	EWT
	Review email re: EWT	MPM	1.6	240.00	EWT
10 May 13	Instructions on file from Mr. Mikulasik; attending to print two copies of the Written Submission Pertaining to Phase 2 of the East-West Tie Line Designation of Proceeding (EB-2011-0140) and mail to OEB	DL	.1	14.00	EWT
	Review emails re: EWT	NM	.2	48.00	EWT
	Review email re: EWT	MPM	.2	30.00	EWT
	Review email re: EWT	MPM	.2	30.00	EWT
13 May 13	Review submissions of other	MPM	1.9	285.00	EWT
13 Way 13	intervenors and applicants re EWT Phase 2 submission	1411 141	1.7	283.00	LWI
14 May 13	Further review submissions of other applications and intervenors re final submissions Phase 2 - EWT	MPM	1.8	270.00	EWT
	Review emails re: EWT	NM	.2	48.00	EWT
	Review email re: EWT	MPM	.2	30.00	EWT
15 May 13	Review OPA and IESO submission; review Consumer Council of Canada submission; review School Energy Coalition submission; review Power Workers Union submission; draft email to Mr. Cyr and Mr. Melchiorre re same - EWT	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review email re: EWT	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email re: EWT	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT

22 May 13	Review email re: EWT Review emails re: EWT		NI MP		.1 .1	24.00 15.00	EWT EWT
	J.A. Cyr Mark Mikulasik Nick Melchiorre D. Lafferty Total hours *Adjusted to	11.00 34.0 29.2 .1 83.0	@ @ @	330.00 150.00 240.00* 140.00	= = =	3,630.00 5,100.00 7,008.00 14.00 15,752.00	
	\$230/hr in Cost Claim						
	To our fee						15,752.00
DISBURSEM	<u>IENTS</u>						
	Total disbursements						0.00
	Total Fees and Disburser	nents					15,752.00
TOTAL TAX	<u>ES</u>						
	HST on 15,752 fees HST on 0.00 disburseme		DT\			2,047.76 0.00	2 047 76
	HST (Registration #: 122 Total Bill	JUU4UJ0	KI)				2,047.76 17,799.76

I A Cym

J.A. Cyr E.& O.E.

This account is due when rendered. Please pay promptly to avoid interest charges. Interest will be charged in accordance with the Solicitors Act of Ontario.

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

Fax: (807) 623-4947



The Corporation of the City of Thunder Bay 500 Donald Street East Thunder Bay ON P7E 5V3 25 June 2013

Our file #: 57695 Account #: 21180

Re: Long Term Energy Plan

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED with respect to the above matter during the period from 29 May 2013 to 25 June 2013:

3 Jun 13	Review emails re: EWT	NM	.7	168.00	EWT
	Review emails re: EWT	MPM	.7	105.00	EWT
09 Jun 13	Review of Altalink Ontario LP reply submission; review of EWT LP reply submission; review of UTC reply submission; review of Iccon Transmission reply submission; review of CNPI reply submission; review of RES reply submission	MPM	6.5	975.00	EWT
14 Jun 13	Review email re: EWT	NM	.1	24.00	EWT
	Review email re: EWT	MPM	.1	15.00	EWT
	Review letter from Nextbridge re correction of EWT LP reply - East West Tie	MPM	.5	75.00	EWT
17 Jun 13	Review East West Tie information re transmission lines; draft email to Mr. John Cyr re same	MPM	.8	120.00	EWT
25 Jun 13	Review email re: EWT	NM	.1	24.00	EWT

Suite 201 1001 William Street Thunder Bay, ON P7B 6M1

	Review email re: EWT		MPN	Л	.1	15.00	EWT
	Mark Mikulasik Nick Melchiorre	8.6	@ @	150.00 240.00		1,290.00 216.00	
	Total hours	9.5				1,506.00	
	To our fee						1,506.00
DISBURSEM	<u>IENTS</u>						
	Total disbursements						0.00
	Total Fees and Disburseme	nts					1,506.00
TOTAL TAX	FS						
TOTAL TAX	<u>L5</u>						
	HST on 1,506 fees					195.78	
	HST on 0.00 disbursements		D.E.			0.00	105.70
	HST (Registration #: 12200)4658	KT)				195.78
	Total Bill						1,701.78

J.A. Cyr E.& O.E.

This account is due when rendered. Please pay promptly to avoid interest charges. Interest will be charged in accordance with the Solicitors Act of Ontario.

Phone: (807) 623-1111

Tollfree: 1-866-WEILERS Internet: www.weilers.ca

Fax: (807) 623-4947