

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

				istructions		
	ata input is indicated by yel	low-shaded fi	elds. Forn	nulas are present in th	e document to assist wit	th the calculation of the
cost claim.	nust be in Canadian dollars.	If applicable	ctata av	change rate and sount		
- An Clanis II	iust de ili Calladian dollars.	п аррисавие	r, state exi Rate:	change rate and count	Country:	
- A separate	"Detail of Fees and Disburs	ements Being		(comprising a "Statem		ed" and a "Statement of
Disbursemer	nts Being Claimed") is requi	red for each c	onsultant	or lawyer/articling stu	ıdent/paralegal. Howev	
	f Fees and Disbursements"					
	aim must be supported by a					1.5
	ch consultant must be attac st 24 months.	ched uniess, ro	or a given	consultant, a CV has b	peen provided to the Bo	ard in another process
	rovided in section 7.03 of t	he Practice D	irection o	n Cost Awards itemiz	zed receints must be no	ovided
miles par as p		ine riudice b	in constitution c	ni cost Awaras, itemiz	ica receipts mast be pro	oviucu.
File # EB-	2012-0137			Process: HORCI 20	13 Rate Increase App	lication
Party:	y: Nishnawbe Aski Nation Affiant's Name: Douglas Cunningham				am	
HST Numbe	er: 812027423 RT000)1		Н	ST Rate Ontario:	13.00%
	Full Regis	strant		Qualif	ying Non-Profit	
	Unregist		$\overline{\Box}$		Tax Exempt	
		Other				
			· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			
				Affidavit		
I,	Jeff Ne	son		of the City/Town	of Thu	nder Bay
in the Prov	vince/State of	Ontar	rio		, swear or affirm	that:
1. l am a rep	resentative of the above-no	oted party (the	e "Partv")	and as such have know	wledge of the matters at	tested to herein.
2. I have exa	mined all of the documenta	ition in suppo	rt of this	cost claim, including th	ne attached "Summary o	f Fees and Disbursements
Being Claime	ed", "Statement(s) of Fees B	eing Claimed'	' and "Sta	tement(s) of Disburser	ments Being Claimed".	
	ned "Summary of Fees and I				_	
	nts Being Claimed" include o		irred and	time spent directly for	the purposes of the Par	ty's participation in the
	gy Board process referred t laim does not include any c		dono or	time coest by a serve	n that is an ampleyee a	affinar af the Destrict
	sections 6.05 and 6.09 of th				ii tiiat is aii employee oi	officer of the Party as
		,	ichec Dire	chon on cost Awards.		
	The factor					
Signature	of Affiant					
C	566: was and the feature was a st	41 C:4: -/T-	c	T !	db	
	affirmed before me at				under Bay	
in the Pro\	vince/State of	Onta	ario	, on	<u>් </u>	<u>//3_</u> ·
	nc	***		£.	(uate)	
				e North Comment		
	VI DUV	<u> </u>	RO	BERT C. EDWARDS		
Commission	oner for taking Affidav	its N	DTARY DI	MRISTER, SOLICITOR		

NOTARY PUBLIC PROVINCE OF ONTARIO



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File# EB-	2012-0137	Proces	:: HORCI 2013 Rate Increase Application
Party:	Nishnawbe Ask	i Nation	
		Summary of Fees and Disbur	sements Being Claimed
Legal/con	sultant fees	\$27,819.0	00
Disbursen	nents	\$414.3	5
HST		\$3,670.3	4
Total Cost	t Claim	\$31,903.6	9



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2012-0137	 Process: HORCI 2013 Rate Increase Application	
Party:	Nishnawbe Aski Nation	 Name: Douglas Cunningham	
		Completed Years Practising/Years of relevant experience	
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal: Consultant:	21	
	CV attached:	CV not required:	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total
Preparation	84.30	\$330.00	\$27,819.00	\$3,616.47	\$31,435.47
Attendance - Technical Conference		\$330.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES \$27,819.00 \$3,616.47

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies	\$356.50	\$46.35	\$402.85
Printing	\$57.85	\$7.52	\$65.37
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$414.35	\$53.87	\$468.22

Suite 600 10 King Street East Toronto, Ontario M5C 1C3

DOUGLAS M. CUNNINGHAM, B.A. (Hons.), M.A. LL.B.

Telephone No.: (416) 703-5400 Direct Line: (416) 703-3729 Facsimile No.: (416) 703-9111

Email: douglasmcunningham@gmail.com

October 4, 2013

Jeff Nelson Finance Director Nishnawbe Aski Nation 710 Victoria St. E. Thunder Bay, Ontario P7C 5P7

Dear Mr. Nelson:

Re: Nishnawbe Aski Nation

Re: HORCI 2013 Rate Increase Application

Our File No. 10068

Enclosed you will find our account for services rendered (Invoice #67). The total amount of fees, disbursements and HST is \$31,903.69.

Should you wish to speak further regarding the account please do not hesitate to contact me.1

Yours very truly,

Douglas M. Cunningham

DMC/am

Encl.

Douglas M. Cunningham, Barrister and Solicitor

10 King Street East Suite 600 Toronto, ON M5C 1C3 Canada

Ph: (416) 703-5400 Fax: (416) 703-9111

Nishnawbe Aski Nation 710 Victoria Street East Thunder Bay, ON P7C 5P7

October 4, 2013

File #:

10068

Inv #:

67

NAN re: HORCI 2013 Rate Increase Application RE:

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Jan-23-13	Review of email and attachments from Una O'Reilly (HORCI) re: Letter of Direction and Notice of Application	0.30	99.00	DMC
Jan-24-13	Review of emails from Jamie Waller (Hydro One) concerning Remotes' 2013 Rate Increase Application; letter to NAN Executive concerning the nature of the Rate Increase Application and NAN's involvement in the OEB proceeding	0.80	264.00	DMC
Jan-31-13	Review of letter from Jamie Waller and attachment; phone message to NAN office seeking instructions concerning same	0.30	99.00	DMC
Feb-05-13	Email from A. Maciel concerning phone call from Deputy Grand Chief Les Louttit re: Rate Increase Application; phone call from L. Louttit concerning the OEB proceeding	0.30	99.00	DMC
Feb-10-13	Phone call with Les Louttit providing instructions on behalf of NAN re: the OEB proceeding	0.20	66.00	DMC
Feb-11-13	Email to Deputy Grand Chief confirming that NAN wants to seek Intervenor Party Status; email from L. Louttit concerning confirmation received from Grand Chief Harvey Yesno; drafting letter to OEB requesting intervenor party status	0.20	66.00	DMC

Invoice #:	67	Page 2	October 4, 2013
------------	----	--------	-----------------

Feb-12-13	Email to Mel Stewart (NAN Energy Consultant) concerning NAN's request for intervenor status and other issues relevant to the OEB proceeding	0.20	66.00	DMC
Feb-28-13	Email from OEB with attached Procedural Order No. 1	0.20	66.00	DMC
Mar-03-13	Reporting email to NAN Executive concerning the Application by Remotes, and preparation of materials and submissions for the OEB proceeding, and related issues	0.80	264.00	DMC
Mar-04-13	Emails from Ben Cheechoo and Les Louttit (NAN Executive members) re: matters relating to the Application by Remotes	0.30	99.00	DMC
Mar-11-13	Review of March 6, 2013 email from Deputy Grand Chief Louttit, and drafting reporting email to NAN Executive concerning cost-related issues, and process to be followed in the OEB proceeding, and materials to be put together for NAN's submissions and interrogatories; responding email from L. Louttit	0.80	264.00	DMC
Mar-12-13	Reviewing Remotes' Application materials, and identifying issues for NAN which should be the subject of interrogatories	4.80	1,584.00	DMC
Mar-13-13	Reviewing voluminous materials (755 pp.) from Remotes in support of its application; email to Mel Stewart re: same	5.30	1,749.00	DMC
Mar-14-13	Reviewing Board Staff Interrogatories to Remotes; and continued review of Remotes' Application materials (755 pp.); phone call to Mel Stewart concerning division of work relating to interrogatories for NAN; email to Mel Stewart	4.50	1,485.00	DMC
Mar-18-13	Continued review of Remotes' Application materials; communications with Mel Stewart concerning his health problems and the work he has done on certain interrogatories; drafting NAN's interrogatories for submission to Remotes	2.20	726.00	DMC
Mar-19-13	Reviewing Remotes' Application record, and review of Energy Probe interrogatories	2.80	924.00	DMC

Invoice #:	67	Page 3	October 4, 2013
------------	----	--------	-----------------

,	directed at Remotes; phone call to Mel Stewart			
Mar-20-13	Drafting letter to OEB requesting extension to submit interrogatories because of Mel Stewart's hospitalization and DMC's family-related issues; phone call and email to A. Maciel re: same; email to M. Stewart	1.20	396.00	DMC
Mar-21-13	Email to M. Stewart concerning written interrogatories and NAN communities served by Remotes; reviewing information from Mel Stewart's file re: certain interrogatories; review of email from Lillian Ing (OEB) with attached letter; emails from Mel Stewart forwarding information he had prepared for assistance in NAN's interrogatories, and reviewing same	1.40	462.00	DMC
Mar-25-13	Reviewing Remotes' lengthy Application record, and drafting NAN interrogatories	4.80	1,584.00	DMC
Mar-26-13	Reviewing certain background information from Remotes' 2009 Rate Increase Application concerning Standard A and residential customers, and costs of providing service; review of similar information in 2013 Rate Increase Application materials; drafting and revising numerous interrogatories for NAN; phone call to Mel Stewart re: same	3.60	1,188.00	DMC
Mar-27-13	Drafting interrogatories for NAN for submission to the OEB; phone calls to Mel Stewart re: same; review of material from Mel Stewart; email to A. Maciel concerning revisions to draft interrogatories and instructions re: filing of same with OEB; phone calls with A. Maciel	0.80	264.00	DMC
Apr-08-13	Review of email from Remotes with preliminary review of attached answers to interrogatories; phone call to Mel Stewart resame	2.80	924.00	DMC
Apr-09-13	Review of Remotes' voluminous materials in answer to interrogatories of Board Staff and the intervening parties; emails to A. Maciel and from Mel Stewart re: same	2.80	924.00	DMC

Invoice #:	67	Page 4		October 4, 201	3
Apr-10-13	interro partie Mel S inforn issues	wing Remotes' materials to answer ogatories of Board Staff and other is to the OEB proceeding; phone can be tewart re: non-responsiveness of containing to NAN's interrogatories, and arising from same for any submistened by NAN	ıll to ertain nd	1,023.00	DMC
Apr-16-13	procee confer Stewa	from Neil Mather to parties to the eding re: usefulness of a settlement ence; email and phone call to Mel rt re: same; review of email on belergy Probe	t	297.00	DMC
Apr-18-13	propo Mel S involv email interro outlin settler interro	w of email on behalf of VECC resed settlement conference; emails tewart re: same and his proposed rement in such a process; review of from Remotes concerning updated agatory; email to Neil Mather et along NAN's position on the issue of ment conference, further written agatories, and related issues; short M. Stewart concerning NAN's position.	f I f a email	429.00	DMC
Apr-23-13	Revie	w of Procedural Order No. 2 from	OEB 0.30	99.00	DMC
Apr-24-13		w of Remotes' updates from Jamie r (Hydro One)	1.10	363.00	DMC
Apr-29-13	Revie	w of OEB Interim Rate Order	0.20	66.00	DMC
May-03-13		w of Energy Probe Supplemental ogatories	0.30	99.00	DMC
May-06-13		w of email and attached supplement ogatories from Board Staff	ntal 0.70	231.00	DMC
May-22-13		w of email from Neil Mather and ed spread sheet	0.30	99.00	DMC
May-27-13	interro interro interro	w of Remotes' Application materi- ogatories and supplemental ogatories, and answers to ogatories, and preparing for Settler rence on May 28, 2013		1,584.00	DMC
May-28-13	Prepar Confe procee	ring for and attending the Settleme rence with other parties to the eding	ent 8.50	2,805.00	DMC

Invoice #:	67	Page	5		October 4, 201	3
Jun-05-13	Review	of draft copy of Settl	ement Proposal	0.60	198.00	DMC
Jun-07-13	various commen providin certain s to respondere free concernide determine Jason Srettleme First Narposition	of emails from Chris parties to the proceed its, etc. on draft Settle g input on behalf of I tatements in the draft and to Chris Haussman iew of Notice of Apping outstanding issued by the OEB; reponallboy (NAN) concent process, issues relation (as a NAN commof NAN concerning the increase	ing providing ement proposal; NAN concerning Proposal; email on's inquiries; dication at to be pring email to erning the ating to Cat Lake nunity), and		759.00	DMC
Jun-10-13	from Ro Settleme	of emails from Chris n Stewart and revised nt Proposal; review of ye (Energy Probe)	l draft	0.60	198.00	DMC
Jun-14-13	One), Ro Michael MacInto	of emails from Jeffre on Stewart (Cat Lake Janagan (VECC), and sh (Energy Probe) co I hearing and witness	First Nation), d David ncerning	0.40	132.00	DMC
Jun-18-13	revised S review o preference of emails respondi	of email from Hydro settlement Proposal a femail from Ron Ste ce of Cat Lake First North Maureen Helt and email to Maureen cross-examinations ons	nd hearing plan; wart re: Vation; review (OEB); Helt concerning	0.60	198.00	DMC
Jun-19-13	Email fro oral pres from A.	om Neil Mather re: ca entations before the (Maciel	incellation of DEB; email	0.20	66.00	DMC
Jun-21-13	email to Stewart o	om Neil Mather Ron Neil Mather; phone concerning preparations on behalf of NAN	all to Mel n of written	0.40	132.00	DMC
Jun-28-13	Review of Procedur	of email and Lillian II al Order No. 3; phon	ng and attached e call to Mel	0.30	99.00	DMC

Invoice #: 67 Page 6 October 4,	2013
---------------------------------	------

	Stewart re: same			
Jul-10-13	Detailed review of Divisional Court decision in Advocacy Centre; review of Algoma decision re: rate increases, and drafting written submissions on behalf of NAN for review by	3.20	1,056.00	DMC
	OEB panel; review of Application materials and answers to certain interrogatories			
Jul-11-13	Drafting written submissions on behalf of NAN; review of Ontario Energy Board Act and Application and responding materials; email and phone call to Mel Stewart concerning same and requesting his comments; review of relevant case law to support submissions, including recent OEB decision on exemptions from the DSC for Remotes	3.10	1,023.00	DMC
Jul-12-13	Making revisions to NAN's written submissions; email from M. Stewart concerning proposed changes and additions; review of written submissions of Cat Lake First Nation; review of submissions of Board Staff; email to A. Maciel; phone calls with A. Maciel re: finalization of NAN's written submissions and filing of same with OEB; email to Deputy Grand Chief Les Louttit and Jason Smallboy concerning NAN's submissions to the OEB	2.20	726.00	DMC
Jul-30-13	Emails to and from Una O'Reilly concerning Remotes' Reply submissions and review of same; phone call with Mel Stewart concerning the position taken by Remotes in response to the concerns of NAN and Cat Lake First Nation	0.70	231.00	DMC
Aug-22-13	Review of email and decision on rate increase application by the OEB	0.60	198.00	DMC
Aug-23-13	Phone message to Jason Smallboy (NAN) re: determination of OEB on 2013 Rate Increase Application by Remotes, and related issues	0.20	66.00	DMC
Sep-03-13	Review of email from Hydro One Networks and draft Rate Order	0.50	165,00	DMC
Sep-10-13	Obtaining instructions from NAN re: Motion for Review of OEB decision (22 August	0.80	264,00	DMC

Invoice #:	67	Page 7	(October 4, 201	3
		2013), and discussion of issues to be covered in motion; email to Board Secretary re: same			
Sep-11-13		Review of Board's 22 August 2013 decision, and NAN's previous submissions to the Board; drafting Notice of Motion; review of certain Rules of Practice for the OEB; email to A. Maciel re: formatting of Motion materials; email to J. Smallboy (NAN) forwarding Notice of Motion; finalizing motion materials and instructions re: filing of same with OEB Secretary	3.50	1,155.00	DMC
Sep-13-13		Email from Hydro One Networks with attached responses to comments on draft order	0.40	132.00	DMC
Sep-23-13		Review of email and attached letter from the OEB	0.20	66.00	DMC
Sep-24-13		Review of email from Hydro One Networks and attached letter re: NAN's motion for a review of the Board's 22 August 2013 decision	0.20	66.00	DMC
Sep-27-13		Review of Board's Rate Order (dated 27 September 2013)	0.40	132.00	DMC
		Totals	84.30	\$27,819.00	
		Total HST on Fees		3,616.47	
DISBURSE	ME	NTS			
	٠	Photocopies		356.50	
Aug-20-13		Agency Fees - Print Three Inv. 11558		57.85	
		Totals	_	\$414.35	
		Total HST on Disbursements		53.87	
		Total Fee, Disbursements and HST		-	\$31,903.69

DOUGLAS M. CUNNINGHAM Barrister & Solicitor

Tax ID No. 864856695 RT0001

*tax exempt

Accounts are payable upon receipt. Unpaid accounts are subject to a 2.0% interest charge per month.



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

	ata inpu	t is indicated by yellow-shade	d fields. For	mulas are present in the docun	nent to assist with the calculation of the
cost claim.		in Canadian dellana (E.a	1-1		er. I
- All claims m	nust be	n Canadian dollars. If applica	ble, state e Rate:	xchange rate and country of ini	
- A separate	"Detail	of Fees and Disbursements Be			Country:
				nt or lawyer/articling student/pa	
				the party's cost claim should be	
- The cost cla	aim mus	t be supported by a complete	d Affidavit s	signed by a representative of the	e party.
			s, for a give	n consultant, a CV has been pro	ovided to the Board in another process
within the la					
- Except as p	rovided	l in section 7.03 of the Practic	e Direction	on Cost Awards, itemized rece	ipts must be provided.
File # EB-	2012-	0137		Process: HORCI 2013 Rate	e Increase Application
Party:	Nishn	awbe Aski Nation		Affiant's Name: Dou	ıglas Cunningham
HST Numbe	er:	812027423 RT0001	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	HST Rate	e Ontario: 13.00%
		Full Registrant		Qualifying N	on-Profit
		Unregistered		· -	x Exempt
		Other			
				Affidavit	
l,		Jeff Nelson		, of the City/Town of	Thunder Bay
in the Prov	vince/S	State of On	tario	, sw	vear or affirm that:
1. I am a rep	resenta	tive of the above-noted party	(the "Party'	') and as such have knowledge	of the matters attested to herein.
2. I have exa	mined a	ill of the documentation in sur	port of this	s cost claim, including the attacl	hed "Summary of Fees and Disbursements
				atement(s) of Disbursements B	
					Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of
			ncurred an	d time spent directly for the pui	rposes of the Party's participation in the
		d process referred to above.	ork done o	r time spent by a person that is	s an employee or officer of the Party as
		s 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's			salt employee of officer of the Farty as
	000000		, ractice on	construction cost (war as.	
Tanana and American		1990m			
Signature	of Affi	ant			
		ed before me at the City/	Town of	Thunder	Bay,
in the Prov	vince/S	State of O	ntario	, on	<u> </u>
	7	78/10		•	

Page 1 of 2

Commissioner for taking Affidavits

ROBERT C. EDWARDS

BARRISTER, SOLICITOR
NOTARY PUBLIC PROVINCE OF ONTARIO



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2012-0137		Process	HORCI 2013 Rate Increase Application
Party:	Nishnawbe Asl	ki Nation	
		Summary of Fees and Disburse	ements Being Claimed
Legal/con:	sultant fees	\$27,819.00	
Disbursen	nents	\$414.35	;
HST		\$3,670.34	,
Total Cost	: Claim	\$31,903.69	



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File# EB-	2012-0137		Process:	HORCI 2013 Rat	te Increase Ap	plication
Party:	Nishnawbe Aski Nation		Name: Douglas Cunningham			
				Completed Practising/Years experien	of relevant	
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal: Consultant:			21		
	CV attached:		CV r	not required:		

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total
Preparation	84.30	\$330.00	\$27,819.00	\$3,616.47	\$31,435.47
Attendance - Technical Conference		\$330.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES	3//		\$27,81	9.00 \$3,616.47	\$31,435.47

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies	\$356.50	\$46.35	\$402.85
Printing	\$57.85	\$7.52	\$65.37
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals	-	\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
u de la cuera un antida de la composición del composición de la co		gramma in the state of	
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$414.35	\$53.87	

Suite 600 10 King Street East Toronto, Ontario M5C 1C3

DOUGLAS M. CUNNINGHAM, B.A. (Hons.), M.A. LL.B.

Telephone No.: (416) 703-5400 Direct Line: (416) 703-3729 Facsimile No.: (416) 703-9111

Email: douglasmounningham@gmail.com

October 4, 2013

Jeff Nelson Finance Director Nishnawbe Aski Nation 710 Victoria St. E. Thunder Bay, Ontario P7C 5P7

Dear Mr. Nelson:

Re: Nishnawbe Aski Nation

Re: HORCI 2013 Rate Increase Application

Our File No. 10068

Enclosed you will find our account for services rendered (Invoice #67). The total amount of fees, disbursements and HST is \$31,903.69.

Should you wish to speak further regarding the account please do not hesitate to contact me.1

Yours very truly,

Douglas M. Cunningham

DMC/am

Encl.

Douglas M. Cunningham, Barrister and Solicitor

10 King Street East Suite 600 Toronto, ON M5C 1C3 Canada

Ph: (416) 703-5400

Fax: (416) 703-9111

Nishnawbe Aski Nation 710 Victoria Street East Thunder Bay, ON P7C 5P7 October 4, 2013

10068

67

File #:
Inv #:

RE: NAN re: HORCI 2013 Rate Increase Application

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Jan-23-13	Review of email and attachments from Una O'Reilly (HORCI) re: Letter of Direction and Notice of Application	0.30	99.00	DMC
Jan-24-13	Review of emails from Jamie Waller (Hydro One) concerning Remotes' 2013 Rate Increase Application; letter to NAN Executive concerning the nature of the Rate Increase Application and NAN's involvement in the OEB proceeding	0.80	264.00	DMC
Jan-31-13	Review of letter from Jamie Waller and attachment; phone message to NAN office seeking instructions concerning same	0.30	99.00	DMC
Feb-05-13	Email from A. Maciel concerning phone call from Deputy Grand Chief Les Louttit re: Rate Increase Application; phone call from L. Louttit concerning the OEB proceeding	0.30	99.00	DMC
Feb-10-13	Phone call with Les Louttit providing instructions on behalf of NAN re: the OEB proceeding	0.20	66.00	DMC
Feb-11-13	Email to Deputy Grand Chief confirming that NAN wants to seek Intervenor Party Status; email from L. Louttit concerning confirmation received from Grand Chief Harvey Yesno; drafting letter to OEB requesting intervenor party status	0.20	66.00	DMC

Feb-12-13	Email to Mel Stewart (NAN Energy Consultant) concerning NAN's request for intervenor status and other issues relevant to the OEB proceeding	0.20	66.00	DMC
Feb-28-13	Email from OEB with attached Procedural Order No. 1	0.20	66.00	DMC
Mar-03-13	Reporting email to NAN Executive concerning the Application by Remotes, and preparation of materials and submissions for the OEB proceeding, and related issues	0.80	264.00	DMC
Mar-04-13	Emails from Ben Cheechoo and Les Louttit (NAN Executive members) re: matters relating to the Application by Remotes	0.30	99.00	DMC
Mar-11-13	Review of March 6, 2013 email from Deputy Grand Chief Louttit, and drafting reporting email to NAN Executive concerning cost-related issues, and process to be followed in the OEB proceeding, and materials to be put together for NAN's submissions and interrogatories; responding email from L. Louttit	0.80	264.00	DMC
Mar-12-13	Reviewing Remotes' Application materials, and identifying issues for NAN which should be the subject of interrogatories	4.80	1,584.00	DMC
Mar-13-13	Reviewing voluminous materials (755 pp.) from Remotes in support of its application; email to Mel Stewart re: same	5.30	1,749.00	DMC
Mar-14-13	Reviewing Board Staff Interrogatories to Remotes; and continued review of Remotes' Application materials (755 pp.); phone call to Mel Stewart concerning division of work relating to interrogatories for NAN; email to Mel Stewart	4.50	1,485.00	DMC
Mar-18-13	Continued review of Remotes' Application materials; communications with Mel Stewart concerning his health problems and the work he has done on certain interrogatories; drafting NAN's interrogatories for submission to Remotes	2.20	726.00	DMC
Mar-19-13	Reviewing Remotes' Application record, and review of Energy Probe interrogatories	2.80	924.00	DMC

Invoice #:	67	Pag	3	October 4, 2013
------------	----	-----	---	-----------------

	directed at Remotes; phone call to Mel Stewart			
Mar-20-13	Drafting letter to OEB requesting extension to submit interrogatories because of Mel Stewart's hospitalization and DMC's family-related issues; phone call and email to A. Maciel re: same; email to M. Stewart	1.20	396.00	DMC
Mar-21-13	Email to M. Stewart concerning written interrogatories and NAN communities served by Remotes; reviewing information from Mel Stewart's file re: certain interrogatories; review of email from Lillian Ing (OEB) with attached letter; emails from Mel Stewart forwarding information he had prepared for assistance in NAN's interrogatories, and reviewing same	1.40	462.00	DMC
Mar-25-13	Reviewing Remotes' lengthy Application record, and drafting NAN interrogatories	4.80	1,584.00	DMC
Mar-26-13	Reviewing certain background information from Remotes' 2009 Rate Increase Application concerning Standard A and residential customers, and costs of providing service; review of similar information in 2013 Rate Increase Application materials; drafting and revising numerous interrogatories for NAN; phone call to Mel Stewart re: same	3.60	1,188.00	DMC
Mar-27-13	Drafting interrogatories for NAN for submission to the OEB; phone calls to Mel Stewart re: same; review of material from Mel Stewart; email to A. Maciel concerning revisions to draft interrogatories and instructions re: filing of same with OEB; phone calls with A. Maciel	0.80	264.00	DMC
Apr-08-13	Review of email from Remotes with preliminary review of attached answers to interrogatories; phone call to Mel Stewart resame	2.80	924.00	DMC
Apr-09-13	Review of Remotes' voluminous materials in answer to interrogatories of Board Staff and the intervening parties; emails to A. Maciel and from Mel Stewart re: same	2.80	924.00	DMC

Invoice #:	67	Page 4	C	October 4, 2013	
Apr-10-13	information to NAN's	d Staff and other ceeding; phone call to sponsiveness of certain	3.10	1,023.00	DMC
Apr-16-13	Email from Neil Mathe proceeding re: usefulne conference; email and Stewart re: same; revie of Energy Probe	phone call to Mel	0.90	297.00	DMC
Apr-18-13	Review of email on be proposed settlement comment in such a involvement in such a email from Remotes continuously email to outlining NAN's position settlement conference, interrogatories, and relation M. Stewart concernic	onference; emails from and his proposed process; review of oncerning updated Neil Mather et al ion on the issue of a further written ated issues; short email	1.30	429.00	DMC
Apr-23-13	Review of Procedural	Order No. 2 from OEB	0.30	99.00	DMC
Apr-24-13	Review of Remotes' up Waller (Hydro One)	pdates from Jamie	1.10	363.00	DMC
Apr-29-13	Review of OEB Interir	n Rate Order	0.20	66.00	DMC
May-03-13	Review of Energy Prol Interrogatories	be Supplemental	0.30	99.00	DMC
May-06-13	Review of email and a interrogatories from Bo		0.70	231.00	DMC
May-22-13	Review of email from attached spread sheet	Neil Mather and	0.30	99.00	DMC
May-27-13	Review of Remotes' A interrogatories and sup interrogatories, and an interrogatories, and pre Conference on May 28	oplemental swers to eparing for Settlement	4.80	1,584.00	DMC
May-28-13	Preparing for and atten Conference with other proceeding		8.50	2,805.00	DMC

Invoice #:	67	Page 5	October 4, 2013
------------	----	--------	-----------------

Jun-05-13	Review of draft copy of Settlement Proposal	0.60	198.00	DMC
Jun-07-13	Review of emails from Chris Haussmann and various parties to the proceeding providing comments, etc. on draft Settlement proposal; providing input on behalf of NAN concerning certain statements in the draft Proposal; email to respond to Chris Haussmann's inquiries; brief review of Notice of Application concerning outstanding issues to be determined by the OEB; reporting email to Jason Smallboy (NAN) concerning the settlement process, issues relating to Cat Lake First Nation (as a NAN community), and position of NAN concerning the proposed 3.45% rate increase	2.30	759.00	DMC
Jun-10-13	Review of emails from Chris Haussmann and from Ron Stewart and revised draft Settlement Proposal; review of email from Peter Faye (Energy Probe)	0.60	198.00	DMC
Jun-14-13	Review of emails from Jeffrey Smith (Hydro One), Ron Stewart (Cat Lake First Nation), Michael Janagan (VECC), and David MacIntosh (Energy Probe) concerning proposed hearing and witness panels	0.40	132.00	DMC
Jun-18-13	Review of email from Hydro One with revised Settlement Proposal and hearing plan; review of email from Ron Stewart re: preference of Cat Lake First Nation; review of emails from Maureen Helt (OEB); responding email to Maureen Helt concerning proposed cross-examinations and written submissions	0.60	198.00	DMC
Jun-19-13	Email from Neil Mather re: cancellation of oral presentations before the OEB; email from A. Maciel	0.20	66.00	DMC
Jun-21-13	Emails from Neil Mather Ron Stewart and email to Neil Mather; phone call to Mel Stewart concerning preparation of written submissions on behalf of NAN for the OEB panel	0.40	132.00	DMC
Jun-28-13	Review of email and Lillian Ing and attached Procedural Order No. 3; phone call to Mel	0.30	99.00	DMC

	Stewart re: same			
Jul-10-13	Detailed review of Divisional Court decision in Advocacy Centre; review of Algoma decision re: rate increases, and drafting written submissions on behalf of NAN for review by	3.20	1,056.00	DMC
	OEB panel; review of Application materials and answers to certain interrogatories			
Jul-11-13	Drafting written submissions on behalf of NAN; review of Ontario Energy Board Act and Application and responding materials; email and phone call to Mel Stewart concerning same and requesting his comments; review of relevant case law to support submissions, including recent OEB decision on exemptions from the DSC for Remotes	3.10	1,023.00	DMC
Jul-12-13	Making revisions to NAN's written submissions; email from M. Stewart concerning proposed changes and additions; review of written submissions of Cat Lake First Nation; review of submissions of Board Staff; email to A. Maciel; phone calls with A. Maciel re: finalization of NAN's written submissions and filing of same with OEB; email to Deputy Grand Chief Les Louttit and Jason Smallboy concerning NAN's submissions to the OEB	2.20	726.00	DMC
Jul-30-13	Emails to and from Una O'Reilly concerning Remotes' Reply submissions and review of same; phone call with Mel Stewart concerning the position taken by Remotes in response to the concerns of NAN and Cat Lake First Nation	0.70	231.00	DMC
Aug-22-13	Review of email and decision on rate increase application by the OEB	0.60	198.00	DMC
Aug-23-13	Phone message to Jason Smallboy (NAN) re: determination of OEB on 2013 Rate Increase Application by Remotes, and related issues	0.20	66.00	DMC
Sep-03-13	Review of email from Hydro One Networks and draft Rate Order	0.50	165.00	DMC
Sep-10-13	Obtaining instructions from NAN re: Motion for Review of OEB decision (22 August	0.80	264.00	DMC

Invoice #:	67	Page 7	(October 4, 201	3
	2013), and discussion of in motion; email to Boa				
Sep-11-13	Review of Board's 22 A and NAN's previous su Board; drafting Notice certain Rules of Practic to A. Maciel re: format materials; email to J. So forwarding Notice of M motion materials and in same with OEB Secreta	bmissions to the of Motion; review of e for the OEB; email ting of Motion mallboy (NAN) fotion; finalizing estructions re: filing of	3.50	1,155.00	DMC
Sep-13-13	Email from Hydro One attached responses to coorder		0.40	132.00	DMC
Sep-23-13	Review of email and at OEB	tached letter from the	0.20	66.00	DMC
Sep-24-13	Review of email from I and attached letter re: N review of the Board's 2 decision	IAN's motion for a	0.20	66.00	DMC
Sep-27-13	Review of Board's Rate September 2013)	e Order (dated 27	0.40	132.00	DMC
	Totals		84.30	\$27,819.00	
	Total HST on Fees			3,616.47	
DISBURSEMENTS					
	Photocopies			356.50	
Aug-20-13	Agency Fees - Print Th	ree Inv. 11558		57.85	
	Totals		***	\$414.35	
	Total HST on Disburse	ments		53.87	
	Total Fee, Disbursem	ents and HST		-	\$31,903.69

DOUGLAS M. CUNNINGHAM Barrister & Solicitor

Tax ID No. 864856695 RT0001

*tax exempt

Accounts are payable upon receipt. Unpaid accounts are subject to a 2.0% interest charge per month.