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Borden Ladner Gervais 

By electronic filing 

October 17, 2013 

Kirsten Walli 
Board Secretary 
Ontario Energy Board 
2300 Yonge Street 
27th  floor 
Toronto, ON M4P 1E4 

Dear Ms Walli, 

Union Gas Limited ("Union") 
5 YR Incentive Rate Mechanism ("I 	RM") Plan 
Board File No.: EB-2013-0202 
Our File No.: 	339583-000159 

Pursuant to the Board's Decision and Order dated October 7, 2013, in the above-noted 
proceeding, we enclose a Cost Claim on behalf of our client, Canadian Manufacturers & 
Exporters ("CME"). 

A copy of this Cost Claim has been forwarded to Union as instructed in the Decision and Order. 

Please contact the undersigned if you have any questions or require any additional information. 

Yours very truly, 
.4 

Peter C.P. Thompson,  LC. 
\slc 
enclosure 
c. 	Chris Ripley (Union) 

George Vegh (McCarthy Tetrault LLP) 
Paul Clipsharn (CME) 

01701: 5942838: vl 

Lawyers I Patent & Trade-mark Agents 



Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements 

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and 

electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in 

the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed. 

Instructions 

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are present in the document to assist with the calculation of the 

cost claim. 

- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency. 

Rate: 	 Country: 

- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of 

Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each consultant or lawyer/articling student/paralegal. However, only one "Summary 

of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided. 

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party. 

- A CV for each consultant must be attached unless, for a given consultant, a CV has been provided to the Board in another process 

within the last 24 months. 

- Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided. 

File # EB- 2013-0202 	 Process: Union Gas Limited - 5 YR IRM Plan 

Party: 	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 	 Affiant's Name: Peter Thompson 

HST Number: 10807 5482 RT0001 	 HST Rate Ontario: 13.00% 

Full Registrant 	❑ 

Unregistered 

Other 

	

Qualifying Non-Profit 	❑ 

	

Tax Exempt 	❑ 

Affidavit 

Peter Thompson 	 , of the City of 	Ottawa 

in the Province of 
	

Ontario 	 , swear or affirm that: 

1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. 

2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements 

Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". 

3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of 

Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the 

Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 

4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as 

describe,sections 6. 	and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. 

Signature of Affiant 

Sworn or affirmed before me at the City of 	Ottawa 

in the Province of 	Ontario 	 , on 	October 11, 2013 
(date) 

Commissioner for takingAffidavits 
Norma Jean Jennings, a Commissioner, etc., 
Province of Ontario, for Borden Ladner 
Gervais LLP, Banisters and Solicitors. 
Expires July 9, 2015. 



Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 
Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements 

File # EB- 2013-0202 Process: Union Gas Limited - 5 YR IRM Plan 

    

Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed 

Legal/consultant fees $3,716.00 

Disbursements $11.00 

HST $484.51 

Total Cost Claim $4,211.51 



Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed 

File # EB- 2013-0202 	 Process: Union Gas Limited - 5YR IRM Plan 

Party: 	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 	Name:  Peter C.P. Thompson, Q.C. 

Completed Years 

Practising/Yea rs of relevant 

experience 

	

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: 
	El 	 45 

	

Consultant: 	111 

	

CV attached: 	III 	CV not required: 
	El 

Statement of Fees Being Claimed 

Hours 
Hourly 

rate 
Subtotal HST Total 

Preparation 7.60 $330.00 $2,508.00 $326.04 $2,834.04 

Attend Oral Hearing 1.20 $330.00 $396.00 $51.48 $447.48 

Case Management $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES I I 	] $2,904.00' $377.521 	 $3,281.52 

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed 

Net Cost HST Total 

Photocopies: 44 copies @ $0.25 each = $11.00 $1.43 $12.43 

Other: $0.00 $0.00 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: [ 	 $11.001 $1.431 $12.43 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

File #: 

Process: 

Party: 

Name: 

EB-2013-0202 

Union Gas Limited — 5 YR IRM Plan 

Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 

Peter Thompson 

Jul 26-13 Considering email from R. Birmingham 0.1 Prep 

Jul 26-13 Considering R. Aiken's comments and email to all parties 0.2 Prep 

Jul 29-13 Reviewing J. Girvan's comments and cross-referencing them to the 0.3 Prep 
Agreement 

Jul 29-13 Reviewing I. Mondrow's comments and cross-referencing them to 0.2 Prep 
Agreement 

Jul 30-13 Considering revised Appendix from C. Ripley 0.1 Prep 

Jul 31-13 Reviewing comments from J. Shepherd and D. Quinn 0.5 Prep 

Jul 31-13 Reviewing final Application material and final Settlement Agreement 
submitted by Union to the Board 

0.8 Prep 

Jul 31-13 Considering emails from T. Brett 0.2 Prep 

Jul 31-13 Considering emails from D. Quinn and J. Shepherd 0.1 Prep 

Jul 31-13 Considering emails from I. Mondrow and J. Shepherd 0.1 Prep 

Jul 31-13 Considering emails from R. Birmingham 0.2 Prep 

Aug 6-13 Considering exchange of emails re: next meeting date 0.1 Prep 

Aug 26-13 Reviewing Notice of Application; finalizing CME intervention request 0.3 Prep 

Sep 3-13 Reviewing presentation of cost allocation results in preparation for 
tomorrow's meeting of M1/M2 01/10 Working Group 

0.5 Prep 

Sep 4-13 Briefing V. DeRose re: working group meeting 0.1 Prep 

Sep 16-13 Considering email from C. Ripley 0.1 Prep 

Sep 28-13 Considering and responding to M. Millar's email 0.3 Prep 

Oct 2-13 Considering M. Millar's emails of October 1 and 2 re: questions pertaining 
to the Settlement Agreement 

0.2 Prep 

Oct 3-13 Reviewing Settlement Agreement, supporting evidence and considering 
questions raised by M. Millar in his emails in preparation for hearing re: 

3.0 Prep 

Settlement Agreement 

Oct 3-13 Attendance, by telephone, of hearing re: proposed 5-yr Incentive 1.2 Attend OH 

Regulation framework 

Oct 7-13 Reviewing Board Decision approving Settlement Agreement 0.2 Prep 

TOTAL HOURS for Peter Thompson: 8.8 

Hours 

Prep 	 7.6 	x $330.00/hr = 

Attend OH 	 1.2 	x $330.00/hr = 

	

8.8 	 TOTAL FEES for Peter Thompson: 

Fees 

2,508.00 

396.00 

$2,904.00 



Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed 

File # EB- 2013-0202 	 Process: Union Gas Limited - 5YR IRM Plan 

Party: 	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 	Name: Vincent J. DeRose 

Completed Years 

Practising/Years of relevant 

experience 

	

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: 
	

11 

	

Consultant: 	❑ 

	

CV attached: 	❑ 	CV not required: 

Statement of Fees Being Claimed 

Hours 
Hourly 

rate 
Subtotal HST Total 

Preparation 2.80 $290.00 $812.00 $105.56 $917.56 

Case Management $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES I I 	$812.001 $105.561 $917.56 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

File #: 	EB-2013-0202 

Process: 	Union Gas Limited — 5 YR IRM Plan 

Party: 	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 

Name: 	Vince DeRose 

411 

Sep 4-13 	Preparation for and attendance at M1/M2 meeting 
	

2.8 
	

Prep 

TOTAL HOURS for Vince DeRose: 
	

2.8 

Hours 
	

Fees 

Prep 
	

2.8 	x $290.00/hr = 
	

812.00 

	

2.8 	 TOTAL FEES for Vince DeRose: 
	

$ 812.00 
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