PETER C.P. THOMPSON, Q.C. 1 613 787 3528 pthompson@blg.com

Borden Ladner Gervais LLP World Exchange Plaza 100 Queen St. Suite 1300 Ottawa, ON, Canada K1P 1J9 T 613.237.5160 F 613.230.8842 blg.com



By electronic filing

December 23, 2013

Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board P.O. Box 2319 2300 Yonge Street 27<sup>th</sup> floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli,

Defining and Mea	asuring Performance of Electricity Distributors
Board File No.:	EB-2010-0379
Our File No.:	339583-000098

Pursuant to the Board's Notice of Hearing for Cost Awards dated December 12, 2013, we enclose a Cost Claim on behalf of our client, Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters ("CME").

A copy of this Cost Claim has been forwarded to each rate-regulated licensed electricity distributor as instructed in the Notice.

Please contact me if you have any questions or require any additional information.

Yours very truly,

Peter C.P. Thompson, Q.C.

\slc enclosure

c. Electricity Distributors
Paul Clipsham (CME)

OTT01: 6079151: v1

### Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



#### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

This form should be used by a party (defined in the Practice Direction on Cost Awards as including a participant in a consultation process) in a consultation before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board Notice of Hearing for Cost Awards. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

		ructions			
- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded	fields. For	mulas are pi	esent in the do	ocument to assist	with the calculation of
the cost claim.					
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicat		change rate	and country o		
×	Rate:		19	Country:	
- A separate "Statement of Disbursements Being Cl					ng student/paralegal.
However only one "Statement of Fees Being Claime				sbursements	
Being Claimed" covering the whole of the party's co				6.1	
- The cost claim must be supported by a completed					D 11 11
- A CV for each consultant must be attached unless process within the last 24 months.	, ior a given	i consultant	, a CV has beer	n provided to the	Board in another
<ul> <li>Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice</li> </ul>	Direction	on Cost Aug	ards itemized	receipts must be	provided
Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Fractice	: Direction (	UII COSt AW	arus, itemizeu	receipts must be	provided.
File # EB- 2010-0379		Process:	Defining & N	Measuring Perfo	rmance of Electricity
Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Expor	ters	Affi	ant's Name:	Peter C.P. Thon	npson, Q.C.
HST Number: 10807 5482 RT0001			HST	Rate Ontario:	13.00%
Full Registrant			Ouglifyin	- Non Drofit	
_			Qualityin	ng Non-Profit	
Unregistered				Tax Exempt	
Other					
- A TO STATE OF THE MAN PARKET OF THE PARKET OF THE	нызлачей.	, in the King Germania	ući slova za uza	us sadulivirás a truncada d	
The state of the s	Ar	fidavit			
I, Peter C.P. Thompson, Q	.C.	, of the Ci	ty/Town of	O	ttawa
in the Province/State of		Ontario		, swear or affir	m that:
1 tom a remarkable of the above while a to	U . 115 111				
1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (1					
<ol><li>I have examined all of the documentation in suppose Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement of Fees</li></ol>					
3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disburseme					
Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs in					
the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above		time spent	arrectly for the	e purposes or the	Party's participation in
4. This cost claim does not include any costs for wo		time spent.	by a person th	nat is an employee	or officer of the Party
as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board'	s Practice D	irection on	Cost Awards	iat is an employee	or officer of the farty
1,00. 100. 1					
We mount					
Signature of Affiant	1				
V					DEC
Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/1			Ottawa		
in the Province/State of Or	ntario		, on	December 20	, 2013
				(date)	
Malledamone	Dana Dana		alaman etc		
Andrea	Rose Raymo	nd, a Commis	зюпег, <b>етс.,</b>		

Andrea Rose Raymond, a Commissioner, etc.,
Province of Ontario, for Borden Ladner
Gervals LLP, Barristers and Solicitors.
Expires May 17, 2016.

## Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements



File # EB-	2010-0379	Process:	Defining & Measuring Performance of Electricity [
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters	<u> </u>	

	Summary of Fees and Disbursements E	Being Claimed
Legal/consultant fees	\$14,782.00	NA CONTRACTOR OF THE CONTRACTO
Disbursements	\$88.25	
HST	\$1,933.13	
Total Cost Claim	\$16,803.38	

#### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

#### Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Statement of Fees being claimed for Eligible Activity is found on the second tab of this workbook.

#### Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed

Statement of Disbursements being claimed is found on the third tab of this workbook.

## Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



#### Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

#### **Individual Whose Costs are Being Claimed**

Name:	Peter C.P. Thompson, Q.C.			
			Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience	
Couns	el/Articling Student/Paralegal:	<b>V</b>	45+	
	Consultant:			
	CV attached:		CV not required:	
Name:	Vincent J. DeRose			
			Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience	
Couns	sel/Articling Student/Paralegal:	~	12	
	Consultant:			
	CV attached:		CV not required:	
Name:	Kim Dullet			
			Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience	
Couns	el/Articling Student/Paralegal:		4	
	Consultant:			
	CV attached:		CV not required:	
Name:	-			
			Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience	
Couns	sel/Articling Student/Paralegal:			
	Consultant:			
	CV attached:		CV not required:	
Name:				
			Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience	
Couns	el/Articling Student/Paralegal: Consultant:			
	CV attached:		CV not required:	

# Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Statement of Fees Being Claimed

File # EB- 2010-0379

Defining & Measuring Performance of

Process Electricity Distributors in Ontario

Eligible

Participant Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters

HST Rate: 13%

	Eligible Activity>				EB-2(	EB-2010-0379	
		Preparation for, attendance at and reporting on Q&A session (up to 10 hours)	Preparation for, at reporting on stakeho	Preparation for, attendance at, and reporting on stakeholder conference (up to 10 hours per day)	Review expert reports, including any questions, to a maximum of 20 hours.	Written comments on Experts Reports (up to 20 hours)	Preparation for (including review of the Board's draft report), attendance at, and reporting on stakeholder conference (up to 20 hours)
Individual Whose Fees are Being	Hourly rate	16-May-13	27-May-13	28-May-13	n/a	27-Jun-13	11-Sep-13
Peter Thompson	\$330.00				9.80	06.9	0:30
Vincent J. DeRose	\$290.00	4.30	08.9	3.40		2.30	
Kim Dullet	\$170.00						7.20
	Totals:	4.30	08.9	3.40	08.6	9.20	7.50





	HST	\$729.30	\$916.11	\$276.25	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1,921.66
	Subtotal	\$5,610.00	\$7,047.00	\$2,125.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$14,782.00
Written comments on Staff Report to the Board on on Performance Measurement and Continuous Improvement for Electricity Distributors issued on July 4, 2013 (up to 20 hours)	12-Aug-13		7.50				7.50
v							
Preparation for, attendance at, and reporting on the industry workshop on LV Adjustments (up to 10 hours)	07-Oct-13			5.30			5.30
Written comments on the Board's draft report and on consultant's report (up to 10 hours)	25-Sep-13						0.00



\$16,703.66

Total legal/consultant fees:

\$7,963.11 \$2,401.25 \$0.00

\$6,339.30

Total

\$0.00



## Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed



File # EB-	2010-0379	Process:	Defining & Measuring Performance of Electricity
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters	2	
Name of inc	dividual whose disbursements are being cla	aimed:	Peter C.P. Thompson, Q.C.
			HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies	\$88.25	\$11.47	\$99.72
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		\$0.00	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation (room only)		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$88.25	\$11.47	\$99.72

## Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Detail of Fees being Claimed



File #:	EB-2010-0379		
Process:	Defining and Measuring Performance of Electricity Distributo	rs	
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters		
Name:	Peter Thompson	i i	
Jun 4-13	Considering and finalizing request for cost award	0.8	Prep
Jun 12-13	Reviewing report submitted by Dr. Cronin for PWU	1.0	Prep
Jun 18-13	Reviewing code amendments and OEB covering letter; considering, composing, revising and finalizing letter of comment to the Board	1.8	Prep
Jun 26-13	Considering email from J. Shepherd; email to P. Clipsham; considering his response and further email to J. Shepherd	0.4	Prep
Jun 27-13	Considering email exchange with J. Shepherd and J. Girvan; reviewing expert reports submitted by CLD, EDA and PWU; reviewing PEG report; email exchange with V. DeRose; reviewing preview of J. Shepherd's submissions; letter to the Board	5.8	Prep
Jun 28-13	Considering outline of CME submissions; considering J. Shepherd's analysis; email exchange and telephone discussion with J. Girvan; considering J. Girvan's draft submissions; drafting, revising and finalizing CME's comments; email exchange with V. DeRose; finalizing letter to the Board		Prep
Jun 28-13	Telephone call from B. Hewson of the OEB	0.1	Prep
Sep 10-13	Briefing K. Dullet re: conference tomorrow	0.3	Prep
	TOTAL HOURS for Peter Thompson:	17.0	
	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>	
	Prep 17.0 x \$330.00/hr =	5,610.00	
	17.0 TOTAL FEES for Peter Thompson:	\$5,610.00	

## Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Detail of Fees being Claimed



File #:	EB-2010-03	B-2010-0379					
Process:	Defining a	nd Measurin	g Performance of Electricity Distributors				
Party:	Canadian I	<b>V</b> lanufacture	rs & Exporters				
Name:	Vince DeR	ose					
May 16 <sup>-</sup> 13	Preparation	for and attenda	ance at Q&A session	4.3	Prep		
May 26-13	Prepare for s	stakeholder me	eetings	1.4	Prep		
May 27-13	Preparation	for and attenda	5.4	Prep			
May 28-13	Preparation	for and attenda	ance at Q&A session	3.4	Prep		
Jun 28-13	Reviewing d submissions		ing comments; reviewing other parties'	2.3	Prep		
Aug 12-13	Reviewing reviewing su		e call to intervenors on Working Group;	3.8	Prep		
Aug 13-13	Reviewing s	ubmissions by	CCC and SEC	1.6	Prep		
Aug 14-13	Reviewing c	omments; draft	submissions	2.1	Prep		
			TOTAL HOURS for Vince DeRose:	24.3			
		<u>Hours</u>		<u>Fees</u>			
	Prep	24.3	x \$290.00/hr =	7,047.00			
		24.3	TOTAL FEES for Vince DeRose:	\$7,047.00			

## Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Detail of Fees being Claimed



File #:	EB-2010-0	379							
Process:	Defining a	Defining and Measuring Performance of Electricity Distributors							
Party:	Canadian	Manufacture	rs & Exporters						
Name:	Kim Dulle	t							
Sep 11-13	Preparing fo	or and attending	g stakeholder meeting	7.2	Prep				
Oct 7-13	Preparation for and attending Low Voltage Adjustments Benchmarking Industry Workshop			5.3	Prep				
			TOTAL HOURS for Kim Dullet:	12.5					
		<u>Hours</u>		<u>Fees</u>					
	Prep	12.5	x \$170.00/hr =	2,125.00					
		12.5	TOTAL FEES for Kim Dullet:	\$2,125.00					