
KLIPPENSTEINS

BARRISTERS & SOLICITORS

160 JoHN SIREE). SU(TE 300.

TORONTO. 0NTARO M5V 2E5

TEL: 416) 598-0288

Iarch 4, 2014

BY COLRWR (2 COPIES) ANI) EMAIL

Is. Kirsten Walli
[3oard Secretary
Ontario Energy Board
P.O. Box 231Q
.230() Yonge Street, Suite 2700
T’oronto, Ontario M4 P 1 E4
BoardSec(ontarioenergyhoan1.ca

Dear Ms. Walli:

FAX: (416) 598-9520

Re: Environmental Defence Correspondence
E B-20 12-0451 — Enbridge Gas Distribution Inc. (“ Enbrklge”)
GTA Pipeline Leave to Construct; EB-2012-0433, EB-2013-0074
Union Gas Ltd. (“Union”) — Parkway West and Brantford-Kirkwall
Parkway U Projects

Enclosed please find Environmental Deftnce’s cost claim in the above matter.

We propose that this claim be apportioned 100% to Enhridge as Environmental
Deknce’s participation in this proceeding was focused on Enhridge’s GTA Pipeline
Leave to Construct application. Although Environmental Defence’s evidence and
participation was also relevant to Union’s application, this was ancillary to the primary
focus on Enhndge’s application.

Please advise if anything further is required or would he of assistance.

End.

cc: Applicant



Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements
This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party’s cost claim.
Paper and electronic copies of this form and Itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as
directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and
sworn or affirmed.

Instructions
- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are present in the document to assist with the calculation of the cost
claim.

All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.
Rate:

__________

Country:

___________________________

- A separate Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed” (comprising a ‘Statement of Fees Being Claimed” and a ‘Statement of
Disbursements Being Claimed) is required for each consultant or lawyer/articling student/paralegal. However, only one
‘Summary of Fees and Disbursements” covering the whole of the party’s cost claim should be provided.

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.
- A CV for each consultant must be attached unless, for a given consultant, a CV has been provided to the Board in another process within
the last 24 months.
- Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

File U EB- EB-2012-0451 Process: En bridge GTA Pipeline

Party: Environmental Defence Affiant’s Name: Kent Elson

HST Number: 87215 1923 RT0001 HST Rate Ontario: 6.50%

Full Registrant LI Qualifying Non-Profit

Unregistered LI Tax Exempt Li
Other LI

Affidavit

I, Kent Elson ,of the City/Town of Toronto
in the Province/State of Ontario , swear or affirm that:

1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the “Party”) and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.
2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached “Summary of Fees and Disbursements
Being Claimed”, “Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed” and “Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed”.
3. The attached “Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed”, “Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed” and “Statement(s) of
Disbursements Being Claimed” include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party’s participation in the
Ontario Energy rd process referred to above.
4. This cost clai es not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as
desc,,,io s 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board’s Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

Signatu o Affiant

Sworn or affi ed before me at the City/Town of Toronto
in they /State of Ontario , on March 4, 2014

Corn missioner for taking Affidavits
U.C t4N
1cff

Pagelof2



Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- EB-2012-0451 Process: Enbridge GTA Pipeline

Party: Environmental Defence

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed
Legal/consultant fees $135,600.90

Disbursements $1,241.13
HST $8,894.73
Total Cost Claim $145,736.76

Page 2 of 2



Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hourly
Hours Subtotal HST Total

rate
Preparation 132.39 $170.00 $22,506.30 $1,462.91 $23,969.21

Attendance - Technical Conference 8.25 $170.00 $1,402.50 $91.16 $1,493.66

Attendance - Settlement Conference 0.00 $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing 24.50 $170.00 $4,165.00 $270.73 $4,435.73
Argument 79.21 $170.00 $13,465.70 $875.27 $14,340.97

Case Management 0.00 $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES $41,539.50 $2,700.07 $44,239.57

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Net Cost HST Total
Photocopies $175.00 $11.38 $186.38
Printing $905.56 $58.86 $964.42
Fax $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Courier $160.57 $10.44 $171.01
Telephone $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Postage $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Transcripts $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Air $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Car $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Rail $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Travel (Other): $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Parking $0.00 included $0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Accommodation $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Meals $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Other: I $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: $1,241.13 I $80.67 I $1,321.801

File # EB- EB-2012-0451

Party: Environmental Defence

Process: Enbridge GTA Pipeline

Name: Kent Elson

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

Counsel

Completed Years

Practising/Years of relevant

experience

CV attached:

2009 Call

CV not required:

1 of 1



Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hourly
Hours Subtotal HST Total

rate
Preparation 4.00 $170.00 $680.00 $44.20 $724.20
Attendance - Technical Conference 0.00 $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference 0.00 $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing 0.00 $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Argument 0.00 $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Case Management 0.00 $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

.

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES ‘‘*%/9 $680.00] $44.20 $724.20

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed
4

Net Cost HST Total
Photocopies $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Printing $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Fax $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Courier $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Telephone $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Postage $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Transcripts $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Air $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Car $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Rail $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Travel (Other): ( $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Parking $0.00 included $0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Accommodation $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Meals $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Other: I $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: $0.00I $0.00 $0.00

File # EB- EB-2012-0451 Process: Enbridge GTA Pipeline

Party: Environmental Defence Name: Cory Wanless

Practising/Years of r&evant

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: Counsel 2009 Call

--

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

1 of 1



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hourly
Hours Subtotal HST Total

rate
Preparation 3.16 $250.00 $790.00 $51.35 $841.35
Attendance - Technical Conference 0.00 $250.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference 0.00 $250.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing 0.00 $250.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Argument 4.08 $250.00 $1,020.00 $66.30 $1,086.30
Case Management 0.00 $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

L
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES $1,810.00J $117.65 $i,927.651

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed
Net Cost HST Total

Photocopies $0.00 $0.00
Printing $0.00 $0.00
Fax $0.00 $0.00
Courier $0.00 $0.00
Telephone $0.00 $0.00
Postage $0.00 $0.00
Transcripts $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Air $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Car $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Rail $0.00 $0.00
Travel (Other): I $0.00 $0.00
Parking included $0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo $0.00 $0.00
Accommodation $0.00 $0.00
Meals $0.00 $0.00
Other: I $0.00 $0.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: so.oof $o.ool $o.ooj

File It EB- EB-2012-0451 Process: Enbridge GTA Pipeline

Party: Environmental Defence Name: Jack Gibbons

Practising/Years of relevant

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

_______________________

Consultant: x Over 20

CV attached: CV not required: x

1 of 1



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Statement of sees Being Claimed

Hourly
Hours Subtotal HST Total

rate
Preparation 83.50 $330.00 $27,555.00 $1,791.08 $29,346.08
Attendance - Technical Conference 4.00 $330.00 $1,320.00 $85.80 $1,405.80
Attendance - Settlement Conference 0.00 $330.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing 3.50 $330.00 $1,155.00 $75.08 $1,230.08
Argument 0.00 $330.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Case Management 0.00 $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES [ // /
/ $30,030 ool $1,951 95 $31,981 95

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed
Net Cost HST Total

Photocopies $0.00 $0.00
Printing $0.00 $0.00
Fax $0.00 $0.00
Courier $0.00 $0.00
Telephone $0.00 $0.00
Postage $0.00 $0.00
Transcripts $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Air $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Car $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Rail $0.00 $0.00
Travel (Other): I $0.00 $0.00
Parking included $0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo $0.00 $0.00
Accommodation $0.00 $0.00
Meals $0.00 $0.00
Other: I $0.00 $0.00

:i: ‘

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: $0.OOl $0.ooI $0.00

File # EB- EB-2012-0451 Process: Enbridge GTA Pipeline

Party: Environmental Defence Name: Ian Jarvis

Practising/Years of relevant

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

_____________

Consultant: x 3S

CV attached: x CV not required:

1 of 1



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hourly
Hours Subtotal HST Total

rate
Preparation 74.50 $290.00 $21,605.00 $1,404.33 $23,009.33
Attendance - Technical Conference 0.00 $290.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference 0.00 $290.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing 0.00 $290.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Argument 0.00 $290.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Case Management 0.00 $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES $21,605.00[ $1,404.33 $23,009.33

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed
Net Cost HST Total

Photocopies $0.00 $0.00
Printing $0.00 $0.00
Fax $0.00 $0.00
Courier $0.00 $0.00
Telephone $0.00 $0.00
Postage $0.00 $0.00
Transcripts $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Air $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Car $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Rail $0.00 $0.00
Travel (Other): $0.00 $0.00
Parking included $0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo $0.00 $0.00
Accommodation $0.00 $0.00
Meals $0.00 $0.00
Other: I $0.00 $0.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: I so.ool $o.ool so.ooj

File # EB- EB-2012-0451 Process: Enbridge GTA Pipeline

Party: Environmental Defence Name: Gillian Henderson

Practising/Years of relevant

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

_____________

Consultant: x 15

CV attached: x CV not required:

1 of 1



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hourly
Hours Subtotal HST Total

rate

Preparation 226.92 $170.00 $38,576.40 $2,507.47 $41,083.87

Attendance - Technical Conference 4.00 $170.00 $680.00 $44.20 $724.20

Attendance - Settlement Conference 0.00 $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Attendance - Oral Hearing 4.00 $170.00 $680.00 $44.20 $724.20

Argument 0.00 $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Case Management 0.00 $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES $39,936.40 $2,595.87 $42,532.7

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Net Cost HST Total

Photocopies $0.00 $0.00

Printing $0.00 $0.00

Fax $0.00 $0.00

Courier $0.00 $0.00

Telephone $0.00 $0.00

Postage $0.00 $0.00

Transcripts $0.00 $0.00

Travel: Air $0.00 $0.00

Travel: Car $0.00 $0.00

Travel: Rail $0.00 $0.00

Travel (Other): I $0.00 $0.00

Parking included $0.00

Taxi or Airport Limo $0.00 $0.00

Accommodation $0.00 $0.00

Meals $0.00 $0.00

Other: I $0.00 $0.00

. .

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: $0.00 $0.00I $0.00

File # EB- EB-2012-0451 Process: Enbridge 3TA Pipeline

Party: Environmental Defence Name: Wen lie Li

Practising/Years of relevant

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

_______________________

Consultant: x 1.5

CV attached: x CV not required:

1 of 1



KLIPPENSTEINS
Barristers & Solicitors
I 60 John Street. Suite 300
Foronto, Ontario M5V 2E5

Telephone: (416) 598-0288 Fax: (416) 598-952()

Environmental Defence Canada Inc. March 04, 2014

116 Spadina Ave
Suite 300 File : 1956
Toronto, ON M5V 2K6

Invoice #: i 182

RE: EB-2012-0451 - Enbridge GTA Pipeline

Note: Unless otherwise indicated, hours are allocated to “preparation.”

DATE DESCRIPTION HOURS LAWYER

Mar-08- 1 3 Review notice of application; Draft intervention 1 .05 KE
request; Correspondence to J G

Mar-14-13 Revising intervention request letter 0.95 KE

Apr-03-13 Draft correspondence to potential expert witness 0.25 KE

Apr-I 5-13 Review various correspondence re expert evidence; I .75 KE
Review various correspondence re coordination of
evidence; Review Union Gas Parkway applications;
Review GTA application re purposes and the various
project segments; Call with J. Gibbons and I. Jarvis

Apr-16-13 Review correspondence from EGDI re late 0.30 KE
interventions; Review Council of Canadians
intervention request; Conftr with JG re avoiding
duplication; Review correspondence and memo from
I G re coordination of evidence

Apr-24-13 Review Procedural Order; Review update to 0.75 KE
evidence and compare to previous versions

Apr-25-13 Review issues list; Review OEB act re factors to 0.25 KE
consider in leave to construct application; Confer
with JG

Apr-26-13 Prepare for issues/process conference (.5); Attend 4.50 KE
issues/process conference (4)

Apr-29-13 Prepare submissions ftr issues and process day 1 .00 KE
tomorrow, including regarding ED’s proposed issue
relating the Ontario’s GFIG reduction policies and
EGDI’s 2014 DSM budget



invoice #: 3 182 Page 2

Apr-30-13 Prepare tbr and attend issues and OCCSS day; 3.00 KE
Review transcript; Correspondence to JG
(preparation 1 .5 hr; attendance 1 .5 1w)

May-07-13 Draft retainer letter tbr Ian Jarvis and written 1.00 KE
acknowledgement of expert’s duty

May-08- 13 Confer with JG; Review retainer letter thr I. Jarvis; 0.45 KB
Correspondence to BOMA counsel

May-09- I 3 Prepare interrogatories and review materials 3.90 KB

May-10-13 Call re expert witness coordination; Finalize terms of 0.40 KB
reference and retainer br I. Jarvis; Correspondence
to I. Jarvis re interrogatories; Reviewing materials re
expert evidence and fees

May-13-13 Correspondence to 1. Jarvis re board criteria tbr 2.95 KB
expert evidence; Confer with JG; Various
correspondence re meeting to coordinate evidence
with GEC; Review interrogatories from 1. Jarvis and
.1. Gibbons; Call and correspondence with Enerlife re
additional interrogatories; Finalize, file and serve
interrogatories

May-I 7-13 Review materials re potential additional I .05 KE
interrogatories; Drafi second set of intelTogatories

May-20-13 Reviewing application materials and drafting 2.85 KE
i ntern)gatories

May-2 1-13 Confer with JG re interrogatories; Drafting 2.95 KB
interrogatories; Call/correspondence with I. Jarvis re
additional interrogatories; Finalize and file
interrogatories

Jun-03- 13 Review correspondence from applicant; Draft 0.25 KB
correspondence to consultant

Jun-04-13 Correspondence to Board and parties re update to 1.70 KB
intervenor contact list; Review May 1 5 and June 3
update to evidence from EGDI; Correspondence to
consultant re update

Jun-10- 13 Confer with JG re gaps in interrogatory responses, 1 .25 KE
technical conf, etc.; Correspondence to Enerlife re
same; Call and correspondence with board staff

Jun- 11- I 3 Correspondence with expert witness; Review of 4.50 KE
interrogatory responses; Draft detailed
correspondence to Enbridge re inadequate
interrogatory responses; Confer with JG; Draft letter
to the Board re the same

Jun-12-13 Prepare for technical conference (.75); Attend 3.50 KE
technical conference (2.75)

Jun-14-13 Confer with JG re outcome oftechiicai conference, 0.20 KE
next steps

Jun-17-13 Correspondence to expert witness 0.35 KE



Invoice #: 3 1 82 Page 3

Jun—I 8—13 Conftrence call with expert witness team 0.30 KE

Jun— 19—I 3 Create draft data charts I .00 KE

Jun-20-13 Review undertaking responses of EGDI: Cunftr with I .2() KE
.IG re same; Correspondence to EnerIit re same

Jun-2 I — I 3 Draft correspondence to expert witness; I .05 KE
Correspondence re expert coordination; Reviewing
transcript re geographical targeting of DSM and
drafting correspondence re same

Jun-25- 13 Confer with JG re draft expert reports; Review 2.00 KE
correspondence from EnerlitC; Collating materials re
industrial DSM; Correspondence to experts re
estimating industrial DSM; Review draft Enerlife
report; Draft comments

Jun-27-13 Review expert report and provide comments; Call 1.20 KE
with Enerlife; Confer with JG; Review various
correspondence

Jun-28-13 Review revised draft of expert report; Confer with 2.50 KE
JG; Conference call with experts; Provide further
detailed comments on expert report; Draft covering
letter; File and serve expert evidence

Jul-02-13 Review/draft various correspondence 0.10 KE

Jul-04- I 3 Meeting with K. Elson to discuss Aug hearing. I .20

Draft interrogatories to GEC; Meet with C. Wanless 2.30 KE
re case issues; Correspondence to GEC counsel;
Correspondence to expert; Prepare declaration and
undertaking; Reviewing confidentiality practice
guidelines re potential motion

Jul-05-13 Preparing and serving interogatories and 1 .20 CW
undertakings re confidentiality
Review materials for and prepare Notice of Motion 2.65 KE
re confidentiality

Jul-08-13 Prepare and serve notice of motion; correspondence 1.20 CW
with KE
Correspondence with JG re confidentiality motion; 0.65 KE
Review/revise motion materials

Jul-10-13 Review confidential evidence provided by Eribridge 0.10 KE
& Union

Jul-16-13 Review correspondence from Enhridge re ED 0.20 KE
confidentiality motion

Jul-17-13 Review interrogatory responses provided by Enerlife; 2.50 KE
Call with Enerlife team

Jul-19-13 Assist with interrogatory responses 3.75 KE

Jul-24-13 Review procedural order 6 0.10 KE



Invoice #: 3 182 Page 4

.ILII-25— 13 Drafting detailed submissions for motion re 4.05 KE
confidential treatment of cost break—down

ALIg-() 1- I 3 Re iew procedural orders 7 and 8; Draft 1 .3() KE
interrogatories On tipdated evidence; Review
coiTespondence from counsel for Enhridge re motion
re confidentiality; Correspondence to counsel for
GEC re making the avoided cost numbers public

Aug-02- 13 Drafl, serve, and file IRs and covering letter 0.4() KE

Aug-07-13 Review procedural order: Review evidence and GEC 2.20 KE
IRs re discrepancies in costing information; Draft
correspondence to counsel for Enhridge re
confidentiality issue; Draft correspondence to J.
Gibbons re same; Review correspondence from
counsel for Enbridge; Draft correspondence to the
Board requesting that motion he held in abeyance;
Call with consultant for GEC

Aug-08-13 Correspondence to 1. Jarvis re new hearing schedule; 0.30 KE
Correspondence to board staff re availability nfl.
Jarvis

Aug- 14-I 3 Question from Ontario Energy Board; email to Kent 0.40

Aug-I 9-13 Review correspondence; Review response to GEC IR I .45 KE
57; Correspondence to D. Poch re motion and
updating evidence of P. Chernick; Review IR
responses on updated evidence; Confer with JG re
inadequate interrogatory responses; Draft
correspondence to S. Stoll re additional infiinnation
required in response to interrogatories

ALIg-20-13 Correspondence with S. Stoll 0.05 KE

Call and correspondence with S. Shrybman; Research 1 .00 KE
re Board jurisdiction re carbon reductions

Aug-21-13 Call from S. Stoll re IRs; Confer with J. Gibbons; 1.00 KE
Draft correspondence to S. Stoll; Further various
correspondence

Aug-22-13 Conference call with S.Stoll and Enbridge staff re ER 0.5() KE
46

Aug-26-13 Review correspondence from S. Stoll re IR 46; 0.45 KE
Correspondence with J. Gibbons; Draft response to
S. Stoll; Review Procedural Order No. 9

Aug-27-13 Correspondence to the Board re motion; Confer with 0,60 KE
J. Gibbons re response to interrogatory no. 46

Aug-28-13 Draft detailed correspondence to S. Stoll re IR 46 0.75 KE

.Aug-29-l3 Correspondence with J. Gibbons re 1.00 KE
cross-examination time estimates and issues for the
hearing; Various correspondence re hearing
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scheduling: Correspondence to and call with J.
Wasylyk; Draft list of issues to address during cross

Aug-30- 13 Review correspondence from S. Stoll: Draft 0.50 KE
coiTeSpondence to S. Stoll re why updated evidence
does not address infb requested in IR 46:
Draft/review correspondence re hearing plan. etc.

Sep-04- I 3 Preparing for cross—examinations and pre-hearing; 5.00 KE
Correspondence to counsel fbr TCPL; Attend
meeting

Sep-05-13 Detailed review of evidence and updates in 7.50 IKE
nreparation for the hearing (3 hr); Attend ire-hearing
conference (4.5 hr)

Sep—06—13 CoiTespondence with Enerlife rc potential up(lates to IKE
evidence; Call with counsel for TCPL; Conlr with J.
Gibbons; Prepare cross-examination notes;
Correspondence with counsel for GEC

Sep-I 0-1 3 Review and respond to correspondence from 1 .00 IKE
Enbridge re questions fbr Enerlife; Various
correspondence with Enerlife re Enbridge questions
and necessary tbllow up; Correspondence with D.
Poch re Enhridge charts; Correspondence to the
parties re ED witness panel and CVs

Sep-i 1-13 Call with Enerlife team re Enhridge questions and 2.50 KE
updates to Enerlife model and report; Detailed review
of changes to report and model; Draft
correspondence explaining changes

Sep- 12-13 Prepare tbr cross-examinations of Enhridge 7.75 KE

Sep-13-13 Prepare fbr cross-examinations of Enhridge; Draft 7.75 KE
questions fhr technical conference

Sep-I 5- 13 Prepare materials for cross-examinations; Draft 5.00 KE
correspondence to Enhridge with charts and tables
for cross-examination; Correspondence from D. Poch
re TCPL issues; Review Friday’s transcript; Draft
correspondence to ratepayer counsel re coordinating
interventions and with ED’s position

Sep-16- [3 Prepare, serve, and file cross-examination document 4.00 IKE
book; Review cross-examination notes; Review
transcript

Sep-17-13 Prepare for hearing (.5 hrs); Attend hearing (2 hrs); 2.70 IKE
Correspondence re IR responses & ED tables (.2)

Sep- I 8- 1 3 Prepare fbr cross-examination tomorrow 1 .40 KE

Sep-I 9-I 3 Prepare ftr hearing (.5 hrs); Attend hearing (5 hrs) 5.50 KE

Sep-20- I 3 Various correspondence; Confer with JG re hearing 0. 10 IKE

Sep-23-13 Prepare tbr cross-examination of EG panel 2; Prepare 2.00 KE
and flIe second document book
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Sep—24— 1 3 Prepare for cross-examination (1 1w); Attend hearing KB
(2 hrs)

Sep-25- I 3 Draft coiTCSpOfldence to S. Stoll re expert I .00 KE
qualitication & J4. 10: Draft correspondence to
experts re evidence issue

Sep—26— 1 3 Prepare frr cross-examination (I 1w): Attend hearing KE
(2 hrs): Prepare for examination of Enerlife witnesses
and for expert witness meeting (2 hrs); Prepare for
cross-examination with Enerlife experts (2 hrs);
Attend meeting between ED and GEC expert
witnesses (1 hr)

Sep-27- 13 Prepare for hearing (1 1w); Attend hearing (4 lirs) 5.05 KB

Sep-30-13 Review undertaking responses; Calculate project 1.05 KB
NPV based on dillerent scenarios

Oct-01-13 Review Procedural Order 11 and various 0.25 KB
correspondence and evidence updates

Oct-07-13 Review materials for potential cross-examination; 0.30 KE
Correspondence to V. DeRose

Oct-08-13 Call with V. DeRose to avoid overlap in 2.00 KE
cross-examination; Prepare for cross-examination;
Prepare aI1d tile cross-examination reference hook

Oct-09-13 Prepare tbr hearing (1 hr); Attend hearing (2 hrs) 3.00 KE

Oct- I 7-13 Confer with JG re argument 0,30 KB

Oct-18-13 Correspondence to S. Stoll re interruptable volumes 0.30 KE

Oct-2 1-13 Correspondence with counsel tbr Enhridge re 1 .00 KE
interruptahles; Review materials re need for project
in Nov 2015

Oct-22-13 Review argument in Chief of Enbridge and Union; 6.50 KB
Review transcripts from all technical conference and
hearing days; Draft initial outline of written
submissions

Oct-23-13 Drafting submissions, reviewing evidence, and 1 .00 KE
compiling compendium materials

Oct-24-13 Drafting submissions, reviewing evidence, and 8.00 KE
compiling compendium materials

Oct-25- 1 3 Drafting submissions, reviewing evidence, and 6.05 KE
compiling compendium materials

Oct-27-13 Drafting submissions, reviewing evidence, and 2.55 KB
compiling compendium materials

Oct-28-13 Drafting submissions, reviewing evidence, and 6.05 KE
compiling compendium materials

Oct-29-13 Drafting submissions, reviewing evidence, and 8.05 KE
compiling compendium materials

Oct-30-13 Drafting submissions, reviewing evidence, and 5.00 KE
compiling compendium materials
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Oct-3 1-13 Drafting submissions, reviewing evidence, and 11 .00 KE
compiling compendium materials

Nov-() I - 13 Drafting and revising submissions: Correspondence 6.00 KE
with J. Gibbons

Nov-02- 13 Revising submissions; Correspondence with J. 3.00 KE
Gibbons

Nov-03- 13 Revising and adding to submissions per J. Gibbons’ 6.55 KE
comments;

Nov-04-13 Confer with J. Gibbons; Review correspondence 0.35 KE
[mm the parties re ftirther evidence on the settlement
igreement

Nov- 12-13 Detailed review and analysis of Union and Enhridge’s 6.05 KE
updated evidence regarding the settlement
agreement; Correspondence with S. Stoll; Drafting
additional submissions regarding Enbridge’s updated
evidence

Nov-I 3-I 3 Revise submissions; Compile compendium 2.00 KE

Nov- 14-1 3 Revise submissions; Compile compendium; File and 7.05 KE
serve materials; Correspondence with K. Millyard

Nov-15-13 Prepare, serve, and file corrected version of 0.50 KE
Submissions and Compendium

Nov-26-13 Review EG & UG argument 0.45 KE

Totals 248.35 $42,219.5()

HST on Fees $5,488.54

FE SUMMARY

Lawyer Hours Amount
Cory Waiiless 4.00 $680.00

Kent Elson 244.35 $41,539.5(

DISBURSEMENTS

Courier expenses 160.57 a..t. ‘&.Je&
Outside photocopy expenses 905.56 ,_ci.e

Photocopies 175,00 7oo @

Totals $1,241.13

FIST on Disbursements $161.35
,
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TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

Previous Balance

Previous Payments

Payment From Trust Towards This Invoice

$49j 10.52

TOTAL DUE

\ny disl,ursements not posicd to your icount on thc late ul tht statement iii he hilled at a later date

THIS IS ACCOUNT HEREIN:

MURRAY KLIPPENSTEIN

E.&O.E.

$49,110.52

Total Tax: $5,649.89

HST #: 87215 1923 RT000 I * lems are HS F exempt

Accounts are due when tendered. Pursuant to the Sti icitors Act. ituletesi at the rate ol 5 00% per annum nay he cijaied on amounts unpaid thirty days
alter the dale of tills account

SO.O()

$O.fl()

‘iO.O()



—iTPN

Invoice 041191249
THE PRINTING HOUSE LTD.

Account: 601994
Date: September 17, 2013

Bill To: Klippenstein, Barristers & Solicitors Ordered By: Kent Elson
Attn: Kent Elson Phone: (416)906-7305

160 John St 3rd Floor Customer P0: 1956
Toronto ON M5V 2E5

r

Ship To: SAME

Job Name:

Item 1-Sided 2-Sided Quantity Description FiST Job Price

A 122 10 Digital output copying X $183.00
Digital B&W Prints I Other Insert tabs! FSC_Mir/ Bind Cerlo copies white f & b

B 2 10 Colour Copying X $11.80
!Other: ‘.‘

C 23 10 Tabs X $92.00
/ Other €iiaa

D I 10 Cerlox Binding

____

X $46.00
/Other: ..

_________________

Your green future can start now with TPH and FSC! www.tph.ca Net Sales $332.80
Produced by TPH® using FSC certified paper (RA-COC-001985) Shipping $0O0

Sub Total $332.80
Branch Contact: Chris Gennings HST $43.26
Address: I 81 University Ave Total Price $376.06

Main Level - Suite 109
Toronto, ON, M5H 3M7

Phone: 416-867-1588

fl/N MIX Y the P0u REMIT TO: The Printing House Ltd.TM
denlrfied as audi 1403 Battiurst Street, Toronto, ON M5R 3H8 • Tel: 416-536-6113 • 1 -800-874-0870 WWVV. List i.CL FSCCerohe G.S.T. / H.S.T. 105242887 RT • O.S.T. 1202417066 •.

TERMS, Net due upon receipt of invoice. nterest of 1 5% per month 18% PA.) will be charged on all overdue accounts.



THE PRINTING HOUSE LTD.

B ill To: Klippenstein, Barristers & Sohcitors
Attn: Kent Elson

160 John St 3rd Floor
Toronto ON M5V 2E5

Invoice 041189480
Account:
Date:

601994
July 22, 2013

Item 1-Sided 2-Sided Quantity I)escription FIST Job Price

50 2 digital colour and b.w output from e-mail X
B&W Prints: /Digital Colour Prints: / FSC_Mix: I Other: black clip

Chris Gennings
181 University Ave
Main Level - Suite 109
Toronto, ON, M5H 3M7
416-867-1588

Net Sales
Shipping
Sub Total
HST
Total Price

REMIT TO: The Printing House LtdT

1403 Bathurst Street. Toronto. ON M5R 3H8 • Tel: 41 6-536-61 13 • 1 -800-874-0870
G.S.T. / H.S,T. 105242887 RT • O.S.T. 120241 7066

TERMS: Net due upon recept of ;nvoice. nterestof 1.5% per mOnth 18% PA wil be charged on ad ouerdue accounts

Branch Contact:
Address:

$32.75
$0.00

$32.75
$4.26

$37.01

Ordered By:
Phone:
Customer P0:

Kent Elson
(416) 906-7305
1956 GTA Pipeline

Ship To: SAME

Job Name:

rr CL4-Y--7

$32.75A
Digital

Your green future can start now with TPH and FSC! www.tph.ca
Produced by TPH® using FSC certified paper (SW-COC-OO 1985)

Phone:

FSC COl

Only he products

identified as such

on this Invoice are
rsc Dertitierl

Nw.iphca



Invoice 041193207
TPH Direct 1239217

THE PRINTING HOUSE LTD.

Account: 601994
Date: November 15, 2013

Klippenstein, Barristers & Solicitors
Kent Elson
160 John St 3rd Floor
Toronto ON M5V 2E5

Ship To: Kent Elson
160 John St.
Toronto, ON, M5V2E5

Instructions: The address is 160 John Street, Suite 300
Job Name: 1956 - Submissions/Compendium

Item I—Sided 2—Sided Quantity 1)escription FIST Job Price

A 368 j_ 4 W.Output

_____J

XJ $220.80
jgjtB&WPi/OthincrUabW S L/1ner1oc : -

5L Colour Outp - -

_____

X $134.52
igttal Colour Prints:

______-

?. . -

_____

c T 51

______

4 Ljabs

_____________

X $84.60
(Other 1840

D 1 L_ 1 4 j CerloxBindin&

___________

X $18.40
LQiiw -__

$458.32
$0.00

$458.32
$59.5

Jentied as Such 1403 Bathurst Street, Toronto ON M5R3H8’Te4165366113. 1800-874-0870 \MNWh.
C__sc.coissgeJFsccenified OS T./H ST. 105242887 RT • Os T. 1202417066 .uxuo.,:

TERMS Net due upon receipt ot invoice Interest of 1 5% per month 118% PA) will he charged on all overdue accounts

[liii ‘I’o:
AUn:

Ordered By:
Phone:
Customer P0:

Kent Elson
(4 16) 906-7305
1956 Submissions / Comp

Branch Contact: Chris Gennings
Address: 1 81 University Ave

Phone:

Main Level - Suite 109
Toronto, ON, M5H 3M7
416-867-1588

Net Sales
Shipping
Sub Total
1-1ST
Total Price



THE PRINTING HOUSE LTD.

Bill To:
Atm:

Ordered By:
Phone:
Customer P0:

Job Name:

Item 1-Sided 2-Sided Quantity Description lIST Job Price

A 25 3 Digital Colour Output
Digital B&W Prints: /Digital Colour Prints: / FSC_Mix: / Other: clip

•_4,-_’

un

x $44.25

Your green future can start now with TPI-l and FSC! www.tph.ca
Produced by TPH® using FSC certified paper (RA-COC-OO 1985)

Branch Contact: Chris Gennings
Address: 181 University Ave

Main Level - Suite 109
Toronto, ON, M5H 3M7

Phone: 416-867-1588

Net Sales
Shipping
Sub Total
HST
Total Price

$44.25
$0.00

$44.25
$5.75

$SOrOO

MlX Only The prouucts

p mm UentitieO as Such
bl on ms Invoice areL_ FSC

REMIT TO: The Printing House Ltd.TM

1403 Bathurst Street, Toronto, ON M5R 3H8 • Tel: 416-536-6113 • 1aO0-874-O37O
GS.T. / H.S.T. 105242887 RT • O.S.T. 1202417066

TERMS Net due upon receIpt I invoice Interest sf1 5% per month 118% PA) wIll be charged on all overdue accounts.

Invoice 041191284

Klippenstein, Barristers & Solicitors
Kent Elson
160 John St 3rd Floor
Toronto ON M5V 2E5

Account:
Date:

Ship To: SAME

601994
September 18, 2013

Kent Elson
(4l6) 906-7305

1956- Enerlife Update Rpt



THE PRINTING HOUSE LTD

Hill To: Klippenstein, Barristers & Solicitors
Ailii; Kent Elson

160 John St 3rd Floor
Toronto ON M5V 2E5

Ship To: SAME

Item 1-Sided 2-Sided Quantity Description 1-1ST Job Price

A 24 4 I)igita] Colour Output X
/Digital Colour Prints: single sided! FSC_Mixed: :

Your green tittur can start now with TPI-l and FSC! www.tph.ca
Produced by [P[f( using FSC certified paper (SW-COC-OO 1985)

Branch Contact: Chris (Jennings
Address: 181 University Ave

Main Level - Suite 109
Toronto, ON, M5H 3M7

Phone: 416-867-1588

—I-----
MIX Only the omducts

dentified as such

[‘SC
on this macate are

FSC CO1959Oj FSCCnrhhnd,

REMIT TO: The Printing House Ltd.TM
1403 Bathurst Street. Toronto, ON M5R 3H8 • Tel: 41 6-536-61 13 • 1 -800-874-0870

G.S.T./ H.S.T. 105242887 RT • O.S.T. 1202417066

1EPMS Net due upon receipt of invoice interest of 1.5% per month 18% P.8 I will be charged on all overdue accounts.

ww

nvoice 041188902
Account:
Date:

Ordered By:
Phone:
Customer P0:

601994
.July 2,2013

Kent Elson
(416) O6-73D5

Enerlife Report

Job Name:

E1r- -poc$

$37.44

$37.44
$0.00

$37.44
$4.87

$42.31

Net Sales
Shipping
Sub Total
1-1ST
Total Price
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hltns://secure.starshirn!roup.caiindex.asp’?CI [)=TEE&U1DOHCJOLOWI P01 HINLRMR... 03/02/2014
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kllII’I NSIIIN. \‘l( IiI(\Y KIRS(lN ‘A.\I.I IO(.\RI)Si,(RIlAR

(Oil Ii II (N S (rd H r 111k 27i10 — 230(1 ‘y IN(t S
HRC)N U ( IN I I URON Il

M5V215 M4I’I (:4

Client se I

Additional In (urinatiOn R EA DY F( (R PICK-i P

2IIULR $1933 imiePsicred 918,20(3 I 58 56PM

Pieces I I) (Ill me Receied 9, 8,2(13 I S8 56 PM

nd $2 SI ‘me I)NpiiIelied 0,18 2(113 2 (P3 I PM

Subtotal $2184 inc Picked L p 91 8’21113 2 III ((I I’M

II S T $284 1 me I )elivered 9) I 8,2011 3 ((6 56 PM

,ii,iI $2468 last \1,id,ticd ‘I 18 21113 3 (0 50 PM

Signature Nicole broker 517

1iiti//citresiirshinurouncaJindexaspCLD”1T’F&UIDOHCJOLOWSQOJLKLLFNJ 03/02/2014
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0,42 kI Il’I’INSI IN. MI RRAY Invoice: 1n3845

0 ii I ft R ( (SI Re Icrenee XX02

lick up I)csiinalion

FJIl’li NSIIIN \ThRRAY KIRSII\ \AIII 4 i.kI)SI(RiF.\R5

(0 kilIN si. 3rd ii (ilIR 2701— 2luO 5 Si
Iiil(i\i((NI
M5\’21S M41’l I 4

(‘licu)

Additional Infiirmaiioii R p j )Y Ilk Pl(lc—I 31

311(11/k S12I’l iiinelntcied II 1521(13 12 2’) 37 PM

I’iecc,, I 1,)) Ii)) lime Rececd I 15 2)113 12 2’( 57 I’M

uel SI 34 lime l)ispiiic Iicd 152(13 I 1)3 29 I’M

Suhiotal 513 53 Time Picked l:p I 15 2(113 4143 I’M

II S $176 lime I)cli’,erccl 115/2(1133 10 08 I’M

1 ,iial S IS 2’) I asi Modilied I I 5 2013 311) 1)8 PM

Signauie Paiuiia Itroker S 17

https://secure.slarshipgroup.ca!index.asp?CIDTEE&UI D—()HCJOLOWUSUIIPLNKH... 03/02/2014
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I’iccc I $11 liii I me Reeierd 3 Ii 2(113 9 (III (HI AM

Sublolal $8 II I inc UlsImIclied 3 15 2(1139 III SI AM

II S I SI ((5 I me Picked I ‘p 3 52(113 9,51 05 AM
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INVOICE: EB-2012-0451#2

ON TARIO
•ZLEAN AIR
A L LI A NC

To: Kllppensteins; Attention: Kent Elson

From: Ontario Clean Air Alliance

Re: Fee for professional services of Jack Gibbons re: OEB Docket No. EB.2012-0451 (Enbridge GTA

Pipeline) for the period October 1, 2013 to November 14, 2013 inclusive

Date: November 18. 2013

1. Reviewing hearing transcripts

2.33 hours x $250/hour

2. Reviewing Settlement Agreement

0.83 hours x $250/hour

3. Assisting with preparation of argument

4.08 hours x $250/hour

HST Registration No. 85281 3997 RT0001

TOTAL

Jack Gitbons

$582.50

$207.50

$1020.00

$235.30

$2,045.30

15O .Jnhri S r(t. Suite OO, loronto, Ontario, MW 255
Teleahone: (416) 260-208() • Fax: (4 16 598-9520

:nldcL’°c)&anuiralliance.org • wwvc1eanaira11ianceorg



rife
(1,Jt rg

22 St Joseph Street

STATEMENT Toronto, Ontano

‘14V 1J9

)te December 18, 2013 Ph: (416>915-1530

F: (116(915-1534

c 1085

To Environmental Defence, do Klippensteins, Barristers & Solicitors

In Time on En bridge GTA Pipeline Leave to Construct 2012-045 1

ITEM AMOUNT

91 hours, Analyst Services

Ian Jarvis - See docket attached $30,030.00

@ $330/hour

74.5 hours, Analyst Services

Gillian Henderson - See docket attached $21,605.00

@ $290/hour

234,92 hours, Analyst Services

Wen Jie Li - See docket attached $39,936.40

@ $170/hour

SUBTOTAL $91,571.40

HST 13% (50%) $5,952.14

TOTAL $97,523.54

Business number 86868 2014 RT0001

Payment due upon receipt of invoice.

Please make cheque payable to Enerlife Consulting Inc.



Founding Chair,
Canada Green
Building Council,
2003 - 2007

Member,
National Advisory
Council Ofl Energy
Efficiency (Canada),
1998 - Present

Member,
Ontario Energy
Minister’s Advisory
Committee
2005 - Present

IAN A. JARVIS, B.Sc., P.Eng.

I AN IA RV IS is a proven, values—driven business leader, and an
international authority on energy efticiency and green building
perlormance. lie has worked successfully iii Canada, the United States
and the UK,

Ian has served as president ot Enerlite Consulting Inc since 2001. Enerlife
is an energy and environmental management consulting firm, empowering
building owners and managers to achieve and demonstrate high
perfrinance in their individual buildings and whole building portfolios.
l’he company develops and tnanages the largest online building
performance management system and database in Canada, and advises
governments, utility companies and industry associations on related policy
and program design.

Prior to founding Enerlife, Ian was CEO of Rose Technology Group, one
of the largest energy performance contractors (ESCO’s) in North America.
Under his leadership, Rose grew from 50 people in three Canadian offices,
to over 200 in nine offices across North America. Rose came to dominate
the Canadian energy performance contracting industry (building renewal
linanced with energy cost savings), and became a North American leader
in this growing and competitive business. Ian led the company’s
expansion into the united States, created Rose’s regional alliances in
Atlantic and Western Canada, established complementary business
divisions in Icility management and new construction, and acquired
majority-ownership in Optimira Controls, a building automation systems
subsidiary. The 1999 Frost & Sullivan Market Engineering Award
recognized Rose’s North American leadership in the development and
growth of the energy services industry.

Ian led the original management huyout of Rose Technology Group from
British Gas in September, 1994. Revenues grew from C$18 million in
1995 to C$52 million in 1999. lan then completed the sale of the company
to Cinergy Corporation (NYSE symbol CIN) in December, 1999.

lan is known as a visionary leader and strategic planner. An outstanding
written and oral communicator, he maintains a high personal profile,
helping to define and build the green building perftrmance industry. He
represented the industry on the 1998 Team Canada trade mission to South
America, and as the Canadian government’s invited private sector
representative at the 1999 Hemispheric Energy Minister’s Contrence in
New Orleans, Louisiana. In 2001, Ian was a member of Premier Hamm’s
blue ribbon advisory panel on energy policy fhr the Province of Nova
Scotia.



I. A. .l.RVIS
Enerlife Consulting Inc October 2001-Present
I ncrI i li. ( O!1SU lii iitt is a manacement consult inc Ii liii cnLtaced in end—use energy
c tile iency creeti hu Id ing perlormance and sustal naN e comniun it des elopiiient

EI)LJCi’ION

inperial College of Science and
I L IiiuiIog I niei i15 of

Ihh hdu, 1)/ ‘u ieni’ (I hjnut.ii
I h’ IUiflhL ut i iiifli t1Ii

‘1EMBERS1IIPS

National Advisoiy C ouncil on
Energy Efficiency (advising the
Government of Canada’s Office
if Inci g Efficieiic

Ontario Energy Minister’s
Ad’ isor C’oinrnittee

I I) Canada S(eeriiig
C ominiltee

‘anida t reeri Building Council
National Suinniit Progiam

C immiltee

l’iotëssio,ial Engineers I )ntario

President ( )ctoher 201)1 Present
Responsible for establishing and gioli’ing an internal tonal e—c’oln,nelLe and
onsuhing business.

• Established company image and presence across (.‘anada
• l)eveloped the largest online building performance management system

in Canada as “sotiware as a service”
• Established programs and services Oar governiiieiits, commercial olilce

owners and managers, multi—un it residential buildings, nun Ic i pal it ies,
hospitals, schools and homeowners

• Principal author of REAIpac 20 by ‘15 Achieving the 0111cc Ruilding
larget of2O ekWh/t12/yr by 2015; and [own Hall Challenge

VESTAR Limited January 2000 — September 2001
VESTAR was a wholly owned subsidiary of Cinergy Corp (NYSE symbol (‘IN),
in the business of improving energy efficiency through renewal and upgrading of
existing buildings, application of technology, and tcility management. With
offices in Pittsburgh and Cincinnati and across Canada, 2000 revenues were
US$60 million.

Vice-President, Canada January — September 2001
Responsible fbr success and p,o/itability of the Canadian l?egion of the business
• Reorganized operations and sales to match regional work volumes
• Established sales and marketing strategies for each part ut the country, to

support and build upon active markets, and to reposition the business in
mature/inactive markets

• Rebuilt confidence and morale through employee meetings across the
country and focused internal communications

• Determined financial health of the business, and relbrecast 2001 budget
and 5-year plan within ten weeks of appointment

• Implemented management reporting systems
• t)eveloped succession plan

Executive Vice-President and Chief Marketing Officer January December, 2000
l?esponsible for leadership in business integration, establishing the EST IR

• brand, “ and strategic planning.
• Formed marketing, business development and communications team
• Led sales conference and sales/marketing initiatives aimed at unil’ing the

sales organizatmns
• Facilitated ongoing business with former Rose offices and clients
• Led development of website, sales collateral and e-marketing
• Lcd business modeling and five-year strategic plan

Rose Technology Group Limited 1984— December 1999
tnder Ian’s leadership, Rose became the dominant Canadian company, and a
North American leader, in energy performance contracting

— a rapidly growing
engineering and construction industry engaged in improving the quality, operating
performance and energy efficiency of buildings.

President, Chair and Chief Executive Officer 994 — 1999
Responsible to Board of [)i,ecIors /ur strategic direction groiiih ciiicl pro/itahihtv
n/i/ic compani’
• Tripled revenues over thur years to CS52 million (1999)



• I orined and des eloped a strong sen i or management (cain
• Recruited high protile outside directors
• Implemented employee share oss nersliip program
• Instituted corporate Code of Conduct
• Managed transition from utility atliliate to a private, employee—owned

company vgitli banking, bonding, insurance and supplier relutioiisliips
PROFLSSIO AL • Established credibility as l)risate company with key clients and
lWVILOPMENT narketplace

• Repaid $15 million vendor note within 16 months\ iiicricaii Maiiasunicn
5OiiCiiiiiOil • (spanded across Canada and into the Inited Slates (Pittsburgh)
ii illhii h// n’ . Reistered operations under ISO 9001

IY) /99(5
• I urmed lacil ity management and new construction divisions

Wilson [carnlng • Acquired majority interest in Optimira Controls, a building automation
(o,,nselor Selling company

/991
• Formed partnership with Keen Engineering to service Western Canada

Wilson Lcarning market
lthsinieLh count Alanagemeni • Concluded sale of the company to Cinergy Corporation in I)ecember,

1999

American Management
Assniaiiun President 1992 — 1994
high Pe,jor,nance Stork 1wn.i l?esponsible to Board of l)ireciors and utility parent (British (jot. ii’hich

/ 993 purchased ( ‘onsumers (;css in 1989) for strategic clitection. gioii’th and
American Management ptolìtahility of the company
\ssocluflofl . Formed and led a high powered executive teaiii
(,a/iingStrategw liliances • Established planning, policies and procedures supporting strong growth

1993
and profitability

Wilson Learning • Won and completed largest energy pertbrrnance contract ever in North
(eflmi’ to )es America (award-winning $43 million Metropolitan Foronto School

Board project)

the learning Partnership • Led and negotiated management buyout of the company from British (las
Summer Inslilute (change September, 1994)
,luinage,nenl and orgi,,ii:a!ioiial
ultiue) Executive Vice-President and COO 199() — 19921995 - 1999

l?espon.rihle as chief operating officer to utiliti’ pametil ( oisznne,s ( iis)

Sinerican Management I ippointed prc’sideni for financial performance sales. opelalions itmi corporate
Assi)L liltitili support VCIViLCS
1’rec,dent lssociatmn Summer

• Established the company’s first strategic planRetreat
/995 - /996 • Created and gained Board and management endorsement of corporate

Values and Beliefs
American Management • Expanded regionally into Atlantic Canada, through partnership withAssociation
lIeasur,ng ( ustomer E nerplan Consultants
Siuistiwtion • Appointed president April, 1992

/ 998

Vice-President, Sales and Marketing 989— 1990
( oldcurc Indutiac

l?esponsihle to utility parent appointed iesicletit fuìr sales and tna,Aclinglhgh ich tlustermoul
/998 1999 • Instituted and led annual operational planning conferences to build

organizational cohesion and effectiveness
I a’, cm m,mt 01 ( )ntarlo • Provided leadership in corporate renewal. achieving prolitability lbr the/ he It ,sclinn 1XL hange

/999 tirst time in 1990
• Led strong growth in sales and improved market image and profile

Ilie Speakers l’oriiiii • Appointed executive vice-president and chief operating officer May,
1)7! lu(ureaj 1chnoliigv

19902000

Vice-President, Engineering 1985
- 1988

Responsible lot c’ngineei,ng solutions Iii J)tO/)OSil/S it/UI f)1OJL’cIS

• Recruited and developed industry-leading engineering staff



• I . eraiicd personal netork to secure earl> prIccts
• Raised conipan> prolile throuch speakine at conferences and s> niposla
• lotindine member of the ( anadian \ssociation of Encrey Ser ice

( onipailies

Partner Q84 I
/?espon.sihle to other /)(z1tnL’rs br eciahlishing a neit’ L’nelgv ,nanageinenl

oiisulti /irni
• Established Rose Technology Group, with Jim Rose and 2 other partners.

as a consultmg engineering lirm April. 1984)
• Achieed recognilion. strong and diversified sales. and prolilahility

Within SIX months

• Concluded sale of the company to Consumers’ Gas in September, 1985,
to torm a hill—service energy performance contracting conipany (ES(O)

Engineering Interface Limited 1976— 1984
During the 1970’s, Engineering Interface became the pre-eminent North American
energy management consulting firm, serving major commercial and public
building owners, with contracts across North America including retrofitting of
Walt Disney World pavilions, and the conceptual design of the EPCOT Center.

Partner and Director of Engineering
Responsible for establishing a consulting division providing energy nunagernen1
cervicesfor existing buildings
• Established the complementary division in the field of energy

management for existing buildings, Which by 1982 was contributing the

larger part of revenues, profits and growth potential of the company
• Led development of leading edge, proprietary energy management

SOftware
• Pioneered innovative and profitable approaches to energy analysis,

reporting and operator/manager training
• [)eveloped wide client base with major commercial developers,

apartment owners, and federal, provincial and municipal governments
• Established a high personal profile and a strong network of clients and

market influencers
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nerfe
BA. (Hon); MBA

LEED AP 0 + M

nciton

• Masters of Business Administration
University College Dublin, Smurfit Business School

• Bachelor of Arts (Honors)
Queens University

• Certificate in Adult Training & Development Program
Ontario Institute for Studies in Education (OISE)

Total Years of Experience: 21

Enerlife Consulting Inc
Enerlife Consulting is a management consulting firm engaged in end-use energy efficiency, green
building performance and sustainable community development.

Principal September 2002 — Present

Gillian is a key contributor to the overall strategy at Enerlife, as well as the development,
implementation and management of projects. Gillian has managed and supported building
performance programs and projects in the municipal, hospital and health care, retail, social
housing and multi-residential sectors.

Her experience includes:

• Senior project manager for implementation of Integrated Building Performance process

at several Cadillac Fairview buildings, including operator training; occupant engagement

strategy and implementation; and energy credits in LEED EB: O&M certification

• Senior project manager/Principal for GREEN UP pilot projects and programs developed

from the LEED pilots for CaGBC in the commercial office, government and

administration, schools, and retail (bank and credit union) sectors. Author of annual

reports summarizing results, top performers and trends.

• Author of two energy benchmarking reports for Natural Resources Canada - one in

support of creating the business case for energy benchmarking for commercial and

institutional sectors and the other providing insight into school and hospital energy

benchmarking and best practices

• Facilitated the stakeholder team and principal author of the ‘Building Operations Fine

Tuning Guide’ — best practice guide for sustainable building operations for Ontario

Realty Corporation (Infrastructure Ontario)

Buildrng Towards a SusIainobe Fulure
—‘ t _% ““,



ne1ife Gillian Henderson
1 B.A. (Hon); MBA

LEED AP 0+ M
• Principal author of ‘Sustainable Intelligence’ guides for commercial office and retail

properties for Oxford Properties including organizational and sector best practices and

case studies

• Developing strategy and structure of newly created Office of Energy Management for
City of Oshawa

• Co-author of Toronto Central Local Health Implementation Network (LHIN) Energy Plan,
part of initial Integrated Health Services Plan

• ‘Realizing the Electricity Conservation Potential in Ontario’s Private Rental Housing
Sector with Particular Attention to Low-Income Households” - study of the private multi-
residential energy market for the Ontario Power Authority (OPA)

• Survey of members for the energy pilot for Social Housing Services Corporation (SHSC)
for 46 housing providers (148 buildings) across Ontario

• Manager for Toronto Region and Conservation Authority Living City programs and
initiatives, including Mayors’ Megawatt Challenge, Greening Health Care, Home Energy
Clinic, and Sustainable Communities

Building Towards a Sudainoble future
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Suildin9 towaids a
Sustainable Future

FiEr. fl,
canuHiq

Name: Wen Jie Li Project team Junior Engineer

position
Education Bachelor of Applied Science (Mechanical Fngineering)

University_of Toronto

Qualifications
With a degree in Mechanical Engineer from the University of Toronto, Wen brings her technical rigour
and problem-solving capabilities to the Enerlife team. She has hands-on experience with energy audits
and energy efficiency retrofit incentive programs. At Enerlife, she assists senior staff on projects for
multiple clients. Wen is also responsible for reviewing and verifying supporting documentation and
energy audit reports (engineering data, equipment specification and energy calculations) for incentive
application submissions. Wen’s experience includes:

• Energy auditor for various clients, including Infrastructure Ontario, City of Toronto, and Sick Kids

Hospital. Wen conducted the audits, analyzed results, produced audit reports and conducted

presentations with clients to review and discuss audit results.

• Lighting and Electrical technical advisor for Simcoe Place energy improvements, including

uncovering energy savings through streamlined controls, tighter management of elevator

transformers, and managing incentives.

• Developed the Target Finder tool used by Enerlife to establish rational targets for energy use

based on individual building systems and use.

• Team project leader for development of engineering design for a Solar Air Conditioning System

at University of Toronto, using building simulation software to evaluate modular system

performance to determine the optimum system integration design.

• As a research assistant in the University of Toronto Sustainability Office, Wen performed an

audit to reduce fume hood energy use, and conducted research projects on LED lighting and

plug-in hybrid electric vehicles.
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