
PETER C.P. THOMPSON, Q.C. 
T 613.787.3528 
pthompson@b1g.com  

Borden Ladner Gervais LLP 
World Exchange Plaza 
100 Queen St. Suite 1300 
Ottawa, ON, Canada K1P 1J9 
T 613.237.5160 
F 613.230.8842 
blg.corn 

BLG 
Borden Ladner Gervais 

By electronic filing 

March 4, 2014 

Kirsten Walli 
Board Secretary . 
Ontario Energy Board 
P.O. Box 2319 
2300 Yonge Street 
27th  floor 
Toronto, ON M4P 1E4 

Dear Ms Walli, 

Enbridge Gas Distribution Inc. — GTA Project — EB-2012-0451 
Union Gas Limited — Parkway West Project — EB-2012-0433 
Union Gas Limited — Brantford-Kirkwall/Parkway D — EB-2013-0074 
Our File No.: 	339583-000158 

Pursuant to the Board's Procedural Order No. 14 dated February 4, 2014, we 
Claim on behalf of our client, Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters ("CME"). 

enclose a Cost 

A copy of this Cost Claim has been forwarded to Enbridge Gas Distribution Inc . ("EGD") and 
to Union Gas Limited ("Union") as instructed in the Procedural Order. 

Please contact me if you have any questions or require any additional information. 

Yours very truly, 

Peter C.P. Thompson, 

\slc 
enclosure 
c. 	Shari Lynn Spratt (EGD) 

Karen Hockin (Union) 
Paul Clipsham (CME) 

OTT01: 6196400: vl 

Lawyers I Patent & Trade-mark Agents 



File # and Process: 

EB-2012-0451 	Enbridge Gas - GTA Project 

EB-2012-0433 	Union Gas - Parkway West Project 

EB-2013-0074 	Union Gas - Brantford-Kirkwall/Parkway D Project 

  

Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 	 Affiant's Name: Peter Thompson 

HST Number: 10807 5482 RT0001 

Full Registrant 	❑ 

Unregistered 	❑ 

Other 

HST Rate Ontario: 	13.00% 

	

Qualifying Non-Profit 	❑ 

	

Tax Exempt 	❑ 

Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 
Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements 

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and 

electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in 

the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion Is signed and sworn or affirmed, 

Instructions 

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are present in the document to assist with the calculation of the cost claim. 

- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency. 

Rate: 	 Country: 

- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of Disbursements 

Being Claimed") is required for each consultant or lawyer/articling student/paralegal. However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" 

covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided. 

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party. 

- A CV for each consultant must be attached unless, for a given consultant, a CV has been provided to the Board in another process within the last 24 

months. 

- Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided. 

Affidavit 

I, Peter C.P. Thompson, Q.C. 	 , of the City/Town of Ottawa 

in the Province/State of 	 Ontario 

 

, swear or affirm that: 

1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. 

2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements 

Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". 

3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of 

Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the 

Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 

4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as 

descri -d in section X 6.05 and 6.094 the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. 

Signature of Affiant 

Sworn or affirmed befo e me at the City/Town of Ottawa 

in the Province/State of Ontario 	 , on 

Ir  

March 4, 2014 
(date) 

 

 

      

Commissioner r taking Affidavits 
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Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 
Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements 

File # and Process: 
EB-2012-0451 	Enbridge Gas - GTA Project 
EB-2012-0433 	Union Gas - Parkway West Project 
EB-2013-0074 	Union Gas - Brantford-Kirkwall/Parkway D Project 

  

Party: 	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed 

Legal/consultant fees $142,313.00 
Disbursements $9,105.09 
HST $19,671.28 

Total Cost Claim $171,089.37 
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Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed 

File # and 
	EB-2012-0451 

	
Enbridge Gas - GTA Project 

Process: 
	EB-2012-0433 

	
Union Gas - Parkway West Project 

EB-2013-0074 
	

Union Gas - Brantford-Kirkwall/Parkway D Project 

Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 	Name: Peter C.P. Thompson, Q.C. 

Completed Years Practising/Years 

of relevant experience 

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: 
	

El 
	

45 

	

Consultant: 	0 

	

CV attached: 	0 	 CV not required: 	I=1 

Statement of Fees Being Claimed 

Hours 
Hourly 

rate 
Subtotal HST Total 

Preparation 20.20 $330.00 $6,666.00 $866.58 $7,532.58 

Attendance - Issues Day Oral Hearing 4.60 $330.00 $1,518.00 $197.34 $1,715.34 

Argument 7.90 $330.00 $2,607.00 $338.91 $2,945.91 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES II I 	$10,791.001 $1,402.831 $12,193.83 

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed 

Net Cost HST Total 

Long Distance Charges (on Hotel Bill) $9.48 $1.23 $10.71 

Travel: Taxis $61.95 $8.05 $70.00 

Travel: Parking $33.63 $4.37 $38.00 

Accommodation $185.00 $24.05 $209.05 

Meals $17.70 $2.30 $20.00 

Other: $0.00 $0.00 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: 	 I 	 $307.761 	$40.001 	 $347.76 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Party: 

Name: 

Enbridge Gas — GTA Project 
Union Gas — Parkway West Project 
Union Gas — Brantford-Kirkwall/Parkway D Project 
Enbridge Gas & Union Gas Combined Facilities 

(EGD GTA) 
(Union PWP) 
(Union BKP) 
(Combined) 

EB-2012-0451 
File # and EB-2012-0433 
Process: 
	

EB-2013-0074 

Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 

Peter Thompson 

Mar 11-13 Considering Notice of Application and supporting materials 
provided by EGD; considering and dictating request for 
intervenor status 

EGD GTA 0.6 Prep 

Apr 8-13 Conference with V. DeRose Union PWP 0.2 Prep 

Apr 10-13 Considering and responding to email from Union re: evidence Union PWP 0.1 Prep 

Apr 10-13 Considering emails from intervenor representatives and 
correspondence re: Union's process proposals 

Union PWP 0.1 Prep 

Apr 10-13 Considering EGD process proposals EGD GTA 0.1 Prep 

Apr 11-13 Reviewing Notice of Application; drafting intervention and 
cost eligibility request for CME 

Union BKP 0.6 Prep 

Apr 17-13 Reviewing Procedural Order No. 1 EGD GTA 0.1 Prep 

Apr 17-13 Considering and composing email to M. Ross re: TCPL's 
position on the Union Parkway Projects 

Union PWP 0.8 Prep 

Apr 17-13 Reviewing Procedural Order No. 1; considering email from Union PWP 0.2 Prep 
M. Ross 

Apr 23-13 Considering and responding to emails from M. Ross Union PWP 0.1 Prep 

Apr 23-13 Considering and responding to emails from M. Ross EGD GTA 0.1 Prep 

Apr 25-13 Preparation for and subsequent telephone conversation with Combined 0.6 Prep 
M. Ross re: TCPL's position and status of its application 
which is linked to Union and EGD's proposals 

Apr 30-13 Preparation for and attendance at Issues and Process Combined 4.6 Attend 

Hearing, including email communications with V. DeRose Issues Day 

May 8-13 Reviewing Procedural Order No. 2 Combined 0.1 Prep 

May 8-13 Drafting and finalizing report to P. Clipsham Combined 0.3 Prep 

May 21-13 Reviewing V. DeRose's draft Interrogatories and providing 
comments to V. DeRose 

Combined 0.4 Prep 

Jun 13-13 Telephone call from V. DeRose re: memorandum of 
understanding between EGD and TCPL 

Combined 0.1 Prep 

Jun 24-13 Considering email from V. DeRose; reviewing EGD Combined 0.4 Prep 
Undertaking Response; considering Union Motion; 
conference with V. DeRose 

Jul 2-13 Considering and responding to email from P. Clipsham Combined 0.3 Prep 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Jul 5-13 Considering and responding to emails from D. Quinn Combined 0.2 Prep 

Jul 5-13 Reviewing materials re: Union/QM! Motion; conference with Combined 0.8 Prep 
V. DeRose 

Jul 8-13 Considering and responding to email from D. Quinn Combined 0.2 Prep 

Jul 9-13 Reviewing submissions of VECC; email to V. DeRose; 
reviewing V. DeRose's draft submissions and suggesting 
revisions; reviewing submissions of BOMA, Board Staff, 
Energy Probe, GEC, SEC and TCPL 

Combined 1.8 Prep 

Jul 10-13 Email to V. DeRose and subsequent meeting with him re: 
oral submissions 

Combined 0.3 Prep 

Jul 10-13 Considering correspondence from EGD and subsequently 
from Union; emails to V. DeRose 

Combined 0.6 Prep 

Jul 11-13 Reviewing EGD letter to the Board and attachments; email to Combined 1.5 Prep 
P. Clipsham; email to J. Girvan; conference with V. DeRose 
re: next steps 

Jul 11-13 Meeting with V. DeRose re: Interrogatories to TCPL Combined 0.2 Prep 

Jul 12-13 Reviewing Interrogatories to TCPL from various intervenors Combined 0.3 Prep 

Jul 16-13 Reviewing Union and GMi Interrogatories to TCPL Combined 0.2 Prep 

Jul 23-13 Reviewing Procedural Order No. 6; email exchange with V. Combined 0.2 Prep 
DeRose 

Jul 25-13 Reviewing TCPL letter to the Board re: Schedule Combined 0.2 Prep 

Jul 25-13 Considering and composing email to P. Clipsham after 
reviewing TCPL letter to the Board; email exchange with V 

Combined 0.6 Prep 

DeRose; conversation with G. Cameron; further letter to P. 
Clipsham 

Jul 29-13 Reviewing Procedural Order No. 7; email to V. DeRose' Combined 0.2 Prep 

Aug 9-13 Reviewing Union/GMi Application to the National Energy Combined 0.5 Prep 
Board re: connection of Albion to Maple Pipeline to TCPL's 
system 

Aug 26-13 Conference with V. DeRose; analyzing issues for purposes of 
briefing V. DeRose re: Settlement Conference 

Combined 2.5 Prep 

Aug 29-13 Telephone call from V. DeRose Combined 0.1 Prep 

Sep 6-13 Conference with V. DeRose re: LTC approval conditions Combined 0.2 Prep 

Sep 11-13 Reviewing letters from Union and TCPL to the Board; 
meeting with V. DeRose; considering emails from various 
intervenor representatives; emails to V. DeRose 

Combined 0.6 Prep 

Sep 12-13 Reviewing term sheet; telephone discussion with V. DeRose Combined 0.8 Prep 

Sep 12-13 Telephone call from V. DeRose Combined 0.3 Prep 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 0-0.0 

Sep 16-13 Considering issues re: ratepayer protection conditions; 
emails to and subsequent conversation with V. DeRose 

Combined 1.0 Prep 

Nov 4-13 Conference with V. DeRose re: Settlement Agreement and 
questions thereon 

Combined 0.2 Prep 

Nov 6-13 Reviewing emails and conference with V. DeRose Combined 0.2 Prep 

Nov 11-13 Reviewing R. Aiken's Argument; email to V. DeRose Combined 0.5 Argument 

Nov 14-13 Reviewing Board staff Argument; reviewing draft CME Combined 4.8 Argument 
Argument prepared by V. DeRose; meeting with V. DeRose 

Nov 14-13 Reviewing revised Argument; email to V. DeRose Combined 0.6 Argument 

Nov 15-13 Meeting with V. DeRose to suggest further revisions to CME Combined 0.4 Argument 
Argument 

Nov 15-13 Reviewing submissions of IGUA, APPrO, CCC and Council 
of Canadians 

Combined 0.9 Argument 

Nov 15-13 Reviewing submissions of BOMA Combined 0.7 Argument 

Jan 30-14 Reviewing Board Decision Combined 1.0 Prep 

Feb 10-14 Reviewing Union's letter to the Board Combined 0.2 Prep 

Feb 18-14 Considering Board staff submissions re: Accounting Order Combined 0.1 Prep 

TOTAL HOURS for Peter Thompson: 32.7 

Hours Fees 

Prep 20.2 x $330.00/hr = 6,666.00 

Attend Issues Day 4.6 x $330.00/hr = 1,518.00 

Argument 7.9 x $330.00/hr = 2,607.00 

32.7 TOTAL FEES for Peter Thompson: $10,791.00 



Borden Ladner Gervais 

BILLABLE EXPENSE REPORT 

NAME: 	Peter Thompson 	 DATE: May 7, 2013 

BILLABLE INFORMATION: 

Client File No./Name: 	CME re: EGD & Union Facilities - file # 339583-000158 

Attendance at Issues & Process Day in Toronto on April 30, 2013 

Canadian Expense 	Expenses 
Total 	 Outside 

EXPENSES 	 Expense 	Pre-Tax 	HST 	Canada 

Transportation (Air,Bus,Train) 	 $ 	$ 	$ 	$ 

Total Kms: 	 0  kms. 	$ 	$ 	$ 	$ 
x Rate $ 	0.45 

Car Rental 	 $ 	$ 	- 	$ 	- 	$ 

Taxis 	 $ 	70.00 	$ 4,i 135 	$ 	gps 	$ 

Hotel / Lodging 	 $ 	 $ / 65.  c'') 	$ a 4-05  $ 

Food and Drink (see hotel bill) 	 $  

Parking 	 $ 	38.00 

Long Distance 	 $  

Miscellaneous (specify) 	 $  

TOTALS: 	 $ 	 $  301.7, $  Li-o.  00  $ 

Total Expenses: 	$ 	355.28 

Less Travel Advance: 

Reimbursement Total (CDN): 	$ 355.28 

1. Expenses are to be remitted within one week of being incurred 

2. Original receipts are required for all items 

PROFESSIONAL/GROUP LEADER APPROVAL /I  y)  Signature: 	e-aA4/Ta-1  
PetePfhompson 

 

  

OTT01\4908979 
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BECK TAXI 
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RECEIPT FOR CAB FARE 
Date:7094a.  273  Amount: 	69e)  

From:  2-7,6) it/0666  

To: 6117(13/t)r 	)
r 

1-  

Cab No.: 	 Driver/ 
Note: Amount shown above includes G.S.T. Driver is an independent Contractor, any G.S.T. Input Credit 
may be claimed at "NOTIONAL" or applied to DRIVERS Registration Number, not Maple Leaf Taxi. 

Seweag 7evrosta An (wet 25 vecvt.4 DriverGSMeWanWiceWen 

To 2 -Z)  YOCIC/ ........... 	• 

Cab No. 	.. Driver 
THANK YOU 

Aeroport d'Ottawa Airport 

Exit _5 CT 30/04/13 16:06 

Cashier 4 
Receipt 078145 

Ticket/Billet 
P1 - No. 042529 
28/04/13 20:02 - 
30/04/13 16:06 - 
Period 1d20h51  
(CAN) 

Total 

Payment Received 
Cash 

$38.00 

$312L--)  

$38.00 

Sub Total 
HST 	13% 

$33.63 
4.37 /4.5-7-  

HST#TVH 898569942RT.CAD 
Good day Au revoir 



$185. 
05 

$1.23 
$g748 

$185.00 
$24.05 

$31.5 

CAMBRIDGE SUITES HOTEL 
15 Richmond Street East 

Toronto, Ontario, Canada M5C 1N2 
(416) 368-1990 Fax: (416) 601-3751 Toll Free:1 800 463-1990 

www.cambridgesuitestoronto.com  

Guest Name: Peter Thompson 

Borden Ladner Gervais LLP 
World Exchange Plaza 

100 Queen St, Suite 1100 

Ottawa, ON K1P 1J9 	CN 

Room Number: 1307 

Folio Number: R4AFF2 - 1 

Group Number: 

No. of Guests: 	1 

Rate: 	 185.00 

C/O Clerk: 	ASHLEY 
CC No: 
	

CL #: 

Arrival: 	04/28/13 
	

Time: 	04:13 PM 
	

Departure. 	04/30/13 	Time: 	01:41 PM 
	

Status: 	HIST 

Description —Charges 	Crli  
04/28/13 1307 
04/28/13 1307t 
04/29/13 0429015742t1 

04/29/13 042901574272 
04/29/13 1307 
04/29/13 1307t 

04/29/13 357777 
04/29/13 357794 
04/29/13 71307 
04/29/13 71307tt1 

04/29/13 357842 
04/29/13 357903 
04/30/13 043004374272 

04/30/13 Ck Out 13:41 

ROOM CHARGE 

ROOM HST 
HST TAX 

LONG DISTANCE 

ROOM CHARGE 
ROOM HST 

RESTAURANT PORTICO 
RESTAURANT PORTICO 

LONG DISTANCE 
HST TAX 

RESTAURANT PORTICO 
RESTAURANT PORTICO 

MINI BAR REV 

VISA-PAYMENT 

UN Ion] tRIA 

E&D ctino( 
Q4.-r3miE.1 

fn iL/ri~S 

$2 4 UNii0A.) 1014 
2.64 

$0.34 

$30.12 
$91.10 

c"--$27.52.)  E &Dana' tfi\Jto 
c 0,46 »0z-14635.42 

FAcit_irt ES 
Folio Balance: 	$0.00 

ROOM HST 

HST TAX 

ROOM HST 
Rest..Portico/V1Rest 

Rest..PorticoN1Rest 
613-237-5160 00:02 

6132375160 00:02 

Rest..PorticoN1Rest 
Rest.. PorticoN1Rest 

declared 

NET- 	1-1ST 

oo m 	/85.°° 
Lo n)G- DISTA foci 	 / 

MERL 	Irl.lo 	c9, 3o 

H.S.T. Reg. No.10086 7910 RT0002 

	

$a 39 .7  
AUTHORIZED BY: 

I agree that my liability for this bill is not waived and agree to be held personally liable in 
the event that the indicated person, company or association fails to pay for any part or 
the full amount of these charges. 

CHECK-OUT BY: 

Signature 

Thank You For Staying With Us 	
Page No. 1 



NEW MINI-BAR ITEMS LIST - Starting October 3rd 2011 

ITEM SALES AMOUNT TOTAL 

HEINEKEN (3) $6.25 
CANADIAN (2) $6.25 
STEAMWHISTIE (2) $6.25 
PONDVIEW - WHITE WINE 750ML (CITYSCAPE) (1) $24.99 
PONDVIEW - RED WINE 750ML (CITYSCAPE) (1) 	_ $24.99 
CHATEAU DES CHARMES - RED WINE 375ML (1) $12.50 
CHATEAU DES CHARMES - WHITE WINE 375ML (1) $12.50 
ABSOLUTE VODKA (1) $7.25 
JONNIE WALKER RED SCOTCH (2) $7.25 
BACARDI RUM (1) 	_ $7.25 
BEEFEATER GIN (1) $7.25 
CANADIAN CLUB RYE (1) $7.25 

NON ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGE 	 r 
ESKA SPRING WATER 750ML (1) r• 10.

et.--.525). 	
50 

 

ESKA SPARKLING WATER 750ML (1) $5.25 
ORANGINA (1) $2.95 
ORANGE JUICE (1) $2.95 
APPLE JUICE (1) $2.95 
CRANBERRY JUICE (1) $2.95 
COCA COLA (2) 2.95 el., 5, qo 
COCA COLA DIET (2) $ . 5 
SPRITE (1) $2.95 
ICE TEA (1) $2.95 
SODA WATER (1) $2.95 
TONIC WATER (1) $2.95 
RED BULL (1) $4.25 

FOOD 
CASHEW IN A JAR (1)  
CHOCOLATE ALMONDS IN JAR (1) 

•-/ 

SMOKEHOUSE ALMONDS (1) 
CARAMILK (1) 

$2.25 _ 
$2.25 

KIT KAT (1) $2.25 
SNICKERS (1) 
M&M (1) 

$2.25 
$2.25 

TOBLERONE (1) 
PRINGLES ORIGNAL & SOUR CREAM (1) 

$4.95 
$2.25 

DORITOS NACHO (1) 
TIC TAC (1) 

$2.25 
$2.25 

RETRO CANDY 
$2.95 

POP ROCKS 
	

$2,95 

=1615 a, 	Date:  iffralfayemE - - - ,. 
Room # ( -#.0manamimMill. HST Ewa 

MAX. 11-mouivr CLAIMED 

$1t1 '7o E-1 

30  H-S-7-  
6)6) 

FUN DIP 



Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed 

File # and 
	EB-2012-0451 

	
Enbridge Gas - GTA Project 

Process: 
	 EB-2012-0433 

	
Union Gas - Parkway West Project 

EB-2013-0074 
	

Union Gas - Brantford-Kirkwall/Parkway D Project 

. ,arty: 	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 	Name: Vincent J. DeRose 

Completed Years Practising/Years 

of relevant experience 

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: 	1=1 
	

12 

	

Consultant: 	❑ 

	

CV attached: 	❑ 	 CV not required: 	LI 

Statement of Fees Being Claimed 

Hours 
Hourly 

rate 

r 
Subtotal HST Total 

Preparation 254.30 $290.00 $73,747.00 $9,587.11 $83,334.11 

Attendance - Technical Conference 30.80 $290.00 $8,932.00 $1,161.16 $10,093.16 

Attendance - Settlement Conference 19.30 $290.00 $5,597.00 $727.61 $6,324.61 

Attendance - Oral Hearing 6.30 $290.00 $1,827.00 $237.51 $2,064.51 

Argument 97.10 $290.00 $28,159.00 $3,660.67 $31,819.67 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES 	I 	 I 1 	$118,262.00 	$15,374.061 $133,636.06 

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed 

Net Cost HST Total 

Photocopies: 5,959 copies at $0.25 each $1,489.75 $193.67 $1,683.42 

Colour Copies: 63 copies at $1.00 each $63.00 $8.19 $71.19 

LPIC Levy Surcharge as in previous Cost Claims $50.00 $6.50 $56.50 

Travel: Air $3,047.44 $396.22 $3,443.66 

Travel: Taxis $498.23 $51.65 $549.88 

Travel: Parking $134.51 $17.49 $152.00 

Accommodation $679.58 $88.33 $767.91 

Meals $30.87 $4.02 $34.89 

Other: $0.00 $0.00 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: 	 1 	 $5,993.381 $766.071 	 $6,759.45 



Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 
Detail of Fees being Claimed 

File # and 
Process: 

EB-2012-0451 Enbridge Gas — GTA Project 
EB-2012-0433 Union Gas — Parkway West Project 
EB-2013-0074 Union Gas — Brantford-Kirkwall/Parkway D Project 

Enbridge Gas & Union Gas Combined Facilities 

Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 

(EGD GTA) 
(Union PWP) 
(Union BKP) 
(Combined)  

Party: 

Name: 

 

Vincent J. DeRose 

 

Mar 18-13 Reviewing Application EGD GTA 2.3 Prep 

Mar 20-13 Reviewing Application and evidence EGD GTA 5.1 Prep 

Mar 22-13 Reviewing evidence EGD GTA 1.8 Prep 

Mar 22-13 Reviewing Application and evidence Union PWP 3.4 Prep 

Mar 25-13 Reviewing revised material Union PWP 2.3 Prep 

Mar 26-13 Reviewing evidence; telephone call to client EGD GTA 3.4 Prep 

Mar 27-13 Reviewing Application; telephone call to client Union PWP 2.4 Prep 

Mar 28-13 Reviewing slide presentation; reviewing Parkway West Union PWP 1.7 Prep 
Application 

Apr 4-13 Reviewing correspondence from EGD EGD GTA 0.3 Prep 

Apr 5-13 Preparation for and attendance at call with client EGD GTA 1.1 Prep 

Apr 8-13 Emails to and from client; telephone call to client EGD GTA 0.5 Prep 

Apr 10-13 Reviewing correspondence from Union and related evidence Union PWP 1.7 Prep 

Apr 10-13 Reviewing revised evidence Union PWP 1.1 Prep 

Apr 11-13 Reviewing evidence EGD GTA 3.1 Prep 

Apr 12-13 Reviewing evidence; telephone call to D. Quinn Union PWP 4.1 Prep 

Apr 25-13 Reviewing evidence Union PWP 1.1 Prep 

May 10-13 Reviewing evidence Union BKP 1.8 Prep 

May 11-13 Reviewing Application and evidence Union BKP 1.4 Prep 

May 13-13 Reviewing revised evidence Combined 2.2 Prep 

May 14-13 Reviewing impact on TCPL system and related TCPL 
expansion 

Combined 2.4 Prep 

May 15-13 Reviewing evidence Combined 2.2 Prep 

May 15-13 Telephone call from client Combined 0.3 Prep 

May 16-13 Reviewing evidence re: Interrogatories Combined 1.3 Prep 

May 17-13 Reviewing evidence Combined 3.1 Prep 

May 20-13 Reviewing evidence to prepare Interrogatories Combined 5.3 Prep 

May 21-13 Drafting Interrogatories, including review of Board Staff Combined 6.4 Prep 
Interrogatories 

May 22-13 Reviewing Interrogatories from other parties Combined 1.1 Prep 

May 24-13 Reviewing Procedural Order No. 3 Combined 0.3 Prep 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Jun 8-13 Reviewing Interrogatory Responses Combined 4.8 Prep 

Jun 9-13 Reviewing Interrogatory Responses Combined 5.1 Prep 

Jun 10-13 Reviewing Interrogatory Responses Combined 3.8 Prep 

Jun 12-13 Prepare for Technical Conference Combined 3.3 Prep 

Jun 12-13 Attendance at Technical Conference Combined 4.2 Attend TC 

Jun 12-13 Meeting with Intervenors Combined 0.4 Prep 

Jun 13-13 Preparation for and attendance at Technical Conference Combined 4.9 Attend TC 

Jun 14-13 Reviewing transcript Combined 2.1 Prep 

Jun 18-13 Reviewing undertakings Combined 1.1 Prep 

Jun 21-13 Reviewing Union motion and relevant evidence; report to 
client 

Combined 2.7 Prep 

Jun 23-13 Reviewing undertaking responses and Union motion Combined 5.4 Prep 

Jun 27-13 Reviewing Procedural Order #4; telephone call to Intervenors 
re: motion 

Combined 0.9 Prep 

Jun 28-13 Telephone call to Union re: motion Combined 0.6 Prep 

Jun 28-13 Reviewing Environmental Defence evidence Combined 0.9 Prep 

Jun 28-13 Reviewing Gaz Metro evidence Combined 0.8 Prep 

Jun 28-13 Reviewing GEC evidence Combined 1.4 Prep 

Jul 2-13 Reviewing motion by Union; obtain instructions from client Combined 2.2 Prep 

Jul 5-13 Reviewing Union Motion Record; obtain instructions Combined 1.3 Prep 

Jul 5-13 Reviewing Intervenor evidence Combined 3.8 Prep 

Jul 8-13 Reviewing evidence, Motion Record; drafting CME 
submissions 

Combined 3.7 Prep 

Jul 8-13 Telephone call from P. Clipsham Combined 0.4 Prep 

Jul 9-13 Drafting CME submissions; reviewing submissions of other 
parties; telephone call to Intervenor representatives; prepare 
for motion 

Combined 6.2 Prep 

Jul 10-13 Prepare for motion; reviewing other parties' submissions; 
reviewing submissions of EGD (including complaint to NEB) 

Combined 4.6 Prep 

Jul 11-13 Reviewing complaint to NEB; listen to submissions to the Combined 4.8 Prep 
Board; reviewing transcript 

Jul 11-13 Telephone call from Board Staff Combined 0.4 Prep 

Jul 11-13 Reviewing TCPL evidence; consider Interrogatories Combined 0.9 Prep 

Jul 11-13 Reviewing Board Staff and SEC Interrogatories to TCPL Combined 0.8 Prep 

Jul 12-13 Reviewing Intervenor Interrogatories; drafting Interrogatories. Combined 2.9 Prep 

Jul 17-13 Prepare briefing of Union/EGD complaint to NEB; changes in Combined 3.3 Prep 
Segment A 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Jul 18-13 Reviewing letter from EGD re: STAR, along with attachments Combined 4.2 Prep 

Jul 18-13 Reviewing TCPL submissions Combined 1.1 Prep 

Jul 19-13 Reviewing Interrogatory Responses from TCPL Combined 1.1 Prep 

Jul 21-13 Reviewing TCPL Response to Interrogatories Combined 2.4 Prep 

Jul 22-13 Reviewing revised evidence Combined 1.2 Prep 

Jul 23-13 Reviewing Enbridge evidence and Interrogatory Responses 
to TCPL 

Combined 2.0 Prep 

Jul 26-13 Reviewing revised Application Combined 0.3 Prep 

Jul 26-13 Reviewing EGD response to TCPL Combined 0.3 Prep 

Jul 26-13 Reviewing Union response to TCPL Combined 0.2 Prep 

Jul 29-13 Reviewing Procedural Order; drafting email to P. Thompson Combined 0.3 Prep 

Aug 1-13 Reviewing Board Staff Interrogatories Combined 1.1 Prep 

Aug 2-13 Reviewing updated evidence Combined 1.1 Prep 

Aug 2-13 Drafting and finalizing Interrogatories Combined 0.7 Prep 

Aug 7-13 Reviewing Environmental Defence letter Combined 0.3 Prep 

Aug 8-13 Reviewing s.71 application by Union Combined 3.1 Prep 

Aug 13-13 Reviewing Interrogatory Responses Combined 0.9 Prep 

Aug 13-13 Reviewing Interrogatory Responses Combined 2.1 Prep 

Aug 14-13 Reviewing Interrogatories Combined 0.7 Prep 

Aug 14-13 Reviewing Interrogatories Combined 0.9 Prep 

Aug 14-13 Telephone call from Intervenor re: Settlement Conference Combined 0.8 Prep 

Aug 15-13 Reviewing Interrogatories and related evidence Combined 2.2 Prep 

Aug 16-13 Reviewing TCPL evidence; compare to filed evidence Combined 2.3 Prep 

Aug 17-13 Reviewing TCPL evidence; compare to filed evidence of Combined 1.4 Prep 
Union and EGD 

Aug 19-13 Reviewing TCPL evidence; draft Interrogatories Combined 2.4 Prep 

Aug 20-13 Reviewing draft Interrogatories; reviewing Interrogatories 
from other stakeholders 

Combined 1.4 Prep 

Aug 21-13 Telephone call from counsel for Union; reviewing Combined 1.4 Prep 
Interrogatories on supplemental evidence 

Aug 26-13 Prepare for Settlement Conference Combined 4.3 Prep 

Aug 26-13 Reviewing TCPL responses Combined 1.8 Prep 

Aug 27-13 Prepare for Settlement Conference Combined 4.2 Prep 

Aug 27-13 Telephone call from M. Ross Combined 0.5 Prep 

Aug 28-13 Prepare for Settlement Conference Combined 1.9 Prep 

Aug 28-13 Attendance at Settlement Conference; including meetings 
before and after with Intervenors 

Combined 7.8 Attend SC 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Aug 29-13 Preparation for and attendance at Settlement Conference Combined 5.6 Attend SC 

Aug 29-13 Telephone call from Intervenors re: timing Combined 0.9 Prep 

Sep 4-13 Reviewing revised evidence; prepare for hearing schedule Combined 3.4 Prep 

Sep 5-13 Preparation for and attendance at Pre-Hearing Conference Combined 5.9 Attend SC 

Sep 6-13 Prepare for hearing Combined 4.7 Prep 

Sep 8-13 Prepare for hearing Combined 3.1 Prep 

Sep 9-13 Prepare for hearing Combined 5.3 Prep 

Sep 10-13 Prepare for hearing Combined 5.3 Prep 

Sep 11-13 Prepare for hearing Combined 6.4 Prep 

Sep 11-13 Reviewing confidential term sheet; prepare for changes to Combined 2.4 Prep 
Applications 

Sep 12-13 Prepare for and attend hearing; meeting with intervenors; 
prepare for Technical Conference 

Combined 7.8 Attend TC 

Sep 13-13 Prepare for and attend Technical Conference; reviewing 
transcript 

Combined 6.8 Attend TC 

Sep 15-13 Prepare for hearing Combined 3.7 Prep 

Sep 16-13 Prepare for and attend Technical Conference Combined 7.1 Attend TC 

Sep 17-13 Prepare for hearing Combined 3.2 Prep 

Sep 18-13 Prepare for hearing Combined 4.3 Prep 

Sep 19-13 Prepare for and attend hearing Combined 6.3 Attend OH 

Sep 20-13 Reviewing transcript; prepare for panel 2 EGD Combined 2.1 Prep 

Sep 23-13 Reviewing evidence; telephone call to J. Girvan; meeting with Combined 4.0 Prep 
K. Dullet re: cross-examinations; reviewing EGD Undertaking 
Responses 

Sep 24-13 Reviewing transcript Combined 1.1 Prep 

Sep 25-13 Reviewing undertakings from Union Combined 2.2 Prep 

Sep 26-13 Telephone call from J. Girvan re: cross-examination of Combined 0.5 Prep 
ED/GEC; meeting with K. Dullet 

Oct 1-13 Reviewing undertaking responses and relevant evidence Combined 2.4 Prep 

Oct 1-13 Reviewing EGD updated evidence Combined 0.4 Prep 

Oct 1-13 Telephone call from intervenors re: Interrogatory Responses 
on TCPL tolls based on term sheet 

Combined 0.6 Prep 

Oct 2-13 Reviewing EGD undertaking responses Combined 1.3 Prep 

Oct 3-13 Reviewing EGD Interrogatory Responses Combined 0.2 Prep 

Oct 3-13 Reviewing Union Interrogatory Response J.3.5 and related 
tolls evidence 

Combined 1.1 Prep 

Oct 7-13 Reviewing GTA material; telephone call to C. Smith; prepare 
for further cross-examination; meeting with K. Dullet 

Combined 5.1 Prep 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Oct 8-13 Reviewing SEC Joint Panel Compendium; telephone call to Combined 2.8 Prep 
K. Dullet; reviewing issues for cross-examination 

Oct 9-13 Reviewing transcript; reviewing related emails; telephone call 
from K. Dullet 

Combined 2.9 Prep 

Oct 10-13 Email exchange and telephone call with K. Dullet re: Joint Combined 0.5 Prep 
Panel and EGD Panel 

Oct 23-13 Reviewing Argument-in-Chief of Union and EGD Combine 3.1 Argument 

Oct 31-13 Reviewing evidence; prepare Argument; telephone call from Combined 4.2 Argument 
Board staff 

Nov 1-13 Reviewing Settlement Agreement; telephone call from M. Combined 7.1 Argument 
Miller; telephone call from C. Smith; telephone call from 
intervenors; drafting emails; reviewing TCPL Supplementary 
Evidence 

Nov 2-13 Reviewing Settlement Agreement; reviewing transcripts; 
emails and telephone calls to and from intervenors 

Combined 5.1 Argument 

Nov 4-13 Telephone call from M. Miller; telephone call from C. Smith; 
telephone call from J. Girvan; drafting submissions 

Combined 6.2 Argument 

Nov 4-13 Drafting emails re: process for Settlement Agreement Combined 0.6 Argument 

Nov 5-13 Emails to and from Board re: Settlement Agreement; 
discussions with intervenors; drafting submissions 

Combined 7.2 Argument 

Nov 6-13 Telephone call from M. Miller; telephone call from C. Smith; 
telephone call from J. Girvan; emails to and from intervenors; 
reviewing provisions relating to Settlement Agreement; 
reviewing transcripts; drafting submissions 

Combined 8.4 Argument 

Nov 7-13 Emails and telephone calls to and from intervenors, Board 
counsel and C. Smith re: Settlement Agreement and 
supplemental evidence; drafting submissions 

Combined 5.6 Argument 

Nov 8-13 Reviewing revised Exhibits and undertakings from EGD and Combined 4.1 Argument 
Union; reviewing transcripts 

Nov 10-13 Drafting submissions Combined 4.9 Argument 

Nov 11-13 Drafting submissions Combined 7.3 Argument 

Nov 12-13 Drafting submissions; reviewing submissions from LPMA and Combined 8.2 Argument 
City of Kitchener 

Nov 13-13 Reviewing Board staff submissions; drafting submissions Combined 7.8 Argument 

Nov 14-13 Drafting submissions Combined 6.1 Argument 

Nov 15-13 Finalizing submissions Combined 1.6 Argument 

Nov 15-13 Reviewing written submissions of other intervenors Combined 3.7 Argument 

Nov 18-13 Reviewing submissions of intervenors Combined 2.3 Argument 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Nov 25-13 Reviewing Reply Argument Combined 2.8 Argument 

Nov 26-13 Reviewing Reply Argument Combined 0.8 Argument 

Jan 30-14 Reviewing Decision Combined 1.2 Prep 

Jan 31-14 Reviewing Decision Combined 1.3 Prep 

Feb 4-14 Reviewing EGD Draft Rate Order Combined 0.6 Prep 

Feb 10-14 Reviewing Accounting Order for Parkway West Combined 0.3 Prep 

Feb 18-14 Reviewing draft Accounting Order and Board staff comments Combined 0.6 Prep 

TOTAL HOURS for Vince DeRose: 407.8 

Hours Fees 

Prep 254.3 x $290.00/hr = 73,747.00 

Attend TC 30.8 x $290.00/hr = 8,932.00 

Attend SC 19.3 x $290.00/hr = 5,597.00 

Attend OH 6.3 x $290.00/hr = 1,827.00 

Argument 97.1 x $290.00/hr = 28,159.00 

407.8 TOTAL FEES for Vince DeRose: $118,262.00 
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Borden Ladner Gervais 
BILLABLE EXPENSE REPORT 

NAME: 	 Vince DeRose 	 DATE: 	 11-Jun-13 

DE RoS 	— 
BILLABLE INFORMATION: 

Client File No./Name: 339583-000146 (CME re: Enbridge Gas - GTA Project) 
Technical Conference - June 12-13, 2013 

EXPENSES 

Transportation(Air, Bus,Train) 

Total Kilometers 

Canadian Expense 	Expenses 
Total 	 Outside 
Expense 	Pre Tax 	 HST 	Canada  

$ 687.32 	60803-4'  r7q,e)g 	$  

$ 

 

 

Rate $ 	0.45 

      

Car Rental 

Taxis 

Hotel / Lodging 

Food and Drink 

Parking 

Long Distance 

Miscellaneous (specify) 

TOTALS: 

       

       

       

       

       

       

       

$ 687.32 

 

g ,sa4 790 0 

  

otal Expenses 	 $ 	687.32 

Less: Travel Advance 

Reimbursement Total (CDN) 	$ 	687.32 

1.  
2.  

Expenses are to be remitted within one week of being incurred 
Original receipts are required for all items 
Non-billable  ex.enses  must  be  approved by Group Lea. 

MMIPSISISWV sga0N04100" A;;W AWWININF' %WA ogaIiite 

    

PROFESSIONAL/GROUP LEADER APPROVAL: 	 Signature 
(check here if by e-mail approval a tached 

OTT01-#5215994-v6-Billable_Expense_Report 



From: 	 DeRose, Vincent J. 
Sent: 	 June-11-13 2:13 PM 
To: 	 Thomson, Kim 
Subject: 	 FW: Itinerary - Please do not reply to this email 

From: PorterAirlines©flyporter.com  [mailto:PorterAirlines@flyporter.com]  
Sent: June-11-13 2:00 PM 
To: DeRose, Vincent J. 
Subject: Itinerary - Please do not reply to this email 

porter 
porter 
porter 
porter 

Passenger Itinerary 

Thank you very much for your business. We have confirmed your reservation in our system. You will not 

receive a paper ticket. Please review flight information for accuracy and make note of ID requirements 

and recommended check-in times. You may print this itinerary for your reference. 

MR. VINCENT J DEROSE 

11 KITIMAT CRES 

OTTAWA, ON K2H 7G4 

CANADA 

Confirmation Number: WCNRNK 	Agent Name: 	 3700003625 

Booking Date: 
	

11 Jun 2013 	 Booked By: 

Passenger Information: 

     

       

Name 	 VlPorter Number 	Flight #/Seat # 

Mr. Vincent J DEROSE 	 3700003625 	 252/NA 261/NA 

  

       

Flight Information: 

Date 	Flight 	Depart 	 Arrive 
	

Stops 

12 Jun 2013 252 	 Ottawa (YOW) 	 Toronto (YTZ) 

10:25 	 11:25 

1 



13 Jun 2013 261 
	

Toronto (YTZ) 	 Ottawa (YOW) 

14:00 	 14:56 

Fare Summary (CAD): 

        

Base Fare: 

Air Traveller Security Charge: 

NAV and Surcharges: 

Airport Improvement Fee: 

Harmonized Sales Tax: 

   

$530.00 

$14.24 

$24.00 

$40.00 

$79.08 f-/S-r 

60g0j4 IJE-r 

-19.0 8  457 

     

   

Total Fare Price: 

   

$687.32 

         

Visa: 
	

C $687.32 

Balance Due: 
	

$0.00 

GST/HST Number: 841583271 	 QST Number: 1212573775 

Baggage Policy: 

TWO items of carry-on baggage are permitted per fare-paying passenger. 

• Carry-on baggage is limited to two pieces: 

o 1 standard article not exceeding 55 cm x 40 cm x 23 cm (21.5" x 15.5" x 9") and weighing 

less than 9 kg (20 Ibs) 

o 1 personal article not exceeding 43 cm x 33 cm x 16 cm (17" x 13" x 6") and weighing 

less than 9 kg (20 Ibs) 

• Items that are not permitted in carry-on baggage aboard the aircraft are those that present a 

potential hazard. They include, but are not limited to, weapons, tools, restraining devices, toy 

weapons, cutting and puncturing devices (knives, box cutters, scissors, straight razors) ice skates 

and other hazardous items as defined and regulated by law including explosives, poisons, and 

other toxic materials. 

• All carry-on baggage must fit in the sizing units located both at check-in and the gate areas. 

• On board the aircraft, all carry-on baggage must be stowed under the seat or in the overhead 

compartments. 

• The following items are not counted as carry-on: coats, cameras, receptacles containing human 

remains, containers carrying life sustaining items, strollers, child restraint systems, crutches, 

canes, walkers and other such items. 

• Porter may require that an item of carry-on baggage travel as checked luggage if the bag cannot 

be safely stowed in the cabin. 

ONE item of checked baggage is permitted, free of charge, per fare-paying passenger. 

• One piece of checked baggage is accepted free of charge for each fare paying passenger. 

• The total combined weight of all checked baggage is limited to 23 kg (50 Ibs). 

• The weight of the baggage is combinable for passengers booked under the same reservation file. 

• A second piece of checked baggage is permitted for a charge of $20 CAD/USD per direction. 

2 



Borden Ladner Gervais 

BILLABLE EXPENSE REPORT 

NAME: Vince DeRose DATE: 	 27-Jun-13 

DE_ 	E 7vrJ 	1)3  

 

+.• 

 

   

k 

BILLABLE INFORMATION: 

Client File No./Name: 339583-000146 (CME re: Enbridge Gas - GTA Project) 
Technical Conference - June 12-13, 2013 

 

Canadian Expense  
Total 
Expense 	Pre Tax 

   

Expenses 
Outside 
Canada  EXPENSES 

 

HST 

 

      

Transportation(Air,Bus,Train) 

Total Kilometers 
Rate $ 	0.45 

Car Rental 

Taxis 	 $ 114.00 	100. gg 	13. /.2. 

Hotel / Lodging 	 $ 219.22 	$ 	194.00 	$ 25.22  

Food and Drink 	 $ 	10.74 	q.50 	i .;AL-1-  

Parking 	 $ 38.00 $ 33.63 $ 4.37 

Long Distance 

Miscellaneous (specify) 

TOTALS: 

         

         

$ 381.96 

 

• '333.,01 	qs $ 

Expenses 	$ 	381.96 

          

Less: Travel Advance 

Reimbursement Total (CDN) 	381.96 

Expenses are to be remitted within one week of being incurred 
2. 	 Original receipts are required for all items 

Non-billable  expenses  must be approved  by  Group Leader 
. 	. 	 l 

::.>":•??'.0•M> 	 "4,  A. 	4: • ... ' ............... 

PROFESSIONAL/GROUP LEADER APPROVAL: 	 Signature 
(check here if by e-mail approval 	ched)I 	 

OTT01-#5215994-v6-Billable_Expense_Report 



www.diamondtaxi.ca  

DATE 
FROM MEM= 
TO  y  

416-366-6868 
AMT $ 	  

RECEIPT 

CALL NO. 	  DATE 

CAB NO. 	17413 	 AMOUNT $ 

DRIVER'S NAME 

FROM 	  

DRIVER'S HST NO. 
(if applicable) 

RECEIPT MI 10 
416-751-5555 LM3 

BECK TAXI 

ollk) 

se
e  

re
ve

rs
e  

o
r  

y o
u
r  e

n t
ry

  c
od

e
  t
o

  Cab N❑ 

From 

To 

,/,,T  Amount 

Signature 

H.S.T. 	  

DRIVER'S NAME 	  
CAB# 	 FARE INCLUDES HST 

as 'notional' or applied to the drive 
The Driver is an Independent Cont 	 T Input credit may be claimed 

and Taxi Ltd. 
	Thank You 

RECEIPT 

CALL NO 

CAB NO.  

DRIVER'S NAME 

TO  	4-- 	(.1 .-‘ .1(1. 
NOTE: AMOUNT SHOWN ABOVE INCLUDES HST 

	
DRIVER'S HST NO. 

may be claimed as 'NOTIONAL" or applied to driver's 
Driver is an Independent Contractor, any HST Input Credit (if applicable) 

registration number, not Co-op Cabs. 

HST# 

DATE% 	 • 

	 AMOUNT 	 

FROM 

TO 	  

NOTE:AMOUNT SHOWN ABOVE INCLUDES HST 
Driver is an Independent Contractor, any HST Input Credit 
may be claimed as "NOTIONAL' or applied to driver'e 
registration number, net Co-op Calla 



Aeroport d'Ottawa Airport 

Exit 2 	13/06/13 14:08 
Receipt 053033 

Ticket/Billet 
P1 - No. 012284 
12/06/13 09:09 - 
13/06/13 14:08 
Period ldShO' 
(CAN) 	 $38.00 

(:1=--)  
Total 	

2 
 

Payment Received 
VISA 	 $38.00 
XXXXXXXXXXXX 	01/17 
Merch:82008580037 
Auth:480403 
Type: Swiped 

Sub Total 
HST 	13% 

$33.63 
4.37  Hsi  

- 	• • 	 -77 

** Customer Copy ** 
Billy Bishop Cafe 

Tab: 30001 
JAYCEE 	6113/2013 12:24 PM 

Transaction # 	314590 
Visa 

TYPE: PURCHASE 

ORDER ID: 00000342748-1-122409 
CARD NUM: **k*****K*1 

ACCOUNT: VISA 

DATE: 2013-06-13 12:24:13 
REF NUM 209125640011911170 C 	Cio  So .ellg=r 
AU1H CODE: 115832 

/0a q- 
,HST#TVH 898569942RT.CAD 
ItiGood day Au revoir 

      

 

• 
$10,121„) 

  

AMOUN1 

 

       

APP LABEL 	SCOIIABANK VISA 
EMV AID 	A0000000031010 
ARQC TVR 	0000008000 
AH614, 	 813608AC66E4F3FF 

Verified by PIN 

01 APPROVED - THANK YOU 027 

*Retain this copy for your records* 

HST Registration# 
84158 3073 RI 0001 



14  ONE KING WEST 
HOTEL • RESIDENCE 

DeRose, Mr. Vince 
Borden Ladner Gervais 
100 Queen Street 
Ottawa, ON K1P 1J9 
Canada 

FOLIO NO.: 
	10V2YM 

ROOM NO.: 
	1204 	AGENT: CF 

ARRIVE: 
	 06/12/13 

DEPART: 
	 06/13/13 

RATE/PACKAGE: 
	194.00 

RATE/PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Corporate Rate 
NO. IN PARTY: 	1 

DEPOSIT REC'D: 	219.22 

06/12/13 40202 1 Corporate Rate 194.00 
06/12/13 TXHST 1 HST 
06/13/13 VISA 1 XXX) 219.22 

Subtotals 219.22 219.22 

PAID IN FULL --- THANK YOU! 

I agree that my liability for this bill is not waived and agree to be held personally liable in the event that the indicated person, company, or 
association fails to pay for any or the full amount of these charges. 

Guest Signature:  	 HST # 83097 7690 RT0001 

1 King Street West Toronto, Ontario M5H 1A1 Main: 416.548.8100 Fax: 416.548.8101 www.onekingwest.com  



Borden Ladner Gervais 
BILLABLE EXPENSE REPORT 

NAME: 	 Vince DeRose 	DATE: 	 30-Aug-13  

bERosE Pvc 	/3 
BILLABLE INFORMATION: 

Client File No./Name: 339583/000158 (CME re: EGD and Union - Combined Facilities) 
Settlement Conference - August 28 and 29, 2013 

Canadian Expense 	Expenses 
Total 	 Outside 

EXPENSES 	 Expense 	Pre Tax 	 HST 	Canada  

Transportation(Air,Bus,Train) 	$ 499.74 	4412.0N 	5'70 SO 

Total Kilometers 	  
Rate $ 	0.45 

Car Rental 

Taxis 	 $ 113.00 

Hotel / Lodging 	 $ 294.65 

Food and Drink 	 $ 	4.15 

Parking 	 $ 	38.00 

Long Distance 

Miscellaneous (specify) 

TOTALS: 

           

           

$ 949.54  si-1-0,.2q toq.a5  $ 

            

            

I  00.00 0.00 

cU0.1/6 33.90 

3067 0.+0 

33.63 4.37 

"NROMON,q1N ;4;;MAC4::WV. 
mn=P. 

Total Expenses 	 949.54  

Less: Travel Advance 

Reimbursement Total (CDN) 	949.54  

2. 
Expenses are to be remitted within one week of being incurred 
Original receipts are required for all items 
Non-billable  expenses  must be a•proved  b  Group Leader 

. 	i Mt: • 	...*..4MA....4. 4..441'45"6:4:4,:::•:,:tikA: 10.$14:111111111110P,  . 	. 	. 
,7 

• MirKERVAOWN YAnlare, • 4::*; 	37 	3' 	"`"-• 	" • • • • 

PROFESSIONAL/GROUP LEADER APPROVAL: 	 Signature 

 

(check here if by e-mail approval attached) 	 

OTT01-#5215994-v4A-Billable_Expense_Report 



From: 
	

PorterAirlines@flyporter.com  

Sent: 
	

August-27-13 2:35 PM 

To: 
	

DeRose, Vincent J. 

Subject: 
	

Itinerary - Please do not reply to this email 

porter 
porter 
porter 
porter 

Passenger Itinerary 

Thank you very much for your business. We have confirmed your reservation in our system. You will not 

receive a paper ticket. Please review flight information for accuracy and make note of ID requirements 

and recommended check-in times. You may print this itinerary for your reference. 

MR. VINCENT J DEROSE 

11 KITIMAT CRES 

OTTAWA, ON K2H 7G4 

CANADA 

Confirmation Number: VZREFB 	Agent Name: 	 3700003625 

Booking Date: 
	

27 Aug 2013 	 Booked By: 

Passenger Information: 

   

    

Name 
	

VlPorter Number 	Flight #/Seat # 

Mr. Vincent 3 DEROSE 
	

3700003625 	 244/NA 263/NA 

Flight Information: 

   

Date 	Flight 	Depart 	 Arrive 

28 Aug 2013 244 	 Ottawa (YOW) 	 Toronto (YTZ) 

07:15 	 08:15 

29 Aug 2013 263 	 Toronto (YTZ) 	 Ottawa (YOW) 

15:00 	 15:56 

Stops 

Fare Summary (CAD): 

1 



Base Fare: 

Air Traveller Security Charge: 

NAV and Surcharges: 

Airport Improvement Fee: 

Harmonized Sales Tax: 

$364.00 

$14.24 

$24.00 

$40.00 

$57.50  psi' 

Total Fare Price: 	 $499.74 

Visa: 	 $499.74 

Balance Due: 	 $0.00 

GST/HST Number: 841583271 	 QST Number: 1212573775 

Baggage Policy: 

TWO items of carry-on baggage are permitted per fare-paying passenger. 

• Carry-on baggage is limited to two pieces: 

o 1 standard article not exceeding 55 cm x 40 cm x 23 cm (21.5" x 15.5" x 9") and weighing 

less than 9 kg (20 Ib) 

o 1 personal article not exceeding 43 cm x 33 cm x 16 cm (17" x 13" x 6") and weighing 

less than 9 kg (20 Ib) 

• Items that are not permitted in carry-on baggage aboard the aircraft are those that present a 

potential hazard. They include, but are not limited to, weapons, tools, restraining devices, toy 

weapons, cutting and puncturing devices (knives, box cutters, scissors, straight razors) ice skates 

and other hazardous items as defined and regulated by law including explosives, poisons, and 

other toxic materials. 

• All carry-on baggage must fit in the sizing units located both at check-in and the gate areas. 

• On board the aircraft, all carry-on baggage must be stowed under the seat or in the overhead 

compartments. 

• The following items are not counted as carry-on: coats, cameras, receptacles containing human 

remains, containers carrying life sustaining items, strollers, child restraint systems, crutches, 

canes, walkers and other such items. 

• Porter may require that an item of carry-on baggage travel as checked luggage if the bag cannot 

be safely stowed in the cabin. 

For travel before August 1, 2013 or for flights booked before July 3, 2013 

ONE item of checked baggage is permitted, free of charge, per fare-paying passenger. 

• One piece of checked baggage is accepted free of charge for each fare paying passenger. 

• The total combined weight of all checked baggage is limited to 23 kg (50 Ib). 

• The weight of the baggage is combinable for passengers booked under the same reservation file. 

• A second piece of checked baggage is permitted for a charge of $20 CAD/USD per direction. 

• There is a $50 CAD/USD charge per additional bag, over and above 2 pieces of baggage. 

• Any combined weight above 23 kg (50 lb) will be charged at a rate of $5 CAD/USD per kg. 

• No single piece can weigh more than 32 kilos (70 lb). 

• The maximum size allowed is 158 cm (62 in) total dimension (the sum of the length, width and 

5 '1 ,50  1-I sT 

1-1-1  q :74 

2 



DRIVER'S NAME 	 HST# 
CABM 	FARE INCLUDES HST 

The Driver is an Independent Contractor. any HST Input credit may be claimed 
as 'notional' or applied to the driver's HST registered number. not Diamond Tani Ltd. 

 

Thank You 

DATE 

FROM 	  
TO 	 1. .7  

416-366-6868 

9-e 	NAT  saKa ()  

www.diamondtaxi.ca  

INDEPENDENT CAB OWNERS' 
CO-OPERATIVE INCORPORATED 

TORONTO, ONTARIO 

  

Date:    FARE: 

From:  /4 tray 1-` 	 _TIP: 

To:  c 0 c-)  11 C2.,) (— 	TOTAL: 

Cab#  fi y  	Dr 	 

1 
Flat rates available for Airport, Out of Town, 

Business Trips, Sightseeing, Etc: Ask Driver for details. 

(7.717,  
HST INCLUDED 

DRIVERS N 

CAB NO - 	  

FROM 	 

TO: 	

AMOUNT ON METER 

GRATUITY (IF ANY)  

TOTAL 

DRIVER MUST OBTAIN 

ACCOUNT # 	  

REFERENCE # 	  

PARCEL REC'D BY 	  

PRINT NAME 	  

SIGNATURE 	

CALL NO.     DATE  14 1 61))  

CAB NO. 	  AMOUNT $  C9 g.0°  

DRIVER'S NAME 	  

FROM VeAh..."5  

TO 	 
NOTE: AMOUNT SHOWN ABOVE INCLUDES HST 
Driver is an Independent Contractor, any HST Input Credit 
may be claimed as "NOTIONAL" or applied to driver's 
registration number, not Co-op Cabs. 

DRIVER'S HST NO. 
(if applicable) 



Aeroport d'Ottawa Airport 

Exit 4 	29/08/13 16:07 

Receipt 099187 

Ticket/Billet 

P1 - No. 046083 

28/08/13 06:16 -

29/08/13 16:07 -

Period 1d9h52'  

(CAN) 	 $38.00 

Total 	 (' S38.0(1) 

Payment Received 

VISA 	 338.00 

XXXXXXXXXXX) 	 01/17 

Merch:82008580037 

Auth:411085 

Type: Swiped 

Sub Total 

HST 	13% 

,HST#TVH 898569942RT.CAD 

5Good day Au revoir 

333.63 

4.37 i.151- 

WI UtV JU7 LLI 	viJui 

Aroma Espresso Bar 
Yonge & Eglinton 

2300 Yonge St, Toronto, ON 
Tel: (416) 987-7288 

265 Jason 1,  

Chk 3729 	VINCA 
Aug28'13 09•20AM 
*** Reprint *** 

Cl osed Check 
Reprint 

1 TO Lg Latte 	 $3.95 
CASH 	 $10.00 

Subtotal 	 $3.95 
1-1ST 5% 	 $0.20 
Paid 	

(--g4F) Change Due 
	-265 Check Closed 09:20AM 	 

*Free Wi-Fi* 

Connect Password : aroma123 
7" oir 	'1,-)1 	c-In4 



THE 

Au-Ma/27 
ROYAL YORK 

Room 10131 

Folio # 1883620 
Cashier # 759 

Page # 1 of 1 
100 Front Street W 
Toronto, ON, Canada M5J 1E3 
T (416) 368-2511 F (416) 368-2884 
G.S.T. Registration # 832522213 

Borden Ladner Gervais 
Mr Vince Derose 
100 Queen St 
Ottawa ON K2H 7K1 
Canada 

Invoice No. 

Arrival 
Departure 

08-28-13 
08-29-13 

Date 	Description 
	

Additional Information 
	

Charges 	Credits 

08-28-13 
	

Refreshment Centre Food SaIeE Room# 10131 : -CHECK# 50703 Torn 
	

12.43 
Ranch Cashews 5 

08-28-13 
	

Refreshment Centre Mineral Sa Room# 10131 : CHECK# 50710 Evian 750 
	

9.61 
ml Sports 

08-28-13 

08-28-13 

08-28-13 

08-28-13 

08-29-13 

Room Charge 

HST - Rooms 

DMP Fee* 

HST-DMP Fee* 

Visa XXDOK 

235.00 

30.55 

6.25 

0.81 

294.65 

Total 
	

294.65 	294.65 

0.00 
0.00 
0.00 
0.00 

GST Summary 
Room : 
F&B : 
Other : 
Total : 

HST Summary 
Room : 
F&B : 
Other : 
Total : 

Balance Due 

RooM 

MEAL. 

0.00 

NET 	1-1 ST 

a)+1 .a5  
ig,G0 
too . '75 

30.55 
0.00 
0.81 

31.36 

3(.36 
a  .54 
33.80 

Thank you for choosing Fairmont Hotels & Resorts. 
To provide feedback about your stay please contact Heather McCrory, General Manager, at Heather. 

We also invite you to share memories of your experience on our community forum - visit www.ev 
cCroryG Fairmont.com. 

mesa iginal.com. 

For information or reservations, visit us at 
www.fairmont.com  or call Fairmont Hotels & Resorts from : 
United States or Canada 1 BOO 441 1414 

I agree that my liability for this bill is not waived and I agree to be held personally liable in the event that the 
Indicated person, company or association falls to pay for any part of or the full amount of these charges. Overdue 
balance subject lo a surcharge al the rale 011.5% per month after one month (18.00% per annum.) 
I have accepted delivery of The Globe and Mail, Had I refused, I would have been eligible for a $1.00 (Mon-Fri) 
and $2.00 (Sat ) credit to my account (Al participating hotels.) 

' Destination Marketing Program Fee 

Thank you for choosing to stay with Fairmont Hotels & Resorts 



Borden Ladner Gervais 
BILLABLE EXPENSE REPORT 

NAME: 	 Vince DeRose 	 DATE: 	 19-Sep-13 

DE ROSE SEP 5 /13 
BILLABLE INFORMATION: 

Client File No./Name: 339583-000158 (CME re: EGD and Union — Combined Facilities) 
Pre-Hearing Conference - Sept. 5, 2013 

Canadian Expense 	Expenses 
Total 	 Outside 
Expense 	Pre Tax 	 HST 	Canada 

$ 585.62 	5/ 	67..38 
EXPENSES 

Transportation(Air,Bus,Train) 

Total Kilometers 
Rate $ 	0.45 

             

Car Rental 

Taxis 

Hotel / Lodging 

Food and Drink 

Parking 

Long Distance 

Miscellaneous (specify) 

TOTALS: 

              

              

              

              

              

              

              

  

$ 585.62 

       

          

Total Expenses 

 

585.62 

               

Less: Travel Advance 

Reimbursement Total (CDN) 585.62 

  

"""""-----xv444444,4z::::: (47,*03:::5:**U0.42,5*Aiia:aze.AgiNgigi40:;?:§; BOUS1101161111161112ESESIISISSIBASSINEWSSEMEMENNINN.,...1':.n.RWASEEMERV-.16.5..W.Miggighai'Va'*::::#:::::#:,4WiSMA.,441; 

2.  
3.  

Expenses are to be remitted within one week of being incurred 
Original receipts are required for all items 
Non-billable expenses must be approved by Group Leader 

PROFESSIONAL/GROUP LEADER APPROVAL: 	 Signature 
(check here if by e-mail approval attached) 

OTT01-#5215994-v6-Billable_Expense_Report 



Itinerary - Porter Airlines 

Booking Information 
You will need to provide this information with proof of identification for access to the 
items on your itinerary.  

Status: 
	

Confirmed 

Confirmation number: 	Q773KZ 
Booking date: 
	

Wednesday, September 04, 2013 

Flight Details 

Departing Flight 

Ottawa (YOW) to Toronto (YTZ) 

September-05-13 Flight PD 246 	 Depart from Ottawa (YOW) at 8:05 AM 

Bombardier Q400 	Arrive in Toronto (YTZ) at 9:05 AM 

Returning Flight 

Toronto (YTZ) to Ottawa (YOW) 

September-05-13 Flight PD 261 	 Depart from Toronto (YTZ) at 2:00 PM 

Bombardier Q400 	Arrive in Ottawa (YOW) at 2:56 PM 

Auto Check-in 

No need to check-in; Auto Check-in will do it for you! 

Prior to departure, Porter will issue a print friendly version and an electronic version of your boarding pass. It will be 
attached to the Flight Reminder sent to the email address on file. Before arriving at the airport, please print a paper copy of 
your boarding pass or verify that you are able to view the electronic version of the boarding pass on your internet enabled  
mobile device. 

Not all reservations are eligible for Auto Check-in; please visit Auto Check-in for further details. 

Seat Selection 

Firm fare reservations will be charged $15 CAD/USD plus tax, per flight, per seat, for seat selection. There is no additional 
charge for Flexible or Freedom fare. 

Premium Seats 
Firm fare reservations will be charged $30 CAD/USD plus tax, per flight, per seat, for Premium Seat selection. Flexible and 
Freedom fares will be charged $15 CAD/USD plus tax, per flight, per seat. Seat selection fees are non-refundable. 

Visit My Bookings to pre-select a seat more than 24 hours before a flight. After you have been Auto Checked-in and a seat 
has been assigned, visit Web Check-in to change seats. 

You can select your seat preferences (aisle or window and the area of the plane) through your VIPorter account. We will 
attempt to accommodate your preferences when automatically assigning seats. 

For operational reasons, Porter reserves the right to change seats at any time.  

Contact Information 

httns://www.flynorter.com/Fliaht/Itineranaculture—en-CA 	 04/09/2013 



Itinerary - Porter Airlines 

Address 

Mr. Vincent J DeRose 

11 Kitimat Cres 

Ottawa, ON K2H 7G4 

Canada 

Phone number(s) 

Home : 

Business : 613-787-3589 

Mobile : 

Email address(es) 

vderose@blg.com  

Passenger Details 

Passenger Details 

1. Vincent J DeRose 	 Adult 	 Male 13/02/1972 

Flight #/Seat #:PD 246/NA 

PD 261/NA 

Payment 

Summary 

Details Charge 

Base Fare $ 440.00 

Air Traveller Security Charge $ 14.24 

NAV and Surcharges $ 24.00 

Airport Improvement Fee $ 40.00 

Harmonized Sales Tax $ 67.38 

Total Fare Price $ 585.62 CAD 	' 

.51g.,94-QE-r 

(0'7.3g Ns-r- 

585 

Payment Details 

Details 
	

Status 
	 Charge 

Credit Card - VI 
	 (Approved) 	 $ 585.62 

Amount Paid 
	

$ 585.62 CAD 

Fare Rules 

httns://www.flyporter.com/Flight/Itinerary?eulture=en-CA 	 04/09/2013 



Borden Ladner Gervais 
BILLABLE EXPENSE REPORT 

NAME: Vince DeRose DATE: 	 26-Sep-13 

kaSE SE p 5 //3 
BILLABLE INFORMATION: 

Client File No./Name: 339583-000158 (CME re: EGD and Union — Combined Facilities) 
Pre-Hearing Conference - Sept. 5, 2013 

 

Canadian Expense  
Total 
Expense 	Pre Tax 

   

Expenses 
Outside 
Canada  EXPENSES 

 

HST 

      

Transportation(Air,Bus,Train) 

Total Kilometers 

       

Rate $ 	0.45 

      

Car Rental 

Taxis 

Hotel / Lodging 

Food and Drink 

Parking 

Long Distance 

Miscellaneous (specify) 

TOTALS: 

70.00 	(.95 	5()5 

x ,06 	$ 

Total Expenses 	 70.00 

Less: Travel Advance 

$ 70.00 

Reimbursement Total (CDN) 
	

70.00 

gg42:atigg4t.:4.igg+.fiaX:''.'.:Vg.g5:.EggfiggaZEEEEMEN 
Expenses are to be remitted within one week of being incurred 

2. 	 Original receipts are required for all items 
Non-billable expenses must be approved by Group Leader 

PROFESSIONAL/GROUP LEADER APPROVAL: 	 Signature 
(check here if by e-mail approval attached)[ 	I 

OTT01-#5215994-v6A-Billable_Expense_Report 



CALL NO. 	 

CAB NO. 

DRIVER'S NAME 

FROM 	  

TO 	  

NOTE: AMOUNT SHOWN ABOVE INCLUDES HST 
Driver is an Independent Contractor, any HST Input Credit 
may be claimed as NOTIONAL" or applied to driver's 
registration number, not Co-op Cabs 

DRIVER'S HST NO 
(if applicable) 

.crowntaxi.c 

DATE6ciod-  5--  TIME 	am/pm 

Fe-\ 

DRIVERS NAME - 

CAB NO • 	  

Si,  t—r 

TO:  A v 7 'I  

AMOUNT ON METER 

GRATUITY (IF ANY) 

TOTAL Z E 00 

DRIVER MUST OBTAIN 

ACCOUNT # 	  

REFERENCE # 	  

PARCEL REC'D BY 	  

PRINT NAME 	  

SIGNATURE 	  



Borden Ladner Gervais 
BILLABLE EXPENSE REPORT 

NAME: 	 Vince DeRose DATE: 	 19-Sep-13 

DEROSE SEP U-13 /3 
BILLABLE INFORMATION: 

Client File No./Name: 339583-000158 (CME re: EGD and Union — Combined Facilities) 
Oral Hearing - Sept. 12-13, 2013 

Canadian Expense 	Expenses 
Total 	 Outside 
Expense 	Pre Tax 	 HST 	Canada 

$ 585.62 	578.Q÷ 67.-38 
EXPENSES 

Transportation(Air, Bus,Train) 

Total Kilometers 
Rate $ 	0.45 

        

Car Rental 

Taxis 

Hotel / Lodging 

Food and Drink 

Parking 

Long Distance 

Miscellaneous (specify) 

TOTALS: 

         

         

         

         

         

         

         

  

$ 585.62 

     

$ 

Total Expenses 	 585.62 

Less: Travel Advance 

Reimbursement Total (CDN) 	 585.62 

• •••—••••• 
Xs§. 
1.  
2.  

Expenses are to be remitted within one week of being incurred 
Original receipts are required for all items 
Non-billable expenses must be approved by Group Leader 

PROFESSIONAL/GROUP LEADER APPROVAL: 	 Signature 
(check here if by e-mail approval attached) 

OTT01-#5215994-v6A-Billable_Expense_Report 



Itinerary - Porter Airlines 

Booking Information 
You will need to provide this information with proof of identification for access to the 
items on your itinerary. 

Status: 
	

Confirmed 

Confirmation number: 
	

Z21 R3L 

Booking date: 
	 Wednesday, September 11, 2013 

Flight Details 

Departing Flight 

Ottawa (YOW) to Toronto (YTZ) 

September-12-13 Flight PD 242 	 Depart from Ottawa (YOW) at 6:25 AM 

Bombardier Q400 	Arrive in Toronto (YTZ) at 7:25 AM 

Returning Flight 

Toronto (YTZ) to Ottawa (YOW) 

September-13-13 Flight PD 263 	 Depart from Toronto (YTZ) at 3:00 PM 

Bombardier Q400 	Arrive in Ottawa (YOW) at 3:56 PM 

Auto Check-in 

No need to check-in; Auto Check-in will do it for you! 

Prior to departure, Porter will issue a print friendly version and an electronic version of your boarding pass. It will be 
attached to the Flight Reminder sent to the email address on file. Before arriving at the airport, please print a paper copy of 
your boarding pass or verify that you are able to view the electronic version of the boarding pass on your internet enabled  
mobile device. 

Not all reservations are eligible for Auto Check-in; please visit Auto Check-in for further details. 

Seat Selection 

Firm fare reservations will be charged $15 CAD/USD plus tax, per flight, per seat, for seat selection. There is no additional 
charge for Flexible or Freedom fare. 

Premium Seats 
Firm fare reservations will be charged $30 CAD/USD plus tax, per flight, per seat, for Premium Seat selection. Flexible and 
Freedom fares will be charged $15 CAD/USD plus tax, per flight, per seat. Seat selection fees are non-refundable. 

Visit My Bookings to pre-select a seat more than 24 hours before a flight. After you have been Auto Checked-in and a seat 
has been assigned, visit Web Check-in to change seats. 

You can select your seat preferences (aisle or window and the area of the plane) through your VI Porter account. We will 
attempt to accommodate your preferences when automatically assigning seats. 

For operational reasons, Porter reserves the right to change seats at any time. 

haps://www.flyporter.com/Flight/My-Bookings/BookingDetails?culture=en-CA 	 12/09/2013 



Itinerary - Porter Airlines 

Contact Information 

Address 

Mr. Vincent J DeRose 

11 Kitimat Cres 

Ottawa, ON K2H 7G4 

Canada 

Phone number(s) 

Home : 

Business : 613-787-3589 

Mobile : 

Email address(es) 

vderose@b1g.com  

Passenger Details 

Passenger Details 

1. Vincent J DeRose 	 Adult 	 Male 13/02/1972 

Flight #/Seat #:PD 242/17C 

PD 263/NA 

Payment 

Summary 

Details 	 Charge 

Base Fare 	 $ 440.00 

Air Traveller Security Charge 	 $ 14.24 

NAV and Surcharges 	 $ 24.00 

Airport Improvement Fee 	 $ 40.00 

Harmonized Sales Tax 	 $ 67.38 

Total Fare Price 	 685.62 CAD ) 

8. 	',JET 
7.30 HST 

5g5.(002 

Payment Details 

Details 
	

Status 
	

Charge 

Credit Card - VI 
	 (Approved) 

	
$ 585.62 

Amount Paid 
	

$ 585.62 CAD 

Fare Rules 

https://www.flyporter.com/Flight/My-Bookings/BookingDetails?culture=en-CA 	 12/09/2013 



DATE: 	 24-Sep-13 NAME: Vince DeRose 

3 DE ROSE SEP is-13 

HST 

Expenses 
Outside 
Canada  EXPENSES 

Canadian Expense  
Total 
Expense 	Pre Tax 

$ 454.33 3 g6:18  50  -L2 	$ 

Borden Ladner Gervais 
BILLABLE EXPENSE REPORT 

BILLABLE INFORMATION: 

Client File No./Name: 339583-000158 (CME re: EGD and Union — Combined Facilities) 
Oral Hearing - Sept. 12-13, 2013 

Transportation(Air,Bus,Train) 

Total Kilometers 	  
Rate $ 	0.45 

Car Rental 

Taxis 

Hotel / Lodging 

Food and Drink 

Parking  

Long Distance 

Miscellaneous (specify) 

TOTALS: 

1. 
2, 
3. 

Mai 

	

$ 125.00 	I I 0 .6,2,  

$ 254.04  

	

$ 37.29 	1 1. 10 

	

$ 38.00 	33 . (0 3 	 

Total Expenses 

Less: Travel Advance 

Reimbursement Total (CDN) 

aiNVAMORCEMENDsmantog,51:9141g.411,11111:: 
Expenses are to be remitted within one week of being incurred 
Original receipts are required for all items 
Non-billable expenses must be  approved by  Group Leader 

	 %MEM: 474. 

OMR:: 'ANS 

PROFESSIONAL/GROUP LEADER APPROVAL 
(check here if by e-mail approval attached)] 	 

OTT01-#5215994-v6B-Billable_Expense_Report 

$ 	454.33 

454.33 
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Tr] VISA 

G.S.T. 

BECK TAXI 

,1.4" RECEIPT 
Cab No. 

From 1-13.1 3 vt 

DATE 

	 AMOUNT $ 	b  

DRIVER'S HST NO. 
(if applicable) 

NOTE: AMOUNT SHOWN ABOVE INCLUDES HST 
Driver is an Independent Contractor, any HST Input Credit 
may be claimed as "NOTIONAL" or applied to driver's 
registration number, not Co-op Cabs. 
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DRIVER'S HST NO. 
(il applicable) 

TO 

NOTE: AMOUNT. SHOWN ABOVE INCLUDES HST 
Driver is an Independent COntractor, any HST Input Credit 
may be claimed as 'wonomAr or applied to driver's 

registration number, not Co-op Cabs. 

To 	? 	4  

Date  'S tp 4 1 5   Amount  t)? / a °I)  
Signature 	  

CALL NO. 	 

CAB NO. _ 	 

DRIVER'S NAME 

FROM  YU'')—(1>  

TO 	0 - t. th f•--> • 

A6roport d' Ottawa Airport 

Exit 1 	13/09/13 15:10 
Receipt 024116 

Ticket/Billet 
P1 - No. 069679 
12/09/13 05:23 -
13/09/13 15:10 -
Period 1d9h48' 
(CAN) 

$33.63 
4.37 /...ts-r 

$38.00 

$38.00 

$38.00 

01/17 

.:1-IST#TVH 898569942RT.CAD 
?iGood day Au revoir 

BECK TAXI 

Oor RECEIPT 

Amount 

Signature 	  

Cab No 	  

From  141001̀  r 
To 	  

Date  &PI-  )`k.  

WSA 

G.S.T. 

DATE 
CALL NO. 

CAB NO. 

DRIVER'S NA 

FROM 

p_  <-11 
AMOUNT $ 	  

RECEIPT 

Total 

Payment Received 
VISA 
XXXXXXXXXXXX _ 
Merch:82008580037 
Auth:449499 
Type: Swiped 

Sub Total 
HST 	13% 



r. 
HILTON 

HHONORS 

\\F% 
1vALC OA. 

A` !CYO- 
are-, ea. 

CONK AD 
• • 

Hittno 

1) 

tif 

TAX SUMMARY 

L-71- - 	3  

t225 ° 

CHARGE TOTAL 

ROOM & TAX $219.00 $5.83 $28.47 

TOTAL PAID $219.00 $5.83 $28.47 

DMP 	 HST UMMARY OF TAXES 

$0.74 

$0.74 

Authorization / Autorisation i rn111121:s 

Purchases & Services / Achats & Services 

Taxes 

Establishment No. & Location 
trdel'etablissement & Location 

Check No. / Numero de folio 

790912 A 

DATE OF CHARGE 
Date de la Charge 

Account No. / Num4ro de compte 

Card Member Name / Nom Du Membre 

EslahlIshmenr a grees lo Irenvoit lo card holder lor payment 
Celahlisserrienl acceple de tranamettre 	diteMeur de la carte parole paler-neat 

Hilton 
TORONTO 

HILTON TORONTO 

145 Richmond Street West I Toronto, Ontario I M5H 2L2 

T: 416 869 3456 I F: 416 869 3187 

W: hilton.com  

Name and Address / Nom et Adresse 
DEROSE, VINCE 

15 BEAUMARIS DRIVE OTTAWA 

ONATRIO, K1Y2J4 
US 

Room/ Cha m bre 
Arrival Date/ Date d'arrivee 

Departure Date/ Date de depart  

2812/K1 
9/12/2013 3:35:00PM 
9/13/2013 

Adult/Child/ Adulte/Enfant 	1/0 
Room Rate/Tarif 	 219.00 

RATE PLAN 
	

LV5 

HH# 

AL: 
BONUS AL: 
	

CAR: 
CONFIRMATION NUMBER : 3539184525 

9/13/2013 	PAGE 	1 

DATE 	 DESCRIPTION ID REF. NO CHARGES 

9/12/2013 GUEST ROOM RIAN 3738968 $219.00 

9/12/2013 HST - ROOM TAX 13% RIAN 3738968 $28.47 

9/12/2013 DESTINATION MARKETING RIAN 3738968 $5.83 
PROGRAM 

9/12/2013 DESTINATION MKTG RIAN 3738968 $0.74 
PRnr"-tP AM - HST 

9/13/2013 VS SCOSTA 3739405 

BALANCE 

- _ 

$254.04 

$0.00 

CREDITS BALANCE 

  

  

Tips & Misc. / Pourboires & Divers 

  

    

HDPDH 
6eala,1V.10,1011.11 CARD MEMBER'S SIGNATURE / SIGNATURE MEMBRE 

 

TOTAL AMOUNT 
MONTANT TOTAL 

 

MERCHANDISE AND/OR SERVICES PURCHASED ON THIS CARD SHALL NOT BE RESOLD OR RETURNED FOR A CASH REFUND 
Les merchandises et/ou services achetes sur cette carte ne peuvent etre revendus ou retournes pour un remboursement en argent comptant. 

Payment Due Upon Receipt / Paiement dO a la reception 
HST No. 833657646 RT0001 

 

a AMERICAS • EUROPE • MIDDLE EAST • AFRICA • ASIA • AUSTRALASIA 



NINKI IZAKAYA 
133 RICHMOND ST W M5H2L3 

TORONTO 	ON 
22209791 

GW2220979101 

"" 	PURCHASE 	"" 
09-12-2013 	 19:03:57 

Acct # 	**********. 
Account Chequiog Card Type DP 

A0000002771010 	INTERAC 

Trace # 1213 

Inv. # 366 
Auth # 686360 RRN 001013200 

Purchase 	 $33.90 

Tip 
	

$3.39 

70t31 	 —4377Fr 

(00 ) APPROVEO -THAW YOU 
Retain this copy for your 

records 

Customer copy 

TRANSACTION RECORD 

## 0032 
Ninki Izakaya 

133 Richmond St. N, Suite 101 
Toronto,ON 

Phone (647) 748-2388 
Business # 818692907-rt0001 

Date: Sep 12, 	2013 	Time: 06:58PM 
Server: 	arisa 
Bill: 	0032 

1 Spicy Tuna Roll 8,00 
1 Spicy Salmpn P()11 7.00 
1 Red Org7onn 0505,4 01 9.00 
1 00:30W 6.00 

Subtotal 
HST 3.90 

Open Time : Sep 12,2013 06:53PM 

Come join us for Happy hours from 3pm-6pm 
Mon-Friday ! $7.9 for a tapa and a 

drink. And checkout our new set menu 
available only on Saturday at $9.99! 

Find us on facebockfor updates, random 
offers and giveaways. 

www.facebook.com/NinkiIzakaya  

3 , La. 
Tota l 
	

33 	 7. 

ICIRX Aklcuktr cL/qIMED 

0.'10 NET.  
PST 

41:1  02 	00 



Borden Ladner Gervais 
BILLABLE EXPENSE REPORT 

NAME: 	 Vince DeRose 	 DATE: 	 19-Sep-13 

De RoSE 	SEP /6 13 
BILLABLE INFORMATION: 

Client File No./Name: 339583-000158 (CME re: EGD and Union — Combined Facilities) 
Oral Hearing - Sept. 16, 2013 

EXPENSES 

Transportation(Air, Bus,Train) 

Canadian Expense 	Expenses 
Total 	 Outside 
Expense 	Pre Tax 	 HST 	Canada  

$ 585.62 sys..aq- 	61.3g  	 

Total Kilometers 

  

Rate $ 	0.45 

      

Car Rental 

Taxis 

Hotel / Lodging 

Food and Drink 

Parking 

Long Distance 

Miscellaneous (specify) 

TOTALS: 

          

          

          

          

          

          

          

          

$ 585.62 

      

      

      

Total Expenses 	585.62 

Less: Travel Advance 

Reimbursement Total (CDN) 	 585.62 

           

sris 	 gg;NWteMICaMtil .-;10."‘ !,.4 V;A 	ss,1 k4M. 	 ACD:Me 
1 
	

Expenses are to be remitted within one week of being incurred 
2. 	 Original receipts are required for all items 
3 
	

Non-billable expenses must be approved b Group Leader 
Izavier?*>,  -41111011snessmaven ,QMtlev!: 111115tai&MOMORMEnare*vatsmei. 

PROFESSIONAL/GROUP LEADER APPROVAL: 
(check here if by e-mail approval attached)! 

OTT01-#5215994-v6B-Billable_Expense_Report 



Confirmation 

Number: 

Booking Date: 

R4BTPF 	Agent Name: 	 3700003625 

15 Sep 2013 	 Booked By: 

Date 	Flight 	Depart 	 Arrive 

16 Sep 2013 242 	Ottawa (YOW) 	 Toronto (YTZ) 

06:25 	 07:25 

16 Sep 2013 269 	Toronto (YTZ) 	 Ottawa (YOW) 

Stops 

Passenger Itinerary 

Thank you very much for your business. We have confirmed your reservation in our system. You 

will not receive a paper ticket. Please review flight information for accuracy and make note of ID 

requirements and recommended check-in times. You may print this itinerary for your reference. 

MR. VINCENT 3 DEROSE 

11 KITIMAT CRES 

OTTAWA, ON K2H 7G4 

CANADA 

Passenger Information: 

Name 	 VlPorter Number 	Flight #/Seat # 

Mr. Vincent 3 DEROSE 	 3700003625 	 242/NA 269/NA 

Flight Information: 

From: 	 PorterAirlines@flyporter.com  
Sent: 	 September-15-13 12:52 PM 
To: 	 DeRose, Vincent J. 
Subject: 	 Itinerary - Please do not reply to this email 

porter 
More destinations. More affordably. 
Help us reach new destinations. Visit porterplans.com. 

4-, 



17:55 

Fare Summary (CAD): 

18:51 

Base Fare: $440.00 

Air Traveller Security Charge: $14.24 

NAV and Surcharges: $24.00 

Airport Improvement Fee: $40.00 

Harmonized Sales Tax: $67.38 

Total Fare Price: $585.62 

Visa: $585.62 

Balance Due: $0.00 

GST/HST Number: 841583271 QST Number: 1212573775 

Baggage Policy: 

5/s„a1-1-NE-r 

79 38 14s-r- 

TWO items of carry-on baggage are permitted per fare-paying passenger. 

• Carry-on baggage is limited to two pieces: 

o 1 standard article not exceeding 55 cm x 40 cm x 23 cm (21.5" x 15.5" x 9") and 

weighing less than 9 kg (20 Ib) 

o 1 personal article not exceeding 43 cm x 33 cm x 16 cm (17" x 13" x 6") and 

weighing less than 9 kg (20 Ib) 

• Items that are not permitted in carry-on baggage aboard the aircraft are those that 

present a potential hazard. They include, but are not limited to, weapons, tools, 

restraining devices, toy weapons, cutting and puncturing devices (knives, box cutters, 

scissors, straight razors) ice skates and other hazardous items as defined and regulated 

by law including explosives, poisons, and other toxic materials. 

• All carry-on baggage must fit in the sizing units located both at check-in and the gate 

areas. 

• On board the aircraft, all carry-on baggage must be stowed under the seat or in the 

overhead compartments. 

• The following items are not counted as carry-on: coats, cameras, receptacles containing 

human remains, containers carrying life sustaining items, strollers, child restraint 

systems, crutches, canes, walkers and other such items. 

• Porter may require that an item of carry-on baggage travel as checked luggage if the bag 

cannot be safely stowed in the cabin. 

For travel before August 1, 2013 or for flights booked before July 3, 2013 

ONE item of checked baggage is permitted, free of charge, per fare-paying 

passenger. 



Borden Ladner Gervais 
BILLABLE EXPENSE REPORT 

NAME: 	 Vince DeRose 	 DATE: 	 24-Sep-13 

DE ROSE SE  P 16113 
BILLABLE INFORMATION: 

Client File No./Name: 339583-000158 (CME re: EGD and Union — Combined Facilities) 
Oral Hearing - Sept. 16, 2013 

 

Canadian Expense  
Total 
Expense 	Pre Tax 

   

Expenses 
Outside 
Canada  EXPENSES 

 

HST 

 

     

Transportation(Air,Bus,Train) 

Total Kilometers 	  
Rate $ 	0.45 

Car Rental 

Taxis 	 $ 70.00 	6/.q5  Fgos 
Hotel / Lodging 

Food and Drink 

Parking 	 $ 	19.00 	16,.<31  
Long Distance 

Miscellaneous (specify) 

TOTALS: 

       

       

$ 	89.00 

 

ig,16 /0,14 

 

Total Expenses 	 89.00 

Less: Travel Advance 

Reimbursement Total (CDN) 	 89.00 

g" Vtontikl, 	 fOXW 	 ;Q:AV 

2.  
3.  

'..:CiNN:;::?k.  • A1k5.̀: ■̀ 

Expenses are to be remitted within one week of being incurred 
Original receipts are required for all items 
Non-billable expenses must be approved by Group Leader 

REMO VIEttc#::'.:ve :Rigi VOW .„:$ •  "VW, A41081V199'..,V?' '4' 

PROFESSIONAL/GROUP LEADER APPROVAL: 	 Signature 
(check here if by e-mail approval attached)I 

OTT01-#5215994-v6C-Billable_Expense_Report 



INDEPENDENT CAB OWNERS' 
CO-OPERATIVE INCORPORATED 

TORONTO, ONTARIO 

Date: (6119'9 115_  FARE: 

TIP: 

TOTAL 

Driver: 

Flat rates available for Airport, Out of Town, 
Business Trips, Sightseeing, Etc: Ask Driver for details. 

From: 

To: 

Cab# 

Adroport ,'Ottawa Airport 

Exit 2 	16/09/13 18:57 
Receipt 029215 

Ticket/Billet 
P1 - No. 075400 
16/09/13 05:27 -
16/09/13 18:57 -
Period 0d13h31' 
(CAN) 	 $19.00 

WHEEL TRANS 

"A Synonym for Service" 
Total 
	

$19.00 

Payment Received 
VISA 
XXXXXXXXXXX: 
Merch:82008580037 
Auth:467266 
Type: Swiped 

Sub Total 
HST 	13% 

:IIST#TVH 898569942RT.CAD 
Good day Au revoir 

P 

C9L 	  
CAB NO  7 -X  

DRIVER: 

REF. NO.: 	  

FROM: 	  

TO: 

TOKEN: 	  

PASS NO.: 	  

METER: 

LESS CASH: — 
3ic 

CHARGE TOTAL:  $  
t $5 	 . 

THIS CHARGE MUSTINCLUDE 
PASS #, TOKEN OR TICKET 

and 
METER RECEIPT 

ASSIST DOOR TO DOOR 

01/17 

$16.81 
2.19 psi— 

$19.00 DATE: 



Borden Ladner Gervais 
BILLABLE EXPENSE REPORT 

NAME: 	 Vince DeRose 	 DATE: 	 20-Sep-13 

1)EROSE  SEP 0113 
BILLABLE INFORMATION: 

Client File No./Name: 339583-000158 (CME re: EGD and Union — Combined Facilities) 
Oral Hearing - Sept. 19, 2013 

 

Canadian Expense  
Total 
Expense 	Pre Tax 

   

Expenses 
Outside 
Canada  EXPENSES 

 

HST 

      

Transportation(Air,Bus,Train) 	$ 499.74 e„R ,d 	5 

Total Kilometers 

       

Rate $ 	0.45 

      

Car Rental 

Taxis 

Hotel / Lodging 

Food and Drink 

Parking 

Long Distance 

Miscellaneous (specify) 

TOTALS: 

       

       

       

       

       

       

       

$ 499.74 

 

Total Expenses 	499.74 

Less: Travel Advance 

Reimbursement Total (CDN) 	 499.74 

INEXIIIIIMM;04, :ter 

 

2.  

3.  

 

Expenses are to be remitted within one week of being incurred 
Original receipts are required for all items 
Non-billable expenses must be approved by Group Leader 

   

, 	"^1g"" gKO:::;:gggggg%gggre.Wit.,g4V0:04:mgm:A:';: 
:.„5W:A§Mg.,:::::::NM:il.tig:7-Amyix • 

    

    

PROFESSIONAL/GROUP LEADER APPROVAL: Signature 

 

   

(check here if by e-mail approval attached)I 	 

OTTo 1 45215994-v6D-Billable_Expense_Report 



Itinerary - Porter Airlines 

Booking Information 
You will need to provide this information with proof of identification for access to the 
items on your itinerary 

Status: 
	

Confirmed 

Confirmation number: 
	

YDJ9UX 

Booking date: 
	

Wednesday, September 18, 2013 

Flight Details 

Departing Flight 

Ottawa (YOW) to Toronto (YTZ) 

September 19, 2013 Flight PD 242 	Depart from Ottawa (YOW) at 6:25 AM 

Bombardier Q400 	Arrive in Toronto (YTZ) at 7:25 AM 

Returning Flight 

Toronto (YTZ) to Ottawa (YOW) 

September 20, 2013 Flight PD 261 	Depart from Toronto (YTZ) at 2:00 PM 

Bombardier Q400 	Arrive in Ottawa (YOVV) at 2:56 PM 

Auto Check-in 

No need to check-in; Auto Check-in will do it for you! 

Prior to departure, Porter will issue a print friendly version and an electronic version of your boarding pass. It will be 
attached to the Flight Reminder sent to the email address on file. Before arriving at the airport, please print a paper copy of 
your boarding pass or verify that you are able to view the electronic version of the boarding pass on your internet enabled  
mobile device. 

Not all reservations are eligible for Auto Check-in; please visit Auto Check-in for further details. 

Seat Selection 

Firm fare reservations will be charged $15 CAD/USD plus tax, per flight, per seat, for seat selection. There is no additional 
charge for Flexible or Freedom fare. 

Premium Seats 
Firm fare reservations will be charged $30 CAD/USD plus tax, per flight, per seat, for Premium Seat selection. Flexible and 
Freedom fares will be charged $15 CAD/USD plus tax, per flight, per seat. Seat selection fees are non-refundable. 

Visit My Bookings to pre-select a seat more than 24 hours before a flight. After you have been Auto Checked-in and a seat 
has been assigned, visit Web Check-in to change seats. 

You can select your seat preferences (aisle or window and the area of the plane) through your VlPorter account. We will 
attempt to accommodate your preferences when automatically assigning seats. 

For operational reasons, Porter reserves the right to change  seats at any time. 

Contact Information 

https://www.flyporter.com/Flight/Itinerary?culture=en-CA 	 18/09/2013 



Itinerary - Porter Airlines 

Address 

Mr. Vincent J DeRose 

11 Kitimat Cres 

Ottawa, ON K2H 7G4 

Canada 

Phone number(s) 

Home : 

Business : 613-787-3589 

Mobile : 

Email address(es) 

vderose@blg.com  

Passenger Details 

Passenger Details 

1. Vincent J DeRose 	 Adult 	 Male 1972-02-13 

Flight #/Seat #:PD 242/NA 

PD 261/NA 

Payment 

Summary 

Details Charge 

Base Fare $ 364.00 

Air Traveller Security Charge $ 14.24 

NAV and Surcharges $ 24.00 

Airport Improvement Fee $ 40.00 

Harmonized Sales Tax $ 57.50 

Total Fare Price $ 499.74 CAD) 

1-140 . a L NEI- 

5150   1-IST 

Payment Details 

Details 

Credit Card - V/ 

Amount Paid 

Status 

(Approved) 

Charge 

$ 499.74 

$ 499.74 CAD 

Fare Rules 

https://vvww.flyporter.com/Flight/Itinerary?culture=en-CA 	 18/09/2013 



Borden Ladner Gervais 
BILLABLE EXPENSE REPORT 

NAME: Vince DeRose DATE: 

DE RO.S 

 

24-Sep-13  

SEP lq  /13 

   

BILLABLE INFORMATION: 

Client File No./Name: 339583-000158 (CME re: EGD and Union — Combined Facilities) 
Oral Hearing - Sept. 19, 2013 

 

Canadian Expense  
Total 
Expense 	Pre Tax 

   

Expenses 
Outside 
Canada  EXPENSES 

 

HST 

      

Transportation(Air, Bus,Train) 

Total Kilometers 	  
Rate $ 	0.45 

Car Rental 

Taxis 

Hotel / Lodging 

Food and Drink 

Parking 

Long Distance 

Miscellaneous (specify) 

TOTALS: 

         

$ 	71.00 	(2?•83 	go /1 

	

$ 19.00 	/6.g/ a./61   

   

   

   

   

         

         

         

$ 90.00 	qq,  04--  /0036 

Total Expenses 	 90.00 

Less: Travel Advance 

Reimbursement Total (CDN) 	 90,00 

          

Expenses are to be remitted within one week of being incurred 
2. Original receipts are required for all items 
3. Non-billable expenses must be approved  by Group  Leader 

7.i1327 Menffitmeriinieiti AC' 

PROFESSIONAL/GROUP LEADER APPROVAL: 	 Signatur 
(check here if by e-mail approval attached) 	I 

OTT01-#5215994-v6D-Billable_Expense_Report 

111:.A9ATatti:g111.1amilie 	144A1**04...::MUUMW 



CALL NO. 

CAB NO. 

DRIVER'S NAME 

FROM 104/-11 4:3  

TO 

DATE 

AI OUNTSL15,0 

a
lV

I
W

I
I
,
V

  

Aeroport d'Ottawa Airport 

$16.81 
2.19 r -)F 

Exit 4 	19/09/13 17:07 
Receipt 034057 

Ticket/Billet 
P1 - No. 080537 
19/09/13 05:28 -
19/09/13 17:07 -
Period Odllh40' 
(CAN) 	 $19.00 

Total 	 $19.00 

Payment Received 
VISA 	 . 
XXXXXXXXXXXX _ 

$19
01/

00
17 

Merch:82008580037 
Auth:414503 
Type: Swiped 

Sub Total 
HST 	13% 

NUTS:.AMOUNISNOWN ASCIIIE INCLUDES FIST 
Driver IC an Independent ICemtranter. any HST Input Credit 
may Ian clannod an 'NOTIONAL' or applied to driver's 
repaarataai number, eel' Co. np.C.AP6_ L0

DRIVERS HST NO. 
1 applicable) 

,LHST#TVH 898569942RT.CAD 
2Good day Au revoir 

MCKTAXI  RECEI 
Cab No. 

From 	(Jrt,  

To  /O J) ( 	— 

Date 	 Amount 	 

Signature 



Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed 

File # and 
	EB-2012-0451 

	
Enbridge Gas - GTA Project 

Process: 
	EB-2012-0433 

	
Union Gas - Parkway West Project 

EB-2013-0074 
	

Union Gas - Brantford-Kirkwall/Parkway D Project 

Party: 	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 	Name: Kim Dullet 

Completed Years Practising/Years 

of relevant experience 

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: 	El 
	

12 

	

Consultant: 	E 

	

CV attached: 	El 	 CV not required: 	CI 

Statement of Fees Being Claimed 

Hours 
Hourly 

rate 
Subtotal HST Total 

Preparation 50.80 $170.00 $8,636.00 $1,122.68 $9,758.68 

Attendance - Oral Hearing 21.40 $170.00 $3,638.00 $472.94 $4,110.94 

Argument 5.80 $170.00 $986.00 $128.18 $1,114.18 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES 	I I 	$13,260.001 $1,723.801 $14,983.80 

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed 

Net Cost HST Total 

Travel: Air $2,409.74 $313.26 $2,723.00 

Travel: Taxis $308.89 $40.16 $349.05 

Travel: Meals $34.89 $4.53 $39.42 

Parking $50.43 $6.57 $57.00 

Other: $0.00 $0.00 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: 	 I 	 $2,803.951 $364.521 $3,168.47 



(EGD GTA) 
(Union PWP) 
(Union BKP) 
(Combined) 

Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

EB-2012-0451 Enbridge Gas — GTA Project 
File # and EB-2012-0433 Union Gas — Parkway West Project 
Process: 	EB-2013-0074 Union Gas — Brantford-Kirkwall/Parkway D Project 

Enbridge Gas  & Union Gas Combined  Facilities  

Party: 
	

Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 

Name: Kim Dullet 

Mar 20-13 Correspondence with P. Thompson and V. DeRose re: 
status; review of memo to file 

EGD GTA 0.3 Prep 

Apr 5-13 Reviewing correspondence re: intervenor requests Union PWP 0.2 Prep 

Apr 12-13 Reviewing Application and pre-filed evidence Union PWP 2.3 Prep 

Apr 12-13 Review and analysis of Leave to Construct Application EGD GTA 2.8 Prep 

Apr 12-13 Review and analysis of Application and pre-filed evidence Union BKP 1.8 Prep 

Apr 17-13 Review of correspondence from EGD re: late interventions EGD GTA 0.2 Prep 

Apr 18-13 Reviewing Procedural Order No. 1 and Draft Issues List EGD GTA 0.3 Prep 

Apr 18-13 Reviewing Procedural Order No. 1 and Draft Issues List Union PWP 0.2 Prep 

Apr 26-13 Reviewing presentations for Issues and Processes EGD GTA 0.2 Prep 
Conference 

Apr 26-13 Review of Updated Application and Evidence EGD GTA 0.6 Prep 

Apr 26-13 Correspondence from J. Wasylyk and review of Draft Issues EGD GTA 0.2 Prep 
List following conference 

Apr 26-13 Reviewing presentations for Issues and Processes Union PWP 0.2 Prep 
Conference 

Apr 29-13 Review of correspondence from E. Chin re proposed 
schedule 

EGD GTA 0.2 Prep 

Apr 29-13 Reviewing correspondence from K. Hockin supporting EGD's 
proposed schedule 

Union PWP 0.1 Prep 

Apr 30-13 Reviewing APPrO Issues and Processes Day Compendium EGD GTA 0.6 Prep 

May 9-13 Review of Procedural Order No. 2 EGD GTA 0.2 Prep 

May 10-13 Review of correspondence from Dr. Quinn to EGD re 
information required 

EGD GTA 0.1 Prep 

May 13-13 Review of Environmental Defence Preliminary Interrogatories EGD GTA 0.2 Prep 

May 17-13 Review of updated exhibits to EGD Application EGD GTA 0.5 Prep 

May 17-13 Reviewing Interrogatories of Direct Energy and LMPA EGD GTA 0.3 Prep 

May 24-13 Review and analysis of Interrogatories of Intervenors EGD GTA 0.6 Prep 

May 24-13 Review of Interrogatories of CME EGD GTA 0.2 Prep 

May 24-13 Review and analysis of Interrogatories of intervenors Union PWP 0.3 Prep 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

May 24-13 Review of Interrogatories of CME Union PWP 0.1 Prep 

May 24-13 Review and analysis of Interrogatories of intervenors Union BKP 0.3 Prep 

May 24-13 Review of CME Interrogatories Union BKP 0.1 Prep 

Jun 5-13 Review of updated Exhibits and Enbridge interrogatory 
responses to Environmental Defence 

EGD GTA 0.3 Prep 

Jun 21-13 Review of Motion of Union and Gaz Metro Union PWP 0.2 Prep 

Jun 23-13 Review of undertakings from Technical Conference EGD GTA 0.3 Prep 

Jun 23-13 Review of undertakings from Technical Conference Union PWP 0.3 Prep 

Jul 23-13 Review of updated evidence of EGD EGD GTA 0.3 Prep 

Aug 2-13 Reviewing Interrogatories of CME and intervenors to updated 
evidence filed by EGD 

Combined 0.4 Prep 

Sep 10-13 Meeting with V. DeRose re: preparation for panels Combined 0.3 Prep 

Sep 12-13 Reviewing transcript from hearing Combined 0.3 Prep 

Sep 16-13 Reviewing transcript from Technical Conference; follow-up 
with V. DeRose 

Combined 0.3 Prep 

Sep 17-13 Reviewing transcripts from Technical Conference and 
hearings in preparation for appearance 

Combined 1.8 Prep 

Sep 18-13 Reviewing materials submitted by J. Wolnik and D. Quinn re: 
cross-examinations 

Combined 0.3 Prep 

Sep 23-13 Preparation for cross-examination of Enbridge panel; 
consultations with V. DeRose and J. Girvan 

Combined 6.5 Prep 

Sep 24-13 Preparation for and attendance at hearing; consultations with Combined 10.3 Attend OH 
J. Girvan 

Sep 25-13 Meeting with V. DeRose re: attendance at next panel Combined 0.2 Prep 

Sep 26-13 Correspondence with V. DeRose and J. Girvan re: 
attendance at and questions for ED/GEC panel 

Combined 0.3 Prep 

Sep 26-13 Correspondence with J. Wasylyk re: CME/CCC attendances Combined 0.3 Prep 

Sep 26-13 Review of correspondence from EGD re: Woodbine Combined 0.2 Prep 
Investments 

Sep 26-13 Review of correspondence from Board to D. Poch re: 
confidentiality issue 

Combined 0.1 Prep 

Sep 27-13 Reviewing transcript from examinations held on September Combined 1.1 Prep 
26 2013, in place of attendance 

Sep 27-13 Reviewing EGD Compendium of Materials and transcripts 
from examinations held on September 27, 2013 in place of 
attendance 

Combined 1.7 Prep 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 
=mak i=d2a1111 

Sep 29-13 Preparation for cross-examination of EGD panels; 
consultations with J. Girvan 

Combined 3.2 Prep 

Sep 29-13 Reviewing correspondence re: cancellation of hearing date Combined 0.2 Prep 

Oct 1-13 Correspondence from D. Quinn to Board re: follow-up to 
requested information 

Combined 0.1 Prep 

Oct 1-13 Review of Updated Evidence re: Panel 4 Combined 0.4 Prep 

Oct 2-13 Review of Procedural Order re: timetable and 
correspondence from J. Wasylyk re: revised schedule 

Combined 0.2 Prep 

Oct 3-13 Reviewing updated undertakings of Union and EGD Combined 0.4 Prep 

Oct 3-13 Reviewing CV of D. Rheaume Combined 0.1 Prep 

Oct 6-13 Reviewing comments of J. Girvan and M. Gardner; 
preparation for Joint Panel and EGD Panel #3 

Combined 2.8 Prep 

Oct 7-13 Meeting with V. DeRose to prepare for Joint Panel and EGD Combined 1.3 Prep 
Panel #3; drafting questions 

Oct 8-13 Review and analysis of TCPL supplementary evidence in 
preparation for cross-examination of Joint Panel; meeting 
with V. DeRose; drafting questions for cross-examination of 

Combined 2.4 Prep 

Joint Panel 

Oct 9-13 Various consultations with V. DeRose and J. Girvan Combined 6.3 Prep 

Oct 9-13 Preparation for and attending cross-examination of Joint Combined 5.0 Attend OH 
Panel 

Oct 10-13 Various correspondence with V. DeRose and J. Girvan Combined 4.1 Prep 

Oct 10-13 Preparation for and attending cross-examination of Joint Combined 6.1 Attend OH 
Panel 

Oct 15-13 Review of Procedural Order No. 12; report to V. DeRose Combined 0.2 Prep 

Oct 18-13 Review and analysis of answers to undertakings from EGD 
and Union 

Combined 0.3 Prep 

Oct 21-13 Reviewing Arguments-in-Chief of EGD and Union Combined 1.3 Argument 

Nov 4-13 Reviewing correspondence from Board and intervenors re: 
further steps in light of Settlement Agreement 

Combined 0.3 Argument 

Nov 5-13 Review and analysis of Settlement Agreement Combined 1.4 Argument 

Nov 5-13 Reviewing correspondence from Board and intervenors re: 
further steps in light of Settlement Agreement 

Combined 0.3 Argument 

ime 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Nov 6-13 Reviewing submissions of Union and various intervenors re: Combined 0.4 Argument 
Settlement Agreement and need for further discovery 

Nov 7-13 Reviewing submissions of Union and various intervenors re: Combined 0.2 Argument 
Settlement Agreement and negotiations for extension of filing 
date 

Nov 11-13 Review of LPMA Argument Combined 0.3 Argument 

Nov 13-13 Review and analysis of Board staff submissions Combined 0.4 Argument 

Nov 15-13 Reviewing Arguments of various intervenors and CME Combined 0.8 Argument 

Nov 26-13 Reviewing Union and EGD Reply Arguments and 
amendments to Settlement Agreement 

Combined 0.4 Argument 

Jan 30-14 Review and analysis of Board Order Combined 0.5 Prep 

TOTAL HOURS for Kim Dullet: 78.0 

Hours Fees 

Prep 50.8 x $170.00/hr = 8,636.00 

Attend OH 21.4 x $170.00/hr = 3,638.00 

Argument 5.8 x $170.00/hr = 986.00 

78.0 TOTAL FEES for Kim Dullet: $13,260.00 



aircanada.com  - Flights - Booking Confirmation 

Search Select Review Passengers Purchase Seats Itinerary 

An email booking confirmation has been sent to: kdullet@blg.com. 

Itinerary/Receipt 
ing reference: QDL7N5 

K/A4 
Your booking is confirrli 

Use your booking reference to retrieve your official Itinerary/Receipt at aircanada.com. 

Passengers Miss Rajkamal Dullet Airfare 

Options 

542.00 

0.00 
Flight Fi on To Departure Taxes, fees and 137.41 
AC441 Ottawa (YOW) Toronto (YYZ) 07:00 08:05 char ges 

Wed 21-Aug 2013 Wed 21-Aug 2013 
-f revel insurance Purchase Travel 

AC462 Toronto (YYZ) Ottawa (YOW) 18:10 19:13 Insurance 
Wed 21-Aug 2013 Wed 21-Aug 2013 

Grand Total $679.41 
Canadian dollars 

View detailed Itinerary/Receipt 

Itinerary/Receipt 

 

-1Rm\JEL on) 
SEP 24/13 

Your booking is confirmed. Please print/retain this page 
for your financial records (e.g. for taxation, expense claim 
or payment card reconciliation purposes). We thank you for 
choosing Air Canada and look forward to welcoming you on 
board. 

Booking Information AIR CANADA 

Booking Reference: QDL7N5 Customer Care 

Electronic Ticketing confirmed. This is your 
official itinerary/receipt. 

Main Contact: 
Miss Rajkamal Dullet 
kdullet@blg.com  
Mobile: 1-613-8580600 
Work: 1-613-2375160-34792 

Air Canada 
1-888-247-2262 

Flight Arrivals and Departures 
1-888-422-7533 

143,00 	/ F. sc/ 
	 wr 

'1  +4 	960 15 
NT 

Flight Itinerary 

Fare To 	 Stops Duration Aircraft 
Type 

 Meal 

AC441 	Ottawa, Ottawa 	Toronto, Pearson 	0 	lhrOS 	Ego 	Fee, V 
Intl (YOW) 	 Int'l (YYZ) 
Wed 21-Aug 2013 	Wed 21-Aug 2013 
07:00 	 08:05 - Terminal 1 

AC462 	Toronto, Pearson 	Ottawa, Ottawa 	0 	lhr03 	319 	Fie u, 
Int'l (YYZ) 	 Int'l (VOW) 
Wed 21-Aug 2013 	Wed 21-Aug 2013 
18:10 - Terminal 1 	19:13 

Passenger Information 

1: Miss Rajkamal Dullet : Adult (16+), Ticket Number: 0142124449575 

Air Canada - Aeroplan : 982540155 	 Meal Preference: 	None 

Payment Card: 	xxxx-xxxx-xxxx 	 Special Needs: 	None 

Seat Selection: 	AC441 15C , AC462 28C 

Purchase Summary 

Fare Summary 
Passenger Type Adult 

Air Transportation Charges 
Departing Flight - Hey, 259.00 

Return Flight - Flex 259.00 

Surcharees 24.00 

Taxes, Fees and Charges 
Canada Airport Inipiovernent, Fee 45 00 

Canada Harmonized Sales Tax (GST/HST #10009-2287 RT0001) 78.16 

Air  Traveller. Secui rip Charge (ATSC) 14.25 

Flight 	From 

https://book.aircanada.com/pl/AConl  ine/en/B ookTripPlanSery let;_isessionid=Xx 1 hSTmbKfPl... 8/16/13 



aircanada.com  - Flights - Booking Confirmation 

Total airfare and taxes before options (per passenger) 	 679.41 

Number of passengers 	 1 

Travel Insurance (declined) 	 0.00 

Grand Total - Canadian dollars 
	

$679.41 

Payment Information 

Credit/Debit Card xxxx-xxxx-xxxx 	Amount paid: $679.41 
The following charges (tax inclusive) will appear on your credit or debit card statement: 

• Air Canada: $679.41 (Airfare - per ticket) 

Ticket number(s): 0142124449575 

601,0,2513 
7g,164 

Fare Rules 

Departing Flight Ottawa (VOW) To Toronto (YYZ) - Flex 

Return Flight Toronto (YYZ) To Ottawa (YOW) - Flex 

Changes: 

Prior to day of departure - Change fee per direction, per passenger, is $50 CAD plus applicable 
taxes and any additional fare difference. Changes can be made up to 2 hours prior to departure. 

Same-day confirmed changes at check-in or at the airport are permitted at a flat fee of $75 
CAD/USD per direction, per passenger (subject to availability). Same-day flights only. 

• Same-day standby is available only to passengers travelling on a flight between Toronto and 

Montreal or Ottawa (connecting flights excluded), as well as to passengers travelling between 
Toronto Pearson (YYZ) and LaGuardia (LGA), John F. Kennedy (JFK) and Newark (EWR) airports. 

• Flights can only be used in sequence from the place of departure specified on the itinerary. 

• Cancellations: 

Tickets are non-refundable and non-transferable, 

Cancellations can be made up to 45 minutes prior to departure. 

• Provided the original booking is cancelled prior to the original flight departure, the value of the 
unused ticket can be applied within a one year period from date of issue of the original tickets to 

the value of a new ticket subject to the change fee per direction, per passenger, plus applicable 
taxes and any additional fare difference, subject to availability and advance purchase requirements. 
The new outbound travel date must commence within a one year period from the original date of 
ticket issuance. If the fare for the new journey is lower, any residual amount will be forfeited. 

Customers who no-show their flight will forfeit the fare paid. 

• Complimentary advance standard seat selection on Alr Canada and Air Canada Express (operated 
by Jazz), subject to availability. 

• Air Canada will cancel your ticket and provide a full refund without penalty up to 24 hours after 
purchase. 

• Flights operated by Alr Canada: earn 100% Aeroplan Miles (Altitude Qualifying Miles) 

• Read complete faf:-.1 rule:, applicable to this fare. 

Important Information 

Please review this itinerary/receipt and, should you have any questions, please call 1-888-247-2262 within 24 hours of receipt. 

Before You Go: A 'To-Do' List 

All passengers are advised to view the Naval clecumeniatfon page for important information on identification required for travel. 

Baggage Policy 

Links 	

(\L  B. 

Loafed-. 
Carry-on baggage I Check .d bagg 7, ge 

Check-in vvd boaiding times 

' Manage my booking online: 	http://www.aircanada.com/mybookings  

Information and Services 

General conditions of carriage: http://www.aircanada.com/conditionsofcarriage  
http://www.aircanada.com/travelinfo 	WLI-A) 	 C)72-11  

Flight Departure & Arrivals: 	http://www.aircanada.com/flightstatus  

Reduce your carbon footprint! 
4.1:,/ Offset now I Learn more 	 // 3 

	

tArael,  (A■Ca61  61-3'\-- 	11-11  

	

ait9,71  60:4-4  44,e, 	 ra2-Z-C6 

4(t& 
FIL-S1>  

https://book.aircanada.com/p1/AConline/en/BookTripPlanSery  letj sessionid—Xx hSTmbl(1131... 8/16/1 3 



CARLSON WAGONLIT TRAVEL 
885 MEADOWLANDS DR 
SUITE 501 
OTTAWA, ONTARIO 
K2C 3N2 
GST Reg#: R113405179 
Branch: 	011138 
Agent: 	JOY PACADA Tel: 613-238-4040 

50017273 

CarlsonWagionlitTr.4..cti 

To: BORDEN LADNER GERVAIS YOW 
	

Invoice Number: 
	

79216 
100 QUEEN ST STE 110 

	
Date: 
	

September 23, 2013 
OTTAWA ON MP 1J9 

	
Page: 
	

1/3 

Our Reference: 
	

C6J0106441C NM4H3H 

INVOICE 

For 
MS RAJKAMAL DULLET 

Tuesday, September 24, 2013 

cc, Air 

AIR CANADA 
From: OTTAWA ON 
To: 	TORONTO PEARSON 
Stops: 	0 

.14 Air 

AIR CANADA 
From: TORONTO PEARSON 
To: OTTAWA ON 
Stops: 	0 

Cost: 
AIR CANADA WEB 2125848432 

Service Fee CWT*11138-2125848432 

Flight: 479 	H CLASS 
06:00 AM Equipment: A320 
07:05 AM 

Flight: 458 	H CLASS 
04:10 PM Equipment: A319 

05:13 PM 

(CA**********“ 

HST: 
Ticket Total: 

(CA***********: 

HST: 
Service Fee Total: 

Mile(s) Flown: 226 

Mile(s) Flown: 226 

100.00 

13.00 
113.00 

43,00 

5.59 
48.59 



To: BORDEN LADNER GERVAIS YOW 
	

Invoice Number: 
	

79216 

100 QUEEN ST STE 110 
	

Date: 
	

September 23, 2013 

OTTAWA ON K1P 1J9 
	

Page: 
	

2/3 

Our Reference: 
	

C6J0106441C NM4H3H 

INVOICE 

Total: 
Grand Total: 

Less Credit Card Payments: 

Total GST/HST: 

Credit / Balance Due To This Invoice: 

Total Balance Due: 

161.59 

C76175D 

18.59 kis-r 

0.00 

0.00 

TICKET EXCHANGE 

/ 14-3  ,.00  NET 

1 3.  sq /4s-7- THANK YOU FOR CHOOSING CARLSON WAGONLIT TRAVEL 
TICO REGISTRATION IS 50017273 
CLIENT FUNDS WILL BE DEPOSITED INTO A TRUST ACCOUNT 
BY MAKING A PAYMENT ON THIS BOOKING, THE CLIENT IS ACCEPTING 
THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE SUPPLIER(S). TO UNDERSTAND 
THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS, PLEASE REFER TO THE BROCHURE, 
INTERNET SITE, PAMPHLET OR AIRLINE TICKET CORRESPONDING TO 
YOUR TRIP. ALL RATES ARE SUBJECT TO INCREASE AS PER THE 
SUPPLIERS TERMS AND CONDITIONS. IF INCREASED BY MORE THAN 
SEVEN PERCENT (EXCEPT AS RELATED TO A PST OR GST INCREASE) 
THE CUSTOMER HAS THE RIGHT TO CANCEL AND OBTAIN A FULL 
REFUND. 

PLEASE REVIEW THE ITINERARY/INVOICE AT TIME OF PAYMENT/ 
TICKET ISSUANCE. COSTS TO MAKE ANY CHANGES AFTER PAYMENT 
ARE THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE CLIENT. 
TRAVELLERS RESPONSIBILITIES ARE AS FOLLOWS: 
PRESENTING APPROPRIATE IDENTITY PAPERS FOR TRAVEL; I.E. A 
PASSPORT OR BIRTH CERTIFICATE AND AN IDENTITY CARD WITH 
A PHOTO AND OR A VISA ACCORDING TO THE DESTINATION AND 
TRAVELLER NATIONALITY. 
COSTS RELATED TO REFUSED DESTINATION ENTRY FOR ANY REASON 
VERIFYING THE SPELLING OF THE NAMES ON THIS INVOICE AT TIME 
OF BOOKING; SHOULD MATCH EXACTLY TO THE DOCUMENTS YOU WILL 
PRESENT AT CHECK-IN AT THE AIRPORT, 
PENALTIES INCURRED TO CHANGE TRAVEL ARRANGEMENTS 



Borden Ladner Gervais 
BILLABLE EXPENSE REPORT 

NAME: 	Kim Dullet 	 DATE: 11-Oct-13 

BILLABLE INFORMATION: 

Client File No./Name: 	CME re: EGD & Union Combined Facilities - file # 339583-000158 

Attendance at Hearing on September 24, 2013 

EXPENSES 

Canadian Expense 	Expenses 
Total 	 Outside 

Expense 	Pre-Tax 	HST 	Canada 

        

Transportation (Air,Bus,Train) 

       

        

Total Kms: 0 kms. $ $ $ 
x Rate $ 0.45 

Car Rental $ 	- $ $ $ 

Taxis $ 	117.05 $ 	103.58 $ 	13.47 $ 

Hotel / Lodging $ $ 	- $ 	- $ 

Food and Drink $ $ $ 	- $ 

Parking $ 	19.00 $ 	16.81 $ 	2.19 $ 

Long Distance $ $ 	- $ 	- $ 

Miscellaneous (specify) $ $ $ $ 

TOTALS: $ 	136.05 $ 	120.39 $ 	15.66 $ 

Total Expenses: 	$ 	136.05 

Less Travel Advance: 

Reimbursement Total (CDN): 	$ 	136.05 

1. Expenses are to be remitted within one week of being incurred 
2. Original receipts are required for all items 

PROFESSIONAL/GROUP LEADER APPROVAL: 	 Signature: 
Peter Thompson 

OTTO1 \4908979 



Exit 2 
Receipt 04 

24/09/A1 16:20 
04 

VISA 
AID: A00000 
TVR: 00 00 00 80 00 
TSI: F8 00 

Thank You for Choosing 
Aerofleet 

HST #100007164RT0001 
vompayplus.ca 

RY 	A VERIFIEb Pif 
CARGHOIDER AGREES TO PM ISSUER 

SUCH TOTAL III 
ACCOROAUCE WITH ISSUER'S 

AGR NEU 
CARDROLRER 

VISA 
AID: A000000( 
TVR: 00 00 00 80 00 
TSI: F8 00 

Thank You for Choosing 
Beck Taxi 

3 Nays to Order 
PHONE-NEB-APP 

2520 
CAB 2087 

Adroport ..'Ottawa Airport 

Ticket/Billet 
P1 - No.. 088268 
24/09/13 05:20 -
24/09/13 16:20 -
Period Odllhl' 
(CAN) 	 $19.00 

Total 	 ( $19.00,  

Payment Received 
VISA 	 $19.00 
XXXXXXXXXXX) 	08/14 
Merch:82008580037 
Auth:033204 
Type: Swiped 

Sub Total 
HST 	13% 

:JIST#TVH 898569942RT.CAD 
TGood day Au revoir 
?r! 

$16.81 
2.19 os-T- 

AEROFIEET SERVICES 
30-2601 MATfiESON ELV E 

MISSISSAUGA ON 
wtmaaero ileac a 

1.800.2680905 
416.449.4990 

CAI3#30 

SALE 

MID: IEMV000000 
TID: PS472430 	REF#: 00000002 
Batch #: 101 	Sal: 001101002 
09124113 	 07:52:40: 
Invoice #: 2 
APPR CODE 087832 
VISA 
	

Chip 

1 UntIJH UMUN UK 
Toronto ON M4A 2S6 

wwtrubeckt.rxi.com  
(4161751-5555 

SALE 

MID: 4341607 
TID: A4341607 	IEF#: 00000004 
Batch #: 062 	SEC: 062001001004 
09/24113 	 14:07:18 

CVC: Y 
APPR CODE: 015751 
VISA 

AMOUNT 	 $52.00 
TIP 	 7.80_ 	 AMOUNT 	$61.26 
TOTAL 	 69.80 	 TIP 	 $6.00 

--$67 26 
APPROVED 	

TOTAL 	
-----__: _- 

00 - API:ILI) /ED - 001 

CUSTOMER COPY 
CUSTOMER COPY 



Ottawa, Ottawa 
Int'l (YOW) 
Fri 27-Sep 2013 
07:00 

Toronto, 
Pearson Int'l 
(YYZ) 
Fri 27-Sep 2013 
nR.n7 - Terminal 1 

Flight 

AC441 0 	1hr07 	319 	Flex, V 

Stops Duration Aircraft Fare  Type Meal 

Want travel insurance?  Protect yourself and your family against unforeseen circumstances. 

Need a car in Toronto?  Great rates and additional Aeroplan Miles. VA I S nBudger  

Looking for around transportation or attractions? DoLLE-r 
Booking Information 

Booking Reference: 
	

NDJUDI . 1111L_,  

Electronic Ticketing confirmed. This is your official-. 
itinerary/receipt. 
Main Contact: 
Miss Rajkamal Dullet 
kdullet@jblg.com   
Mobile: 1-613-8580600 
Work: 1-613-2375160-34792 

Online Services 

Manacle  my booking online (view/change my booking; select seats*). 
Request an upgrade  
Select Seats  
Maple Leaf Lounge I Meal Vouchers I On My Way  
Alert me  of flight status changes directly to my mobile phone or email. 
Flight Arrivals & Departures - check online if my flight is on time. 
Check-in online  and print my boarding pass. 

!Customer Care 
JAir Canada 
1-888-247-2262 
Flight Arrivals and 
Departures 
1-888-422-7533 

* Can rThe booking be changed online? 

Flight Itinerary 

Toronto, 
Pearson Intl 

AC458 (YYZ) 
Fri 27-Sep 2013 
16:10 - Terminal 1 

Ottawa, Ottawa 
Int'l (YOW) 
Fri 27-Sep 2013 
17:13 

0 	lhr03 320 	Flex, V 

Passenger Information 

        

1: Miss Rajkamal Dullet : Adult (16+), Ticket Number: 0142125934731 

Air Canada - 	 982540155 
	

Meal Preference : 	None 
Aeroplan : 

Payment Card: 	xxxx-xxxx-xxxx- 
	 Special Needs: 	None 

Seat Selection: 	AC441 14C , AC458 14C 

2 



Place liquids, liquids, aerosols 
and gels 

I 
1 

Purchase Summary 

Fare Summary 
Passenger Type  Adult 

Air Transportation Charges 

Departing Flight - Flex 220.00 

Return Flight - Flex 220.00 

Surcharges 24.00 

Taxes, Fees and Charges 
Canada Airport_  Improvement Fee 45.00 

Canada Harmonized Sales Tax (GST/HST #10009-2287 RT0001) 68.02 

Air Travellers Security Charge (ATSC) 14.25 

Total airfare and taxes before options (per passenger) 591.27  

Number of passengers 1 

Travel Insurance (declined) 0.00 

Grand Total - Canadian dollars $591.27 

Payment Information 

Credit/Debit Card xxxx-xxxx-xxxx• 	Amount paid: $591.27 
The following charges (tax inclusive) will appear on your credit or debit card statement: 

Air Canada: $591.27 (Airfare - per ticket) 

Ticket number(s): 0142125934731 

enRoute City Guide 

5 23 .075 8.0  

Al -e 	i-(Sr 

f 

Toronto 
It's sprawling, it's noisy, it's the commercial 
capital of Canada, but if you get a little cozy 
with Toronto, you soon realize that, at its 
core, it's just a big softy... 

1:1 Read the complete Guide 

what do you think  of our new City Guide 
feature? 

Fare Rules 
Departing Flight Ottawa (YOW) To Toronto (YYZ) - Flex 
Return Flight Toronto (YYZ) To Ottawa (YOW) - Flex 

• Changes: 
o Prior to day of departure - Change fee per direction, per passenger, is $50 CAD plus 

applicable taxes and any additional fare difference. Changes can be made up to 2 hours  

3 



Azgo 

a.a.,e6eLe- 

NDJUDI 

1DULL -1-  

a/71-cre7 / From: Air Canada [mailto:confirmation©aircanada.ca] 
Sent: September-26-13 11:40 AM 
To: Misner, Dawn 
Subject: Dawn Misner is sending you the itinerary for your next trip from Ottawa to Toronto. 

740 

:6.41-11  (j2AeZOdd 
:4 

b****** PLEASE DO NOT REPLY TO THIS E-MAIL *****4  

AIR CANADA * 

Itinerary/Receipt 
From: Dawn Misner 

Your booking is confirmed. Please print/retain this page 
for your financial records (e.g. for taxation, expense claim 
or payment card reconciliation purposes). We thank you 
for choosing Air Canada and look forward to welcoming 
you on board. 

Scan this 
barcode to  
check in  at any 
Air Canada 
check in kiosk. 

weee 
'• 	

• 

ALT" I' ii Le Curd  •1Wl• • 
%Ea 	 • 

U Want travel insurance?  Protect yourself and your family against unforeseen circumstances. 

Need a car in Toronto?  Great rates and additional Aeroplan Miles. "IS 
'Budget 

 

Looking for ground transportation or attractions?  

Booking Information 

( 

Booking Reference: 

Electronic Ticketing confirmed. This is your official 
itinerary/receipt. 
Main Contact: 
Miss Rajkamal Dullet  

Customer Care 
Air Canada 
1-888-247-2262 
Flight Arrivals and 
Departures 
1-888-422-7533 

1 



kdullet(@b1g.com  
Mobile: 1-613-8580600 
Work: 1-613-2375160-34792 

Online Services 

Manage  my booking online (view/change my booking; select seats*). 

Reauest an upgrade 
Select Seats  
Maple Leaf Lounge I Meal Vouchers I On My Way 
Alert me  of flight status changes directly to my mobile phone or email. 
Flight Arrivals & Departures  - check online if my flight is on time. 
Check-in online  and print my boarding pass. 

* Can nnybgoking be changed online? 

Flight Itinerary 

Flight From To 	 Stops Duration Aircraft 
Fare 
Type 

Meal 

AC479 

Ottawa, Ottawa 
Intl (YOW) 
Mon 30-Sep 2013 
06:00 

Toronto, 
Pearson Int'l 
(YYZ) 	 0 	lhr05 
Mon 30-Sep 2013 
07:05 - Terminal 1 

M 	Flex, V 

Toronto, 
Pearson Intl 

AC458 (YYZ) 
Mon 30-Sep 2013 
16:10 - Terminal 1 

Ottawa, Ottawa 
Int'l (YOW) 
Mon 30-Sep 2013 
17:13 

0 	1hr03 319 	Flex,  V 

Passenger Information 

1: Miss Rajkamal Dullet : Adult (16+), Ticket Number: 0142125934731 

Air Canada - 
	

982540155 
	

Meal Preference : 	Regular 
Aeroplan 

Payment Card: 	xxxx-xxxx-xxxx- 	_ 	 Special Needs: 
	

None 

Seat Selection: 
	

AC479  15F ,  AC458  18A 

Additional charges and/or refund summary 

Passenger Type 

Air Transportation Charges 
Airfare (includes Surcharges) 

Extra Charges (Change Fee) 
Change Fee 

Canada Harmonized Sales Tax (GST/HST #10009-2287 RT0001) 

Total Extra Charge (Change Fee) 

Number of passengers 

Grand Total - Canadian dollars 

Additional 
charges   

Adult 

0.00 

100.00 

13.00  lls-r 
113.00 

1 

$113.00 

Payment Information 
Credit/Debit Card xxxx-xxxx-xxxx- 	Amount paid:  $113.00 
The following charges (tax inclusive) will appear on your credit or debit card statement: 

Air Canada: $113.00 (Change Fee per ticket) 

Ticket number(s): 0142125934731 

2 



CARLSON WAGONLIT TRAVEL 
885 MEADOWLANDS DR 	 50017273 

SUITE 501 
OTTAWA, ONTARIO 
K2C 3N2 
GST Reg#: R113405179 
Branch: 	011138 
Agent: 	JOY PACADA Tel: 613-238-4040 

To: BORDEN LADNER GERVAIS YOW 	 Invoice Number: 	79521 
100 QUEEN ST STE 110 	 Date: 	 October 8, 2013 
OTTAWA ON 1(113  1J9 	 Page: 	 1/3 

Our Reference: 	C6J0106675C TNHVFO 

INVOICE 
	

Mi4VEL oN 
ACT /0  

For 
MS RAJKAMAL DULLET 

CarlsonWagon& Tr014 

K. DULLEY 

AIR CANADA 
From: TORONTO PEARSON 
To: OTTAWA ON 
Stops: 	0 

Cost: 

Service Fee CWT*11138-2126362842 

AIR CANADA WEB 2126362842 

Mile(s) Flown: 226 

Mile(s) Flown: 226 

Wednesday, October 9, 2013 

.14. Air 

AIR CANADA 	 Flight: 441 	V CLASS 
From: OTTAWA 	ON 	 07:00 AM Equipment: A319 
To: 	TORONTO PEARSON 	 08:07 AM 
Stops: 	0 

Air 

Flight: 460 	U CLASS 
05:10 PM Equipment: A319 

06:13 PM 

(CA************ 	 43.00 

	

HST: 	 5.59 

	

Service Fee Total: 	 48.59 
(CA************ 	 220.00 

	

HST: 	 28.60 

	

Ticket Total: 	 248.60 



--yuLAkt 
Jar 

To: BORDEN LADNER GERVAIS YOW 	 Invoice Number: 	79521 
100 QUEEN ST STE 110 	 Date: 	 October 8, 2013 
OTTAWA ON LOP 139 	 Page: 	 2/3 

Our Reference: 	C6J0106675C TNHVFO 

INVOICE 

Total: 
Grand Total: 

Less Credit Card Payments: 

Total GST/HST: 

Credit / Balance Due To This Invoice: 

Total Balance Due: 

297.19 

 

339583-00158 

297.19 

34.19  HST 
0.00 

0.00 

THANK YOU FOR CHOOSING CARLSON WAGONLIT TRAVEL 
TICO REGISTRATION IS 50017273 
CLIENT FUNDS WILL BE DEPOSITED INTO A TRUST ACCOUNT 
BY MAKING A PAYMENT ON THIS BOOKING, THE CLIENT IS ACCEPTING 
THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE SUPPLIER(S). TO UNDERSTAND 
THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS, PLEASE REFER TO THE BROCHURE, 
INTERNET SITE, PAMPHLET OR AIRLINE TICKET CORRESPONDING TO 
YOUR TRIP. ALL RATES ARE SUBJECT TO INCREASE AS PER THE 
SUPPLIERS TERMS AND CONDITIONS. IF INCREASED BY MORE THAN 
SEVEN PERCENT (EXCEPT AS RELATED TO A PST OR GST INCREASE) 
THE CUSTOMER HAS THE RIGHT TO CANCEL AND OBTAIN A FULL 
REFUND. 

PLEASE REVIEW THE ITINERARY/INVOICE AT TIME OF PAYMENT/ 
TICKET ISSUANCE. COSTS TO MAKE ANY CHANGES AFTER PAYMENT 
ARE THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE CLIENT. 
TRAVELLERS RESPONSIBILITIES ARE AS FOLLOWS: 
PRESENTING APPROPRIATE IDENTITY PAPERS FOR TRAVEL; I.E. A 
PASSPORT OR BIRTH CERTIFICATE AND AN IDENTITY CARD WITH 
A PHOTO AND OR A VISA ACCORDING TO THE DESTINATION AND 
TRAVELLER NATIONALITY. 
COSTS RELATED TO REFUSED DESTINATION ENTRY FOR ANY REASON 
VERIFYING THE SPELLING OF THE NAMES ON THIS INVOICE AT TIME 
OF BOOKING; SHOULD MATCH EXACTLY TO THE DOCUMENTS YOU WILL 
PRESENT AT CHECK-IN AT THE AIRPORT. 
PENALTIES INCURRED TO CHANGE TRAVEL ARRANGEMENTS 
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Scan this barcode 
to check In at any 
Air Canada check 
in kiosk.  

From: Air Canada [mailto:confirmation@aircanada.ca]  

Sent: October-07-13 3:58 PM 
To: Misner, Dawn 

H.buLLEr 
-rRfivEL onl OCT-Ci / 3 

5a3. a5 /./.'"r 6E 002- 

	

/0o. 00 	14s-7- /3 e  Do 

°° /./Sr 	cio 

	

/co,  oo 	1/sr  /3,„oo 

L/30 	 6 .59' 

4i gg6.a5 	115 .a/ 

/) .00 1.46 
****** PLEASE DO NOT REPLY TO THIS E-MAIL ****** 

AIR CANADA ® 

Itinerary/Receipt 
From: Joy Pacada  

changes for NDJUDI 

- • 	.•. 	— N11 

Hotels in Toronto 

Why book your hotel stay at 
aircanada.com? 

Book a hotel 

 

• Lowest price guaranteed 
• Great choice of hotels 
• Aeroplan Mile offer exclusive 

to aircanada.com  

Hotels provided by WWTMS. 

[E Want travel insurance?  Protect yourself and your family against unforeseen circumstances. 

wit 	 ' V■.1) Need a car in Toronto?  Great rates and additional Aeroplan Miles. VA IS 	Budget 
 

a Looking for around transportation or attractions? 

1 



Booking Information 

Booking Referenc NDJUDI 
Customer Care 
Air Canada 
1-888-247-2262 
Flight Arrivals and 
Departures 
1-888-422-7533 

Electronic Ticketing confirmed. This is your official 
itinerary/ receipt. 
Main Contact: 
Miss Rajkamal Dullet 
kdullet(ablg.corn  
Mobile: 1-613-8580600 
Work: 1-613-2375160-34792 

Online Services 

Manage  my booking online (view/change my booking; select seats*). 
Request an upgrade  
Select Seats 
Maole Leaf Lounge I Meal Vouchers I On My Way 
Alert me  of flight status changes directly to my mobile phone or email. 
Flight Arrivals & Departures - check online if my flight is on time. 
Check-in online  and print my boarding pass. 

* Can my booking be changed online? 

Flight Itinerary 

Flight From To 	 Stops Duration Aircraft Upgrade 
status 

AC441 

Ottawa, Ottawa 
Int'l (YOW) 
Wed 09-Oct 2013 
07:00 

Toronto, Pearson 
Int'l (YYZ) 
Wed 09-Oct 2013 
08:07 - Terminal 1 

0 	ihr07 	319 

AC460 

Toronto, Pearson 
Int'l (YYZ) 
Wed 09-Oct 2013 
17:10 - Terminal 1 

Ottawa, Ottawa 
Int'l (YOW) 
Wed 09-Oct 2013 
18:13 

0 	1hr03 319 

Passenger Information 

1: Miss Rajkamal Dullet : Adult (16+), Ticket Number: 0142126362842 

Air Canada - 
	 982540155 

	
Meal Preference : 	Regular 

Aeroplan : 

Payment Card: 	xxxx-xxxx-xxxx- 	 Special Needs: 
	

None 

Seat Selection: 
	

None 

Additional charges and/or refund summary 

Passenger Type 

Air Transportation Charges 
Airfare (includes Surcharges) 

Taxes, Fees and Charges 
Canada Harmonized Sales Tax (GST/HST #10009-2287 RT0001) 

Total Additional Fare 

Extra Charges (Change Fee) 
Change Fee 

Total Extra Charge (Change Fee) 

Number of passengers 

Grand Total - Canadian dollars 

Additional 
charges  

Adult 

120.00  A)E1-  

15.60 PST  

135.60 

0.00 

0.00 

1 

$135.60 

2 



CARLSON WAGONLIT TRAVEL 
885 MEADOWLANDS DR 
SUITE 501 
OTTAWA, ONTARIO 
K2C 3N2 
GST Reel: R113405179 
Branch: 	011138 
Agent: 	JOY PACADA Tel: 613-238-4040 

50017273 

CarlsonWagonlitTr.„Lcel 

KbuLLE-r 
To: BORDEN LADNER GERVAIS YOW 	 Invoice Number: 	79522 

100 QUEEN ST STE 110 	 Date: 	 October 8, 2013 
OTTAWA ON MP 1J9 	 Page: 	 1/3 

Our Reference: 	C6J0106676C TQMQFK 

INVOICE 
AVEL OA] 

a°7--  IC/13 
For 
MS RAJKAMAL DULLET 

AC 	982540155 

Thursday, October 10, 2013 

91c,, Air 

AIR CANADA 

From: OTTAWA ON 
To: 	TORONTO PEARSON 
Stops: 	0 
Seat(s): 16C 

6(06 	8606.1 

I 3  (3° 	/ - 

101.33 
NET 	14  ST 

1/ 

Flight: 479 	11 CLASS 
06:00 AM Equipment: A320 

07:05 AM 	 Mile(s) Flown: 226 

•=f, Air 

AIR CANADA 	 Flight: 460 	V CLASS 
From: TORONTO PEARSON 	 05:10 PM Equipment: A320 
To: 	OTTAWA 	ON 	 06:13 PM 
Stops: 	0 
Seat(s): 26F 
ONLY WINDOW SEAT AVAILABLE 

Mile(s) Flown: 226 

Cost: 

Service Fee CWT*11138-3971635971 

TKT- AC3971635971 	E-TKT 

(CA***********4 43.00 

HST: 5.59 
Service Fee Total: 48.59 

(CA************ 564.00 

HST: 81.02 
Tax: 59.24 

Ticket Total: 704.26 



To: BORDEN LADNER GERVAIS YOW 	 Invoice Number: 	79522 

100 QUEEN ST STE 110 	 Date: 	 October 8, 2013 

OTTAWA ON KIP 1J9 	 Page: 	 2/3 

Our Reference: 	C6J0106676C TQMQFK 

INVOICE 

Total: 
Grand Total: 

Less Credit Card Payments: 

Total GST/HST: 

Credit / Balance Due To This Invoice: 

Total Balance Due: 

339583-00158 

THANK YOU FOR CHOOSING CARLSON WAGONLIT TRAVEL 
TICO REGISTRATION IS 50017273 
CLIENT FUNDS WILL BE DEPOSITED INTO A TRUST ACCOUNT 

BY MAKING A PAYMENT ON THIS BOOKING, THE CLIENT IS ACCEPTING 
THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE SUPPLIER(S). TO UNDERSTAND 
THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS, PLEASE REFER TO THE BROCHURE, 
INTERNET SITE, PAMPHLET OR AIRLINE TICKET CORRESPONDING TO 
YOUR TRIP. ALL RATES ARE SUBJECT TO INCREASE AS PER THE 
SUPPLIERS TERMS AND CONDITIONS. IF INCREASED BY MORE THAN 
SEVEN PERCENT (EXCEPT AS RELATED TO A PST OR GST INCREASE) 
THE CUSTOMER HAS THE RIGHT TO CANCEL AND OBTAIN A FULL 
REFUND. 

PLEASE REVIEW THE ITINERARY/INVOICE AT TIME OF PAYMENT/ 
TICKET ISSUANCE. COSTS TO MAKE ANY CHANGES AFTER PAYMENT 
ARE THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE CLIENT. 
TRAVELLERS RESPONSIBILITIES ARE AS FOLLOWS: 
PRESENTING APPROPRIATE IDENTITY PAPERS FOR TRAVEL; I.E. A 
PASSPORT OR BIRTH CERTIFICATE AND AN IDENTITY CARD WITH 
A PHOTO AND OR A VISA ACCORDING TO THE DESTINATION AND 
TRAVELLER NATIONALITY. 
COSTS RELATED TO REFUSED DESTINATION ENTRY FOR ANY REASON 
VERIFYING THE SPELLING OF THE NAMES ON THIS INVOICE AT TIME 
OF BOOKING; SHOULD MATCH EXACTLY TO THE DOCUMENTS YOU WILL 
PRESENT AT CHECK-IN AT THE AIRPORT. 
PENALTIES INCURRED TO CHANGE TRAVEL ARRANGEMENTS 

752.,5 

86.61 14 ST 
0.00 

0.00 



CARLSON WAGONLIT TRAVEL 
885 MEADOWLANDS DR 
SUITE 501 
OTTAWA, ONTARIO 

K2C 3N2 
GST Reg#: R113405179 
Branch: 	011138 
Agent: 	JOY PACADA Tel: 613-238-4040 

50017273 

CarlsonWagonlitzl 

K. D uLLE-r 

To: BORDEN LADNER GERVAIS YOW 	 Invoice Number: 	79579 
100 QUEEN ST STE 110 	 Date: 	 October 9, 2013 
OTTAWA ON KW 1J9 	 Page: 	 1/3 

Our Reference: 	C6J0106676C TQMQFK 

For 
MS RAJKAMAL DULLET 

AC 	982540155 

INVOICE 
VEL on] 

Ocr-  10/13 

Mile(s) Flown: 226 

AIR CANADA 
From: TORONTO PEARSON 
To: OTTAWA ON 
Stops: 	0 
Seat(s): 26F 
ONLY WINDOW SEAT AVAILABLE 

Cost: 
TKT- AC3971746252 
	

E-TKT EXCHANGED 

Service Fee CWT*11138-3971746252 

Thursday, October 10, 2013 

.1c,, Air 

AIR CANADA 	 F jolt 	I 	U CLASS 
From: OTTAWA 	ON 	 07:00 AM Equipment: A319 
To: 	TORONTO PEARSON 	 08:07 AM 
Stops: 	0 
Seat(s): 28C 

Air 

Flight: 460 	V CLASS 
05:10 PM Equipment: A320 

06:13 PM 
	

Mile(s) Flown: 226 

(CA************ 	 70.00 

	

HST: 	 9.10 

	

Ticket Total: 	 79.10 
(CA***********: 	 43.00 

	

HST: 	 5.59 

	

Service Fee Total: 	 48.59 



To: BORDEN LADNER GERVAIS YOW 	 Invoice Number: 	79579 

100 QUEEN ST STE 110 	 Date: 	 October 9, 2013 

OTTAWA ON KIP 1J9 	 Page: 	 2/3 

Our Reference: 	C6J0106676C TQMQFK 

INVOICE 

Total: 
Grand Total: 

Less Credit Card Payments: 

Total GST/HST: 

Credit / Balance Due To This Invoice: 

Total Previous Payments: 

Total Charges Previous Invoices: 

Total Balance Due: 

TI CKET  EXCHANGE 

THANK YOU FOR CHOOSING CARLSON WAGONLIT TRAVEL 
TICO REGISTRATION IS 50017273 
CLIENT FUNDS WILL BE DEPOSITED INTO A TRUST ACCOUNT 
BY MAKING A PAYMENT ON THIS BOOKING, THE CLIENT IS ACCEPTING 
THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE SUPPLIER(S). TO UNDERSTAND 
THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS, PLEASE REFER TO THE BROCHURE, 
INTERNET SITE, PAMPHLET OR AIRLINE TICKET CORRESPONDING TO 
YOUR TRIP. ALL RATES ARE SUBJECT TO INCREASE AS PER THE 
SUPPLIERS TERMS AND CONDITIONS. IF INCREASED BY MORE THAN 
SEVEN PERCENT (EXCEPT AS RELATED TO A PST OR GST INCREASE) 
THE CUSTOMER HAS THE RIGHT TO CANCEL AND OBTAIN A FULL 
REFUND. 

PLEASE REVIEW THE ITINERARY/INVOICE AT TIME OF PAYMENT/ 
TICKET ISSUANCE. COSTS TO MAKE ANY CHANGES AFTER PAYMENT 
ARE TI-IL RESPONSIBILITY OF THE CLIENT. 
TRAVELLERS RESPONSIBILITIES ARE AS FOLLOWS: 
PRESENTING APPROPRIATE IDENTITY PAPERS FOR TRAVEL; I.E. A 
PASSPORT OR BIRTH CERTIFICATE AND AN IDENTITY CARD WITH 
A PHOTO AND OR A VISA ACCORDING TO THE DESTINATION AND 
TRAVELLER NATIONALITY. 
COSTS RELATED TO REFUSED DESTINATION ENTRY FOR ANY REASON 
VERIFYING THE SPELLING OF THE NAMES ON THIS INVOICE AT TIME 
OF BOOKING; SHOULD MATCH EXACTLY TO THE DOCUMENTS YOU WILL 
PRESENT AT CHECK-IN AT THE AIRPORT. 
PENALTIES INCURRED TO CHANGE TRAVEL ARRANGEMENTS 

127.69 

127.69 

14.69 	ST 
0.00 

752.85 

752.85 

0.00 



bui_LE'r 
L/cr 7-16/3 

BILLABLE INFORMATION: 

Client File No./Name: 	CME re: EGD & Union Combined Facilities - file # 339583-000158 

Borden Ladner Gervais 
BILLABLE EXPENSE REPORT 

NAME: 	Kim Dullet 	 DATE: 11-Oct-13 

Attendance at Hearing on October 9 and 10, 2013 

EXPENSES 

Canadian Expense 	Expenses 
Total 	 Outside 

Expense 	Pre-Tax 	HST 	Canada  

        

Transportation (Air,Bus,Train) 

       

        

Total Kms: 0 kms. $ 	- $ 	- $ 	- $ 
x Rate $ 0.45 

Car Rental $ $ 	- $ 	- $ 

Taxis $ 	232.00 $ 	205.31 $ 	26.69 $ 

Hotel / Lodging $ $ $ $ 

Food and Drink $ 	39.42 $ 	34.89 $ 	4.53 $ 

Parking $ 	38.00 $ 	33.62 $ 	4.38 $ 

Long Distance $ $ $ $ 

Miscellaneous (specify) $ 	- $ $ $ 

TOTALS: $ 	309.42 $ 	273.82 $ 	35.60 $ 

Total Expenses: 	$ 309.42 

Less Travel Advance: 

Reimbursement Total (CDN): 	$ 309.42 

1. Expenses are to be remitted within one week of being incurred 
2. Original receipts are required for all items 

PROFESSIONAL/GROUP LEADER APPROVAL: 	 Signature: 
Peter Thompson 

OTTO1 \4908979 
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Oc-r 
01440118 TAXI 

251 QUEEN SI EASI 
TORONTO 	Oil 

CAB 3248 

teal 1d:6471286 
Invoice H:2120 
VISA PURCHASE 
OPP Label: ESA 
41D:A0080000011810 
TVR: 0500088000 
151: F800 
Card XXXXXXXM 

00 APPROVED 001 

AMOUR 
T IP 

0 AL 

8. EttH HA a verified PIN, cardholdp; 
Fag issuer such total in 

acciAance:th issuer's agreement 
cildi cardholder 

$56.25 
$6.00 

OCT-  (0113 

AIRLIFT SRO TAXI 109 
1125 CRESTLAWH DR UHIT 

MISSISSAUGA ON 
(416) 674-6464 

IERMITAL ID.: 	0089250008024148929999 
MERCHATI 0: 	 8024148929 

VISA 
Ottti414 	aP:**/***4 	CNIP 
EMU SALE 
BATCH: 000061 	MU: 000061 
Oct 10, 7013 	08:51 
0616111AL TRANSACII011 TIME 	08:50 

AID: 60000000031010 
UR: 08 BO BO 80 00 
ISI: F8 00 
IC: 671EA30EOFB7E074 

AIM H 083289 
RECORD: 3 

SALE A111 
	

$52.00 

TIP 
	

$6.00 

RAJKAMRL DULLET 

DV ENIERITG A VERIFIED P14, CARDHOLDER 
AGREES TO PAY ISSUER SUCH TOTAL IH 
ACCORDANCE WITH ISSUER'S AGREEMEHT 0110 
CARDHOLDER 

1-000-268-54H 
WWW.ATRI1FISERUICE.LA 

CUSTOMER COPY 

lief, 11 0010010610 
Entry Method: C 
Auth.11: 040219 

1,..A. 

OCT ( 0 /13 
DI8110110 TAXI 

251 L111EEll ST EAST 
10801110 	88 

CAB 1016 

Tern 10:P9471289 
Invoice 11:635 
VISA PURCHASE 
App Label ESA 
AID:40000000031010 
TUR: 0000008000 
191: F800 
Card 11: XXXXXXHXX) 

00 APPROVED 001 

AMOUNT 	 $49.75 
TIP 	 $6. 00 

TOT AL 

By entering a verified PIT, cardholder 
agrees 10 pily issuer such total in 
accordance with issuer's agreement 
with cardholder 

Ref. 11: 8010016110 
Egf9 Method: C 
Auth.0: 048896 
Date: 2013/10/10 	Iime: 03113P 

***GUST ONER COPY*** 



Subtotal 
Tax 
Payment 
VISA 	AO DL 

SSP America 
Camden Domestic, Ti 

Lester B. Pearson Intl Airport 
GST # 825875560RT001 

416-776-2477 

2.3 HARSHADA  

SSP America 
Camden Domestic T1 

Lester B. Pearson Intl Airport 
GST # 825875560RT001 

416-776-2477 

658 Elizabet 

    

Chk 1574 	OcffigrT 02:32P Gst 0 

    

;1318 :09A Gst 0 

             

**TO GQ** 
Yogurt Peach 3,00 
Dasani 591m1 2.69 
Cash 10.00 

Food 3.00 
NA Bev 2.69 
HST Tax 145r 0..74 
Payment 6.45= 
Change Due 3.55 

FEEDBACK 
Dish Up Your Expetience. 

We appreciate feedback 
about your visit.. 

Please call us.  1 877 325 8777 
Or email 

feedback@foodtravelexperts.com  

**-170 GC)** 
1 Chic Avocado 
	

10 .00 
$ Aged Swiss 
	

1.00 
XXXXXXXXXXX 
Visa 
	 12.43 

Food 
	

11.00 
HST Tax 
	

f-/Sr 1.43 
Payment 

FEEDBACK 
Dish Up Your Experience. 

We appreciate feedback 
ahnHt vnlir visit 

BAR 120 
HMSHOST TORONTO PEARSON INT'L 

1004 SURSATTIE 

CHK 8379 ODT10 1 	8:12AM 

1 SML YOGURT 
	

3.00 
1 SML MONTCLAIR 
	

2.79 
1 SML FRESH FRUIT 
	

1.39 

Thank you, Questions & Comments 
Loronto.comments@hmshost.com  

GST # 1375'12901 

APPlicatioo Label; VISA 
AID: A0000000031010 
TVR: 00 00 00 80 00 

1ST: F8 00 

Merchant COPY 

SSP America 
Camden Domestic T1 

Lester B. Pearson Intl Airport 
GST # 825875560RT001 

416-776-2477 

423 PARLA-KA 

Chk 2341 	Dot-1 

**TQ GO** 

03:36P 	Gst 	0 

1 Chic Avocado 10.00 
$ Mild Cheddar 1.00 

XXXXXXXXXXXX 
Visa 12.43 

Food 11.00 
HST Tax 1.43 
Payment 12.43 

FEEDBACK 
Dish Up Your Experience. 

We appreciate feedback 



Aeroport ..'Ottawa Airport 

Exit 2 	09/10/13 16:22 
Receipt 067796 

Ticket/Billet 
P1 - No. 011767 
09/10/13 06:20 -
09/10/13 16:22 -
Period OdlOh3' 
(CAN) 	 $19.00 

Total 	 $19.00 	, 

Payment Received 
VISA 	 .0 
XXXXXXXXXXX 	

$19 
08/104 

Merch:82008580037 
Auth:090918 
Type: Swiped 

Sub Total 	 $16.81 
HST 	13% 	wr  2.19 

'HST#TVH 898569942RT.CAD 
Good day Au revoir 

A4roport d'Ottawa Airport 

Ce-r--  10 
Exit 4 	10/10/13 17:17 
Receipt 070226 

Ticket/Billet 
P1 - No. 013701 
10/10/13 06:22 -
10/10/13 17:17 -
Period 0d1056' 
(CAN) 	 $19.00 

Total 	 ( $19.00 

Payment Received 
VISA 	 .0 
XXXXXXXXXXX, 	

$19 
08/104 

Merch:82008580037 
Auth:046538 
Type: Swiped 

Sub Total 	 $16.81 
HST 	13% 	ilsr- 2.19 

'HST#TVH 898569942RT.CAD 
Good day Au revoir 
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