T
DR QUINN & ASSOCIATES LTD.

VIA E-MAIL, RESS & COURIER TO THE BOARD
March 6, 2014

Ontario Energy Board
P.O. Box 2319

27" Floor

2300 Yonge Street
Toronto ON M4P 1E4

Attn:  Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary
RE: EB-2012-0451 ENBRIDGE GAS DISTRIBUTION- GTA REINFORCEMENT

EB-2012-0433 UNION GAS - PARKWAY WEST PROJECT
EB-2013-0074 UNION GAS - BRANTFORD-KIRKWALL/PARKWAY D

Please find attached the cost claim of the Federation of Rental-housing Providers of Ontario
(FRPO) for the above noted proceedings. We are appreciative of the utilities indulgence on the
timing of formal submission.

Respectfully Submitted on Behalf of FRPO,
//’ | 4 /7 »
/\(/(,UW A——

Dwayne R. Quinn
Principal
DR QUINN & ASSOCIATES LTD.

C. J. Wasylyk - Board Staff
K. Hockin - Union
E. Chin - EGD
L. Cooper - FRPO

* 130 Muscovey, Drive * Elmira, ON ¢ N3B 3P7 ¢ drquinn@rogers.com ¢ (519)-500-1022 e




ilfrpo

Federation of Rental-housing [l Providers of Ontario

Invoice To Invoice
Ontario Energy Board
Attn: Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary Date Invoice #
P.O. Box 2319, 27th Floor
2300 Yonge Street 04/03/14 QUINN 78
Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

P.O. No. Terms Project
Upon Receipt
Description Qty Rate Amount
Cost Claim of the Federation of Rental-housing Providers of Ontario 45,154.87 45,154.87
EB-2012-0433 & EB-2013-0074
RE: DR Quinn and Associates Ltd.
HST (ON) on sales 13.00% 5,870.13
Total $51,025.00
Balance Due $51,025.00

20 Upjohn Road - Suite 105 - Toronto, ON - M3B 2V9 - Telephone: 416.385.1100



ilfrpo

Federation of Rental-housing [l Providers of Ontario

Invoice To Invoice
Ontario Energy Board
Attn: Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary Date Invoice #
P.O. Box 2319, 27th Floor
2300 Yonge Street 04/03/14 QUINN 78
Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

P.O. No. Terms Project
Upon Receipt
Description Qty Rate Amount
Cost Claim of the Federation of Rental-housing Providers of Ontario 53,036.37 53,036.37
EB-2012-0451
RE: DR Quinn and Associates Ltd.
HST (ON) on sales 13.00% 6,894.73
Total $59,931.10
Balance Due $59,931.10

20 Upjohn Road - Suite 105 - Toronto, ON - M3B 2V9 - Telephone: 416.385.1100



DR QUINN & ASSOCIATES LTD. Invoice

130 Muscovey Drive, _
Elmira, ON N3B 3P7 Date Invoice #
(519) 500-1022 15/02/2014 78

drquinn@rogers.com

Invoice To

Federation of Rental-housing Providers ON
Mike Chopowick

20 Upjohn Road, Suite 105

Toronto, Ontario

M3B 2V9
Terms
Net 60

Service Dates Description Qty Rate Amount

FRPO REPRESENTATION IN EB-2012-0451 ENBRIDGE GAS

DISTRIBUTION GTA REINFORCEMENT
29/10/2012 STAKEHOLDER MEETING 1.5] 330.00 495.00
11/03/2013 REVIEW EVIDENCE 3| 330.00 990.00
29/03/2013 REVIEW EVIDENCE 25| 330.00 825.00
12/04/2013 REVIEW EVIDENCE - IDENTIFY ISSUES 2| 330.00 660.00
13/04/2013 REVIEW EVIDENCE - IDENTIFY ISSUES - REQUEST MAPS OF EGD 2| 330.00 660.00
24/04/2013 PREPARE EGD ISSUES 2| 330.00 660.00
26/04/2013 ISSUES CONFERENCE 2| 330.00 660.00
30/04/2013 ISSUES DAY 2| 330.00 660.00
09/05/2013 REVIEW BOARD DECISION - LETTER TO EGD 1] 330.00 330.00
13/05/2013 CROSS REFERENCE APPLICATIONS - REVIEW EGD MAP 2.5| 330.00 825.00
15/05/2013 REVIEW PAST FACILITY APPLICATIONS - DRAFT IR'S 4| 330.00 1,320.00
16/05/2013 REVIEW EVIDENCE - COMMUNICATION WITH EGD 1] 330.00 330.00
18/05/2013 REVIEW EVIDENCE - DRAFT IR'S 41 330.00 1,320.00
19/05/2013 DRAFT IR'S 11 330.00 330.00
20/05/2013 DRAFT IR'S 4| 330.00 1,320.00
21/05/2013 REFINE IR'S AND SUBMIT 1.5] 330.00 495.00
08/06/2013 REVIEW IRR'S 2| 330.00 660.00
09/06/2013 REVIEW IRR'S 4| 330.00 1,320.00
10/06/2013 PREPARE TECH CONF QUESTIONS 1.5] 330.00 495.00
11/06/2013 PREPARE TECH CONF QUESTIONS 2.5] 330.00 825.00
12/06/2013 ATTEND TECH CONF 41 330.00 1,320.00
12/06/2013 REFINE QUESTIONS - REVIEW TRANSCRIPT - SUBMIT QUESTIONS TO 2| 330.00 660.00

EGD
13/06/2013 ATTEND TECH CONF 3.5] 330.00 1,155.00
26/06/2013 REVIEW UNDERTAKING RESPONSES 1.5] 330.00 495.00
30/06/2013 REVIEW UNION MOTION - INTERVENOR COMMUNICATION 11 330.00 330.00

Total

GST/HST No. 820292415

Page 1




DR QUINN & ASSOCIATES LTD. Invoice

130 Muscovey Drive, _
Elmira, ON N3B 3P7 Date Invoice #
(519) 500-1022 15/02/2014 78

drquinn@rogers.com

Invoice To

Federation of Rental-housing Providers ON
Mike Chopowick

20 Upjohn Road, Suite 105

Toronto, Ontario

M3B 2V9
Terms
Net 60
Service Dates Description Qty Rate Amount
03/07/2013 REVIEW INTERVENOR EVIDENCE - IDENTIFY ISSUES 3.5] 330.00 1,155.00
04/07/2013 REVIEW UNION MOTION RECORD - DRAFT IR'S 3.5] 330.00 1,155.00
05/07/2013 INTERVENOR COMMUNICATION - DRAFT AND SUBMIT INTERVENOR 25| 330.00 825.00
EVIDENCE R'S
10/07/2013 PROVIDE SUBMISSION - REVIEW EGD LETTER TO BOARD 1.5] 330.00 495.00
16/07/2013 REVIEW GTA APPROACH 0.5] 330.00 165.00
21/07/2013 REVIEW INTERVENOR IRR'S 1.5] 330.00 495.00
12/08/2013 REVIEW UPDATED TCPL EVIDENCE 11 330.00 330.00
13/08/2013 REVIEW EGD UPDATED IRR'S 2| 330.00 660.00
20/08/2013 PREPARE AND SUBMIT IR'S ON TCPL REVISED EVIDENCE 2.5] 330.00 825.00
21/08/2013 REVIEW OF EVIDENCE - DISCUSSION WITH EGD STAFF 1] 330.00 330.00
22/08/2013 REVIEW IRR'S EGD EVIDENCE 2| 330.00 660.00
26/08/2013 REVIEW TCPL IRR's AND EVIDENCE 2| 330.00 660.00
28/08/2013 SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE AND PREPARATION 55| 330.00 1,815.00
02/09/2013 REVISE CROSS ESTIMATES - EMAIL BOARD STAFF 1] 330.00 330.00
05/09/2013 ATTEND PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE 1.5] 330.00 495.00
14/09/2013 PREPARE CROSS 2.5| 330.00 825.00
19/09/2013 ATTEND HEARING 2| 330.00 660.00
23/09/2013 PREPARE EGD CROSS 3| 330.00 990.00
24/09/2013 ATTEND HEARING 4| 330.00 1,320.00
25/09/2013 PREPARE CROSS 1.5] 330.00 495.00
26/09/2013 ATTEND HEARING 45| 330.00 1,485.00
26/09/2013 PREPARE/REFINE CROSS 2.5] 330.00 825.00
27/09/2013 ATTEND HEARING 4| 330.00 1,320.00
01/10/2013 LETTER TO THE BOARD REGARDING SETTLEMENT 11 330.00 330.00
04/10/2013 REVIEW EGD UNDERTAKINGS AND PREPARE CROSS 45| 330.00 1,485.00
07/10/2013 PREPARE CROSS OF JOINT PANEL 2.5] 330.00 825.00
08/10/2013 ATTEND HEARING 2| 330.00 660.00
Total
GST/HST No. 820292415
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DR QUINN & ASSOCIATES LTD. Invoice

130 Muscovey Drive, _
Elmira, ON N3B 3P7 Date Invoice #
(519) 500-1022 15/02/2014 78

drquinn@rogers.com

Invoice To

Federation of Rental-housing Providers ON
Mike Chopowick

20 Upjohn Road, Suite 105

Toronto, Ontario

M3B 2V9
Terms
Net 60

Service Dates Description Qty Rate Amount
09/10/2013 ATTEND HEARING 41 330.00] 1,320.00
19/10/2013 REVIEW UNDERTAKINGS 1] 330.00 330.00
25/10/2013 REVIEW EGD UNDERTAKINGS 2] 330.00 660.00
30/10/2013 REVIEW IRR'S AND UNDERTAKINGS 2| 330.00 660.00
04/11/2013 REVIEW SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT - EMAIL BOARD STAFF AND 3] 330.00 990.00

INTERVENORS
05/11/2013 PREPARE AND EMAIL CONCERNS AND OUTLINE ARGUMENT 3] 330.00 990.00
06/11/2013 COMMUNICATION REGARDING SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT - 3] 330.00 990.00

FURTHER REVIEW
07/11/2013 SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT COMMUNICATION - OUTLINE ARGUMENT 2| 330.00 660.00
08/11/2013 DRAFT ARGUMENT 1.5( 330.00 495.00
10/11/2013 SEND ARGUMENT OUTLINE TO INTERVENOR 1] 330.00 330.00
11/11/2013 DRAFT ARGUMENT 1.5( 330.00 495.00
07/11/2013 FINALIZE AND SUBMIT ARGUMENT 41 330.00] 1,320.00

DISBURSEMENTS
29/10/2012 Mileage Charged to Client 280 0.40 112.00
25/04/2013 HOTEL ACCOMMODATION 206.55 206.55
25/04/2013 Mileage Charged to Client 140 0.40 56.00
26/04/2013 PARKING 15.93 15.93
30/04/2013 PARKING 15.93 15.93
11/06/2013 HOTEL ACCOMMODATION 184.52 184.52
12/06/2013 LUNCH 9.96 9.96
12/06/2013 SUPPER 16.63 16.63
27/08/2013 HOTEL ACCOMMODATION 184.52 184.52
27/08/2013 Mileage Charged to Client 140 0.40 56.00
05/09/2013 PARKING 17.70 17.70
05/09/2013 Mileage Charged to Client 140 0.40 56.00

Total

GST/HST No. 820292415
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DR QUINN & ASSOCIATES LTD. Invoice

130 Muscovey Drive, _
Elmira, ON N3B 3P7 Date Invoice #
(519) 500-1022 15/02/2014 78

drquinn@rogers.com

Invoice To

Federation of Rental-housing Providers ON
Mike Chopowick

20 Upjohn Road, Suite 105

Toronto, Ontario

M3B 2V9
Terms
Net 60
Service Dates Description Qty Rate Amount
23/09/2013 HOTEL ACCOMMODATION 211.07 211.07
23/09/2013 Mileage Charged to Client 140 0.40 56.00
24/09/2013 Mileage Charged to Client 140 0.40 56.00
24/09/2013 PARKING 17.70 17.70
26/09/2013 Mileage Charged to Client 140 0.40 56.00
26/09/2013 LUNCH 6.98 6.98
26/09/2013 SUPPER 14.46 14.46
26/09/2013 PARKING 17.70 17.70
26/09/2013 HOTEL ACCOMMODATION 211.07 211.07
27/09/2013 BREAKFAST 6.20 6.20
27/09/2013 LUNCH 9.96 9.96
27/09/2013 PARKING 17.70 17.70
27/09/2013 Mileage Charged to Client 140 0.40 56.00
30/09/2013 Mileage Charged to Client 140 0.40 56.00
30/09/2013 SUPPER 17.37 17.37
30/09/2013 HOTEL ACCOMMODATION 211.07 211.07
01/10/2013 SUPPER 17.58 17.58
01/10/2013 HOTEL ACCOMMODATION 211.07 211.07
02/10/2013 LUNCH 7.03 7.03
02/10/2013 SUPPER 17.58 17.58
02/10/2013 HOTEL ACCOMMODATION 211.07 211.07
02/10/2013 Mileage Charged to Client 140 0.40 56.00
08/10/2013 Mileage Charged to Client 140 0.40 56.00
08/10/2013 PARKING 17.70 17.70
08/10/2013 LUNCH 9.96 9.96
08/10/2013 SUPPER 17.58 17.58
09/10/2013 HOTEL ACCOMMODATION 211.07 211.07
10/10/2013 BREAKFAST 3.24 3.24
Total
GST/HST No. 820292415
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DR QUINN & ASSOCIATES LTD. Invoice

130 Muscovey Drive, _
Elmira, ON N3B 3P7 Date Invoice #
(519) 500-1022 15/02/2014 78

drquinn@rogers.com

Invoice To

Federation of Rental-housing Providers ON
Mike Chopowick

20 Upjohn Road, Suite 105

Toronto, Ontario

M3B 2V9
Terms
Net 60
Service Dates Description Qty Rate Amount
10/10/2013 LUNCH 9.96 9.96
10/10/2013 SUPPER 17.70 17.70
10/10/2013 HOTEL ACCOMMODATION 211.07 211.07
11/10/2013 PARKING 17.70 17.70
11/10/2013 Mileage Charged to Client 140 0.40 56.00
HST on Sales 13.00%| 6,902.52
Total $59,998.85
GST/HST No. 820292415

Page 5



DR QUINN & ASSOCIATES LTD. Invoice

130 Muscovey Drive,

Elmira, ON N3B 3P7 Date Invoice #
(519) 500-1022 15/02/2014 76

drquinn@rogers.com

Invoice To

Federation of Rental-housing Providers ON
Mike Chopowick

20 Upjohn Road, Suite 105

Toronto, Ontario

M3B 2V9
Terms
Net 60
Service Dates Description Qty Rate Amount
FRPO REPRESENTATION: UNION APPLICATIONS EB-2012-0433 &
EB-2013-0074

22/03/2013 REVIEW EVIDENCE FOR PARKWAY WEST (0433) 1.5] 330.00 495.00
25/03/2013 REVIEW EVIDENCE FOR PARKWAY WEST (0433) 2| 330.00 660.00
26/03/2013 REVIEW SUMMARY PRESENTATION AND EVIDENCE (0074) 11 330.00 330.00
11/04/2013 REVIEW EVIDENCE - DRAFT ISSUES (0433) 2.5] 330.00 825.00
15/04/2013 REVIEW EVIDENCE - DRAFT ISSUES (0074) 1.5] 330.00 495.00
16/04/2013 PREPARE ISSUES (0074) 11 330.00 330.00
24/04/2013 PREPARE ISSUES (0433) 1.5] 330.00 495.00
26/04/2013 ISSUES CONFERENCE 2| 330.00 660.00
30/04/2013 ISSUES DAY 2| 330.00 660.00
15/05/2013 REVIEW AND CROSS-REFERENCE APPLICATIONS 11 330.00 330.00
16/05/2013 DRAFT ISSUES AND IR'S (0074) 1] 330.00 330.00
21/05/2013 DRAFT IR'S (0433) 2| 330.00 660.00
21/05/2013 DRAFT IR'S (0074) 1.5] 330.00 495.00
07/06/2013 REVIEW IRR'S (0074) 2| 330.00 660.00
08/06/2013 REVIEW IRR'S (0433) 3| 330.00 990.00
09/06/2013 PREPARE TECH CONF QUESTIONS (0433) 1] 330.00 330.00
09/06/2013 PREPARE TECH CONF QUESTIONS (0074) 1] 330.00 330.00
13/06/2013 ATTEND TECH CONF 2.5| 330.00 825.00
20/06/2013 REVIEW UNDERTAKING RESPONSES 2| 330.00 660.00
26/06/2013 REVIEW UNION MOTION 1] 330.00 330.00
10/07/2013 REVIEW UNION-EGD SUBMISSIONS 1.5] 330.00 495.00
12/07/2013 CONTACT INTERVENOR - PREPARE AND SUBMIT IR'S TO TCPL 2| 330.00 660.00
19/07/2013 REVIEW TCPL IRR'S 1.5] 330.00 495.00
14/08/2013 REVIEW IRR'S 3| 330.00 990.00
29/08/2013 SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE AND PREPARATION 45| 330.00 1,485.00
05/09/2013 ATTEND PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE 1.5] 330.00 495.00

Total

GST/HST No. 820292415

Page 1




DR QUINN & ASSOCIATES LTD. Invoice

130 Muscovey Drive, _
Elmira, ON N3B 3P7 Date Invoice #
(519) 500-1022 15/02/2014 76

drquinn@rogers.com

Invoice To

Federation of Rental-housing Providers ON
Mike Chopowick

20 Upjohn Road, Suite 105

Toronto, Ontario

M3B 2V9

Terms

Net 60
Service Dates Description Qty Rate Amount

09/09/2013 REVIEW RECORD - PREPARE CROSS 3| 330.00 990.00
10/09/2013 REVIEW RECORD - PREPARE CROSS 2] 330.00 660.00
11/09/2013 REVIEW RECORD - PREPARE & REVISE CROSS AFTER EMAIL 7] 330.00( 2,310.00
12/09/2013 ATTEND HEARING, MEET WITH UTILITIES, REVIEW AGREEMENT, 6| 330.00( 1,980.00
DISCUSS WITH INTERVENORS

13/09/2013 ATTEND IN-CAMERA MEETING WITH UTILITIES 6.5] 330.00 2,145.00
14/09/2013 PREPARE REVISED CROSS 2| 330.00 660.00
16/09/2013 ATTEND HEARING 6| 330.00( 1,980.00
16/09/2013 REVIEW TRANSCRIPT - REVISE CROSS 1] 330.00 330.00
17/09/2013 ATTEND HEARING 45| 330.00( 1,485.00
18/09/2013 PREPARE COMPENDIUM - FINALIZE CROSS 2.5] 330.00 825.00
19/09/2013 ATTEND HEARING 2.5] 330.00 825.00
28/09/2013 REVIEW UNION UNDERTAKINGS 1.5] 330.00 495.00
01/10/2013 REVIEW OF UNDERTAKINGS AND LETTER TO THE BOARD 1.5 330.00 495.00
07/10/2013 PREPARE CROSS OF JOINT PANEL 1.5 330.00 495.00
08/10/2013 ATTEND HEARING 2| 330.00 660.00
09/10/2013 ATTEND HEARING 2| 330.00 660.00
11/10/2013 REVIEW UNION UNDERTAKINGS 2| 330.00 660.00
19/10/2013 REVIEW UNION UNDERTAKINGS 1.5 330.00 495.00
25/10/2013 REVIEW UNION ARGUMENT-IN-CHIEF 2| 330.00 660.00
30/10/2013 REVIEW RECORD 2| 330.00 660.00
04/11/2013 REVIEW SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT - EMAIL BOARD STAFF 1& 3] 330.00 990.00
INTERVENORS
05/11/2013 PREPARE & COMMUNICATE CONCERNS - COMMUNICATION WITH 2| 330.00 660.00
INTERVENORS
06/11/2013 COMMUNICATION WITH BOARD STAFF AND INTERVENORS - 3.5] 330.00( 1,155.00

OUTLINE ARGUMENT

Total

GST/HST No. 820292415

Page 2




DR QUINN & ASSOCIATES LTD. Invoice

130 Muscovey Drive, _
Elmira, ON N3B 3P7 Date Invoice #
(519) 500-1022 15/02/2014 76

drquinn@rogers.com

Invoice To

Federation of Rental-housing Providers ON
Mike Chopowick

20 Upjohn Road, Suite 105

Toronto, Ontario

M3B 2V9
Terms
Net 60
Service Dates Description Qty Rate Amount
07/11/2013 SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT COMMUNICATIONS - OUTLINE 2| 330.00 660.00
ARGUMENT
08/11/2013 REVIEW DAWN-PARKWAY TECHNICAL FIGURES - DRAFT ARGUMENT 3.5] 330.00] 1,155.00
09/11/2013 CREATE DAWN-PARKWAY MODEL - EMAIL BOARD STAFF 6.5] 330.00| 2,145.00
10/11/2013 SEND ARGUMENT OUTLINE TO INTERVENORS 1] 330.00 330.00
12/11/2013 DRAFT ARGUMENT 1] 330.00 330.00
15/11/2013 DRAFT ARGUMENT 2] 330.00 660.00
16/11/2013 FINALIZE ARGUMENT 3] 330.00 990.00
DISBURSEMENTS
29/04/2013 HOTEL ACCOMMODATION 180.00 180.00
12/06/2013 HOTEL ACCOMMODATION 184.52 184.52
13/06/2013 LUNCH 9.96 9.96
28/08/2013 HOTEL ACCOMMODATION 184.52 184.52
12/09/2013 SUPPER 14.95 14.95
12/09/2013 PARKING 17.70 17.70
12/09/2013 MILEAGE CHARGED TO CLIENT 140 0.40 56.00
12/09/2013 HOTEL ACCOMMODATION 211.07 211.07
13/09/2013 PARKING 17.70 17.70
13/09/2013 LUNCH 9.96 9.96
13/09/2013 Mileage Charged to Client 140 0.40 56.00
13/09/2013 Mileage Charged to Client 140 0.40 56.00
16/09/2013 PARKING 17.70 17.70
16/09/2013 LUNCH 9.96 9.96
16/09/2013 SUPPER 13.01 13.01
16/09/2013 HOTEL ACCOMMODATION 184.52 184.52
17/09/2013 PARKING 17.70 17.70
17/09/2013 LUNCH 9.96 9.96
Total
GST/HST No. 820292415
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DR QUINN & ASSOCIATES LTD. Invoice

130 Muscovey Drive, _
Elmira, ON N3B 3P7 Date Invoice #
(519) 500-1022 15/02/2014 76

drquinn@rogers.com

Invoice To

Federation of Rental-housing Providers ON
Mike Chopowick

20 Upjohn Road, Suite 105

Toronto, Ontario

M3B 2V9
Terms
Net 60
Service Dates Description Qty Rate Amount
17/09/2013 Mileage Charged to Client 140 0.40 56.00
19/09/2013 Mileage Charged to Client 140 0.40 56.00
19/09/2013 BREAKFAST 6.20 6.20
19/09/2013 PARKING 17.70 17.70
19/09/2013 SUPPER 15.00 15.00
08/10/2013 HOTEL ACCOMMODATION 211.07 211.07
09/10/2013 LUNCH 9.96 9.96
09/10/2013 SUPPER 17.37 17.37
HST on Sales 13.00%| 5,940.42
Total $51,635.95
GST/HST No. 820292415

Page 4




Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost
claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other
parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is
signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are present in the document to assist with the calculation of the
cost claim.
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.

Rate: Country:

- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed™ (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of
Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each consultant or lawyer/articling student/paralegal. However, only one

"Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.

- A CV for each consultant must be attached unless, for a given consultant, a CV has been provided to the Board in another process
within the last 24 months.

- Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

File # EB- EB-2012-0451 Process: ENBRIDGE GTA REINFORCEMENT
Party: Federation of Rental-housing Prov. Of Ont. Affiant's Name: Dwayne R. Quinn
HST Number: 82029 2415 RT0001 HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%
Full Registrant Qualifying Non-Profit O
Unregistered ] Tax Exempt O
Other O
Affidavit
1, R. Dwayne Quinn , of the City/Town of Elmira
in the Province/State of Ontario , swear or affirm that:

1.1 am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.
2. | have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".
3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of

Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the

Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.
4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as

described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

Signature of Affiant

Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of \_, -\ o A\—~— .
in the Province/State of (™\_ N\ >~ > ,on o Sl 20N .

(date)

\ Heather Anne Grant, a Commissioner, etc.,
;gge& e B S Provinoeofomario for Dueck, Sauer, Jutzi & Noil LLP
Commissioner for taking Affidavits . Expires November 2, 2016.
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Ontario Energy Board %%i
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS A

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- EB-2012-0451 Process: ENBRIDGE GTA REINFORCEMENT

Party: Federation of Rental-housing Prov. Of Ont.

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Legal/consultant fees $49,995.00
Disbursements $3,119.24
HST $6,884.57
Total Cost Claim $59,998.81
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Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Oirtano

File # EB- 2012-0451 Process: ENBRIDGE GTA REINFORCEMENT
Party: Federation of Rental-housing Prov. of Ont  Name: Dwayne R. Quinn
Completed Years
Practising/Years of relevant
experience
Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: ]
Consultant: 26
CV attached: CV not required: L]
Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Hours Hourly Subtotal HST Total
rate
Preparation 108.50 [ $330.00| $35,805.00 $4,654.65 $40,459.65
Attendance - Technical Conference 7.50| $330.00( $2,475.00 $321.75 $2,796.75
Attendance - Settlement Conference 7.00 | $330.00] $2,310.00 $300.30 $2,610.30
Attendance - Oral Hearing 20.50 | $330.00| S$6,765.00 $879.45 $7,644.45
Argument 8.00 | $330.00| $2,640.00 $343.20 $2,983.20
Case Management 0.00| $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES | | | $49,995.00]  $6,499.35] $56,494.35|
Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed
Net Cost HST Total
Photocopies $0.00 $0.00
Printing $S0.00 $0.00
Fax $0.00 $0.00
Courier $S0.00 $0.00
Telephone $0.00 $0.00
Postage $0.00 $0.00
Transcripts $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Air $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Car $728.00 $94.64 $822.64
Travel: Rail $0.00 $0.00
Travel (Other): | $0.00 $0.00
Parking $156.00 included $156.00
Taxi or Airport Limo $0.00 $0.00
Accommodation $2,053.08 $266.90 $2,319.98
Meals $182.16 $23.68 $205.84
Other: $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: | $3,119.24]  $385.22] $3,504.46 |

lof1l



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost
claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other
parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is
signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are present in the document to assist with the calculation of the
cost claim.
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.

Rate: Country:

- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed™ (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a ' Statement of
Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each consultant or lawyer/articling student/paralegal. However, only one

"Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.

- A CV for each consultant must be attached unless, for a given consultant, a CV has been provided to the Board in another process
within the last 24 months.

- Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

File # EB- EB-2012-0433 & 2013-0074 Process: UNION BRANTFORD-KIRKWALL & PARKWAY
Party: Federation of Rental-housing Prov. Of Ont. Affiant's Name: Dwayne R. Quinn
HST Number: 82029 2415 RT0001 HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%

Full Registrant Qualifying Non-Profit 1l

Unregistered L] Tax Exempt ]

Other O
Affidavit

1, R. Dwayne Quinn , of the City/Town of Elmira
in the Province/State of Ontario , swear or affirm that:

1. 1 am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.

2. | have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements
Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".

3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of
Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the

Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.
4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as

described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

Loyopr 2

Signature of Affiant
Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of \\ -\ XD ,
in the Province/State of T O~ ,on Bl 20 O

(date)

Heather Anne Grant, a Commissioner, etc..
vameofomam forDueck,SauerJulzi&NoﬂLLF
. fictors. Expires November 2, 2016.

Page 1 of 2



Ontario Energy Board %%i
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS A

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- EB-2012-0433 & 2013-0074 Process: UNION BRANTFORD-KIRKWALL & PARKWAY

Party: Federation of Rental-housing Prov. Of Ont.

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Legal/consultant fees S44,055.00
Disbursements $1,652.03
HST $5,928.91
Total Cost Claim $51,635.94

Page 2 of 2



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

kgt

Oirtano

File # EB- EB-2012-0433 & 2013-0074 Process: UNION BRANTFORD-KIRKWALL & PARKWAY
Party: Federation of Rental-housing Prov. of Ont  Name: Dwayne R. Quinn
Completed Years
Practising/Years of relevant
experience
Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: ]
Consultant: 26
CV attached: CV not required: L]
Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Hours Hourly Subtotal HST Total
rate
Preparation 91.50 | $330.00( $30,195.00 $3,925.35 $34,120.35
Attendance - Technical Conference 2.50| $330.00 $825.00 $107.25 $932.25
Attendance - Settlement Conference 6.00 | $330.00] $1,980.00 $257.40 $2,237.40
Attendance - Oral Hearing 23.00 | $330.00| $7,590.00 $986.70 $8,576.70
Argument 10.50 | $330.00| $3,465.00 $450.45 $3,915.45
Case Management 0.00| $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES | | | $44,055.00]  $5,727.15] $49,782.15|
Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed
Net Cost HST Total
Photocopies $0.00 $0.00
Printing $S0.00 $0.00
Fax $0.00 $0.00
Courier $S0.00 $0.00
Telephone $0.00 $0.00
Postage $0.00 $0.00
Transcripts $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Air $0.00 $0.00
Travel: Car $280.00 $36.40 $316.40
Travel: Rail $0.00 $0.00
Travel (Other): | $0.00 $0.00
Parking $100.00 included $100.00
Taxi or Airport Limo $0.00 $0.00
Accommodation $1,155.70 $150.24 $1,305.94
Meals $116.33 $15.12 $131.45
Other: $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: | $1,652.03  $201.76 $1,853.79|

lof1l



WESTGTa  EB-2002-64S1 /0433 45132074
,\\a rrott. HST REGISTRATION # 842713090

TORONTO DOWNTOWN 525 B treet, T i
spcsbirtes ay Street, Toronto, ON M5G 212 = 416.597.9200 = Marriott.com/YYZEC

—

1507 QUINN/DWAYNE/MR 180.00 04/26/13 12:00 1710
Room Name Rate Depart Time Acc‘r #
GK_ DR QUINN & ASSOCIATE 80  04/25/13 19:24
144
Room Payment RWD# H XXXXX3 2 7 0
Clerk Address
DATE | REFERENCE |  cHArRGes | CREDITS | BALANCE DUE
04/25 SELFPARK # 171041 .00
04/25 SELFPARK 04é25/13 30.00 0
04/25 ROOM 1507, 1 180.00 :
04/25 RM TX 1507, 1 23.40 MN
04/26 VS CARD $233.40
TO BE SETTLED TO: VISA CURRENT BALANCE .00

THANK YOU FOR CHOOSING MARRIOTT! TO EXPEDITE YOUR CHECK-OUT,
PLEASE CALL THE FRONT DESK, OR PRESS "MENU" ON YOUR
TV REMOTE CONTROL TO ACCESS VIDEO CHECK-OUT.

------------------- TAXES & FEE SUMMARY ----=---------c-=u--
___DESCRIPTION " " " "TAXED AMOUNT TAX
GST ROOM AG i ~ L00%
GST OTHER DH .00
PROVINCIAL SALES TAX (BEFJKL) .00
DESTINATION MKT FEE c& .00
HST MNO) 26.85
NET CHARGES TAX CREDITS FOLIO
206.55 26.85 .00 233.40
------------------- EXP. REPORT SUMMARY =---------o-mmmme--
04/25 SELFPARK 30.00
ROOM&TAX 203.40

AS REQUESTED, A FINAL COPY OF YOUR BILL WILL BE EMAILED TO:
DRQUINN@GROGERS . COM
SEE "INTERNET PRIVACY STATEMENT" ON MARRIOTT.COM

Your Rewards 1goirﬂ:s/mi]es earned on your eligible earnings
will be credited to your account. Check your
Rewards Account Statement for updated activity.

BETHR 8RS 8| HILSPEF]
WD - - QM O OO --*ngmmg
SEgeS SaF & 83 3sCss:
S ST S 8 STYL
LR = = g
A 3 - < = S ™o
This statement is your only receipt. You have agreed to pay in cash or by approved person: - i 4
to you. The amount shown in the credits column opposite any credit card entry in the refei [ax o I oz H
(The credit card company will bill in the usual manner.) If for any reason the credit card ca &5 b=
If you are direct billed, in the event payment is not made within 25 days after checkout, yo E E - = . i
rate of 1.5% per month (ANNUAL RATE 18%), or the maximum allowed by law, plus the ri : - &0 ~ B 8 52 ..
e E 2= ,,5FF =
Signature X o T 28 Es s SEES]
lgos BECEE Sy« B 82 EEE
H BN I D B O5F o0t SRS ER REEE
7-2955 Rev.10/08

OEST QTA



WesT GTA.

J\arnott. - HSTREGISTRAEIFSS FOXRO
TORONTO DOWNTOWN 525 Bay Street, Toronto, ON M5G 2L2 = 416.597.9200 = Marriott.com/YYZEC
EATON CENTRE
——— K_\
R622 QUINN/DWAYNE/MR 180.00 04430/13 13:00 1915
oom Name Rate Depal Time Ac CT#
GKA DR QUINN & ASSOCIATE 80  |4/29/1¥ 13:08
144
(R;I%?-W Adirecs Payment RwD # H Xxxxx3 2 7 0
DATE | REFERENCE | CHARGES | CREDITS | BALANCE DUE
04/29 SELFPARK # 191536 .00
04/29 ROOM 622, 1 180.00
04/29 RM TX 622, 1 23.40 M
04/30 VS CARD $203.40
TO BE SETTLED TO: VISA CURRENT BALANCE .00

THANK YOU FOR CHOOSING MARRIOTT! TO EXPEDITE YOUR CHECK-OUT,
PLEASE CALL THE FRONT DESK, OR PRESS "MENU" ON YOUR
TV REMOTE CONTROL TO ACCESS VIDEO CHECK-OUT.

------------------- TAXES & FEE SUMMARY - -=------cooomomm-

DESCRIPTION TAXED AMOUNT TAX
GST ROOM AG .00
GST OTHER DH .00
PROVINCIAL SALES TAX (BEFJKL) .00
DESTINATION MKT FEE Ch .00
HST MNO) 23.40

NET CHARGES TAX CREDITS FOLIO

180.00 23.40 .00 203.40

------------------- EXP. REPORT SUMMARY -------------------
04/29 ROOM&TAX 203.40

AS REQUESTED, A FINAL COPY OF YOUR BILL WILL BE EMAILED TO:
DRQUINNGROGERS.COM
SEE "INTERNET PRIVACY STATEMENT" ON MARRIOTT.COM

Your Rewards.goints/mﬂes earned on your eligibie earnings
will be credited to your account. Check your
Rewards Account Statement for updated activity.

o

o x = =

b

oo oo Pas J RS- = o W
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WEST gy EB-2o(z ~64S|

05
J\arrott. ' 20)3-p6 74 L LIES ROl
TORONTO DOWNTOWN 525 Bay Street, Toronto, ON M5G 212 = 416.597.9200 =« Marriott.com/YYZEC
EATON CENTRE
ST ST HST REGISTRATION 862712999
1507 QUINN/DWAYNE/MR 180.00 06/13/13 12:00 766
Room Name Rate Depart Time ACCT #
GK 80  06/10/13 18:07
Type Arrive Time
41
e pament RWD#: XXXXX3270
Clerk Address
DATE | REFERENCE |  cHARGES | CREDITS | BALANCE DUE
06/10 ROOM 1507, 1 180.00
06/10 RM TX 1507, 1 23.40 MA
06/10 D.M.P. 1507, 1 4,52 C
06/10 DMP HST 1507, 1 .59 G
06/11 ROOM 1507, 1 180.00
06/11 RM TX 1507, 1 23.40 MA
06/11 D.M.P. 1507, 1 4.52 C
06/11 DMP HST 1507, 1 .59 G
06/12 ROOM 1507, 1 180.00
06/12 RM TX 1507, .1 23.40 MA
06/12 D.M.P. 1507, 1 4.52 C
06/12 DMP HST 1507, 1 .59 G
06/13 VS CARD $625.53 |
TO BE SETTLED TO: VISA CURRENT BALANCE .00

THANK YOU FOR CHOOSING MARRIOTT! TO EXPEDITE YOUR CHECK-OUT,
PLEASE CALL THE FRONT DESK, OR PRESS "MENU" ON YOUR
TV REMOTE CONTROL TO ACCESS VIDEO CHECK-OUT.

------------------- TAXES & FEE SUMMARY ---------c-mcmcomm-
DESCRIPTION TAXED AMOUNT TAX
HST {ROOM& {AGN) 68.07
HST (INCIDENTALS) MO) 3.90
NET CHARGES TAX CREDITS FOLIO
553,56 71.97 .00 625.53
------------------- EXP. REPORT SUMMARY --------c-mmmmmmmm-
06/10 ROOM&TAX 208.51
06/11 ROOM&TAX 208.51
06/12 ROOM&TAX 208.51

AS REQUESTED, A FINAL COPY OF YOUR BILL WILL BE EMAILED TO:
DRQUINNGROGERS .COM
SEE "INTERNET PRIVACY STATEMENT" ON MARRIOTT.COM

This statement is your only receipt. You have agreed to pay in cash or by approved personal check or to authorize us to charge your credit card for all amounts charged
to you, The amount shown in the credits column opposite any credit card entry in the reference column above will be charged to the credit card number set forth above.
(The credit card company will bill in the usual manner.) If for any reason the credit card company does not make payment on this account, you will owe us such amount.
If you are direct billed, in the event payment is not made within 25 days after checkout, you will owe us interest from the checkout date on any unpaid amount at the
rate of 1.5% per month (ANNUAL RATE 18%), or the maximum allowed by law, plus the reasonable cost of collection, including attorney fees.

Signature X.

7-2955 Rev.10/08 To secure your next stay, go to Marriott.com.
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TORONTO DOWNTOWN
EATON CENTRE

o %

W

HST REGISTRATION G BEESTR §F9OLIC
525 Bay Street, Toronto, ON M5G 2.2 2 416.597.920C = Marriott.com/YYZE!

8%0..QUINN/DWAYNE /MR

0 S Type

16

Room
Clerk

130 MUSCOVEY DR

ELMLBA.
|

REFERENCE

ON N3B3

18000 08430/13 12:@Q 10169
) 30/ ACCT#
80  084a/13 12:5&

PASSPORT :
VSXXXXXXXXXXXX6755
P7 Payment RWD# :

CREDITS

XXXXX3270 -

BALANCE DUE

08/27 SELFPARK #1016963 .00
08/27 ROOM 820, 1 180.00
08/27 RM TX 820, 1 23.40 MA
. +08/27 D.M.P. 820, 1 4.52 C
08/27 DMP HST 820, 1 <59 G
08/28 SELFPARK #1016930 .00
08/28 ROOM 820, 1 180.00
08/28 RM TX 820, 1 23.40 MA
08/28 D.M.P. 820, 1 4.52 c
08/28 DMP HST 820, 1 <98 G
08/29 SELFPARK #1016930 .00
08/30 CCARD-VS ‘ 417.02
SETTLED TO: VISA XXXXXXXXXXXX6755
.00
m---------=-----2-- TAXES & FEE SUMMARY -------------------
DESCRIPTION TAXED AMOUNT TAX
HST iROOM& EAGN) ‘ " 45.38
HST (INCIDENTALS) MO) 2.60
NET CHARGES TAX CREDITS FOLIO
369.04 47.98 417.02 .00
------------------- EXP. REPORT SUMMARY -----------=-------
08/27 ROOM&TAX 208.51
08/28 ROOM&TAX 208.51 -

AS REQUESTED, A FINAL COPY OF YOUR BILL WILL BE EMAILED TO:

DRQUI

NNGROGERS.COM

SEE "INTERNET PRIVACY STATEMENT" ON MARRIOTT.COM

Your Rewards g
will be credi ‘ our
Rewards Account Statement for updated activity.

oints/miles earned on your eligible earning§h
ed to your account. Check your :

e ™
saae

-
This statement is vour only receipt. You have agread ic pay in cash or by approved persanai check or io authorize us tc charge your credit card for ali amounts charged
tc vou. The amount shown in the credits column opposite any credit card entry in the reference column above will be ciiarged to the credit card number set forth above.

{Thec

§ card company will bili in the usuai manner.; If for anv reason the credit card company does not make payment on this account, you will owe us such amount.

If you are direct billed, in the @vent payment is not made within 25 days after checkout, you will owe us interest frem the checkout daie on any unpaid amount at the
cate of 1.5% per month (ANNUAL RATE 18%), or the maximum aliowed by iaw, plus the reasonable cost of coilection, including attorney fees.

Signature X

7-2955 Rev.10/08

Ta secure your next stay, go tc Marriott.com.



A WHK .-y

\WESTGTA,
A\arriott. HST REGISTRATECUNEASB 7009k
TORONTO DOWNTOWN 525 Bay Street, Toronto, ON M5G 212 = 416.597.9200 = Marriott.com/YYZEC
EATON CENTRE
e SR HST REGISTRATION 862712999
1532 QUINN/DWAYNE /MR 180.00 09/13/13 12:00 RELL
GK. 80  09/12/13 15:08
144
Room Payment ) RWD#: XXXXX3270

Clerk Address

BALANCE DUE

09/12 SELFPARK # 164640 .00

09/12 SELFPARK 09é12/13 30.00 0

09/12 ROOM 1532, %1 180.00

09/12 RM TX 1632, 1 23.40 MA

09/12 D.M.P. 1832, 1 4.52 C

09/12 DMP HST 1632, 1 .59

09/13 VS CARD $238.51

TO BE SETTLED To: VISA CURRENT BALANCE .00

THANK YOU FOR CHOOSING MARRIOTT! TO EXPEDITE YOUR CHECK-o0uUT,
PLEASE CALL THE FRONT DESK, OR PRESS "MENU" ON YOUR
TV REMOTE CONTROL TO ACCESS VIDEO CHECK-o0UT.

------------------- TAXES & FEE SUMMRRY Z-i-i...oisii i on.
DESCRIPTION TAXED AMOUNT TAX
HST gROOM& AGN) 22.69
HST (INCIDENTALS) MO) 4.75
NET CHARGES TAX CREDITS FOLIO
211.07 27.44 .00 238.51
------------------- EXP. REPORT SUMMARY -----.______Z22.7C.
09/12 SELFPARK 30.00
ROOM&TAX 208.51

AS REQUESTED, A FINAL COPY OF YOUR BILL WILL BE EMAILED TO:
DRQUINN@ROGERS.COM
SEE "INTERNET PRIVACY STATEMENT" ON MARRIOTT.COM

Your Rewards points/miles earned on your eligible earnings
Will be credited to your account. Check your

Rewards Account Statement for updated activity.
\_

I25d3B B g <= OCTmmw =
3 (F82Z I§ 8§ =3 FE23% 353
e § [agd 5 5 Sms SO O
R gaET oo LF 85 71%eg
AARNE & BaE T 8 <
H g ,:_—D'_: =10
This statement is your only receipt. You have agreed to pay in cash or by approved pers H - == sSi=
to you. The amount shown in the credits column opposite any credit card entry in the ri Q .: § s [ . B E
(The credit card company will bill in the usual manner.) If for any reason the credit care '\\ : 5 § § L S
If you are direct billed, in the event payment is not made within 25 days after checkout b E % = g o D g %E&:
rate of 1.5% per month (ANNUAL RATE 18%), or the maximum allowed by law, plus tt ' ag R SH [ Y § g oo B2S
0SS sY8 E 328 Scosma sna
i RSN @*" SN |SIPDS o =T
Signature X =] ag(‘ﬂ s e E o @S o
mR8832%d 3§ B8 28888 x B2

7-2955 Rev.10/08
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WEST GTA - UNION

A\arrioft. HST REGISTRATNES S FINY
TORONTO DOWNTOWN 525 Bay Street, Toronto, ON M5G 212 = 416.597.9200 = Marriott.com/YYZEC
EATON CENTRE
HST REGISTRATION 862712999
732 QUINN/DWAYNE/MR 180.00 09/17/13 12:00 2590
6K 80  09/16/13 17401
144
!é?eorrkn Aildress Payment RWD # H XXXXX 3 2 7 0
09/16 ROOM 732, 1 180.00
09/16 RM TX 732, 1 23.40 MA
09/16 D.M.P. 732, 1 4.52 C
09/16 DMP HS 732, 1 .59 G
09/17 VS CARD

$208.51

CURRENT BALANCE .00

THANK YOU FOR CHOOSING MARRIOTT! TO EXPEDITE YOUR CHECK-OUT,
PLEASE CALL THE FRONT DESK, OR PRESS "MENU" ON YOUR
TV REMOTE CONTROL TO ACCESS VIDEO CHECK-OUT.

TO BE SETTLED TO: VISA

................... TAXES & FEE SUMMARY

DESCRIPTION TAXED AMOUNT TAX
HST 2RO0M& EAGN) 22.69
HST (INCIDENTALS) MO) 1.30
NET CHARGES TAX CREDITS FOLIO
184.52 23.99 .00 208.51

------------------- EXP. REPORT SUMMARY
09/16 ROOM&TAX 208.51

AS REQUESTED, A FINAL COPY OF YOUR BILL WILL BE EMAILED TO:
DRQUINNGROGERS.COM
SEE "INTERNET PRIVACY STATEMENT" ON MARRIOTT.COM

Your Rewards points/miles earned on your eligible earnings
will be credited to your account. Check your
Rewards Account Statement for updated activity.

fﬂﬂ#ﬂ—_ﬂ#___,,ﬂﬂﬂ_——/—-~—*—"”’”ﬂ*\\
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A\arriott. HST REGISTRATIRNASOPTIIT
TORONTO DOWNTOWN 525 Bay Street, Toronto, ON M5G 2L.2 = 416.597.9200 = Marriott.com/YYZEC
EATON CENTRE
HST REGISTRATION 862712999
1104 QUINN/DWAYNE/MR 180.00 &3124/13 12:00 Agg%;
GK- 80  09/23/13 2}:17
144
E&or{(n s Payment RWD # H XXXXX 3270
09/23 SELFPARK # 439778 .00
09/23 SELFPARK 09{23/13 30.00 0
09/23 ROOM 1104, 1 180.00
09/23 RM TX 1104, 1 23.40 MA
09/23 D.M.P. 1104, 1 4.52 C
09/23 DMP HST 1104, 1 «58 G
09/24 VS CARD $238.51
TO BE SETTLED TO: VISA CURRENT BALANCE .00

THANK YOU FOR CHOOSING MARRIOTT! TO EXPEDITE YOUR CHECK-OUT,
PLEASE CALL THE FRONT DESK, OR PRESS "MENU" ON YOUR
TV REMOTE CONTROL TO ACCESS VIDEO CHECK-OUT.

------------------- TAXES & FEE SUMMARY =-------=---=-------=--~

DESCRIPTION TAXED AMOUNT TAX
HST iROOM& iAGN) 22 .69
HST (INCIDENTALS) MO) 4.75

NET CHARGES TAX CREDITS FOLIO

211.07 27 .44 .00 238.51

------------------- EXP. REPORT SUMMARY -------------------
09/23 SELFPARK 30.00
ROOM&TAX 208.51

AS REQUESTED, A FINAL COPY OF YOUR BILL WILL BE EMAILED TO:
DRQUINNGROGERS . COM
SEE "INTERNET PRIVACY STATEMENT" ON MARRIOTT.COM

Your Rewards.goints/mﬂes earned on your eligible earnings
will be credited to your account. Check your
Rewards Account Statement for s=dssad ackiuitu

= = o << d o Mmoo — 5
532 23 3 -¥3 3223s 2%
L P 5 s OO = o a = —
nim!’“ s S503 @ =7 Q%
~ 828 - A 035 - .
B FQ g2 27
& - % % (== = :_\’ % g
F = i m
A - 22 @ i,
iy " g . AN 3 =3 D 1 —
This statement is your only lrecelpt. You have agreed to pay in cash or by a B e N !X
to you. The amount shown in the credits column opposite any credit card 5 % % % % o m
(The credit card company will bill in the usual manner.) If for any reason t § e %_\_\\ = :‘% "_—c_i-
If you are direct billed, in the event payment is not made within 25 days al FUL 2w D QS gg""""’ w2
rate of 1.5% per month (ANNUAL RATE 18%), or the maximum allowed t Qﬁég&? E %% %8:85 ?gg
S N - S - = S oS O
Signature X SSEs~58 B was axdds 4.5

7-2955 Rev. ]0/08 1U STLUIT yuUUl 1ITAL 31ay, FY LU iMidl VLt LUl



WEST QTR - Zg-2u2-0451 G Ecp
A\arriott.

HST REGISTRATEUNESS F(M9RD
TORONTO DOWNTOWN 525 Bay Street, Toronto, ON M5G 212 = 416.597.9200 = Marriott.com/YYZEC
EATON CENTRE
HST REGISTRATION 862712999
¥%94 QHLNN/DWAYNE/MR IQQ.OO g§427/13 L%éOO Agé?;
GK. ' 80 09/26/13 15:11
144 ‘
Room Addres Payment RWD#: XXXXX3270
DATE | REFERENCE | cHARGES | CREDITS | BALANCE DUE
09/26 SELFPARK # 516369 .00
09/26 SELFPARK 09426/13 30.00 0
09/26 ROOM 1204, 1 180.00
09/26 RM TX 1204, 1 23.40 MA
09/26 D.M.P. 1204, 1 4.52 C
09/26 DMP HST 1204, 1 .59 G
09/27 VS CARD $238.51
TO BE SETTLED TO: VISA CURRENT BALANCE .00

THANK YOU FOR CHOOSING MARRIOTT! TO EXPEDITE YOUR CHECK-OUT,
PLEASE CALL THE FRONT DESK, OR PRESS "MENU" ON YOUR
TV REMOTE CONTROL TO ACCESS VIDEO CHECK-OUT.

------------------- TAXES & FEE SUMMARY == ----coocoaeoao .

DESCRIPTION TAXED AMOUNT TAX
HST éROOMB gAGN) 22.69
HST (INCIDENTALS) MO) 4.75

NET CHARGES TAX CREDITS FOLIO

211.07 27.44 .00 238.51

------------------- EXP. REPORT SUMMARY ---------commeao.
09/26 SELFPARK 30.00
ROOM&TAX 208.51

AS REQUESTED, A FINAL COPY OF YOUR BILL WILL BE EMAILED TO:
DRQUINNGROGERS.COM
SEE "INTERNET PRIVACY STATEMENT" ON MARRIOTT.COM

Your Rewards Eoints/mi]es earnM

P will ha errodited tn vaur acenr
' ognzg B3B8 |
é‘ S .=2zys 53 8522 33%53% Fagi |
‘ i -n;;%%ﬁ TES0@ 83 T g C#
v iSEEE 28 8 02 gERIE 253 W ig2% ggw” gg 2 i
-\ ig33F S S gt 82750 TR \\Q iRy e 23 Fid
= — € O = junl ? - l:;:
N ez 8% 55 % o B Fap v =i
»ioF 55 g R 23 28 2P |
£ TTmy o3 =i te. BE o _go 8BRS GES
s @8 22 3FE _BH2 _Gr B ESEssblZ aso
@%ggag_ﬁ S 528 geomp =50 R
g5idesE = was 22388 2.5

7-2955 Rev.10/08 To secure your next stay, go to Marriott.com.




From: Thanks for staying!

To: DRQUINN@ROGERS.COM
Subject: Your Sep 30, 2013 - Oct 3, 2013 stay at the Toronto Marriott Downtown Eaton Centre Hotel
Date: October-05-13 11:04:36 AM

Thank you for choosing the Toronto Marriott Downtown
Eaton Centre Hotel for your recent stay.

As requested, below is a billing summary or adjustment for
your stay. If you have questions about your bill, please
contact the hotel directly at (416) 597-9200.

) ) You have elected to receive
Make another reservation on Marriott.com >> eFolio email messages after

every stay.

Modify your email
preferences >>

Summary of Your Stay

Hotel: Toronto Marriott Downtown Eaton Guest: QUINN/DWAYNE/MR
Centre Hotel 130 MUSCOVEY DR
525 Bay Street ELMIRA, ON N3B3P7
Toronto, Ontario M5G 2L2 CAN
Canada

(416) 597-9200

Dates of stay: Sep 30, 2013 - Oct 03, 2013 Room number: 1032
Guest number: 6311 Group number:
Marriott Rewards number: XXXXX3270

Date Description Reference Charges Credits
09/30/13 TELECOMM BASEHSIA 0.00
09/30/13 TELECOMM PREMHSIA 0.00
09/30/13 TELECOMM FREEHSIA 0.00
09/30/13 SELFPARK 09/30/13 30.00
09/30/13 ROOM 1032, 1 180.00
09/30/13 RM TX 1032, 1 28.51
10/01/13 TELECOMM BASEHSIA 0.00
10/01/13 TELECOMM PREMHSIA 0.00
10/01/13 TELECOMM FREEHSIA 0.00
10/01/13 SELFPARK 10.01.13 30.00
10/01/13 ROOM 1032, 1 180.00
10/01/13 RM TX 1032, 1 28.51
10/02/13 TELECOMM BASEHSIA 0.00
10/02/13 TELECOMM PREMHSIA 0.00
10/02/13 TELECOMM FREEHSIA 0.00

10/02/13 SELFPARK 10.02.13 30.00


mailto:efolio@marriott.com
mailto:DRQUINN@ROGERS.COM
https://marriott.com/search/cwsearch.mi?ignore=true&WT_Ref=eFolio
https://marriott.com/rewards/myAccount/editEmailPreferences.mi
https://marriott.com/rewards/myAccount/editEmailPreferences.mi

10/02/13 ROOM 1032, 1 180.00

10/02/13 RM TX 1032, 1 28.51

10/03/13 Payment - Visa HSKP C/0O 715.53
XXXXXXXXXXXX6755

Total balance 0.00 CAD

How was your stay? Share your experiences on Marriott Rewards Insiders.
Was that the best night's sleep you've ever had? How about a repeat performance at your place!

2]

Important Information

Do Not Reply to this Email
This email is an auto-generated message. Replies to automated messages are not monitored. If
you have any questions please contact the hotel directly at (416) 597-9200.

Why Have | Received this Email?
You received this email because you subscribed to eFolio, a feature enabling you to receive an
electronic version of your hotel bill by email after every stay. Modify your email preferences >>

Availability

Electronic versions of your hotel bill, available by email from our over 2,300 participating properties
in the Marriott family of hotels in the USA and Canada, are emailed to you within 72 hours of
check-out. These email messages reflect changes made to your bill up to 11pm on your day of
departure. Any adjustments after that time may not be shown.

If you have received this email in error, please notify us.

Learn more about eFolio, receiving your hotel bills by email.

Authenticity of Bills
Marriott retains official records of all charges and credits to your account and will honor only those
records.

Privacy
Your privacy is important to Marriott. For full details of our privacy policy, please visit our Internet
Privacy Statement.

Credit of Marriott Rewards Points
After a stay, it may take up to 7 days for Marriott Rewards points to be credited to your account.

Terms of Use::Internet Privacy Statement(c)1996-2012 Marriott International, Inc. All rights reserved. Marriott proprietary information.


http://www.rewards-insiders.marriott.com/community/hotel-reviews?scid=f467ffcc-cd04-4a25-af34-f3a7e0e26ab9
http://www.rewards-insiders.marriott.com/community/hotel-reviews?scid=f467ffcc-cd04-4a25-af34-f3a7e0e26ab9
http://www.rewards-insiders.marriott.com/community/hotel-reviews?scid=f467ffcc-cd04-4a25-af34-f3a7e0e26ab9
http://www.shopmarriott.com/redirect.aspx?p=0802002&t=/&m=YYZEC
http://www.shopmarriott.com/redirect.aspx?p=0802002&t=/&m=YYZEC
http://www.shopmarriott.com/redirect.aspx?p=0802002&t=/&m=YYZEC
https://marriott.com/rewards/myAccount/editEmailPreferences.mi
https://marriott.com/suggest/suggest.mi?WT_Ref=eResConfo
http://marriott.com/rewards/eFolioAbout.mi
https://marriott.com/privacy.mi
https://marriott.com/privacy.mi
http://marriott.com/copyrite.mi
http://marriott.com/privacy.mi

WEST
J\arriott. ' o HST REGISTRATQNES §6RT3 2989

TORONTO DOWNTOWN 525 Bay Street, Toronto, ON M5G 2L2 = 416.597.9200 = Marriott.com/YYZEC
EATON CENTRE
HST REGISTRATION 862712999

435 QUINN/DWAYNE/MR 180.00 10/11/13 12:00 7841

Hs 80 }0/08/13 1742

144

ot — RWD#: XXXXX3270
REFERENCE CREDITS BALANCE DUE

i EE tan ;

10/08 ROOM 435, 1 180.00 gB-202- sl oted

10708 RM TX 435, 1  23.40 MA

10/08 D.M.P. 435, 1 4.52 C

10/08 DMP HST 435, 1 .59 G

S o

10709 ROOM 435, 1 180.00 EBf%ll'Dﬁ%d"('

10/09 RM TX 435, 1  23.40 MA

10/09 D.M.P. 435, 1 4.52 C

10/09 DMP HST 435, 1 .59 G

R SR

10710 ROOM 435, 1 180.00 %/%/Z’%’%

10/10 RM TX 435, 1  23.40 A

10/10 D.M.P. 435, 1 4.52 C

10710 DMP HST 435, 1 .59

10/11 VS CARD $715.53

TO BE SETTLED TO: VISA CURRENT BALANCE .00
THANK YOU FOR CHOOSING MARRIOTT! TO EXPEDITE YOUR CHECK-OUT,
PLEASE CALL THE FRONT DESK, OR PRESS "MENU" ON YOUR

TV REMOTE CONTROL TO ACCESS VIDEO CHECK-OUT.

------------------- TAXES & FEE SUMMARY ~ = --c---iofoocancan-

DESCRIPTION TAXED AMOUNT TAX
HST {ROOM& iAGN) 68.07
HST (INCIDENTALS) MO) 14.25

NET CHARGES TAX CREDITS FOLIO
633.21 82,32 .00 715.53
------------------- EXP .~ REPORT- . SUMMARY..: = cr=r=rr-prom-p----
10/08 SELFPARK 30.00
ROOM&TAX 208.51
10/09 SELFPARK 30.00
ROOM&TAX 208.51
10/10 SELFPARK 30.00
ROOM&TAX 208.51

This statement is your only receipt. You have agreed to pay in cash or by approved personal check or to authorize us to charge your credit card for all amounts charged
to you. The amount shown in the credits column opposite any credit card entry in the reference column above will be charged to the credit card number set forth above.
(The credit card company will bill in the usual manner.) If for any reason the credit card company does not make payment on this account, you will owe us such amount.
If you are direct billed, in the event payment is not made within 25 days after checkout, you will owe us interest from the checkout date on any unpaid amount at the
rate of 1.5% per month (ANNUAL RATE 18%), or the maximum allowed by law, plus the reasonable cost of collection, including attorney fees.

Signature X

7-2955 Rev.10/08 To secure your next stay, go to Marriott.com.




RECEIPT

CRR PARK: Yonge & Eglinton “tr

DEVICE: Paystatic 3
PAID: 04/09/13 01: 15P
SHORT TERM 05591
ENTRY: 04/09/13 08:36A
EXIT: 04/09/13 01:16P

PARKING DURATION: 00 04:19
CHARGED DURATION: 000 02:40

PAID: CAD20.00
TAX FREE CAD17.70
VAT, 13% . CAl2. 3
CREDIT CARD CAD20.00
CREDIT CARD
DATE: 04/09/13 01:15P
Rk 330001 Ionkx
0314
PRICE: CAD20.00
TRANSACTION No: XC2482507
MERCHANT Nb: 302050:3726
AUTH CODE: 131448



Receter RECEIPT RECEIPT RECEIPT
CAR PARK:  Yonge & Eglinton Ctr ORR PARY:  Yonge & Eglinton Ctr CAR PARK: i ,
DEVICE: Paystation 3 DEVICE: Paystation 3 DEVIE@SK frge Eij;@ﬁ%?oﬁtg %?GIEE?K’ e EiléQ§€° Ctg
PRID: 16/09/13 04:25P PRID: 19/09/13 1:55° PRID: 12/09/13 B3P P R 6%
Em TERM 102817 SHORT TERY 103621 SHORT TERM 101881 SHORT TERM 10214
B 16/89/13 08: 16A ENTRY: 190913 07: 4% ENTRY: 12/09/13 08108 ENTRY 13/89/13 08:15R
\ 16/28/13 04,26 BIT: 19/09/13 M1:5¢4 BT 12/03/13 02, 40P BT /13 RSP
PARKING DURATION: 000 0B:3 PARKING DURATION: 000 06:05 PARKING DURATION: OO0 06:27 PORKING DURFTION: 000 07: 4
CHRGED DLRATION: 000 02:40 CHRGED DURATION: 000 82140 CHARGED DURATION: 000 @2:40 CHARGED DURATION: 000 02:40
BAID: 0.0 PAID: (A0P0.00 PAID: CF020.00 PAID: CF0e0.00
TRX FREE CAD17. 70 TR FREE 01770 TRX FREE CA17.70 TRX FREE CD17. 70
VAT, 13 1 (A0? 30 VAT 13 : CA0R. 0 VAT, 13 : C0R.%0 VAT, 13, CADR. %0
CREDIT CARD CADZD.00 CREDIT CARD (AD20.00 CREDIT CARD (RD20.00 CREDIT CARD CADZ0, 20
REDIT ORD REDIT CFRD REDIT OFRD 7 '
0TE, BA9/13 04,25 0RTE: 19/09/13 04,549 ATE: 12/8/13 R, 3P m%EU w0 13/09/13 03:55°
xmam1m ****3333313%3/**3 K00k 330001 35000k ' mxa‘.{mm;rm
[
RICE: CADR. 00 RICE: (ADP0.00 RICE B4
RGO ST TREACTION N 2SS TR iCa MSoe e
QJE%W o WA MERCHANT No: WP0502372% MERCHANT Nox W03 MERCHANT No: 20376
oIE: 12405 ATH CODE: 13541B AUTH CODE: 14%38 AUTH CODE: 155518
WEST G1p WEST GTB WEST GTA
— Lwnttt
W ('( JOEY - Eaton Centrve 41/0/ - (’(
1 Dundas St W Unit
T nto o
JOEY nse 123 ;
EATON CENTRE E47-352-5839 P T »
GRILL | LOUNGE 4% TRANSACTION RECORD *¥ U
1 DUNDAS STREEI WEST Tvan. #:1 ZOTOE il /
TORONTO, ON MG 173 e ey
P+ 647.352.5639 B T Tn =
Table &t 3586 COOKHOUSE
100109 Karly M Erotr soe iy LODIDE
__________________________________ EmFlowee MName: Karlw N Montanas 3027
Tbl 110/2 Chk 3586 Gst 1 fasterCard 1230 Stesles Ave. Fast
0ct09'13 02:32PM Pre-fiuth Purchase M n, L9T BRI

___________________________ AID: AODOOO0OOD41010
| CAESAR W/CHICKEN  15.00 o
Amount $16 .3

. 15.00 Tip $7 .6
SUBTTL . s
TAX HST 13% 1.95 TGTAL CAD®13.

03:14PM TOTAL 16.95

KRN EENHARER 28448 C

HAPPROVED 1516658
go-001 151€E58B
IYzius0z s JYEZLUCOE
115001001016
2013-10-09 15 . C:64

TUR: QOOCDOIIaN

TSI ESOD
Custamer CoFy
THANK YOU

Come A93ln

( o QN =
\Fz?s‘w//

Ri.o B4 T0245RT0001

1
_€0ﬁ,

=

'3 02:59PH
Check #xx

.ar

1 ?'« Chicken

4 CL"‘| “k‘{'

‘Dark

/Sweet Potato
© 1otal 2.
HS | 1.
Total Due 174 1
*Total Due (Cash only) 14.15

Tell Us How We Did Today t
* RECEIVE & FRFE APPETIZERO*

o with a $25 purchase,
------------ T omplete our survey at:
We are eager to hear from you! WK, mgqt§n dback . com
www . joeyrestaurants.com (AR PARK:  Yonge & Eglinton Ctr or call -860-239-78R
Get on the waitlist or W Raton 3 ‘reess Code: 30271
! 17/09/13 02:07P - 1 days
make a reservation at SHORT TERM S mar . 19.99: nr
Wil . JOEYWATITLIST .COM ENTRY 120913 06: R other «  rs: at r,‘ -3
G3T#B3075 4155 RTOOO! T locat1ons on nly; must sne survey
CHRGED DORATION: 000 02,40 /alidation code am ‘thi. receipt
PAID: (AD2D.0
TRX FREE CAD(?.70
VAT A3 CAbR. 3
CREDIT CARD (A0 .00
CREDIT CARD
DATE: 17/09/13 02, 06P
ook 330001 3ok
w14
PRICE: (AD2D.00
TRASACTION Mo: XC2518681
MERCHNT N W%
AUTH CODE: - 140618




JOEY
EATON CENTRE
GRILL | LOUNGE
1 DUNDAS STREET WEST
TORONTO, ON M5G 123
P: 647.352.5639

100230 Tess F

Thl 60/° Chk 5018 Gstﬁm;
Sep1S’13 02:44PM
*x% Memo Check *x

SEAT:2
1 CAESAR W/CHICKEN  15.00
SUBTTL ; 15.00
Tax HST 13% .92
03:18PM TOTAL 16.95

y‘}p-m )
‘;1z~515§?§?§ﬁm

W5 N

TR A
N

RS et =

We are eager to hear from you!
Wi . joeyrestaurants.com
Get on the waitlist or
reservation at
ITLIST.COM
< 9155 RT000?

maks &
Wi . JOEY
GST

Ju DD
.

*i*x**#***x*&*
CHECK # 1714686 DATE 10,/09/13
TABLE # 274 TIME  8:57PW
FExRERRF DUPLICATE CHECK fhRRRERER

Rk F R KRR R AR

COCKTAIL & Amy H.

erati S TEHS (RDERED AMOUNT
| PT77AEASYOT 7 pler  14.46
(.64

W t’}m,

SUBTOTAL 15,10
IRTRI

TOTAL 15.10

""" LR RRRRRRRRRRRE R

ENTER TO WIN A TRIP FORN
10 THE CARIBBEAN

Please share your feedback wi

Complete a brief survey

in the next 5 days about this|visil
to our restaurant and be en red

for a chance to win.

Go to:

.

i/ jacks

kR

X *
* CODE: 80576029610 *
* %
*******i*iﬁ**$$¥$§$$$¥*$$**4********@¥f$
supTO AL 15 .10
TAX 1.97¢

TOTAL DUE

ROUNDED YUX%

)

WATCH THE GAME 1N HD AT JACK'S!E
THE OFFTCTAL HOME OF OUR TORONTO
MAPLE LEAFSELY GO LEAFFS GOL:t

(ipen everday 11am - 7amit!

Jack Astor’s Bar and Gris
- Gundas 5t E.

g, Ontario, MHRZGY
416-753-9800

GS1 66715756RTOU3

Toron

L g S

i

e A U
JACK ASTOR'S DUMMNS
e SAQUARE
17 T MDAS STREET E. 4TH
F
TOROMTO OM
CaRD 363636 36 % 3 K XX
- xS L
B:?E TYPE MAS TERCARL
sl 2013-10-05
1 1976 21:00:37
SERUR ID 140826
CHECK 5
i vinds z 3 171468E
224 COCKTAIL

RECEIPT HUMBER
CBZ014096~-001-001-555-0

FURCHASE

AMOUNT $17.07
TIP £
MasterCard
AOCO0000041010

H83B5500B34E4 708
0000008000-E800
FDD401 CO4C3BE4Z2

AFPROVED

AUTHE 210038
THﬁNK You

01-027

CARDHOLDER COPY

IMPORTAMNT — RETAIM THIS
COPY FOR YOUR RECDRDé



Hcbk bk pckiakichbocrk s sk
CHECK # "69377C
TABLE # 237

bk PUPLI[FTt fHEﬁ

COCKTAIL : Morgan D. e

SEAT#  ITEMS ORCEREC
¢ PIIZA.EASYSELL
Mozz,shred
10%FOCD

SUBTOTAL 13. 01

Sry rv
1J .

TCTAL 13. 01

PROMCTIONS ==
TVPE AMOUN™

T0%FOOD =145

1.45

ENTER TU IN A R P FCR i
10 THE CARIBBEAN

Please shere your feedback with us!
Cumpgp|e a brief survey
ri the next 5 days about this visit
tu our ra.taurdnt and be enterad
for a chance to win,
Go 1c:
wiw . ~astaurantoues Hons . com/ jacks

Skt ekl bk dokokkk sk

* CO0E: 0126700

XK £
kR Rackono ook R ook kR kool keloinor

T fi?&!_, EHE 14 ..
f“f* E]hﬂ{J
SUBTOT AL
TAX

'i‘(;i“y'iiJi l#][uli_ [14 .70

Yoo e you're the best joint in town

2 Bd s pare o SHOONNTHLL

Be vomre the party's oot
Open averday ?*“ - Ldm"‘
Mo mmin ~dd o Apnimpme?y M ST ST T L L e

AMOUR

14,46 10%F000
1.4

SRR K Kok Rk R siioloR
ER 3

u

BAG

rolls

BY THAL PAN

spring

kR R ERR R
+*f%**%**********F*********#%**t

Spring Rolls Atrium
09/\9/13 26 Pl
Table T 11 Peop\n 1
gerver: 50 Bar Order

*********#x****************

CHECK:
PR

Rl 7.‘
A\S CHICKEN WINGS T L
J A14 COCOCNUT SHRIMZ

1 Taxable: 17‘

sub-total: W
HST:

hu' cence. NIN
(ST 461228 3752

i)

i Dl

Thark You For Dining At Spring "t

Reservation please Call:

s 85,2929
reservation:

spri nng\]o

\
\

. A4 CDCOCNUT SHRIMP

Al

i!gliii 'IEEE!!' ‘I:EE%%'
v

spring rolls

BY THAI PAN

CRkkkR bR R R R R R R Rk
pring Rolls Atrium

38-40 Dundas St. West Order 4004
Toronto Ontario M5G 202

el. 416 585 2929

9/12/13  7:49 PM

fable T 11 Cust |

srter 50 Bar Order
R R e T e

14.97

Taxable: 14,97

14.97
1.38

16 .92

sub-total:
HET:

Total Due -

Feference: DWUAYNE
Gol #81228 3752

Ihank You For Dining At Spring Ro1ls
For Reservation Please Call:

416 58%.2929 < '
Online reservation: springrolls.ca



ESSSSSTR RSS2 S22 eSS PSS SRS S
CAECK # 1580452 DATE 6/12/13

TABLE # 240 TIME  9:30PM
== COCKTAIL : Beth =
sEAT#  LTEMS ORDERED AMDUNT

3 PIZIA.EASYSELL, Mozz,shred 14,46

SUBTOTAL 14.46

SRR S
14.46

TOTAl 14.46

FRRkR R R R R R SERRERKFX 25T
ENTER TO WIN A TRIP FOR 2
TO THE CAR/BP™*N

Please share jour f with usi
Complete a brie,
in the next & days «hou. Jig
to cur restaurant ke enterc

for a chance iin.
WAW. rescadrar - sstione.com/ s
3 Fo Rk s RERRRRORE ER S £k
* %
* DU 72400 %
i %
s FRERE i *
BTOTAL t e
TAAL ;
TU[&L DUE 16 .
RO ED TUTA‘ if .35
/o know your the best joint i
whar yvour DJ's name is SMOOOU
Be where the party's at!ll
Open everday 7 0 - 2am! !
Margarita snyone? o astic flasours!
Jack Astor'y Ba g Gritl
10 Dun LT
Toronto, Or tario, M5B2GS
416-2F"

GST B68715/L6RTOUIN

2
Jack @sTORYS DLDAE
SOUFr

10 DUMDAZ STREET + .

=

TOROMHTO
== 36363 %3663 % 6% w545
CAaRD TYFE MEE TERCARD
DATE 20130817
TIME 1711 21+:2
SERUR 1D i
CHEK #
ToLE # 240 o i
FEKEIFT HHHEE‘
CHRE b=~

PURCH: &
EMOUNT Fio .34
TP $Z.45
TOTAL

EF P a3
MasterCard

AO000000041 010
SHEE1 290AFBCSYBE

CO00002000-ES00

3BBAF 7S30B4D008E

APPROVED
AUTHE 213238
THEMK YOU

01-027

CARDHOLDER COPY

MPORTAMNT — RETAIM THIS
COPY FOR YOUR RECORDS

aTA

**x  DUPLICATE 3%

Freshii

2300 Yonge Street Ki
Tononto ON( i

14
P 416- 48b -2301
F 416-486-2309
GST #85'8366?0 RT0001
Order Time: Se
Prirnted At: LS }gj}g p
server: Day Cash 1

Bg‘)‘ 017351 Tvpe: Carry Out
Ihi: Guests: 1

'U

:stom Salad 0.99

§~na1nu 0.00

1led Chicker 0.99

Ja“ﬂ & Ched”a( 0.99

e 05

2ssing as Sugy

Canada Dry " LStEd?.gg
subtotal:

HST® 18.0%] : "8

05 [5.0%]: 0.56

nta $12.67

i b

Charge Oue: %5:88

Thariks for visitin
If your order waE ]essgthan

per

let us know andh?e 11 make it

ri
contact us ag Freshiij

find us twitter and faéegggk

P 416-486-2301
F 416-486-2309

Jun 12/13 12:46p

Day Cash 1
61?1 0%4366 umET?T_IQ__313240
T purchase
3240130612124647
510 xkkkkkkk8448 S

MasterCard
Jun 12/13 12:46:00
bMCIJOZUJHrOH?1 AM%&

I u

11.54
11.54

:nc;ra*ure

Cardnholdsr will pay card issuer
above amount pursuant to
Cardholder Agreement.

ADPROVED - THANK YOU
Thaks for visiting.
If your order was less than
perfect,
let us know and we'11 make it
rlght
contact us at Freshii.com
find us twitter and facebook

GST #857836670 RT0O001



YYD 1s3m l RECEifT .
_________________________________ ‘ CPR PARK:  Yonge & Eglinton Ctr Dvig, . e d falinton Ctr
SEhE} 13000 HLW DEVICE: Paystation 3 PAID: aystation 3
g s INGHERGH PAID: 26/09/13 02: 33 ST 1 213 013
ms;%gx N L SHORT TERY 1567 ENTRY, Ba1p S
s 5  zmaEs B s S

EXITy /13 02 NG DURAT :
ORKGE L IDIE ook 10N
; PARKING DURATION: 00 5:52 CHARGED S
WRERE o i - w2
: PAID CADPD.00 TRX. FRE CADIB. 20
00" 2200 00 LI TRK FREE 1. 70 VAT RD15.33
5:% U)LY VAT, 13 k] . CR2.07
334 %L CADfB,
O i ggﬁ gﬂ . g om £
- SR DT A1 R St
dSr*10 El/eQ/ L2 11x3 i FRIC MB/M
WiS'al /6022 g FRICE i o v
i ' .
e WAL LiHS TRAGACTION Nor ~ XC2S47466 RN g, 163875
o B Yl MERCHRNT No: 20503726 ATH CopE, 372
Elga:lg:alslﬁ;g - 1301A30 AUTH CODE 143218 T 28
! uoA Hidd ¥ = P
oER WEST GTA st QTA f
F, ) R
3 \—\\ D &
) e ] T R I
O T e 66X | 3000
e Yonge & Eglinton Gt 52~ 205020€ 1o 3000 Ky genLy 1o LM
Pﬁm!,CE' aystation 5 869h6520% f N LW L2 1o NOILUENRL
B585/13 @ 21p gy W do Rl il
%%ﬂ B o~ bl EWf M%M
f Xk 1%
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CAR PARK:  Yonge & Eglinton Ctr
DEVICE: Paystation 3
! 24/09/13 @1:55P
SHORT TERM 105130
ENTRY: 24/09/13 08: 48R
EXIT: 24/09/13 01:55P
PARKING DURATION: 000 05:15
CHARGED DURATION: 000 02: 40
PAID: CAD20.80
TAX FREE CAD1?7.70
VAT, 13 (AD2.30
CREDIT CARD CAD20.00
CREDIT CARD
DATE: 24/09/13 0155P
k330001 35000k
0314
PRICE: CADZ0. 00
TRANSACTION No: X(25399%
MERCHANT No: 30205023726
AUTH CODE: 148
WEST 674
e 300 AL
92LECRS020E ON INGHORW
EpSHBSIIX AN NOTLOGSHGYL
00° 0200 L
%
HhkKSE | BOREE wkkk
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00' 02060 il4d
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16:40 000 NOLLENT NI
d25+v@ €1/01/80 111X
52580 €1/01/80 1ANING
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deb 0 £1/01/80 i(lkd
£ ui1ye)sheg A
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RE-PRINT

spring rolls

BY THAL PAN

FRRRRRRRRR Rk kbR kkokkkokk

Sniing Rolls Atrium
16,01/13  7:27 PM
Table T16 People 1
Server: 50 Bar Order

CHECK : s ¥¥kkx

GTr &

SPRING ROLLS RESTAURAN
348 BROADVIEW AVE M4M269
TORONTO ON
22655555

GH2265555501

PURCHASE
10-01-2013 19:43:02

¢
ACCt # ************8448
Exp Date waper Card Type MC
Name: QUINN/DWAYNE R.
A0000000041010

11311

1331

MasterCard

Trace # 3162 Operator 50

Inv. # 3229

puth # 194308 RRN 001108067

KEERRRRR KRR KRR KRR KRR KRR KRR KKK purchase 518.03

Tip e

2 413 CHICKEN WINGS 15.98 Total 519.35

e L [0 ) R THAM YO
Sub-total: 15.98
HST: 2.08

Total Due: 1806 Retain thiscz(:?ii for your

re
Cash: 18.06 Customer copy

Amount Due: 0.00

Reference: DWIN 519 500 1022
GST #81228 3752

Thank You For Dining At Spring Rol
For Reservation Please Call:

416 585.2929

Online reservation: springrolls.ca

x  Freshii
300 Yonge Street (Kiosk)
Teronto, ON
H4P 114
P 416-480-2301
F 416-486-2309

Oct 10/13 1:02p

lay Cash 1

SALE RECEIPT
re #47568 tko 10/11/13 12:47:36
way Sandwiches & Salads
Eglinton Avenue West
101 %
RONTO
7-345-2109
anstt 121 Clerk 1  Ra
¢1 TRDT 101113 Reg-ID

Receipt # 0000288715

- ON M4R1K8

jul
&EG—MAIN

_ [TEM -—QIY- . PRICE MEMO PLU
ey ITALfr 1 1§ 6.5 10289
L Bev T§ 1.9 10024
unding 1 $ . 0.00 55005
SUBTOTAL $  © 8.74
HST HIGH § 1.4
HST LOW ©$ ~0.00
KT & ol
KE-OUT ++TOTAL § 9.8
edit AMT TEND § 9.8
CHANGE DUE$ . 0.00

E
Lw did we do today? Get a free cookie
ske 1 min. survey at www. tel lsubway . com

?11J5"9}§§9§ : Ttem ID: 130333
Tvoe:  _ Purchase
grq;r 1D: 0333132831302
%afo Num: 519 kkkkkx8448 §
Account MasterCard
Date: Oct 40/13 13:02:00
Ref: : bMCWFIWOHAT01C  THMCH
ALt Coce: 13023
Amount : o e
Amount : %?:gﬁ
Sigﬂéia;é ---------------------------

Cardholder will pay card issuer
above amount pursuant to
Cardholder Agreement.

APPROVED - THANK YOU
~ Thanks for visiting,
If your order wa: less than

 perfect,
Tet us know and we' 11 make it

|

\

|
-

bak

Freshii

2300 Yonge Street (Kiosk)
Toronto,
4%%?4%%42301
e ARE-
E 416-486-2309

get 08/13 12:11p

B
557
5191*1******8448 S
e
oot 08/1 s
-0yS1008  1MCH
BMCWISEGYST ]211§§

| Amount:
i Amount: mmms——mTIEEIEIEES

Sigrature

Cardholder will pay card issuer
above amount pursuant to
Cardholider hgreement.

APPROVED - THANK_YUU
Thanks for visiting.
If your orderrwas less than
pe

let us know'a?d w%'ll make it

contact us a Freshii.com

find us twitter and facebook
ST #857836670 RT0001




e N h

SHARK_D\CLUB

sports bar grill

$16-500-067
b, HH 269

10 Dundas S5t E, Toronto,
Y225 -2 TABLE & 13

{

102 AURELL  SviCk: 0 8:3/p i6/10/13

1 CLASSIC BURGER 10. :i‘

1 CHEESE BAGUETTE 6. 94
Sub Total:

HST
10710 9:30pTOTAL :

k% PLEASE PAY YOUR SERVER ¥
GST RB734464550002RT

Thank You far Joining us at Shark Clu
Two Time National Champion
5 Canada's Best Sports Bar
Welcome to the Sports Bar Revolution
www . sharkc lubs, com
JOIN US FOR WING NIGHT
EVERY WEDNESDAY
EVERYTHING TO MAKE THE GAME GREAT!

FIND US ON FACEBUOOK

g

QTh

SHARK CLUB DUNDAS
10 DUNDAS STREET EAST
SUITE 30
TORONTO ON 5B 2G9
(416) 506-0753

SALE
Server #: 000102
MiD: 5530147 o
TID: G5530147 REF#: 00_()00{;14
Batch # 010 SEQ: 010001001044
10/10/13 243747
APPR CODE. 21374B
MASTERCARD e
k**'l**’ki‘*ir*i844sc /
AMOUNT $22.30
TIP $4.01
TOTAL $26.31

00 - APPROVED - 001

MasterCard

AID: A0000000041010
TVR: 00 00 00 80 00
TSL E8 00

CUSTOMER COPY

—— T e ey gt

a% £

oy &

metro

*% STORE #752 (416) 483-7340 k%
*x EGOE xx ¥¥ HST & R105216170 xx

10/02/13 1:19 PH 0752 53 0125 308

CHICKEN LEG 5.98 RF
F2G0 BEVERAGE 1.00 H
PLASTIC BAG .05 H
R-HST 5% .30
H-HST 13% 14
F-PREP FOOD TX 8% .48
TRX .92 BAL 795

UF H0  HasterCard 7.95
ACCOUNT NUMBER #xxxx%xkxx%%8448
AUTHOR. #: 131938

CHANGE .00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEHS SOLD = 3

AIR MILES COLLECTOR *xxxxx%1850
BASE AIR MILES ERARNED 0
BONUS AIR WILES EARMED 0

AIR WILES:1-8688-247-6453 airmiles.ca

WIN $1,000 IN GROCERY GIFT CARDS
Visit: netrosurvey.ca

RETAIN RECEIPT FOR PRODUCT RETURN
WITHIN 14 DAYS. SEE STORE FOR DETAILS.

¥CUSTOMER CARE NUMBER 1-877-763-7374 x

EEE netro.ca XX XX
10/02/13 13:19 0752 53 0125 308

e —

Lak B

metro

XX STORE #752 (416) 483-7340 Xx
*X ERUE xx ¥5OHST # R10521617¢  xx

9/26/13  2:30 PH 0752 06 0250 245

F2G BEUERAGE 1.00 R
CHICKEN LEG 5.98 RF
PLRSTIC BAG 05 H
R-HST 5% 35
H-HST 133 .01
F-PREP FOOD TX 8% .48
TRY .84 BAL 7.87

UF Ho HasterCard 1.87
RCCOUNT NUMEER KXXEXXKKKXX%B448
AUTHOR. #: 143113

CHANGE .00
TOTAL HUMBER OF ITENS SOLD = 3
AIR HWILES COLLECTOR
BASE AIR HILES FaRNED 0
BONUS AIR MILES F4RNED 0
AIR MILES:I-888-247-6453 airniles.ca

WIN $1,90ﬁ IN GROCERY &IFT CARDS
Uisit: netrosurvey.ca

XXXX¥% %1850

RETAIN RECEIPT FoR ¢ JCT RETURN
WITHIN 14 DAVS. sit STURE FoR BE?QILS.

xCUSTOMER CAREF RUMBER 1-877-763-7374 «
XX %X netra.ca X
9726/13 14:31 0752 06 0250 245
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spring rolls

BY THAL PAN

i3

B S T ST TT ST E TSR LR L AR
ring Rolls Atrium
8/13  7:28 PH
ie T16 People 1

er: 50 Bar Order CHECK; ki

kR R R LR R R

513 CHICKEN WINGS o

Taxahle: 15.98

HST: 08

Sub-total: 15.98
2.

Total Due: 18.006

18.06
Amount Due: 0.00

e rence: QUEEN 5195001022
. #1228 3752

.+ You For Dining At Spring Rolls
- Reservation Please Call:
415 58R.2928
0 1ine reservation: springrolls.ca

-~ RE-PRINT ===

 RE-PRINT ——mm e
— BEDRTNT e e

gperator 50

: 369%98 RRN 0&1115053

| £18.06
rchase AL
(fc $1.80

g M

AT

1 8 Wings 10.99
No Sauce

1 SwiPotFries 5.99

Subtotal 16.98

HST 2.21

Total Due 19.19

Total Due (Cash only) 19.20

Tell Us We Did Today to
* RECEIVE A FREE BPPETIZER *
with a $25 purchase.
Complete wur Guest survey at:
www . montanasfeedback .com
or call 1-866-239-3808.
Access Code: 302711
i ;1 per table;
A A w4+l

mls 7

SEATH  ITEMS ORDEREC AHOU

P74 EASYSELL, Mozz,shred 14

SUBTOTAL P4

ral 14
i Pl 4t

dhack with us

['YEY

LR REF ik oK oS & 5 TP T PHSTE S S S

i

w (70 0T

4

i fopokRdoakE ¥ P TE NS e b
e =l , ..

Jack Astor's t
10 Dur

Torante, Ortar{ #8269

.t

e ofid b

T
chy i
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CHECK # 1707051
T#BLE # 211

= COCKTAIL : Jon L

SEAT#  1TEMS URDERED

3 PIZIA.EASYSELL
3 chz biend, +ADD.BACON

SUBTOTAL

TOTAL

NATE G/
L‘IJ-YL b,"

TIME  9:286P!

AMOUNT

15.10

1540

15.10

15.10

FRERORR R R R R R kR ER R R KRR R AR K

ENTER [0 @IN A TRIP FOK &
10 THE CARIBBEAN

Please share your feedback with
Complete a brief survey

us!

in the next 5 days ahout this visii
to our restaurant and be entered

for a chance to win.
Go to:

Wae  =atauraniquestions.co
coRFRERRrARE AR R R RARAA £

* &
% CODE: 85521320000 5
¥ ¥
PIPISTSIEEES ST S S R S SEREE & b
SUEB i ] & il
TAX 1.97

TOTAL DUE NF L0
=0
17 .0y

FOUNDED TOTAL

bih
K3

You know vou're the nest joint in town
when vour DJ’s jame 15 SMOCOOTH !

Be where the partv’s atit!
Open everday 1ian - Zaili!
Margarita Anyone?

aod Ve
ane art

Jack Astor’s Bas
‘0 Dundas “t. ¢
Torunte. Ontar: it
4 15-263 1500
B7T15156RTHCST

i
Gy,

5 rantastic flavours:

s 44

L

L7 1 i o

JaCK ASTOR’S DUNDAS /

SQUARE
10 DUNDaS STREET E. 4TH
E
TOROWTO o
CaRG 33636362303 363 %0403
caRD TYPE MEETERCARD
DAHTE Z2013-09-30
TIME 9094 21:29:09
SERUR 1D 138202
CHECK i 1707051
THELE # Z11 COCKTAIL

RECE IFT NUMEER
CAZ00I800-001 —001-1258-0

PURCHASE
AMOUNT $17.07
TIP $2.56
TOTAL

$19.53

MasterCard
EOO00000041010
OBCOEDZC8167CEVE
0ODO00B000-ES00
PE4FF 3F CF 7ZDOSDE

APPROVED
K U

O1=027

CARDHOLDER COPY

IMPORTAMNT — RETAIN THIS
COPY FOR YOUR RECORDZ

aTh %

P onalva i
FIEsi]
o2 Street (Kiosk)
ronto, ON
WP 1i:4
~ 416-480-2301
i 416-486-2305

Jun 13/13 11:52a

D

4741120613115249
519 kkkrv448448 S
MasterCard
) Jun 13/13 11:52:00
et BMCWJOJXHFOB13  THCHW
suth Code: 115248
A 11.54
Amount b ey 1154

Sigrature

Cardholder will ¢av cand issuer
above amgunt Qui;(ﬁﬁt to
Cardholder Agreer=nt.

APPROVED - THANK GU
~ Thanks for visiting.
If your order was less than

perfect, :
Tet us know and we'll make it
right! =
contact us at freshii.com
find us twitter and facebook

GST #B857836670 RT0001
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ar was less than
perfect, |

let us know and we'11 make it
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