

THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS

Chair, GAIL REGAN President, Cara Holdings Ltd.

President, PATRICIA ADAMS
MAX ALLEN
ANDREW ROMAN
Producer, IDEAS, CBC Radio
ANDREW COYNE
Columnist, National Post
GLENN FOX
FOressor of Economics, University of Guelph
IAN GRAY
President, St. Lawrence Starch Co.
Clifford DoRWIN
Professor of Political Science, University of Toronto
Columnist, National Post
GLERN FOX
Resident Expert, PSI Initiative, University of Toronto
MICHAEL TREBILCOCK
Chair, Law & Economics, University of Toronto
MARGARET WENTE
Professor of Political Science, University of Toronto
Columnist, The Globe and Mail

June 2, 2014

BY FAX & BY COURIER

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge St, Suite 2701 Toronto ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli:

Board File No. EB-2013-0381
Independent Electricity System Operator --- Fiscal 2014 Fees Submission for Review
Energy Probe - Costs Submission

Pursuant to the Decision and Order, issued on May 22, 2014, please find attached the Costs Submission of Energy Probe Research Foundation (Energy Probe) in respect of the EB-2013-0381 proceeding for the consideration of the Board.

Should you require additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours truly,

David S. MacIntosh

Swidt to that

Case Manager

cc. Adrian Pye, Independent Electricity System Operator (By email)
Jessica Savage, Independent Electricity System Operator (By email)
Glenn Zacher, Stikeman Elliott LLP (By email)
Brady Yauch, Consultant to Energy Probe (By email)

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

			tructions		
- Required da	ata input is indicated by yellow-sł	iaded fields. Formi	ulas are present in the doc	ument to assist with	the calculation of the
cost claim.					
- All claims m	nust be in Canadian dollars. If ap	plicable, state excr Rate:	nange rate and country of i	initial currency. Country:	
- A separate '	"Detail of Fees and Disbursement		 comprising a "Statement o		" and a "Statement of
	nts Being Claimed") is required for				
"Summary of	f Fees and Disbursements" coveri	ng the whole of th	e party's cost claim should	be provided.	
	im must be supported by a comp				
	ch consultant must be attached u	nless, for a given o	consultant, a CV has been p	provided to the Board	d in another process
	st 24 months. rovided in section 7.03 of the Pr	actice Direction or	. Cost Awards itemized re	reints must he prov	ided.
- Except as b	Tovided in Section 7.03 of the FT	active Direction of	i cost Awaras, itemizea re	ecipes mase se prov	iucu.
File # EB-	2013-0381		Process: Independent E	lectricity System C	perator 2014 Fees
Party:	Energy Probe Research Four	dation	Affiant's Name:	Annetta Turner	-
HST Numbe	er: 10730 5146 RT0001		HST Ra	ate Ontario: 6	.50%
	Full Registrant		Qualifying	Non-Profit	✓
	Unregistered			Гах Exempt	
	Other		•	an anompe	l
~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~					
	574.45 574.65		Affidavit		
, e	Annetta Turne	er,	of the City/Town of	То	ronto
in the Prov	vince/State of	Ontario, Canad	da , :	swear or affirm tl	nat:
2. I have exa Being Claime 3. The attach Disbursemer Ontario Ener 4. This cost of	resentative of the above-noted p mined all of the documentation i ed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being ( ned "Summary of Fees and Disbur nts Being Claimed" include only or rgy Board process referred to abor claim does not include any costs f sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Bor	n support of this co Claimed" and "Stati sements Being Cla osts incurred and t we. or work done, or ti	ost claim, including the atta ement(s) of Disbursements imed", "Statement(s) of Fe ime spent directly for the p ime spent, by a person tha	ached "Summary of I s Being Claimed". ees Being Claimed" ar ourposes of the Party	Fees and Disbursements and "Statement(s) of V's participation in the
Signature	of Affiant		Total and the state of the stat		
Sworn or a	affirmed before me at the (	City/Town of			,
in the Prov	vince/State of		, on		T
			pengenan	(date)	

Commissioner for taking Affidavits

File # EB-	2013-0381	Process:	IESO Fiscal 2014 Fees Review

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundation

Summa	ry of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed	
Legal/consultant fees	\$5,387.50	
Disbursements		
HST	\$350.19	
Total Cost Claim	\$5,737.69	

# Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



## **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File# EB-	2013-0381	Process:	IESO Fiscal 2014 Fees Reviev	٧
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundation	Name:	David MacIntosh	
			Completed Years Practising/Years of relevant experience	
Counse	I/Articling Student/Paralegal: Consultant:	<u>'</u>	14	
	CV attached:	CV n	ot required:	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total
Preparation	6.50	\$290.00	\$1,885.00	\$122.53	\$2,007.53
Attendance - Technical Conference		\$290.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference	0.50	\$290.00	\$145.00	\$9.43	\$154.43
Attendance - Oral Hearing		\$290.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Argument		\$290.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Case Management	0.75	\$170.00	\$127.50	\$8.29	\$135.79
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES			\$2,157.50	\$140.24	\$2,297.74

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

#### Time Sheet for D. MacIntosh

### Board File: EB-2013-0381 Independent Electricity System Operator 2014 Fees

Summary:	Hours
Preparation	6.50
Attend. Tech.	0.00
Attend. ADR	0.50
Attend. Hearing	0.00
Argument Prep.	0.00
Case Mngt. (CM)	0.75
Total	7.75

Date	Hours	Note
16-Jan-14	1.00	prep - Preliminary Review of Prefiled Evidence
16-Jan-14	0.50	prep - Draft Notice of Intervention
15-Feb-14	0.25	prep - Review Evidence Update
06-Mar-14	0.75	prep - Draft Interrogatories
08-Mar-14	0.75	prep - Draft Interrogatories
06-Apr-14	1.00	prep - Review Evidence and Interrogatory Responses
28-Apr-14	1.50	prep - Prepare for Settlement Conference
30-Apr-14	0.75	prep - Review Settlement Proposal
Total	6.50	Preparation

Date	Hours	Note
30-Apr-14	0.50	Attend ADR
Total	0.50	Attendance - ADR

Date	Hours	Note
16-Jan-14 13-Mar-14		CM - File Notice of Intervention CM - Check & File Interrogatories
Total	0.75	Case Management

# Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



## **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2013-0381	Process:	IESO Fiscal 2014 Fees Review	
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundation	Name:	Brady Yauch	
			Completed Years Practising/Years of relevant experience	
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal:  Consultant:		5	
	CV attached:	CV n	ot required:	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total
Preparation	19.00	\$170.00	\$3,230.00	\$209.95	\$3,439.95
Attendance - Technical Conference		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Settlement Conference		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Argument		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES			\$3,230.00	\$209.95	\$3,439.95

### Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

## **Brady Yauch**

67A Auburn Avenue Toronto ON M6H 2L8 GST/HST 802822023 RT0001

#### Bill To:

Mr. David MacIntosh Energy Probe Research Foundation 225 Brunswick Avenue Toronto, Ontario, M5S 2M6

#### For:

Intervenor services for the Independent Electricity System Operator Fiscal Year 2014 Fees Submission, EB-2013-0381.

DATE: 5/30/14

Date	DESCRIPTION	Time
March 5, 2014	Reviewed the Electricity System Operator Fiscal Year 2014 Fees Submission by the IESO. Took notes and drafted initial questions.	6.25 Hours
March 6, 2014	Reviewed the Electricity System Operator Fiscal Year 2014 Fees Submission by the IESO. Refined intervenor questions.	4 hours
March 8, 2014	Reviewed the Electricity System Operator Fiscal Year 2014 Fees Submission by the IESO and taking notes for intervenor questions.	2.25 hours
March 8, 2014	Edited and crafted final draft of intervenor questions for the Electricity System Operator Fiscal Year 2014 Fees Submission by the IESO.	2.5 hours
March 11, 2014	Reviewed Board staff IRs for Electricity System Operator Fiscal Year 2014 Fees Submission by the IESO	2.75 hours
April 5, 2014	Reviewing responses from IESO regarding Energy Probe Research Foundation IRs.	1.25 hours
		Total
		19 hours

## **Brady Yauch**

Business: (416) 964-9223 ext 236

Cellular: (416) 822-6884

Email: byauchenergyprobe@gmail.com

#### UNIVERSITY EDUCATION

2013 MA, Economics, York University

2011 Certificate, Economics, Ryerson University

2006 MSc, Cultural Politics, University of Edinburgh

2004 BA, Literature, University of California Santa Cruz

#### **CAREER HISTORY**

2013 - Present Borealis Energy Research Association

- Consultant and Economist to Energy Probe, Consumer Policy Institute and Probe International
- Write reports and other publications on economic viability and public policy issues.

2010 – 2013 Business News Network (BNN), Toronto, Ontario

- Online Economics Editor and Reporter
- Wrote articles focused largely on the Canadian economy, but also notable economic events around the world
- Presented ideas on economics topics and matters to the newsroom

2009 – 2010 Energy Probe Research Foundation, Toronto, Ontario

Policy consultant to Energy Probe and Probe International

2008-2009, Brookshire Media, Toronto Ontario

- Economics reporter and editor
- Led discussions and coverage of economic issues

#### NOTABLE PUBLICATIONS AND PROJECTS

#### 2013 - Present

- Economic analysis of the TTC's proposed Downtown Relief Line, for Consumer Policy Institute
- "Governments rip up renewable contracts" for the Financial Post.
- "Will the World Bank's Latest Mega Expansion Cause Mega Damage?" for Huffington Post.ca

- "While Canadians endured hardships during recent storms, customers in UK got compensated" in the Financial Post that detailed the difference in compensation structures between Ontario and UK power customers.
- "Why China's renewables industry is headed for collapse" in the Financial Post that detailed problems facing China's renewable energy industry.
- "How Canada encourages corrupt countries" in the Financial Post which focused on the policy environment that fostered corruption at SNC-Lavalin and other companies.
- "SNC-Lavalin Corruption Allegations Abound -- So Why's Canada Promoting the Company Abroad?" for Huffington Post.ca
- "Smart Commute: Millions in spending and little to show for it", which detailed the cost of a Metrolinx program and the impact it has had on congestion and traffic.

#### 2010 – 2013 Business News Network (BNN), Toronto, Ontario

- "Canada's lost decade in manufacturing" for BNN.ca.
- "The rise and fall of Canadian exporters" for BNN.ca. and
- "More Fed action likely, but will it work?" for BNN.ca

#### 2009 – 2010 Energy Probe Research Foundation, Toronto, Ontario

- Carbon Credit Database for Probe International. I helped build and maintain the first, and only, online database of carbon credit projects. I was often called upon to explain the carbon credit market to reporters, other policy groups and policy makers.
- "The World Bank Needs Critical Reforms Before It's Allowed to Saddle the Developing World with more Debt" for The Baltimore Chronicle

#### Prior to 2009

- "What if green jobs don't pay?" for Washington Post.com
- "A winter of discontent" for building.ca
- "Boxed Out: OMB Dismisses Big Box Development in Leslieville" for BlogTO.ca