

THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS

Chair, GAIL REGAN President, Cara Holdings Ltd.

President, PATRICIA ADAMS
MAX ALLEN
Producer, IDEAS, CBC Radio
ANDREW COYNE
Columnist, National Post Rot
GLENN FOX
Professor of Economics, University of Guelph IAN GRAY
President, St. Lawrence Starch Co
CLIFFORD ORWIN
Professor of Political Science, University of Toronto

Secretary/Treasurer, ANNETTA TURNER
ANDREW ROMAN
Barrister & Solicitor, Miller Thomson
ANDREW STARK
Rotman School of Management, University of Toronto
GEORGE TOMKO
Resident Expert, PSI Initiative, University of Toronto
MICHAEL TREBILCOCK
Chair, Law & Economics, University of Toronto
MARGARET WENTE
Tomto
Columnist, The Globe and Mail

June 24, 2014

BY EMAIL & BY COURIER

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge St, Suite 2701 Toronto ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli:

Board File No. EB-2013-0321 --- Ontario Power Generation Inc. 2014 - 2015 Payment Amounts Energy Probe - Interim Costs Submission

Pursuant to directions from the Board Panel on June 12, 2014, attached please find the Interim Costs Submission of Energy Probe Research Foundation (Energy Probe) in the EB-2013-0321 proceeding for consideration of the Board

Should you require additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours truly,

David S. MacIntosh

Swidt touthet

Case Manager

cc. Colin Anderson, Ontario Power Generation Inc. (By email)

Carlton D. Mathias, Ontario Power Generation Inc. (By email)

Crawford Smith, Torys LLP (By email)

Charles Keizer, Torys LLP (By email)

Lawrence Schwartz, Economic Consultant to Energy Probe (By email)



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

| | | Instructions | |
|--|---|--|---|
| - All claims m | nust be in Canadian dollars. If applical | ole, state exchange rate and cou Rate: | Country: |
| Disbursemen However, on - The cost cla - A CV for each | nts Being Claimed") is required for each ly one "Summary of Fees and Disburse im must be supported by a completed ch consultant/analyst must be attache | lawyer, analyst/consultant and ments" covering the whole of th Affidavit signed by a represent d unless provided to the Board | ne party's cost claim should be provided. ative of the party. as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff. |
| | | | ards, itemized receipts must be provided. |
| File # EB- | 2013-0321 | Process: Ontario | Power Generation 2014 Payment Amounts |
| Party: | Energy Probe Research Foundation | on Affiant's Na | ame: Annetta Turner |
| HST Numbe | er: 10730 5146 RT0001 | | HST Rate Ontario: 6.50% |
| | Full Registrant | Qu | ualifying Non-Profit |
| | Unregistered | | Tax Exempt |
| | Other | | |
| | | Affidavit | |
| grand g | Annetta Turner | , of the City/Tow | n of <u>Toronto</u> |
| in the Prov | vince/State of Onto | ario, Canada | , swear or affirm that: |
| 2. I have exa Being Claime 3. The attach Disbursemer Ontario Ener 4. This cost of | mined all of the documentation in suped", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimened "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs ing Board process referred to above. | port of this cost claim, including ed" and "Statement(s) of Disbur nts Being Claimed", "Statement acurred and time spent directly rk done, or time spent, by a per | (s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of for the purposes of the Party's participation in the son that is an employee or officer of the Party as |
| Signature | of Affiant | The state of the s | |
| Sworn or a | affirmed before me at the City/ | Town of | , |
| | | , on | |
| | | | (date) |

Commissioner for taking Affidavits



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

| File # EB- 2013-0321 | | Process: Onta | ario Power Generation 2014 Payment Amounts |
|---------------------------------|--------------------|---|--|
| Party: Energy Probe Research Fo | oundation | Make distribution of the Control of | |
| Sumr | nary of Fe | es and Disbursemen | ts Being Claimed |
| Legal/consultant/other fees | \$ | 28,925.00 | |
| Disbursements | \$ | 70.80 | |
| HST | \$ | 1,889.33 | |
| Total Cost Claim | \$ | 30,885.13 | |
| | | Payment Informatio | on stage to leave helicophility in set |
| Make cheque payable t | to: Energy | Probe Research Foun | dation |
| Send payment to this addre | ss: <u>225 Bru</u> | nswick Avenue | |
| | Toronto | , Ontario M5S 2M6 | |
| | Attentic | n: David MacIntosh | |
| | | | |



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

| File# EB- | 2013-0321 | | Process: O | ntario Power Generation 2014 Payment A | mounts |
|-----------|--|--------------|-------------------------------|---|--------|
| Party: | Energy Probe Research Foundati | on | Service Pro | vider Name: Larry Schwartz | - |
| | SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE | (check one) | Year Called to Bar | Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience | |
| | Legal Counsel | | | 30 | |
| | Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst | | | Hourly Rate: \$330 | |
| | For Consultant/Analyst: | 71 | ched rided within previous | HST Rate Charged (enter %): 6.5% 24 months | |

| Statement of Fees Being Claimed | | | | | | | | | | |
|---------------------------------|---|---|---|----|-----------|------|----------|---|-----------|--|
| S | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Hours | Но | urly Rate | | Subtotal | HST | | | Total | |
| Pre-hearing Conference | | | | | | | | ···· | | |
| Preparation | ngapyyyna aman ngapera aman no po ngapyyya akino bersal pinani hann | \$ | 330.00 | \$ | | \$ | | \$ | | |
| Attendance | | \$ | 330.00 | \$ | | \$ | ** | \$ | | |
| Technical Conference | | *************************************** | | | | ~~~~ | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 330.00 | \$ | | \$ | | \$ | | |
| Attendance | 13.3 | \$ | 330.00 | \$ | 4,372.50 | \$ | 284.21 | \$ | 4,656.71 | |
| Interrogatories | | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | 9.3 | \$ | 330.00 | \$ | 3,052.50 | \$ | 198.41 | \$ | 3,250.91 | |
| Responses | 6.8 | \$ | 330.00 | \$ | 2,227.50 | \$ | 144.79 | \$ | 2,372.29 | |
| Issues Conference | | | | | | | | *************************************** | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 330.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | ** | |
| Attendance | | \$ | 330.00 | \$ | ~ | \$ | wa | \$ | 1.00 | |
| ADR - Settlement Conference | | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | 4.5 | \$ | 330.00 | \$ | 1,485.00 | \$ | 96.53 | \$ | 1,581.53 | |
| Attendance | 9.3 | \$ | 330.00 | \$ | 3,052.50 | \$ | 198.41 | \$ | 3,250.91 | |
| Proposal Preparation | | \$ | 330.00 | \$ | ** | \$ | | \$ | - | |
| Argument | | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 330.00 | \$ | ~ | \$ | 62 | \$ | so- | |
| Oral Hearing | | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | 6.0 | \$ | 330.00 | \$ | 1,980.00 | \$ | 128.70 | \$ | 2,108.70 | |
| Attendance | | \$ | 330.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | _ | |
| Other Conferences | | | A THE RESERVE TO THE | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 330.00 | \$ | 14 | \$ | | \$ | | |
| Attendance | | \$ | 330.00 | \$ | | \$ | 44 | \$ | _ | |
| Case Management | | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | | \$ | - | \$ | _ | |
| TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | | | | \$ | 16,170.00 | \$ | 1,051.05 | \$ | 17,221.05 | |



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

| File # EB- | 2013-0321 | Process: | Ontario Power Generation 2014 Payment Amounts |
|------------|-----------|----------|---|
| | | | |

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundati Service Provider Name: Larry Schwartz

| Staten | nent of Disbursements Being Claim | ed | | |
|----------------------|-----------------------------------|------|-----|-------|
| | Net Cost | HST | Tot | al |
| Scanning/Photocopy | | | \$ | • |
| Printing | | | \$ | _ |
| Courier | | | \$ | hrb |
| Telephone/Fax | | | \$ | _ |
| Transcripts | | | \$ | - |
| Travel: Air | | | \$ | |
| Travel: Car | | | \$ | harp |
| Travel: Rail | | | \$ | - |
| Travel (Other): | | | \$ | -4 |
| Parking | | | \$ | |
| Taxi | | | \$ | |
| Accommodation | | | \$ | |
| Meals | | | \$ | 10 |
| Other: | | | \$ | |
| Other: | | | \$ | |
| Other: | | | \$ | ben . |
| | | | | |
| TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: | \$ - | \$ - | \$ | in |

Time Sheet for Larry Schwartz

Board File: EB-2013-0321 Ontario Power Generation 2014 - 2015 Payment Amounts Interim Costs Submission

| Summary: | Hours |
|---|--|
| Preparation Attend. Tech. Attend. ADR Attend. Hearing Argument Prep. Case Mngt. (CM) | 26.50 13.25 9.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 |
| Total | 49.00 |

| Date | Hours | Note |
|--------|-------|--|
| 04-Jan | 1.50 | Review Application and other pre-filed evidence |
| 05-Jan | 2.00 | Review Application and other pre-filed evidence |
| 09-Jan | 1.50 | Review Rate Base section of Application |
| 19-Jan | 0.50 | Review Capitalization and Cost of Capital evidence |
| 20-Jan | 1.50 | Review Capitalization and Cost of Capital evidence |
| 23-Jan | 0.25 | Review Determination of Payment Amounts evidence |
| 23-Jan | 1.50 | Draft Interrogatories |
| 24-Jan | 0.50 | Draft Interrogatories |
| 24-Jan | 0.50 | Prepare Comments on Draft Issues List |
| 20-Apr | 3.00 | Review OPG interrogatory responses |
| 21-Apr | 3.75 | Review OPG interrogatory responses |
| 05-May | 0.50 | Meeting with Case Manager |
| 06-May | 0.50 | Intervenor Teleconference Call to Prioritize Issues |
| 20-May | 1.50 | Review Interrogatory Responses & McShane Report |
| 20-May | 1.50 | Attend Intervenor Meeting to Discuss Settlement Conference |
| 09-Jun | 4.00 | Review Evidence re: NTP; Draft Questions for Hearing |
| 10-Jun | 2.00 | Review IIsley Report, NTP Interrogatory Responses; Draft Questions |
| Total | 26.50 | Preparation |

| Date | Hours | Note |
|------------------|-------|--|
| 22-Apr 23-Apr | | Attend Technical Conference (excl. 1.5 hrs lunch) Attend Technical Conference (excl. 1 hr lunch) |
| Total | 13.25 | Attendance - Technical Conference |

| Hours | Note | Date |
|------------------|------|--|
| 21-May 22-May | | Attend Settlement Conference (excl. lunch) Attend Settlement Conference |
| Total | 9.25 | Attendance - ADR |



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

| File# EB- | 2013-0321 | | Process: Ontario Power | Generation 2014 Payment A | mounts |
|-----------|--------------------------------|--------------|---|--|--------|
| Party: | Energy Probe Research Foundati | on | Service Provider Name: | David MacIntosh | |
| | | | Year Called to | Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant | |
| | SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE | (check one) | Bar | Experience | |
| | Legal Counsel | | | 14 | |
| | Articling Student/Paralegal | | • | | • |
| | Consultant | V | | Hourly Rate: \$290 | |
| | Analyst | | | | |
| | For Consultant/Analyst: | CV attac | ched HST Rate Chrided within previous 24 months | arged (<i>enter</i> %): 6.5% | |

| Statement of Fees Being Claimed | | | | | | | | | | | |
|---------------------------------|--|----|------------|----|-----------|----|--|--------------------------------|-----------|--|--|
| | Hours | Нс | ourly Rate | | Subtotal | | HST | HST Total | | | |
| Pre-hearing Conference | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | | | |
| Attendance | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | *** | \$ | *** | \$ | | | |
| Technical Conference | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | 3.0 | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 870.00 | \$ | 56.55 | \$ | 926.55 | | |
| Attendance | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | Australia de la constantina della constantina de | \$ | | | |
| Interrogatories | | | | | | | | ~***************************** | | | |
| Preparation | 5.0 | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 1,450.00 | \$ | 94.25 | \$ | 1,544.25 | | |
| Responses | 1.8 | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 507.50 | \$ | 32.99 | \$ | 540.49 | | |
| Issues Conference | | | | | | | *************************************** | | | | |
| Preparation | 4.8 | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 1,377.50 | \$ | 89.54 | \$ | 1,467.04 | | |
| Attendance | -40/ ALK COMMON TO ALK AND A | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | •• | \$ | *** | \$ | | | |
| ADR - Settlement Conference | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | 5.5 | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 1,595.00 | \$ | 103.68 | \$ | 1,698.68 | | |
| Attendance | 17.8 | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 5,147.50 | \$ | 334.59 | \$ | 5,482.09 | | |
| Proposal Preparation | 3.3 | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 942.50 | \$ | 61.26 | \$ | 1,003.76 | | |
| Argument | **** | | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | ** | \$ | | \$ | | | |
| Oral Hearing | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | 2.3 | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 652.50 | \$ | 42.41 | \$ | 694.91 | | |
| Attendance | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | | \$ | | \$ | | | |
| Other Conferences | representation for the total state of the st | | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | | \$ | | \$ | | | |
| Attendance | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | | \$ | | \$ | | | |
| Case Management | 1.3 | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | 212.50 | \$ | 13.81 | \$ | 226.31 | | |
| TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | | | | \$ | 12,755.00 | \$ | 829.08 | \$ | 13,584.08 | | |



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2013-0321 Process: Ontario Power Generation 2014 Payment Amounts

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundati Service Provider Name: David MacIntosh

| Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed | | | | | | |
|--|----|----------|----|------|----|--|
| | | Net Cost | | HST | | Total |
| Scanning/Photocopy | | | | | \$ | PP. |
| Printing | | | | | \$ | - |
| Courier | | | | | \$ | American Control of the Control of t |
| Telephone/Fax | | | | | \$ | _ |
| Transcripts | | | | | \$ | _ |
| Travel: Air | | | | | \$ | AA FERSON SERIES (Litture conflicters consequences and consequences (Considers on America) |
| Travel: Car | | | | | \$ | and a second and a |
| Travel: Rail | | | | | \$ | 1- |
| Travel (Other): | | | | | \$ | |
| Parking | \$ | 70.80 | \$ | 9.20 | \$ | 70.80 |
| Taxi | | | | | \$ | A4* |
| Accommodation | | | | | \$ | *** |
| Meals | | | | | \$ | The state of the s |
| Other: | | | | | \$ | |
| Other: | | | | | \$ | |
| Other: | | | | : | \$ | |
| | | | | | | |
| TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: | \$ | 70.80 | \$ | 9.20 | \$ | 70.80 |

Time Sheet for D. MacIntosh

Board File: EB-2013-0321 Ontario Power Generation 2014 - 2015 Payment Amounts Interim Costs Submission

| Summary: | Hours | |
|--|--|--|
| Preparation Attend. Tech. Attend. ADR Attend. Hearing Argument Prep. Case Mngt. (CM) | 25.50 0.00 17.75 0.00 0.00 1.25 | |
| Total | 44.50 | |
| Date | Hours | Note |
| 27-Oct-13 28-Oct-13 09-Dec-13 24-Jan-14 08-Feb-14 11-Feb-14 27-Feb-14 28-Mar-14 31-Mar-14 20-Apr-14 22-Apr-14 07-May-14 18-May-14 20-May-14 02-Jun-14 09-Jun-14 11-Jun-14 Total | 2.25 0.25 1.75 0.50 1.00 0.50 0.75 1.00 0.50 1.75 1.25 1.75 0.50 1.75 1.50 2.25 1.50 2.25 2.50 | prep - Preliminary Review of Prefiled Evidence prep - Draft Notice of Intervention prep - Review the Applicant's Impact Statement prep - Draft Submissions on Draft Issues List prep - Review Parties Submissions on Draft Issues List prep - Draft Surreply on Draft Issues List prep - Review Board's Decision and Order on Issues List prep - Finalize Interrogatories prep - Review Issue Prioritization of Issues Material prep - Draft Submissions re Prioritization of Issues prep - Review Applicant's Interrogatory Responses prep - Review Day 1 Technical Conference Transcript prep - Review Day 2 Technical Conference Transcript prep - Review AMPCO Letter to Board re Issue Prioritization prep - Prepare for Intervenor Meeting, Review Evidence prep - Attend Intervenor Meeting Prior to Settlement Conference prep - Prepare For Settlement Proposals, Many Emails prep - Review Revised Settlement Proposal & Many Emails prep - Many Emails Re Settlement Proposal prep - Prepare For Oral Hearing |
| Date | Hours | Note |
| 21-May-14 22-May-14 23-May-14 26-May-14 | 6.25 3.50 5.50 2.50 | Attend ADR, Day 1 Attend ADR, Day 2 Attend ADR, Day 3 Attend ADR, Day 4 |
| Total | 17.75 | Attendance - ADR |

| Date | Hours | Note |
|--|--------------|--|
| 28-Oct-13 24-Jan-14 11-Feb-14 28-Feb-14 | 0.25 0.25 | CM - File Intervention Itr & Notice. CM - File Comments Draft Issues List CM - File Surreply Draft Issues List CM - Check and File Interrogatories |
| Total | 1.25 | Case Management |

RECEIPT

CAR PARK: Yonge & Eglinton Ctr
DEVICE: Paystation 4
PAID: 26/05/14 05:06P
SKCRT TERM 26/05/14 01:03P
ENITY: 26/05/14 01:03P
PARKING DURATION: 000 02:40
PAID: CAD20.00
TAX FREE CAD17.70
V.A.T. 13%: CAD20.00
CASH PAYMENTS: CAD20.00

| RECEIPT | |
|--|---|
| DEVICE: | Eglinton Ctr Paystation 5 3/05/14 04:39P |
| | 051695 3/05/14 11:06A 3/05/14 04:41P 000 05:33 |
| FAID: TAX FREE V.A.T. 13%; CASH PAYMENTS: | CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30 CAD20.00 |

| RECEIPT | |
|--|---|
| DEVICE | Eglinton Ctr Paystation 4 /05/14 05:43P |
| | 051611 /05/14 01:28P /05/14 05:43P 000 04:15 |
| PAID: TAX FREE V.A.T. 13%: CASH PAYMENTS: | CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30 CAD20.00 |