PLAINS

MIDSTREAM

C A N A D A

Date: September 8, 2014

Ontario Energy Board
P.O. Box 2319

2300 Yonge Street
Toronto, Ontario, Canada
M4P 1E4

RE: License Cancellation - EW-2011-0393, BP Canada Energy Company

Dear Sir or Madam,

Please be informed that BP Canada Energy Company (BP) was amalgamated with
Plains Midstream Canada ULC (Plains) since 2012. Plains had applied for its own
license and an electricity wholesaler account with IESO has been fully established and
functioning.

Please cancel the BP Canada Energy Company license EW-2011-0393 as it is no
longer required.

Sincerely,

P

Scott Sill
Vice President, Operations

1400, 607 Eighth Avenue SW Calgary, Alberta, Canada T2P 0A7 | 1:403.298.210 f: 403.233.0399

www.plainsmidstream.com



» Ontario Energy Board Commission de I'Energie

de I'Ontario
a
P.0. Box 2319 C.P.2319 InV0|ce
Ontarlo 2300 Yonge Street 27e étage
27th Floor 2300, rue Yonge Date Invoice #
Toronto ON  M4P 1E4 Toronto ON M4P 1E4
Telephone: 416-481-1967 Téléphone: 416-481-1967 01/04/2014 1415EW097
Bill Te: Ship To:
BP Canada Energy Company BP Canada Energy Company
1182 Plank Road 1182 Plank Road
P.O. Box 216 P.O. Box 216
Sarnia ON N7T 7H9 Sarnia ON N7T 7H9
Attn: Ted Burgel Aftn: Ted Burgel
Jarms.
Net 30 Days
Licence Description Annual Fee Amount
1 Annual Registration Fee for 2014-15 Fiscal Year 800.00 800.00
EW-2011-0393
Please make cheque payable to the Ontario Energy Board and mail to the above address. .
aue pay oY Total Invoice 3 800.00

12.1 (2) The management committee may set and charge licence fees, application fees and other fees relating to an application or
appeal to the Board. 2003, ¢. 3, s. 17.

IMPORTANT: |t is a condition of your Ontario Energy Board licence that the amount(s) noted in this invoice be paid
within the prescribed time. Your licence conditions are each an “enforceable provision® of the Ontario Energy Board Act, 1998,
and sanctions for non-compliance may include financial penalties, licence suspension and revocation.

Inquiries: Please call Finance Dept. at 416-440-7662 or write to the above address referring to the invoice number.

12.1 (2) Le comité de gestion peut fixer et exiger des droits pour les permis, des droits pour les demandes et
des droits pour les requétes qui sont présentées a la Commission ou les appels qui sont interjetés devant elle. 2003, chap. 3, art. 17.

IMPORTANT: L'une des conditions du permis qui vous été délivré par la Commission de I'énergie de I'Ontario stipule que la ou
les sommes indiquées sur la présente facture doivent étre réglées au moment prescrit. Chacune des conditions de

votre permis constitue une « disposition exécutoire » aux termes de la Loi de 1998 sur la Commission de I'énergie

de I'Ontario. Parmi les sanctions prévues pour manquement & la conformité, mentionnons des pénalités financiéres,

ainsi que la suspension ou révocation du permis.

Renseignements: Veuillez appeler Dep. des Fin. au 416-440-7662 ou écrire & I'adresse indiquée plus haut et préciser le numéro de facture.



Andy Tse

From: George Dimitropoulos <George.Dimitropoulos@ontarioenergyboard.ca>
Sent: Wednesday, August 13, 2014 08:52

To: Andy Tse

Subject: RE: Outstanding Invoice

Hi Andy,

We don't have a record of any request for cancellation for the BP Canada Energy Company. If you'd
like to cancel this licence because it's no longer necessary, please file a letter with the Board
requesting cancellation. At that point we will be able to void the invoice for payment for 2014-15. If
you do not cancel the licence than the payment will need to be paid to the Board. If you have any
questions please let me know. Thanks.

Regards,

George Dimitropoulos

Advisor, Licensing & Performance Reporting
Ontario Energy Board

416-544-5152
george.dimitropoulos@ontarioenergyboard.ca

From: Andy Tse [mailto:Andy.Tse@plainsmidstream.com]
Sent: August 7, 2014 6:10 PM

To: John Pickernell

Cc: Rudina Gjinali; Maureen Connor

Subject: RE: Outstanding Invoice

John,

Thanks for the info.

| believe we have made the payment under Plains Midstream Canada a while ago, and recall my colleague had contacted
to update the contact details to “Mark Stokes”.

Like I've pointed out, BP Canada Energy Company has been amalgamated to Plains Midstream, and the record on your
file seems to be duplicated, thus don’t believe a licence is needed.

BP Canada Energy Group ULC is a totally unrelated company to us.
Please advise if further course of action is required.

Thanks.
Andy

Andy Tse | Specialist, Operational Analyst
Plains Midstream Canada | Suite 1400, 607 8th Ave SW | Calgary, AB T2P QA7
P: 403.261.7490 | M: 403-606-3383 | F: 403.298.2177 | www.plainsmidstream.com

& Please consider the environment before printing this email



From: John Pickernell [mailto:John.Pickernell@ontarioenergyboard.ca]
Sent: Thursday, August 07, 2014 14:07

To: Andy Tse
Cc: Rudina Gjinali; Maureen Connor
Subject: FW: Outstanding Invoice

Hello Andy,

I've copied Maureen Connor in our Licence department concerning your request below. I've looked
through this email thread and am uncertain which licence number you are referring to, however,
here’s a list of active lists currently with the Board:

» Plains Midstream Canada ULC, EW-2012-0221- Primary contact is Mark Stokes in Calgary
o BP Canada Energy Company, EW-2011-0393 — Primary contact is Ted Burgel in Sarnia
e BP Canada Energy Group ULC, EW-2011-0233 — Primary contact is Cheryl Worthy in Calgary

This information can also be found here on the Board’s website. If any of these licences are held by
your firm and need to be amended, please contact Maureen and she will direct in terms of filing a
licence amendment application.

Thank you,
John

John Pickernell
Applications Administration
Ontario Energy Board
416-440-7605

Fax: 416-440-7656

Website: www.ontarioenergyboard.ca

Official Correspondence: BoardSec@ontarioenergyboard.ca
E-filings: https://www.pes.ontarioenergyboard.ca/eservice/

Address:

2300 Yonge Street 27th Floor
Toronto, ON

M4P 1E4

From: Rudina Gjinali

Sent: August-07-14 3:50 PM

To: 'Andy Tse'

Subject: RE: Outstanding Invoice

Hi Andy,

Pll forward your email to the Board Secretary office. Please provide us with the new contact
information.

Thanks,



Rudina Gjinali, CGA

Accountant

Ontario Energy Board

P.O. Box 2319

2300 Yonge Street, 27th Floor

Toronto ON M4P 1E4

Tel: 416 440-7662 Toll free: 1-888-632-6273
Fax: 416 440-7656

Email: rudina.gjinali@ontarioenergyboard.ca

From: Andy Tse [mailto:Andy.Tse@plainsmidstream.com]
Sent: August-07-14 3:46 PM

To: Rudina Gjinali

Subject: RE: Outstanding Invoice

Rudina,

Do you think you can update the company name on file to
Plains Midstream Canada?

BP Canada Energy Company was amalgamated to Plains for two years.

Thanks.
Andy

From: Rudina Gjinali [mailto:Rudina.Gjinali@ontarioenergyboard.ca]
Sent: Thursday, August 07, 2014 13:42

To: Andy Tse; Ted Burgel
Cc: Ryan Mawhinney; Mike Schaefer; Kathy Brigman; Dorian Ago
Subject: RE: Outstanding Invoice

Hi Andy,
Please find attached the outstanding invoice as per your request.
Thanks,

Rudina Gjinali, CGA

Accountant

Ontario Energy Board

P.O. Box 2319

2300 Yonge Street, 27th Floor

Toronto ON M4P 1E4

Tel: 416 440-7662 Toll free: 1-888-632-6273
Fax: 416 440-7656

Email: rudina.gjinali@ontarioenergyboard.ca

From: Andy Tse [mailto:Andy.Tse@plainsmidstream.com]
Sent: August-07-14 3:38 PM

To: Dorian Ago; Ted Burgel
Cc: Rudina Gjinali; Ryan Mawhinney; Mike Schaefer; Kathy Brigman
Subject: RE: Outstanding Invoice

3



Dorian,
Do you mind to resend me the invoice and | can follow up from here?

Thanks.
Andy

Andy Tse | Specialist, Operational Analyst
Plains Midstream Canada | Suite 1400, 607 8th Ave SW | Calgary, AB T2P 0A7
P:403.261.7490 | M: 403-606-3383 | F: 403.298.2177 | www.plainsmidstream.com

& Please consider the environment before printing this email

From: Dorian Ago [mailto:Dorian.Ago@ontarioenergyboard.cal

Sent: Thursday, August 07, 2014 13:28

To: Ted Burgel

Cc: Rudina Gjinali; Ryan Mawhinney; Andy Tse; Mike Schaefer; Kathy Brigman
Subject: RE: Outstanding Invoice

Hi Ted,
Thank you for getting back to me.

Ryan / Andy: Let me know if you do not have the invoice, we will resend one through email if that's
the case.

Thanks again,
Dorian Ago

People, Culture & Business Solutions
Ontario Energy Board

2300 Yonge St, 26th floor

Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

t: 416-440-7666 ext. 754

f: 416-440-7671

e: Dorian.Ago@ontarioenergyboard.ca

From: Ted Burgel [mailto:Ted.Burgel@plainsmidstream.com]
Sent: August-07-14 2:45 PM

To: Dorian Ago

Cc: Rudina Gjinali; Ryan Mawhinney; Andy Tse; Mike Schaefer; Kathy Brigman
Subject: RE: Outstanding Invoice

Importance: High

Hi Dorian



| forwarded your vx-mail to another person here but | think she is on vacation. | have copied some other folks here who
may be able to help you

Ryan / Andy: Would either of you or someone there be able to work with Dorian to get our OEB License fee paid. This
is our license to buy power from the IESO

Thanks

Ted

From: Dorian Ago [mailto:Dorian.Ago@ontarioenergyboard.ca]
Sent: Thursday, August 07, 2014 2:40 PM

To: Ted Burgel

Cc: Rudina Gjinali

Subject: Outstanding Invoice

Good afternoon Ted,

I am following up on the voicemail | left a few days ago regarding an outstanding invoice. This is a
reminder that your account with us is more than 90 days overdue. Payment for Invoice: 1415EW097
for an amount of 800$ was due may 1*. Please provide an update on payment status or if there any
issues causing delay.

Thank you,
Dorian Ago

People, Culture & Business Solutions
Ontario Energy Board

2300 Yonge St, 26th floor

Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

t: 416-440-7666 ext. 754

f: 416-440-7671

e: Dorian.Ago@ontarioenergyboard.ca

This electronic transmission, including any accompanying attachments, may contain information that is
confidential, privileged and/or exempt from disclosure under applicable law, and is intended only for the
recipient(s) named above. Any distribution, review, dissemination or copying of the contents of this
communication by anyone other than the intended recipient(s) is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete the copy
you have received.

Ce message, transmis par courriel, y compris tout fichier joint, peut contenir des renseignements qui sont
confidentiels, qui sont protégés par le secret professionnel ou qui ne peuvent étre divulgués aux termes des lois
applicables et s'adressent exclusivement au(x) destinataire(s) indiqué(s) ci-dessus. La distribution, la diffusion,
I'examen ou la reproduction du contenu du courriel par une autre personne que le(s) destinataire(s) voulu(s) sont
strictement interdits. Si vous recevez ce message par erreur, veuillez le supprimer définitivement et en aviser
I'expéditeur immédiatement par retour du courriel.



