
David I. Poch Barrister                                            tel. (613) 264-0055   fax (613) 264-2878 

 
 

 
1649 Old Brooke Road, Maberly, Ontario K0H 2B0                                  e-mail: dpoch@eelaw.ca 
 

30 November 2014 
 
Ontario Energy Board  
2300 Yonge St., 27th Floor 
Toronto, ON 
M4P 1E4 
 
Attn: Ms Kirsten Walli 
Board Secretary 

 
By electronic filing and mail 
 
Dear Ms Walli: 
 
 
 

Re: EB-2013-0321 - OPG 2014-15 Payments – GEC Cost Claim 
 
Enclosed please find two copies of GEC’s cost claim in this matter. 
 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
 
David Poch 
 
Cc: OPG regulatory (by e-mail) 





Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- Process:

Party:

Total Cost Claim

HST

$47,487.55

Legal/consultant fees

Disbursements

$5,453.23

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

$38,890.50

$3,143.82

GEC

OPG 2014-15 Payments2013-0321

Commissioner for taking Affidavits
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Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- Process:

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly

rate
Subtotal HST

68.60 $330.00 $22,638.00 $2,942.94

9.25 $330.00 $3,052.50 $396.83

$0.00 $0.00

13.50 $330.00 $4,455.00 $579.15

26.50 $330.00 $8,745.00 $1,136.85

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$38,890.50 $5,055.77

HST

$28.26

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$158.66

$35.10

$56.16

Travel (Other): $0.00

included

$30.48

$78.15

$10.65

$0.00

$397.47

2013-0321 OPG 2014-15 Payments

GEC David Poch

Completed Years

Practising/Years of relevant

experience

34

$0.00

$1,379.15

$0.00

$270.00

$245.64

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

$43,946.27

$305.10

$488.16$432.00

$601.16

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone

Postage

$234.46

Transcripts

Photocopies

Attendance - Oral Hearing

Argument

$5,034.15

$9,881.85

$0.00Case Management

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$25,580.94Preparation

Attendance - Technical Conference

Attendance - Settlement Conference

Total

$3,449.33

$0.00

$92.61

$0.00

$3,541.29

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

$81.96

$3,143.82

Parking $86.37

$264.94

$679.31

Total

$0.00

Taxi or Airport Limo

$86.37

Accommodation

$1,220.49

Net Cost

$217.38
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David I. Poch Barrister                                            tel. (613) 264-0055   fax (613) 264-2878 

 
 

 
1649 Old Brooke Road, Maberly, Ontario K0H 2B0                                  e-mail: dpoch@eelaw.ca 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

ACCOUNT 

 

 

Date: 28 November 2014 

 

To:  GEC 

 

Re:   EB-2013-0321 – OPG 2014-15 Payments – Hearing Phase 

 

 

For services rendered on behalf of GEC in this matter (see dockets attached)    

 

Fees at OEB tariff for purposes of costs request: 

 

Fees 117.85 hrs. @ $330.00 (see docket) $38,890.50 

Disbursements (see summary)    $3,143.82 

Subtotal       $42,034.32 

HST        $5,464.46 

Total Costs       $47,498.78 

 

This is my account E&OE 

 

 

 

 

David Poch 

 

HST# 11020 1506 

 

 



A B C D E F G

Time Docket for David Poch: EB-2013-0321 OPG 2014-15 - Hearing Phase

Date Description of work prep hrg tech ADR arg

12 Meet OPA, confer other parties, attend day 1 1.25 1

13

review KPMG, prep, confer re OPA scope and 

need for cross - draft questions to OPA for 

discussion 6

16 prep cross of OPG (and opa) 6.25

17 correspond OPA, prep 1.75

18 prep, meet other parties, attend 1.25 3.5

19

monitor hearing, correspond, draft points for 

arg, review transcript 1.75 3 0.5

20 correspond OPA, confer ED, review transcripts 0.75

21 review transcript 1

24

review OPA correspondence, confer ED re 

need for witness, draft arg re Pickering aspects 0.75 2.5

25 draft arg on Pickering 3.75

26 confer Elson and correspond OPA 0.5

July 2

confer F. Cass, Elson, initial review of new 

filing 1.5

3 review new evid 2

4 review new evid, prep for tech conf 5.75

7 " 3.75

8 meet Elson, prep, attend tech conf 0.5 6

9 prep, corresp., attend tech 0.75 3.25

10 review transcript, prep 4

11 review t'scripts prep cross 4.25

12 prep cross of OPG 3

13 narrow cross and cross materials 2.5

14 prep, assemble cross book 3.5

15

review new undertaking responses -- revise 

cross, prep, correspond client etc., review 

transcript 4.25

16

prep, attend, review new undertaking 

responses 2.25 3

17 review cross, meet OPG re JT3.17, attend 1.5 3

21 review responses, correspond OPA, client 0.5

22 draft arg 3.5

23 review transcripts 5

25 draft arg 6.5

28 review OPG argument and draft arg 5.75

30 draft arg, confer client 2.25

Aug 22

review correspondence and drafts of other 

parties, finalize arg. 1.75

Sept 11 review OPG reply and report 0.75

Nov 21 review decision and report 1.6

SUBTOTALS EXCL. INTERIM CLAIM 68.6 13.5 9.25 26.5

Total Hours 117.85



Disbursements David Poch - GEC - File: OPG 2014-15  EB-2013-0321 - Hearing Phase

excl HST unless noted

Category Date Description Amount Net of GST

Air June 11-12 Ottawa-Tor ret 582.25

June 12 change flight fee 50

June 17 Ottawa-Tor 318.12

June 18 Tor-Ottawa 270.12

1220.49

Train July7-9 Via Kingston-Tor. Ret 216

Jul 15-17 " 216

subtotal 432

Mileage June 11-12 Maberly-Ottawa ret 200km 67.5

June 17-18 Maberly-Ottawa ret 200km 67.5

July 7-9 Maberly-Kingston ret 200km 67.5

July 15-17 " 67.5

subtotal 270

Parking

incl HST June 11-12 at Ottawa airport 21

June 17-18 at Ottawa airport 41

July 7-9 at via 21.35

July 15-17 14.25

subtotal 97.6 86.37

Taxis/limos Apr 21 to hotel 23

incl HST June 11 to hotel 59

june 12 to Pearson 54.18

Jun 17 to hotel 25.25

Jun 18 to Pearson 59.51

July 7 to accomodation 13

July 9 to VIA 30

July 15 to hotel 24

subtotal 264.94 234.46

Accomodation June 11 169.99

June 17 149.59

July 15-17 281.58

subtotal 601.16

Meals (@ max8.75/11.25/20)

incl HST

Jun 12 11.25

Jun 18 11.25

July 7-9 dinner 20

lunch 7.86

July 15-17 11.25

20

11



subtotal 92.61 81.96

Photocopies Jun 18 cross materials 127.88

July 16 " 89.5

subtotal 217.38

TOTAL excluding interim claims 3143.82












































