578 McNaughton Ave. West Chatham, Ontario, N7L 4J6 Phone: (519) 351-8624 E-mail: randy.aiken@sympatico.ca

January 5, 2015

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street Suite 2700 Toronto, Ontario, M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli:

#### Re: EB-2014-0271 - Union Gas 2015 Rates - Cost Award Documents of LPMA

As per the Board's Decision and Order dated December 18, 2014, please find attached two copies of the following documents related to the requested cost award of the London Property Management Association ("LPMA") associated with their participation with respect to the above noted proceeding. An electronic copy has also been e-mailed to the Board Secretary and filed through the Board's RESS system.

A copy has also been sent by e-mail to Union Gas. The cost award documents contains the following pages from the Cost Claim for Hearings form and supporting information:

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements, Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed, Copy of Aiken & Associates invoice dated January 5, 2015, and Photocopy of expense receipts.

Payment should be made to the LPMA at the following address:

London Property Management Association 460 Berkshire Drive, Unit 102 London, Ontario, N6J 3S1

Attn: Emma Sims

If you have any questions, please give me a call.

Sincerely,

Randy Aiken

Randy Aiken Aiken & Associates

c.c. Ms. Emma Sims, LPMA
Chris Ripley, Union Gas (by e-mail)



### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

				mulas are embedded in the change rate and country		culations.
Disbursemer However, on - The cost cla	nts Being Claimed Ily one "Summary aim must be supp	") is required for eac of Fees and Disburs orted by a complete	ing Claimed" h lawyer, an ements" cov d Affidavit si	(comprising a "Statemen alyst/consultant and artic ering the whole of the pa gned by a representative ovided to the Board as pre	it of Fees Being Claimed" ling student/paralegal. rty's cost claim should be of the party.	provided.
Ex	cept as provided	in section 7.03 of th	e Practice Di	irection on Cost Awards,	itemized receipts must k	e provided.
File # EB-	2014-0271			Process: Union Gas -	2015 Rates	
Party:	<b>London Prope</b>	rty Management A	\ssociation	Affiant's Name:	Randall E. Aiken	
HST Numbe	er: na			нѕт	Rate Ontario: 13.0	00%
		Full Registrant		Qualify	ring Non-Profit	
		Unregistered Other			Tax Exempt	
				Affidavit		
I,	R	andall E. Aiken		, of the City/Town of	Chathai	m-Kent
in the Prov	ince/State of	Or	tario		, swear or affirm tha	at:
<ul><li>2. I have exa</li><li>Being Claime</li><li>3. The attach</li><li>Disbursemer</li></ul>	mined all of the d ed", "Statement(s ned "Summary of nts Being Claimed	locumentation in sup ) of Fees Being Claim Fees and Disbursem	oport of this led" and "Sta ents Being Cl	and as such have knowle cost claim, including the a stement(s) of Disburseme laimed", "Statement(s) of time spent directly for th	attached "Summary of Fe nts Being Claimed". Fees Being Claimed" and	es and Disbursements I "Statement(s) of
				time spent, by a person tection on Cost Awards.	hat is an employee or off	icer of the Party as
Ray	fell &	Gha	Tradition on a	colon on cost/wards.		
Signature	of Affiant					
Sworn or a	affirmed befor	e me at the City/	Town of	Chath	am-Kent	,
in the Prov	ince/State of	0	ntario	, on	Jan. 5, 2015	•
R		0.55			(date)	
Commission	oner for taking	, Affidavits				

Romnie Elizabeth Vestula, a Commindence, etc., Prevince of Cetario, for J. Quaglia Lew Office a Professional Comparation. Explant September 21, 2016.

Page 1 of 2



### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

File # EB- 2014-0271 Process: Union Gas - 2015 Rates

Party: London Property Management Association

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed						
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	4,389.00				
Disbursements	\$	275.88				
HST	\$	605.94				
Total Cost Claim	\$	5,270.82				

### **Payment Information**

Make cheque payable to: London Property Management Association

Send payment to this address: Emma Sims

**London Property Management Association** 

460 Berskhire Drive, Unit 102 London, Ontario, N6J 3S1



### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2014-0271		Process: Union Gas - 20	015 Rates	
Party:	London Property Management As	ssociation	Service Provider Name:	Randall E. Aiken	
			Year Called to	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant	
	<b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE</b>	(check one)	Bar	Experience	
	Legal Counsel			29	
	<b>Articling Student/Paralegal</b>				
	Consultant	✓		Hourly Rate: \$330	
	Analyst				
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV atta	ached HST Rate C	harged (enter % ): 13.0%	
		CV pro	vided within previous 24 months		

S	Statement of Fees Being Claimed									
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	,	Subtotal		HST		Total	
Pre-hearing Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Technical Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Interrogatories										
Preparation	2.7	\$	330.00	\$	891.00	\$	115.83	\$	1,006.83	
Responses	1.1	\$	330.00	\$	363.00	\$	47.19	\$	410.19	
Issues Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
ADR - Settlement Conference										
Preparation	0.4	\$	330.00	\$	132.00	\$	17.16	\$	149.16	
Attendance	4.5	\$	330.00	\$	1,485.00	\$	193.05	\$	1,678.05	
Proposal Preparation	4.6	\$	330.00	\$	1,518.00	\$	197.34	\$	1,715.34	
Argument										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Oral Hearing										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Other Conferences										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	4,389.00	\$	570.57	\$	4,959.57	



### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB- 201	14-0271	Process:	Union Gas - 2015 Rates
11 <b>e # cb-</b> 20.	14-02/1	Process:	Union Gas - 2015 Rales

Party: London Property Management / Service Provider Name: Randall E. Aiken

	Statement of D	isbursements Being Claimed	1	
		Net Cost	HST	Total
Scanning/Photocop	у			\$ -
Printing				\$ -
Courier				\$ -
Telephone/Fax				\$ -
Transcripts				\$ -
Travel: Air				\$ -
Travel: Car		\$ 107.26	\$ 13.94	\$ 121.20
Travel: Rail				\$ -
Travel (Other):				\$ -
Parking		\$ 17.70	\$ 2.30	\$ 17.70
Taxi				\$ -
Accommodation		\$ 128.75	\$ 16.25	\$ 145.00
Meals		\$ 22.17	\$ 2.88	\$ 25.05
Other:				\$ -
Other:				\$ -
Other:				\$ -
		·		
TOTAL DISBURSEM	ENTS:	\$ 275.88	\$ 35.37	\$ 308.95



### **AIKEN & ASSOCIATES**

578 McNAUGHTON AVE. WEST CHATHAM, ONTARIO, N7L 4J6 (519) 351-8624 randy.aiken@sympatico.ca

INVOICE NO. 003-2015

DATE January 5, 2015

HST REGISTRATION NO. 130417983

TO Emma Sims
London Property Management Association
460 Berkshire Drive, Unit 102
London, Ontario, N6J 3S1

PROJECT
EB-2014-0271 - Union Gas - 2015 Rates
Page 1 of 2

DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION	RATE	TOTAL
Oct. 26	1.20	Review of evidence & preparation of interrogatories		
Oct. 27	1.50	Review of evidence & preparation of interrogatories		
Nov. 11	1.10	Review of interrogatory responses & updated LRAM evidence		
Nov. 12	0.40	Preparation for settlement conference		
Nov. 14	4.50	Attendance at settlement conference		
Nov. 20	0.50	Review and response to numerous e-mails re unsettled issues		
Nov. 21	0.70	Review and response to numerous e-mails re unsettled issues		
Nov. 24	1.20	Review and response to numerous e-mails re unsettled issues		
Nov. 25	0.50	Intervenor conference call re unsettled issues		
Nov. 27	1.20	Conference call wit Union and conference call with intervenors re unsettled issues		
Dec. 1	0.30	Review of draft settlement agreement & preparation of comments		
Dec. 3	0.20	Review of revised draft agreement & sign off		
	13.30	Sub-total - Consulting Costs	330.00	4,389.00

PROJECT
EB-2014-0271 - Union Gas - 2015 Rates
Page 2 of 2

DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION	RATE	TOTAL
<b>EXPENSES</b>				
Travel - Ca	<u>r</u>			
Aug. 7		Toronto to Chatham (303 kms @ \$0.354/km (HST component calculated below))	107.26	
		Sub-Total - Travel - Car		107.26
Travel - Ot	<u>her</u>			
Nov. 14		Parking at OEB	17.70	
		Sub-Total - Travel - Other		17.70
Accomodat	ion			
Sept. 2	.1011	Hotel, including parking	128.75	
30pt. 2		Sub-Total - Accomodation		128.75
		Sub-Total - Accombidation		120.73
Meals				
Nov. 13		Dinner	17.70	
Nov. 14		Lunch	4.47	
		Sub-Total - Meals		22.17
CLIMANAADV		TOTAL FEEC AND EVDENICES		4 ( / 4 00
SUMMARY		TOTAL FEES AND EXPENSES		4,664.88
		HST DETAIL		
		Consulting Fees (@ 13.0%)		570.57
		Travel - Car (@ 13.0%)		13.94
		Travel - Other (@ 13.0%)		2.30
		Accomodation (@ 13.0%)		16.25
		Meals (@ 13.0%)		2.88
		TOTAL HST		605.94
			SUBTOTAL	4,664.88
			H.S.T.	605.94
			TOTAL	\$5,270.82

Make all cheques payable to AIKEN & ASSOCIATES Payment is due upon receipt of payment for the project



Mr Randall Aiken 578 Mcnaughton Ave West Chatham ON N7L 4J6 Canada A/R Number Group Code Invoice No. Reference #

Room No.

305

Page No.

1 of 1

Arrival

11-12-14

Cashier No.

114

Departure

11-14-14

User ID

SW

Date		Description		
11-12-14	*Accommodation		125.00	E12-2014-007
11-12-14	Facilities Fee		3.75	FRIM.
11-12-14	Room HST 13%		16.25	1 12110010
11-13-14	In Room Dining-Food	Room# 305 : CHECK# 798957	37.21	FB-2014-0
11-13-14	*Accommodation		125.00	DAM
11-13-14	Facilities Fee		3.75	0,510
11-13-14	Room HST 13%		16.25	

Total 327.21 0.00

Balance 327.21

		Facilities Fee			Room HST 13				
0.00	0.00	7.50	0.00	0.00	32.50	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00

Guest Signature	
ancar asidingenic	

I have received the goods and / or services in the amount shown heron. I agree that my liability for this bill is not waived and agree to be held personally liable in the event that the indicated person, company, or association fails to pay for any part or the full amount of these charges. If a credit card charge, I further agree to perform the obligations set forth in the cardholder's agreement with the issuer.

TORONTO DON VALLEY HOTEL & SUITES 175 Wynford Drive Toronto, Ontario M3C 1J3 Telephone: (416) 449-4111 Fax: (416) 449-4946

Store #100752 (416)483-73 E&OE HST# R1052161	340 170
DELI F2 Sandw.combo a	IF 4.49
SUBTOTAL	4.49
4.49 RED ( 5.000)% 4.49 PFT ( 8.000)%	0.22 0.36
TOTAL ROUNDED ROUNDED TOTAL	<b>5.07</b> -0.02 5.05
CASH CHANGE DUE Total number of items sold =	7.00 1.95
RETAIN RECEIPT FOR PRODUCT RE WITHIN 14 DAYS. SEE STORE FOR	ETURN Details.
WIN \$1000 in Metro Gift Ca Visit: metrosurvey.ca	ards
*CUSTOMER CARE NUMBER 1-877-763  *** Betro.ca *** Paul Pontarini, Store Manager 11/14/2014 Cashier 308 10075	1-7374* 12:59 PM 2 53 5670

PRINT NAME	
SIGNATURES  *** GRATUITY INCLUDED IN BILL *** 11/13/14 GUEST 1 NUMBER 798957	PECE IPT
	CPR PARK: Yonge & Eglinton C DEVICE: Paystation PAID: 14/11/14 02:5
	SHORT TERM 0106 ENTRY: 14/11/14 07:0 EXIT: 14/11/14 02:5 PARKING DURATION: 0000 07: CHARGED DURATION: 0000 02:
	PAID; CAD20.1 TAX FREE CAD17. V.A.T. 13%; CAD2.3
	COCH DOVMENTE CORDON A

IN ROOM DINING 175 WYNFORD DRIVE TORONTO, ONTARIO M3C 1J3

123 TABLE 1305/1

**HST** 

TOTAL...37.21.

GRATUITY 15%

ROOM NO. 305 TIPS. 4.60

TIME 19:52

20.00

2.95

3.00

3.82

3.44

33.21

GST # R - 870011962

1 DON BURGER

1 DIET COKE

1 DELIVERY CHARGE

NET SALES 25.95 GRAND TOTAL

ROOM SERVE



