



January 15, 2015

via email and RESS - signed original to follow by courier

Ms. Kirsten Walli  
Board Secretary  
Ontario Energy Board  
2300 Yonge Street, 27th Floor  
Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

**Re: Horizon Utilities Corporation Distribution Rates 2015-2019 (EB-2014-0002)  
- SIA Cost Claims**

Dear Ms. Walli,

In accordance with the Ontario Energy Board's ("OEB") Decision and Rate Order dated January 8, 2015, attached are the cost claims of the Sustainable Infrastructure Alliance of Ontario (the "SIA").

Please note that our mailing address has changed. Please direct all future correspondence, as well as payment of any approved cost claims (made out to **SIA Ontario**), to the following address:

**SIA of Ontario  
55 Bloor Street West  
PO Box 19611 (Manulife)  
Toronto, ON  
M4W 3T9**

We thank the OEB for the opportunity to participate in this proceeding.

Sincerely,

*[original signed by]*

Robert Sutton  
Director, SIA

**Ontario Energy Board**  
**COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS**



**Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

**Instructions**

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are present in the document to assist with the calculation of the cost claim.
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.  
Rate: \_\_\_\_\_ Country: \_\_\_\_\_
- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each consultant or lawyer/articling student/paralegal. However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.
- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.
- A CV for each consultant must be attached unless, for a given consultant, a CV has been provided to the Board in another process within the last 24 months.
- **Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.**

<b>File #</b> EB- <u>2014-0002</u>	<b>Process:</b> <u>Horizon 2015-2019 CIR Application</u>
<b>Party:</b> <u>SIA Ontario</u>	<b>Affiant's Name:</b> <u>Dionisio Rivera</u>
<b>HST Number:</b> <u>82436 5795 RT0001</u>	<b>HST Rate Ontario:</b> <u>13.00%</u>
Full Registrant <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	Qualifying Non-Profit <input type="checkbox"/>
Unregistered <input type="checkbox"/>	Tax Exempt <input type="checkbox"/>
Other <input type="checkbox"/>	

**Affidavit**

I, Dionisio Rivera, of the City/Town of Richmond Hill  
in the Province/State of Ontario, swear or affirm that:

1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.
2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".
3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.
4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

**Signature of Affiant**

Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of Toronto,  
in the Province/State of Ontario, on December 15, 2014.  
(date)

**Commissioner for taking Affidavits**

**Ontario Energy Board**  
**COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS**



**Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

**File #** EB- 2014-0002 **Process:** Horizon 2015-2019 CIR Application

**Party:** SIA Ontario

**Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

Legal/consultant fees	\$15,297.50
Disbursements	\$0.00
HST	\$1,988.68
<b>Total Cost Claim</b>	<b>\$17,286.18</b>

**Ontario Energy Board  
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS**



**Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	<b>2014-0002</b>	Process:	<b>Horizon 2015-2019 CIR Application</b>
Party:	<b>SIA Ontario</b>	Name:	<b>Dionisio Rivera</b>
		Completed Years Practising/ Years of relevant experience	<b>13</b>
Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:	<input type="checkbox"/>		
Consultant:	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		
CV attached:	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	CV not required:	<input type="checkbox"/>

**Statement of Fees Being Claimed**

	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total
Preparation	41.00	\$290.00	\$11,890.00	\$1,545.70	\$13,435.70
Attendance - Technical Conference	3.75	\$290.00	\$1,087.50	\$141.38	\$1,228.88
Attendance - Settlement Conference	2.50	\$290.00	\$725.00	\$94.25	\$819.25
Attendance - Oral Hearing	3.75	\$290.00	\$1,087.50	\$141.38	\$1,228.88
Argument	1.75	\$290.00	\$507.50	\$65.98	\$573.48
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
<b>TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES</b>			<b>\$15,297.50</b>	<b>\$1,988.68</b>	<b>\$17,286.18</b>

**Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed**

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
<b>TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>

**Timesheet: EB-2014-0002 (Horizon Rates 2015-2019)**

Date	Description	Preparation	Technical Conference	ADR	Hearing	Argument	Total
11-Jun-14	Review PO#1; Review Evidence Scope	0.5					0.5
16-Jun-14	Preliminary Review of Prefiled Evidence	1.5					1.5
17-Jun-14	Preliminary Review of Prefiled Evidence	2.75					2.75
18-Jun-15	Evidence review - begin IR preparation	2.75					2.75
20-Jun-14	Evidence review - begin IR preparation	2					2
22-Jun-14	Draft IRs	2.5					2.5
23-Jun-14	Draft IRs	1.75					1.75
24-Jun-14	Continue evidence review and IRs	2					2
25-Jun-14	Reviewed Updated Evidence	0.75					0.75
01-Jul-14	Continue drafting IRs	2					2
03-Jul-14	Continue evidence review and IRs	2.75					2.75
04-Jul-14	Finalize and Submit IRs	0.75					0.75
07-Jul-14	Review IRs of other parties	0.5					0.5
11-Jul-14	Emails	0.25					0.25
02-Aug-14	Review IR responses	2					2
05-Aug-14	Review IR responses	2.75					2.75
07-Aug-14	Review IR responses; Prepare for TC	3					3
09-Aug-14	Review PO #3	0.25					0.25
10-Aug-14	Review IR responses; Prepare for TC	2.5					2.5
11-Aug-14	Briefly Review Weirfolds Evidence	0.5					0.5
13-Aug-14	Emails; IR Confidentiality; TC Question Review	0.5					0.5
14-Aug-14	File TC Questions	0.75					0.75
15-Aug-14	Review SEC Letter; Emails	0.25					0.25
18-Aug-14	Final TC Prep; Emails	0.75					0.75
19-Aug-14	Attend Tech Conference (morning only)		1.75				1.75
19-Aug-14	Review TC Question Responses	1.5					1.5
20-Aug-14	Review Tech Conference Transcript		2				2

Dionisio Rivera Consulting  
 1013-15 Baif Blvd.  
 Richmond Hill, ON L4C 5N7  
 Tel: 416-770-4937  
 dionisio.rivera@live.com

20-Aug-14	Draft Issues List Emails & Review	0.75					0.75
21-Aug-14	Review PO #4; Minor TC follow-ups	0.25					0.25
22-Aug-14	Horizon Motion and UT Responses Review	0.75					0.75
05-Sep-14	CoH Evidence Withdrawal, Emails, and PO#6	0.25					0.25
17-Sep-14	Review PO#7			0.25			0.25
18-Sep-14	Review Decision Re: Confidentiality	0.25					0.25
20-Sep-14	Emails Re: Settlement Proposal; Sign Off			0.5			0.5
25-Sep-14	Review Finalized Settlement Proposal			1			1
26-Sep-14	Multiple Emails	0.25					0.25
27-Sep-14	Briefly Review Evidence Update	0.5					0.5
02-Oct-14	Review Board Staff Submissions Re: Settlement			0.75			0.75
03-Oct-14	Briefly Review Transcript Vol 1 & 2				1.75		1.75
04-Oct-14	Review Conf. Filing Responses	0.5					0.5
10-Oct-14	Review Transcript Vol 3 & 4				2		2
17-Oct-14	Briefly Review Transcript Vol 5 + Emails					1.25	1.25
24-Oct-14	Briefly Review Transcript Vol 6					0.5	0.5
<b>TOTAL</b>		<b>41</b>	<b>3.75</b>	<b>2.5</b>	<b>3.75</b>	<b>1.75</b>	<b>52.75</b>

<b>Total Cost (at \$290/hour)</b>	<b>\$ 15,297.50</b>
<b>HST</b>	<b>\$ 1,988.68</b>
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>\$ 17,286.18</b>

**Dionisio Rivera Consulting**  
1013-15 Baif Blvd.  
Richmond Hill, ON L4C 5N7  
Tel: 416-770-4937  
dionisio.rivera@live.com

---

## **CURRICULUM VITAE OF**

### **Dionisio Rivera, P. Eng (Ph)**

#### **EDUCATION:**

- B. Sc. Mechanical Engineering, Saint Louis University, Philippines - 1988
- Six Sigma Certification, USA - 2005

#### **PROFESSIONAL EXPERIENCE:**

- Dionisio Rivera Consulting (GTA, Canada)
  - Owner and Principal Engineering Consultant (Jun 2001 – Present)
- GEA Canada Inc. (Richmond Hill, Canada)
  - Senior Applications Engineer (Mar 2011 – Jul 2014)
- SPX Flow Technology Systems Inc. - formerly APV North America (Goldsboro, USA)
  - Applications Engineer (Aug 2007 – Feb 2011)
- APV Canada Inc. (Concord, Canada)
  - Engineering Sales Representative (May 2000 – Aug 2006)
- APV Middle East Ltd. (Riyadh, Kingdom of Saudi Arabia)
  - Technical Engineering Assistant (May 1993 – Dec 1999)
- South Sea Textile Mfg. Inc. (Lipa City, Philippines)
  - Assistant Engineer (Jan 1991 - May 1993)
- South Sea Textile Mfg. Co. Ltd. (Tuen Mun, Hong Kong)
  - Junior Engineer (Oct 1989 – Dec 1990)