

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

				nstructions	The Real Property of	
- All claims m	nust be in Cana	dian dollars. If applica	able, state e :Rate	mulas are embedded in the form to as schange rate and country of initial curre Count	ency. cry:	
Disbursemer However, on - The cost cla - A CV for ea	nts Being Claim ly one "Summa aim must be su ch consultant/a	ed") is required for eac ary of Fees and Disburs oported by a complete analyst must be attach	ch lawyer, ar sements" cov d Affidavit s ed unless pr	"(comprising a "Statement of Fees Beir nalyst/consultant and articling student/vering the whole of the party's cost claigned by a representative of the party. ovided to the Board as prescribed on the party.	paralegal. m should be p	provided. d Tariff.
File # EB-	2013-0339	a pagalah at	73	Process: wpd White Pines Inc. A		
Party:	Al. S. Warur	kiw		Affiant's Name: Graham Andrews		
HST Numbe	er: 82624	4220RT001	14	HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%		
		Full Registrant Unregistered Other		Qualifying Non-Pro Tax Exen]
				Affidavit		
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	id West	Graham Andrews		, of the City/Town of	Toror	
in the Prov	vince/State o	of OI	ntario	, swear or	affirm that	t:
2. I have exa Being Claime 3. The attacl Disburseme Ontario Ene 4. This cost of	amined all of the ed", "Statemen hed "Summary nts Being Claim rgy Board proc claim does not	e documentation in su t(s) of Fees Being Clair of Fees and Disbursen ed" include only costs ess referred to above. include any costs for w	pport of this ned" and "St nents Being (incurred an vork done, o	") and as such have knowledge of the meas cost claim, including the attached "Sustement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Color time spent directly for the purposes of the spent, by a person that is an emprection on Cost Awards.	mmary of Fee iimed". Claimed" and ' of the Party's p	es and Disbursements "Statement(s) of participation in the
Signature	of Affiant					
Sworn or	affirmed be	fore me at the City	/Town of	Toronto		
in the Pro	vince/State	of	Ontario	, onMar	ch-26-15 (date)	
_C	De 1	Weil				
Commissi	oner for tak	ing Affidavits				

Page 1 of 2

Anna Maciel, a Const

Province of Ontario, for Our Barrister and Solicitor. Evolves August 28, 2017.



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

2013-0339		Process: wpd White Pines Inc. Applica	tion for Leave to Constru
Party: Al. S. Warunkiw			
S	ummary of Fee	and Disbursements Being Claimed	
ultant/other fees	\$	2,176.00	
ents	\$.	
	\$	282.88	
Claim	\$	2,458.88	
	Al. S. Warunkiw Si ultant/other fees ents	Summary of Fees ultant/other fees \$ ents \$ \$	Al. S. Warunkiw Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed ultant/other fees \$ 2,176.00 ents \$ 5 \$ 282.88

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Eric K. Gillespie Professional Corporation, In Trust

Send payment to this address: Eric K. Gillespie Professional Corporation

10 King Street East, Suite 600

Toronto, Ontario

M5C 1C3



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File# EB-	2013-0339		Process: wp	nd White Pines Inc. Application for Leave to Const
Party:	Al. S. Warunkiw		Service Prov	rider Name: Graham Andrews
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience
	Legal Counsel	$\overline{\checkmark}$	2012	2
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst			Hourly Rate: \$170
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	ched vided within previous	HST Rate Charged (enter %): 13.0% 24 months

P. DANE STREET, SAN THE WASHINGTON OF	atement o								Takal
	Hours	Ho	urly Rate	S	ubtotal		HST		Total
Pre-hearing Conference									
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	(4)	\$		\$	
Technical Conference									
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$		\$	· ·	\$	
Interrogatories									
Preparation	4.50	\$	170.00	\$	765.00	\$	99.45	\$	864.45
Responses		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$		\$	*)
Issues Conference									
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$	-	\$	20
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	È	\$	2	\$:#3
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$		\$	-
Attendance	7 4 4 -	\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Proposal Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$	- 2	\$	
Argument				_					064.06
Preparation	1.90	\$	170.00	\$	323.00	\$	41.99	\$	364.99
Oral Hearing				_		ļ.,		_	
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	•	\$	-
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$		\$	= =	\$	-
Other Conferences						<u> </u>			
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	90	\$	
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	(#)	\$	#0	\$	4 000 44
Case Management	6.40	\$	170.00	\$	1,088.00	\$	141.44	\$	1,229.44
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES	MILITER OF STREET			\$	2,176.00	\$	282.88	\$	2,458.88



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2013-0339	Process: wpd White I	te Pines Inc. Application for Leave to Const		
Party:	Al. S. Warunkiw	Service Provider Name:	Graham Andrews		

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Scanning/Photocopy	STATE OF THE STATE		\$ -
Printing			\$ -
Courier			\$ -
Telephone/Fax			\$.
Transcripts			\$
Travel: Air			\$.
Travel: Car	1 13 13 1		\$
Travel: Rail			\$
Travel (Other):			\$
Parking			\$
Taxi			\$
Accommodation	THE STATE OF THE STATE OF		\$
Meals			\$
Other:			\$
Other:		- A three ent	\$
Other:			\$
ouier.	3万里是成为自己的美国的发生的发生。		EL SISTEMATION DE LA COMPANION
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	\$ -	\$

ERIC K. GILLESPIE PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION

Barristers & Solicitors Suite 600, 10 King Street East Toronto, ON M5C 1C3 Canada

Ph: (416) 703-5400

Fax: (416) 703-9111

Mr. Al S. Warunkiw 745 Crowes Road Milford Ontario K0K 2T0 Canada

File #:

00898

RE:

EB-2013-0339 - wpd White Pines Wind Incorporated Application for Leave to Construct

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	LAWYER
Dec-12-13	Review documents and telephone call with S. Warunkiw re OEB request; left voicemail	0.60	GA
Dec-16-13	Telephone call with client S. Warunkiw re OEB filing; review of emails; drafting letter; sending same to client for review; sending to OEB and applicant's counsel	2.30	GA
Mar-13-14	Telephone call with client re Interrogatories; review documents for same; review documents including PO1; correspondence from client re same; reply to same	0.80	GA
Mar-18-14	Drafting OEB submissions for S. Warunkiw; correspondence to same re approval	1.40	GA
Mar-19-14	Drafting OEB Interrogatories for S. Warunkiw; correspondence from same re same; review documents from client re issues and concerns; serving and filing Interrogatories on wpd, other parties and OEB	1.90	GA
Apr-03-14	Correspondence from Correspondence from I. Minott re Responses to Warunkiw Interrogatories; review of same; email exchange with client re response and evidence	0.40	GA

Apr-17-14	Correspondence to S. Warunkiw re evidence for OEB proceeding	0.20	GA
Apr-21-14	Correspondence from S. Warunkiw re OEB evidence filings; response to same with suggestions; correspondence from same re other opinions	0.50	GA
Apr-22-14	Correspondence from clients re evidence requirements and formatting queries	0.80	GA
Apr-23-14	Drafting letter to OEB re intention to file evidence for Warunkiw	0.20	GA
Apr-28-14	Correspondence from S. Warunkiw re evidence; reply to same	0.30	GA
May-20-14	Correspondence from client re discussion of evidence; reply to same	0.20	GA
May-23-14	Correspondence from S. Warunkiw re evidence; review of same	0.30	GA
May-26-14	Correspondence from S. Warunkiw re submissions; review and editing of same; submission to OEB; telephone call with client re same	0.90	GA
May-27-14	Correspondence from client re submissions	0.20	GA
Jul-25-14	Correspondence to S. Warunkiw re final submissions; discussion re same	0.80	GA
Mar-19-15	Correspondence from OEB incl. decision; review documents incl. decision; correspondence to client re same; response from same re same	0.20	GA
Mar-25-15	Preparation of cost submissions	0.80	GA