

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

			lr	nstructions		
- All claims m - A separate " Disbursemen However, onl - The cost cla - A CV for eac	ust be in Canadian dol 'Detail of Fees and Dis ts Being Claimed") is re ly one "Summary of Fe im must be supported th consultant/analyst of	llars. If applicable bursements Bei equired for each es and Disburse by a completed must be attache	ole, state ex Rate: ng Claimed ⁿ n lawyer, an ments" cov I Affidavit si d unless pro	mulas are embedded in the change rate and country of inchange rate and country of inchange rate and country of inchange rate and country of alyst/consultant and articling rate whole of the party gned by a representative of covided to the Board as prescriptive on Cost Awards, items	nitial currency. Country: f Fees Being Claim g student/paraleg 's cost claim shoul the party. ribed on the Cost	ned" and a "Statement of al. d be provided. Award Tariff.
File# EB-	2013-0339			Process: wpd White Pin	nes Inc. Applicat	ion for Leave to Constru
Party:	Gordon Gibbins	W 18.		Affiant's Name: G	raham Andrews	
HST Numbe	er: 826244220R7	Γ001	15.7	HST R	ate Ontario:	13.00%
		Registrant registered Other		Qualifyin	g Non-Profit Tax Exempt	
				Affidavit		
Ι,	Graha	m Andrews		, of the City/Town of _		Toronto
-	vince/State of	On	tario	,	swear or affirm	n that:
2. I have exa Being Claime 3. The attach Disbursemer Ontario Ener 4. This cost of described in	mined all of the docured", "Statement(s) of Formed "Summary of Fees and Being Claimed" include Sections 6.05 and 6.05	nentation in sup ees Being Claim and Disbursemo lude only costs i rred to above. any costs for we	port of this ed" and "Stants Being Concurred and pork done, or) and as such have knowledge cost claim, including the attatement(s) of Disbursement: Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fed time spent directly for the statement spent, by a person that ection on Cost Awards.	ached "Summary s Being Claimed". ees Being Claimed purposes of the Pa	of Fees and Disbursements " and "Statement(s) of arty's participation in the
	of Affiant					
	affirmed before m vince/State of		Town of ntario	, on	March-26- (date)	15 .
(0	o VVVV	fidavits				

Commissioner for taking Affidavits

Expires August 28, 2017.



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB-	2013-0339		Process:	wpd White Pines Inc. Application for Leave to Constru
Party:	Gordon Gibbins			
		Summary of Fees	and Disburse	ments Being Claimed
Legal/con:	sultant/other fees	\$	3,356.00	
Disbursen	nents	\$	-	
HST		\$	436.28	_
Total Cost	Claim	\$	3,792.28	-

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Eric K. Gillespie Professional Corporation, In Trust

Send payment to this address: Eric K. Gillespie Professional Corporation

10 King Street East, Suite 600

Toronto, Ontario

M5C 1C3



File # EB-	2013-0339		Process: wpa	d White Pines Inc. Application for Leave to	Consti
Party:	Gordon Gibbins		Service Provid	der Name: Graham Andrews	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience	
	Legal Counsel	(check one)	2012	2	
	Articling Student/Paralegal				
	Consultant			Hourly Rate: \$170	
	Analyst	🗀			
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV atta	ched	HST Rate Charged (enter %): 13.0%	
		CV prov	vided within previous 24	4 months	

St.	atement o	f Fe	es Being	Clai	med			1149.50	
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	S	Subtotal	HST		Total	
Pre-hearing Conference									
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$:=:	\$	
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	(#)	\$	8
Technical Conference									
Preparation	74 (776)	\$	170.00	\$	-	\$		\$	-
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Interrogatories									
Preparation	3.00	\$	170.00	\$	510.00	\$	66.30	\$	576.30
Responses	2.00	\$	170.00	\$	340.00	\$	44.20	\$	384.20
Issues Conference									
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	(/ 2 F	\$	92	\$	*
Attendance	The other	\$	170.00	\$	020	\$:: - :	\$	-
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation	7 11 11	\$	170.00	\$) 5	\$		\$	(-):
Attendance	. II V =	\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Proposal Preparation	b liberile	\$	170.00	\$	Æ	\$::+::	\$	
Argument									
Preparation	- 75	\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Oral Hearing									
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	=	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	#	\$	-	\$	-
Other Conferences									
Preparation	_	\$	170.00	\$		\$	-	\$	*
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	5.	\$	-
Case Management	8.60	\$	170.00	\$	1,462.00	\$	190.06	\$	1,652.06
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES			and the second	\$	2,312.00	\$	300.56	\$	2,612.56



File # EB-	2013-0339	Process:	wpd White Pir	nes Inc. Application for Leave to Constr
Partv:	Gordon Gibbins	Service Provi	ider Name:	Graham Andrews

	nent of Disbursements Being Claim Net Cost	HST	Total	
Scanning/Photocopy			\$	100
Printing			\$:
Courier		- 11. 11. 11.	\$	
Telephone/Fax			\$	
Transcripts			\$	
Travel: Air			\$	4
Travel: Car		100	\$	
Travel: Rail			\$	
Travel (Other):			\$	
Parking			\$	
Taxi			\$	
Accommodation			\$	
Meals	(A) 电影局 (A)		\$	
Other:			\$	
Other:		The Army	\$	
Other:		THE YEAR	\$	
	AND THE PROPERTY OF THE PROPER			
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	\$ -	\$	



File # EB-	2013-0339		Process: w	pd White Pines Inc. Application for Leave to Const
Party:	Gordon Gibbins		Service Prov	vider Name: Eric K. Gillespie
			Year Called to	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Bar	Experience
	Legal Counsel	$\overline{\checkmark}$	1996	19
	Articling Student/Paralegal			
	Consultant			Hourly Rate: \$290
	Analyst			
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV atta	ched vided within previous	HST Rate Charged (enter %): 13.0%

Sta	atement o	f Fe	es Being	Clair	ned	I G	1-16 54	with the second
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	Şı	ubtotal		HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference								
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$		\$	-	\$ -
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	7	\$ -
Technical Conference								
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	2	\$	里	\$ (#2)
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	*	\$ -
Interrogatories								
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Responses		\$	290.00	\$		\$	-	\$ -
Issues Conference								
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	2	\$	-	\$ [1980] [27]
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	- #	\$		\$ -
ADR - Settlement Conference								
Preparation	LUNEAU IV	\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	=	\$ -
Attendance	H -15'81	\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	*	\$ -
Proposal Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	9400	\$	-	\$ -
Argument								
Preparation	1.90	\$	290.00	\$	551.00	\$	71.63	\$ 622.63
Oral Hearing								
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	i#0.	\$ -
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$:#2	\$	-	\$ -
Other Conferences							· ·	
Preparation	- v /f	\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	*	\$ #
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	en isteración	\$ -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES	and the			\$	551.00	\$	71.63	\$ 622.63



File # EB-	2013-0339	Process:	wpd White Pir	nes Inc. Application for Leave to Constr
Partv:	Gordon Gibbins	Service Prov	ider Name:	Eric K. Gillespie

	Net Cost	HST	To	otal
Scanning/Photocopy			\$	
Printing	# W. W. W. W. E. L. W. W. E.	e energy special	\$,
Courier			\$	
Telephone/Fax			\$	
Transcripts			\$	
Travel: Air			\$	
Travel: Car			\$	
Travel: Rail	127 Z (185)		\$	
Travel (Other):			\$	
Parking			\$	
Тахі	27 T 18 18 18 18 18 18		\$	3
Accommodation	A B B B B B B B B B B B B B B B B B B B	E I I I E I I I	\$	
Meals		ارزارانك الماران	\$	
Other:			\$	
Other:			\$	
Other:			\$	
	网络加利亚亚洲 经市场的 经基础 医电影 医多种			APPRICATE OF
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	\$ -	\$	



File # EB-	2013-0339		Process: w	pd White Pines Inc. Application for Leave to Const
Party:	Gordon Gibbins		Service Prov	vider Name: David Hwang
			Year Called to	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Bar	Experience
	Legal Counsel	V	2013	1
	Articling Student/Paralegal			
	Consultant			Hourly Rate: \$170
	Analyst			· ·
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV atta	ached	HST Rate Charged (enter %): 13.0%
		CV pro	vided within previous	s 24 months

STEEL	atement o			_		SWEET.			
	Hours	Ho	urly Rate	S	ubtotal	tal HST			Total
Pre-hearing Conference									
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	28	\$	-
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	17:	\$	-
Technical Conference									
Preparation	ov nim l	\$	170.00	\$	72	\$	(2)	\$	-
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$:: * :	\$	-
Interrogatories									
Preparation	4:4	\$	170.00	\$	-	\$::=:	\$	-
Responses	Vita i i i	\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Issues Conference									
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	Ë	\$	7 =	\$	-
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	#	\$	(a)	\$	-
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$		\$	
Attendance	/	\$	170.00	\$	2	\$	4	\$	1980
Proposal Preparation	FILE BUILD	\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	#	\$	(* :
Argument									
Preparation	2.90	\$	170.00	\$	493.00	\$	64.09	\$	557.09
Oral Hearing									
Preparation	JI (1918)	\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	2	\$	-
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	¥	\$	*	\$	-
Other Conferences									
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$	*	\$	~
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Case Management	A4 6 A1 2	\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	F WOL THE STORY
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	493.00	\$	64.09	\$	557.09



File# EB-	2013-0339	Process: wpd W	hite Pines Inc. Application for Leave to Constr
Party:	Gordon Gibbins	Service Provider Nan	ne:

		\$ \$ \$ \$	# 9
		\$	
			4
		Ś	
		т	-
		\$	-
		\$	
		\$	-
		\$	-
		\$	-
		\$	-
		\$	1#3
	W STATE OF	\$	
	e de la comunicación de la comun		:•
medical for the Wi		\$	
		\$	-
			V PIESE
	\$	\$ - \$ -	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$

ERIC K. GILLESPIE PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION

Barristers & Solicitors Suite 600, 10 King Street East Toronto, ON M5C 1C3 Canada

Ph: (416) 703-5400

Fax: (416) 703-9111

Gord Gibbins 1078 Royal Road, Milford, ON Canada

File #:

00899

RE:

EB-2013-0339 – wpd White Pines Incorporated – Application for Leave to Construct

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	LAWYER
Oct-15-13	Telephone call with client G. Gibbins re options for White Pines OEB hearing	0.30	GA
Dec-06-13	Drafting letter re Intervenor request for APPEC; email from G. Gibbins re same	2.10	GA
Dec-13-13	Drafting final version of request letters for APPEC and G. Gibbins; submitting same to OEB	3.40	GA
Mar-18-14	Drafting OEB submissions for G. Gibbins; correspondence to same re draft of same	0.90	GA
Mar-19-14	Drafting OEB submissions for G. Gibbins; correspondence from client re same; review documents including charts and directions from client re issues; serving and filing Interrogatories on wpd, other parties and OEB	2.10	GA
Apr-03-14	Correspondence from I. Minott re OEB Responses to Gibbins Interrogatories; review of same; emailing same to client	0.40	GA
Apr-04-14	Correspondence from client re response to APPEC OEB Interrogatories; reply to same	0.80	GA
Apr-17-14	Correspondence from G. Gibbins re filing	0.80	GA

	evidence for OEB proceedings; reply to same		
Apr-23-14	Drafting letter to OEB re intention to file evidence for Gibbins; sending same via email to OEB	0.20	GA
May-09-14	Correspondence from G. Gibbins re letter re	0.20	GA
Jul-09-14	length of transmission line; replyt o same Telephone call with E. Gillespie re Gibbins letter; review documents incl. legislation and Regulations	1.30	GA
Jul-14-14	Prepare OEB filings.	1.30	DH
Jul-22-14	Discussions with G. Andrews re: transmission line issues etc.	0.20	EKG
Aug-11-14	Forward Final Draft of submissions to clients; Discussion re: same	1.60	DH
Aug-13-14	Re-drafting and reformatting final submissions from all clients.	1.20	EKG
Aug-19-14	Correspondence from client re decision timeline, etc; response to same re same	0.30	GA
Oct-06-14	Telephone call with G. Gibbins re: various issues and updates	0.30	EKG
Nov-05-14	Review of emails re: OEB correspondence etc.	0.20	EKG
Mar-19-15	Correspondence from OEB incl. decision; review documents incl. decision; correspondence to client re same	0.20	GA
Mar-25-15	Preparation of cost submissions	0.60	GA