April 30, 2015

via email and RESS - signed original to follow by mail

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street, 27th Floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Re: Hydro One Networks Inc Distribution Rates 2015-2019 (EB-2013-0416)
- SIA Cost Claims

Dear Ms. Walli,

In accordance with the Ontario Energy Board's ("OEB") Rate Order dated April 23, 2015, attached are the cost claims of the Sustainable Infrastructure Alliance of Ontario (the "SIA").

Please note that our mailing address has changed from that on record in this proceeding. Please direct all future correspondence, as well as payment of any approved cost claims, to the following address:

SIA of Ontario 55 Bloor Street West PO Box 19611 (Manulife) Toronto, ON M4W 3T9

We thank the OEB for the opportunity to participate in this proceeding.

Sincerely,

[original signed by]

Robert Sutton
Director, SIA of Ontario

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

			Instructions	
-		ed by yellow-shaded fields. Fo		e form to assist with calculations. of initial currency.
		Rate		Country:
Disbursemer However, on - The cost cla	nts Being Claimed" ly one "Summary o aim must be suppo) is required for each lawyer, a of Fees and Disbursements" co rted by a completed Affidavit	analyst/consultant and articl overing the whole of the par signed by a representative o	ty's cost claim should be provided.
Ex	cept as provided i	n section 7.03 of the Practice	Direction on Cost Awards,	itemized receipts must be provided.
File# EB-	2013-0416		Process: Hydro One 2	015-2019 CIR Application
Party:	SIA of Ontario		Affiant's Name:	Dionisio Rivera
HST Numbe	er: 82436 57	95 RT0001	HST	Rate Ontario: 13.00%
	F	ull Registrant Unregistered Other	Qualifyi	ing Non-Profit Tax Exempt
			Affidavit	
l,	Di	onisio Rivera	, of the City/Town of	Brockville
in the Prov	/ince/State of	Ontario		, swear or affirm that:
2. I have example and the second of the seco	mined all of the do ed", "Statement(s) ned "Summary of F nts Being Claimed" rgy Board process r laim does not inclu	cumentation in support of th of Fees Being Claimed" and "S ees and Disbursements Being include only costs incurred ar referred to above.	is cost claim, including the a statement(s) of Disbursemer Claimed", "Statement(s) of and time spent directly for the or time spent, by a person th	dge of the matters attested to herein. ttached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements its Being Claimed". Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of e purposes of the Party's participation in the nat is an employee or officer of the Party as
Signature	of Affiant			
		me at the City/Town of	Ott	tawa ,
	/ince/State of	Ontario	, on	April 27, 2015 .
				(date)

Commissioner for taking Affidavits

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2013-0416		Process:	Hydro One 2015-2019 CIR Application	
Party:	SIA of Ontario			
	S	ummary of Fees	and Disburse	ments Being Claimed
Legal/cons	sultant/other fees	\$	35,307.50	
Disbursem	nents	\$	-	
HST		\$	4,589.98	
Total Cost	Claim	\$	39,897.48	•

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: SIA Ontario

Send payment to this address: 55 Bloor Street West

PO Box 19611 (Manulife) Toronto, ON M4W 3T9

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2013-01416		Process:	Hydro One 2015-2019 CIF	R Rate Application
Party:	SIA of Ontario		Name:	Dionisio Rivera	
				Completed Years Practising/Years of relevant experience	
Counse	I/Articling Student/Paralegal:			14	
	Consultant:	✓			
	CV attached:		CV r	oot required:	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed								
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total			
Preparation	59.25	\$290.00	\$17,182.50	\$2,233.73	\$19,416.23			
Attendance - Technical Conference	18.50	\$290.00	\$5,365.00	\$697.45	\$6,062.45			
Attendance - Settlement Conference	0.00	\$290.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00			
Attendance - Oral Hearing	18.75	\$290.00	\$5,437.50	\$706.88	\$6,144.38			
Argument	25.25	\$290.00	\$7,322.50	\$951.93	\$8,274.43			
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00			
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES			\$35,307.50	\$4,589.98	\$39,897.48			

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

Dionisio Rivera Consulting 303-1350 Kensington Pkwy Brockville, ON K6V 6B9 Tel: 416-770-4937 dionisio.rivera@live.com

File: EB-2012-0416 (Hydro One Networks Inc - Distribution Rates 2015-2019)

			Technical				
Date	Description	Preparation	Conference	ADR	Hearing*	Argument	Total
22-Mar-14	Preliminary Review of Prefiled Evidence	3.25					3.25
27-Mar-14	Preliminary Review of Prefiled Evidence	2.25					2.25
08-Apr-15	Review Evidence in Prep for Tech Conference	0.5					0.5
10-Apr-14	Attend Tech Conference #1 (from late morning)		3.25				3.25
12-Apr-14	Review Technical Conference #1 Transcript		0.75				0.75
24-Apr-14	Review Tech Conf. Issues Emails	0.25					0.25
25-Apr-14	Review Technical Conference #2 Transcript		2				2
29-Apr-14	Reviewed Tech Conf. Issues - Emails	0.75					0.75
30-Apr-14	Attend Tech Conference #3 (remotely)		2.5				2.5
03-May-14	Review Technical Conference #3 Transcript		1.25				1.25
08-May-14	Review Draft Issues List (HONI Revisions)	0.25					0.25
14-May-14	Review Issues List Conference Transcript				1.75		1.75
20-May-14	Review PO #3 & Issues List	0.5					0.5
21-May-14	Review Prefiled Evidence	2.25					2.25
22-May-14	Review Prefiled Evidence; Begin Drafting IRs	3.25					3.25
24-May-14	Review several OEB Guidelines; Continue IR Prep	3.25					3.25
02-Jun-14	Review Emails concerning HONI Update	0.5					0.5
03-Jun-14	Emails to HONI re evidence	0.25					0.25
04-Jun-14	Review HONI Updated Evidence	1.75					1.75
05-Jun-14	Continue Drafting IRs	2.5					2.5
07-Jun-14	Review RRFE Requirements; Continue IRs	1.5					1.5
09-Jun-14	Review Evidence; Continue IRs	2.75					2.75
10-Jun-14	Continue Drafting IRs	3.5					3.5
11-Jun-14	Review OEB Staff IRs; Continue Drafting IRs	2.25					2.25
12-Jun-14	Finalize IRs; format and prepare for filing	1.25					1.25
13-Jun-14	Briefly Review Filed IRs	0.75					0.75

Dionisio Rivera Consulting 303-1350 Kensington Pkwy Brockville, ON K6V 6B9 Tel: 416-770-4937 dionisio.rivera@live.com

15-Jun-14 Responding Emails to HONI	0.25			0.25
07-Jul-14 Review IR responses	2.25			2.25
08-Jul-14 Review IR responses	2.75			2.75
09-Jul-14 Review IR responses; note potential TC issues	2			2
11-Jul-14 Briefly review GEC Evidence	1.25			1.25
14-Jul-14 Review and prepare TC notes	1.5			1.5
16-Jul-14 Finalize TC Questions	0.75			0.75
17-Jul-14 File TC Questions	0.25			0.25
18-Jul-14 Briefly Review TC questions of other parties	1.25			1.25
20-Jul-14 Identify Issues of concern	1.25			1.25
21-Jul-14 Attend Technical Conference (morning only)		3.75		3.75
22-Jul-14 Attend Technical Conference (remote/webcast)		3.25		3.25
23-Jul-14 Review Technical Conference Transcripts; Notes		1.75		1.75
24-Jul-14 Review PO#4 and emails	0.25			0.25
25-Jul-14 Review correspondance; Undertaking Responses	1			1
29-Jul-14 Emails; Settlement Conference Conclusions	0.25			0.25
01-Aug-14 Motion, emails, revised IR responses	1			1
09-Aug-14 Review Motion Response	0.25			0.25
13-Aug-14 Review SEC Motion Reply	0.25			0.25
03-Sep-14 Review HONI Updated IR Responses	0.5			0.5
04-Sep-14 Review Panel List. Emails.	0.25			0.25
05-Sep-14 Identify issues of concern for oral hearing	0.5			0.5
08-Sep-14 Hearing Day #1 (remote/webcast)			4	4
09-Sep-14 Emails, Procedure	0.25			0.25
09-Sep-14 Review Hearing Transcript #1			1	1
10-Sep-14 Read Hearing Transcript #2			2	2
12-Sep-14 Read Hearing Transcript #3 +Undertaking Resp.			2.25	2.25
15-Sep-14 Read Hearing Transcript #4 +Undertaking Resp.			2	2
17-Sep-14 Read Hearing Transcript #6 +Undertaking Resp.			2	2
20-Sep-14 Read Hearing Transcript #5			2.25	2.25
20-Sep-14 Read Hearing Transcript #7 +Undertaking Resp.			1.5	1.5
26-Sep-14 Emails, Procedure Issues	0.5			0.5

Dionisio Rivera Consulting 303-1350 Kensington Pkwy Brockville, ON K6V 6B9 Tel: 416-770-4937 dionisio.rivera@live.com

04-Oct-14	Review record materials, Form Reply Outline	3		_	_		3
04-Oct-14	Read Argument in Chief, Begin Drafting Reply					2.75	2.75
05-Oct-14	Draft Final Argument					3	3
07-Oct-14	Draft Final Argument					3.75	3.75
09-Oct-14	Review Board Staff Argument; Draft Argument					3.75	3.75
10-Oct-14	Draft Final Argument, Review UT Responses					1.75	1.75
11-Oct-14	Draft Final Argument					3	3
12-Oct-14	Draft Final Argument					1.5	1.5
14-Oct-14	Draft Final Argument					1.5	1.5
15-Oct-14	Finalize and file Final Argument					3.25	3.25
29-Oct-14	Briefly review Reply Argument					1	1
12-Mar-15	Review Decision	1.25					1.25
25-Mar-15	Review HONI Draft Rate Order	1					1
02-Apr-15	Review Communications Motions	0.5					0.5
07-Apr-15	Review DRO Comments; HONI Motion-Reply	0.75					0.75
11-Apr-15	Briefly Review Final Revised Draft Rate Order	0.25					0.25
17-Apr-15	Briefly Review Draft Rate Order Decision	0.25					0.25
20-Apr-15	Briefly Review Final Rate Order	0.25			_	_	0.25
	TOTAL	59.25	18.5	0	18.75	25.25	121.75

^{*}includes time spent reviewing transcripts in lieu of in-person hearing attendance.

Total Cost (at \$290/hour)	\$ 35,307.50
HST	\$ 4,589.98
TOTAL	\$ 39,897.48