PETER C.P. THOMPSON, Q.C. T 613 787 3528 pthompson@blg.com

Borden Ladner Gervais LLP World Exchange Plaza 100 Queen St. Suite 1300 Ottawa, ON, Canada K1P 1J9 T 613.237.5160 F 613.230.8842 blg.com



Our File # 339583-000187

By electronic filing

May 7, 2015

Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street, 27th floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli

Re:

Union Gas Limited ("Union") - Dawn Parkway 2016 Expansion Project

Board File #:

EB-2014-0261

Pursuant to the Board's Decision and Order dated April 30, 2015, we enclose a Cost Claim on behalf of our client, Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters ("CME").

A copy of this Cost Claim has been forwarded to Union as instructed in the Decision and Order.

This Cost Claim covers the value of services which this firm provided for CME in this proceeding in the amount of \$24,633.44, inclusive of fees, disbursements and HST. It also includes the value of services in the amount of \$14,700.00 provided by John Rosenkranz in assisting the representatives of CME, The Federation of Rental-housing Providers of Ontario ("FRPO"), and the Ontario Greenhouse Vegetable Growers ("OGVG").

Please note that we have created the following new categories:

- "Preparation" to identify time spent on activities falling outside the definition of the Board's set categories
- "Evidence Preparation"
- "Post-Decision Activities" to identify time spent on the matter beyond the release of the Board's Decision

Please contact us if you have any questions or require any additional information.

Yours very truly

Borden Ladner Gervais LLP

Peter C.P. Thompson, Q.C.

enclosure

c. Karen Hockin (Union)

Crawford Smith (Torys LLP)

Dwayne Quinn (for FRPO and OGVG)

John Rosenkranz

Paul Clipsham (CME)

OTT01: 6980765: v1



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

				Instruction	S			
- Required dat	a input is inc	licated by yellow-shaded fie	lds. Formulas	are embedde	d in the form	to assist with calculation	ons.	
- All claims mu	ıst be in Can	adian dollars. If applicable,	state exchang	ge rate and co	untry of initia	al currency.		
			Rate:	•	_	Country:		
Being Claimed Disbursement - The cost clain - A CV for each	") is required s" covering t m must be su n consultant,	s and Disbursements Being (d for each lawyer, analyst/co he whole of the party's cost apported by a completed Aff analyst must be attached un wided in section 7.03 of t	onsultant and claim should fidavit signed nless provided	articling stude be provided. by a represen d to the Board	ent/paralegal tative of the as prescribe	. However, only one " party. d on the Cost Award Ta	Summary of Fo	ees and
File # EB-	2014-026	51	Process:	Union Gas	Limited -	Dawn Parkway 20	16 Expansio	on Project
Party:	Canadiar	Manufacturers & Exp	orters	Aff	iant's Nam	ne: Peter C.P. Thon	npson, QC	
HST Numbe	er: <u>108</u>	307 5482 RT0001		_	Н	ST Rate Ontario: _	13.00%	
		Full Registrant			Qual	lifying Non-Profit		
8		Unregistered				Tax Exempt		
		Other	\checkmark					
				Affidavit				
1,	Peter C.	P. Thompson, QC		, of the C	ity of	Ottawa		
in the Prov			ntario		•	, swear or affin	rm that:	
2. I have exam Claimed", "Sta 3. The attache	nined all of the stement(s) of d "Summary " include on	the above-noted party (the ne documentation in suppor Fees Being Claimed" and "S of Fees and Disbursements y costs incurred and time sp	t of this cost c Statement(s) c Being Claime	claim, includin of Disburseme d", "Statemer	g the attache nts Being Cla it(s) of Fees B	d "Summary of Fees an imed". Jeing Claimed" and "Sta	nd Disburseme Itement(s) of [Disbursements
	and 6.09 of t	include any costs for work of the Board's Practice Direction World American			erson that is a	in employee or officer (of the Party as	described in
Sworn or s	affirmed	efore me at the City	of	Ottawa				
in the Prov		Ontario		- Ctava	, on	May 7, 2015		
III CITC FTOV		Officiallo			_,	(date)	•	
Commission	theur	Ady eking Affidavits			-			



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2014-0261 Process: Union Gas Limited - Dawn Parkway 2016 Expansion Project

Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed					
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$36,402.00				
Disbursements	\$97.50				
HST	\$2,833.94				
Total Cost Claim	\$39,333.44				

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Borden Ladner Gervais LLP

Send payment to this address: Borden Ladner Gervais LLP

Attention: Peter C.P. Thompson, QC

World Exchange Plaza

100 Queen Street, Suite 1300

Ottawa, ON K1P 1J9



File # EB-	2014-0261	Process:	Union Gas Limited - Da	wn Parkway 2016 Expansi	on Project
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & Ex	(porters	Service Provider Name:	Peter C.P. Thompson, QC	
	Service Provider Type	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	* *	s Practising/Years t experience
	Legal Counsel	[]	1967	4	5+
	Articling Student/Paralegal				
	Consultant			Hourly Rate:	\$330.00
	Analyst			_	
	For Consultant/Analyst:		CV attached	HST Rate Charged (enter %)	13%
			CV provided within previous	; 24 months	

	St	atement o	f Fees Beir	ng Claimed		
		Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total
Preparation:		0.20	\$330.00	\$66.00	\$8.58	\$74.58
Interrogatories:	Preparation	3.20	\$330.00	\$1,056.00	\$137.28	\$1,193.28
The tropactories.	Responses	0.90	\$330.00	\$297.00	\$38.61	\$335.61
Issues Conference:	Preparation	1.00	\$330.00	\$330.00	\$42.90	\$372.90
	Attendance		\$330.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
ADR - Settlement Confe	rence:					
	Preparation	4.10	\$330.00	\$1,353.00	\$175.89	\$1,528.89
	Attendance		\$330.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Proj	posal Preparation		\$330.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Oral Hearing:	Preparation	0.30	\$330.00	\$99.00	\$12.87	\$111.87
	Attendance		\$330.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Post-Decision Activities		0.50	\$330.00	\$165.00	\$21.45	\$186.45
TOTAL SERVICE PROVID			The state of the s	\$3,366.00	\$437.58	\$3,803.58



File #:	EB-2014-0261						
Process:	Union Gas Limited – Dawn Parkway 2016 Expansion Project						
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters						
Name:	Peter Thompson						
Oct 10-14	Preparation of intervention and cost eligibility request	0.2	Preparation				
Nov 28-14	Reviewing prefiled evidence and Interrogatories of Board Staff and VECC; drafting and finalizing CME Interrogatories; reviewing Interrogatories submitted by BOMA, SEC, TCPL and GAPLO	3.2	Interrogatories Prep				
Jan 19-15	Reviewing letter from the Board; email to J. Rosenkranz	0.1	Interrogatory Responses				
Jan 19-15	Reviewing Interrogatories from Board staff and Union; emails to J. Rosenkranz	0.3	Interrogatory Responses				
Jan 21-15	Reviewing Union letter to the Board re: Issues List; email to J. Rosenkranz	0.2	Issues Conf. Prep				
Jan 21-15	Email to J. Rosenkranz; considering his proposed revisions to Union's Issues List	0.2	Issues Conf. Prep				
Jan 22-15	Considering and composing letter to the Board	0.2	Issues Conf. Prep				
Jan 22-15	Email to J. Rosenkranz and V. DeRose	0.1	Interrogatory Responses				
Jan 28-15	Considering email from J. Rosenkranz	0.2	Interrogatory Responses				
Jan 30-15	Considering Procedural Order No. 2; email to J. Rosenkranz	0.1	Interrogatory Responses				
Jan 30-15	Considering email from J. Rosenkranz	0.1	Interrogatory Responses				
Feb 4-15	Reviewing GAPLO submissions re: Issues List	0.2	Issues Conf. Prep				
Feb 4-15	Letter to the Board re: Issues List.	0.1	Issues Conf. Prep				
Feb 5-15	Considering email from J. Rosenkranz, pre-filed evidence and composing follow-up email to J. Rosenkranz	1.3	Settlement Conf. Prep				
Feb 6-15	Reviewing Interrogatory Responses; considering possible conditions for approval and follow-up meeting with V. DeRose	1.8	Settlement Conf. Prep				
Feb 6-15	Considering and responding to emails from D. Quinn and J. Rosenkranz	0.2	Settlement Conf. Prep				
Feb 6-15	Considering Board Decision on Issues List	0.1	Issues Conf. Prep				
Feb 6-15	Reviewing Union letter to the Board re: APPrO Interrogatory	0.2	Settlement Conf. Prep				
Feb 8-15	Considering emails from J. Rosenkranz and D. Quinn	0.2	Settlement Conf. Prep				
Feb 9-15	Considering and composing email to J. Rosenkranz	0.2	Settlement Conf. Prep				
Feb 10-15	Conference with V. DeRose	0.2	Settlement Conf. Prep				
Mar 3-15	Reviewing Board Staff Submissions re: settlement	0.3	Oral Hearing Prep				



Apr 30-15

Reviewing Board Decision and Order; instructing assistant on preparation of Cost Claim

0.5

Post-Decision Activities

Total Hours for Peter Thompson:

10.2

	<u>Hours</u>		<u>Fees</u>
Preparation	0.2	x \$330.00/hr =	66.00
Interrogatories Prep	3.2	x \$330.00/hr =	1,056.00
Interrogatory Responses	0.9	x \$330.00/hr =	297.00
Issues Conf. Prep	1.0	x \$330.00/hr =	330.00
Settlement Conf. Prep	4.1	x \$330.00/hr =	1,353.00
Oral Hearing Prep	0.3	x \$330.00/hr =	99.00
Post-Decision Activities	0.5	x \$330.00/hr =	165.00
-	10.2	Total Fees for Peter Thompson:	\$3,366.00

OTT01: 6584008: v1



File # EB-	Process: Union Gas Limited - Dawn Parkway 2016 Expansion Project					
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters	Manufacturers & Exporters Service Provider Name: Peter C.P. Thompson, QC				
Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed						
		Net Cost	HST	Total		
Scanning/F	Photocopying: 190 copies @ \$0.25 each	\$47.50	\$6.18	\$53.68		
LPIC Levy S	Surcharge (as in previous cost claims)	\$50.00	\$6.50	\$0.00		
Other:			\$0.00	\$0.00		
TOTAL DIS	BURSEMENTS:	\$97.50	\$12.68	\$53.68		



File # EB-	2014-0261	Process	Union Gas Limited - Da	wn Parkway 2016 Expans	ion Project	
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & Ex	porters	_ Service Provider Name:			
	Service Provider Type	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	•	rs Practising/Years t experience	
	Legal Counsel		2001		14	
	Articling Student/Paralegal					
	Consultant			Hourly Rate:	\$290.00	
	Analyst			_		
	For Consultant/Analyst:		CV attached	HST Rate Charged (enter %)	13%	
			CV provided within previous	s 24 months		

Statement of Fees Being Claimed							
		Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total	
Preparation:		2.50	\$290.00	\$725.00	\$94.25	\$819.25	
Interrogatories:	Preparation	8.90	\$290.00	\$2,581.00	\$335.53	\$2,916.53	
	Responses	2.90	\$290.00	\$841.00	\$109.33	\$950.33	
Evidence Preparation		5.60	\$290.00	\$1,624.00	\$211.12	\$1,835.12	
Issues Conf.erence							
	Preparation	0.50	\$290.00	\$145.00	\$18.85	\$163.85	
ADR - Settlement Confere	nce:						
	Preparation	12.80	\$290.00	\$3,712.00	\$482.56	\$4,194.56	
	Attendance	23.80	\$290.00	\$6,902.00	\$897.26	\$7,799.26	
Propos	sal Preparation	3.90	\$290.00	\$1,131.00	\$147.03	\$1,278.03	
Oral Hearing:	Preparation	0.90	\$290.00	\$261.00	\$33.93	\$294.93	
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER	FEES			\$17,922.00	\$2,329.86	\$20,251.86	



File #:	File #: EB-2014-0261					
Process:	Union Gas Limited – Dawn Parkway 2016 Expansion Project					
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters		A CONTRACTOR OF THE PROPERTY O			
Name:	Vince DeRose					
Nov 26-14	Reviewing Application and evidence	2.5	Preparation			
Dec 22-14	Reviewing Interrogatory Responses; prepare for and attend call with D. Quinn and J. Rosenkranz	5.4	Interrogatory Prep			
Dec 23/14	Reviewing evidence and Interrogatory Responses	3.5	Interrogatory Prep			
Jan 7-15	Reviewing J. Rosenkranz evidence	1.4	Evidence Preparation			
Jan 8-15	Reviewing J. Rosenkranz evidence; prepare for and attend teleconference with D. Quinn and J. Rosenkranz	2.3	Evidence Preparation			
Jan 8-15	Reviewing revised evidence	0.8	Evidence Preparation			
Jan 9-15	Finalize and file evidence of J. Rosenkranz	1.1	Evidence Preparation			
Jan 19-15	Reviewing Interrogatories for Rosenkranz	0.5	Interrogatory Responses			
Jan 23-15	Attendance at teleconference with J. Rosenkranz.	1.1	Interrogatory Responses			
Jan 28-15	Reviewing Interrogatory Responses and filing	1.3	Interrogatory Responses			
Feb 4-15	Reviewing correspondence re: draft Issues List	0.5	Issues Conf. Prep			
Feb 5-15	Reviewing evidence and input from J. Rosenkranz	3.4	Settlement Conf. Prep			
Feb 6-15	Prepare for Settlement Conference	1.0	Settlement Conf. Prep			
Feb 8-15	Prepare for Settlement Conference	3.1	Settlement Conf. Prep			
Feb 9-15	Prepare for and attend Settlement Conference	6.3	Settlement Conf. Attend			
Feb 10-15	Reviewing revised evidence and considering conditions	2.2	Settlement Conf. Prep			
Feb 11-15	Prepare for and attend teleconference; emails to and from J. Rosenkranz; reviewing Board evidence; telephone call to Intervenors	3.1	Settlement Conf. Prep.			
Feb 12-15	Emails to Union; attendance at teleconference with Intervenors and Union; emails with expert	3.4	Settlement Conf. Attend			
Feb 13-15	Emails and calls to and from Intervenors	1.2	Settlement Conf. Attend			
Feb 17-15	Emails and telephone calls with Intervenors re: settlement; attendance at settlement call with Union	3.2	Settlement Conf. Attend			
Feb 18-15	Prepare for and attend Intervenor teleconference	0.9	Settlement Conf. Attend			
Feb 18-15	Prepare for and attend teleconference with Intervenors	2.8	Settlement Conf. Attend			
Feb 19-15	Emails to and from Intervenors; prepare for and attend Intervenor call; telephone call from M. Kitchen	3.8	Settlement Conf. Attend			
Feb 20-15	Emails to and from Intervenors re: AFUDC proposal and settlement; telephone call with Union	2.2	Settlement Conf. Attend			



Feb 24-15	Drafting email re: draft settlement	0.3	Settlement Proposal Prep
Feb 25-15	Reviewing draft settlement	1.1	Settlement Proposal Prep
Feb 26-15	Reviewing draft settlement and emails to Intervenors.	1.6	Settlement Proposal Prep
Feb 27-15	Reviewing final draft settlement and approval	0.9	Settlement Proposal Prep
Mar 3-15	Reviewing Board Staff submission	0.4	Oral Hearing Prep
Mar 5-15	Reviewing revised settlement and respond	0.5	Oral Hearing Prep
			MATERIAL STATE OF THE STATE OF

Total Hours for Vince DeRose: 61.8

	<u>Hours</u>		<u>Fees</u>
Preparation	2.5	x \$290.00/hr =	725.00
Interrogatories Prep	8.9	x \$290.00/hr =	2,581.00
Interrogatory Responses	2.9	x \$290.00/hr =	841.00
Evidence Preparation	5.6	x \$290.00/hr =	1,624.00
Issues Conf. Prep	0.5	x \$290.00/hr =	145.00
Settlement Conf. Prep	12.8	x \$290.00/hr =	3,712.00
Settlement Conf. Attend	23.8	x \$290.00/hr =	6,902.00
Settlement Proposal Prep	3.9	x \$290.00/hr =	1,131.00
Oral Hearing Prep	0.9	x \$290.00/hr =	261.00
•	61.8	Total Fees for Vince DeRose:	\$17,922.00



File # EB-	2014-0261	Process	Union Gas Limited - Da	wn Parkway 2016 Expansi	on Project		
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & Ex	porters	Service Provider Name: Emma Blanchard				
	Service Provider Type	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	•	s Practising/Years t experience		
	Legal Counsel	V	2007		8		
	Articling Student/Paralegal		Language Control of the Control of t	Contraction in the Contraction i			
	Consultant			Hourly Rate:	\$230.00		
	Analyst			_			
	For Consultant/Analyst:		CV attached	HST Rate Charged (enter %)	13%		
	·		CV provided within previous	24 months			

Statement of Fees Being Claimed					
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total
Oral Hearing					
Preparation	,	\$230.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Attendance	1.80	\$230.00	\$414.00	\$53.82	\$467.82
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES			\$414.00	\$53.82	\$467.82



File #:	EB-2014-0261					
Process:	Union Gas Limited – Dawn Parkway 2016 Expansion Project					
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters					
Name:	Emma Blanchard					
Mar 5-15	Review Board Staff submissions re: Settlement Agreement; attend hearing by teleconference for the purpose of confirming CME support of Settlement Agreement			1.8	Oral Hearing Attend	
			Total Hours for Emma Blanchard:	1.8	_	
		<u>Hours</u>			<u>Fees</u>	
Oral Hearing Attend		1.8	x \$230.00/hr =		\$414.00	
		1.8	Total Fees for Emma Blanchard:		\$ 414.00	



File # EB-	2014-0261	Process: Union Gas Limited - Dawn Parkway 2016 Expansion Project					
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & Ex	oporters	Service Provider Name:	John Rosenkranz			
	Service Provider Type	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	•	irs Practising/Years nt experience		
	Legal Counsel		n/a		30+		
	Articling Student/Paralegal		8				
	Consultant	V		Hourly Rate:	\$300.00		
	Analyst						
	For Consultant/Analyst:	V	CV attached	HST Rate Charged (enter %)	n/a		
			CV provided within previous	s 24 months			

Statement of Fees Being Claimed					
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total
Interrogatories					
Preparation	6.00	\$300.00	\$1,800.00	\$0.00	\$1,800.00
Responses	7.50	\$300.00	\$2,250.00	\$0.00	\$2,250.00
Evidence Preparatrion	35.00	\$300.00	\$10,500.00	\$0.00	\$10,500.00
Issues Conference					
Preparation	0.50	\$300.00	\$150.00	\$0.00	\$150.00
Attendance					
Proposal Preparation					
<u> </u>					
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES			\$14,700.00	\$0.00	\$14,700.00

INVOICE 5/1/2015

John A. Rosenkranz 56 Washington Drive Acton, MA 01720

\$14,700.00

Borden Ladner Gervais LLP 100 Queen Street, Suite 1100 Ottawa, ON K1P 1J9

Total Project Cost (Canadian Dollars)

Project: Union Gas 2016 Dawn-Parkway Expansion (EB-2014-0261)

Date	Hours	
25-Nov-14	3.0	Interrogatories to Union Gas
26-Nov-14	3.0	Interrogatories to Union Gas
22-Dec-14	1.5	Review Union responses to IRs
29-Dec-14	7.0	Prepare Evidence
30-Dec-14	5.0	Prepare Evidence
31-Dec-14	4.0	Prepare Evidence
5-Jan-15	6.0	Prepare Evidence
6-Jan-15	3.0	Prepare Evidence
7-Jan-15	4.0	Prepare Evidence
8-Jan-15	4.0	Prepare Evidence
9-Jan-15	2.0	Prepare Evidence
22-Jan-15	0.5	Comments on Issues List
23-Jan-15	2.5	Respond to IRs from Staff and Union
26-Jan-15	0.5	Respond to IRs from Staff and Union
27-Jan-15	2.0	Respond to IRs from Staff and Union
28-Jan-15	1.0	Respond to IRs from Staff and Union
Consulting Fee Travel Expenses	49.0	Hourly Rate \$300.00 \$14,700.00 \$0.00

John A. Rosenkranz

Mr. Rosenkranz is an energy consultant with experience in natural gas supply planning, pipeline and storage development, and utility regulation. Clients include developers and operators of electric generation facilities, energy regulators and other public agencies, and natural gas consumers.

Mr. Rosenkranz began his career as a market analyst and supply planning consultant to natural gas pipeline and distribution companies. As a project manager with J. Makowski Company, Mr. Rosenkranz directed gas market studies and participated in the development, marketing, and financing of gas pipeline and storage projects. At PG&E Gas Transmission he evaluated midstream investment opportunities, managed a geologic test program at a potential natural gas storage site, and represented the company on the management committees of two interstate pipeline partnerships.

Mr. Rosenkranz has developed and implemented gas supply and transportation strategies for electric generating plants in the U.S. and Canada. These assignments include negotiating gas supply and pipeline service agreements, restructuring existing fuel arrangements, and supporting litigation and arbitration related to long term contracts.

Mr. Rosenkranz has participated in pipeline rate cases and other regulatory proceedings. He has submitted testimony at the Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, and appeared as an expert witness before the Ontario Energy Board and state utility commissions. Mr. Rosenkranz received a BA in economics at George Washington University and completed all course and examination requirements for a doctorate in economics at Northwestern University.