

#### THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS

Chair, GAIL REGAN President, Cara Holdings Ltd.

President, PATRICIA ADAMS MAX ALLEN Producer, IDEAS, CBC Radio ANDREW COYNE Columnist, National Post GLENN FOX Professor of Economics, University of Guelph IAN GRAY President, St. Lawrence Starch Co. CLIFFORD ORWIN

Secretary/Treasurer, ANNETTA TURNER ANDREW ROMAN Barrister & Solicitor, Miller Thor ANDREW STARK Rotman School of Management, University of Toronto GEORGE TOMKO Resident Expert, PSI Initiative, University of Toronto MICHAEL TREBILCOCK Chair, Law & Economics, University of Toronto MARGARET WENTE Professor of Political Science, University of Toronto Columnist, The Globe and Mail

May 8, 2015

BY EMAIL & BY COURIER

Ms. Kirsten Walli **Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board** 2300 Yonge St, Suite 2701 Toronto ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli:

**Board File No. EB-2014-0289 Consultation – Natural Gas Market Review Energy Probe – Costs Submission** 

Pursuant to the Notice of Hearing for Cost Awards, dated April 23, 2015, the Costs Submission of Energy Probe Research Foundation (Energy Probe) in the EB-2014-0289 consultation was filed on April 30, 2015 for the Board's consideration.

Unfortunately, Energy Probe filed using the original Statement of Fees Being Claimed form that had been supplied by the Board which generated an incorrect Statement of Fees Being Claimed. Attached please find a corrected Costs Submission for the Board's consideration.

Should you have any questions or require additional information, please contact me.

Yours truly,

David S. MacIntosh

Case Manager

Batul Rahimtoola, Ontario Energy Board (By email) cc:

Shelly-Anne Connell, Ontario Energy Board (By email)

Roger Higgin, Consultant to Energy Probe (By email)

Parties of Interest (By email)

Energy Probe Research Foundation 225 BRUNSWICK AVE., TORONTO, ONTARIO M5S 2M6

Phone: (416) 964-9223 Fax: (416) 964-8239 E-mail: EnergyProbe@nextcity.com Internet: www.EnergyProbe.org

### **Ontario Energy Board** COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



### Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party (defined in the Practice Direction on Cost Awards as including a participant in a consultation process) in a consultation before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board Notice of Hearing for Cost Awards. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

## **Instructions**

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are present in the document to assist with the calculation of the cost claim.
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.

- A separate "Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed" is required for each consultant or lawyer/articling student/paralegal. However only one "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.
- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.
- A CV for each consultant must be attached unless, for a given consultant, a CV has been provided to the Board in another

File # EB-	ile # EB- 2014-0289		Process: 2014 Natural Gas Market Review			
Party:	Energy Pr	obe Research Found	ation	Affiant's Name: Annetta Turner		ner
HST Numbe	er: <u>10</u>	730 5146 RT0001		HST I	Rate Ontario:_	6.5%
		Full Registrant Unregistered Other		Qualifyin	g Non-Profit Tax Exempt	
	المعالا العا			Affidavit		
	-	===			, swear or affil	
1. I am a rep 2. I have exa Disbursemer 3. The attach Disbursemer the Ontario 4. This cost of	resentative mined all of its Being Cla ied "Summa its Being Cla Energy Boar laim does n	e of  of the above-noted par the documentation in s imed", "Statement of F iry of Fees and Disburse imed" include only cos d process referred to al ot include any costs for	ty (the "Party support of th ees Being Cla ments Being as incurred an bove. work done,	_	lge of the matter tached "Summar Disbursements B s Being Claimed" purposes of the	rm that: s attested to herein. y of Fees and eing Claimed". and "Statement(s) of Party's participation ir
2. I have exa Disbursemer 3. The attach Disbursemer the Ontario 4. This cost of	resentative mined all of its Being Cla ied "Summa its Being Cla Energy Boar laim does n in sections	e of  of the above-noted par the documentation in s imed", "Statement of F iry of Fees and Disburse imed" include only cos d process referred to al ot include any costs for 6.05 and 6.09 of the Bo	ty (the "Party support of th ees Being Cla ments Being as incurred an bove. work done,	Ontario  y") and as such have knowled is cost claim, including the at aimed" and "Statement(s) of Claimed", "Statement of Fee and time spent directly for the or time spent, by a person the	lge of the matter tached "Summar Disbursements B s Being Claimed" purposes of the	rm that: s attested to herein. y of Fees and eing Claimed". and "Statement(s) of Party's participation ir

# Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

File # EB- 2014-0289 Process: 2014 Natural Gas Market Review

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundation

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed					
Legal/consultant fees	\$11,240.00				
Disbursements	\$40.00				
HST	\$733.20				
Total Cost Claim	\$12,013.20				

### **Payment Information**

Make cheque payable to: **Energy Probe Research Foundation** 

Send payment to this address: Energy Probe Research Foundation

225 Brunswick Avenue

Toronto, Ontario, Canada M5S 2M6

**Attention: David MacIntosh** 

### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

#### **Statement of Fees Being Claimed**

Statement of Fees being claimed for Eligible Activity is found on the third tab of this workbook.

### Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed

Statement of Disbursements being claimed is found on the fourth tab of this workbook.

# Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

	individe	iai whose	Costs are Being C	laimed
Name: Counse	Roger Higgin el/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached:		Year Called to Bar  CV not required:	Completed Years Practicing/Years of Relevant Experience 30+
Name: Counse	David MacIntosh  Pl/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant:		Year Called to Bar	Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience
	CV attached:		CV not required:	
Name: Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached:		Year Called to Bar  CV not required:	Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience
Name: Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached:		Year Called to Bar  CV not required:	Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience
Name: Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached:		Year Called to Bar  CV not required:	Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience

# Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Statement of Fees Being Claimed

File # EB- 2014-0289

Process 2014 Natural Gas Market Review

Party Energy Probe Research Foundation

HST Rate: 7%

Preparation of a Separate Expert Submission for the Stakeholder Conference	Up to 40 hours + 20 hours per additional eligible participant	
Written Comments on Stakeholder Conference Issues	Up to 25 hours	
Stakeholder Conference (preparation, attendance & reporting)	Up to 22 hours (up to 2 days @ 11 hours/day)	

		nours/aay)	Op to 25 nours	engible participant			
			:			!	
Individual Whose Fees are Being Claimed   Hourly rate	Hourly rate		Hours		Subtotal	HST	Total
Dr. Roger Higgin	\$330.00	12.00	8.00		\$6,600.00	\$429.00	\$7,029.00
David MacIntosh	\$290.00	10.00	00.9		\$4,640.00	\$301.60	\$4,941.60
					\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
					\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
					\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
	Total:	22.00	14.00		0.00 \$11,240.00	\$730.60	

Total legal/consultant fees: \$11,970.60

# Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed



File # EB-	2014-0289	Process:	2014 Natural Gas Market Review	
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundation			
Name of in	dividual whose disbursements are being c	laimed:		
			HST Rate Ontario:	6.5%

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Scanning/Photocopy		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone/Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		\$0.00	\$0.00
Тахі		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

1/



### SPA Inc

15 Malabar Place Don Mills, Toronto, Ontario M3B 1A4 (416) 391-0738 fax (416) 391-0738 Invoice No. 2015-EP-9

### INVOICE =

#### Customer

Name Energy Probe Research Foundation

Address 225 Brunswick Avenue

City Toronto Province Ont P.C. M5S 2M6

Attn. Mr. David MacIntosh

Date Project No Title 24/04/2015 OEB NGMR

EB-2014-0289

Hours	Date	Description Of Services	Unit Price	TOTAL
4.00	Dec 1 2014	Prepn Review Pre-Conference Material	\$330.00	\$1,320.00
6.00	Dec 3 2014	Attend Natural Gas Forum Day 1	\$330.00	\$1,980.00
6.00	Dec 4 2014	Attend Natural Gas Forum Day 2	\$330.00	\$1,980.00
4.00	Jan 12 2015	Written Observations/Comments for Client	\$330.00	\$1,320.00

20.00

Payment Details 
Cheque

Name SPA INC

Date

Taxes HST \$858.00
PST
TOTAL \$7,458.00

HST NUMBER 88413 6714 RT0001

### Time Sheet for D. MacIntosh

### Board File: EB-2014-0289 Natural Gas Market Review OEB Consultation

Summary:	Hours
Preparation	6.00
Attend. Tech.	0.00
Attend. ADR	10.00
Attend. Hearing	0.00
Argument Prep.	0.00
Case Mngt. (CM)	0.00
Total	16.00

Date	Hours	Note
10-Jan-15 12-Jan-15		Prepare Comments Prepare Comments
Total		Preparation

Date	Hours	Note
03-Dec-14	5.00	Attend Natural Gas Forum Day 1
04-Dec-14	5.00	Attend Natural Gas Forum Day 2
Total	10.00	Attendance - Stakeholder Meeting

RECE	PT
CAR PARK; Yonge DEVICE; PAID;	8 Eglinton Ctr Paystation 4 04/12/14 03:30P
SHORT TERM ENTRY: EXIT: PARKING DURATION; CHARGED DURATION;	071167 04 12/14 09:28A 04 12/14 09:33P 000 06:02 000 02:40
PALD: TAX FREE V.A.T. 13%;	CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30
CASH PAYMENTS:	CAD30.00

i 🎉

*******	RECEIPT		•
******			0.0
CAR PARK:	Yonge 8	& Eglinton	
DEVICE		Paystati	on 4
PAID:	00	3/12/14 04	128P
SHORT TER			1038
ENTRY	03	9/12/14 09	152A
EXIT <sub>‡</sub> -	03	3/12/14 04	:329
PARKING D	JRATION:	000 Q	6:36
CHARGED DI	URATION:	000 0	2:40
PAID:		CORC	n nn
			0.00
TAX FREE		CAD1	
V.A.T. 13	11	CHID	2.30
CAS	TS	CAD2	0.07