

PUBLIC INTEREST ADVOCACY CENTRE LE CENTRE POUR LA DÉFENSE DE L'INTÉRÊT PUBLIC

June 16, 2015

PIAC FILE # 6454-16

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board Suite 2700 2300 Yonge Street 27th floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

VIA E-Mail 6 pages

Dear Ms. Walli:

Re:

Board File No. EB-2013-0004

Load Displacement Generation Working Group

Cost Claim of Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC)

On behalf of the Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC) we have attached their cost claim with respect to the above-noted proceeding.

We have also served a copy on each rate-regulated electricity distributor via email.

Yours truly,

Michael Janigan Counsel for VECC

Cc: Electricity Distributors

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party (defined in the Practice Direction on Cost Awards as including a participant in a consultation process) in a consultation before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board Notice of Hearing for Cost Awards. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

		Instru			
- Required data in	put is indicated by yellow-sh	aded fields. Formu	as are present in the	document to assist with the	calculation of
the cost claim.					
- All claims must b	e in Canadian dollars. If ap	plicable, state excha	ange rate and country	of initial currency.	
	2 4200	Rate:		Country:	
- A separate "State	ement of Disbursements Bei	ng Claimed" is requ	ired for each consulta	nt or lawyer/articling stude	nt/paralegal.
However only one	"Statement of Fees Being C	laimed" and one "S	ummary of Fees and D	Disbursements	
	vering the whole of the part			1970	
- A CV for each cor	ust be supported by a comp rsultant must be attached u	nless for a given es	o by a representative	of the party.	sales at the sale
process within the		illess, for a given co	nsuitant, a CV nas bee	en provided to the Board in	another
• 10 1001 1100 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000	ed in section 7.03 of the Pra	actice Direction on	Cost Awards itemize	tracaints must be provided	ı
		Tetree Direction on	cost Awards, Itemizet	receipts must be provided	l.
File # EB-	2013-000	54 p	rocess: OEB L	and Design	11 = 116
	1/6/1		ocess. Och Z	CAU ///Speke	NENT 40
Party:	DECE		Affiant's Name	Downa 15	RADY
HST Number:	13059 2405 RT 0001	<u>-</u>	HST	Rate Ontario: 3.99	_ /
	Full Registrant		Qualifyi	ng Non-Profit	í
	Unregistered	$\overline{\Box}$	- Cadin yi	Tax Exempt	
	Other			Tax Exempt	
	Other				
		Affid	avit		
l,	Donna Brady	, 0	f the City/Town of	Ottawa	
in the Province,	/State of		ntario	, swear or affirm that:	3
1 Lam a represent	rative of the above noted as	why /the UD-styll)		- 5	
2. I have examined	tative of the above-noted pa I all of the documentation in	rty (the Party) an	d as such have knowle	edge of the matters attested	to herein.
Dishursements Bei	ng Claimed", "Statement of	Fees Being Claimed	" and "Statement(s) a	f Dishusses and Bailer Claim	and
3. The attached "S	ummary of Fees and Disburs	sements Being Claim	ned". "Statement of Fe	es Reing Claimed" and "State	tement(s) of
Disbursements Bei	ng Claimed" include only co	sts incurred and tim	ne spent directly for th	e nurnoses of the Party's na	articination in
the Ontario Energy	Board process referred to a	above.			
4. This cost claim d	loes not include any costs fo	r work done, or tim	e spent, by a person t	hat is an employee or office	r of the Party
as described in sec	tions 6.05 and 6.09 of the B	oard's Practice Dire	ction on Cost Awards.		
	-) /	1			
	-50				
Signature of Af	fiant				
Sworn or affirm	ned before me at the Ci	ty/Town of	Ottawa		
in the Province,	/State of	Ontario	, on	JUNG 16	-2015.
				(date)	
//					
Commission	for taking Affidavita				
Commissioner	for taking Affidavits				

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB-	2013-0009	Process: OEB LOAD / ISPLACEMENT
Party:	UECE	GENERATION WE
	Summary of Fees and Disl	bursements Being Claimed
Legal/consu	sultant fees 12, 292.50	
Disburseme HST	484.32	
Total Cost (484.32 Claim 12, 776.82	3000
	Detail of Fees and Disbu	rsements Being Claimed
	Statement of Fe	es Being Claimed
Statem	ment of Fees being claimed for Eligible Activ	vity is found on the second tab of this workbook.
	Statement(s) of Disbur	sements Being Claimed
S	Statement of Disbursements being claimed	is found on the third tab of this workbook.

Ontario Energy Board





Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Individu	iai wnose	Costs are Being C	laimed
Name: Bill Harper Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached:		Year Called to Bar CV not required:	Completed Years Practicing/Years of Relevant Experience
ev attached.		cv not required.	
Name: Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant:		Year Called to Bar	Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience
CV attached:		CV not required:	
Name: Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached:		Year Called to Bar CV not required:	Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience
Name: Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached:		Year Called to Bar CV not required:	Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience
Name: Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant:		Year Called to Bar	Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience
CV attached:		CV not required:	

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Statement of Fees Being Claimed



Ξ
e #
EB -
2013-0004

Process Load Displacement Generation Working Group

Party VECC

HST Rate: 13%

Number of Meeting Days

						Individu		
Totals					Bill Harper	Individuals Whose Fees Are Being Claimed		
S					330	Hourly Rate		
					37.25	Up to 11 hours per day	Total Hours Claimed	Claimed: 4*
\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$12,292.50	Subtotal		
\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1,598.03	HST		
\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	00.00 \$0.00	\$0.00	\$13,890.53	Total		

^{*}Mr. Harper attended the meetings on April 5, 2013; April 23, 2013; May 23, 2013 and June 25, 2013.

Econalysis Consulting Services

34 King St East Suite 630 Toronto, Ontario M5C 2X8

Statement of Costs

Date	File #
12/06/2015	2015036

Bill To

Public Interest Advocacy Centre Suite 1204 1 Nicholas Street Ottawa, ON K1N 7B7

Terms	Docket No.	
Net 30	EB-2013-0004	

Project

OEB Standby WG

03/04/2013					
	Preparation	Meeting prep	1.5	330.00	495.00
04/04/2013	Preparation	5.1	1	330.00	330.00
05/04/2013	Attendance	WG mtg	6.25	330.00	2,062.50
22/04/2013	Preparation		1.5	330.00	495.00
23/04/2013	Attendance		5.25	330.00	1,732.50
30/04/2013	Preparation	Review Draft Minutes	0.25	330.00	82.50
23/05/2013	Attendance	Attend sub-Work Group mtg	2.5	330.00	825.00
14/06/2013	Preparation	Review Elenchus Scenarios	2	330.00	660.00
17/06/2013	Preparation		0.5	330.00	165.00
17/06/2013	Preparation	Conference Call with sub-group	1	330.00	330.00
25/06/2013	Attendance		5	330.00	1,650.00
12/07/2013	Preparation	Review draft minutes	0.25	330.00	82.50
07/08/2013	Preparation	Review Elenchus report	3	330.00	990.00
08/08/2013	Preparation	Review Elenchus Report	2	330.00	660.00
16/09/2013	Preparation	Review/Comment on draft Report	2.25	330.00	742.50
17/09/2013	Preparation	Review Report	0.5	330.00	165.00
11/10/2013	Preparation	Review Oct draft report	1	330.00	330.00
15/10/2013	Preparation	Review Oct. Draft Report	1	330.00	330.00
16/10/2013	Preparation	Review Draft Report	0.5	330.00	165.00
	4	Subtotal		57.5 (W.S.) E	12,292.50
	1	HST on Sales		13.00%	1,598.03

HST #10160 6028	\$1,598.03
Total	\$13,890.53