Eric K. Gillespie Direct Tel: 416.703.6362 Email: egillespie@gillespielaw.ca

July 22, 2015

Delivered via Email and Courier

Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board Suite 2700, 2300 Yonge Street Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli:

Re: wpd Sumac Ridge Incorporated Application to Establish a Location pursuant to S. 41(9)
Ontario Energy Board File Number EB-2013-0442

We are the solicitors for Dr. E. J. Salmon, an intervenor in the proceedings for this Application. We enclose the Cost Submissions of Dr. Salmon, including supporting documentation to document in detail the time spent by counsel on this matter.

We respectfully request that the Board accept these submissions and award the requested costs to our client.

Thank you for your attention to this matter.

Yours very truly,

ERIC K. GILLESPIE
PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION

Eric K. Gillespie

EKG/ga

Encl.

cc P. Duffy, Stikeman Elliott LLP, Lawyers for wpd White Pines Wind Inc.

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are embedded in the form to assist with calculations. - All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency. - A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal. However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party: cost claim should be provided. - The cost claim must be supported by a completed Afficavit signed by a representative of the party. - A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff. Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided. File # EB-	The second	TO BUT			nstructions	MINISTER H	
- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (Comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal. However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided. - The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party. - A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff. Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided. File # EB-		•		able, state ex		initial currency.	calculations.
Party: Dr. E. J. Salmon, Intervenor HST Number: 826244220RT001 Full Registrant Unregistered Other	Disbursemen However, on - The cost cla - A CV for each	nts Being ally one "S aim must ch consu	Claimed") is required for each cummary of Fees and Disburs be supported by a complete Itant/analyst must be attach	eing Claimed ch lawyer, an sements" cov ed Affidavit si ed unless pro	alyst/consultant and articlir vering the whole of the party igned by a representative of ovided to the Board as preso	of Fees Being Claim ng student/paraleg y's cost claim shoul the party. cribed on the Cost	al. d be provided. Award Tariff.
HST Number: 826244220RT001	File # EB-	2013-0	442		Process: Application u	nder s. 41(9) of t	he Electricity Act
Full Registrant	Party:	Dr. E. J	. Salmon, Intervenor		Affiant's Name:	Graham Andrews	
Affidavit I, Graham Andrews , of the City/Town of in the Province/State of Ontario , swear or affirm that: 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of Toronto , in the Province/State of Ontario , on July-22-15 .	HST Numbe	er: 8	26244220RT001	A	HST R	ate Ontario:	(2) 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10
I, Graham Andrews , of the City/Town of Toronto in the Province/State of Ontario , swear or affirm that: 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of Toronto , on July-22-15 .			Unregistered		Qualifyin		
in the Province/State of Ontario Ontario , swear or affirm that: 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of					Affidavit	trais de la company	
in the Province/State of Ontario , swear or affirm that: 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of Toronto , in the Province/State of Ontario , on July-22-15 .	l,	Lisa	Graham Andrews		, of the City/Town of	The state of the s	oronto
2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of Toronto in the Province/State of Ontario, on July-22-15		vince/S	tate of Or	ntario		swear or affirm	that:
in the Province/State of Ontario , on July-22-15 .	2. I have exa Being Claime 3. The attach Disbursemer Ontario Ener 4. This cost of described in	mined all ed", "Stat ned "Sum nts Being rgy Board claim doe sections	I of the documentation in su tement(s) of Fees Being Clain mary of Fees and Disbursem Claimed" include only costs I process referred to above. Is not include any costs for w 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's	pport of this ned" and "Stanents Being Concurred and ork done, or Practice Directions	cost claim, including the attactement(s) of Disbursement claimed", "Statement(s) of Fortime spent directly for the	tached "Summary or is Being Claimed". ees Being Claimed" purposes of the Pa	of Fees and Disbursements and "Statement(s) of rty's participation in the
in the Province/State of Ontario , on July-22-15 .	Sworn or a	affirme	d before me at the City	/Town of	Toro	onto	<u> </u>
			·		, on		Special .

Commissioner for taking Affidavits

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2013-0442 Process: Application under s. 41(9) of the Electricity Act

Party:

Dr. E. J. Salmon, Intervenor

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed								
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	10,268.00						
Disbursements	\$	380						
HST	\$	1,334.84						
Total Cost Claim	\$	11,602.84						

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Eric K. Gillespie Professional Corporation, In Trust

Send payment to this address: 10 King Street East, Suite 600

Toronto, Ontario

M5C 1C3

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2013-0442	,	Process: Ap	pplication under s. 41(9) of the Electricity Act
Party:	Dr. E. J. Salmon, Intervenor		Service Prov	vider Name: Graham Andrews
			Year Called to	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Bar	Experience
	Legal Counsel	V	2012	3
	Articling Student/Paralegal			
	Consultant			Hourly Rate: \$170
	Analyst			
	For Consultant/Analyst:	☐ CV attac	ched	HST Rate Charged (enter %): 13.0%
		☐ CV prov	ided within previous	24 months

the section was an indicated allowers at the second		100000		Statement of Fees Being Claimed							
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total		
Pre-hearing Conference											
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Attendance	7 (N. W.)	\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Technical Conference											
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Interrogatories											
Preparation	4.30	\$	170.00	\$	731.00	\$	95.03	\$	826.03		
Responses	8.10	\$	170.00	\$	1,377.00	\$	179.01	\$	1,556.01		
Issues Conference											
Preparation	240	\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	(<u>11</u>)	\$	-	\$	-		
ADR - Settlement Conference											
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	_	\$	-		
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Proposal Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Argument											
Preparation	26.40	\$	170.00	\$	4,488.00	\$	583.44	\$	5,071.44		
Oral Hearing											
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	2.#S	\$	-	\$	-		
Other Conferences											
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	82	\$	721	\$	¥		
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$		\$			
Case Management	21.60	\$	170.00	\$	3,672.00	\$	477.36	\$	4,149.36		
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES		Ī		Ś	10,268.00	\$	1,334.84	\$	11,602.84		

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2013-0442

Process:

Application under s. 41(9) of the Electricity Act

Party:

Dr. E. J. Salmon, Intervenor

Service Provider Name:

Graham Andrews

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Scanning/Photocopy	SENSERIES S		\$ -
Printing			\$ -
Courier			\$ -
Telephone/Fax			\$ -
Transcripts	WALLEL DE LES		\$ -
Travel: Air			\$ -
Travel: Car			\$ -
Travel: Rail			\$ -
Travel (Other):			\$ -
Parking	100000000000000000000000000000000000000		\$ -
Тахі	Ballery J. G. Bally		\$ -
Accommodation			\$ -
Meals	THE RESERVE OF STREET		\$ -
Other:		- Allerda	\$ -
Other:			\$ -
Other:			\$ -
(1) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1)			
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	\$ -	\$ -

Dr. E. J. Salmon ON Canada

File #: 00901

Attention: Dr. Salmon Inv #:

RE: Wpd Sumac Ridge OEB Hearing - Intervenor

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TASK	HOUR S	LWYR
Dec-17-14	Drafting letter to OEB re motion request; sending same to same	BW	0.80	GA
Dec-18-14	Telephone call with client re OEB; review documents incl. OEB PO, etc; drafting letter re motion request; correspondence from client re same and re intervenor status; review documents re same	BW	2.40	GA
Jan-05-15	Correspondence from client re status	BW	0.20	GA
	Correspondence from client re OEB filings; review documents incl. evidence and drafts	BW	0.40	GA
Jan-06-15	Correspondence from client re submissions; review documents incl. same; reply to same re same	BW	0.50	GA
Jan-12-15	Drafting Suppl. Interrogatories for OEB submissions; correspondence from client re same; replies to same re same; serving and filing materials with OEB	BW	3.80	GA
Jan-20-15	Correspondence from client re submissions; review documents incl. attachments	BW	0.90	GA
Jan-21-15	Review documents from wpd re submissions	BW	2.10	GA

Invoice #:	Page 2	July 22, 2015
------------	--------	---------------

Jan-22-15	Review documents from clients incl. draft response, etc.; correspondence from clients re same; replies re same	BW	2.30	GA
Jan-23-15	Drafting submissions; revisions to same; correspondence to clients re clarification; replies from same	BW	2.40	GA
Jan-26-15	Drafting revisions to evidence submissions; correspondence to client re same; replies from same re same	BW	3.20	GA
Jan-27-15	Correspondence from client re revisions to draft	BW	0.10	GA
Feb-02-15	Correspondence from client re evidence for OEB; review documents incl same; correspondence to client re same; replies from same re same	BW	0.90	GA
Feb-06-15	Correspondence from I. Minott re OEB further information requested; correspondence from client re Interrogatorries from Board Staff; review documents incl. same; correspondence from clients re responses to same	BW	1.90	GA
Feb-09-15	Correspondence from client re initial thoughts responding to Interrogatories	BW	0.20	GA
Feb-13-15	Correspondence from client re response materials to Interrogatories; review documents incl. same; drafting revisions to responses; correspondence to client re clarification of same	BW	3.70	GA
Feb-17-15	Correspondence from client re revisions to responses incl. additional documents; revisions to responses; serving and filing with OEB	BW	2.30	GA
Feb-24-15	Review documents incl. wpd Arg. in Chief; correspondence from client re same	BW	0.90	GA
Mar-02-15	Review documents incl. draft submissions from clients; revisions to same; correspondence to client re	BW	1.90	GA

	same			
Mar-03-15	Drafting revisions to Final Submissions re OEB; editing same; legal research re same; serving same to OEB	BW	4.10	GA
Mar-16-15	Correspondence from client re PO 4	BW	0.30	GA
Mar-18-15	Correspondence to client re response and details for same	BW	0.50	GA
	Correspondence from client re submissions and thoughts; review documents re same	BW	0.40	GA
Mar-23-15	Correspondence from client re thoughts for submission; legal research re same	BW	0.60	GA
Mar-26-15	Correspondence from client re draft submissions; review documents incl. same; legal research re same	BW	3.80	GA
Mar-27-15	Correspondence to client re draft submissions; correspondence to R. Carlson re draft submissions	BW	0.30	GA
Mar-30-15	Legal Research re case law; drafting revisions to submissions	BW	3.10	GA
Mar-31-15	Legal Research re submissions re road allowance; correspondence from COKL solicitor; reply to same re same	BW	3.90	GA
Apr-02-15	Preparation of submissions; review documents incl. same; serving and filing with Board	BW	3.20	GA
Apr-14-15	Correspondence from client re further reply to issues presented by wpd; reply to same re same	BW	0.30	GA
Apr-16-15	Review documents from client re submissions	BW	1.40	GA
Apr-17-15	Drafting revisions to reply submissions; correspondence to client re same	BW	2.10	GA

Invoice #:		Page	4		July	22, 2015	
Apr-20-15	Legal Research drafting revision correspondence submission of sa service on wpd	ns to same; to client re s	ame;	BW	3.40		GA
Jul-17-15	Correspondence decision; review same; telephone decision and opt	documents call with cli	incl.	BW	2.10		GA
	Totals				60.40	\$10,268.0	0
	Total GST on F	ees				\$1,334.84	4
FEE SUMN Lawyer	MARY:	Hours	Effectiv	ve Rate	An	nount	
Graham And	drews	60.40	9	\$170.00	\$10,2	68.00	
	Total Fees & D	isbursemen	ts				\$11,602.84
	Previous Balance	ce					\$0.00
	Previous Payme	ents					\$0.00
	Balance Due N	ow					\$11,602.84

AMOUNT QUOTED:

\$0.00