

THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS

President, Cara Holdings Ltd, President, PATRICIA ADAMS MAX ALLEN Producer, IDEAS, CBC Radio ANDREW COYNE Columnist, National Post GLENN FOX Professor of Economics, University of Guelph IAN GRAY President, St. Lawrence Starch Co, CLIFFORD ORWIN Professor of Political Science, University of Toronto

Chair, GAIL REGAN sident, Cara Holdings Ltd. Secretary//Treasurer, ANNETTA TURNER ANDREW ROMAN Barrister & Solicitor, Miller Thomson ANDREW STARK Rotman School of Management, University of Toronto GEORGE TOMKO uelph Resident Expert, PSI Initiative, University of Toronto MICHAEL TREBILCOCK Chair, Law & Economics, University of Toronto MARGARET WENTE of Toronto Columnist, The Globe and Mail

January 8, 2016

BY EMAIL & COURIER

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge St, Suite 2701 Toronto ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli:

Board File No. EB-2015-0166 Union Gas & EB-2015-0175 Enbridge Gas Distribution Pre-Approval of the Cost Consequences of NEXUS Long Term Contracts Energy Probe – Costs Submission

Pursuant to the Decision and Order issued December 17, 2015 in the EB-2015-0166/EB-2015-0175 joint proceeding, attached please find the Costs Submission of Energy Probe Research Foundation (Energy Probe) for consideration of the Board.

Energy Probe apologizes for filing its Costs Submission past the January 7, 2015 deadline.

Should you require additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours truly,

Dwill the thits

David S. MacIntosh Case Manager

cc: Karen Hockin, Union Gas Limited (By email) Mark Kitchen, Union Gas Limited (By email) Charles Keizer, Torys LLP (By email) Andrew Mandyam, Enbridge Gas Distribution Inc. (By email) David Stevens, Aird & Berlis LLP (By email) Shelley Grice, Consultant to Energy Probe (By email) Brady Yauch, Consultant to Energy Probe (By email) Parties of Interest (By email)

Energy Probe Research Foundation 225 BRUNSWICK AVE., TORONTO, ONTARIO M5S 2M6



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are embedded in the form to assist with calculations.

- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.

Rate: Country: - A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal.

However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.

- A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff.

Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

| File # EB- | 2015 | -0166 & 2015-0175 | | Process: Unio | n Gas & EGDI - NI | EXUS Pipeline |
|------------|----------------------------------|--|---------------|---------------|--------------------------------|---------------|
| Party: | Energy Probe Research Foundation | | Affiant's Nam | th Brubaker | | |
| HST Numbe | er: | 10730 5146 RT0001 | | H | T Rate Ontario: | 6.50% |
| | | Full Registrant Unregistered Other | | Quali | fying Non-Profit Tax Exempt | |

| | Affidavit | | |
|-------------------------|----------------------------|-------------------------|--|
| , Elizabeth Brub | aker , of the City/Town of | Toronto | |
| n the Province/State of | Ontario, Canada | , swear or affirm that: | |

1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.

2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".

3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.

4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

Signature of Affiant

i

Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of

in the Province/State of

__ , on

(date)

Commissioner for taking Affidavits



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

| File # EB- 2015-0166 & 2015-0175 | 5 | Process: | Union Gas & EGDI - NEXUS Pipeline | | | |
|----------------------------------|--------------|----------------------|-----------------------------------|--|--|--|
| Party: Energy Probe Research | Foundation | | | | | |
| Sun | nmary of Fee | es and Disbursem | ents Being Claimed | | | |
| Legal/consultant/other fees | \$ | 21,020.00 | | | | |
| Disbursements | \$ | | | | | |
| HST | \$ | 1,366.30 | | | | |
| Total Cost Claim | \$ | 22,386.30 | | | | |
| | | Payment Informa | tion | | | |
| Make cheque payable | e to: Energ | y Probe Researd | ch Foundation | | | |
| Send payment to this addr | ess: 225 B | 225 Brunswick Avenue | | | | |
| | Toron | to, Canada M58 | S 2M6 | | | |
| | Attent | ion: David MacIr | ntosh | | | |
| | | | | | | |



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

| File # EB- 2015-0166 & 2015-0175 | | | Process: | | Union Ga | s & I | GDI - NEX | US P | ipeline |
|---------------------------------------|--------------|-----|---------------|-------|---------------|-------|-----------------------|------|-----------------|
| Party: Energy Probe Research Foundati | on | | Service P | rovi | der Name: | | Shelley Gr | ice | |
| Faity. | 011 | | Jei vice F | 101 | uer wanne. | | | | |
| | | ¥ | r Called to | | | | Complet | | |
| SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE | (check one) | rea | Bar | | | Ы | actising/Yea Exper | | Relevant |
| Legal Counsel | | | | | 1 | | 1 | | |
| Articling Student/Paralegal | | | | | 2 | | | 5 | |
| Consultant | | | | | | | -lourly Rate: | | \$230 |
| Analyst | Π | | | | | | iouny nate. | | 7250 |
| For Consultant/Analyst | CV attac | had | | | UST Data Ch | | d (enter %): | | 6.5% |
| For consultant/Analyst. | | | within previo | | | arge | u (enter 70). | - | 0.370 |
| | | ueu | within previo | Jus Z | | | | - | |
| Statement of Fees Being Claimed | | | | | | | | | |
| | Hours | Но | urly Rate | : | Subtotal | | HST | | Total |
| Pre-hearing Conference | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 230.00 | \$ | (1 2) | \$ | <u>u</u> | \$ | 24 |
| Attendance | | \$ | 230.00 | \$ | 1 | \$ | | \$ | |
| Technical Conference | |] | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | 3.50 | \$ | 230.00 | \$ | 805.00 | \$ | 52.33 | \$ | 857.33 |
| Attendance | | \$ | 230.00 | \$ | 82 | \$ | | \$ | 1 4 1 |
| Interrogatories | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | 8.25 | \$ | 230.00 | \$ | 1,897.50 | \$ | 123.34 | \$ | 2,020.84 |
| Responses | 2.00 | \$ | 230.00 | \$ | 460.00 | \$ | 29.90 | \$ | 489.90 |
| Issues Conference | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 230.00 | \$ | <u> </u> | \$ | ÷ | \$ | |
| Attendance | | \$ | 230.00 | \$ | 142 | \$ | - | \$ | 3=3 |
| ADR - Settlement Conference | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 230.00 | \$ | | \$ | - | \$ | |
| Attendance | | \$ | 230.00 | \$ | ÷. | \$ | | \$ | |
| Proposal Preparation | | \$ | 230.00 | \$ | 220 | \$ | ÷ | \$ | 2 4 2 |
| Argument | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | 2.25 | \$ | 230.00 | \$ | 517.50 | \$ | 33.64 | \$ | 551.14 |
| Oral Hearing | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 230.00 | \$ | ÷. | \$ | | \$ | |
| Attendance | | \$ | 230.00 | \$ | 727 | \$ | 120 | \$ | 14 |
| Other Conferences | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 230.00 | \$ | | \$ | - | \$ | (#) |
| Attendance | | \$ | 230.00 | \$ | | \$ | 32 | \$ | |
| Case Management | | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | - | \$ | æ, | \$ | 7 4 |
| TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | | | | \$ | 3,680.00 | \$ | 239.20 | \$ | 3,919.20 |

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed



File # EB- 2015-0166 & 2015-0175

Process:

Union Gas & EGDI - NEXUS Pipeline

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundati

Service Provider Name:

Shelley Grice

| | Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed | | | | | |
|----------|--|-------|--|--|--|--|
| Net Cost | HST | Total | | | | |
| | | \$ | | | | |
| | | \$ | 1 | | | |
| | | \$ | | | | |
| | | \$ | : ii)! | | | |
| | | \$ | * | | | |
| | | \$ | | | | |
| | | \$ | 3 | | | |
| | | \$ | 1 2 0 | | | |
| | | \$ | :#)! | | | |
| | | \$ | ieji | | | |
| | | \$ | | | | |
| | | \$ | | | | |
| | | \$ | (هُ) | | | |
| | | \$ | 2 4 3) | | | |
| | | \$ | (m)) | | | |
| | | \$ | | | | |
| | | | | | | |
| | Net Cost | | \$ \$ \$ | | | |

| PROJECT T | IME SHEET | DATE | INVOICE |
|------------|--|---|---------|
| EB-2015-01 | 66/EB-2015-0175 | 2016-01-05 | #353 |
| NEXUS Gas | Limited/EGDI 5 Transmission - Pre-approval 1ME SHEET | | |
| DATE | TASK DESCRIPTION | CHARGE TYPE | Hours |
| 2015-08-07 | Preparation; Review Union & Enbridge applications; Prepare interrogatories | Prepare Irs | 4.00 |
| 2015-08-08 | Preparation; Review Union & Enbridge applications; Prepare interrogatories | Prepare Irs | 2.25 |
| 2015-08-10 | Review application; Finalize interrogatories | Prepare Irs | 2.00 |
| 2015-09-03 | Review & consider interrogatory responses | IR Responses | 1.00 |
| 2015-09-06 | Review & consider interrogatory responses | IR Responses | 1.00 |
| 2015-09-07 | Review & consider interrogatory responses; Prepare questions for Technical Conference; emails w/client | Preparation Technical Conference Questions | 2.50 |
| 2015-09-08 | Finalize questions for Technical Conference; emails w/client | Preparation Technical Conference Questions | 1.00 |
| 2015-11-24 | Review & prepare submission, AIC, edits | Submission | 1.00 |
| 2015-11-25 | Review & prepare submission; emails; edits | Submission | 1.25 |
| | | Total | 16.00 |

Shelley Grice, P. Eng.

46 Scarborough Road, Toronto ON M4E 3M5 416-694-3917, shelley.grice@rogers.com

INVOICE #353

January 5, 2016

Energy Probe Research Foundation 225 Brunswick Avenue Toronto, Ontario M5S 2M6 Attention: Mr. David MacIntosh

Re:

Union Gas Limited/Enbridge Gas Distribution Inc. EB-2015-0166/EB-2015-0175 NEXUS Gas Transmission

| Description | Charge Type | Hours | Rate | Amount |
|--------------------------|-------------|-------|----------|------------|
| Professional Services of | f | | | |
| Shelley Grice | Preparation | 13.75 | \$230.00 | \$3,162.50 |
| | Attendance | | \$230.00 | \$0.00 |
| | Argument | 2.25 | \$230.00 | \$517.50 |
| Sub-Total | | | | \$3,680.00 |
| HST on Services | | | | \$478.40 |
| Disbursements | | | | |
| HST on Disbursements | ; | | | |
| GST # 817042757RT0 | 001 | 16.00 | TOTAL | \$4,158.40 |

Details are included in the attached time sheet. Please make cheque payable to Shelley Grice.

Sincerely,

Thellyguice

Shelley Grice, P. Eng.



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

| File # EB- | 2015-0166 & 2015-0175 | | | Process: | | Union Ga | s & I | EGDI - NEX | US P | ipeline |
|-------------|---|--------------|--------------------------|---------------------|--------|------------|-----------------|-------------------------------|----------|------------------|
| Party: | Energy Probe Research Foundat | ion | on Service Provider Name | | | ider Name: | David MacIntosh | | | sh |
| | SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel Articling Student/Paralegal | (check one) | Yea | ar Called to Bar |] | | P | | | Relevant |
| | Consultant Analyst For Consultant/Analyst: | CV attac | | within previc | 2016 2 | | | Hourly Rate: d (enter %): | | \$290 6.5% |
| | Ci. | tatement o | | | | | | | | |
| | | Hours | _ | urly Rate | r | Subtotal | - | HST | 1 | Total |
| Pre-hearing | g Conference | | | | | | | | | |
| | Preparation | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 110.0 | \$ | ÷ | \$ | 19 (B) |
| | Attendance | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 12 | \$ | <u> </u> | \$ | 1 |
| Technical C | Conference | | | | | | | | | |
| | Preparation | 0.50 | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 145.00 | \$ | 9.43 | \$ | 154.43 |
| | Attendance | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 5 | \$ | | \$ | |
| Interrogato | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Preparation | 6.25 | · · | 290.00 | \$ | 1,812.50 | \$ | 117.81 | \$ | 1,930.31 |
| | Responses | 2.25 | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 652.50 | \$ | 42.41 | \$ | 694.91 |
| Issues Conf | | | <i>.</i> | 200.00 | | | | | <u> </u> | |
| | Preparation Attendance | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | | \$ \$ | | \$ | |
| | ement Conference | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | | \$ | 5 | \$ | |
| ADR - Setti | Preparation | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | | \$ | - | \$ | - |
| | Attendance | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | |
| | Proposal Preparation | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | ····· |
| Argument | | | Ŷ | 200.00 | , v | | Ý | | | |
| | Preparation | 3.75 | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 1,087.50 | \$ | 70.69 | \$ | 1,158.19 |
| Oral Hearin | g | | | | | | | | | |
| | Preparation | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | Ħ | \$ | # | \$ | 9 8 0 |
| | Attendance | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 151 | \$ | 5 | \$ | 1. 1. |
| Other Conf | erences | | | | | | | | | |
| | Preparation | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 9 | \$ | 2 | \$ | 242 |
| | Attendance | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | ÷ | \$ | Ŧ | \$ | |
| Case Mana | gement | 1.75 | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | 297.50 | \$ | 19.34 | \$ | 316.84 |
| TOTAL SER | VICE PROVIDER FEES | | | | \$ | 3,995.00 | \$ | 259.68 | \$ | 4,254.68 |

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed



File # EB- 2015-0166 & 2015-0175

Process:

Union Gas & EGDI - NEXUS Pipeline

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundati

· —

Service Provider Name:

David MacIntosh

| Statem | ent of Disbursements Being Claim | ed | | |
|----------------------|----------------------------------|------|-------|---------------------|
| | Net Cost | HST | Total | |
| Scanning/Photocopy | | | \$ | - |
| Printing | | | \$ | - |
| Courier | | | \$ | |
| Telephone/Fax | | | \$ | (H) |
| Transcripts | | | \$ | ** 2 |
| Travel: Air | | | \$ | |
| Travel: Car | | | \$ | 5 2 9 |
| Travel: Rail | | | \$ | |
| Travel (Other): | | | \$ | : - 3 |
| Parking | | | \$ | |
| Taxi | | | \$ | |
| Accommodation | | | \$ | 145 1 4 0 |
| Meals | | | \$ | - |
| Other: | | | \$ | |
| Other: | | | \$ | :=2 |
| Other: | | | \$ | |
| | | | | |
| TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: | \$ - | \$ - | \$ | |

Time Sheet for D. MacIntosh Board File: EB-2015-0166 Union & EB-2015-0175 EGDI - NEXUS Pipeline

| Summary: | Hours |
|---|---|
| Preparation Attend. Tech. Attend. ADR Attend. Hearing Argument Prep. Case Mngt. (CM) | 12.75 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1.75 |
| Total | 14.50 |

| Date | |
|------|--|
| | |

Hours Note

| 22-Jul-15 | 1.75 | Review Prefiled Evidence Union |
|--------------|-------|--|
| 22-Jul-15 | 0.50 | Draft Notice of Intervention Union |
| 27-Jul-15 | 1.25 | Review Prefiled Evidence Enbridge |
| 27-Jul-15 | 0.50 | Draft Notice of Intervention Enbridge |
| 10-Aug-15 | 1.75 | Review Evidence and Draft Interrogatories |
| 11-Aug-15 | 0.50 | Review Evidence and Finalize Interrogatories |
| 27-Aug-15 | 2.25 | Review Applicant's Interrogatory Responses |
| 07-Sep-15 | 0.50 | Technical Conference Questions Preparation |
| 17-Sep-15 | 0.75 | Review Technical Conference Undertakings, Updated Evidence |
| 19-Nov-15 | 1.75 | Review Oral Hearing Transcripts, 3 Hearing Days |
| 26-Nov-15 | 0.75 | Draft Argument |
| 1826/12/2015 | 0.50 | Review Decision and Rate Order |
| | | |
| Total | 12.75 | Preparation |

| Date | Hours | Note |
|-----------|-------|---|
| 22-Jul-15 | 0.50 | CM - Notice of Intervention - Union Gas Limited |
| 27-Jul-15 | 0.50 | CM - Notice of Intervention - Enbridge Gas Distribution |
| 11-Aug-15 | 0.25 | CM - File Interrogatories |
| 17-Sep-15 | 0.25 | CM - File Technical Conference Questions Letter |
| 26-Nov-15 | 0.25 | CM - File Argument |
| Total | 1.75 | Case Management |



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

| File # EB- 2015-0166 & 2015-0175 | | | Process: Union Gas & EGDI - NEXUS Pipeline | | | | Pipeline | | |
|---|--------------|----------------------|--|-------|------------|----------|-----------------------------------|----------|---------------|
| Party: Energy Probe Research Foundation | ion | | Service P | rovi | ider Name: | | Brady Yau | ch | |
| SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel | (check one) | Yea | r Called to Bar | 1 | | Pi | Complet ractising/Yea Exper | ars of | Relevant |
| Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst For Consultant/Analyst: | CV attac | | within previo | ous 2 | | | Hourly Rate: d (enter %): | | \$170 6.5% |
| Statement of Fees Being Claimed | | | | | | | | | |
| | Hours | Hourly Rate Subtotal | | HST | | Total | | | |
| Pre-hearing Conference | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | <u>u</u> | \$ | ÷ | \$ | - |
| Attendance | | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | # | \$ | - | \$ | : . : |
| Technical Conference | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | 1,317.50 | \$ | 85.64 | \$ | 1,403.14 |
| Attendance | 12.50 | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | 2,125.00 | \$ | 138.13 | \$ | 2,263.13 |
| Interrogatories | | | | _ | | | | 4 | |
| Preparation | 11.75 | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | 1,997.50 | \$ | 129.84 | \$ | 2,127.34 |
| Responses | | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | | \$ | - | \$ | |
| Issues Conference | | ~ | 170.00 | | | - | | <i>.</i> | - |
| Preparation | | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | | \$ | - | \$ | |
| Attendance | | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | <u></u> | \$ | - | \$ | |
| ADR - Settlement Conference | | <u> </u> | 470.00 | | | 4 | | ć | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | # | \$ | | \$ | 9E |
| Attendance | | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | 5 | \$ | | \$ | 350 |
| Proposal Preparation Argument | | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | | \$ | | \$ | |
| Preparation | 14.50 | Ċ | 170.00 | \$ | 2,465.00 | \$ | 160.23 | \$ | 2,625.23 |
| Oral Hearing | 14.50 | ې ب | 170.00 | | 2,403.00 | <u>د</u> | 100.23 | ې | 2,023.23 |
| Preparation | 21.00 | ć | 170.00 | \$ | 3,570.00 | \$ | 232.05 | \$ | 3,802.05 |
| Attendance | 11.00 | _ | 170.00 | \$ | 1,870.00 | \$ | 121.55 | \$ | 1,991.55 |
| Other Conferences | 11.00 | Ŷ | 1,0.00 | Ļ | 1,070.00 | Ŷ | 121.33 | ÷ | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | H | \$ | - | \$ | |
| Attendance | | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | | \$ | - | \$ | |
| Case Management | | \$ | 170.00 | \$ | | \$ | | \$ | ÷. |
| TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | | | | | 13,345.00 | \$ | 867.43 | \$ | 14,212.43 |

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed



File # EB- 2015-0166 & 2015-0175

Process:

Union Gas & EGDI - NEXUS Pipeline

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundati

Service Provider Name:

Brady Yauch

| Sta | tement of Disbursements Being Claim | ned | | |
|----------------------|-------------------------------------|------|-------|------------------|
| | Net Cost | HST | Total | |
| Scanning/Photocopy | | | \$ | |
| Printing | | | \$ | <u></u> |
| Courier | | | \$ |) = 1 |
| Telephone/Fax | | | \$ | (#) |
| Transcripts | | | \$ | |
| Travel: Air | | | \$ | |
| Travel: Car | | | \$ | 7 1 23 |
| Travel: Rail | | | \$ | :=: |
| Travel (Other): | | | \$ | |
| Parking | | | \$ | :#: |
| Taxi | | | \$ | |
| Accommodation | | | \$ | 121 |
| Meals | | | \$ | : = : |
| Other: | | | \$ | |
| Other: | | | \$ | ۰ |
| Other: | | | \$ | |
| | | | | |
| TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: | \$ - | \$ - | \$ | - |

Brady Yauch

67A Auburn Avenue Toronto ON M6H 2L8 GST/HST 802822023 RT0001

Bill To:

Mr. David MacIntosh Energy Probe Research Foundation 225 Brunswick Avenue Toronto, Ontario, M5S 2M6 For: NEXUS Proceeding (EB-2015-0166 / EB-2015-0175)

| Date | DESCRIPTION | Time |
|----------------------|---|------------|
| August 5, 2015 | Prepared evidence for IRs for the Nexus pipeline cases | 6.25 Hours |
| August 6, 2015 | Prepared evidence for IRs for the Nexus pipeline cases | 5.5 Hours |
| September 3, 2015 | Prepared for technical conference on September 8 | 4.25 hours |
| September 4, 2015 | Prepared for technical conference on September 8 | 3.5 hours |
| September 8, 2015 | Attended technical conference | 6.5 hours |
| September 9, 2015 | Attended technical conference | 6 hours |
| November10, 2015 | Prepared for cross examination on November 13, 2015 | 4.25 hours |
| November11, 2015 | Prepared for cross examination on November 13, 2015 | 5.75 hours |
| November12, 2015 | Convened with other interveners for cross examination on November 13, 2015. | 1 hour |
| November12, 2015 | Prepared for cross examination on November 13, 2015 | 6.5 hours |
| November 13, 2015 | Attended oral hearing | 3.5 hours |
| November 14, 2014 | Prepared for oral examination of enbridge and Sussex economics | 3.5 hours |
| November 16, 2015 | Attended oral hearing | 3.5 hours |
| November 16, 2015 | Attended oral hearing | 4 hours |
| November 23, 2015 | Wrote and edited final argument | 4.25 hours |
| November 24, 2015 | Wrote and edited final argument | 5.5 hours |
| November 25, 2015 | Wrote and edited final argument | 4.75 hours |

| | Total 78.5 hours |
|--|---------------------|