

THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS

Chair, GAIL REGAN President, Cara Holdings Ltd.

President, PATRICIA ADAMS
MAX ALLEN
Producer, IDEAS, CBC Radio
ANDREW COYNE
Columnist, National Post
GLENN FOX
Professor of Economics, University of Guelph
IAN GRAY

President, St. Lawrence Starch Co. CLIFFORD OR WIN Professor of Political Science, University of Toronto

Secretary/Treasurer, ANNETTA TURNER
ANDREW ROMAN
Barrister & Solicitor, Miller Thomson
ANDREW STARK
Rotman School of Management, University of Toronto
GEORGE TOMKO
Resident Expert, PSI Initiative, University of Toronto
MICHAEL TREBILCOCK
Chair, Law & Economics, University of Toronto
MARGARET WENTE
Columnist, The Globe and Mail

January 9, 2016

BY EMAIL & BY COURIER

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge St, Suite 2701 Toronto ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli:

Board File No. EB-2014-0101 Oshawa PUC Networks Inc. --- 2015-2019 Rates Energy Probe – Costs Submission

Pursuant to the final Rate Order, issued December 22, 2015, please find attached the Costs Submission of Energy Probe Research Foundation (Energy Probe) in the EB-2014-0101 proceeding for consideration of the Board.

Should you require additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours truly,

David S. MacIntosh

Swidt to that

Case Manager

cc. Phil Martin, Oshawa PUC Networks (By email)

Ian Mondrow, Gowlings Lafleur Henderson LLP (By email)

Randy Aiken, Aiken & Associates (By email)

Interested Parties (By email)



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

			Ir	structions			
- All claims m - A separate Disbursemen However, on - The cost cla - A CV for each	nust be in "Detail o nts Being aly one "S aim must ch consul	is indicated by yellow-shaded Canadian dollars. If applical Fees and Disbursements Bei Claimed") is required for each ummary of Fees and Disburse be supported by a completed tant/analyst must be attache rovided in section 7.03 of the	ble, state ex Rate: ng Claimed [®] n lawyer, and ements" cove d Affidavit sip d unless pro	change rate a (comprising alyst/consultaering the who gned by a repovided to the	a "Statement a "Statement ant and articlible of the part aresentative of Board as pres	of initial currency Country: of Fees Being Ci ing student/para ty's cost claim sh of the party. scribed on the Co	/. laimed" and a "Statement of alegal. hould be provided. ost Award Tariff.
File # EB-	2014-0	101		Process:	Oshawa	PUC 2016 CIR	Rates
Party:		Probe Research Foundation	on		nt's Name:		th Brubaker
HST Numbe		10730 5146 RT0001			HST I	Rate Ontario:	6.50%
	_	Full Registrant			Qualifyi	ng Non-Profit	
		Unregistered			Qualityi	Tax Exempt	
		Other				·	
				0.661 1 10			
				Affidavit			
l,		Elizabeth Brubaker		, of the City			Toronto
in the Prov	vince/St	ate of	Ontario,	Canada		, swear or aff	irm that:
2. I have example and Being Claime 3. The attach Disbursemer Ontario Ener 4. This cost of	mined all ed", "State ned "Sum nts Being rgy Board claim doe	ve of the above-noted party (of the documentation in sup- ement(s) of Fees Being Claime mary of Fees and Disburseme Claimed" include only costs in process referred to above. s not include any costs for wo 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's	port of this ed" and "Sta ents Being Cl ncurred and ork done, or	cost claim, in- itement(s) of laimed", "Stat time spent d time spent, b	cluding the at Disbursemen tement(s) of I irectly for the by a person the	ttached "Summa hts Being Claimed Fees Being Claim e purposes of the	ary of Fees and Disbursement d". ned" and "Statement(s) of e Party's participation in the
Signature	of Affia	nt					
Sworn or a	affirme	d before me at the City/	Town of				. 46
in the Prov					on		
	•	·			-	(date)

Commissioner for taking Affidavits



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Process:

File # EB- 2014-0101

Oshawa PUC 2016 CIR Rates

Party:	Energy Probe Rese	arch Foundation		
		Summary of Fee	s and Disbursem	ents Being Claimed
Legal/cor	nsultant/other fees	\$	57,836.00	
Disburse	ments	\$	2,471.07	
HST		\$	3,919.96	
Total Cos	t Claim	\$	64,227.03	
			Payment Informa	ition
	Make cheque pa	yable to: Energy	y Probe Researd	ch Foundation

Toronto, Canada M5S 2M6
Attention: David MacIntosh

Send payment to this address: 225 Brunswick Avenue



File # EB-	2014-0101		Process:	Oshawa PU	IC 2016 CIR Rates	
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundation	on	Service Pro	vider Name: _	Randy Aiken	
			Year Called to		Completed Years Practising/Years of Rele	
ľ	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Bar		Experience	
	Legal Counsel			Γ	30	
	Articling Student/Paralegal			-		
	Consultant	V			Hourly Rate: \$3	30
	Analyst				-	
	For Consultant/Analyst:	☐ CV attac	hed	HST Rate Cha	arged (enter %): 6.5	5%
		✓ CV provi	ided within previous	24 months		

Statement of Fees Being Claimed													
50				_		-	LICT		Total				
	Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST												
Pre-hearing Conference		_		_									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$	<u> </u>	\$	(*				
Attendance	3.00	\$	330.00	\$	990.00	\$	64.35	\$	1,054.35				
Technical Conference													
Preparation	5.00	\$	330.00	\$	1,650.00	\$	107.25	\$	1,757.25				
Attendance	10.50	\$	330.00	\$	3,465.00	\$	225.23	\$	3,690.23				
Interrogatories													
Preparation	19.10	\$	330.00	\$	6,303.00	\$	409.70	\$	6,712.70				
Responses	14.00	\$	330.00	\$	4,620.00	\$	300.30	\$	4,920.30				
Issues Conference													
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$		\$	\ 				
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$		\$	E	\$	927				
ADR - Settlement Conference													
Preparation	15.20	\$	330.00	\$	5,016.00	\$	326.04	\$	5,342.04				
Attendance	14.70	\$	330.00	\$	4,851.00	\$	315.32	\$	5,166.32				
Proposal Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$		\$	(A)				
Argument						_							
Preparation	37.50	\$	330.00	\$	12,375.00	\$	804.38	\$	13,179.38				
Oral Hearing				Ė	,								
Preparation	24.50	\$	330.00	\$	8,085.00	\$	525.53	\$	8,610.53				
Attendance	15.70	\$	330.00	\$	5,181.00	\$	336.77	\$	5,517.77				
Other Conferences				Ť		_			-,				
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	548	\$		\$	5721				
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$		\$	39 0				
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$: E				
		<u> </u>	1, 0.00										
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	52,536.00	\$	3,414.84	\$	55,950.84				



File # EB-	2014-0101	Process:	Oshawa PUC 2016 CIR Rates	
		.,		
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundati	Service Provider Na	me: Randy Aiken	

		Net Cost		HST	Total
Scanning/Photocopy					\$ (*
Printing					\$ 3.5
Courier					\$ 1.72
Telephone/Fax					\$ 7 <u>4</u>
Transcripts					\$ ·
Travel: Air					\$ 1083
Travel: Car	\$	643.56	\$	41.83	\$ 685.39
Travel: Rail					\$ 15
Travel (Other):					\$ 4
Parking	\$	141.60	\$	9.20	\$ 141.60
Тахі					\$ -
Accommodation	\$	1,354.88	\$	88.07	\$ 1,442.95
Meals	\$	157.36	\$	10.23	\$ 167.59
Other:					\$ 8
Other:					\$ #
Other:					\$ •
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	[\$	2,297.40	5	149.33	\$ 2,437.53

INVOICE

AIKEN & ASSOCIATES

578 McNAUGHTON AVE. WEST CHATHAM, ONTARIO, N7L 4J6 (519) 351-8624 randy.aiken@sympatico.ca INVOICE NO. 046-2015

DATE December 22, 2015

HST REGISTRATION NO. 130417983

Mr. David MacIntosh Energy Probe Research Foundation 225 Brunswick Avenue Toronto, Ontario, M5S 2M6

PROJECT EB-2014-0101 - Oshawa PUC Networks - Custom IR Rates Case Page 1 of 2

DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION	RATE	TOTAL
Mar. 31	2.40	Review of evidence & preparation of interrogatories		
Apr. 2	3.00	Attendance at presentation meeting		
Apr. 8	0.50	Discussion with M. Rubenstein re filing and issues		
Apr. 10	8.00	Review of evidence & preparation of interrogatories		
Apr. 13	8.20	Review of evidence & preparation of interrogatories		
May 13	7.60	Review of interrogatory responses & preparation of technical conference questions		
May 14	6.40	Review of interrogatory responses & preparation of technical conference questions		
May 20	5.00	Review of interrogatory responses & preparation of technical conference questions		
May 21	6.00	Attendance at technical conference		
May 22	4.50	Attendance at technical conference (by phone)		
May 29	1.40	Review of technical conference undertakings		
May 31	8.40	Preparation for settlement conference		
June 1	5.40	Preparation for settlement conference		
June 2	6.50	Attendance at settlement conference		
June 3	3.70	Attendance at settlement conference		
June 4	4.50	Attendance at settlement conference		
June 8	0.70	Conference call with intervenors re issues for oral and written hearing		
June 24	2.90	Review of updated evidence		
June 25	7.20	Preparation of cross-examination and compendium materials		
June 26	7.00	Preparation of cross-examination and compendium materials		
June 29	3.20	Preparation of cross-examination		
June 30	6.50	Attendance at hearing		
July 2	6.50	Attendance at hearing		
July 3	1.70	Attendance at hearing		
July 5	1.00	Review of transcript		
July 9	2.50	Review of undertaking responses & conference call with intervenors		
July 9	1.00	Attendance at hearing (by phone)		
July 13	8.30	Preparation of argument		
July 15	6.00	Preparation of argument		
July 16	5.50	Preparation of argument including review of argument-in-chief		
July 19	4.60	Preparation of argument, including review of Staff submission		
July 20	1.30	Conference call with intervenors re submissions		
July 20	7.00	Preparation of argument		
July 21	2.50	Preparation of argument		
July 24	0.50	Review of edits to argument		
Dec. 1	1.80	Revew of decision & draft rate order & preparation of comments		
Total	159.20		330.00	52,536.00

	EB-2014-0101 - Oshawa PUC Networks - Custom IR Rates Case								
		Page 2 of 2							
DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION	RATE	TOTAL					
EXPENSES									
Travel - Car		To the Challes (202 has a CO 254 lbs (UST assessment administratibely))	107.26						
Apr. 2		Toronto to Chatham (303 kms @ \$0.354/km (HST component calculated below))	107.26						
May 21		Toronto to Chatham (303 kms @ \$0.354/km (HST component calculated below))	107.26						
June 1 June 4		Chatham to Toronto (303 kms @ \$0.354/km (HST component calculated below))	107.26						
June 4 June 29		Toronto to Chatham (303 kms @ \$0.354/km (HST component calculated below)) Chatham to Toronto (303 kms @ \$0.354/km (HST component calculated below))	107.26						
		Toronto to Chatham (303 kms @ \$0.354/km (HST component calculated below))	107.26						
July 3		Sub-Total - Travel - Car	107.20	643.50					
Travel - Oth	er	Sab Focal Francis Gal							
Apr. 2		Parking at Ontario Energy Board	17,70						
May 21		Parking at Ontario Energy Board	17.70						
June 2		Parking at Ontario Energy Board	17.70						
June 3		Parking at Ontario Energy Board	17.70						
June 4		Parking at Ontario Energy Board	17.70						
June 30		Parking at Ontario Energy Board	17.70						
July 2		Parking at Ontario Energy Board	17.70						
July 3		Parking at Ontario Energy Board	17.70						
		Sub-Total - Travel - Other		141.60					
Accomodation	on on								
Apr. 1		Hotel, including parking	155.12						
May 20		Hotel, including parking	134.52						
June 1		Hotel, including parking	124.22						
June 2		Hotel, including parking	155.12						
June 3		Hotel, including parking	124.22						
June 29		Hotel, including parking	134.52						
June 30		Hotel, including parking	175.72						
July 1		Hotel, including parking	175.72						
July 2		Hotel, including parking	175.72						
		Sub-Total - Accomodation		1,354.8					
Meals			47.70						
Apr. 1		Dinner	17.70						
May 20		Dinner	17.70						
May 21		Lunch	5.54						
June 2		Lunch	4.49 17.70						
June 2		Dinner	9,96						
June 3		Lunch	17,70						
June 3		Dinner	4.49						
June 4 June 30		Lunch	4.49						
June 30		Dinner	17.70						
July 1		Dinner	17.70						
July 2		Lunch	4,49						
July 2		Dinner	17.70						
Suly 2		Sub-Total - Meals		157.3					
		TOTAL PERCAND EVENING		E4 033 44					
SUMMARY		TOTAL FEES AND EXPENSES		54,833.40					
		HST DETAIL							
		Consulting Fees (@ 13.0%)		6,829.6					
		Travel - Car (@ 13.0%)		83.6					
		Travel - Other (per receipts)		18.4					
		Accomodation (per receipts)		171.3					
		Meals (as per receipts)		20.4					
		TOTAL HST		7,123.5					
			SUBTOTAL	5/ 932 /					
			-	54,833.4					
			H.S.T.	<u>7,123.5</u>					



A/R Number Group Code Invoice No. Reference #

Room No.

424

Page No.

1 of 2

Arrival

03-31-15

Cashier No.

114

Departure

04-02-15

User ID

SW

Date		Description	Charges	Credits
03-31-15	In Room Dining-Food	Room# 424 : CHECK# 807628	35.91	E6D
03-31-15	*Accommodation		139.00	STKHLD
03-31-15	Facilities Fee		4.17	ZINAFK
03-31-15	Room HST 13%		18.07	
03-31-15	Parking 4	DOS O E NE VENEZ A	11.95	
03-31-15	Other HST 13%		1.55	e e
04-01-15	In Room Dining-Food	Room# 424 : CHECK# 807696	38.21	
04-01-15	*Accommodation		139.00	EB-2014
04-01-15	Facilities Fee	*	4.17	-0101
04-01-15	Room HST 13%		18.07	OSHAW
04-01-15	Parking 4		11.95	USAM W
04-01-15	Other HST 13%	25	1.55	



A/R Number Group Code Invoice No. Reference #

Room No.

424

Page No.

2 of 2

Arrival

03-31-15

Cashier No.

114

Departure

04-02-15

User ID

SW

Date		De	scription			С	harges	Credits
					To	otal	423.60	0.
					Balar	nce	423.60	
	Facilities Fee			Room HST 13		Other HST 13		

Guest Signature:		
oacor orginataro.		

I have received the goods and / or services in the amount shown heron. I agree that my liability for this bill is not waived and agree to be held personally liable in the event that the indicated person, company, or association fails to pay for any part or the full amount of these charges. If a credit card charge, I further agree to perform the obligations set forth in the cardholder's agreement with the issuer.



A/R Number Group Code Invoice No. Reference #

Room No.

467

Page No.

1 of 2

Arrival

05-18-15

Cashier No.

111

Departure

05-21-15

User ID

ERC

Date	Description	Charges	Credits
05-18-15	*Accommodation	119.00	EB-2014-009 North Boy
05-18-15	Facilities Fee	3.57	North Breed
05-18-15	Room HST 13%	15.47	week buy
05-18-15	Parking 4	11.95	Ì
05-18-15	Other HST 13%	1.55	i i
05-19-15	In Room Dining-Food Room# 467 : CHECK# 811555	41.06	i i
05-19-15	*Accommodation	119.00	1
05-19-15	Facilities Fee	3.57	1 1
05-19-15	Room HST 13%	15.47	i i
05-19-15	Parking 4	11.95	i i
05-19-15	Other HST 13%	1.55	
05-20-15	In Room Dining-Food Room# 467 : CHECK# 811605	35.91	EB-2014-010
05-20-15	*Accommodation	119.00	EB-2014-010
05-20-15	Facilities Fee	3.57	C.A. W.
05-20-15	Room HST 13%	15.47	i i
05-20-15	Parking 4	11.95	
05-20-15	Other HST 13%	1.55	i i

TORONTO DON VALLEY HOTEL & SUITES 175 Wynford Drive Toronto, Ontario M3C 1J3 Telephone: (416) 449-4111 Fax: (416) 449-4946 HST#870011962 www.torontodonvalleyhotel.com



A/R Number Group Code Invoice No. Reference #

Room No.

467

Page No.

2 of 2

Arrival

05-18-15

Cashier No.

111

Departure

05-21-15

User ID

ERC

Date	Description					С	harges	Credits
					To	otal	531.59	0.0
					Bala	nce	531.59	
	 			Room HST 13		Other HST 13		
	Facilities Fee			TOOM TIOT TO		0,110,110,10		

Guest Signature:			

I have received the goods and / or services in the amount shown heron. I agree that my liability for this bill is not waived and agree to be held personally liable in the event that the indicated person, company, or association fails to pay for any part or the full amount of these charges. If a credit card charge, I further agree to perform the obligations set forth in the cardholder's agreement with the issuer.

TORONTO DON VALLEY HOTEL & SUITES
175 Wynford Drive
Toronto, Ontario M3C 1J3
Telephone: (416) 449-4111 Fax: (416) 449-4946
HST#870011962 www.torontodonvalleyhotel.com



A/R Number Group Code Invoice No.

Reference #

Room No.

656

Page No.

2 of 2

Arrival

06-01-15

Cashier No.

114

Departure

06-04-15

User ID

SW

Date	Description	on	Charges	Credits
		Total	519.64	0.0
		Balance	519.64	

		Facilities Fee			Room HST 13		Other HST 13		
0.00	0.00	10.71	0.00	0.00	46.41	0.00	4.65	0.00	0.00

Out and Other advisor?		
Guest Signature:		

I have received the goods and / or services in the amount shown heron. I agree that my liability for this bill is not waived and agree to be held personally liable in the event that the indicated person, company, or association falls to pay for any part or the full amount of these charges. If a credit card charge, I further agree to perform the obligations set forth in the cardholder's agreement with the issuer.



A/R Number Group Code Invoice No. Reference #

Room No.

206

Page No.

1 of 2

Arrival

06-29-15

Cashier No.

114

Departure

07-03-15

User ID

SW

Date		Charges	Credits	
06-29-15	*Accommodation		119.00	
06-29-15	Facilities Fee		3.57	
06-29-15	Room HST 13%		15.47	2503 %
06-29-15	Parking 4		11.95	
06-29-15	Other HST 13%	2 2 13 103 2 3	1.55	
06-30-15	In Room Dining-Food	Room# 206 : CHECK# 815762	46.20	
06-30-15	*Accommodation		159.00	
06-30-15	Facilities Fee	-	4.77	8.
06-30-15	Room HST 13%		20.67	
06-30-15	Parking 4		11.95	
06-30-15	Other HST 13%		1.55	
07-01-15	In Room Dining-Food	Room# 206 : CHECK# 815819	37.72	
07-01-15	*Accommodation		159.00	
07-01-15	Facilities Fee	***	4.77	
07-01-15	Room HST 13%		20.67	
07-01-15	Parking 4		11.95	
07-01-15	Other HST 13%	6.3	1.55	
07-02-15	In Room Dining-Food	Room# 206 : CHECK# 815864	35.91	
7-02-15	*Accommodation		159.00	
7-02-15	Facilities Fee		4.77	
7-02-15	Room HST 13%		20.67	

TORONTO DON VALLEY HOTEL & SUITES 175 Wynford Drive Toronto, Ontario M3C 1J3 Telephone: (416) 449-4111 Fax: (416) 385-6700 HST#870011962 www.torontodonvalleyhotel.com



A/R Number Group Code Invoice No. Reference #

Room No.

206

Page No.

2 of 2

Arrival

06-29-15

Cashier No.

114

Departure

07-03-15

User ID

SW

Date	Description	Charges	Credits
07-02-15	Parking 4	11.95	
07-02-15	Other HST 13%	1.55	

865.19	0.00		
865 19			
	865.19 865.19		

		Facilities Fee			Room HST 13		Other HST 13		
0.00	0.00	17.88	0.00	0.00	77,48	0.00	6.20	0.00	0.00

Sugat Claumaturas			
Guest Signature:			

I have received the goods and / or services in the amount shown heron. I agree that my liability for this will not be waived and agree to be held personally liable in the event that the indicated person, company or association fails to pay for any part of or the full amount of these charges. I further agree the obligations set forth in the cardholder's agreement with the issuer. I also am aware the following taxes are non negotiable; HST 13% and Facility Fee 3%.

IN ROOM 175 WYN TORONTO M3C GST # R ~ 8700	11962	TIME 18:25
1 DON BURG 1 DIET COM 1 DELIVER	CE Y CHARGE HST ATTIFY 15%	20.09 2.95 3.00 3.62 3.44
AL COME CO	es GRAND TOTA	
ROOM 113. 42	TOTAL 3	
PRINT NAME		

RIS	
IN ROOM DINTING 175 WYNFORD DRIVE 10RONTO, ONTARIO M3C 1J3 GST # R - 875011962 SRV 123 TABLE 1467/1 TIME 18:2	3
1 FISH AND CHIPS 19.00 1 DELIVERY CHARGE 3.00 1 MILK 2.99 HST 3.61 GRATUITY 15% 3.29) }
NET SALES 24,95 GRAND TOTAL	į
RUOM NO. 467 TIPS 4.00	
TOTAL 3.5.91	

PRINT NAME.....

SIGNATURES

5/20/15 GUEST 1 NUMBER 811605

*** GRATULTY INCLUDED IN BILL ***

DEVICE.	Eglinton Ctr Paystation 3 1/85/15 @4:57P
SHORT TELM	074859 1/85/15 07:01A 1/85/15 05:01P 000 09:56 000 82:40
PAIDI TAX FREE V.A.T. 11.7 :	CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30

CASH PAYI ENTS:

CADZO.CO

RECEIPT

Yonge & Eglinton Ctr Paystation 3 02/04/15 01:22P

02/04/15 07:09A 02/04/15 01:23P

000 06:13 000 02:40

CAD20.00 CAD17.70

CAD20 .00

CAR PARK

DEVICE PA1D: SHORT TELM

ENTRY:

EXIT: 0 PARKING LURATION:

CHARGED ILRATIONS

V.A.T. 1.2 :

CACH PAY ENTS:

_					
	m	e	t	ro	

SIGNATURES..... *** GRATUITY INCLUDED IN BILL ***

4/1/15 GUEST I NUMBER 807696 KEPRINT

F 2	SANDU. B BEVER RAL WER	AGE	RF RF	4.49
	ASTIC B		н	0.05
SU	втот	AL	5	. 54
	0.05 5.49 5.49	HST (13.000)% RED (5.000)% PFT (8.000)%		0.01 0.27 0.44
	TAL ROUMD=0 DEC =T		6	26
	0000			

CASH CHANGE DUE Total number of items s.

RETAIN RECEIPT FOR PROLUCT REL WITHIN 14 DAYS. SEE STORE FOR

*CUSTONER CARE NUMBER 1-877-76% *** petro.ca ***
Paul Pontarini Store Har How did we do?
HETROSURVEY.CA for
\$1000 IN FREE 9K0CERIE:
Your code: 2B51895
05/21/2015
deli 312 à † e to ... al ui ars 0286 12:40 52 53 70

metro

DELI F2 SANDW.COMBG RF	4.49
SUBTOTAL	4.49
4.49 RED (5.000)% 4.49 PFT (8.000)%	0.22
T FIT A L ROWDED TOTAL	5.07 -0.02 5.05
CASH CHANGE DUE Total number of items sold =	0 - 5.25 1 - 2 0
RETAIN RECEIPT FOR PRODUCT RE WITHIN 14 DAYS. SEE STORE FOR	TURN DETAILS:
#CUSTOHER CARE NUMBER 1 8/7-763 *** hetro.ca *** Paul Pontarini,Store Manager How did we do? Tell us at	
METROSURVEY.CA for a chance t s1000 IN FREE GROCERIES. Honthly Your code: 476189321F3D900 06/02/2015	uinners
	2 53 4661

RECEIPT	
DEVICE.	glinton Ctr Paystation 3 36/15 04:469
	078368 06/15 07:089 06/15 04:48P 000 09:38 000 02:40
PALD: TAX FREE V.A.T. 17%;	CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30
CRSH PAM ENTS:	CAD20.000

IN ROOM DINING 175 WYNFORD DRIVE TORONTO, ONTARIO M3C 1J3

GST # R - 870011962

SRV 94 TABLE 1656/1 TIME 18:15

NOTO KEA

1 JERK CHK SANDWCH 16,00 1 DELIVERY CHARGE 3.00 1 MILK 2.95 HST 3.22

GRATUITY 15%

2.84

NET SALES

21.95 GRAND TOTAL

28,01

056 TIPS 4.00

TOTAL 32.01

PRINT NAME

SIGNATURES..... *** GRATULTY INCLUDED IN BILL *** 6/2/15 GUEST 1 NUMBER 812851

Store #100752 (416)483-7340 E80E HST# R105216170

F2 SANDW.COMBO 4.49 4.49 SUBTOTAL 4,49 RED (5.000)% 4,49 PFT (8,000)% 0.27 0.36 5.07 TOTAL ROUNDED -0.02 ROUNDED TOTAL 5.05 5.10 CHANGE DUE
Total number of items sold = 0.05

RETAIN RECEIPT FOR PRODUCT RETURN WITHIN 14 DAYS. SEE STORE FOR DETRILS:

CUSTONER CARE NUMBER 1-877-763-7374 *** Metro.ca ***

P.B. Yonge/Eglinton

2300 Yonge Street Toronto, Ontario Tel: (416) 485-1244 Check #: 1429057

Server: Brenda L Date: 06/03/2015 Table: 142 -2 Time: 13:54

Client: 2

IT THE BUILDER SECTIONS IN THE

1 Pop Jumbo ClubHse

CUB TOTALS HST

E WE S SWE

TOTAL: 6.48

PLEASE PAY YOUR SERVER

Pickle barrel Yange a Eglinton offers DELIVERY Please call (410)485-7279

COME AND ENJOY OUR BREAKFAST SPECIAL LOP ONLY \$5.99 Mon-Sun (9-Madeam)

SERVICE SERVICE F. 1876 . . .

HST #869149484

DEVICE

PARKING DURATION:

SHORT TERM

V.A.T. 13%: CASH PAYMENTS:

Yonge & Eglinton Ctr Paystation 3 02/07/15 05:20P

088005

02/07/15 07:03A

02/07/15 05:23P N: 000 10:16

RECEIPT (DUPLICATE) CAR PARK: Yonge & Eglinton Ctr DEVICE: Paystation 3 PAID: 03/05/15 02:48P PAID: SHORT TERM 93/06/15 07:00A ENTRY: EXIT: 63/06/15 02:50P N: 060 07:47 PARKING DURATION: CHARGED DURATION: 200 02:40 PAID: CAD20.00 TAX FREE CAD17.70

CAD2.38

[AD20.00

V.A.T. 13% :

CASH PAYMENTS:

DEVICE Paystation 3 84/86/15 82:43P SHORT TEIM ENTRY 04/06/15 07:08A 04/06/15 02:43P EXIT PARKING LURATION: 000 02:40 CAD20.00 V.A.T. 1.7 1 CAD2.30 CASH PAY ENTS: CAD20.00

Yonge & Eglinton Ctr Paystation 3 DEVICE PAID: SHORT TERM 30/06/15 07:06A 30/06/15 05:21P ENTRY: EXIT PARKING DURATION: CHARGED DURATION: 0000 02:40 CAD28.88 V.A.T. 13% I CAD28.00 CASH PRYMENTS:

IN ROOM DINING 175 WYNFORD DRIVE TORONTO, ONTARIO M3C 1J3 GST # R = 870011962 SRV 94 TABLE 1656/1 TIME 18:31 VOID KEY 1 BISTRO BURGER 16.00 3.00 1 DELIVERY CHARGE 2.95 1 MILK HST 3,22 **GRATUITY 15%** 2,84 NET SALES 21.95 GRAND TOTAL 28 01 -6. TIPS. ... 5.00 TOTAL . 33.01

MS	
IN ROOM DINING 175 WYNFORD DRIVE TORONTO, ONTARIO M3C 1J3 GST # R - 870011962 SRV 94 TABLE 1206/1 TI	IME 18:33
1 BISTRO BURGER 1 DIET COKE 1 CHEESE CAKE 1 DELIVERY CHARGE 1 MILK HST GGATUITY 15%	16.00 2.95 8.00 3.00 2.95 3.82 4.48
NET SALES 32.90 GRAND TOTAL	41.20
ROOM NO. 206TIPS	00
TOTAL 4.6: a	20

PRINT NAME.....

SIGNATURES....

*** GRATUITY INCLUDED IN BILL ***

6/30/15 GUEST 1 NUMBER 815762 REPRINT

RECEIPT Yonge & Eglinton Ctr Paystation 3 CAR PARKI DEVICE 03/07/15 11:24A PAIDi 088244 SHORT TERM 03/07/15 07:08A 03/07/15 11:28A 000 04:16 ENTRY PARKING DURATION CHARGED DURATION: CAD20.00 TAX FREE CAD17,70 V.A.T. 13% i CAD20.00 CASH PAYMENTS:

PRINT NAME.....

SIGNATURES.....

*** GRATUITY INCLUDED IN BILL ***

6/3/15 GUEST 1 NUMBER 813009 REPRINT

Store %100752 (416)483-7340 E&DE HST# R105216170

DELI F2 SANDW.COMBO	RF 4.49
SUBTOTAL	4.49
4.49 RED (5.000)% 4.49 PFT (8.000)%	0.22 0.36
TOTAL ROUNDED ROUNDED TOTAL	5 . 0 7 -0.02 5.05
CASH CHANGE DUE Total number of items sold =	0 - 95

RETAIN RECEIPT FOR PRODUCT RETURN WITHIN 14 DAYS. SEE STORE FOR DETAILS.

CUSTOMER CARE NUMBER 1-877-763-7374

*** metro.co ***

Paul Pontarini, Store Hanager

How did we do? Tell us at

HETROSUREY.CA for a chance to win

\$1000 IN FREE GROCERIES. Monthly winners

Your code: 90618930832090383

06/30/2015

deli 308 100752 53 9483

metro

Store #100752 (416)483+7340 E&0E HST# R105216170

DELI F2 SANDH.COMBO	RF 4.49
SUBTOTAL	4.49
4.49 RED (5.000)% 4.49 PFT (8.000)%	0.22 0.36
TOTAL ROUNDED ROUNDED TOTAL	5 0 7 -0.02 5.05
CASH CHANGE DUE Total number of items sold =	0 0 5 1
RETAIN RECEIPT FOR PRODU NITHIN 14 DAYS. SEE STORE	
*CUSTOMER CARE NUMBER 1-87 *** netro.ca ***	
Paul Pontarini,Store Manager How did we do? Tell METROSURVEY.CA for a cha	us at nce to vin
\$1000 IN FREE GROCERIES. Mo	

Your code: 9471893205C5900B2 07/02/2015 12:58 PM

308

100752 53 9754

PLC	RIS
IN ROOM DINING 175 WYNFORD DRIVE TORONTO, ONTARIO M3C 1J3 GST # R - 870011962 SRV 94 TABLE 1206/1 TIME 18:24	LX ROOM DINING 1/G AYNHORD DRIVE TORONTO, ONTARIO M3C 1J3 655 870011962
SRV 94 TABLE 1206/1 TIME 18:34 VOID KEY	SRV 25 [96/1 TIME 20:22 VOID 6
1 FISH AND CHIPS 19.00 1 DELIVERY CHARGE 3.00 1 MILK 2.95 HST 3.67 GRATUITY 15% 3.29	1 ROAST CHICK 23.00 1 MILK 2.95 HST 3.88 GRATUITY 15% 3.89
NET SALES 24.95 GRAND TOTAL 31.91	NET SALES 25.95 GRAND TOTAL 33.72
ROOM NO. 206TIPS . 4.00	ROUM NO. 206. TIPS. 11.00
TOTAL. 35.9/	TOTAL 37.72
PRINT NAME	PRINT NAME
SIGNATURES *** GRATUITY INCLUDED IN BILL *** 7/2/15 GUEST 1 NUMBER 815864	SIGNATURES *** GRATUITY INCLUDED IN BILL *** 7/1/15 GUEST 1 NUMBER 815819 REPRINT

R/2	
A ROOM DINING 173 AYRFORD DRIVE TORONTO, ONTARIO M3C 1J3 CRM R70011962 SRV R70012	ME 20:22
1 ROAST CHICKIR 1 MILK HST GRATUITY 15%	23.00 2.95 3.88 3.89
NET SALER 25.95 GRAND TOTAL	33.72
ROUM NO 206.TIPS7.	<i>Ο</i> υ
TOTAL3.7.	72
PRINT NAME	



File # EB-	2014-0101		Process:	Oshawa PU	IC 2016 CIR Rates	
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundation	on	Service Pro	vider Name: _	David MacIntosh	- ->:
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar		Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience	
	Legal Counsel				16	
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst	☐ ✓		_	Hourly Rate: \$290	
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	hed ided within previous		arged (enter %): 6.5%	

	CV provi										
Statement of Fees Being Claimed											
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total		
Pre-hearing Conference											
Preparation	0.75	\$	290.00	\$	217.50	\$	14.14	\$	231.64		
Attendance	3.25	\$	290.00	\$	942.50	\$	61.26	\$	1,003.76		
Technical Conference											
Preparation	0.50	\$	290.00	\$	145.00	\$	9.43	\$	154.43		
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$		\$	-	\$	351		
Interrogatories											
Preparation	5.25	\$	290.00	\$	1,522.50	\$	98.96	\$	1,621.46		
Responses	1.00	\$	290.00	\$	290.00	\$	18.85	\$	308.85		
Issues Conference											
Preparation	0.25	\$	290.00	\$	72.50	\$	4.71	\$	77.21		
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	5 5 3	\$		\$	0.5		
ADR - Settlement Conference											
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$		\$	발	\$	2 ≢3		
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	t = 0	\$	4	\$	(#)		
Proposal Preparation	0.25	\$	290.00	\$	72.50	\$	4.71	\$	77.21		
Argument											
Preparation	4.50	\$	290.00	\$	1,305.00	\$	84.83	\$	1,389.83		
Oral Hearing											
Preparation	1.50	\$	290.00	\$	435.00	\$	28.28	\$	463.28		
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$:=:	\$	i n	\$	\$.		
Other Conferences											
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	<u>a</u>	\$	741		
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	7€:		
Case Management	1.75	_	170.00	\$	297.50	\$	19.34	\$	316.84		
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	5,300.00	\$	344.50	\$	5,644.50		



File # EB-	2014-0101	Process: Oshawa	PUC 2016 CIR Rates	
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundati	Service Provider Name:	David MacIntosh	

		Net Cost		HST	Total	
Scanning/Photocopy					\$ -	
Printing	\$	173.67	\$	11.29	\$	184.96
Courier					\$	22
Telephone/Fax					\$)±
Transcripts					\$	
Travel: Air					\$	÷
Travel: Car					\$	72
Travel: Rail					\$	
Travel (Other):					\$) = :
Parking					\$:#:
Taxi					\$	· ·
Accommodation					\$	72
Meals					\$	245
Other:					\$: * :
Other:					\$	3=
Other:					\$	<u> </u>
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	 \$	173.67	\$	11.29	\$	184.96

Time Sheet for D. MacIntosh

Board File: EB-2014-0101 Oshawa PUC 2015 CIR Rates

Summary:	Hours
Preparation	17.25
Attend. Tech.	0.00
Attend. ADR	0.00
Attend. Hearing	0.00
Argument Prep.	0.00
Case Mngt. (CM)	1.75
Total	19.00

Date	Hours	Note
25-Aug-14	0.75	Prepare for Stakeholder Meeting
25-Aug-14	3.25	Attend Stakeholder Meeting Hosted by Phil Martin, Oshawa VP
24-Dec-14	0.75	Review Request For Interim Rates, Emails
14-Feb-15	1.75	Review Prefiled Evidence
14-Feb-15	0.50	Draft Notice of Intervention
24-Feb-15	0.50	Many Emails In Respect of Expedited Discovery & Settlement Process
26-Feb-15	0.50	Many Emails In Respect of Expedited Discovery & Settlement Process
14-Apr-15	1.25	Review Evidence and Draft Interrogatories
04-May-15	0.50	Draft Letter to Board In Respect of Technical Conference Scheduling
20-May-15	1.00	Review Interrogatory Responses
01-Jun-15	0.25	Review Procedural Order No. 3, Issues List Decision
04-Jun-15	0.25	Discussion With Randy Aiken - Outcome of Settlement Conference
22-Jun-15	0.25	Many Emails In Respect of Hearing Schedule
27-Jun-15	1.25	Prepare Energy Probe Hearing Compendium
10-Jul-15	1.25	Review of Hearing Transcripts
23-Jul-15	1.75	Draft Argument
24-Jul-15	0.50	Finalize Argument
14-Nov-15	0.50	Review Decision and Order
01-Dec-15	0.50	Draft Comments Draft Rate Order
Total	17.25	Preparation

Date	Hours	Note
14-Feb-15	0.50	CM - File Intervention Letter & Notice.
15-Apr-15	0.25	CM - File Interrogatories
04-May-15	0.25	CM - File Letter to Board Re Technical Conference Scheduling
27-Jun-15	0.25	CM - File Energy Probe Hearing Compendium
24-Jul-15	0.25	CM - File Final Argument
23-Dec-15	0.25	CM - File Energy Probe Comments re Draft Rate Order
Total	1.75	Case Management

Fed 歌Office。 绘

FedEx Office is your destination for printing and shipping.

459 Bloor Street West Toronto, ON M5S 1X9 Tel: (416) 928-0110 GST # R102846524

7:26:28 PM EST Customer: David MacIntosh 6/29/2015 Team Member: Rory H.

SALE

Oty 15 173,67	375 @ 0.4410 T 0.49	15 @ 0.0273 T	375 @ 0.0090 T	1 @ 4.5000 T 5.00	11 58
photocopy	CLR 1S Copy/Print 000173 Reg. Price	Machine Stapling 000078 Red Price	Drill Per Sheet 000371 Red Price	Drilling Setup 000372 Reg. Price	Price per piece

Figure	wly 15	0.07
CLR 1S Copy/Print 000173 Reg. Price	375 @ 0.49	0,4410
Machine Stapling 000078 Reg. Price	15. 15.00 10.00	0.0273
Drill Per Sheet 000371 Rea. Price	375 @ 0 01	0,0090
Drilling Setup 000372 Reg. Price	5.00	4.5000
Price per piece Regular Total Discounts	11,58 192,95 19,28	
Sub-Total		173.67

173,67 22.58	00.00	196.25	196.25
Sub-Total HST	Deposit	Total	Debit Card (M)

KINKO'S H3402H 459 BLOOR ST WEST TORONTO, ON MSS1X9 416-928-0110

Merchant ID: 040080097181 Term ID: 100

Ref 41: 032

Sale

XXXXXXXXXXX8689

Entry Method: CHIP

Acct Type: Chequing 06/29/15

Appr Code: 005272 Batch#: 000039

Inv #: 000032

Apprvd

Irace: 00841651 Retrieval Ref.#: 00000014

136.25

No signature required, Verified by PIN.
Your account will be debited with the
above amount.
Retain this copy for statement
verification.

Application Label: INTERAC AID: A0000002771010 TVR: 80 80 00 80 00 TSI: 68 00

Customer Copy