
David I. Poch Barrister                                            tel. (613) 264-0055   fax (613) 264-2878 

 
 

 
1649 Old Brooke Road, Maberly, Ontario K0H 2B0                                  e-mail: dpoch@eelaw.ca 
 

2 November 2015 
 
Ontario Energy Board  
Attn: Ms Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary 
2300 Yonge St., 27th Floor 
Toronto, ON, M4P 1E4    By electronic filing and mail 
 
Dear Ms Walli: 
 

Re: EB-2015-0029 & EB-2015-0049 Gas DSM – GEC Cost Claim 
 
Enclosed please find GEC’s costs claim in the above-noted matters.  Based on the dockets and 
advice of our experts GEC’s claim has been apportioned between the two companies.  Please 
note that the fees and disbursements of Mr. Chernick and his Resource Insight Inc. colleagues 
have been split 50:50 as his work addressed common issues or Enbridge distribution avoided 
costs which were utilized by both Enbridge and Union. 
 
We expect that GEC’s claim will be significantly larger than other parties due to GEC’s extensive 
role in this matter and we offer the following further explanation.  DSM is GEC’s primary focus 
in its OEB interventions. GEC played a lead role in this proceeding and several consumer group 
intervenors have indicated that they rely on GEC’s experts to inform their positions in DSM 
proceedings. This case addressed six year DSM plans for both gas utilities.  It was the first case 
to consider the Board’s new DSM guidelines. GEC’s pre-filed evidence was 111 pages in length 
and covered many aspects of the hearing.  Apart from GEC, only Board Staff submitted 
extensive evidence.  GEC cooperated with other parties many of whom indicated their reliance 
on our expert reports to avoid the need for separate expert evidence or to support their 
arguments.  GEC submitted 128 interrogatory questions (not including sub-questions), we 
responded to 86 interrogatories (not including subparts) and 15 transcript undertakings. Each 
of our witnesses was required to attend for extensive cross examination over the course of 
three days.  Our 71 page written argument addressed 10 of the Board’s 13 listed topics and 
included 134 footnoted citations.   
 
Should the Board require any further information we would be pleased to assist. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
 
David Poch 
Cc: EGDI & Union Gas 





Party: GEC

EGDI

Name Fees Disb HST Totals

David Poch $51,711.00 $611.83 $6,799.19

Kai Millyard $37,383.00 $4,859.79

Chris Neme (EFG) $55,275.00 $1,303.94

Jim Grevatt (EFG) $5,775.00

Richard Faesy (EFG) $82.50

Paul Chernick (RII) $56,677.50 $3,242.16

Adam Auster (RII) $977.50

Susan Geller (RII) $13,488.75

Simon Metcalf (RII) $3,442.50

Subtotals $224,812.75 $5,157.93 $11,658.98 $241,629.66

UNION

Name Fees Disb HST Totals

David Poch $49,962.00 $611.83 $6,571.82

Kai Millyard $35,751.00 $4,647.63

Chris Neme (EFG) $53,047.50 $1,303.94

Jim Grevatt (EFG) $5,775.00

Jonathan Willson (EFG) $6,205.00

Paul Chernick (RII) $56,677.50 $3,242.16

Adam Auster (RII) $977.50

Susan Geller (RII) $13,488.75

Simon Metcalf (RII) $3,442.50

Subtotals $225,326.75 $5,157.93 $11,219.45 $241,704.13

GRAND TOTALS $450,139.50 $10,315.86 $22,878.43 $483,333.79

Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

                                Process EB-2015-0049 & 0029

Page 2 of 2



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB- Process: 

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly 

rate
Subtotal HST

83.60 $330.00 $27,588.00 $3,586.44

8.25 $330.00 $2,722.50 $353.93

$330.00 $0.00 $0.00

25.80 $330.00 $8,514.00 $1,106.82

33.75 $330.00 $11,137.50 $1,447.88

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$49,962.00 $6,495.06

HST

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$6.73

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$36.40

$13.26

Travel (Other): $0.00

included

$1.15

$0.00

$19.22

$0.00

$76.76

Net Cost

Parking $21.40

$10.00

$0.00

Total

$58.48

Taxi or Airport Limo

$21.40

Accommodation

$167.05

$0.00

$688.59

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

$147.83

$611.83

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$31,174.44Preparation

Attendance - Technical Conference

Attendance - Settlement Conference

Total

$3,076.43

$0.00

Photocopies

Attendance - Oral Hearing

Argument

$9,620.82

$12,585.38

$0.00Case Management

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone

Postage   

$8.85

$51.75

Transcripts

$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

$56,457.06

$316.40

$115.26$102.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$280.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

2015-0029 UNION GAS 2015-20 DSM

GEC David Poch

Completed Years 

Practising/Years of relevant 

experience

35

1 of 1



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB- Process: 

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly 

rate
Subtotal HST

86.90 $330.00 $28,677.00 $3,728.01

10.25 $330.00 $3,382.50 $439.73

$330.00 $0.00 $0.00

25.80 $330.00 $8,514.00 $1,106.82

33.75 $330.00 $11,137.50 $1,447.88

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$51,711.00 $6,722.43

HST

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$6.73

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$36.40

$13.26

Travel (Other): $0.00

included

$1.15

$0.00

$19.22

$0.00

$76.76

Net Cost

Parking $21.40

$10.00

$0.00

Total

$58.48

Taxi or Airport Limo

$21.40

Accommodation

$167.05

$0.00

$688.59

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

$147.83

$611.83

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$32,405.01Preparation

Attendance - Technical Conference

Attendance - Settlement Conference

Total

$3,822.23

$0.00

Photocopies

Attendance - Oral Hearing

Argument

$9,620.82

$12,585.38

$0.00Case Management

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone

Postage   

$8.85

$51.75

Transcripts

$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

$58,433.43

$316.40

$115.26$102.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$280.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

2015-0049 EGDI 2015-20 DSM

GEC David Poch

Completed Years 

Practising/Years of relevant 

experience

35

1 of 1



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB‐ Process: 

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly 

rate
Subtotal HST

110.30 $170.00 $18,751.00 $2,437.63

11.30 $170.00 $1,921.00 $249.73

$0.00 $0.00

22.90 $170.00 $3,893.00 $506.09

12.90 $170.00 $2,193.00 $285.09

52.90 $170.00 $8,993.00 $1,169.09

$35,751.00 $4,647.63

HST

25

EB‐2015‐0029 Union Gas 6 Year DSM Plan

Green Energy Coalition Kai Millyard

Completed Years 

Practising/Years of relevant 

experience

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

$40,398.63

Attendance ‐ Oral Hearing

Argument

$4,399.09

$2,478.09

$10,162.09Case Management

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$21,188.63Preparation

Attendance ‐ Technical Conference

Attendance ‐ Settlement Conference

Total

$2,170.73

$0.00

TotalNet Cost HST

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Travel (Other): $0.00

included

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

$0.00

$0.00

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone

Postage   

Transcripts

Photocopies

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

$0.00

Parking $0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Total

$0.00

Taxi or Airport Limo

Accommodation

Net Cost

1 of 1



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB‐ Process: 

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly 

rate
Subtotal HST

112.80 $170.00 $19,176.00 $2,492.88

11.30 $170.00 $1,921.00 $249.73

$0.00 $0.00

26.00 $170.00 $4,420.00 $574.60

12.90 $170.00 $2,193.00 $285.09

56.90 $170.00 $9,673.00 $1,257.49

$37,383.00 $4,859.79

HST

25

EB‐2015‐0049 Enbridge 6 Year DSM Plan

Green Energy Coalition Kai Millyard

Completed Years 

Practising/Years of relevant 

experience

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

$42,242.79

Attendance ‐ Oral Hearing

Argument

$4,994.60

$2,478.09

$10,930.49Case Management

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$21,668.88Preparation

Attendance ‐ Technical Conference

Attendance ‐ Settlement Conference

Total

$2,170.73

$0.00

TotalNet Cost HST

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Travel (Other): $0.00

included

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

$0.00

$0.00

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone

Postage   

Transcripts

Photocopies

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

$0.00

Parking $0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Total

$0.00

Taxi or Airport Limo

Accommodation

Net Cost

1 of 1



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- Process:

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly

rate
Subtotal HST

152.25 $330.00 $50,242.50 $0.00

5.00 $330.00 $1,650.00 $0.00

$330.00 $0.00 $0.00

6.50 $330.00 $2,145.00 $0.00

3.75 $330.00 $1,237.50 $0.00

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$55,275.00 $0.00

HST

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Travel (Other): $0.00

included

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$659.99

Net Cost

Parking $0.00

$55.38

$514.46

Total

$0.00

Taxi or Airport Limo

Accommodation

$6.00

$47.53

$0.00

$1,303.94

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

$47.53

$1,303.94

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$50,242.50Preparation

Attendance - Technical Conference

Attendance - Settlement Conference

Total

$1,650.00

$0.00

Photocopies

Attendance - Oral Hearing

Argument

$2,145.00

$1,237.50

$0.00Case Management

$514.46

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone

Postage

$55.38

Transcripts

$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

$55,275.00

$20.58

$0.00

subway $6.00

$659.99

$0.00

$20.58

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

29

2015-0049 Enbridge 2015-2020 DSM Plan

Green Energy Coalition Chris Neme

Completed Years

Practising/Years of relevant

experience

3 of 3



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- Process:

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly

rate
Subtotal HST

144.00 $330.00 $47,520.00 $0.00

6.50 $330.00 $2,145.00 $0.00

$330.00 $0.00 $0.00

6.50 $330.00 $2,145.00 $0.00

3.75 $330.00 $1,237.50 $0.00

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$53,047.50 $0.00

HST

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Travel (Other): $0.00

included

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

29

2015-0029 Union Gas 2015-2020 DSM Plan

Green Energy Coalition Chris Neme

Completed Years

Practising/Years of relevant

experience

subway $6.00

$659.99

$0.00

$20.58

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

$53,047.50

$20.58

$0.00

$514.46

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone

Postage

$55.38

Transcripts

Photocopies

Attendance - Oral Hearing

Argument

$2,145.00

$1,237.50

$0.00Case Management

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$47,520.00Preparation

Attendance - Technical Conference

Attendance - Settlement Conference

Total

$2,145.00

$0.00

$47.53

$0.00

$1,303.94

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

$47.53

$1,303.94

Parking $0.00

$55.38

$514.46

Total

$0.00

Taxi or Airport Limo

Accommodation

$6.00

$659.99

Net Cost

3 of 3



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- Process:

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly

rate
Subtotal HST

17.50 $330.00 $5,775.00 $0.00

$330.00 $0.00 $0.00

$330.00 $0.00 $0.00

$330.00 $0.00 $0.00

$330.00 $0.00 $0.00

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$5,775.00 $0.00

HST

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Travel (Other): $0.00

included

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

25

2015-0049 Enbridge 2015-2020 DSM Plan

Green Energy Coalition Jim Grevatt

Completed Years

Practising/Years of relevant

experience

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

$5,775.00

$0.00

$0.00

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone

Postage

Transcripts

Photocopies

Attendance - Oral Hearing

Argument

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00Case Management

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$5,775.00Preparation

Attendance - Technical Conference

Attendance - Settlement Conference

Total

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

$0.00

Parking $0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Total

$0.00

Taxi or Airport Limo

Accommodation

Net Cost

3 of 3



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- Process:

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly

rate
Subtotal HST

17.50 $330.00 $5,775.00 $0.00

$330.00 $0.00 $0.00

$330.00 $0.00 $0.00

$330.00 $0.00 $0.00

$330.00 $0.00 $0.00

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$5,775.00 $0.00

HST

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Travel (Other): $0.00

included

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Net Cost

Parking $0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Total

$0.00

Taxi or Airport Limo

Accommodation

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

$0.00

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$5,775.00Preparation

Attendance - Technical Conference

Attendance - Settlement Conference

Total

$0.00

$0.00

Photocopies

Attendance - Oral Hearing

Argument

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00Case Management

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone

Postage

Transcripts

$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

$5,775.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

25

2015-0029 Union Gas 2015-2020 DSM Plan

Green Energy Coalition Jim Grevatt

Completed Years

Practising/Years of relevant

experience

3 of 3

David
Line



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- Process:

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly

rate
Subtotal HST

0.25 $330.00 $82.50 $0.00

$330.00 $0.00 $0.00

$330.00 $0.00 $0.00

$330.00 $0.00 $0.00

$330.00 $0.00 $0.00

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$82.50 $0.00

HST

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Travel (Other): $0.00

included

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Net Cost

Parking $0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Total

$0.00

Taxi or Airport Limo

Accommodation

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

$0.00

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$82.50Preparation

Attendance - Technical Conference

Attendance - Settlement Conference

Total

$0.00

$0.00

Photocopies

Attendance - Oral Hearing

Argument

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00Case Management

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone

Postage

Transcripts

$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

$82.50

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

29

2015-0049 Enbridge 2015-2020 DSM Plan

Green Energy Coalition Richard Faesy

Completed Years

Practising/Years of relevant

experience

3 of 3



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- Process:

Party: Name:

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:

Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Hours
Hourly

rate
Subtotal HST

36.50 $170.00 $6,205.00 $0.00

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00

$6,205.00 $0.00

HST

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Travel (Other): $0.00

included

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Net Cost

Parking $0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Total

$0.00

Taxi or Airport Limo

Accommodation

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

$0.00

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

$6,205.00Preparation

Attendance - Technical Conference

Attendance - Settlement Conference

Total

$0.00

$0.00

Photocopies

Attendance - Oral Hearing

Argument

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00Case Management

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone

Postage

Transcripts

$0.00

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

$6,205.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

1

2015-0029 Union Gas 2015-2020 DSM Plan

Green Energy Coalition Jonathan Willson

Completed Years

Practising/Years of relevant

experience

3 of 3

David
Line



David
Line



David
Line



David
Line



David
Line



David I. Poch Barrister                                            tel. (613) 264-0055   fax (613) 264-2878 

 
 

 
1649 Old Brooke Road, Maberly, Ontario K0H 2B0                                  e-mail: dpoch@eelaw.ca 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

ACCOUNT 

 

 

Date: 28 October 2015 

 

To:  GEC 

 

Re:  EB-2015-0029 and 0049  

 

 

For services rendered on behalf of GEC in this matter (see dockets attached)    

 

Fees at OEB tariff for purposes of costs request: 

 

Fees  308.1 hrs. @ $330.00 (see docket) $101,673.00 

Disbursements (see summary)    $1,223.66 

Subtotal       $102,896.66 

HST        $13376.57 

Total Costs       $116,273.23 

 

This is my account E&OE 

 

 

 

 

David Poch 

 

HST# 11020 1506 
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Time Docket for David Poch: EB-2015-0029 & 0049 - Union & Enbridge 2015-20 DSM

Date Description of work prep hrg tech arg

EGD 

prep

EGD 

TC

Union 

Prep

Union 

TC

2015-April 22 Confer and file intervention 0.5

May 11

Skim plans, review draft IRS to EGDI, 

correspond Neme 1.75

13

review order, confer experts, correspond other 

parties and Board re timing, prep. 1.5

18 correspond re evidence and witnesses 0.2

23

correspond Neme and Chernick re scope of 

evidence 0.25

25

correspond experts, confer Ian Mondrow re 

industrial program 0.3

27 confer Millyard and Neme re issues/Irs 0.4

28 review draft Irs and correspond  re same 0.2

June 1 review draft Irs 0.6

2 review and finalize Irs 1

3

review other party Irs, correspond experts and 

OEB 1.2

9

review PO2 and correspond experts re possibe 

solutions for conflicts 0.25

10 

correspond and confer Board staff re 

scheduling, confer experts re scope of 

evidence, correspond Board 1.2

15

confer ED re need for separate evidence. 

Confer experts re free ridership issues 0.5

22

review Brd correspondence, confer Millyard re: 

next steps and key issues 0.25

24

initial review of IRRs and correspond/confer 

experts re same and re process issues 4

25 confer re IR refusals and clarifications needed 1.2

26 " 0.2

July 1 prep for tech conf 3.5

2

prep for TC and correspond re undertaking, 

confer cousel for EGD 1.5 2.5



A B C D E F G H I J

Time Docket for David Poch: EB-2015-0029 & 0049 - Union & Enbridge 2015-20 DSM

Date Description of work prep hrg tech arg

EGD 

prep

EGD 

TC

Union 

Prep

Union 

TC

6 prep, attend tech conf 2.3 6.5

7 prep, attend tech conf 1.5 4.5

10 t/c experts 1.25

15 review correspondence, confer Millyard 2.25

17 prep 0.75

20 prep - correspond experts 0.5

21

confer re possible delay in evidence, 

correspond re DRIPE and AC 0.5

22

correspond and confer experts - review initial 

partial drafts evidence of CN - correspond re 

Chernick heath delay, prep 3.5

23

review partial drafts, confer experts, 

correspond Board, prep 2.5

24 review partial draft, confer experts 0.75

25 correspondence re preliminary results 0.25

26 comments on draft 1.5

27

review further draft, confer KM & CN and 

Chernick 1.75

28

review and comment on Neme and Chernick 

drafts 3.25

29 review CN final and initial PLC draft 2.5

30

review PLC next draft and confer with KM and 

PLC re same - review further draft 4.25

31

review penultimate draft of PLC evidence, 

confer re possible changes, review final and 

submit 2.25

Aug 3

review correspondence, review OSEA evid., 

further review of Synapse evid., correspond 

experts re next steps 1.75

4

further review of Synapse evid., draft and 

review Irs to Synapse and OSEA, prep 2.5

5 review Irs and confer experts and KM 1.5

6 comment on draft IRRS, prep cross 4.5



A B C D E F G H I J

Time Docket for David Poch: EB-2015-0029 & 0049 - Union & Enbridge 2015-20 DSM

Date Description of work prep hrg tech arg

EGD 

prep

EGD 

TC

Union 

Prep

Union 

TC

7 " 3.75

8 review correspondence re IRRs 0.5

9 review draft IRRS 2.25

10 review draft IRRs and prep cross 8.5

11 " 3.5

12 prep cross, review IRRs, correspond 6.25

13 prep, confer other parties 6.5

14 prep 6.25

15 prep 2.5

17 mt Chernick, mt Millyard, attend tech conf, prep 5.5 4.25

18 mt other counsel, attend TC, prep, Mt KM 7.5 3.25

19 confer KM, PLC other counsel, attend, prep 5 6.5

20 " 4.25 6

21 prep 9.25

22 prep cross 3

24 mt Km, prep, attend 3 6

25 prep, attend, teleconference witnesses 7.75 3.6

26 prep, attend 4.4 6

27 prep attend 1.75 6.5

31 meet and prep experts, prep, attend 6 2.5

Sep. 1 prep cross of Synapse, attend 1 6

2

prep re-exam, attend, confer and prep re 

Synapse 2.25 6

3 prep, attend 0.25 0.75

4

review transcripts, attend remotely, start draft 

outline for arg 1 1.75 0.75

5 review draft TU responses, review transcript 0.75 0.25

7 draft arg 3.75

8 draft arg 6.75

9 draft arg 8.5

10 draft arg 6.25

11 company args,  draft arg 6.5



A B C D E F G H I J

Time Docket for David Poch: EB-2015-0029 & 0049 - Union & Enbridge 2015-20 DSM

Date Description of work prep hrg tech arg

EGD 

prep

EGD 

TC

Union 

Prep

Union 

TC

16 confer KM 0.2

17 draft arg, confer CN and KM 3.25

19 draft arg 0.5

21 draft arg 6.5

22 draft arg 7

24 teleconference CN and KM, draft arg 5.75

25 confer CN and KM,  draft arg 3.75

30 correspond clients re argument, finalize arg 7

Oct. 2

correspondence re argument with ED et al, 

final edits 0.8

3 review arguments and report 1.3

26 review LDC arguments and report 1.75

164.2 51.6 7.5 67.5 4.8 6.5 1.5 4.5

Total hours 308.1

UNION 82.1 25.8 3.75 33.75 1.5 4.5

ENBRIDGE 82.1 25.8 3.75 33.75 4.8 6.5



Disbursements David Poch - GEC File: EB-2015-0029 & 0049 - Union & Enbridge 2015-20 DSM

excl HST unless noted

Category Date Description Amount Net of GST Union EGDI

Air

Train Aug. 16-21 Kingston-Tor ret (note bus class on 2nd leg $204 204 102 102

was cheaper than economy)

Mileage @.4 July 5-8 Maberly-Tor ret.: 600km 240

Aug 16-21 Maberly - Kingston ret 200 k 80

Aug 23-Sep 3 Maberly - Toronto 300 k 240

560 560 280 280

Parking Aug. 16-21 at VIA kingston 48.35 42.79 21.4 21.4

incl HST

Taxis/limos Aug 21 to Union Stn 20 17.7 8.85 8.85

incl HST

Accomodation billetted - n/c



Long Distance Jul 28- Aug 27 103.5 103.5 51.75 51.76

Meals (@ max8.75/11.25/20)

incl HST July 7 11.25

Aug. 17 10.11

20

18 8.53

19 9.66

20

20 11.25

20

23 20

24 11.25

20

26 11.25

27 11.25

20

29 20

30 20

31 20

sep 1 11.25

20

2 11.25

20

3 7.05

subtotal 334.1 295.66 147.83 147.83

TOTAL 1223.65

EGDI 611.83

UNION 611.83



























Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Ontario Energy Board Invoice #

Attention: GEC Invoice Date:

David Poch Invoice Period: April 1-30, 2015

Job Name:

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours

Chris Neme 1023 00 00 $330 CAD 5.00

Subtotal Labor only 5.00

Item Job Code Phase Project Miles Rate

Chris Neme 1023 00 00 - 0.575$

Chris Neme 1023 00 00

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE

Revised Invoice

1430

July 12, 2015

Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1430

Job Code: 1023

Job Name: Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans

Period: April 1-30, 2015

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

04/28/15 00 00 1.50 review filed plan

04/29/15 00 00 0.50 Review filed plan, discuss testimony plan w/GEC

04/30/15 00 00 3.00 Review Enbridge filing

5.00

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Ontario Energy Board Invoice #

Attention: GEC Invoice Date:

David Poch Invoice Period: May 1-31, 2015

Job Name:

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours

Chris Neme 1023 00 00 $330 CAD 3.75

Subtotal Labor only 3.75

Item Job Code Phase Project Miles Rate

Chris Neme 1023 00 00 - 0.575$

Chris Neme 1023 00 00

Subtotal Expenses/Mileage only

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE

Revised Invoice

1459

July 12, 2015

Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1459

Job Code: 1023

Job Name: Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans

Period: May 1-31, 2015

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

05/10/15 00 00 2.00 work on Enbridge interrogatories

05/11/15 00 00 1.00 work on Enbridge interrogatories

05/13/15 00 00 0.75 Finalize Enbridge interogatories

3.75

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Ontario Energy Board Invoice #

Attention: GEC Invoice Date:

David Poch Invoice Period: June 1-30, 2015

Job Name:

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours Amount

Chris Neme 1023 00 00 $330 CAD 22.00 7,260.00$ CAD

Jim Grevatt 1023 00 00 $330 CAD 1.50 495.00$ CAD

-$ CAD

-$ CAD

-$ CAD

Subtotal Labor only 23.50 7,755.00$

Item Job Code Phase Project Miles Rate Amount

Chris Neme 1023 00 00 - 0.575$ -$ CAD

Chris Neme 1023 00 00 -$ CAD

-$ CAD

Subtotal Expenses/Mileage only -$ CAD

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE 7,755.00$ CAD

Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans

Invoice

1491

July 12, 2015



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1491

Job Code: 1023

Job Name: Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans

Period: June 1-30, 2015

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

06/09/15 00 00 0.75 develop GEC issues list for testimony, call w/Kai

06/17/15 00 00 1.25 research on commercial boiler market

06/23/15 00 00 1.50 Enbridge IR response reviews

06/24/15 00 00 5.50 Enbridge IR response reviews

06/25/15 00 00 4.00 Enbridge IR response reviews

06/26/15 00 00 5.00 Enbridge IR response reviews

06/29/15 00 00 2.00 Develop Tech conf Q's for Enbridge

06/30/15 00 00 2.00 Review IRs, call w/Enbridge

22.00

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1491

Job Code: 1023

Job Name: Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans

Period: June 1-30, 2015

Consultant: Jim Grevatt

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

06/30/15 00 00 1.50 Review T&D issues, call with CN

Total 1.50

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Ontario Energy Board Invoice #

Attention: GEC Invoice Date:

David Poch Invoice Period: July 1-31, 2015

Job Name:

Terms:

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours Amount

Chris Neme 1023 00 00 $330 CAD 68.75 22,687.50$ CAD

Jim Grevatt 1023 00 00 $330 CAD 13.25 4,372.50$ CAD

Richard Faesy 1023 00 00 $330 CAD 0.25 82.50$ CAD

-$ CAD

-$ CAD

Subtotal Labor only 82.25 27,142.50$ CAD

Item Job Code Phase Project Miles Rate Amount

Chris Neme 1023 00 00 - 0.575$ -$ CAD

Chris Neme 1023 00 00 -$ CAD

-$ CAD

Subtotal Expenses/Mileage only -$ CAD

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE 27,142.50$ CAD

Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans

Invoice

1515

August 5, 2015

Net 30 Days



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1515

Job Code: 1023

Job Name: Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans

Period: July 1-31, 2015

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

07/01/15 00 00 2.75 Review evidence, prep for tech conf, communications w/Enbridge

07/02/15 00 00 2.50 Review evidence, prep for tech conf

07/03/15 00 00 3.50 Review evidence, edit Q's for tech conf to send to Enbridge, calls w/Enbridge

07/06/15 00 00 5.50 Enbridge tech conference, incl prep

07/08/15 00 00 3.00 Review evidence, analysis for testimony, draft testimony outline

07/09/15 00 00 3.50 Review evidence, analysis for testimony

07/10/15 00 00 2.25 analysis, GEC strategy discussions

07/13/15 00 00 1.50 analysis, draft testimony

07/14/15 00 00 2.00 analysis, draft testimony

07/15/15 00 00 3.25 analysis, draft testimony

07/17/15 00 00 2.00 analysis, draft testimony

07/19/15 00 00 0.50 analysis, draft testimony

07/20/15 00 00 3.25 analysis, draft testimony

07/21/15 00 00 3.00 analysis, draft testimony

07/22/15 00 00 4.50 analysis, draft testimony

07/23/15 00 00 3.75 analysis, draft testimony

07/24/15 00 00 3.50 analysis, draft testimony

07/25/15 00 00 2.50 analysis, draft testimony

07/26/15 00 00 4.00 analysis, draft testimony

07/27/15 00 00 4.00 analysis, draft testimony

07/28/15 00 00 4.75 analysis, draft testimony

07/29/15 00 00 2.00 edit testimony

07/30/15 00 00 1.25 further analysis of MN utilities

68.75

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1515

Job Code: 1023

Job Name: Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans

Period: July 1-31, 2015

Consultant: Jim Grevatt

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

07/02/15 00 00 0.50 Summary bullets for testimony

07/03/15 00 00 0.50 Summary bullets for testimony

07/06/15 00 00 1.75 Testimony re: T&D

07/07/15 00 00 3.00 Testimony re: T&D

07/08/15 00 00 2.00 Testimony re: T&D

07/20/15 00 00 1.00 Upstream program research

07/21/15 00 00 2.00 Upstream program research

07/22/15 00 00 1.50 Upstream program research

07/27/15 00 00 1.00 Upstream program research

Total 13.25

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1515

Job Code: 1023

Job Name: Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans

Period: July 1-31, 2015

Consultant: Richard Faesy

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

07/22/15 00 00 0.25 Provide VEIC upstream meeting notes from discussion with J. Marin to J. Grevatt.

Total 0.25

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Ontario Energy Board Invoice #

Attention: GEC Invoice Date:

David Poch Invoice Period: August 1-31, 2015

Job Name:

Terms:

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours Amount

Chris Neme 1023 00 00 $330 CAD 48.75 16,087.50$ CAD

Jim Grevatt 1023 00 00 $330 CAD 2.75 907.50$ CAD

-$ CAD

-$ CAD

Subtotal Labor only 51.50 16,995.00$ CAD

Item Job Code Phase Project Miles Rate Amount

Chris Neme 1023 00 00 - 0.575$ -$ CAD

Chris Neme 1023 00 00 -$ CAD

-$ CAD

Subtotal Expenses/Mileage only -$ CAD

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE 16,995.00$ CAD

Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans

Invoice

1540

September 4, 2015

Net 30 Days



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1540

Job Code: 1023

Job Name: Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans

Period: August 1-31, 2015

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

08/04/15 00 00 2.25 Review Staff evidence, draft IRs; review IRs of other parties

08/05/15 00 00 2.75 work on IR responses

08/06/15 00 00 4.50 draft responses to interogatories

08/07/15 00 00 5.75 draft responses to interogatories

08/08/15 00 00 4.50 draft responses to interogatories

08/09/15 00 00 2.75 draft responses to interogatories

08/10/15 00 00 4.75 draft responses to interogatories; work on testimony corrections

08/11/15 00 00 0.50 work on changes to testimony

08/12/15 00 00 2.00 work on revisions to testimony and explanation of changes

08/13/15 00 00 0.75 Assist with prep for cross

08/14/15 00 00 0.75 Review Synapse IR responses, feedback to D.Poch on tech conf follow up

08/25/15 00 00 1.50 Prep for hearing, work on tech conf undertaking

08/26/15 00 00 1.50 read hearing transcripts, prep for cross

08/27/15 00 00 3.25 read hearing transcripts, prep for cross; response to Dr. Higgin tech conf undertaking

08/28/15 00 00 3.50 read hearing transcripts, prep for cross; response to Dr. Higgin tech conf undertaking

08/30/15 00 00 3.00 prep for and travel to stand cross

08/31/15 00 00 4.75 prep for and stand cross on filed evidence

48.75

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1540

Job Code: 1023

Job Name: Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans

Period: August 1-31, 2015

Consultant: Jim Grevatt

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

08/07/15 00 00 2.25 DR responses re: upstream

08/09/15 00 00 0.25 DR responses re: upstream

08/12/15 00 00 0.25 Follow up calls with Energy Solutions re: upstream programs

Total 2.75

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Ontario Energy Board Invoice #

Attention: GEC Invoice Date:

David Poch Invoice Period: September 1-30, 2015

Job Name:

Terms:

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours Amount

Chris Neme 1023 00 00 $330 CAD 19.25 6,352.50$ CAD

Jim Grevatt 1023 00 00 $330 CAD 0.00 -$ CAD

-$ CAD

-$ CAD

Subtotal Labor only 19.25 6,352.50$ CAD

Item Job Code Phase Project Miles Rate Amount

Chris Neme 1023 00 00 - 0.575$ -$ CAD

Chris Neme 1023 00 00 1,341.13$ CAD

-$ CAD

-$ CAD

Subtotal Expenses/Mileage only 1,341.13$ CAD

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE 7,693.63$ CAD

Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans

Invoice

1563

October 22, 2015

Net 30 Days

NOTE: Expenses are 1/2 of amount
incurred; Other 50% shared with

another related project



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1563

Job Code: 1023

Job Name: Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans

Period: September 1-30, 2015

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

09/01/15 00 00 5.00 stand cross (incl prep)

09/02/15 00 00 4.50 stand cross (incl prep)

09/02/15 00 00 0.75 work on undertaking responses

09/03/15 00 00 0.75 Draft responses to SEC, ED, EP undertakings

09/04/15 00 00 3.50 Draft responses to SEC, ED, EP undertakings

09/09/15 00 00 1.00 finalize undertaking responses

09/17/15 00 00 1.50 Review draft argument; discuss w/GEC

09/24/15 00 00 1.50 Review draft argument; discuss w/GEC

09/25/15 00 00 0.75 Review draft argument; discuss w/GEC

19.25

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1563

Job Number: 1023

Job Name: Enbridge 2015-2020 Plans

Period: September 1-30, 2015

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Miles Rate Amount Task Description

08/30/15 00 00 - -$ 31.05$ CAD taxi from Toronto airport to GEC mtg

08/30/15 00 00 - -$ 19.33$ CAD dinner

09/01/15 00 00 - -$ 5.75$ CAD lunch

09/01/15 00 00 - - 33.35$ CAD dinner

08/30/15 00 00 - - 8.76$ CAD lunch on way to Toronto

09/02/15 00 00 - -$ 7.53$ CAD dinner on way home from Toronto

09/02/15 00 00 - - 7.69$ CAD gasoline for rental car

08/30/15 00 00 - -$ 311.62$ CAD plane ticket to Toronto

09/02/15 00 00 - - 177.67$ CAD plane ticket from Toronto to Vermont (ticket
had to be cancelled when hearing ran later

09/02/15 00 00 - -$ 514.46$ CAD 3 nights hotel in Toronto

09/02/15 00 00 - - 170.70$ CAD plane ticket from Toronto to Montreal

09/02/15 00 00 - - 12.89$ CAD car rental from Montreal to Burlington,
Vermont airport

09/02/15 00 00 - - 15.33 CAD taxi from Burlington airport to home

09/01/15 00 00 - - 9.00 CAD taxi from GEC dinner to hotel

09/01/15 00 00 - - 5.00 CAD breakfast

09/02/15 00 00 - - 5.00 CAD breakfast

9/1-9/2/15 00 00 - - 6.00 CAD subway tokens for travel to/from hotel and
OEB hearing room

Total - 1,341.13$ CAD

Expense Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Ontario Energy Board Invoice #

Attention: GEC Invoice Date:

David Poch Invoice Period: April 1-30, 2015

Job Name:

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours

Chris Neme 1024 00 00 $330 CAD 0.50

Subtotal Labor only 0.50

Item Job Code Phase Project Miles Rate

Chris Neme 1024 00 00 - 0.575$

Chris Neme 1024 00 00

Subtotal Expenses/Mileage only

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE

Revised Invoice

1431

July 13, 2015

Union 2015-2020 Plans



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1431

Job Code: 1024

Job Name: Union 2015-2020 Plans

Period: April 1-30, 2015

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

04/29/15 00 00 0.50 Review filed plan, discuss testimony plan w/GEC

0.50

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Ontario Energy Board Invoice #

Attention: GEC Invoice Date:

David Poch Invoice Period: May 1-31, 2015

Job Name:

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours

Chris Neme 1024 00 00 $330 CAD 11.50

Subtotal Labor only 11.50

Item Job Code Phase Project Miles Rate

Chris Neme 1024 00 00 - 0.575$

Chris Neme 1024 00 00

Subtotal Expenses/Mileage only

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE

Revised Invoice

1460

July 13, 2015

Union 2015-2020 Plans



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1460

Job Code: 1024

Job Name: Union 2015-2020 Plans

Period: May 1-31, 2015

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

05/18/15 00 00 2.50 Review Union 2015-2020 plan

05/19/15 00 00 0.50 Review Union 2015-2020 plan

05/27/15 00 00 2.00 Draft Union Interogatories

05/28/15 00 00 1.00 Draft Union Interogatories

05/29/15 00 00 5.50 Review Union 2015-2020 plan, draft IRs

11.50

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Ontario Energy Board Invoice #

Attention: GEC Invoice Date:

David Poch Invoice Period: June 1-30, 2015

Job Name:

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours Amount

Chris Neme 1024 00 00 $330 CAD 10.50 3,465.00$ CAD

Jim Grevatt 1024 00 00 $330 CAD 1.50 495.00$ CAD

Jonathan Willson 1024 00 00 $170 CAD 18.00 3,060.00$ CAD

-$

-$

Subtotal Labor only 30.00 7,020.00$ CAD

Item Job Code Phase Project Miles Rate Amount

Chris Neme 1024 00 00 - 0.575$ -$ CAD

Chris Neme 1024 00 00 -$ CAD

-$

Subtotal Expenses/Mileage only -$

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE 7,020.00$ CAD

Union 2015-2020 Plans

Invoice

1492

July 13, 2015



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1492

Job Code: 1024

Job Name: Union 2015-2020 Plans

Period: June 1-30, 2015

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

06/09/15 00 00 0.75 develop GEC issues list for testimony, call w/Kai

06/17/15 00 00 1.25 research on commercial boiler market

06/29/15 00 00 2.75 Review IR responses

06/30/15 00 00 5.75 Review IR responses

10.50

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1492

Job Code: 1024

Job Name: Union 2015-2020 Plans

Period: June 1-30, 2015

Consultant: Jim Grevatt

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

06/30/15 00 00 1.50 Review T&D issues, call with CN

Total 1.50

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1492

Job Code: 1024

Job Name: Union 2015-2020 Plans

Period: June 1-30, 2015

Consultant: Jonathan Willson

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

06/19/15 00 00 6.00 Self-Directed programs research

06/22/15 00 00 1.50 Calls to ACEEE, Puget. Research.

06/22/15 00 00 1.00 Calls to PUCs, utilities. Filings research.

06/24/15 00 00 3.75 Calls to and from PUCs and state govt

06/26/15 00 00 5.25

Call with Marty Stipe (Oregon). Call to Chittum. Research and
memo drafting.

06/29/15 00 00 0.50 Memo

Total 18.00

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Ontario Energy Board Invoice #

Attention: GEC Invoice Date:

David Poch Invoice Period: July 1-31, 2015

Job Name:

Terms:

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours Amount

Chris Neme 1024 00 00 $330 CAD 66.75 22,027.50$ CAD

Jim Grevatt 1024 00 00 $330 CAD 13.25 4,372.50$ CAD

Jonathan Willson 1024 00 00 $170 CAD 10.75 1,827.50$ CAD

-$

-$

Subtotal Labor only 90.75 28,227.50$ CAD

Item Job Code Phase Project Miles Rate Amount

Chris Neme 1024 00 00 - 0.575$ -$ CAD

Chris Neme 1024 00 00 -$ CAD

-$

Subtotal Expenses/Mileage only -$

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE 28,227.50$ CAD

Union 2015-2020 Plans

Invoice

1516

August 5, 2015

Net 30 Days



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1516

Job Code: 1024

Job Name: Union 2015-2020 Plans

Period: July 1-31, 2015

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

07/01/15 00 00 4.00 Review evidence, prep for tech conf

07/02/15 00 00 3.75 Review evidence, prep for tech conf

07/07/15 00 00 7.00 Union tech conference, incl prep

07/08/15 00 00 2.00 Review evidence, analysis for testimony, draft testimony outline

07/09/15 00 00 2.00 Review evidence, analysis for testimony

07/10/15 00 00 2.25 analysis, GEC strategy discussions

07/13/15 00 00 1.50 analysis, draft testimony

07/14/15 00 00 2.00 analysis, draft testimony

07/15/15 00 00 3.25 analysis, draft testimony

07/17/15 00 00 2.00 analysis, draft testimony

07/19/15 00 00 0.50 analysis, draft testimony

07/20/15 00 00 3.25 analysis, draft testimony

07/21/15 00 00 3.00 analysis, draft testimony

07/22/15 00 00 4.50 analysis, draft testimony

07/23/15 00 00 3.75 analysis, draft testimony

07/24/15 00 00 3.50 analysis, draft testimony

07/25/15 00 00 2.50 analysis, draft testimony

07/26/15 00 00 4.00 analysis, draft testimony

07/27/15 00 00 4.00 analysis, draft testimony

07/28/15 00 00 4.75 analysis, draft testimony

07/29/15 00 00 2.00 edit testimony

07/30/15 00 00 1.25 further analysis of MN utilities

66.75

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1516

Job Code: 1024

Job Name: Union 2015-2020 Plans

Period: July 1-31, 2015

Consultant: Jim Grevatt

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

07/02/15 00 00 0.50 Summary bullets for testimony

07/03/15 00 00 0.50 Summary bullets for testimony

07/06/15 00 00 1.75 Testimony re: T&D

07/07/15 00 00 3.00 Testimony re: T&D

07/08/15 00 00 2.00 Testimony re: T&D

07/20/15 00 00 1.00 Upstream program research

07/21/15 00 00 2.00 Upstream program research

07/22/15 00 00 1.50 Upstream program research

07/27/15 00 00 1.00 Upstream program research

Total 13.25

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1516

Job Code: 1024

Job Name: Union 2015-2020 Plans

Period: July 1-31, 2015

Consultant: Jonathan Willson

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

07/02/15 00 00 0.75 Creating table comparing incentives. Based on testimony of gas company.

07/02/15 00 00 2.50 Incentive comparison table

07/06/15 00 00 1.50 Incentive comparison table

07/06/15 00 00 5.75 Incentive comparison table

07/08/15 00 00 0.25 Incentive comparison table

Total 10.75

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Ontario Energy Board Invoice #

Attention: GEC Invoice Date:

David Poch Invoice Period: August 1-31, 2015

Job Name:

Terms:

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours Amount

Chris Neme 1024 00 00 $330 CAD 52.25 17,242.50$ CAD

Jim Grevatt 1024 00 00 $330 CAD 2.75 907.50$ CAD

Jonathan Willson 1024 00 00 $170 CAD 7.75 1,317.50$ CAD

-$

-$

Subtotal Labor only 62.75 19,467.50$ CAD

Item Job Code Phase Project Miles Rate Amount

Chris Neme 1024 00 00 - 0.575$ -$ CAD

Chris Neme 1024 00 00 -$ CAD

-$

Subtotal Expenses/Mileage only -$

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE 19,467.50$ CAD

Union 2015-2020 Plans

Invoice

1541

September 4, 2015

Net 30 Days



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1541

Job Code: 1024

Job Name: Union 2015-2020 Plans

Period: August 1-31, 2015

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

08/04/15 00 00 2.25 Review Staff evidence, draft IRs; review IRs of other parties

08/05/15 00 00 2.75 work on IR responses

08/06/15 00 00 4.50 draft responses to interogatories

08/07/15 00 00 5.75 draft responses to interogatories

08/08/15 00 00 4.50 draft responses to interogatories

08/09/15 00 00 2.75 draft responses to interogatories

08/10/15 00 00 4.75 draft responses to interogatories; work on testimony corrections

08/11/15 00 00 0.50 work on changes to testimony

08/12/15 00 00 2.00 work on revisions to testimony and explanation of changes

08/12/15 00 00 1.50 work on response to supplemental interogs from Union

08/13/15 00 00 2.00 respond to supplemental Interogs from Union

08/13/15 00 00 0.75 Assist with prep for cross

08/14/15 00 00 0.75 Review Synapse IR responses, feedback to D.Poch on tech conf follow up

08/25/15 00 00 1.50 Prep for hearing, work on tech conf undertaking

08/26/15 00 00 1.50 read hearing transcripts, prep for cross

08/27/15 00 00 3.25 read hearing transcripts, prep for cross; response to Dr. Higgin tech conf
undertaking

08/28/15 00 00 3.50 read hearing transcripts, prep for cross; response to Dr. Higgin tech conf
undertaking

08/30/15 00 00 3.00 prep for and travel to stand cross

08/31/15 00 00 4.75 prep for and stand cross on filed evidence

52.25

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1541

Job Code: 1024

Job Name: Union 2015-2020 Plans

Period: August 1-31, 2015

Consultant: Jim Grevatt

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

08/07/15 00 00 2.25 DR responses re: upstream

08/09/15 00 00 0.25 DR responses re: upstream

08/12/15 00 00 0.25 Follow up calls with Energy Solutions re: upstream programs

Total 2.75

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1541

Job Code: 1024

Job Name: Union 2015-2020 Plans

Period: August 1-31, 2015

Consultant: Jonathan Willson

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

08/07/15 00 00 7.75 Table for Interrogatory 3

Total 7.75

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

TO: Ontario Energy Board Invoice #

Attention: GEC Invoice Date:

David Poch Invoice Period:

Job Name:

Terms:

Consultant Job Code Phase Project Rate Hours Amount

Chris Neme 1024 00 00 $330 CAD 19.25 6,352.50$ CAD

Jim Grevatt 1024 00 00 $330 CAD 0.00 -$ CAD

Jonathan Willson 1024 00 00 $170 CAD 0.00 -$ CAD

-$

-$

Subtotal Labor only 19.25 6,352.50$ CAD

Item Job Code Phase Project Miles Rate Amount

Chris Neme 1024 00 00 - 0.575$ -$ CAD

Chris Neme 1024 00 00 1,341.13$ CAD

-$

Subtotal Expenses/Mileage only 1,341.13$ CAD

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE 7,693.63$ CAD

NOTE: Expenses are 1/2 of amount
incurred; Other 50% shared with

another related project

Union 2015-2020 Plans

Invoice

1564

October 22, 2015

Net 30 Days

September 1-30, 2015



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1564

Job Code: 1024

Job Name: Union 2015-2020 Plans

Period: September 1-30, 2015

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Hours Task Description

09/01/15 00 00 5.00 stand cross (incl prep)

09/02/15 00 00 4.50 stand cross (incl prep)

09/02/15 00 00 0.75 work on undertaking responses

09/03/15 00 00 0.75 Draft responses to SEC, ED, EP undertakings

09/04/15 00 00 3.50 Draft responses to SEC, ED, EP undertakings

09/09/15 00 00 1.00 finalize undertaking responses

09/17/15 00 00 1.50 Review draft argument; discuss w/GEC

09/24/15 00 00 1.50 Review draft argument; discuss w/GEC

09/25/15 00 00 0.75 Review draft argument; discuss w/GEC

19.25

Task Description



Energy Futures Group, Inc
PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Phone: (802) 482-5001

Fax: (802) 329-2143

Invoice # 1564

Job Number: 1024

Job Name: Union 2015-2020 Plans

Period: September 1-30, 2015

Consultant: Chris Neme

Date Phase # Project # Miles Rate Amount Task Description

08/30/15 00 00 - -$ 31.05$ CAD taxi from Toronto airport to GEC mtg

08/30/15 00 00 - -$ 19.33$ CAD dinner

09/01/15 00 00 - -$ 5.75$ CAD lunch

09/01/15 00 00 - - 33.35$ CAD dinner

08/30/15 00 00 - - 8.76$ CAD lunch on way to Toronto

09/02/15 00 00 - -$ 7.53$ CAD dinner on way home from Toronto

09/02/15 00 00 - - 7.69$ CAD gasoline for rental car

08/30/15 00 00 - -$ 311.62$ CAD plane ticket to Toronto

09/02/15 00 00 - - 177.67$ CAD plane ticket from Toronto to Vermont (ticket
had to be cancelled when hearing ran later

09/02/15 00 00 - -$ 514.46$ CAD 3 nights hotel in Toronto

09/02/15 00 00 - - 170.70$ CAD plane ticket from Toronto to Montreal

09/02/15 00 00 - - 12.89$ CAD car rental from Montreal to Burlington,
Vermont airport

09/02/15 00 00 - - 15.33 CAD taxi from Burlington airport to home

09/01/15 00 00 - - 9.00 CAD taxi from GEC dinner to hotel

09/01/15 00 00 - - 5.00 CAD breakfast

09/02/15 00 00 - - 5.00 CAD breakfast

9/1-9/2/15 00 00 - - 6.00 CAD subway tokens for travel to/from hotel and
OEB hearing room

Total - 1,341.13$ CAD

Expense Description



Memorandum

To: Ontario Energy Board

CC: David Poch, GEC

From: Chris Neme

Date: 11/3/2015

Re: Notes on EB-2015-0029 and EB-2015-0049 Cost Claim

Two things should be noted about Energy Futures Group’s cost claims for the Enbridge and Union
Gas 2015-2020 DSM Plan regulatory proceedings.

First, whenever it was possible, we allocated hours worked on a specific utility’s filing to that utility.
Obvious examples, include time spent participating in each utility’s technical conference, time spent
draft interrogatories for each utility, time spent responding to interrogatories from each utility and
research or analysis specific to only one of the utilities. However, much of our work was not specific
to either utility. All such work was allocated 50/50 to each utility. All travel expenses were also
allocated 50/50 to each utility.

Second, though our invoices to GEC contained the full cost of meals incurred during Mr. Neme’s
travel to Toronto for cross-examination in late August and early September, the attached cost
claim forms reflect adjustments necessary to ensure that all such meal cost claims are within the
OEB permitted limits (i.e. $8.75 for breakfast, $11.25 for lunch and $20.00 for dinner). Those
adjustments are shown in the following table. As noted above – and as with other travel costs –
half of these costs were allocated to each utility.



Date Meal Actual Amount Cost Claim

8/30/15 Lunch $17.52 $11.25

8/30/15 Dinner $38.65 $20.00

9/1/15 Breakfast $10.00 $8.75

9/1/15 Lunch $11.50 $11.25

9/1/15 Dinner $66.70 $20.00

9/2/15 Breakfast $10.00 $8.75

9/2/15 Dinner $15.06 $15.06

Total $169.44 $95.06

Allocation to
each utility

$47.53
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1/2 = $311.62 
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= $19.35 USD

$25.78 CAD

1/2 = $12.90 CAD
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= $15.06 CAD
1/2 = 7.53 CAD 

= $15.38 CAD
1/2 = 7.69 CAD 

$13.50 USD

$18.00 CAD
1/2 = 9.00 CAD
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$9.00 USD = $12 CAD   1/2 = $6 CAD

$7.50 USD = $10 CAD    1/2 = $5 CAD

7.50 USD = $10 CAD     1/2 = $5 CAD

finance
Highlight



Kai Millyard
72 Regal Road, Toronto, ON, M6H 2K1 

kai@web.ca
GST# R134260793RT00001

416 651-7141

STATEMENT

Date: October 27, 2015

Project: GEC-DSM6

To: Green Energy Coalition, c/o David Poch

Re: Research & Case Management services 
Enbridge & Union Gas 6 Year DSM Plans
EB-2015-0029/0049

Item Amount
429.3 hours 

See dockets attached

@$170/h         $72,981.00 
SubTotal      $72,981.00 

13% HST:      $9,487.53

TOTAL DUE:     $ 82,468.53

Please make cheque payable to “Kai Millyard”. 



Time Docket
for Kai Millyard

Union 6 Year DSM Plan EB-0015-0029

Date CaseMgmt Prep Attend Arg Item
22-May-15 1.2 begin review of evidence
28-May-15 5.8 review Plan - prepare IRs
29-May-15 7.4 review Plan - prepare IRs
01-Jun-15 1.6 1.4 Prepare & file IRs
10-Jun-15 0.6 Evidence outline
22-Jun-15 1.8 evidence research
23-Jun-15 1.4 evidence research
24-Jun-15 0.8 review IR replies
26-Jun-15 4.5 review IR replies
29-Jun-15 3.8 technical conf preparation
30-Jun-15 2.0 0.4 technical conf preparation
01-Jul-15 3.0 2.1 technical conf preparation
02-Jul-15 0.7 1.4 technical conf preparation
06-Jul-15 0.5 technical conf preparation
07-Jul-15 8.3 Technical Conf
08-Jul-15 0.5 teleconf Neme
10-Jul-15 0.5 4.5 t/c Poch, Neme, Chernick ,rsch support
13-Jul-15 2.2 rsch support Chernick, Neme
14-Jul-15 7.2 rsch support Chernick, Neme
17-Jul-15 7.1 rsch support Chernick, Neme
18-Jul-15 3.0 rsch support Chernick, Neme
21-Jul-15 0.7 3.7 rsch support Chernick, Neme
22-Jul-15 3.4 rsch support Chernick, Neme
23-Jul-15 0.9 2.9 rsch support Chernick, Neme
24-Jul-15 4.9 rsch support Neme
26-Jul-15 0.6 rsch support Neme, review drafts
27-Jul-15 3.3 rsch support Neme, review drafts
28-Jul-15 6.6 rsch support Neme, review drafts
29-Jul-15 3.5 review drafts, file Neme
04-Aug-15 1.0 1.7 file Chernick, prepare for Irs
05-Aug-15 1.8 0.3 Organize & assist with received Irs
06-Aug-15 4.2 Assist w IR replies
07-Aug-15 0.9 3.0 Assist w IR replies
08-Aug-15 0.5 4.5 Assist w IR replies
09-Aug-15 1.6 Assist w IR replies
10-Aug-15 4.5 finalize & file Neme responses
11-Aug-15 2.9 review Chernick drafts
12-Aug-15 3.6 finalize & file Chernick responses
13-Aug-15 1.9 file Neme updated evidence
14-Aug-15 1.3 cross prep
17-Aug-15 1.0 1.1 3.0 Tech Conf, cross prep
18-Aug-15 6.5 cross prep w DP
19-Aug-15 3.6 8.0 Day 1 & cross prep
20-Aug-15 3.7 Day 2 & cross prep
21-Aug-15 1.0 Day 3 transcript & cross prep
23-Aug-15 2.8 Cross prep
24-Aug-15 1.7 3.7 Day 4, prep Tus
28-Aug-15 4.3 prep for Direct, file TU
30-Aug-15 7.2 prep for Direct
31-Aug-15 2.5 0.8 Day 9
01-Sep-15 3.7 Day 10
02-Sep-15 3.0 Day 11
04-Sep-15 1.2 prep TUs
08-Sep-15 0.4 file TUs.
09-Sep-15 0.3 1.5 file TUs, comment on draft arg
14-Sep-15 1.5 assist w Arg
15-Sep-15 3.2 assist w Arg
24-Sep-15 2.2 draft review & teleconf
28-Sep-15 1.5 assist w Arg
29-Sep-15 3.0 final assis w Arg

TOTAL 52.9            110.3             34.2            12.9            210.3                                                                     

@$170/h 8,993.00$   18,751.00$    5,814.00$   2,193.00$   35,751.00$                                                            



Time Docket
for Kai Millyard

Enbridge 6 Year DSM Plan EB-2015-0049

Date CaseMgmt Prep Attend Arg Item
29-Apr-15 0.6 t/c Neme, Gibbons
14-May-15 1.7 set up, file Irs batch 1
25-May-15 3.2 review filing
26-May-15 7.3 review filing
27-May-15 5.8 review filing, prepare Irs
01-Jun-15 1.2 complete, file IRs batch 2 & 3
04-Jun-15 1.5 rsch support Chernick
09-Jun-15 0.7 t/c Neme re evidence outline
11-Jun-15 0.3 distribution list letter
22-Jun-15 2.0 evidence research
23-Jun-15 1.2 manage IR replies
24-Jun-15 4.9 review IR replies
25-Jun-15 0.7 2.0 technical conf preparation
26-Jun-15 3.1 technical conf preparation
30-Jun-15 4.0 1.6 technical conf preparation & EGD telecon
01-Jul-15 4.0 technical conf preparation
02-Jul-15 0.2 2.0 technical conf preparation
05-Jul-15 2.4 technical conf preparation
06-Jul-15 8.3 Technical Conf
08-Jul-15 1.5 t/c Fiona, review new responses
10-Jul-15 4.5 t/c Poch, Neme, Chernick
13-Jul-15 1.9 rsch support Chernick, Neme
14-Jul-15 3.0 rsch support Chernick, Neme
16-Jul-15 2.5 rsch support Chernick, Neme
18-Jul-15 2.8 rsch support Chernick, Neme
20-Jul-15 5.6 rsch support Chernick, Neme
21-Jul-15 1.9 rsch support Chernick, Neme
22-Jul-15 2.9 rsch support Chernick, Neme
23-Jul-15 1.0 3.0 rsch support Chernick, Neme
24-Jul-15 1.8 rsch support Neme
25-Jul-15 1.7 rsch support Neme
26-Jul-15 2.0 rsch support Neme, review drafts
27-Jul-15 5.2 rsch support Neme, review drafts
28-Jul-15 3.2 review drafts
29-Jul-15 2.9 2.6 review drafts, file Neme
30-Jul-15 2.0 2.0 rsch support Chernick, review drafts
04-Aug-15 1.0 file Irs for others
05-Aug-15 1.8 0.3 Organize & assist with received Irs
06-Aug-15 0.5 4.2 Assist w IR replies
07-Aug-15 0.8 3.0 Assist w IR replies
08-Aug-15 0.5 4.5 Assist w IR replies
09-Aug-15 1.5 Assist w IR replies
10-Aug-15 4.5 finalize & file Neme responses
11-Aug-15 2.9 review Chernick drafts
12-Aug-15 3.6 finalize & file Chernick responses
13-Aug-15 1.9 file Neme updated evidence
14-Aug-15 1.3 cross prep
17-Aug-15 1.0 3.0 Tech Conf
19-Aug-15 2.0 Day 1 & cross prep
20-Aug-15 1.8 3.7 Day 2 & cross prep
21-Aug-15 2.6 Day 3 transcript & cross prep
23-Aug-15 2.5 Cross prep
24-Aug-15 3.8 Day 4
25-Aug-15 4.2 3.6 Day 5, t/c CN, PLC, DP, cross prep
26-Aug-15 2.5 7.4 Day 6, cross prep
28-Aug-15 4.3 prep for Direct, file TU
29-Aug-15 3.2 prep for Direct
30-Aug-15 2.0 prep for Direct
31-Aug-15 5.0 0.8 Day 9
01-Sep-15 3.7 Day 10
02-Sep-15 3.0 Day 11
04-Sep-15 1.2 prep TUs
08-Sep-15 0.4 file TUs.
09-Sep-15 0.3 1.5 file TUs, comment on draft arg
14-Sep-15 1.5 assist w Arg
15-Sep-15 3.2 assist w Arg
24-Sep-15 2.2 draft review & teleconf
28-Sep-15 1.5 assist w Arg
29-Sep-15 3.0 final assis w Arg

TOTAL 56.9 112.8 37.3 12.9 219.90                                                             
@$170/h 9,673.00$    19,176.00$   6,341.00$   2,193.00$   37,383.00$                                                      

































































JIM GREVATT, MANAGING CONSULTANT  

Energy Futures Group • P.O. Box 587, Hinesburg, VT  05461 • 802-482-5001 • jgrevatt@energyfuturesgroup.com 
 

 
EDUCATION 
B.F.A., University Honors, University of Illinois, 1982  

EXPERIENCE 
2013-present: Managing Consultant, Energy Futures Group, Hinesburg, VT 
2012-2013: Director, Targeted Implementation, Vermont Energy Investment Corp., Burlington, VT 
2011-2012: Director, Residential Energy Services, District of Columbia Sustainable Energy Utility 
 for Vermont Energy Investment Corp., Washington, D.C. and Burlington, VT 
2010-2012: Managing Consultant, Vermont Energy Investment Corporation, Burlington, VT 
2005-2010: Director, Residential Services, Vermont Energy Investment Corp., Burlington, VT 
2001-2005: Manager, Energy Services, Vermont Gas Systems, S. Burlington, VT 
1998-2001: Manager, Residential Energy Services, Vermont Gas Systems, S. Burlington, VT 
1996-1998: Manager, HomeBase Retrofit Program, Vermont Gas Systems, S. Burlington, VT 
1994-1996: Technical Specialist, Vermont Gas Systems, S. Burlington, VT 
1991-1994: Associate Director and Technical Specialist, Champlain Valley Weatherization Program, 
Burlington, VT 

PROFESSIONAL SUMMARY 
Jim Grevatt brings over 20 years’ experience as a leadership professional in energy efficiency program 
operations to his consulting practice. Jim uses an in-depth knowledge of the nuts and bolts of running 
programs and a clear understanding of strategic thinking and planning to ensure that programs achieve 
their desired market impacts. Throughout his career, Jim has focused on building strong relationships 
with staff, peers, trade allies, regulators, and clients as the best way to understand the needs and 
challenges that each sector faces. As Director of Residential Services for Efficiency Vermont for over 
five years, and then in the same role for the District of Columbia Sustainable Energy Utility for its 
startup operation, Jim has hands-on experience with industry-leading markets-based approaches to 
managing energy efficiency programs, including multi-family, low income, residential retrofit, new 
construction, HVAC, and efficient products programs. In his leadership roles he was responsible for 
finding successful consensus approaches among diverse groups of partners and stakeholders, and for 
policy interactions with regulators, assuring that program processes were efficient and effective. Prior 
to his roles with Vermont Energy Investment Corporation, Jim managed Vermont Gas’ residential 
and commercial energy efficiency programs. In each of these roles Jim had overall responsibility both 
for program design and operations.     

SELECTED PROJECTS  
• Regulatory Assistance Project: Expert technical support for DSM in China Worked with 

various government agencies and grid companies, as well as advocacy organizations to provide 
technical support related to advancing DSM and energy efficiency in China (2015)  

• Energy Efficiency for All: Expert technical support for affordable multifamily energy 
efficiency advocacy in Pennsylvania and Virginia Worked with a coalition of energy efficiency 
and affordable housing advocates to shape advocacy efforts with utilities and regulators (2015)  



JIM GREVATT, MANAGING CONSULTANT  
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• Vermont Public Service Department: Evaluation of Clean Energy Development Fund 
Conducted interviews of staff and key stakeholders under contract to NMR and prepared memo 
outlining process findings and recommendations (2014-2015)  

• Evaluation of Efficiency Maine Low-Income Multi-Family Weatherization Program- 
Responsible for program staff and building owner interviews and process evaluation under 
contract to NMR and Efficiency Maine (2014-2015) 

• Coalition of Maryland Energy Efficiency Advocates Prepared written comments and 
appeared before the Commission to present evidence regarding Maryland utilities’ 2015-2017 
EmPOWER Maryland energy efficiency plans, and in subsequent proceedings related to utility 
goal-setting, cost-effectiveness testing, and energy efficiency financing (2014-2015)  

• Northeast Energy Efficiency Partnerships- Researched and co-authored meta-study of the use 
of energy efficiency to defer T&D investments (2014) 

• Northeast Energy Efficiency Partnerships- Researched and co-authored meta-study of 
ductless heat pump performance and market acceptance (2014) 

• High Meadows Fund- Co-authored a study assessing the market viability of “High Performance 
Homes” in Vermont (2014) 

• Energy Savings Potential Study, Delaware Department of Natural Resources- led narrative 
development for the residential programs for a study of the energy efficiency savings potential in 
Delaware (2013-2014) 

• Regulatory Assistance Project- Provide technical support to energy efficiency advocates in 
proceedings in Maryland, Mississippi, and Missouri (2013-2014) 

• Better Buildings Solutions Center, U. S. Department of Energy- Energy Futures Group’s 
lead author in drafting and reviewing web content for ten how-to “handbooks” detailing proven 
approaches to designing and implementing residential retrofit efficiency programs (2013-2014) 

• Natural Resources Defense Council- Provided expert witness testimony in support of NRDC’s 
intervention in Ameren Illinois’ 2014-2016 energy efficiency plan.  Testimony demonstrated that 
Ameren would be capable of capturing significantly greater efficiency savings than it had proposed 
(2013) 

• Utility Program Benchmarking- led research on behalf of a California IOU to compare the cost 
of saved energy across ~10 leading utility portfolios.  The research sought to determine if there 
are discernable differences in the cost of saved energy related to utility spending in specific non-
incentive categories, including administration, marketing, and EM&V (2013) 

• Research on trends in multi-family, HVAC, and new construction programs- developed an 
analysis of emerging program trends on behalf of a leading energy efficiency industry firm (2013-
2014) 

• Efficiency Power Plant, Regulatory Assistance Project- Partnered with RAP to develop a 
demonstration tool to show how energy efficiency measures can be used to mitigate air quality 
impacts related to power production (2013) 
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• Natural Gas Energy Efficiency Analysis, the Green Energy Coalition- Provided analytical 
support to demonstrate in testimony that Enbridge Gas could reduce the scale of its proposed 
pipeline expansion by implementing aggressive energy efficiency programs (2013) 

• Targeted Implementation, VEIC-  Responsible for market analysis and strategic planning for 
a new division expanding VEIC’s energy efficiency program implementation projects (2012-2013) 

• DC Sustainable Energy Utility- Led the planning and startup implementation of Residential 
programs for the DC SEU, including single and multi-family and retail market programs.  Led the 
development of the initial portfolio-level Annual Plan.  Led client and partner interactions around 
planning and policy development.  Member of DC SEU Senior Management Team (2011-2012) 

• EmPOWER Maryland Critical Program Review- Expert consultant to the Maryland Office 
of Peoples’ Counsel in EmPOWER Maryland hearings regarding utility energy efficiency planning 
and reporting.  Represented the OPC in stakeholder meetings that informed the current 2012-
2014 EmPOWER plans.  Multiple appearances before the Maryland Public Service Commission. 
(2010-2012) 

• Efficiency Vermont 20 year Forecast of Efficiency Potential- Senior Advisor in developing 
the forecast scenarios that led to significantly increased efficiency investment in Vermont (2010-
2011) 

• Efficiency Vermont Residential Programs- Directed 100% growth in program budgets to 
nearly $10M annually.  Responsible for strategic direction, leadership, and results for Efficiency 
Vermont’s award-winning residential retrofit, new construction, retail, and low income programs.  
Supported excellence in a staff of 30 (2005-2010). 

• Vermont Gas Systems Efficiency Program Leader- Directed strategic planning and program 
operations that led to six programs and portfolio as a whole being recognized as exemplary in 
Responding to the Natural Gas Crisis: America's Best Natural Gas Energy Efficiency Programs 
(ACEEE, 2003).  Built contractor infrastructure and internal support to consistently meet program 
objectives.  Led development of Annual Reports, planning and budgeting.  Collaborated with 
Efficiency Vermont staff to develop a fuel-blind, state-wide, jointly offered residential new 
construction program (2001-2005) 

• Residential Retrofit Program Development- Enhanced design and performance of VGS’ 
residential retrofit offerings by streamlining delivery and building strong relationships with 
contractors, homeowners, and property managers (1994-2005) 

• Demonstrated Technical Excellence in Approaches to Residential Retrofits Conducted 
hundreds of residential energy audits and quality assurance inspections for natural gas and 
alternative-fueled homes.  Trained and coached installers to obtain desired quality.  Worked to 
satisfy homeowners through explanation, education, sound listening to concerns, and ultimately 
assuring that concerns were addressed.  Trained new staff in auditing techniques.  (1991-1998)  
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SELECTED PRESENTATIONS  

EERS Advancements in Maryland: EmPOWER After 2015- Presentation at ACEEE Energy Efficiency 
as a Resource Conference, September, 2015 

Leveling the Playing Field for Distributed Energy Resources- Panelist discussing the use of energy efficiency 
to defer T&D investments, Acadia Center forum on Envisioning Our Energy Future, February, 2015 

Residential Retrofit Programs: What's Working? Perspectives from National Program Leaders- Panelist at AESP 
National Conference 2012 

Elements of Retrofit Program Incentive Design- DOE Technical Assistance Program Publication, April, 2011 

Designing Effective Incentives to Drive Residential Retrofit Participation- DOE Technical Assistance Program 
Webinar, October, 2010 

Quality Assurance for Residential Retrofit Programs- DOE Technical Assistance Program Webinar, October, 
2010 

Home Performance with ENERGY STAR, Quality Assurance in Vermont- Panelist at the ACI Home Energy 
Retrofit Summit, April 2010  

Delivering on the Promise-Engaging Communities and the Public- Panelist at 2010 NEEP Summit, March, 2010 

Home Performance with Energy Star in Vermont - Presentation at CEE Member meeting, June 2009 

Leading by Example: Exemplary Low Income Energy Efficiency Programs –Presented on Efficiency Vermont’s 
Residential low income services at California’s Low Income Energy Efficiency Symposium, June 2006 

“Natural Gas Efficiency Policies, Responding to the Natural Gas Crisis One Therm at a Time” - Co-presented 
with Dan York and Anna Monis Shipley of American Council for an Energy-Efficient Economy 
(ACEEE) -ACEEE/CEE Market Transformation Symposium, 2004 
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EDUCATION

M.E.R.L., Vermont Law School, 2015 (Candidate)
B.A.., Political Science, Johnson State College, 2012

EXPERIENCE

2015-Present: Analyst, Energy Futures Group, Hinesburg, VT
2014-2015: Energy Fellow, Vermont Law School Institute for Energy and the Environment, South
Royalton, VT
2012-2014: Paralegal, Langrock Sperry & Wool, LLP, Middlebury, VT

PROFESSIONAL SUMMARY

Jonathan Willson provides energy research and analysis for a variety of consulting projects for
clients across the United States and Canada. Prior to joining Energy Futures Group, Jonathan led a
team of student consultants in developing a replicable community solar model for Vermont
customers. He consulted directly with community groups and municipalities, guiding them through
the virtual net metering permitting process. During his time at Energy Futures Group, Jonathan has
conducted multi-state analysis of energy efficiency program incentive levels and performance. He
has researched innovative energy savings strategies, including: voltage optimization, combined heat
and power systems, behavioral energy efficiency technology, and residential building energy codes.

SELECTED PROJECTS

 Benchmarking Maine’s Energy Efficiency Performance. Providing research and analysis of
Efficiency Maine’s energy efficiency performance. Conducted a multi-state comparison of
program offerings, incentive levels, depth and cost of savings. (2015 to present)

 Regulatory Assistance Project - U.S. Providing research support on strategic reports,
including what it would take to achieve 30% electricity savings over ten years. (2015 to present)

SELECTED PUBLICATIONS

 “Vermont Group Net Metering: Information & Guidelines for 150 kW (AC) Community Solar
Projects”, published by the Vermont Law School Institute for Energy and the Environment,
January 2015 (with David Huang)



Qualifications of 

SUSAN C. GELLER 
Resource Insight, Inc. 

5 Water Street 
Arlington, Massachusetts 02176 

 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL EXPERIENCE 
1992–
Present 

Senior Research Associate, Resource Insight. Since 2015: Consulting Associate. 
Reviews cost-allocation, rate-design, and marginal-cost methodologies. 
Determines avoided costs for  screening of conservation and distributed-genera-
tion investments. Assesses prudence of generation-plant investment, power 
purchases, and power-procurement decision processes. Reviews performance-
based ratemaking proposals. Evaluates utilities’ least-cost resource planning and 
long-range demand forecasts. 

1978–91 Utility Rate Analyst, Utilities Division, Massachusetts Department of the 
Attorney General. Presented expert testimony before the Massachusetts Depart-
ment of Public Utilities, the Massachusetts Energy Facilities Siting Council, and 
the Atomic Safety and Licensing Board, on economic issues in electric and gas 
utility regulation. Included testimony on reliability and reviewability of load 
forecasting methodologies, proposals for embedded cost allocation methodologies, 
measurement of marginal cost of gas and electric supply, evaluation and design of 
utility retail rate structure, financial incentives for utility funding of conservation 
programs, evaluation of need for and economics of new electric generation plant, 
and design of gas transportation tariffs. 

Formulated strategy and litigation issues in cases concerning economic and 
econometric questions, including efficiency and equity of gas and electric rate 
design proposals; financial incentives and program development for utility-funded 
conservation and load management; validity of long range demand forecasts; 
implementation of least cost supply planning and methods of cost recovery; 
economics of new plant construction; design of resource bidding systems. 
Formulated and advocated policy positions for the Utilities Division in the areas 
of least cost supply planning, resource bidding and deregulation, rate treatment of 
costs of future supply and demand resources, and rate design. 

Prepared discovery and briefs. Developed lines of cross-examination and provided 
technical assistance to attorneys in their preparation of cross-examination. 
Participated in negotiations with utilities. Acted as information resource for the 
Utilities Division on utility planning, operations and regulatory history.  

PROFESSIONAL AFFILIATIONS 
Member, International Association for Energy Economics 
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EDUCA TION 
MA, Public Policy Program, Harvard University Kennedy School of Government, June, 
1978. 

BA, Economics, magna cum laude, Harvard University, June, 1974. 

REPORTS 
“Avoided Energy Supply Costs for Demand-Side Management in Massachusetts” (with 
Rachel Brailove, Paul Chernick, Bruce Biewald, and David White). 1999. Northborough, 
Mass.: Avoided-Energy-Supply-Component Study Group, c/o New England Power Supply 
Company. 

“Performance-based Regulation in a Restructured Utility Industry” (with Bruce Biewald, 
Tim Woolf, Peter Bradford, Paul Chernick, and Jerrold Oppenheim). 1997. Washington: 
NARUC. 

“Restructuring the Electric Utilities of Maryland: Protecting and Advancing Consumer 
Interests” (with Paul Chernick, Jonathan Wallach, John Plunkett, Roger Colton, Peter 
Bradford, Bruce Biewald, and David Wise). 1997. Baltimore, Maryland: Maryland Office of 
People’s Counsel. 

“Estimation of Market Value, Stranded Investment, and Restructuring Gains for Major 
Massachusetts Utilities” (with Paul Chernick, Jonathan Wallach, Rachel Brailove, and Adam 
Auster). 1996. On behalf of the Massachusetts Attorney General (Boston). 

“Review of the Elizabethtown Gas Company’s 1992 DSM Plan and the Demand-Side 
Management Rules” (with Jonathan Wallach, Paul Chernick, John Plunkett, James Peters, 
Blair Hamilton, and A. Shapiro). 1992. Report to the New Jersey Department of Public 
Advocate. 

“Review of Jersey Central Power & Light’s 1992 DSM Plan and the Demand-Side 
Management Rules” (with Jonathan Wallach, et al.); Report to the New Jersey Department 
of Public Advocate, June 1992. 

PRESENTATIONS 
“Cost Allocation for Utility Ratemaking.” With Paul Chernick. Day-long workshop for the 
staff of the Connecticut Department of Public Utility Control, October, 1993. 

EXPERT TESTIMONY 
1. EFSC 78-12/DPU 19494, Phase I; Boston Edison Company’s 1978 Demand and 

Energy Forecast; June 12, 1978. 
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 Review of and adjustments to Boston Edison’s end-use and econometric forecast, 
including effect on projections of electric price increases. Joint testimony with P. 
Chernick. 

2. EFSC 78-4; 1978 Long Range Forecast of New England Gas and Electric 
Association (“NEGEA”); November 10, 1978. 

 Reviewability and reliability of judgmental forecasts; shortcomings of simple 
time-trending, and important factors to consider in forecasting electric sales.  

3. EFSC 78-1; 1978 Long Range Forecast of Massachusetts Municipal Wholesale 
Electric Company (“MMWEC”); September 1, 1978.  

 Evaluation of judgmental forecasting, simple time-trending, and modeling of 
“conservation.” 

4. MDPU 19494, Phase II; Boston Edison’s Construction Program and Capacity Needs; 
April 1, 1979.  

 Evaluation of the 1978 forecasts of ten New England utilities which constituted 92% 
of projected NEPOOL demand. Joint testimony with P. Chernick. 

5. ASLB, NRC 50-471; Boston Edison Company, Pilgrim Nuclear Generating Station, 
Unit No. 2; June 29, 1979. 

 Evaluation of two New England regional demand forecasts, an Oak Ridge National 
Laboratory econometric forecast and the NEPOOL end-use and econometric forecast, 
and cost-effectiveness of investment in a nuclear generating unit. Joint testimony with 
P. Chernick. 

6. MDPU 19845; Boston Edison Company’s Time-Of-Use Rates; December 4, 1979.

 Formulation of marginal cost pricing principles; analysis of BECo rate design 
proposals and marginal cost study; development of alternative costing methodology 
and rate design proposals. Joint testimony with P. Chernick.  

7. MDPU 20055; Petition of Eastern Utilities Associates, New England Gas and 
Electric, and Fitchburg Gas and Electric to Purchase Additional Shares of Seabrook 
Nuclear Plant; January 23, 1980. 

 Evaluation of New Bedford Gas and Electric forecast as a basis for the Company’s 
“need for power” argument. 

8. MDPU 20248; Petition of MMWEC to Purchase Additional Shares of Seabrook 
Nuclear Plant; June 2, 1980. 

 Evaluation of reviewability and reliability of 29 demand forecasts (for the 29 
members of MMWEC), the basis for the Company’s “need for power” argument. 
Focused on the use of subjective data, interviews as a basis for forecasting, simple 
time-trending, and specific modeling assumptions. 
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9. EFSC 79-4; 1979 NEGEA Long Range Forecast; July 16, 1980. 

 Evaluation of judgmental forecasting approach; recommended standards for use of 
subjective data; evaluated specific data input and modeling assumptions.  

10. EFSC 80-4; 1979 Long Range Forecast and Supply Plan of New England Electric 
System; November 5, 1980. 

 Review of end-use and econometric forecast. Presented general principles of 
econometric forecasting and documentation. More specific issues include space 
heating penetration projections, conservation, and commercial model specification. 

11. MDPU 81-12; 1981 Long Range Forecast of Boston Edison Company; May 15, 
1981. 

 Review of end-use and econometric forecast. General principles of econometric 
forecasting and documentation, including model specification, use of statistical tests, 
subjective adjustments to econometric results, and role of judgment. Specific issues 
include demographic projection, appliance penetration and usage projections, and 
impact of appliance efficiency improvements and price increases. 

12. MDPU 702; Nantucket Electric Company Request for General Rate Increase; 
October 2, 1981.  

 Proposal of change in method of adjusting existing rate structures to collect allowed 
rate increase. 

13. MDPU 800; Massachusetts Electric Company Request for General Rate Relief; 
October 9, 1981.  

 Efficiency and equity of declining block rate structures, customer charges, demand 
charges and ratchets. Development of alternative rate design proposals.  

14. MDPU 906; Boston Edison Company Request for General Rate Relief; December 
31, 1981. 

 Statement of general principles of cost allocation and rate design; efficiency and 
equity of Company’s proposed declining block rate structures and demand charges; 
estimation of marginal cost; development of alternative rate design proposals.  

15. MDPU 1015; Cambridge Electric Light Company Request for General Rate Relief; 
May 18, 1982.  

 Economic efficiency of Company’s proposed declining block rate structures and 
demand charges; development of alternative rate design proposals. 

16. MDPU 955; Massachusetts Electric Light Company Proposals for Load Management 
and Conservation Rates; June 7, 1982. 
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 Evaluation of cost-effectiveness of storage heating as a load management measure; 
comparison of bill reductions versus system cost savings under the Company’s rate 
design proposals. Evaluation of Company’s marginal cost estimates; specific issues 
include average versus marginal loss factors, externalities, marginal distribution 
capacity costs of off-peak loads.  

17. MDPU 1133; Massachusetts Electric Light Company Request for General Rate 
Increase; August 6, 1982. 

 Economic efficiency of Company’s proposed declining block rate structures and 
demand charges; development of alternative rate design proposals. 

18. MDPU 1350; Boston Edison Company Request for General Rate Increase; February 
1, 1983. 

 Evaluation of Company’s marginal cost estimates; development of rate design 
proposals based on revised estimate of marginal cost.  

19. MDPU 1530; Nantucket Electric Company Request for General Rate Increase; July 
22, 1983.  

 Development of marginal cost estimate and rate design proposals for Nantucket 
system. Evaluation of Company’s plans to install a new diesel unit; specific issues 
include reliability value of smaller generation units and of demand-side management 
alternatives to new generation, in particular resetting of water heater time clock 
controls. Contribution of winter, spring and fall loads as well as summer loads to 
need for capacity and implications for rate design. Evaluation of effectiveness of 
Company’s rate design proposals in controlling summer peak load growth.  

20. MDPU 84-25; Western Massachusetts Electric Company Request For General Rate 
Increase; April 11, 1984.  

 Development of long run marginal cost estimate. Evaluation of Company’s short run 
marginal energy cost estimates. Marginal cost issues also addressed are Company’s 
exclusion of marginal transmission and distribution capacity costs and marginal loss 
factors. Economic efficiency of demand charges and ratchets. 

 No-loser’s test as a standard for evaluating conservation programs. Critique of 
Company’s cost-benefit analysis of conservation. Recommendations for program 
design and cost allocation.  

21. MDPU 84-145; Fitchburg Gas and Electric Light Company Request for General Rate 
Increase; September 28, 1984 

 Evaluation of embedded cost of service study. Specific issues include reliability of 
borrowed load data; validity of class maximum demand as allocator for demand-
related distribution plant, of allocation of revenue losses associated with water heater 
rentals to residential classes, and of allocation of low-income subsidy entirely to 
residential classes. 



 

Susan C. Geller      Resource Insight, Incorporated Page 6 
 

22. MDPU 84-145; Fitchburg Gas and Electric Light Company Request for General Rate 
Increase; October 1984 

 Evaluation of marginal cost study. 

23. MDPU 84-55/EFSC 83-28; Nantucket Electric Company Long Range Forecast and 
Supply Plan; March 15, 1985 

 Evaluation of forecast methodology (including plausibility of regression models, 
failure to distinguish seasonal from annual customers, failure to reflect future C&LM, 
and error on definition of customer number variables) and plausibility of forecast 
results. 

24. MDPU 84-276; Rules Governing Rates and Conditions for Utility Purchases of 
Power from Qualifying Facilities; April 1, 1985.  

 Long run versus short run marginal cost as the basis for payments to small power 
producers; distortions in proposed production target formula. 

25. MDPU 84-276; Rules Governing Rates and Conditions for Utility Purchases of 
Power from Qualifying Facilities; October 18, 1985.  

 Evaluation of ratepayer risk associated with long term fixed price contracts; long run 
versus short run marginal cost as the basis for the long term contract price. 

26. MDPU 85-271; Boston Edison Company Request For General Rate Increase; March 
7, 1986 

 Examination of long run versus short run costs as basis for setting retail energy rates; 
evaluation of demand charges as an effective and appropriate rate design mechanism.

27. MDPU 85-270; Western Massachusetts Electric Company Request For General Rate 
Increase; March 26, 1986. 

 Examination of long run versus short run costs as basis for setting retail energy rates; 
evaluation of demand charges as an effective and appropriate rate design mechanism.

28. MDPU 86-27; Colonial Gas Company Partial Requirements and Cogeneration Rate 
Proposals; April 18, 1986.  

 Economic efficiency and equity of using marginal cost rather than embedded cost to 
set class revenue requirement solely for these special rates; cost justification of 
proposed end-use rate classification; evaluation of Company’s marginal cost esti-
mates (including issues involving interruptible sales, cost of liquefaction of LNG, use 
of simulation model which assumes perfect foresight, effect of design year reliability 
standard on normal year costs, and marginal distribution cost estimates). 

29. MDPU 85-178; Investigation by the Department Regarding Charges and Service for 
Transportation of Natural Gas for Industrial End-Users; May 12, 1986.  
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 Proposed method of calculating transportation rates that credits transporting cus-
tomers with no more than savings to retail distribution company.  

30. MDPU 86-82; Berkshire Gas Company Request For General Rate Increase; July 28, 
1986.  

 Evaluation of marginal cost methodology. Addressed effect on marginal energy cost 
of load uncertainty, hedging, and hedging; increases in storage volumes as a 
component of capacity cost; and inclusion of reserve margin in calculation of ca-
pacity cost. Identified calculational error in Company translation of marginal capacity 
cost estimate into rate design. Recommended alternative to use of average daily 
weather to develop “normal” year. Addressed economic efficiency and equity of 
lower rates for specific end-uses, namely off-peak transportation, dual fuel and 
cogeneration customers. Potential conflicts of interest in Company’s proposal to 
broker gas. 

31. MDPU 86-280; Western Massachusetts Electric Company Request For General Rate 
Increase; March 11, 1987.  

 Long run versus short run costs as basis for setting retail energy rates.  

32. MDPU 87-122; Commonwealth Gas Company Request For General Rate Increase; 
October 6, 1987.  

 Evaluation of marginal cost methodology. Addressed and quantified effect on 
marginal energy cost of load uncertainty, hedging of supplemental gas supplies, and 
storage. Addressed and quantified effect of interruptible sales on marginal cost. 
Identified calculational error in Company translation of marginal capacity cost 
estimate into charges in rate design. Evaluation of Company’s interruptible sales 
policy, in general, and of pricing of sales to COM/Energy electric generation 
facilities, in particular.  

33. MDPU 87-169; Investigation of the Adequacy of Plans to Ensure Reliable Service in 
the Summer of 1987 and Thereafter; December 4, 1987. 

 Long run versus short run costs as basis for setting retail rates. Price setting as a 
regulatory tool for controlling demand. 

34. MDPU 87-221; Cambridge Electric Light Company Request for General Rate 
Increase; February 16, 1988. 

 Evaluation of Company’s supply plan and need for new capacity, including use of 
average rather than seasonal capacity ratings and treatment of availability uncer-
tainties. Validity of the discounted peaker method. Market-clearing price as the basis 
for short run marginal cost pricing. Other marginal cost issues include effect of 
summer derating on cost of peaker, appropriateness of discounting transmission costs 
based on in-service date rather than year of deficiency, payments for transmission by 
others as a component of marginal cost, and error in translation of marginal cost 
estimate into rate design. 
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35. MDPU 88-135/151; Commonwealth Electric Company Request For General Rate 
Increase; October 21, 1988. 

 Evaluation of Company’s supply plan and need for new capacity, including reliability 
of load forecast and treatment of uncertainty in plant availability, life extensions, and 
demand-side versus supply-side resources. Validity of the discounted peaker method. 
Discussion of a number of marginal costing issues including the accurate use of price 
indices, lumpiness in marginal transmission capacity cost estimates, effect of 
uncertainty in plant availability, utility conservation, outage power from the power 
pool, and unit start-up costs on estimate of marginal energy cost.  

36. MDPU 89-21; Massachusetts Electric Company Request For General Rate Increase; 
July 21, 1989. 

 Cost-effectiveness of demand-metering; demand charge incentive structure; validity 
of time-of-use literature as basis for estimate of non-TOU demand charge effects; 
evaluation of Company use of statistical results and cost-effectiveness methodology.

37. MDPU 89-195; Massachusetts Electric Company; December 22, 1989. 

 Evaluation of Company’s proposed cost recovery and incentives for conservation and 
load management programs. 

38. EFSC 90/12/90-12A; Boston Edison Company Request For Approval Of Long-
Range Forecast Of Electric Needs And Requirements and Request For Approval Of 
Proposal To Construct A 306 MW Natural Gas/Distillate Oil-Fired Combined Cycle 
Generation Station At Its Edgar Station Site; March 4, 1991. 

 Evaluation of the need for and the economics of the Company’s proposed new 
generation facility. 
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SIMON METCALF 

Resource Insight, Inc. 

5 Water Street 

Arlington, Massachusetts 02476 

 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL EXPERIENCE 

June 2015–

Present 

Research Assistant, Resource Insight, Inc. Supporting investigations into 

costs of operating and retrofitting energy facilities with quantitative data 

synthesis and qualitative research. 

2014 Regional Photovoltaics Designer, SolarCity.  Designed residential 

photovoltaic systems in accordance with local regulations and customer 

wishes. 

2013–2014 Vehicle Engineer, Terrafugia. Designed structural & system components 

of prototype roadable aircraft. 

2012 Engineering Intern, GE Aviation.  Supported quality control for 

irrotational parts in GE’s Lynn MA facility, including for the LM6000 

turbine.  

EDUCATION 

BS, Mechanical Engineering, Tufts University, 2013. 



RICHARD FAESY, PRINCIPAL  

Energy	Futures	Group	•	P.O.	Box	587,	Hinesburg,	VT		05461	•	802‐482‐5001	•	rfaesy@energyfuturesgroup.com 
 

EDUCATION 

M.S. Coursework in Energy Management & Policy, University of Pennsylvania, 1986 
B.S., Resource Economics and Environmental Studies, University of Vermont, 1983 

EXPERIENCE 

2010-present: Principal, Energy Futures Group, Hinesburg, VT 
2000-2010: Energy Efficiency Division Manager, Vermont Energy Investment Corporation (VEIC), 
Burlington, VT 
1986-2000: Director, Energy Rated Homes of Vermont (ERH-VT), Burlington, VT 
1989-2000: Development Director, Single Family Services, VEIC, Burlington, VT 

PROFESSIONAL SUMMARY 

As a Certified Energy Rater and LEED Accredited Professional, Richard Faesy specializes in 
residential buildings, technologies and markets, with a focus on residential retrofit, energy rating and 
labeling, ENERGY STAR Homes, building codes, energy efficiency financing, green building and 
effective energy efficiency policy, program design and implementation.  He currently works with 
clients in Connecticut, Iowa, Massachusetts, New York, Rhode Island, Vermont, the U.S. federal 
government and others.  He has been active locally, regionally and nationally in many residential new 
construction and retrofit, energy rating and disclosure, energy financing, codes and green building 
efforts for more than 25 years.  Richard helped create and was the founding president of the board 
of the Northeast HERS Alliance, and was a founding board member of the Residential Energy 
Services Network (RESNET), serving from inception in 1995 until 2010, including terms as 
president and other officer positions.  Richard has been featured in a national Dateline/NBC story 
on energy efficiency and was also awarded RESNET’s Lifetime Achievement Award.  Prior to co-
founding Energy Futures Group, Richard managed the Energy Efficiency Division of the Vermont 
Energy Investment Corporation’s (VEIC) consulting business.   As a leader and technical expert, he 
has a reputation for delivering fresh thinking grounded in reality and experience in energy efficiency 
policy, program design and projects. Strong communication, management and planning skills ensure 
no surprises.  

PROJECTS 

 Connecticut Energy Efficiency Board. Residential programs advisor assisting the Board 
with goal setting, utility oversight and planning and technical assistance. 2007-present. 

 Connecticut Fund for the Environment / Environment Northeast.  Energy 
efficiency financing programs comparisons research white paper.  2012. 

 Eastern Resources Group.  Supported development of strategies and materials for DOE’s 
Better Buildings Neighborhood Program participants. 

 Efficiency Maine. Team lead for development of Maine Residential New Construction 
Technical Baseline Study, resulting in influencing adoption of Maine’s energy code. 2007- 2008. 

 Efficiency Vermont. Senior Advisor for residential program design and policy guidance for 
Vermont’s statewide, award-winning energy efficiency utility. 2000-present. 
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 Groton School, Groton, MA. Lead the development of a campus-wide assessment and 
follow-on services resulting in significant multi-year investments in energy improvements. 2006-
present. 

 High Meadows Fund (Vermont Community Foundation).  Interviews and research 
of Vermont Home Performance Contractors and fuel dealers, findings, recommendations, 
presentation, report and follow-on market development.  2012. 

 ICF Consulting.  Assisted with enhancements and modifications to EPA’s ENERGY STAR 
Labeled Homes Program. 2006. 

 Iowa Office of Consumer Advocate. Team lead for utility program portfolio review, 
testimony development, and on-going program modifications and enhancements. 2008-present. 

 Joint Management Committee (Massachusetts, Connecticut, Rhode Island and 
New Hampshire utilities). Oversight of the regional ENERGY STAR Homes Programs 
as a representative for the non-utility parties. 2003-2007. 

 LEED for Homes Provider. Led the Northeast team (of six firms) implementing the U.S. 
Green Building Council’s LEED for Homes rating system in the Northeast United States and 
Canada. 2006-2009. 

 Long Island Power Authority. Team lead on program design, planning, policy guidance 
and technical assistance on residential and multifamily sectors and development of Long Island 
Residential New Construction Technical Baseline Study. 2003-2010. 

 Massachusetts Energy Efficiency Advisory Council. Consultant overseeing the 
residential new construction and existing homes programs in Massachusetts. 2007-present. 

 Natural Resources Defense Council. Researched and developed white paper on policy 
options for building energy disclosure policies.  Worked with three communities to implement 
the recommended policies.  2012- present. 

 New Jersey Office of Clean Energy, Board of Public Utilities. Senior Advisor for 
program design and oversight of New Jersey ENERGY STAR Homes Program assisting the 
Honeywell Team and the Office of Clean Energy design and develop program modifications 
and enhancements, set goals, and provide budgeting and implementation assistance. 2004-2010. 

 Northeast HERS Alliance. President of the Board and manager of the regional initiative 
involving dozens of organizations and individuals working to further HERS and Energy 
Mortgages in the region. 1998-2007. 

 New York State Energy Research and Development Authority (NYSERDA).  
Senior Advisor in development of New York Energy Code Compliance Study.  2010 – 2011. 

 RESNET HERS Standards Drafting Committee. Participant in nine-person committee 
responsible for updating the Mortgage Industry National HERS Standards. 2002. 
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 Rhode Island Energy Efficiency and Resource Management Council. Consultant 
overseeing the residential new construction and existing homes programs in Rhode Island. 2008-
present. 

 U.S. Department of Energy/Better Buildings Neighborhood Program (BBNP). 
Supported Eastern Resources Group (ERG) and other DOE subs in development of strategic 
approaches and support materials in moving BBNP programs to success and sustainability. 

 U.S. Department of Energy/Oak Ridge National Laboratory. Senior Advisor and 
Aggregated Products lead for Program Design Team of DOE’s Technical Assistance Project for 
American Recovery and Reinvestment Act (ARRA) communities and states. 2010-2011. 

 U.S. DOE/National Renewable Energy Laboratory/Integrated Building and 
Construction Solutions (IBACOS).  Led development of a series of fact sheets as part of a 
guide to assist HVAC contractors to transition to become whole-house home performance 
contractors. 2011. 

 U.S. Environmental Protection Agency. Assisted with enhancements and modifications 
to EPA’s ENERGY STAR Homes Program. Assisted with development of multifamily 
ENERGY STAR program, Advanced Lighting Package and remodeling program.  2003-2010. 

 U.S. Green Building Council: Sub-contractor to Building Knowledge Research Group LLC 
to help develop LEED for Homes residential green rating system and implementation strategy.  
2005. 

 Vermont Department of Public Service.  Senior Advisor to NMR Group on baseline 
study of residential new construction and remodeling in Vermont. 2011 - present. 

 Vermont Department of Public Service: Led consulting team in the development of the 
Vermont Energy Code Compliance Plan. 2011 - 2012. 

 Vermont Residential Energy Code. Consultant and negotiator in the update of the Code 
and development of a mechanical ventilation standard for Vermont.  1999-2003. Representative 
for Efficiency Vermont on the Code Steering Committee for the Code update process.  2010-
2011. 

SELECTED PUBLICATIONS  

 Accelerating Energy Efficiency in the New Construction Market with Stretch Codes, 
Proceedings of ACEEE 2012 Summer Study on Energy Efficiency in Buildings, August 2012. 

 Residential Energy Disclosure Policies, for the Natural Resources Defense Council, June 2012. 

 Energy Efficiency Financing Programs Review, for the Connecticut Fund for the 
Environment/Environment Northeast, June 2012.  

 Interviews with Vermont Home Performance Contractors and Fuel Dealers, for the High 
Meadows Fund, May 2012. 
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 Vermont Energy Code Compliance Plan, for the Vermont Department of Public Service, 
January 2012. 

 The Costs and Benefits of Measuring if States Meet 90% Compliance with Building Codes, (with 
R. Wirtshafter et. al.), Proceedings of the International Energy Program Evaluation Conference 
(IEPEC), August 2011. 

 New York Energy Code Compliance Study, (with VEIC et. al.) New York State Energy 
Research and Development Authority (NYSERDA), pending publication. 

 Elements of Retrofit Program Incentive Design, (with J. Grevatt) for the US DOE Technical 
Assistance Project, pending publication on the DOE Solution Center web site, completed 2011. 

 Energy Disclosure and Upgrade Policies (with R. Foster) for the US DOE Technical Assistance 
Project, pending publication on the DOE Solution Center web site, completed 2011. 

 Funding for Energy Efficiency Programs for Unregulated Fuels, (with M. Testa) for the US 
DOE Technical Assistance Project, pending publication on the DOE Solution Center web site, 
completed 2011. 

 Residential Retrofit Program Design Guide, (with K. Tohinaka, N, Kuhn and D. Quinlan) for 
the US DOE Technical Assistance Project, published on the DOE Solution Center web site, 
May 2011. 

 “$300,000, 4 Bedrooms and a ‘B+’ Energy Rating” – Transforming Markets with Mandatory 
Building Energy Labeling” (with Philippe Dunsky, et. al.), Proceedings of ACEEE 2010 Summer 
Study on Energy Efficiency in Buildings, August 2010. 

 Valuing Building Energy Efficiency Through Disclosure and Upgrade Policies: A Roadmap for 
the Northeast U.S., with Dunsky Energy Consulting for the Northeast Energy Efficiency 
Partnerships (NEEP), November 2009. 

  “Maine New Homes: How a Baseline Study Can Set You Straight”, (with L. Badger, P. Scheckel 
and D. Conant), 2008 Summer Study on Energy Efficiency in Buildings Proceedings, American 
Council for an Energy-Efficient Economy, Washington, DC, August 2008. 

 “Energy Efficient Lighting in ENERGY STAR® Homes…It Just Keeps Getting Better”, (with  
J. Walsh, M. McNally,  J. Livermore, W. Blake, S. Bonanno, D. Conant, and L. Hoefgen), 2006 
Summer Study on Energy Efficiency in Buildings Proceedings, American Council for an Energy-
Efficient Economy, Washington, DC, August 2006. 

 “Residential New Construction Baseline Study Best Practices: Lessons Learned from Long 
Island, New York”, (with T. Galvin, S. Slote and K. Harrison), 2004 Summer Study on Energy 
Efficiency in Buildings Proceedings, American Council for an Energy-Efficient Economy, 
Washington, DC, August 2004. 

 “Herding Cats: Developing a Uniform Approach to Achieving Energy Efficiency in High-Rise 
Multifamily Buildings for EPA’s ENERGY STAR Program”, (with D. Hepinstall, and N. 
Stone), 2004 Summer Study on Energy Efficiency in Buildings Proceedings, American Council 
for an Energy-Efficient Economy, Washington, DC, August 2004. 
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 Long Island Residential New Construction Technical Baseline Study, for the Long Island Power 
Authority.  May 2004. 

SELECTED PRESENTATIONS  

 “Requirements for Labeling and Disclosure of Building Energy Efficiency”, Regulatory 
Assistance Project Advocates Webinar, March, 2012. 

 “90% Code Compliance with HERS Raters” and “Energy Disclosure Policies: How to Gain 
Traction”, RESNET Conference, Austin, Texas, February 2012. 

 Testimony to Vermont Senate and House Committees on Natural Resources and 
Energy on S.143 & H.497, “Building Energy Disclosure Legislation”, February 2012. 

 “Residential Retrofit Program Design Guide Overview”, U.S. DOE Technical Assistance 
Program National Webcast, May 2011. 

 “Supporting Energy-Efficiency Codes and Standards through DSM/EE Programs”, Regulatory 
Assistance Project Advocates Webinar, April, 2011. 

 “UVM Green Building Class - The History of LEED for Homes”, University of Vermont, 
Guest Lecturer, Burlington, Vermont, February, 2011. 

 “H.57: Energy Performance Disclosure”, Vermont House of Representatives General, 
Housing and Military Affairs Committee testimony, February 2011. 

 “What’s Happening with New Construction Standards”, Yestermorrow Design/Build School, 
Guest Lecturer, Warren, Vermont, February 2011. 

 “Designing Effective Incentives to Drive Residential Retrofit Program Participation”, U.S. 
DOE Technical Assistance Program National Webcast, October 2010. 

 “Vermont Residential Code Update”, Northeast Energy Efficiency Partnerships (NEEP) 
Regional EMV Forum and Public Policy Workshop: Roadmap to Claiming Savings from 
Building Energy Codes and Appliance Standards, Marlborough, MA, September 2010. 

 “Designing Effective Retrofit Programs”, U.S. DOE Technical Assistance Program 
National Webcast, August 2010. 

PROFESSIONAL AFFILIATIONS 

 Chair, Funding and Finance Committee, (Vermont) Thermal Efficiency Task Force, 2012 

 Member, (International) Zero Energy Homes Task Force, 2012 

 Member, Vermont Legislature’s Building Energy Disclosure Working Group, 2011 

 Board Director, Residential Energy Services Network (RESNET), 2002 – 2010 

 Board Director, Building for Social Responsibility, 1996 – 2000, 2005 - present 

 Member, Vermont Builds Greener Program Committee, 2000 - present 
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 Member, US Green Building Council / LEED for Homes Core Committee, 2003 - 2008 

 Member, High-Rise Multifamily ENERGY STAR National Working Group, 2003 - 2007 



Qualifications of 

ADAM AUSTER 

Resource Insight, Inc. 

5 Water Street 

Arlington, Massachusetts 02476 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL EXPERIENCE 

1992–

Present 

Editor, Resource Insight. Edit and prepare for final publication reports, expert 

testimony, and peer-review papers related to energy utilities. Prepare proposals for 

competitive public-sector procurement processes. Research, fact-check, and 

respond to client review. Initiate news stories in trade publications. Design and 

manage web site. Coach others’ writing skills. 

1989–92 Communications Director, Massachusetts Municipal Association. Supervised 

free-lancers and three full-time employees to publish The Beacon (monthly), The 

Municipal Advocate (quarterly), and other annual and special publications. Raised 

one sixth of the Association’s annual operating budget through fee-based services; 

modernized production process. Implemented content-management system to cut 

costs and create new services. Trained staff. 

1984–89 Communications Associate, Massachusetts Municipal Association. Wrote and 

edited news, feature, and editorials according to Chicago and AP style; set type on 

AM Varityper equipment and prepared camera-ready mechanicals for printers 

using traditional and electronic page-layout methods; took photographs using SLR 

camera; scheduled and coordinated jobs with printers and mailing houses; 

improved the quality and timeliness of publications. Led redesign of quarterly 

magazine. 

1981–83 Field Director, Clamshell Alliance. As principal staff person, planned and 

organized campaigns, established a state-wide legislative action network, testified 

before state, local, and federal units of government, managed direct-mail donor-

acquisition program, spoke to community and business groups, developed a nine-

week study curriculum on energy issues. As primary spokesperson, wrote timely 

press releases, developed contacts with print and broadcast reporters and news 

organizations, held news conferences, and publicized issues and events. 

EDUCATION 

BA with honors; Social Thought and Political Economy, University of Massachusetts at 

Amherst. 

Graduate work in economics and management, Harvard Extension School. 
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