

THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS

Chair, GAIL REGAN President, Cara Holdings Ltd.

President, PATRICIA ADAMS Secretary/Treasurer, ANNETTA TURNER MAX ALLEN ANDREW ROMAN Producer, IDEAS, CBC Radio Barrister & Solicitor, Miller Thomson ANDREW COYNE ANDREW STARK Columnist, National Post Rotman School of Management, University of Toronto GLENN FOX GEORGE TOMKO Professor of Economics, University of Guelph Resident Expert, PSI Initiative, University of Toronto IAN GRAY MICHAEL TREBILCOCK Chair, Law & Economics, University of Toronto President, St. Lawrence Starch Co. CLIFFORD ORWIN MARGARET WENTE

Columnist, The Globe and Mail

February 3, 2016

BY EMAIL & COURIER

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge St, Suite 2701 Toronto ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli:

Board File No. EB-2015-0116 Union Gas Limited – 2016 Rate Adjustment Application Energy Probe – Costs Submission

Professor of Political Science, University of Toronto

Pursuant to the Decision and Accounting Order, issued January 7, 2016, please find the Costs Submission of Energy Probe Research Foundation (Energy Probe) in the EB-2015-0116 proceeding for consideration of the Board.

Energy Probe apologizes to the Board and to the Applicant for the late filing of its Costs Submission.

Should you require additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours truly,

David S. MacIntosh

Swidt heath to

Case Manager

cc: Chris Ripley, Union Gas Limited (By email)

Crawford Smith, Torys LLP (By email)

Roger Higgin, Consultant to Energy Probe (By email) Brady Yauch, Consultant to Energy Probe (By email)

Shelley Grice, Consultant to Energy Probe (By email)

Parties of Interest (By email)

Energy Probe Research Foundation 225 BRUNSWICK AVE., TORONTO, ONTARIO M5S 2M6

Phone: (416) 964-9223 Fax: (416) 964-8239 E-mail: EnergyProbe@nextcity.com Internet: www.EnergyProbe.org



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Amaavit portion is	signed and sworn of aminied.					
		Instructions				
- All claims must be - A separate "Detai Disbursements Beil However, only one - The cost claim mu - A CV for each con	out is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. In Canadian dollars. If applicable, state in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state in Canadian dollars in Canadian dollars in Canadian in	e exchange rate and country of te: ned" (comprising a "Statement , analyst/consultant and articl covering the whole of the par it signed by a representative of provided to the Board as pre	of initial currency. Country: t of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of ling student/paralegal. ty's cost claim should be provided. of the party. scribed on the Cost Award Tariff.			
File # EB- 2015	i-0116	Process: Unio	on Gas Limited 2016 Rates			
Party: Er	nergy Probe Research Foundation	Affiant's Name:	Elizabeth Brubaker			
HST Number:	10730 5146 RT0001	нѕт	Rate Ontario: 6.50%			
	Full Registrant Unregistered Other	Qualify	ing Non-Profit Tax Exempt			
		Affidavit				
l,	Elizabeth Brubaker	, of the City/Town of	Toronto			
in the Province/	State of	Ontario, Canada	, swear or affirm that:			
 I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed". The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. 						
Signature of Aff	fiant					
Sworn or affirm	ned before me at the City/Town o	of	<i>,</i>			
in the Province/			<u> </u>			
			(date)			

Commissioner for taking Affidavits



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB-	2015-0116		Process:	Union Gas Limited 2016 Rates	
Party:	Energy Probe Research	ch Foundatio	on		
	Sum	mary of Fe	es and Disburseme	nts Being Claimed	
Legal/cons	ultant/other fees	\$	10,135.00		
Disbursem	ents	\$	() 		
HST		\$	658.78		
Total Cost	Claim	\$	10,793.78		
			Payment Informati	on	
			rayment imormati	OII	
Make cheque payable to: Energy Probe Research Foundation					
Se	end payment to this addre				
		Toron	to, Canada M5S	2M6	
Attention: [in a David Manlat	I-	



File # EB-	2015-0116		Process:	Union (Gas Limited 20.	16 Rates
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundat	tion	Service Pr	ovider Name:_	Dr. Roge	r Higgin
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (check one)	Year Called to Bar		Complete Practising/Year Experie	s of Relevant
	Legal Counsel				30	concest.
	Articling Student/Paralegal				_	
	Consultant				Hourly Rate:	\$330
	Analyst _	_ ⊔				
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	hed	HST Rate Cha	arged (enter %):	6.5%
		CV provi	ided within previo	us 24 months		-

	Ľ CV provi	iaea	within previo	us 2	4 months		
St	atement o	f Fe	ees Being	Cla	imed		
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	(m):	\$ =	\$ 0#8
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	•:	\$ #	\$:: :::
Technical Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$.	\$ CORT	\$ 19
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	F#6	\$ 4	\$ 7(4)
Interrogatories							
Preparation	7.00	\$	330.00	\$	2,310.00	\$ 150.15	\$ 2,460.15
Responses	3.00	\$	330.00	\$	990.00	\$ 64.35	\$ 1,054.35
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	¥8	\$ 2	\$ 9 2
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ 2	\$ 0 : e:
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	25 0	\$ π	\$ 951
Attendance	6.00	\$	330.00	\$	1,980.00	\$ 128.70	\$ 2,108.70
Proposal Preparation	1.00	\$	330.00	\$	330.00	\$ 21.45	\$ 351.45
Argument							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	(*)	\$	\$ (A.#.)
Oral Hearing							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	36	\$ -	\$ ¥
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	149	\$ 일	\$ £ ₽
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	± ₹ 3	\$	\$:
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	· •	\$	\$ (-
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$		\$ 	\$ (<u>\$</u>
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	5,610.00	\$ 364.65	\$ 5,974.65



File # EB-	2015-0116	Process:	Jnion Gas Limited 2016 Rates
Party:	Energy Probe Research Founc	Service Provider Name	Dr. Roger Higgin

Stateme	ent of Disbursements Being Claim	ed		
	Net Cost	HST	Т	otal
Scanning/Photocopy			\$	
Printing			\$	-
Courier			\$	(2)
Telephone/Fax			\$	(2)
Transcripts			\$: #:
Travel: Air			\$: * :
Travel: Car			\$	(3)
Travel: Rail			\$	-
Travel (Other):			\$	125
Parking			\$	3.00
Тахі			\$	350
Accommodation			\$	(5)
Meals			\$	-
Other:			\$	=
Other:	- L		\$	3€:
Other:			\$	
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$ -	\$ -	\$	-



SPA Inc

15 Malabar Place Don Mills, Toronto, Ontario M3B 1A4 (416) 391-0738 fax (416) 391-0738 Invoice No. 2016-EP-04

INVOICE

Cus	stomer					
Name	Energy Probe Research Foundation					
Address	225 Bruns	wick Avenue				
City	Toronto	Province Ont	P.C. M5S 2M6			
	Attn Mr [David MacIntosh				

Date 2015 01 29
Project No Union Gas Limited
Title EB-2015-0116
2016 Rates

Date	Description Of Services	Unit Price	TOTAL
Oct 15 2015	Prepn Review Application Make Notes	\$330.00	\$1,320.00
Oct 25 2015	Prepn Draft IRs send to client	\$330.00	\$990.00
Nov 8 2015	Prepn Review IR responses Notes for ADF	\$330.00	\$990.00
Nov 10 2015	Attend Settlement Conference	\$330.00	\$990.00
Nov 11 2015	Attend Settlement Conference	\$330.00	\$990.00
Nov 18 2015	Review Draft Settlement Proposal	\$330.00	\$330.00
	Oct 15 2015 Oct 25 2015 Nov 8 2015 Nov 10 2015 Nov 11 2015	Oct 15 2015 Prepn Review Application Make Notes Oct 25 2015 Prepn Draft IRs send to client Nov 8 2015 Prepn Review IR responses Notes for ADF Nov 10 2015 Attend Settlement Conference Nov 11 2015 Attend Settlement Conference Nov 18 2015 Review Draft Settlement Proposal	Oct 15 2015 Prepn Review Application Make Notes \$330.00 Oct 25 2015 Prepn Draft IRs send to client \$330.00 Nov 8 2015 Prepn Review IR responses Notes for ADF \$330.00 Nov 10 2015 Attend Settlement Conference \$330.00 Nov 11 2015 Attend Settlement Conference \$330.00

Taxes

17.00

Payment Details
Cheque

Name SPA INC

Date

	\$5,610.00
HST	\$729.30
PST	
TOTAL	\$6,339.30

HST NUMBER 88413 6714 RT0001



File # EB-	2015-0116		Process:	Union (Gas Limited 2016 Rates	
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundation		Service Prov	vider Name:_	David MacIntosh	-,
			Year Called to		Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Bar		Experience	
	Legal Counsel				16	
	Articling Student/Paralegal					- 10
	Consultant	V			Hourly Rate: \$290	1
	Analyst				<u>*</u>	•
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	hed	HST Rate Cha	arged (enter %): 6.5%	
		✓ CV prov	ided within previous	24 months		

St	atement o	f Fe	es Being	Clai	imed		
	Hours		urly Rate		Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	=)'	\$ 2	\$ 24
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	(4)	\$ -	\$:=
Technical Conference							
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	1 4 8	\$ 表	\$ (1.00m) (1.00m)
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	*	\$ 5-7	\$ 美
Interrogatories							
Preparation	2.25	\$	290.00	\$	652.50	\$ 42.41	\$ 694.91
Responses	0.75	\$	290.00	\$	217.50	\$ 14.14	\$ 231.64
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	- 3	\$ Ē,	\$ 第
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	=	\$ =	\$ 2 4
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	(#);	\$ 	\$ ()
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$. # 2	\$ 	\$ ((5)
Proposal Preparation	1.00	\$	290.00	\$	290.00	\$ 18.85	\$ 308.85
Argument							
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$ æ5	\$ 9100
Oral Hearing							
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$:5::	\$ 2.5	\$ (/=:
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$		\$ 影	\$ 92
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	(資)	\$ (48)	\$ (-)
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$:•:	\$.+):	\$ 0#E
Case Management	0.75	\$	170.00	\$	127.50	\$ 8.29	\$ 135.79
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	1,287.50	\$ 83.69	\$ 1,371.19



File # EB-	2015-0116	Process:	Jnion Gas Limited 2016 Rates
Party:	Energy Probe Research Founc	Service Provider Name	David MacIntosh

	Net Cost	HST	T	otal
Scanning/Photocopy	ĺ		\$	-
Printing			\$	-
Courier			\$	
Telephone/Fax			\$	
Transcripts			\$	
Travel: Air			\$	9
Travel: Car			\$	34
Travel: Rail			\$:
Travel (Other):			\$	
Parking			\$	_ =
Тахі			\$	-
Accommodation			\$	
Meals			\$:-
Other:			\$	
Other:			\$	
Other:			\$	- 3
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$ -	\$ -	\$	

Time Sheet for D. MacIntosh

Board File: EB-2015-0116 Union Gas 2016 Rates

Summary:	Hours				
Preparation	4.00				
Attend. Tech.	0.00				
Attend. ADR	0.00				
Attend. Hearing	0.00				
Argument Prep.	0.00				
Case Mngt. (CM)	0.75				
Total	4.75				

Date	Hours	Note
18-Sep-15	0.50	Draft Notice of Intervention
24-Sep-15	1.00	Preliminary Review of Prefiled Evidence
25-Oct-15	0.75	Draft Interrogatories
08-Nov-15	0.75	Review Interrogatory Responses
18-Nov-15	0.50	Review Settlement Proposal
05-Dec-15	0.50	Review Decision and Order
Total	4.00	Preparation

Date	Hours	Note
18-Sep-15 27-Oct-15		CM - File Notice of Intervention CM - Check & File Interrogatories
Total	0.75	Case Management



File # EB-	2015-0116		Process:	Union G	Gas Limited 2016 Rates	
Party:	Energy Probe Research Found	Service Prov	vider Name: _	Brady Yauch	_0	
			Year Called to		Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Bar		Experience	
	Legal Counsel				5	
	Articling Student/Paralegal					
	Consultant	/			Hourly Rate: \$170	
	Analyst					
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	ched	HST Rate Cha	orged (enter %): 6.5%	
		☑ CV prov	ided within previous :	24 months	**	-112);

C+	atement o	f Fe	es Reing	Clai	imed		
	Hours		urly Rate	_	Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	(#C)	\$ =	\$ (#)
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$		\$ -	\$ (₩)
Technical Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	5 0	\$ 	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	<u></u>	\$ 8	\$:
Interrogatories							
Preparation	16.00	\$	170.00	\$	2,720.00	\$ 176.80	\$ 2,896.80
Responses		\$	170.00	\$	æ.v	\$ н	\$
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	<u>2</u> 6	\$ 8	\$ ·
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	**	\$ ii.	\$ 1 1 - 1
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	*	\$ -	\$ 6 7 2
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	<u> </u>	\$ 	\$ <u></u>
Proposal Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	27	\$ 2	\$ 24
Argument							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$:=:	\$ -	\$ i e
Oral Hearing							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	- 36	\$ -	\$) <u>-</u>
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	=2:	\$ =	\$ 844
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$:=:	\$ -	\$,(⊜:
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$:#2	\$ -	\$ 35/
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$		\$ 5/	\$ E
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	2,720.00	\$ 176.80	\$ 2,896.80



File # EB-	2015-0116	Process: Un	nion Gas Limited 2016 Rates	
Party:	Energy Probe Research Founc	Service Provider Name:	Brady Yauch	

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed								
	Net Cost	HST	Т	otal				
Scanning/Photocopy			\$	£				
Printing			\$;=:				
Courier			\$	3.50				
Telephone/Fax			\$					
Transcripts			\$	-				
Travel: Air			\$	72				
Travel: Car			\$: -				
Travel: Rail			\$; = ;				
Travel (Other):			\$:::				
Parking			\$	•				
Тахі			\$:=:				
Accommodation			\$:#:				
Meals			\$: -				
Other:			\$					
Other:			\$	-				
Other:			\$	74				
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$ -	\$ -	\$					

Brady Yauch

67A Auburn Avenue Toronto ON M6H 2L8 GST/HST 802822023 RT0001

Bill To:

For:

Intervener services for EB-2015-0116 Union 2016 gas rates

DATE: 2/3/16

Mr. David MacIntosh Energy Probe Research Foundation 225 Brunswick Avenue Toronto, Ontario, M5S 2M6

Date	DESCRIPTION	Time
October 21, 2015	Reviewed evidence and drafted IRs for EB-2015-0116 Union 2016 gas rates	4 Hours
October 23. 2015	Reviewed evidence and drafted IRs for EB-2015-0116 Union 2016 gas rates	8 Hours
October 26. 2015	Reviewed evidence and drafted IRs for EB-2015-0116 Union 2016 gas rates	4 hours
		Total 16 hours



File # EB-	2015-0116		Process: _	Union (Gas Limited 201	6 Rates	
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundation		Service Provider Name:		Shelley Grid	ce	
	SEDVICE DROVIDED TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar		Completed Practising/Years	of Relevant	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (check one) Legal Counsel		Dar	ī	Experience 14		
	Articling Student/Paralegal			L			
	Consultant	✓			Hourly Rate:	\$230	
	Analyst	_ 🗆					
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	ched	HST Rate Cha	arged (enter %):	6.5%	
			ided within previou	is 24 months			

			within previo				
St	atement o	f Fe	es Being	Clai	med		
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	S	ubtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ 8	\$ 12
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	(4)	\$ 2	\$ 924
Technical Conference							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$: #X	\$	\$ <u>.</u>
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	3 (\$ =	\$
Interrogatories							
Preparation	2.25	\$	230.00	\$	517.50	\$ 33.64	\$ 551.14
Responses		\$	230.00	\$	(#):	\$ *	\$
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$.	\$	\$ ()
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	20	\$ <u> </u>	\$
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	(#1)	\$ *	\$)•:
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	***	\$ 	\$
Proposal Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	5 0	\$ 5	\$ =
Argument							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	(2)	\$ 2	\$ 35
Oral Hearing							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	*	\$	\$ ()
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	表的	\$ 	\$ 3
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	14 9	\$ 2	\$ 393
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	*:	\$ -	\$ ·
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	*	\$ -	\$:#:
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	517.50	\$ 33.64	\$ 551.14



File # EB-	2015-0116	Process: Unio	on Gas Limited 2016 Rates		
Party:	Energy Probe Research Founc	Service Provider Name:	Shelley Grice		

	Net Cost	HST	Total	
Scanning/Photocopy			\$	-
Printing			\$	1
Courier			\$	-
Telephone/Fax			\$	
Transcripts			\$	
Travel: Air			\$	
Travel: Car			\$	8
Travel: Rail			\$	(4
Travel (Other):			\$:
Parking			\$	8 8
Тахі			\$	5
Accommodation			\$	7
Meals			\$	34
Other:			\$	
Other:			\$	8
Other:			\$	
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$ -	\$ -	\$	

Shelley Grice, P. Eng.

46 Scarborough Road, Toronto ON M4E 3M5 416-694-3917, shelley.grice@rogers.com

INVOICE #361

February 2, 2016

Energy Probe Research Foundation 225 Brunswick Avenue Toronto, Ontraio M5S 2M6 Attention: Mr. David MacIntosh

Re:

Union Gas Limited

EB-2015-0116 2016 Rates, Custom IR, Year 3

Description	Charge Type	Hours	Rate	Amount
Professional Services of				
Shelley Grice	Preparation	2.25	\$230.00	\$517.50
	Attendance		\$230.00	\$0.00
	Argument		\$230.00	\$0.00
Sub-Total				\$517.50
HST on Services				\$67.28
Disbursements				
HST on Disbursements				
GST # 817042757RT000	1	2.25	TOTAL	\$584.78

Details are included in the attached time sheet. Please make cheque payable to Shelley Grice.

Sincerely,

Shelley Grice, P. Eng.

Shellygrice

Shelley Grice				
PROJECT 1	TIME SHEET	DATE	#361	
EB-2015-0116 Union Gas L 2016 Rates, PROJECT T	imited	2015-12-01		
DATE	TASK DESCRIPTION	CHARGE TYPE	Hours	
2015-10-26	Preparation; Review application; Prepare interrogatories; emails	Preparation	2.25	
		Total	2.25	