VINCENT J. DEROSE
T 613.787.3589
vderose@blg.com

Our File # 339583-000168

By electronic filing

February 4, 2016

Kirsten Walli

Board Secretary
Ontario Energy Board
P.O. Box 2319

2300 Yonge Street

27" floor

Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli

Re: Ontario Power Generation Inc, (“OPG”)

Borden Ladner Gervais LLP
World Exchange Plaza

100 Queen St. Suite 1300
Ottawa, ON, Canada K1P 1J9
T 613.237 5160

F 613.230 8842

big.com

Borden Ladner Gervais

Motion to Review and Vary Decision with Reasons in EB-2013-0321

Board File #: EB-2014-0369

Pursuant to the Board’s Decision and Order dated January 28, 2016, we enclose a Cost Claim on behalf

of our client, Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters (“CME”).

A copy of this Cost Claim has been forwarded to OPG as instructed in the Decision and Order.

Please contact me if you have any questions or require any additional information.

Yours very truly

|

\__.'_,._. -_—

i
e of
Vincent J. DeRose

enclosure
c. Charles Keizer and Crawford Smith (Torys LLP)
Paul Clipsham (CME)

OTTOL: 7456508: v1

Lawyers | Patent & Trade-mark Agents



Ontario Energy Board xf%a
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS =
Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and
electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in
the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are embedded in the form to assist with calculations.
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.
Rate: Country:

- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" {comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of Disbursements
Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal. However, only one "Summary of Fees and
Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.
- A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff.
Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

Ontario Power Generation Inc. - IVMlotion to review and vary

File # EB- 2014-0369 Process: Decision with Reasons in EB-2013-0321

Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters Affiant's Name: Vincent J. DeRose

HST Number: 10807 5482 RT0001 HST Rate Ontario:  13.00%
Full Registrant O Qualifying Non-Profit O

Unregistered O Tax Exempt O
Other

[ Affidavit

1, Vincent J. DeRose , of the City of Ottawa

in the Province of Ontario , swear or affirm that:

1. | am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.

2. | have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being
Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".

3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements
Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process
referred to above.

4. This cost glaim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in

sections f705\and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.
o —
'l\-._/
Signature of Affiant
Sworn or affirmed before me at the City of Ottawa ;

in the Province of~ Ontario ,on February 4, 2016

P
/ L (date)

I"'._h y \{
Page 1 of 2



Ontario Energy Board k%%

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2014-0369

Ontario Power Generation Inc. - Motion to review and vary
Process: Decision with Reasons in EB-2013-0321

Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Legal/consultant/other fees
Disbursements
HST

$23,297.00
$1,289.09
$3,195.52

Total Cost Claim

$27,781.61

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to:

Send payment to this address:

Borden Ladner Gervais LLP

Borden Ladner Gervais LLP

Attention: Vincent J. DeRose

World Exchange Plaza

100 Queen Street, Suite 1300

Ottawa, ON K1P 1J9

Page 2 of 2



Ontario Energy Board "%&
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS e
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Ontario Power Generation Inc. - iViotion to review and vary

File # EB- 2014-0369 Process: Decision with Reasons in EB-2013-0321
Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters Service Provider Name: Peter C.P. Thompson, QC
Year Called to Completed Years Practising/Years

vi rovi T check one
SEiceRRovidERijpR ( 4 Bar of relevant experience

Legal Counsel 1967 | 45+

Articling Student/Paralegal

O
Consultant d Hourly Rate:| $330.00
Analyst g
O CV attached HST Rate Charged (enter %) | 13%

O CV provided within previous 24 months

For Consultant/Analyst:

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hours Hourly rate| Subtotal HST Total
Preparation: 4,70 | $330.00( S$1,551.00 $201.63 $1,752.63
Oral Hearing: Preparation 14.90| $330.00 $4,917.00 $639.21 $5,556.21
Attendance $330.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Other Conf: Preparation $330.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Attendance $330.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES $6,468.00 $840.84 $7,308.84




File #:

Process:

Party:
Name:

Dec 12-14
Dec 18-14
Jan 13-15
Jan 21-15

Jan 27-15

Feb 3-15
Feb 20-15
Feb 24-15

Feb 26-15
Feb 27-15
Mar 2-15
Mar 2-15
Mar 3-15

Mar 17-15

Mar 23-15

Preparation

Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees being Claimed

EB-2014-0369

ke

Qniuvd

Ontario Power Generation Inc. (OPG)

Motion to Review and Vary the Decision with Reasons in EB-2013-0321

Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters

Peter Thompson (PCT)

Considering OPG's Motion for Review and Variance

Reviewing OPG's Payment Order

Considering Board's Notice of Hearing and Procedural Order No. 1.
Reviewing OPG's Motion for Review; considering possible responses to
issues raised by OPG

Reviewing OPG's Submissions; considering responses for discussion
with E. Blanchard

Organize Motion materials; consider responses to OPG's Argument
Reviewing Board Staff Submissions

Considering and drafting outline of response to OPG's Motion to Vary
for discussion with E. Blanchard

Considering, dictating and revising draft Submissions for E. Blanchard
to consider; brief conference

Reviewing E. Blanchard's draft Submissions and providing comments
thereon

Reviewing, revising and finalizing E. Blanchard's Submissions on
Motion to Vary, including email and telephone communications with E.
Blanchard

Reviewing Arguments of AMPCO, VECC, Society and PWU
Reviewing Arguments of Energy Probe and SEC

Conference with E. Blanchard

Reviewing case references provided by OPG; conference with E.
Blanchard

Total Hours for Peter Thompson:

Hours
4.7 x $330.00/hr =

Oral Hearing Prep 14.9 x $330.00/hr =

OTT01: 7159239: v1

19.6 Total Fees for Peter Thompson:

19.6

0.5 Preparation
0.1 Preparation
0.1 Preparation
1.8 Preparation
2.2 Preparation
1.2 Oral Hearing Prep
1.2 Oral Hearing Prep
2.8 Oral Hearing Prep
2.5 Oral Hearing Prep
1.5 Oral Hearing Prep
29 Oral Hearing Prep
1.0 Oral Hearing Prep
0.5 Oral Hearing Prep
0.1 Oral Hearing Prep
1.2 Oral Hearing Prep
Fees
1,551.00
4,917.00
$6,468.00



Ontario Energy Board K%%
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS .
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Ontario Power Generation Inc. - Motion to review and vary

File # EB- 2014-0369 Process: Decision with Reasons in EB-2013-0321
Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters Service Provider Name: Vincent J. DeRose
Service Provider Type (check one) Year Called to Completed Years Practi'slng/Years
Bar of relevant experience

Legal Counsel 2001 I 14

Articling Student/Paralegal

O

Consultant [ Hourly Rate:| $290.00
]
O

Analyst
For Consultant/Analyst: CV attached HST Rate Charged (enter %) 13%

[ CV provided within previous 24 months

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hours Hourly rate| Subtotal HST Total
Preparation: 8.60 | $290.00( $2,494.00 $324.22 $2,818.22
Oral Hearing: Preparation 10.00 | $290.00| $2,900.00 $377.00 $3,277.00
Attendance $290.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Post-Decision Activities: 1.00 [ $290.00 $290.00 $37.70 $327.70
Other Conf: Preparation $290.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Attendance $290.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES $5,684.00 $738.92 $6,422.92




File #:

Process:

Party:
Name:

Dec 10-14
Dec 11-14
Dec 12-14
Dec 16-14
Dec 19-14
Dec 27-14
Feb 22-15
Feb 25-15
Feb 26-15
Feb 27-15
Mar 23-15
Jan 28-16

Preparation

Oral Hearing Prep 10.0 x $290.00/hr =
Post-Decision Activities 1.0 x $290.00/hr =
19.6 Total Fees for Vince DeRose:

Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees being Claimed e

EB-2014-0369
Ontario Power Generation Inc. (OPG)
Motion to Review and Vary the Decision with Reasons in EB-2013-0321
Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters
Vince DeRose (VJD)
Reviewing Notice of Motion 0.7 Preparation
Reviewing Notice of Motion 1.1 Preparation
Reviewing OPG response to comments on Draft Rate Order 1.1 Preparation
Reviewing OPG Motion for Variance 2.1 Preparation
Reviewing Board Payment Amounts Order 0.5 Preparation
Reviewing TFP Report by London Economics 3.1 Preparation
Reviewing Board Staff Submissions and OPG motion 3.0 Oral Hearing Prep
Drafting Submissions re Niagara Tunne! 4.2 Oral Hearing Prep
Meeting with E. Blanchard; redrafting Submissions 1.1 Oral Hearing Prep
Redrafting Submissions on motion to vary 1.3 Oral Hearing Prep
Meeting with E. Blanchard 04 Oral Hearing Prep
Reviewing Decision and Order 1.0 Post-Decision Activities

Total Hours for Vince DeRose: 19.6

Hours
8.6 x $290.00/hr =

Fees
2,494.00
2,900.00

290.00

$5,684.00



Ontario Energy Board ﬁf%)i

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS el
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Ontario Power Generation inc. - Miotion to review and vary

File # EB- 2014-0369 Process: Decision with Reasons in EB-2013-0321
Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters Service Provider Name: Emma Blanchard
Service Provider Type (check one) Year Called to Completed Years Pract!sing/Years
Bar of relevant experience
Legal Counsel I 8

Articling Student/Paralegal O
Consultant O Hourly Rate:l $230.00

Analyst O

O

For Consultant/Analyst: CV attached HST Rate Charged (enter %) 13%

d CV provided within previous 24 months

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hours Hourly rate| Subtotal HST Total
Preparation: $230.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Oral Hearing: Preparation 33,40 $230.00| $7,682.00 $998.66 $8,680.66
Attendance 7.00 | $230.00| $1,610.00 $209.30 $1,819.30
Post-Decision Activities: 1.70| $230.00 $391.00 $50.83 $441.83
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES [ | $9,683.00] $1,258.79| $10,941.79




Ontario Energy Board Elmq
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS Gl
Detail of Fees being Claimed N

File #: EB-2014-0369
Process: Ontario Power Generation Inc. (OPG)
) Motion to Review and Vary the Decision with Reasons in EB-2013-0321
Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters
Name: Emma Blanchard (EB)
Feb 20-15 Review OPG Submissions re Motion to Review; review Decision and 3.6 Oral Hearing Prep
Submissions of SEC, Board Staff , Energy Probe and AMPCO re
Niagara Tunnel and tax loss; prepare outline of written submissions;
conference with V. DeRose
Feb 22-15 Receipt and review of Board Staff Submissions; prepare additional 1.3 Oral Hearing Prep
notes for Submissions
Feb 24-15 Conference with V. DeRose and P. Thompson; draft CME Submissions 0.2 Oral Hearing Prep
Feb 26-15 Continue drafting Submissions re Motion to Vary; conference with P. 4.1 Oral Hearing Prep
Thompson
Feb 27-15 Continue drafting written Submissions 5.5 Oral Hearing Prep
Feb 28-15 Continue revising Submissions re Motion to Vary 3.0 Oral Hearing Prep
Mar 1-15 Continue revising draft Submissions re OPG Motion to Vary 20 Oral Hearing Prep
Mar 2-15 Continue revising draft submissions re OPG Motion to Vary 2.5 Oral Hearing Prep
Mar 17-15 Email from P. Clipsham re total bill impacts of Decision; review OPG 1.2 Oral Hearing Prep
Submissions re draft Rate Order; prepare summary for P. Clipsham;
conference with P. Thompson re effect of deferral and variance account
clearing on total bill impact
Mar 19-15 Consider materiality issue 0.2 Oral Hearing Prep
Mar 22-15 Prepare notes for Oral Hearing of OPG Motion to Vary 0.3 Oral Hearing Prep
Mar 23-15 Continue preparing for Motion to Vary; receipt and review of additional 7.5 Oral Hearing Prep
case law from OPG; conference with P. Thompson r: prudence doctrine
and tax loss carry forward
Mar 24-15 Continue preparing for Oral Hearing of Motion to Vary 2.0 Oral Hearing Prep
Mar 24-15 Attend and present argument at Oral Hearing of Motion to Vary 7.0 Oral Hearing Attend
Jan 28-16 Preliminary review of Decision and Order re Motion to Vary 0.2 Post-Decision Activities
Jan 29-16 Continue review of Decision and Order; prepare comments for client 1.5 Post-Decision Activities
Total Hours for Emma Blanchard: 42.1
Hours Fees
Oral Hearing Prep 334 x $230.00/hr = 7,682.00
Oral Hearing Attend 7.0 x $230.00/hr = 1,610.00
Post-Decision Activities 1.7 x $230.00/hr = 391.00

42.1 Total Fees for Emma Blanchard: $9,683.00



Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Lo

Ontario Power Generation Inc. - Motion to review and vary

File # EB- 2014-0369 Process: Decision with Reasons in EB-2013-0321

Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters Service Provider Name: Emma Blanchard

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed
Net Cost HST Total

Scanning/Photocopying: 329 copies @ $0.25 each $82.25 $10.69 $92.94
Westlaw Searches $37.00 $4.81 $41.81
Quicklaw Searches $189.02 $24.57 $213.59
Travel: Airfare $699.25 $90.90 $790.15
Taxis $81.42 $10.58 $92.00
Accommodation $180.25 $22.75 $203.00
Meals $19.90 $2.60 $22.50
Other: $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: $1,289.09 $166.91 $1,456.00
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Castanza, Suzanne

From: Velho, Paulina

Sent: February-04-16 2:58 PM

To: Castanza, Suzanne

Subject: FW: Porter Airlines Itinerary - Ottawa to Toronto - Mon 23 Mar 2015

Here’s the flight

Paulina Velho
B LG Coordinator - Legal Finance Team
Borden Ladner Gervals T7613.237.0234 ext 30437 | F613.787.3731 | M613.237.5160 | pvelho@blg.com
World Exchange Plaza, 100 Queen St, Suite 1300, Ottawa, ON, Canada K1P 1J9

Borden Ladner Gervais LLP | It begins with service
Calgary | Montréal | Ottawa | Toronto | Vancouver
blg.com

To manage your communication preferences or unsubscribe, please click on
blg.com/mypreferences/

b% Please consider the environment before printing this email

sniination or copying of this message by anyone other than & named recipient is strictly prohibited. Il you are nol a named
sponsibie for delivering this message o a named recipient, please notify us immediately, and permanently destroy this
message ard any copies you may have Waining: Email may rol be secure unless properly encrypted

From: PorterAirlines@flyporter.com [mailto:PorterAirlines@flyporter.com]

Sent: February-04-16 2:50 PM

To: Velho, Paulina

Subject: Porter Airlines Itinerary - Ottawa to Tororito - Mon 23 Mar 2015 )

Thank you for flying Porter

Booking status: Closed

ithin 2
Porter confirmation number: H74YJJ L e

MON 23 MAR 2015

OTTAWA, CA (YOW) TO TORONTO, CA (YTZ)

PD 276 - 9:10 PM ' 10:15 PM Duration: 1hr 5min



Ottawa, CA (YOW) Toronto, CA (YTZ) Seats: 166
Ariive af airport by 8:16 PV

TUE 24 MAR 2015

TORONTO, CA (YTZ) TO OTTAWA, CA (YOW)

\ ’ ] 9:51 PM Duration: 56 minutes

i i
=s=="Toronto, CA (YTZ) Ottawa, CA (YOW)
Artive ai oirport by 8:25 PM Seats: 124

Modify Your Booking

PASSENGER
/ Emma Blanchard /
LVIPorter Member 1136000825

BAGGAGE POLICY

lil Checked baggage policy

Weight fee per bag above
1st bag 2nd bag 23kg
Pay in Pay at Pay in Pay at

advance airport advance airport
Ottawa -
Toronto $25 - $28.75 $25 - $28.75 $35-$40.25 | $35-$40.25 $75 - $86.25
Flexible fare class
Toronto -
Ottawa $25 - $28.75 $25 - $28.75 $35-$40.25 | $35-$40.25 $75 - $86.25
Flexible fare class

If you have prepaid for your checked baggage and are traveling with a partner airline, please be prepared to present
your itinerary at the airline check-in counter.

See [ull checked bapeage rules

i Carry-on baggage policy
TWO items of carry-on baggage are permitted, free of charge, per passenger.
See all carry-on baggape rules

SUMMARY OF PURCHASES

+ Flights
Ottawa - Toronto (paid)
Toronto - Ottawa (paid)

|i|Checked bags
Ottawa - Toronto Bags not added ©Add a bag




Toronto - Ottawa

.l Seat selection
Ottawa - Toronto
Toronto - Ottawa

Bags not added

1 reserved seat

1 reserved seat

Enhance your travel experience

Hertz Car Rental
(See details)

Hertz.

FARE INFORMATION

Air transportation charges

Taxes, fees and charges

Total Fare Price

NET £99.45
ysTt  90.90

OAdd a bag

Save $10 plus tax per bag when you pay online

OUpgrade seats
OLiperade seats

$514.00 CAD
$276.15 CAD

$790.15 CAD

See Complete Recelpt

CHANGE FEES i

Same day airport change per passenger®*

Advance change per passenger

Ottawa - Toronto
Flexible fare class

Complimentary

$50 per direction +/- fare difference

Toronto - Ottawa
Flexible fare class

Complimentary

$50 per direction +/- fare difference

* Subject to availability

DAY OF TRAVEL

Identification requirements
All passengers travelling within Canada are required to present one piece of valid government issued photo

identification

Please click here for departure airport information.

We look forward to seeing you soon!

Rated top small airli
Traveler's Readers

ne in the world by Conde Nast
Choice Awards

See more information

flyporter.com

Porter Airlines is proud to be rated an official 4 Star
Airline by SKYTRAX



[Job# |
RECEIPT FOR CAB FARE

Amount .';& é; . g Date /b/éi Yo _93 ' /5
From DS - AND p~

To /.‘\77:7 |
€abiNo. )/ YDriver ) 7//4 X /

BLOELINE

H S T. Included in meter fare

NET 8.4

‘%’

The driver is an independent Contractor, any
HST input eredit may be claimed as “notional™
* or applied 1o the driver’s HST registered |

un ot “axl number, not Imperial Taxi ! ST .
Date: #L%CAB# ?,lm O ‘ 'L/ /0 5 g

Amount },_,_ HST#
DOWNLOAD OUR APP

I'Tmn www.smarttaxi.ca
‘ El 401

To: -

Signature: S

. e
= 7G3.%

RECEIPT
Date I — 0D — 1%

Cab No /7 (474 _nmount=Z 2. 0 Vd)
. ("/ 7

Driver =
L e —
From:
To:
Job #

RecEIPT FOR CAB FARE

D5 e e O 5/24 /7:‘}#

Amount 2= = E%

From

To

g /

cabNo. / _a] } Driver /{_9.»/{\97 .
g . ol e

HST |nciutder in meter fare ‘ |E[@ Wi | =




CAMBRIDGE SUITES HOTEL

15 Richmond Street East
Toronto, Ontario, Canada M5C 1N2
(416) 368-1990 Fax: (416) 601-3751 Toll Free:1 800 463-1990
www.cambridgesuitestoronto.com

Guest Name Emma Blanchard Room Number: 2103
Borden Ladner Gervais LLP Folio Number: R58788
100 Queen St, Suite 1300
Ottawa, ON K1p 1J9 CN

Group Number:;
No. of Guests: 1

Rate: 175.00
C/O Clerk: STEW
CC No CL#:
Arrival; 03/23/15 Time: 10:27 PM Departure: 03/24/15 Time: 07:57 AM Status: HIST
Charge Type Description Charges
03/23/15 2103 ROOM CHARGE $175.00
03/23/15 2103t DESTINATION MARKETING FEE DESTINATION MARKETING PROGRAM $5.25
03/23/15 2103t ROOM HST ROOM HST $22.75
03/24/15 Ck Out 07:56 VISA-PAYMENT -$203.00

Folio Balance: $0.00

NET /80.45
UST 22.75

e —

¥ 203.°°

H.S.T. Reg. No.10086 7910 RT0002

AUTHORIZED BY: o CHECK-QUT BY:

Signature
| agree that my liability for this bill is not waived and agree to be held personally liable in
the event that the indicated person, company or assaciation fails to pay for any part or
the full amount of these charges.

Thank You For Staying With Us

Page No. |



Avoma Espresso Bar
Yong: & Eglinton
230 VYongs &t, Toronto, ON
e - (416) 987-7288

1003 Micha G
.,wm MﬁﬁQiT
Far2' 15 08:53AM6QEA\<FA

sok Ueprint sk

Chk 7 1

emnrint

170 Sm Lappuzcing -7 $3.59

W £ g NE' §i90

D ‘7/ {.tST $20.00
0.,

subtotal $5.45

5 5% $0.27

57 8% $0 .44

Ia C 6.5 )
————— 10903 Chesk Closed 08; —=====c

Fpe bRk

Connect, Password @ aromal123
Iy " 0ty 100 91 DT NNNi

Atome Espresso Bar
e Fglinton Center
2300 Yonge St
fnronto. M4P 1E4
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T W20
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IS S SE SR THE <3

AGDNO00N031010
¥ osa Cred 't

Card Type: VI

Trans Type: PURCHASE é 50 ver
Card Entry: C ‘
fath # @ 089371 0.85 HST

Sevprence {1 001001983
Merch I« 21270686

Enp oyes # @ 300
Terpina” ) MC2127068602
Dittis . 03-24-2015

T e 0 15:16:29

fnrnt (ii_fi.SSﬁ;)
00 APPROVED - THANK YOU
Retain this copy for your

recirds
skk USTOMER COPY ek

Aroma Espresso Bar
Yonge & Eglinton
2300 Yonge St, Toronto, ON
Tel: (416) 987-7288

300 Mi Jung
Chk 5039 a | HAR %L"
Mar24'15 12:47pN
LUNCH

¥k Reprint #k+
Closed Check
170 4 %FDrint
roma Sid 7.
KXXXKXXXNNN $7.95
VISA 7.95 weT -

l.o
Subtotal ¥ HsT

HST 5% :8:28

HST 8% $0.64

Paid $8.99
-------- 300 Check Closed 12 48Pi=======C

‘XFree Wi-Fix

Connect Password aromalza

HeT o1n 200 291 BT Anad

S THIS s THE ONLY

RECEPT WE HAVE
FoR THIS MEAL.



Ontario Energy Board Z(

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS N

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

ontario Power Generation inc. - iviotion to review and vary

File # EB- 2014-0369 Process: Decision with Reasons in EB-2013-0321
Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters Service Provider Name: Eden Alexander
Service Provider Type (check one) Year Called to Completed Years Practising/Years
Bar of relevant experience

Legal Counsel | 1

Articling Student/Paralegal

O

Consultant O Hourly Rate:l $170.00
O
O

Analyst
For Consultant/Analyst: CV attached HST Rate Charged (enter %) 13%

O CV provided within previous 24 months

Statement of Fees Belng Claimed

Hours Hourly rate| Subtotal HST Total
Preparation: 8.60 | $170.00| $1,462.00 $190.06 $1,652.06

TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES ] | $1,462.00]  $190.06 $1,652.06




File #:
Process:
Party:
Name:

Feb 17-156

Feb 27-15

Mar 18-15

Preparation

Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees being Claimed

EB-2014-0369

'\l .

Ontario Power Generation Inc. (OPG)

Motion to Review and Vary the Decision with Reasons in EB-2013-0321

Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters

Eden Alexander (EA)

Review relevant submissions in matter EB-2013-0321, and prepare
extracts of intervener submissions related to the Motion for Review and
Vary; organize submissions for review

Research standard of review; research application of suggested case
law; edit and update Submissions

Compile cases re standard of review

Total Hours for Eden Alexander:

Hours
8.6 x $170.00/hr =

8.6 Total Fees for Eden Alexander:

3.2

44

1.0
8.6

Preparation

Preparation

Preparation

Fees
1,462.00

$1,462.00
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