

August 4, 2016

via email and RESS - signed original to follow by mail

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street, 27th Floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Re: Toronto Hydro-Electric System Limited ICM True-Up Application (EB-2015-0173) - SIA Cost Claims

Dear Ms. Walli,

In accordance with the Ontario Energy Board's ("OEB") Decision on the Settlement Proposal dated July 28, 2016, attached are the cost claims of the Sustainable Infrastructure Alliance of Ontario (the "SIA").

As indicated in its letter dated June 27, 2016, in the interest of administrative and cost efficiency the SIA withdrew as an intervenor from this proceeding after determining that further participation would be largely duplicative of the efforts of other intervening parties. As such, in these cost claim submissions, the SIA is only requesting recovery of costs related to efforts undertaken prior to the date of its intervention withdrawal.

As always, the SIA thanks the OEB for the opportunity to participate in this proceeding.

Sincerely,

[original signed by]

Robert Sutton Director, SIA of Ontario

Ontario Energy BoardCOST CLAIM FOR HEARINGSAffidavit and Summa Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are embedded in the form to assist with calculations.

- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.

However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.

- A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff.

Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

File # EB- 2015-0173 Prov	Process: Toronto Hydro ICM True-Up Application					
Party: SIA of Ontario	Affiant's Name: Dionisio Rivera					
HST Number: 82436 5795 RT0001	HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%					
Full Registrant Unregistered Other	Qualifying Non-Profit					

Affidavit											
I,	Dionis	io Rivera	, of the City/Town of	Brockville							
in the Prov	ince/State of	Ontario		, swear or affirm that:							

I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.
I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements"

Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".

3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.

4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

Signature of Affiant

Sworn or affirmed before	me at the City/Town of	Ottawa				
in the Province/State of	Ontario	, on August 2, 2016				
			(date)	_		

Ontario Energy BoardCOST CLAIM FOR HEARINGSAffidavit and Summa Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2015-0173

Process: Toronto Hydro ICM True-Up Application

Party: SIA of Ontario

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed								
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	5,292.50						
Disbursements	\$	-						
HST	\$	688.03						
Total Cost Claim	\$	5,980.53						

Payment Information								
Make cheque payable to:	SI Alliance of Ontario							
Send payment to this address:	55 Bloor Street West PO Box 19611 (Manulife) Toronto, ON M4W 3T9							

Ontario Energy BoardCOST CLAIM FOR HEARINGSDetail of Fees and Disbursem

File # EB- <u>2015-0173</u>	}		1	Process:	Tor	ronto Hydro	ΙΟΝ	1 True-Up A	Appli	cation
Party: SIA of Onto	ario	Service Provider Name: Dionisio Rivera								
	VICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	(check one)	Yea	Completed Years ear Called to Practising/Years of Releva Bar Experience 15				Relevant		
Articiir	ng Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst						I	Hourly Rate:		\$290
F	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac		within previc	ous 2		narge	d (enter %):		13.0%
	St	tatement o	of Fe	es Being	Cla	imed				
		Hours		urly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total
Pre-hearing Conference	e									
	Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
	Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Technical Conference										
	Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
	Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Interrogatories										
	Preparation	12.0	\$	290.00	\$	3,480.00	\$	452.40	\$	3,932.40
	Responses	4.8	\$	290.00	\$	1,377.50	\$	179.08	\$	1,556.58
Issues Conference										
	Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
	Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
ADR - Settlement Conf									4	
	Preparation	1.5	\$	290.00	\$	435.00	\$	56.55	\$	491.55
	Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
	Proposal Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Argument	Preparation		ć	290.00	ć		\$	-	\$	
Oral Hearing	Freparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	Ş	-	Ş	-
Oral freating	Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
	Attendance		ې \$	290.00	ې \$	-	ې \$	-	\$	-
Other Conferences	, atendance		Ŷ	230.00	Ŷ		~		Ŷ	
	Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
	Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Case Management			\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
TOTAL SERVICE PROVI	DER FEES		-		\$	5,292.50	\$	688.03	\$	5,980.53

Ontario Energy BoardCOST CLAIM FOR HEARINGSDetail of Fees and Disbursem

File # EB- 2015-0173

Process:

Toronto Hydro ICM True-Up Application

Party: SIA of Ontario

Service Provider Name:

Dionisio Rivera

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed								
	Net Cost	HST	Total					
Scanning/Photocopy			\$-					
Printing			\$-					
Courier			\$-					
Telephone/Fax			\$-					
Transcripts			\$-					
Travel: Air			\$-					
Travel: Car			\$-					
Travel: Rail			\$-					
Travel (Other):			\$-					
Parking			\$-					
Тахі			\$-					
Accommodation			\$-					
Meals			\$-					
Other:			\$-					
Other:			\$-					
Other:			\$-					
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		-						
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	- \$ -	\$-					

_

File: EB-2015-0173 (THESL ICM True Up)

		Pre-H	earing	Tec	hnical			Iss	ues	ADR	Settlen	nent				Ot	her
Date	Description	Confe	erence	Conf	erence	Interro	ogatories	Conference Conference		ce	Argument Oral Hearing		Conference				
		Р	А	Р	А	Ρ*	R	Р	А	Р	A	PP	Р	Р	А	Р	А
26-Apr-16	Review PO#1					0.25											
27-Apr-16	Review Application					2											
28-Apr-16	Continue Application Review					2											
30-Apr-16	Review EB-2012-0064 Record					2.5											
03-May-16	Begin IR Drafting					1.5											
06-May-16	Review Board Staff IRs					0.75											
09-May-16	Draft IRs					1.25											
10-May-16	Finalize and File IRs					1.75											
30-May-16	Review IR Responses						1.75										
31-May-16	Review IR Responses						3										
14-Jun-16	Emails; Correspondance Re: Settle									0.25							
23-Jun-16	Settlement Prep; identify issues									0.75							
24-Jun-16	Confirmation re: SIA withdrawal									0.5							
	TOTAL	0	0	0	0	12	4.75	0	0	1.5	0	0	0	0	0	0	(

*includes time spent on preliminary evidence review

Total Cost (at \$290/hour)	\$ 5,292.50
HST	\$ 688.03
TOTAL	\$ 5,980.53