Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party (defined in the Practice Direction on Cost Awards as including a participant in a consultation process) in a consultation before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board Notice of Hearing for Cost Awards. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

- Poguirod data input is in disc.	l	nstructions	
- Required data input is indicated by yellow-s of the cost claim.	haded fields.	Formulas are present in the doc	cument to assist with the calculation
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If ap	nlicable stat	to ovehange rate and a series	
a de la comunición de l	Rat	e.	
- A separate "Statement of Disbursements Bei	ing Claimed"	is required for each consultant	Country:
student/paralegal. However only one "Staten	nent of Fees	Reing Claimod" and and "Comme	ary of Foos and Dishumana and
b starting the whole of the par	LV S COST Clair	n should be provided	
 The cost claim must be supported by a comp 	leted Affiday	vit signed by a representative of	the party.
- A CV for each consultant must be attached u process within the last 24 months.	inless, for a g	given consultant, a CV has been p	provided to the Board in another
- Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Pra	actice Directi	ion on Cost Awards itomized as	
			eceipts must be provided.
File # EB- 2015-0117		Process: Natural Gas Cor	nservation Potential Study
Party: Energy Futures Group		Affiant's Name: Chr	
HST Number:		HST Rat	e Ontario:
Full Registrant		Qualifying N	lon-Profit
Unregistered	\checkmark		x Exempt \square
Other			x exempt \Box
, Chris Neme n the Province/State of		Affidavit, of the City/Town of	Hinesburg
			ear or affirm that:
I am a representative of the above-noted pa	rty (the "Pari	ty") and as such have knowledge	of the matters attended to be
in that examined all of the documentation in	Support of fi	his cost claim including the atta	chod "C.,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,
rise discriments being claimed, Statement of I	tees Being Cl	aimed" and "Statement(s) of Di-	h
The accached Sammary of Fees and Dispurse	ements Being	[(laimed" "Statement of Food I	Poing Claims all - Illou
f Disbursements Being Claimed" include only of articipation in the Ontario Energy Board proce	costs incurre	d and time spent directly for the	e purposes of the Party's
. This cost claim does not include any costs for	swork done	o above.	
. This cost claim does not include any costs for arty as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the sections of the section of	the Board's P	Practice Direction on Cost Assert	is an employee or officer of the
/) () -	the board 3 r	ractice Direction on Cost Award	
C-V-			HILL APARTON
ignature of Affiant			NOTAR
	-	11.00 10 10	A
worn or affirmed before me at the Cit		Dirophia	is an employee or officer of the s. RIL CLODE NOTAR DE LIC COUNTAIN COUNTA
the Province/State of Vermon		, on 8/16	ADD OUBLIC A.
		7-7	(date) COUNTAININ
			*///.

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

mmissioner for taking Affidalits	
e # EB- 2015-0117	Process: Natural Gas Conservation Potential Study
rty: Energy Futures Group	
Summary	of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed
egal/consultant fees	\$21,450.00
isbursements	\$0.00
ST	\$0.00
otal Cost Claim	\$21,450.00
Make cheque payable to:	Payment Information
	Payment Information Energy Futures Group
Make cheque payable to:	Payment Information Energy Futures Group P.O. Box 587
	Payment Information Energy Futures Group
Make cheque payable to: Send payment to this address:	Payment Information Energy Futures Group P.O. Box 587 Hinesburg, Vermont 05482

Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed

Statement of Disbursements being claimed is found on the fourth tab of this workbook.

Ontario Energy Board





Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Individual Whose Costs are Being Claimed Name: Chris Neme **Completed Years** Year Called Practicing/Years of Relevant to Bar Experience Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: 30 Analyst/Consultant: ☑ CV attached: CV not required: ✓ Name: **Completed Years** Year Called Practicing/Years of relevant to Bar experience Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached: CV not required: Name: **Completed Years** Year Called Practicing/Years of relevant to Bar experience Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached: CV not required: Name: **Completed Years** Year Called Practicing/Years of relevant to Bar experience Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached: CV not required: Name: **Completed Years** Year Called Practicing/Years of relevant to Bar experience Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached: CV not required:

Total legal/consultant fees: \$21,450.00

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Statement of Fees Being Claimed

File # EB- 2015-0117

Process Natural Gas Conservation Potential Study

Party Energy Futures Group

HST Rate:

Hinesburg, VT 05461 Phone: (802) 482-5001 Fax: (802) 329-2143



Task Description

Invoice #

1517

Job Code:

1025

Job Name: OEB gas potential study committee

Period:

July 1-31, 2015

Date	Phase #	Project #	Hours	Task Description
07/15/15	00	00	0.50	review draft RFP for potential study
07/16/15	00	00	2.75	gas potential study committee call, incl prep
07/22/15	00	00	0.50	draft comments on potential study RFP, send to Valerie and Takis
			3.75	

Hinesburg, VT 05461 Phone: (802) 482-5001 Fax: (802) 329-2143



Task Description

Invoice #

1614

Job Code:

1025

Job Name: OEB gas potential study committee

Period:

November 1-30, 2015

Date	Phase #	Project #	Hours	Task Description
11/04/15	00	00	2.00	committee meeting to discuss potential study methodological issues (incl prep)
11/20/15	00	00	3.00	EAC mtg to review potential study workplan w/ICF
			5.00	

PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461 Phone: (802) 482-5001 Fax: (802) 329-2143



Task Description

Invoice #

1641

Job Code:

1025

Job Name: OEB gas potential study committee

Period:

December 1-31, 2015

Date	Phase #	Project #	Hours	Task Description
12/04/15	00	00	1.00	call w/OEB and ICF on achievable potential
12/18/15	00	00		review ICF draft measure list, send comments
			1.75	

Hinesburg, VT 05461 Phone: (802) 482-5001 Fax: (802) 329-2143



Task Description

Invoice #

1667

Job Code:

1025

Job Name: OEB gas potential study committee

Period:

January 1-31, 2016

Date	Phase #	Project #	Hours	Task Description
01/20/16	00	00	7.25	Prep for and participate in mtg w/ICF on avoided costs and measure assumptions
			7.25	

Hinesburg, VT 05461 Phone: (802) 482-5001 Fax: (802) 329-2143



Task Description

Invoice #

1693

Job Code: 1025

Job Name: OEB gas potential study committee

Period:

February 1-29, 2016

Date	Phase #	Project #	Hours	Task Description
02/01/16	00	00	3.50	review ICF draft measure assumptions
02/02/16	00	00	1.50	Review ICF draft measure assumptions, send comments
02/16/16	00	00	1.75	call w/ICF, incl prep
02/16/16	00	00	0.50	feedback to ICF on leading programs, experts
02/19/16	00	00	3.50	prep for and participate in potential study working group meeting by phone
			10.75	

Hinesburg, VT 05461 Phone: (802) 482-5001 Fax: (802) 329-2143



Task Description

Invoice #

1721

Job Code:

1025

Job Name: OEB gas potential study committee

Period:

March 1-31, 2016

Phase #	Project #	Hours	Task Description
00	00	1.00	Review avoided cost chapter
00	00	1.00	draft and send comments on avoided cost draft chapter
00	00	5.50	prep for and participate in potential study working group meeting
00	00	0.75	analysis of TRM measures related to TWG 7, ICF Slide 57; send comments to wor
		8.25	
	00 00 00	00 00 00 00 00 00	00 00 1.00 00 00 1.00 00 00 5.50 00 00 0.75

Hinesburg, VT 05461 Phone: (802) 482-5001 Fax: (802) 329-2143



Task Description

Invoice #

1747

Job Code:

1025

Job Name: OEB gas potential study committee

Period:

April 1-30, 2016

Date	Phase #	Project #	Hours	Task Description
04/07/16	00	00	1.75	TWG conf call on achievable potential issues
04/11/16	00	00	0.25	input on budget allocations
04/19/16	00	00	7.00	TWG meeting participation (by phone), incl prep
04/28/16	00	00	2.25	Review TWG package 1 materials, send comments
			11.25	

Hinesburg, VT 05461 Phone: (802) 482-5001 Fax: (802) 329-2143



Task Description

Invoice #

1775

Job Code:

1025

Job Name: OEB gas potential study committee

Period:

May 1-31, 2016

Date	Phase #	Project #	Hours	Task Description
05/04/16	00	00	3.25	prep for and participate in call w/ICF, Staff; follow up on windows
05/17/16	00	00	1.50	Review and send comments on work package 3
05/19/16	00	00	2.25	review achievable potential material, call w/Valerie, send comments
05/20/16	00	00	1.50	potential study working group mtg
			8.50	

Hinesburg, VT 05461 Phone: (802) 482-5001 Fax: (802) 329-2143



Task Description

Invoice #

1775

Job Code:

1025

Job Name: OEB gas potential study committee

Period:

June 1-30, 2016

Date	Phase #	Project #	Hours	Task Description
06/03/16	00	00	3.00	Review potential study updated assumptions; draft comments
06/06/16	00	00	3.75	Review work package 6 files, draft and send comments
06/20/16	00	00	1.25	review draft report
06/21/16	00	00	0.50	draft and send comments on draft report
			8.50	