



Fogler, Rubinoﬀ LLP
Lawyers

77 King Street West
Suite 3000, PO Box 95
TD Centre North Tower
Toronto, ON M5K 1G8
t: 416.864.9700 | f: 416.941.8852
foglers.com

December 14, 2016

Reply To: Thomas Brett
Direct Dial: 416.941.8861
E-mail: tbrett@foglers.com
Our File No. 161352

VIA RESS, EMAIL AND COURIER

Ontario Energy Board
2300 Yonge Street
27th Floor
Toronto, Ontario
M4P 1E4

Attention: Kirsten Walli,
Board Secretary

Dear Ms. Walli:

Re: EB-2015-0275: IESO, 2016 Revenue Requirement

Please find enclosed herewith BOMA's Cost Claim.

Yours truly,

FOGLER, RUBINOFF LLP

Thomas Brett
TB/dd
Encls.

cc: Rudra Mukherji, OEB (*via email*)
Miriam Heinz, IESO (*via email*)
Fred Cass, Aird & Berlis (*via email*)
Marion Fraser, Fraser & Company (*via email*)
Bala Gnanam, BOMA (*via email*)

Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are embedded in the form to assist with calculations.
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.
Rate: _____ Country: _____
- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal. However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.
- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.
- A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff.

Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

File # EB- 2015-0275 Process: IESO 2015 Revenue Requirement
Party: BOMA Affiant's Name: Tom Brett
HST Number: R119420859 HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%
Full Registrant Qualifying Non-Profit
Unregistered Tax Exempt
Other

Affidavit

I, Tom Brett, of the City/Town of Toronto
in the Province/State of Ontario, swear or affirm that:

1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.
2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".
3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.
4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

[Signature]
Signature of Affiant

Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of Toronto,
in the Province/State of Ontario, on December 14/16.
(date)

[Signature]
Commissioner for taking Affidavits

**Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS**



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2015-0275 Process: IESO 2015 Revenue Requirement

Party: BOMA

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	22,737.00
Disbursements	\$	50.81
HST	\$	2,962.42
Total Cost Claim	\$	25,750.23

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Fogler, Rubinoff LLP

Send payment to this address: Attn: Debbie Dey
77 King Street West, Suite 3000
P.O. Box 95, TD Centre North Tower
Toronto, ON M5K 1G8

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- <u>2015-0275</u>	Process: <u>IESO 2015 Revenue Requirement</u>
Party: <u>BOMA</u>	Service Provider Name: <u>Tom Brett</u>
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (check one)	Year Called to Bar
Legal Counsel <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="text" value="1971"/>
Articling Student/Paralegal <input type="checkbox"/>	
Consultant <input type="checkbox"/>	
Analyst <input type="checkbox"/>	
Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience	<input type="text" value="36"/>
Hourly Rate:	<input type="text" value="\$330"/>
For Consultant/Analyst: <input type="checkbox"/> CV attached	HST Rate Charged (enter %): <input type="text" value="13.0%"/>
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> CV provided within previous 24 months	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed					
	Hours	Hourly Rate	Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference					
Preparation		\$ 330.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$ 330.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Technical Conference					
Preparation		\$ 330.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$ 330.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Interrogatories					
Preparation	21.70	\$ 330.00	\$ 7,161.00	\$ 930.93	\$ 8,091.93
Responses		\$ 330.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Issues Conference					
Preparation		\$ 330.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$ 330.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
ADR - Settlement Conference					
Preparation	25.70	\$ 330.00	\$ 8,481.00	\$ 1,102.53	\$ 9,583.53
Attendance	15.00	\$ 330.00	\$ 4,950.00	\$ 643.50	\$ 5,593.50
Proposal Preparation	6.50	\$ 330.00	\$ 2,145.00	\$ 278.85	\$ 2,423.85
Argument					
Preparation		\$ 330.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Oral Hearing					
Preparation		\$ 330.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$ 330.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Other Conferences					
Preparation		\$ 330.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$ 330.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Case Management					
		\$ 170.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES			\$ 22,737.00	\$ 2,955.81	\$ 25,692.81

Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed



File # EB- 2015-0275

Process: IESO 2015 Revenue Requirement

Party: BOMA

Service Provider Name: Tom Brett

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed				
		Net Cost	HST	Total
Scanning/Photocopy			\$ -	\$ -
Printing			\$ -	\$ -
Courier		\$ 50.81	\$ 6.61	\$ 57.42
Telephone/Fax			\$ -	\$ -
Transcripts			\$ -	\$ -
Travel: Air			\$ -	\$ -
Travel: Car			\$ -	\$ -
Travel: Rail			\$ -	\$ -
Travel (Other):			\$ -	\$ -
Parking			\$ -	\$ -
Taxi			\$ -	\$ -
Accommodation			\$ -	\$ -
Meals			\$ -	\$ -
Other:			\$ -	\$ -
Other:			\$ -	\$ -
Other:			\$ -	\$ -
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:		\$ 50.81	\$ 6.61	\$ 57.42

December 9, 2016

Independent Electricity System Operator
 1600 - 120 Adelaide Street West
 Toronto ON
 M5H 1T1
 Attention: Miriam Heinz
 Regulatory Coordinator, Corporate
 Affairs/Legal

IN ACCOUNT WITH
 Fogler, Rubinoff LLP
 77 King Street West, Suite 3000
 TD Centre North Tower
 P.O. Box 95
 Toronto, ON
 M5K 1G8
 Telephone: 416-864-9700
 Fax: 416-941-8852
 www.foglers.com

fogler
 rubinoff

Our File: F1588 / 161352
IESO, 2016 Revenue Requirement; Board File No. EB-2015-0275

TO OUR FEE for professional services rendered with respect to the above-captioned matter, including:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Lawyer</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hrs</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Feb-09-16	TB	Reviewing evidence.	1.30	429.00
Feb-11-16	TB	Preparation of comments.	1.00	330.00
Feb-25-16	TB	Reviewing evidence.	1.50	495.00
Feb-26-16	TB	Reviewing evidence; Preparing IRs.	4.00	1,320.00
Mar-01-16	TB	Reviewing evidence.	1.80	594.00
May-25-16	TB	Reviewing evidence; Preparing Comments on the Draft Issues List.	3.50	1,155.00
May-26-16	TB	Preparation of comments to Draft Issues List.	0.60	198.00
Jun-01-16	TB	Reviewing IESO letter and preparing letter re: errors.	1.00	330.00
Jun-30-16	TB	Preparation of IRs.	6.00	1,980.00
Jul-28-16	TB	Reviewing IRRs.	1.00	330.00
Aug-02-16	TB	Reviewing IR Responses; Preparing for Settlement Conference.	5.00	1,650.00
Aug-03-16	TB	Reviewing IRs; Preparing for Settlement Conference.	3.50	1,155.00
Aug-04-16	TB	Reviewign IR Responses; Preparing for Settlement Conference.	2.20	726.00
Aug-15-16	TB	Preparation for Settlement Conference.	6.00	1,980.00
Aug-16-16	TB	Preparation for Settlement Conference.	6.50	2,145.00
Aug-17-16	TB	Preparation for Settlement Conference.	1.50	495.00
Aug-17-16	TB	Attending Settlement Conference.	7.00	2,310.00
Aug-18-16	TB	Preparation for Settlement Conference.	1.00	330.00
Aug-18-16	TB	Attending Settlement Conference.	8.00	2,640.00
Aug-19-16	TB	Reviewing material from Settlement Conference.	4.00	1,320.00
Aug-24-16	TB	Telephone conference with parties.	0.30	99.00
Aug-25-16	TB	Reviewing material.	0.50	165.00
Sep-02-16	TB	Reviewing Draft Settlement Agreement; Preparing comments.	0.50	165.00
Sep-06-16	TB	Reviewing comments.	1.20	396.00
TOTAL FEES:				\$22,737.00
OUR FEE HEREIN				\$22,737.00

Summary of Fees

<u>Initials</u>	<u>Total Time</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Value</u>
TB	68.90	330.00	22,737.00

Disbursements

Taxable	Courier & Delivery	\$50.81	
	Total Disbursements		\$50.81
	Total Fees and Disbursements		\$22,787.81
	HST @ 13% on Fees and Taxable Disbursements		\$2,962.42
	Total Fees, Disbursements and Taxes this Bill		\$25,750.23
	Balance Due:		\$25,750.23

**THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
FOGLER, RUBINOFF LLP**

Thomas Brett

THIS ACCOUNT BEARS INTEREST, COMMENCING ONE MONTH AFTER DELIVERY, AT THE RATE OF 3.30% PER ANNUM AS AUTHORIZED BY THE SOLICITORS' ACT. ANY DISBURSEMENTS NOT POSTED TO YOUR ACCOUNT ON THE DATE OF THIS STATEMENT WILL BE BILLED LATER.

E. & O.E. GST/HST No : R119420859
Please return a copy of this account with your payment. Thank you.

	6792		15:43	King St. West	Sherwoodtowne Blvd (Miss)	164989	0704 10:40		
179	746-6793	4	0630 15:43	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	Diego Gueli 1971 Queen St E	DET - 164984	Irene 0704 11:00	10.89	-4
180	746-6796	4	0630 15:45	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	THE TORONTO DOMINION BANK 4720 Tahoe Blvd (Miss)	AT - 164978	Jorge 0704 10:42	10.89	17
181	746-6797	4	0630 15:46	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	Royal Bank of Canada 36 York Mills Rd (Nort)	CAD - 164757	Rahinie 0704 09:47	10.89	1
182	746-6801	4	0630 15:49	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	WILSON BLANCAHARD 16 Four Seasons Pl (Etob)	AT - 164438	Sue_C 0704 12:59	10.89	17
183	746-6802	4	0630 15:49	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	THE TORONTO DOMINION BANK 4720 Tahoe Blvd (Miss)	AT - 164984	Jorge 0704 10:42	10.89	17
184	746-6806	4	0630 15:50	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	THE TORONTO DOMINION BANK 4720 Tahoe Blvd (Miss)	AT - 164990	Jorge 0704 10:42	10.89	17
185	746-6811	4	0630 15:53	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	THE TORONTO DOMINION BANK 4720 Tahoe Blvd (Miss)	AT - 164995	Jorge 0704 10:42	10.89	17
186	746-6814	4	0630 15:54	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	ROYAL BANK 10 York Mills Rd (Nort)	AT - 164993	Rahinie 0704 09:47	10.89	1
187	746-6819	4	0630 15:57	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	THE TORONTO DOMINION BANK 4720 Tahoe Blvd (Miss)	AT - 164994	Jorge 0704 10:42	10.89	17
188	746-6822	4	0630 15:58	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	ontario energy 2300 Yonge St	TB - 161352	Katians 0704 11:37	10.89	N
189	746-6827	0 Ret	0630 16:04	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	TD BANK 55 King St W	ACC - 999999	pat-parvin 0630 18:09	15.00	B
190	746-6834	4	0630 16:08	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	THE TORONTO DOMINION BANK 4720 Tahoe Blvd (Miss)	AT - 164815	Jorge 0704 10:42	10.89	17
191	746-6836	4	0630 16:09	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	Parker & Company 830 Mount Pleasant Rd	RMR - 163983	Kate 0704 11:48	10.89	N
192	746-6845	1 (nd)	0630 16:15	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	JDB PROPERTY MANAGEMENT INC 30 Grand Trunk Cres	DKM - 164881	Purna 0630 17:03	6.05	777
193	746-6852	4	0630 16:19	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	ROYAL BANK 10 York Mills Rd (Nort)	AT - 164999	Rahinie 0704 09:47	10.89	1
194	746-6859	4	0630 16:24	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	CIBC BANK 750 Lawrence Ave W (Nort)	AT - 164998	mok 0704 10:58	10.89	69
195	746-6861	2 (nd)	0630 16:26	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	homEquity bank 1881 Yonge St	RMR - 163691	Stephanie 0704 11:20	13.75	N
196	746-6864	4	0630 16:35	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	LENDICARE CAPITAL INC 1465 Pickering Pky (Pick)	AT - 164820	Heather 0704 12:33	15.40	+44
197	746-6870	4	0630 16:38	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	peddle & pollard llp 15449 Yonge St (Auro)	RMR - 163984	Kent P 0704 09:01	20.08	29
198	746-6873	4	0630 16:40	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	THE BANK OF NOV SCOTIA 16635 Yonge St (Newm)	AT - 164980	Makfare 0704 09:33	23.38	29
199	746-6874	4	0630 16:41	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	MISSRACHEL WOODS 3132 Windwood Dr (Miss)	JDH - 002832	Mail Box(APR) 0704 11:07	10.89	17
200	746-6875	4	0630 16:44	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	NAVIN CHADHA 14 George St N (Bram)	RMR - 163983	Liza Y 0704 12:02	16.78	17
201	746-6889	1 (nd)	0630 17:06	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	CITY OF MISSISSAUGA 300 City Centre Dr (Miss)	AT - 164200	Annabella_T(4FI) 0704 09:56	43.73	17
202	746-6890	2 (nd)	0630 17:12	Fogler Rubinfoff 77 King St. West	OSGOOD HALL LAW SCHOOL OF YORK 4700 Keele St (Nort)	MLG - 999999	baldassarra 0704 11:31	27.23	69
							SubTotal	3285.15	

50	745-1872	2	0526 10:21	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	Imex systems inc 34 Greensboro Dr (Etob)	CRD - 147789	Lana I 0526 14:23	27.23	45
51	745-1877	0	0526 10:25	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	CHAITONS 5000 Yonge St (Nort)	AT - 164123	teys 0526 11:43	43.73	T
52	745-1888	1	0526 10:31	CIBC 1 Eglinton Ave E	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	LPB - 161869	parvin 0526 12:44	18.15	Y
53	745-2039	1	0526 12:09	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	TERANET LAND 123 Front St W	acc - 999999	Andrea 0526 12:43	6.05	B
54	745-2040	1	0526 12:10	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	oncorp direct 1033 Bay St	acc - 999999	Vivi 0526 12:55	6.05	K
55	745-2012	1 (nd)	0526 12:13	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	MRS ARLETTE BOLLIGER 38 Avoca Ave	sir - 085487	kuan 0527 09:37	11.00	T
56	745-2057		0526 12:38	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	ontario energy 2300 Yonge St	tb - 161352	Fatma 0527 08:33	10.89	K
57	745-2081	1	0526 13:12	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	niman gelgoot and assoc 10 Price St	mfg - 155488	Fadi 0526 14:29	11.00	S
58	745-2100	4	0526 13:27	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	PAUL PETKOVSKI/EDWIN RAJ 1181 West Shore Dr (Miss)	AMM - 142973	S B 2 doors(APR) 0527 09:46	10.89	17
59	745-2162	0	0526 14:45	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	MR MICHAEL APPLETON 1166 BAY ST	mha - 002767	Sal 0526 15:36	9.02	21
60	745-2186	0 Ret	0526 15:17	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	TD BANK 55 King St W	RMR - 156927	Rebecca-Bery 0526 16:13	15.00	B
61	745-2191	0 Ret	0526 15:20	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	SCOTIA BANK 40 King St W	RMR - 161133	andrea-Bery 0526 16:14	15.00	B
62	745-2200	1 Ret	0526 15:27	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	INDUSTRY CANADA 151 Yonge St	CSZ - 151293	Monika-Bery/Monika-Bery 0526 16:15	12.10	B
63	745-2203	4 Ret	0526 15:30	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	2496395 ONTARIO INC 1290 Heritage Way (Oakv)	RM - 161150	+Return (Parvin)/as per parvin 0527 17:30	37.40	17
64	745-2209	0	0526 15:37	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	TORONTO CITY HALL 55 John St	JDF - 066826	fenwick 0526 15:49	9.02	555
65	745-2210	0	0526 15:38	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 330 University Ave	JDF - 066826	ross 0526 15:56	9.02	555
66	745-2237	4	0526 16:10	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	STEP CANADA 45 Sheppard Ave E (Nort)	dsk - 052059	M Smith 0527 09:03	10.89	I
67	745-2258	4	0526 16:33	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	benefact consulting 6285 Northam Dr (Miss)	jmj - 142336	Ryan 0527 13:44	10.89	17
68	745-2273	1 (nd)	0526 17:10	Artistic Die Cutting 160 Applewood Cres (Conc)	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	SS - 155115	barry 0527 13:35	58.58	69
69	745-2275	3 (nd)	0526 17:11	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	FCT INSURANCE 2235 Sheridan Garden Dr (Oakv)	RMR - 156927	Nazish (M Room) 0527 11:27	37.40	17
70	745-2349	2	0527 08:18	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	OFFICE OF THE SUPERINTENDENT 25 St Clair Ave E	SHS - 144412	qian 0527 10:26	8.25	23
71	745-2361	2	0527 08:19	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	Kingwest & Company 86 Avenue Rd	CRD - 043112	erin 0527 11:14	8.25	I
72	745-2364	1	0527 08:21	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	BANK OF MONTREAL 100 King St W	VW - 124395	winsom 0527 08:48	6.05	B
73	745-2369	1	0527 08:23	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 330 University Ave	VED - 161869	Rosi 0527 09:03	6.05	B
74	745-2418	0 Ret	0527 09:20	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	TD BANK 55 King St W	ET - 151457	Rebecca-Maj 0527 09:58	15.00	B
75	745-2421	0 Ret	0527 09:22	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	CIBC BANK 199 Bay St	INK - 151457	Hailey-Mai 0527 09:59	15.00	B
						RM - 999999			

10789
 740-0794
 740-10808
 96 97

	0440		12:17	King St. West	Granton Dr (Rich)	153379	0120 14:29		
72	740-0444	4	0120 12:21	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	Millenium Acquistions Inc. 26 Imperial St	DS - 074406	Daphne 0120 15:27	10.89	K
73	740-0462	4	0120 12:43	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	ontario energy 2300 Yonge St	TB - 161352		10.89	K
74	740-0472	1	0120 12:52	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	YVONNE YU LAW CLERK 3595 Bathurst St (Nort)	CWS - 002893	Yvonne yu 0120 14:01	25.58	3
75	740-0483	1	0120 13:09	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	City of Toronto Revenue Servic 5100 Yonge St (Nort)	LES - 154788 Pieces: 2	Dela ross 0120 14:03	29.15	80
76	740-0485	1	0120 13:12	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	property information reports 5100 Yonge St (Nort)	LES - 154788	Gabriella 0120 14:03	29.15	80
77	740-0532	1	0120 14:28	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	Bennett Jones LLP 100 King St W	MAD - 999999	Karima 0120 15:16	6.05	B
78	740-0560	4	0120 14:55	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	Aldo Gottardo Family Trust 277 Pennsylvania Ave (Conc)	KJY - 154920	carmela 0121 11:03	16.78	69
79	740-0568	0 Ret	0120 15:04	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	TD Bank 55 King St W	ACC - 999999 Pieces: 4	Pat-Bery 0120 16:15	15.00	B
80	740-0571	0 Ret	0120 15:05	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	HSBC BANK 70 York St	ACC - 999999	Peny-Bery 0120 16:16	15.00	B
81	740-0573	0 Ret	0120 15:05	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	BMO 100 King St W	ACC - 999999	Mona- Bery 0120 16:16	15.00	B
82	740-0577	4	0120 15:09	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	DAWSCO 939 2015 CORP 939 Eglinton Ave E (East)	LW - 156340	Martinez 0121 07:57	10.89	+44
83	740-0591	1 Ret	0120 15:26	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	INDUSTRY CANADA 151 Yonge St	CSZ - 154279	Bery 0120 16:54	12.10	B
84	740-0592	1 (nd)	0120 15:29	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	Toronto Smart Court 47 Sheppard Ave E (Nort)	MS - 155588	Rey 0121 08:21	29.15	K
85	740-0596	4	0120 15:35	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	FISHMAN HOLDINGS NORTH AMERICA 500 Rexdale Blvd (Etob)	LW - 154571	Dianne 0121 12:31	10.89	17
86	740-0607	4	0120 15:56	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	compugen inc 100 Via Renzo Dr (Rich)	rh - 153654	Debie 0121 11:07	16.78	29
87	740-0628	4	0120 16:27	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	2140102 Ontario inc. 100 York Blvd (Rich)	MLM - 161362 Extra Charge: \$16.78	Ally 0121 11:49	33.56	29
88	740-0649	0 Ret	0120 16:50	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	TD BANK 55 King St W	gm - 144043	Bery 0121 08:04	15.00	B
89	740-0650	0 Ret	0120 16:51	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	ROYAL BANK 200 Bay St	GM - 144043	bery 0120 18:12	15.00	B
90	740-0651	4	0120 16:55	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	Peel Standard Condominium Corp 1359 Rathburn Rd E (Miss)	CAD - 152165 Lbs: 4	J__Bains (S G 0121 10:34	10.89	17
91	740-0727	1	0121 08:27	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	norton rose fulbright canada 200 Bay St	DJO - 152162	vnessa 0121 09:36	6.05	B
92	740-0728	2	0121 08:29	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	kintork lakeshore corp 1 Market St	LW - 121339	michael 0121 09:53	4.51	555
93	740-0730	0	0121 08:31	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	ontario energy 2300 Yonge St	TB - 131167 Pieces: 9 Lbs: 250 \$37.50 Van Charge: \$20.00	melanie 0121 10:15	84.73	26
94	740-0731	1	0121 10:02	Fogler Rubinoff 77 King St. West	CITY OF TORONTO 55 John St	JDF - 141652	janice 0121 10:35	6.05	555
95	740-0732	0 Ret	0121	Fogler Rubinoff 77	ROYAL BANK 200 Bay St	GM -	Majid	15.00	B