

PUBLIC INTEREST ADVOCACY CENTRE LE CENTRE POUR LA DÉFENSE DE L'INTÉRÊT PUBLIC

December 16, 2016

PIAC FILE # 6593

VIA E-Mail 14 pages

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board Suite 2700 2300 Yonge Street Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli:

Re: Bo

Board File No. EB-2016-0025

Cost Claim of Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC)

We have attached the cost claim of the Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC) associated with its participation in the above noted proceeding. Pursuant to the Decision and Order of December 8, 2016 we have also directed a copy to Applicants via email.

Please note that time spent not within the specific categories was put in the other categories classification.

Thank you.

2

Michael Janigan Counsel for VECC

cc:

Applicants

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

			300		Instructions			
				cable, state e	ormulas are embedo exchange rate and c		of initial currency.	
- A congrato	"Detail of	Foot and Dich	ircomonte B	Rate		ataman	Country:	nimed" and a "Statement of
Disburseme However, or - The cost cl	nts Being (nly one "Si laim must l	Claimed") is required in contract of the contr	juired for ea and Disbui y a complet	ach lawyer, a rsements" co ed Affidavit	inalyst/consultant a overing the whole of signed by a represent provided to the Boar	nd artic the pa ntative	cling student/paral rty's cost claim sho of the party.	egal. ould be provided.
E	xcept as p	rovided in secti	on 7.03 of 1	the Practice	Direction on Cost A	wards,	itemized receipts	must be provided.
File # EB-	EB-201	6-0025			Process: Amal	gamat	e to form LDC Co).
Party:	VECC				Affiant's	Name:	Donna Brady	
HST Numb	er: 13	3059 2405				HST	Rate Ontario:	3.94%
			gistrant gistered Other	000	-	Qualify	ing Non-Profit Tax Exempt	
ı,		Donna	Brady		Affidavit	wn of		Ottawa
in the Pro	vince/St			ntario	_, or the city, to	WIII OI	, swear or affir	Carried Control of Carried Contr
2. I have exa Being Claim 3. The attac Disburseme Ontario Ene 4. This cost	amined all ed", "State hed "Sumr ents Being (ergy Board claim does	of the document ement(s) of Fees mary of Fees an Claimed" include process referres anot include an	ntation in su s Being Clain d Disburser e only costs d to above. y costs for v	upport of thi med" and "Si nents Being incurred an work done, o	s cost claim, includir tatement(s) of Disbu Claimed", "Stateme d time spent directl	ng the aursement(s) of y for the	attached "Summar nts Being Claimed" Fees Being Claime e purposes of the	s attested to herein. y of Fees and Disbursemen '. d" and "Statement(s) of Party's participation in the e or officer of the Party as
Signature	of Affiai	nt		/				
				/T				
		before me				Ot	tawa	12'11
in the Pro	vince/Sta	ate of		Ontario	, on		DSC. (date)	10-10.
Commissi	onor san	taking Affid						
LANGE HINGE	BALLING TABLE	LOUGH DE MATTICE	aviis					

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- EB-2016-0025		Process:	Amalgamate to form LDC Co.
Party: VECC			
Summa	ary of Fee	es and Disburse	ments Being Claimed
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	37,514.25	
Disbursements	\$	120.20	
HST	\$	1,481.46	
Total Cost Claim	\$	39,115.91	
		Payment Inforn	nation
Make cheque payable to:	Public	Interest Advo	cacy Centre
Send payment to this address:	1204-0	ONE Nicholas	Street

Ottawa, ON K1N 7B7





Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	EB-2016-0025		Process: A	malgamate to form LD	C Co.		
Party:	VECC		Service Pro	vider Name: Michael	Michael Janigan		
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar		Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience		
	Legal Counsel Articling Student/Paralegal		1980	UIES S			
	Consultant Analyst			Hourly	Rate: \$330		
	For Consultant/Analyst:		hed ided within previous	HST Rate Charged (enter	er %): 3.9%		

	atement o	_		CIC		_	Test de la companya	MATE.	
	Hours	Ho	urly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total
Pre-hearing Conference									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	
Attendance	- 1 V V	\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Technical Conference									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$		\$	-	\$	
Interrogatories									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Responses		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Issues Conference									
Preparation	2.1	\$	330.00	\$	693.00	\$	27.30	\$	720.30
Attendance	-	\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	- 10	\$	
Proposal Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$		\$	-
Argument									
Preparation	15.1	\$	330.00	\$	4,983.00	\$	196.33	\$	5,179.33
Oral Hearing							17 40		1.00
Preparation	32.7	\$	330.00	\$	10,791.00	\$	425.17	\$	11,216.17
Attendance	18.3	\$	330.00	\$	6,039.00	\$	237.94	\$	6,276.94
Other Conferences									
Preparation	1.9	\$	330.00	\$	627.00	\$	24.70	\$	651.70
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$		\$		\$	- 10 - 10 - 10 - 10 - 10 - 10 - 10 - 10
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$.=:	\$	-	\$	-
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	23,133.00	\$	911.44	\$	24,044.44

Michael Janigan
Janigan Professional Corporation
c/o Public Interest Advocacy Centre
1204-ONE Nicholas Street
Ottawa, ON
KIN 7B7

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

December 16, 2016

TO: VULNERABLE ENERGY CONSUMERS COALITION

c/o Public Interest Advocacy Centre Suite 1204 ONE Nicholas Street Ottawa. ON

KIN 7B7

Re: EB - 2016-0025 -

Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC)

Cost Claim

For Services Rendered as Counsel in the above-noted matter.

RATE: \$330.00 per hour

To receipt, review, and attending on behalf of VECC in the above-noted proceeding.

June 2016 to December 2016

TO: Hours

70.1 Hours @ \$330.00 per hour

23,133.00

HST @ 13%

3,007.29

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND OWING:

\$26,140.29

Michael Janigan Janigan Professional Corporation - 831059738

MJdockets LDCMAAD.txt

TraxTime report for Michael Janigan created 12/16/2016 11:33 AM

Tuesday, June 21, 2016 - Total 1.1

in: 6:07p out: 7:11p 1.1

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

reviw old proceedings and MAAD handbook

Wednesday, June 22, 2016 - Total 2.1

in: 1:01p out: 3:09p 2.1

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review file and issues list and SEC correspondence and draft

response

Wednesday, August 10, 2016 - Total 0.6

in: 7:44a out: 8:22a 0.6

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review file for intervenor teleconference

Thursday, August 11, 2016 - Total 2.7

in: 12:43p out: 3:23p 2.7

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review evidence and teleconference with intervenors

Wednesday, August 31, 2016 - Total 0.6

in: 6:11p out: 6:44p 0.6

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

reviewfile and estimates for hearing plan

Monday, September 05, 2016 - Total 1.3

in: 5:16p out: 5:46p 0.5

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review emails and to review of hearing plan and emails

in: 8:09p out: 8:57p 0.8

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

to research and review of merger principles and evidnce

Tuesday, September 06, 2016 - Total 7.8

in: 1:09p out: 4:28p 3.3

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review file and evidence

in: 6:01p out: 7:13p 1.2

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review evidence

in: 8:44p out: 11:59p

3.3

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review file and prep

Wednesday, September 07, 2016 - Total 4.6

in: 7:03a out: 8:10a 1.1

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review Undertakings

in: 10:00a out: 11:30a

1.5

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

attend hearing

in: 11:54a out: 12:51p

1

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

monitor streaming broadcast

1/2 rate

in: 2:05p out: 3:02p 1

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

monitor streaming webcast 1/2 rate

MJdockets LDCMAAD.txt

Thursday, September 08, 2016 - Total 7.4

in: 9:49a out: 10:57a

1.1

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review file prep for hearing

in: 11:30a out: 12:23p

0.9

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review transcript

in: 4:11p out: 6:19p 2.1

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review notes and transcript prep hearing

in: 7:02p out: 10:17p

3.3

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

prep hearing

Friday, September 09, 2016 - Total 8.5

in: 6:44a out: 7:59a 1.3

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

prep hearing

in: 9:30a out: 4:40p 7.2

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

attend hearing

Wednesday, September 14, 2016 - Total 6.9

in: 9:31a out: 11:08a

1.6

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review file and prep cross for panel 2

in: 1:58p out: 4:17p 2.3

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review file prep cross

in: 7:22p out: 10:20p

3

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review evidence and transcripts

Thursday, September 15, 2016 - Total 8.3

in: 6:45a out: 8:02a 1.3

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review file prep for hearing

in: 9:30a out: 4:30p 7

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

attend at hearing

Monday, September 26, 2016 - Total 3.3

in: 6:33a out: 8:15a 1.7

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review licence app

in: 9:30a out: 11:05a

1.6

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

attend at OEB

Wednesday, October 05, 2016 - Total 2.1

in: 4:11p out: 6:17p 2.1

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review transcripts draft argument

Thursday, October 06, 2016 - Total 6.1

in: 8:29a out: 9:55a 1.4

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

review law and evidence

in: 1:27p out: 3:15p 1.8

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

prep argument

in: 7:02p out: 9:57p 2.9

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

draft argument

Friday, October 07, 2016 - Total 6.9

MJdockets LDCMAAD.txt 6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

in: 7:32a out: 8:47a 1.3 read transcripts prep arg

in: 9:24a out: 10:36a prep argument

in: 11:55a out: 1:14p 1.3 prep argument.

in: 3:29p out: 5:46p 2.3

edit draft

in: 8:33p out: 9:23p 0.8

edit final version

1.2 6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

Friday, December 09, 2016 - Total 0.8

in: 3:12p out: 4:02p 0.8

6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

read Decision and emails

Totals From Friday, January 01, 2016 To Friday, December 16, 2016

71.1 6593EB2016-0025MAADPwstm

71.1 Total

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	EB-2016-0025	Process: Amalgamat	e to form LDC Co.	
Party:	VECC	Service Provider Name:	Michael Janigan	

	N	et Cost		HST	Total	
Scanning/Photocopy	\$	33.90			\$	33.90
Printing	\$	86.30	\$	3.40	\$	89.70
Courier					\$	
Telephone/Fax					\$	
Transcripts					\$	-
Travel: Air					\$	-
Travel: Car	The state of the s				\$	
Travel: Rail					\$	2
Travel (Other):					\$	
Parking					\$	-
Taxi					\$	-
Accommodation					\$	1
Meals			- 4		\$	-
Other:					\$	-
Other:		VIII VIII VIII VIII VIII VIII VIII VII			\$	
Other:					\$	
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	120.20	Ś	3.40	\$	123.60

Donna Brady

Subject:

FW: LDC MAAD EB-2016-0025 Cost claim

From: Michael Janigan [mailto:mjanigan@piac.ca]

Sent: Friday, December 16, 2016 11:42 AM

To: Donna Brady

Subject: LDC MAAD EB-2016-0025 Cost claim

Donna:

Here is the LDC MAAD Powerstream et al. claim.

Add 226 photocopies.

Thanks.

www.piac.ca

Michael Janigan Special Counsel Regulatory and Consumer Affairs Public Interest Advocacy Centre 31 Hillsdale Ave. E. Toronto, ON M4S1T4 Office Tele: 416-840-3907 226 × 0.163 33.90

6.50.

18.60

THE PRINTING SPOT
2107 YONGE STREET
TORONTO ON

CARD 1538
CARD TYPE 2016/08/14
TIME 3366 17:09:44
TIME 4366 17:09:44
RECEIPT NUMBER
H84071835-001-117-011-0
PURCHASE
TOTAL \$7.35

VISA A00000000031010 SDC02E594C6C2DD2 0000000000

APPROVED

CARDHOLDER COPY

01-027

IMPORTANT - RETAIN THIS COPY FOR YOUR RECORDS

61.20

PRINT THREE

6593
PRINT THREE
2300 YONGE ST
416 481 5159
CALL AGAIN

REG 09-09-2016 11:00 0006

51 X 30.12 0EPT03 11 \$61.20 TAX-AN 1 \$51.20 TAX 1 \$7.96 CHARGE \$63.16

(M) WILHARD ILVAN TON

Retain this copy for your records Customer copy





Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2016-0025		Process: BF	HPS Merger	1 1
Party:	VECC		Service Prov	vider Name: Mark Garner	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	Completed Practising/Years Experier	of Relevant
	Legal Counsel		118 20 148	28	
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst			Hourly Rate:	\$325
	For Consultant/Analyst:		ached vided within previous :	HST Rate Charged (enter %):	3.9%

SI	tatement o	of Fe	es Being	Cla	imed		
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference						anime constru	
Preparation		\$	325.00	\$		\$ 77.0	\$
Attendance		\$	325.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$
Technical Conference							
Preparation	1.75 1.8	\$	325.00	\$	568.75	\$ 22.41	\$ 591.10
Attendance	6.0	\$	325.00	\$	1,950.00	\$ 76.83	\$ 2,026.83
Interrogatories							
Preparation	7.0	\$	325.00	\$	2,275.00	\$ 89.64	\$ 2,364.64
Responses	4.5	\$	325.00	\$	1,462.50	\$ 57.62	\$ 1,520.12
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	325.00	\$		\$ -	\$ 9#0
Attendance		\$	325.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	325.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ (<u>4</u>)
Attendance	Palleria	\$	325.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ 0=9
Proposal Preparation		\$	325.00	\$	*	\$ -	\$ 800
Argument							
Preparation	18.5	\$	325.00	\$	6,012.50	\$ 236.89	\$ 6,249.39
Oral Hearing							
Preparation	5.5	\$	325.00	\$	1,787.50	\$ 70.43	\$ 1,857.93
Attendance		\$	325.00	\$		\$ -	\$ -
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	325.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$
Attendance	1.0	\$	325.00	\$	325.00	\$ 12.81	\$ 337.81
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	r#c	\$ -	\$ -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES		de la		\$	14,381.25	\$ 566.62	\$ 14,947.87

Econalysis Consulting Services

34 King St East Suite 630 Toronto, Ontario M5C 2X8

Statement of Costs

Date	File #
12/12/2016	2016077

Public Interest Advocacy Centre
Suite 1204
1 Nicholas Street
Ottawa, ON
K1N 7B7

Terms	Docket No.
Net 30	EB-2016-0025

			Net 30	I	EB-2016-0025
		Project			
		BHPS Merger			
Serviced	Item	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
23/06/2016	Other Conferences Attendance	Attend Merger Presentation at	1	225.00	205.00

Serviced	Item	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
23/06/2016	Other Conferences Attendance	Attend Merger Presentation at	1	325.00	325.00
06/07/2016 10/08/2016	Interrogatories Preparation	OEB 9:30-10:40 Draft Interrogatories/notes	7	325.00	2,275.00
10/00/2010	Interrogatories Responses	Review interrogatory response/notes/begin TC	4.5	325.00	1,462.50
11/08/2016	Technical Conf. Preparation	preperation Teleconference among intervenors/discuss areas of interest/coordinate issue	1.25	325.00	406.25
17/08/2016	Technical Conf. Preparation	coverage/strategy for hearing Prepare letter regarding issue for Technical Conference/prepare to TC.	0.5	325.00	162.50
24/08/2016 08/09/2016	Technical Conf. Attendance Oral Hearing Preparation	Attend Technical Conference	6	325.00	1,950.00
		Prepare cross-examination notes/discuss with MJ	5	325.00	1,625.00
21/09/2016	Oral Hearing Preparation	Review draft licence filed by Applicant prior to hearing.	0.5	325.00	162.50
05/10/2016	Argument Preparation	Review undertakings, transcript and discuss MJ outline of	3	325.00	975.00
06/10/2016	Argument Preparation	argument with MJ. Draft portions of argument/incorporate with MJ outline and portions	6.5	325.00	2,112.50

HST #10160 6028
Total

Econalysis Consulting Services

34 King St East Suite 630 Toronto, Ontario M5C 2X8

Bill To Public Interest Advocacy Centre Suite 1204 1 Nicholas Street Ottawa, ON K1N 7B7

Statement of Costs

Date	File #	
12/12/2016	2016077	

Terms	Docket No.	
Net 30	EB-2016-0025	

Project BHPS Merger									
07/10/2016	Argument Preparation	Complete and finalize argument/review with MJ/File (10pm) Subtotal HST on Sales	9	325.00	2,925.00 14,381.25 1,869.56				

HST #10160 6028 \$1,869.56

Total \$16,250.81