

### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

			<u>Ir</u>	nstructions	
- All claims m	nust b	e in Canadian dollars. If appl	icable, state ex Rate:	mulas are embedded in the form to assist workchange rate and country of initial currency.  Country: (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Cla	
Disbursement However, on - The cost cla	nts Be Ily one nim m	ing Claimed") is required for e "Summary of Fees and Disbu ust be supported by a comple	each lawyer, an ursements" cov eted Affidavit si	calyst/consultant and articling student/paral rering the whole of the party's cost claim sho gned by a representative of the party. povided to the Board as prescribed on the Co	egal. ould be provided.
Exc	cept a	ns provided in section 7.03 of	the Practice D	irection on Cost Awards, itemized receipts	must be provided.
File # EB-	201	6-0245		Process: Union Gas 2017 Rates	
Party:	Fed	eration of Rental-housing	Prov. Of Ont.	Affiant's Name: Dwayne R. Quir	n
HST Numbe	er:	82029 2415 RT0001		HST Rate Ontario:	13.00%
		Full Registrant Unregistered Other	0	Qualifying Non-Profit Tax Exempt	
I, in the Prov		R. Dwayne Quint		, of the City/Town of, swear or affin	Elmira
1. I am a rep 2. I have exa Being Claime 3. The attach Disbursemen Ontario Ener 4. This cost of described in  Signature	resenmined ded", "sents Bergy Book laim of Art	tative of the above-noted pare all of the documentation in statement(s) of Fees Being Classummary of Fees and Disburse ing Claimed" include only costard process referred to above does not include any costs for ons 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board fill	ty (the "Party") support of this simed" and "Sta ements Being C ts incurred and e. work done, or d's Practice Dire	and as such have knowledge of the matter cost claim, including the attached "Summar atement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed laimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed time spent directly for the purposes of the time spent, by a person that is an employer	s attested to herein. ry of Fees and Disbursements ". ed" and "Statement(s) of Party's participation in the
in the Prov			~>	on Dec 19 (date)	2016.
1	Q.	, Pr	eather Anne Grant, a ( ovince of Ontario, for I Noll LLP, Barristers ar pires November 2, 20	Dueck, Sauer, Julzi nd Solicitors.	



#### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

**Commissioner for taking Affidavits** 

File # EB- 2016-0245 Process: Union Gas 2017 Rates

Party: Federation of Rental-housing Prov. Of Ont.

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed					
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	9,735.00			
Disbursements	\$	303.30			
HST	\$	1,304.98			
Total Cost Claim	\$	11,343.28			

#### **Payment Information**

Make cheque payable to: Federation of Rental-housing Providers of Ontario

Send payment to this address: 20 Upjohn Road, Suite 105

Toronto, Ontario

M3B 2V9

Attention: Kristina Lauesen



## **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2016-0245		Process: Union Gas 2017 Rates				
Party:	Federation of Rental-housing Pro	v. Of Ont.	Service Provider Name:	Dwayne R. Quinn			
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	(check one )	Year Called to Bar	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience			
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst			Hourly Rate: \$330			
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	ched HST Rate Clided within previous 24 months	harged ( <i>enter</i> % ): 13.0%			

Statement of Fees Being Claimed								
	Hours	Hourly Rate Subtotal HST		Total				
Pre-hearing Conference								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Technical Conference								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Interrogatories								
Preparation	11.5	\$	330.00	\$	3,795.00	\$	493.35	\$ 4,288.35
Responses		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Issues Conference								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
ADR - Settlement Conference								
Preparation	10.5	\$	330.00	\$	3,465.00	\$	450.45	\$ 3,915.45
Attendance	6.0	\$	330.00	\$	1,980.00	\$	257.40	\$ 2,237.40
Proposal Preparation	1.5	\$	330.00	\$	495.00	\$	64.35	\$ 559.35
Argument								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Oral Hearing								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Other Conferences								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ <u>-</u>
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	9,735.00	\$	1,265.55	\$ 11,000.55



## **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File# EB-	2016-0245	Process:	Union Gas 2017 Rates	

**Party:** Federation of Rental-housing Pro Service Provider Name: Dwayne R. Quinn

	Statement of	Disbursen	nents Being Claimed		
			Net Cost	HST	Total
Scanning/Photocop	ру				\$ -
Printing					\$ -
Courier					\$ -
Telephone/Fax					\$ -
Transcripts					\$ -
Travel: Air					\$ -
Travel: Car		\$	56.00	\$ 7.28	\$ 63.28
Travel: Rail					\$ -
Travel (Other):					\$ -
Parking					\$ -
Тахі					\$ -
Accommodation		\$	234.00	\$ 30.42	\$ 264.42
Meals		\$	8.03	\$ 1.04	\$ 9.07
Other:	HOTEL D.M.P.	\$	5.27	\$ 0.69	\$ 5.96
Other:					\$ -
Other:					\$ -
TOTAL DISBURSEM	FNTS:	\$	303.30	\$ 39.43	\$ 342.73

### DR QUINN & ASSOCIATES LTD.

**Invoice** 

130 Muscovey Drive, Elmira, ON N3B 3P7 (519) 500-1022

drquinn@rogers.com

Date	Invoice #
12/19/2016	150

Invoice To

Federation of Rental-housing Providers ON 20 Upjohn Road, Suite 105 Toronto, ON M3B 2V9

Terms
Net 60

Service Dates	Description	Qty	Rate	Amount
10/28/2016	REVIEW EVIDENCE, ID ISSUES	1.5	330.00	495.00
10/29/2016	REVIEW EVIDENCE, ID ISSUES, REVIEW BOARD STAFF IR's	2	330.00	660.00
10/30/2016	REVIEW EVIDENCE, ID ISSUES	1.5	330.00	495.00
11/1/2016	REVIEW GAS SUPPLY, ID ISSUES	1	0.00	0.00
11/1/2016	EB-2013-0365 PARKWAY DELIVERY, ID ISSUES	2	330.00	660.00
11/3/2016	GAS SUPPLY IR's	1.5	0.00	0.00
11/3/2016	DRAFT IR's, REVIEW INTERVENOR IR's, CALL W/BOARD STAFF, FINALIZE AND SUBMIT	4.5	330.00	1,485.00
11/11/2016	REVIEW IRR's,	1.5	330.00	495.00
11/12/2016	REVIEW IRR's, REVIEW EB-2013-0365 SETTLEMENT, DRAFT LETTER RE IRR's	4	330.00	1,320.00
11/13/2016	REVIEW DOCKETS, FINALIZE AND SUBMIT LETTER	1	330.00	330.00
11/14/2016	REVIEW OTHER INTERVENOR IRR's	1.5	330.00	495.00
11/15/2016	PREPARE ISSUES FOR DISCUSSION	1.5	330.00	495.00
11/16/2016	PREP AND ATTEND SETTLEMENT	7	330.00	2,310.00
11/21/2016	REVIEW SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL, EMAIL REQUEST FOR UPDATED IRR's	1	330.00	330.00
11/23/2016	FINAL REVIEW, EMAIL ACCEPTANCE	0.5	330.00	165.00
11/15/2016	TRAVEL MILEAGE	140	0.40	56.00
11/15/2016	HOTEL ACCOMMODATION		239.27	239.27
11/16/2016	LUNCH		8.03	8.03
	HST on Sales		13.00%	1,304.98

**Total** \$11,343.28

From: Thanks for staying!

To: DRQUINN@ROGERS.COM

Subject: Your Nov 15, 2016 - Nov 18, 2016 stay at the Toronto Marriott Downtown Eaton Centre Hotel

**Date:** Sunday, November 20, 2016 5:25:54 AM

Thank you for choosing the Toronto Marriott Downtown Eaton Centre Hotel for your recent stay.

As requested, below is a billing summary or adjustment for your stay. **If you have questions about your bill**, please contact the hotel directly at (416) 597-9200.

Make another reservation on Marriott.com >>



Marriott Rewards members may receive this email automatically after every stay.

Modify your email preferences >>

#### Summary of Your Stay

**Hotel: Toronto Marriott Downtown Eaton** 

Centre Hotel 525 Bay Street

Toronto, Ontario M5G 2L2

Canada

(416) 597-9200

Guest: QUINN/DWAYNE/MR

130 MUSCOVEY DR ELMIRA, ON N3B3P7

CAN

Dates of stay: Nov 15, 2016 - Nov 18, 2016

Guest number: 1826

Marriott Rewards number: XXXXX3270

Room number: 701 Group number:

Date	Description	Reference	Charges	Credits
11/15/16	TELECOMM	FREEHSIA	0.00	
11/15/16	SELFPARK	11/15/16	36.00	
11/15/16	ROOM	701, 1	198.00	
11/15/16	HST	701, 1	25.74	
11/15/16	D.M.P.	701, 1	5.27	
11/15/16	DMP HST	701, 1	0.68	
11/16/16	RM SERV	5430 701	25.47	
11/16/16	TELECOMM	FREEHSIA	0.00	
11/16/16	SELFPARK	11/16/16	36.00	
11/16/16	ROOM	701, 1	198.00	
11/16/16	HST	701, 1	25.74	
11/16/16	D.M.P.	701, 1	5.27	
11/16/16	DMP HST	701, 1	0.68	
11/17/16	TELECOMM	FREEHSIA	0.00	
11/17/16	SELFPARK	11/17/16	36.00	
11/17/16	ROOM	701, 1	198.00	

## metro

Store #100752 (416)483-7340 E&0E HST# R105216170

DELI CHICKEN LEG F2GO BEVERAGE F2GO BEVERAGE GENERAL MERC PLASTIC BAG	RF H H	5. 98 1. 00 1. 00 0. 05
SUBTOTAL		8.03
2.05 HST (13.000)% 5.98 RED (5.000)% 5.98 PFT (8.000)%		0. 27 0. 30 0. 48
TOTAL		9. 08
CREDIT CR Total number of items sold =	4	9. 08
AIR MILES BASE AIR MILES EARNED BONUS AIR MILES EARNED Total Air Miles earned AIR MILES COLLECTOR	*	0 0 <b>0</b> *****
DREAM MILES BALANCE AIR MILES CASH BALANCE		4624 176

AIR MILES: 1-888-247-6453 airmiles.ca

RETAIN RECEIPT FOR PRODUCT RETURN WITHIN 14 DAYS. SEE STORE FOR DETAILS.

\*CUSTOMER CARE NUMBER 1-877-763-7374\*

\*\*\* metro.ca \*\*\*

How did we do? Tell us at METROSURVEY.CA for a chance to win \$1000 IN FREE GROCERIES. Monthly winners

6EB1893646D7901C0

TRANSACTION RECORD/RELEVE DE TRANSACTION

D0000040000 DETENADOMO 0040000