AI ken & ASSOCiateS Phone: (519) 351-8624

578 McNaughton Ave. West E-mail: randy.aiken@sympatico.ca
Chatham, Ontario, N7L 4J6

March 24, 2017

Ms. Kirsten Walli

Board Secretary

Ontario Energy Board
2300 Yonge Street

Suite 2700

Toronto, Ontario, M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli:
Re: EB-2016-0091 — London Hydro 2017 Rates - Cost Award Documents of LPMA

As per the Board’s Decision and Rate Order dated March 23, 2017, please find attached two
copies of the following documents related to the requested cost award of the London Property
Management Association (“LPMA”) associated with their participation with respect to the above
noted hearing. An electronic copy has also been e-mailed to the Board Secretary and to London
Hydrs.

The cost award documents contains the following pages from the Cost Claim for Hearings form
and supporting information:

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements,
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed,

Aiken & Associates invoice dated February 27, 2017, and
Photocopies of expenses.

It should be noted that due to the limitations in the Statement of Fees Being Claimed, attendance
time associated with the settlement proposal presentation has been included as Attendance Other
Conferences. Similarly, time spent on a conference call that dealt with concerns of a ratepayer on
the calculation of the global adjustment have been included under Proposal Preparation for the
ADR Settlement Conference.

Payment should be made to the LPMA at the following address:
London Property Management Association

460 Berkshire Drive, Unit 102

London, Ontario, N6J 3S1

Attn: Shirley Criger

If you have any questions, please give me a call.

Sincerely,

Randy Aiken
Aiken & Associates

c.C. Ms. Shirley Criger, LPMA
Martin Benum, London Hydro (e-mail only)






Ontario Energy Board Fﬁ

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS e
Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2016-0091 Process: London Hydro 2017 Cost of Service Rates

Party: London Property Management Association

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Legal/consultant/other fees S 17,424.00
Disbursements S 540.73
HST S 2,334.58
Total Cost Claim S 20,299.31

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: London Property Management Association

Send payment to this address: Shirley Criger
London Property Management Association
460 Berskhire Drive, Unit 102
London, Ontario, N6J 351
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Ontario Energy Board %}
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS :
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File# EB- 2016-0091 Process: London Hydro 2017 Cost of Service Rates
Party: London Property Management Association Service Provider Name: Randall E. Aiken
Completed Years
Year Called to Practising/Years of Relevant
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (check one) Bar Experience
Legal Counsel L] [::::::::::] 30 |
Articling Student/Paralegal L]
Consultant Hourly Rate:
Analyst l
For Consultant/Analyst: L] cvattached HST Rate Charged (enter % ):
CV provided within previous 24 months
Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total
Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation $ 33000(S - |S - $ -
Attendance S 330.00|5S - S - S -
Technical Conference
Preparation S 330.00(S$ - S - S -
Attendance $ 330.00(S - S - $ -
Interrogatories
Preparation 16.9|$ 330.00|$ 5,577.00$ 72501 S 6,302.01
Responses 9.8[$ 330.00(S$ 3,23400|S$ 42042 S 3,654.42
Issues Conference
Preparation S 33000(S - S - S -
Attendance $ 330.00(S$ - S - $ -
ADR - Settlement Conference
Preparation 6.3|S 33000|S$ 2079.00($ 27027 | S 2,349.27
Attendance 11.5($ 330.00|$ 3,79500|S$ 49335 S 4,288.35
Proposal Preparation 6.3[$ 33000|S$ 2,079.00|S$ 27027 | S 2,349.27
Argument
Preparation $ 33000(S - |S - $ -
Oral Hearing
Preparation $ 33000(S - |S - $ -
Attendance S 330.00|5$S - S - S -
Other Conferences
Preparation S 33000(S$ - S - S -
Attendance 20/$ 330.00]|5$ 660.00 | $ 85.80 | $ 745.80
Case Management $ 170.00( S - S - S -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | | S 17,424.00 | S 2,265.12 | S 19,689.12
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File # EB- 2016-0091

Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Party: London Property Management /

Process:

Service Provider Name:

London Hydro 2017 Cost of Service Rates

Randall E. Aiken

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Net Cost

HST

Total

Scanning/Photocopy

Printing

Courier

Telephone/Fax

Transcripts

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

21452 [ S

27.89

Travel: Rail

Travel (Other): |

Parking at OEB

3540 [ S

4.60

Parking

Taxi

Accommodation

240.20 | S

30.40

Meals

50.61 [ S

6.57

Other:

Other:

Other:

wnlnlnlunluninlunlnlnlvlunlnlunlnlunlun

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

540.73 [ $

69.46 | $

610.19
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INVOICE
AIKEN & ASSOCIATES

578 MCNAUGHTON AVE. WEST INVOICE NO. 003-2017
CHATHAM, ONTARIO, N7L 4J6 DATE February 27, 2017
(519) 351-8624 HST REGISTRATION NO. 130417983

randy.aiken@sympatico.ca

TO Shirley Criger
London Property Management Association
460 Berkshire Drive, Unit 102
London, Ontario, N6J 351

PROJECT
EB-2016-0091 - London Hydro - 2017 Cost of Service Rates Application
Page 1 of 2
DATE HOURS DESCRIPTION RATE TOTAL
Oct. 28 2.00 [Review of evidence & preparation of interrogatories
Oct. 31 1.50 |Review of evidence & preparation of interrogatories
Nov. 28 4.10 |Review of evidence & preparation of interrogatories
Dec. 1 3.60 |[Review of evidence & preparation of interrogatories
Dec. 5 2.50 [Review of evidence & preparation of interrogatories
Dec. 8 3.20 |[Review of evidence & preparation of interrogatories
Jan. 20 3.00 [Review of interrogatory responses & preparation of clarification questions
Jan. 22 6.80 |[Review of interrogatory responses & preparation of clarification questions
Jan. 23 3.90 |Preparation for settlement conference
Jan. 24 1.20 |Review of clarification question responses
Jan. 25 7.00 |Attendance at settlement conference
Jan. 26 1.20 |Preparation for settlement conference
Jan. 26 4.50 |Attendance at settlement conference
Feb. 2 1.50 |Review of draft settlement proposal & preparation of comments
Feb. 3 1.00 |Review of draft settlement proposal spreadsheets
Feb. 7 1.20 |Review of revised draft settlement proposal spreadsheets
Feb. 9 1.10 |Review of final spreadsheets
Feb. 13 1.10 |Conference call re global adjustment calculation/concern
Feb. 16 2.00 |Attendance at settlement proposal presentation (by phone)
Feb. 25 0.40 |Review of draft rate order
52.80 |Sub-total - Consulting Costs 330.00 17,424.00

Make all cheques payable to AIKEN & ASSOCIATES
Payment is due upon receipt of payment for the project




PROJECT

EB-2016-0091 - London Hydro - 2017 Cost of Service Rates Application

Page 2 of 2
DATE HOURS DESCRIPTION RATE TOTAL
EXPENSES
Travel - Car
Jan. 24 Chatham to Toronto (303 kms @ $0.354/km (HST component calculated below)) 107.26
Jan. 26 Toronto to Chatham (303 kms @ $0.354/km (HST component calculated below)) 107.26
Sub-Total - Travel - Car 214.52
Travel - Other
Jan. 25 Parking at OEB 17.70
Jan. 26 Parking at OEB 17.70
Sub-Total - Travel - Other 35.40
Accomodation
Jan. 24 Hotel, including parking 120.10
Jan. 25 Hotel, including parking 120.10
Sub-Total - Accomodation 240.20
Meals
Jan. 24 Dinner 17.70
Jan. 25 Lunch 5.25
Jan. 25 Dinner 17.70
Jan. 26 Lunch 9.96
Sub-Total - Meals 50.61
SUMMARY TOTAL FEES AND EXPENSES 17,964.73
HST DETAIL
Consulting Fees (@ 13.0%) 2,265.12
Travel - Car (@ 13.0%) 27.89
Travel - Other (@ 13.0%) 4.60
Accomodation (@ 13.0%) 30.40
Meals (@ 13.0%) 6.57
TOTAL HST 2,334.58
SUBTOTAL 17,964.73
H.S.T. 2,334.58
TOTAL $20,299.31

Make all cheques payable to AIKEN & ASSOCIATES
Payment is due upon receipt of payment for the project




Charges

Credits

Mr Randall Aiken A/R Number
578 Mcnaughton Ave West Group Code
Chatham ON N7L 4J6
Canada Invoice No.
Reference #
Room No. 418 Page No. 10f2
Arrival 01-24-17 Cashier No. 114
Departure 01-26-17 User ID SW
Date Descripti_oh -
01-24-17 1In Room Dining-Food Room# 418 : CHECK# 877732
01-24-17 *Accommodation
01-24-17 ‘Facilities Fee
01-24-17 ‘Room HST 13%
01-24-17 ‘Parking 4
01-24-17 }Other HST 13%
01-25-17 [|n Room Dining-Food Room# 418 : CHECK# 877834
01-25-17 :*Accommodation
|01-25-17 ‘Facilities Fee
01-25-17 Room HST 13%
01-25-17 Parking 4
01-25-17 | Other HST 13%

TORONTO DON VALLEY HOTEL & SUITES
175 Wynford Drive
Toronto, Ontario M3C 1J3

Telephone: (416)449-4111 Fax: (416) 385-6700

HST#870011962 www.torontodonvalleyhotel.com

| 33.31
105.00
3.15
13.65
11.95
1.55
38.15
105.00
3.15
13.65
11.95
1.55



Mr Randall Aiken

A/R Number

578 Mcnaughton Ave West Eroun Code

Chatham ON N7L 4J6 P

Canada |nVOice NO
Reference #

Room No. 418 Page No. 20f2

Arrival 01-24-17 Cashier No. 114

Departure 01-26-17 User ID SW

Date Description _ Charges Credits
Total 342.06 0.00
Balance 342.06
Facilities Fee Room HST 13 Other HST 13
0.00 0.00 6.30 0.00 0.00 27.30 0.00 3.10 0.00 0.00

Guest Signature:

| have received the goods and / or services in the amount shown heron. | agree that my liability for this will not be waived and agree to be held
personally liable in the event that the indicated person, company or association fails to pay for any part of or the full amount of these charges. |

further agree the obligations set forth in the cardholder's agreement with the issuer. | also am aware the following taxes are non negotiable;
HST 13% and Facility Fee 3%.

TORONTO DON VALLEY HOTEL & SUITES
175 Wynford Drive
Toronto, Ontario M3C 1J3

Telephone: (416) 4494111

Fax: (416) 385-6700

HST#870011962 www.torontodonvalieyhotel.com



IN ROOM DINING
175 WYNFORD DRIVE
TORONTO, ONTARIO

M3C 1J3
GST # R - 870011962
SRV 123 TABLE 1418/1 TIME 18:34
ROOM SERVE
1 VALLEY BURGER 17.00
1 DIET COKE 2.95
1 DELIVERY CHARGE 3.00
1 MILK 2.85
HST 3.82
SERVICE 15% 3.43
NET SALES ~ 25.90 GRAND TOTAL  33.15

............

ROOM NO......... ...

PRINT NAME. ...

SIGNATURES : i wsvnniminimsnsmamemsmanan
¥xx  GRATUITY INCLUDED IN BILL

1/25/17 GUEST 1 NUMBER 877834
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GST # R - 870011962
SRV 123 TABLE 1418/1  TIME 18:26
ROOM SERVE
1 WYNFORD CLUB 17.00 e e
1 DELIVERY CHARGE 3.00
1 MILK 2.95
HST 3.37
SERVICE 15% 2.99
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