

PUBLIC INTEREST ADVOCACY CENTRE LE CENTRE POUR LA DÉFENSE DE L'INTÉRÊT PUBLIC

May 10, 2017

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board P.O. Box 2319 2300 Yonge Street Toronto, ON M4P 1E4 PIAC File # 6630-05 VIA E-Mail 6 pages

Re:

EB-2016-0110 - Welland Hydro-Electric System Corp

Cost Claim of Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC)

On behalf of the Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC) we have attached their cost claim with respect to the above-noted proceeding. We have also directed copy of same to the Applicant as well as their counsel via email.

Thank you.

Donna Brady

Office Administrator

Cc: Welland – Wayne Armstrong – warmstrong@wellandhydro.com

Counsel - John Vellone - jvellone@blg.com



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

	Instructions
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, star R: - A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claim Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawye However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" - The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affida - A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless	country: med" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of or, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal. " covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.
File # EB- 2016-0110	Process: Welland 2017 COS
Party: VECC	Affiant's Name: Donna Brady
HST Number: 13059 2405	HST Rate Ontario: 3.94%
Full Registrant Unregistered Other	Qualifying Non-Profit Tax Exempt
I, Donna Brady	, of the City/Town of Ottawa
in the Province/State of Ontario	, swear or affirm that:
2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.	ing Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the e, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as
	x
Signature of Affiant	
Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town	of Ottawa
in the Province/State of Ontario	on <u>MA+10-2017</u>
Commissioner for taking Affidavits	



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Process: Welland 2017 COS

File # EB- 2016-0110

Sum	mary of Fe	es and Disbursements Being Claimed	
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	10,065.00	
Disbursements	\$	ontool• on the personal and the second of t	
HST	\$	396.56	
Total Cost Claim	\$	10,461.56	
		Payment Information	

Send payment to this address: 1204-ONE Nicholas Street

Ottawa, ON K1N 7B7



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2016-0110		Process: M	Velland 2017 COS	
Party:	VECC		Service Pro	ovider Name: Bill Harper	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one	Year Called to Bar	Completed Practising/Years Experier	of Relevant
	Legal Counsel			37	
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst			Hourly Rate:	\$330
	For Consultant/Analyst:	☐ CV at	tached	HST Rate Charged (enter %):	3.9%
		☑ CV pr	ovided within previous	s 24 months	-

St	atement o	f Fe	es Being	Cla	imed				
	Hours Hourly Rate		:	Subtotal HST			Total		
Pre-hearing Conference									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	120	\$	2	\$	7(2)
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	340
Technical Conference									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$		\$	-
Attend ance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	
Interrogatories									
Preparation	2.8	\$	330.00	\$	907.50	\$	35.76	\$	943.26
Responses		\$	330.00	\$	(= 1	\$	-	\$	
Issues Conference									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	7	\$	÷
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	5 <u>2</u> 4
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation	7.0	\$	330.00	\$	2,310.00	\$	91.01	\$	2,401.01
Attendance	3.3	\$	330.00	\$	1,072.50	\$	42.26	\$	1,114.76
Proposal Preparation	0.5	\$	330.00	\$	165.00	\$	6.50	\$	171.50
Argument									
Preparation	-	\$	330.00	\$	7 4 5	\$	2	\$	294
Oral Hearing									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	2 7
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$		\$	-	\$	(F)
Other Conferences									
Pre paration		\$	330.00	\$	148	\$	φ	\$	(CE)
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	£
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	4,455.00	\$	175.53	\$	4,630.53



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File# EB-	2016-0110		Process: <u>M</u>	Velland 2017 COS	
Party:	VECC		Service Pro	ovider Name: Mark Garner	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	Completed Practising/Years Experier	of Relevant
	Legal Counsel			29	
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst			Hourly Rate:	\$330
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV prov	hed ided within previous	HST Rate Charged (enter %):	3.9%

St	atement c	f Fe	es Being	Cla	imed					
	Hours Ho		Hourly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total	
Pre-hearing Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	3	\$		\$		
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	4	\$	-	\$	1200	
Technical Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$		\$. 	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	(7)	
Interrogatories										
Preparation	7.5	\$	330.00	\$	2,475.00	\$	97.52	\$	2,572.52	
Responses		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Issues Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	9=8	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$		\$	7	
ADR - Settlement Conference										
Preparation	4.0	\$	330.00	\$	1,320.00	\$	52.01	\$	1,372.01	
Attendance	4.5	\$	330.00	\$	1,485.00	\$	58.51	\$	1,543.51	
Proposal Preparation	1.0	\$	330.00	\$	330.00	\$	13.00	\$	343.00	
Argument										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$	-	\$	3207	
Oral Hearing										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	·=)?	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Other Conferences										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	=1	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	2	\$	-	\$	2:	
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	14 0	
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	5,610.00	\$	221.03	\$	5,831.03	

Econalysis Consulting Services

34 King St East Suite 630 Toronto, Ontario M5C 2X8

Bill To Public Interest Advocacy Centre Suite 1204 1 Nicholas Street Ottawa, ON K1N 7B7

Statement of Costs

Date	File#
5/5/2017	2017013

Terms	Docket No.
Net 30	EB-2016-0110

Project

Welland 2017 COS

Serviced	Item	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
2/24/2017	Interrogatories Preparation		0.75	330.00	247.50
2/25/2017	Interrogatories Preparation		2	330.00	660.00
2/28/2017	Interrogatories Preparation	Review past decisions/review evidence/interrogatories/file setup	7.5	330.00	2,475.00
3/21/2017	ADR Preparation		1	330.00	330.00
3/22/2017	ADR Preparation		3.25	330.00	1,072.50
3/24/2017	ADR Preparation		2.5	330.00	825.00
3/31/2017	ADR Preparation	Review clarification queston responses	0.25	330.00	82.50
4/1/2017	ADR Preparation	Review interrogatory response/develop settment notes	4	330.00	1,320.00
4/3/2017	ADR Attendance		3.25	330.00	1,072.50
4/3/2017	ADR Attendance	Attend settlement conference (no counsel)	4	330.00	1,320.00
4/4/2017	ADR Attendance	Reconve settlement conference - day 2 (1 - 1:30pm)	0.5	330.00	165.00
4/12/2017	ADR Proposal Preparation		0.5	330.00	165.00
4/16/2017	ADR Proposal Preparation	Review 1st draft of settlement agreement	0.5	330.00	165.00
4/19/2017	ADR Proposal Preparation	Final review of settlement proposal	0.5	330.00	165.00
		Subtotal HST on Sales		13.00%	10,065.00 1,308.45

HST #10160 6028	\$1,308.45
Total	\$11,373.45