Attention:			File #: Inv #:	999291 Sample
RE: Re:	Henvey Inlet			
DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Oct-20-16	Email to client	0.10		EB
	Email from client	0.10		EB
A is " A first				
	n fri fe gelise om de fender ferste state for de series andere series andere series andere series andere series		A MARKEN BAR	
Stratt White an		æ		
				-

			,	
Jan-19-17	Email to Hana; email from Emilio; review application; research and review rules of Ontario Energy Board; draft letter to Ontario Energy Board for Intervenor Status.	1.00		ST
Jan-23-17	Email to Ontario Engergy Board; email to Emilio; emails from/to client	0.40		ST
Feb-16-17	Email from Opt B with Procedural Order; emails from Emilio	0.40		ST
Feb-22-17	Email from Jeff Hull; telephone call to Jeff Hull	0.30		ST
Feb-23-17	Emails from client; emails from/to Emilio	0.50		ST
Feb-24-17	Review Procedural Order; review rules of Ontario Engergy Board re: review of decision; email to client	1.00		ST
				<b>A</b> .
Mar-01-17	Emails from/to Hana; email from Hull	0.50		ST
				4
Mar-02-17	Emails to/from Jeff Hull	0.20		ST
Mar-03-17	Emails from/to Jeff Hull; emails from Emilio; telephone call with Hana; telephone call with Jeff Hull; telephone call with Brian Hull; email to Hana	1.50		ST
Mar-06-17	Review emails from Myers; telephone call to Brian Hull; email from Brian Hull	0.60		ST
	Email to counsel; review emails from client	0.50		CL
Mar-07-17	Email from Jonathan Myers	0.10		ST
Mar-08-17	Emails from Jonathan Myers;emails from Hana; review/revise draft motion; email from client	0.60		ST
	Prepare motion record; research rules; give instructions to A. Scott; review emails from Mr. Myers; emails to/from client	3.00		CL

Page 2

June 6, 2017

	Page 3		June 6, 2	017
•				
Mar-09-17	Email from Brian Hull; telephone call to Jeff Hull; email from Emilio	0.30		ST
Mar-10-17	Email to Board	0.10		EB
Mar-13-17	Emails from/to Emilio; telephone call to Brian Hull; review Surveyor's email and drawings; draft email to Jonathan Myers	1.00	STATE OF A	ST
Mar-14-17	Emails to/from Anne Scott; email from Jeff Hull	0.50		ST
Mar-21-17	Review email from counsel for applicant	0.30		CL
Mar-22-17	Review director's decision	0.30		CL
Mar-24-17	Letter from counsel	0.10		EB
Mar-30-17	Prepare request for reconsideration	1.00		CL
Apr-02-17	Instructions to expert	0.20		CL
Apr-04-17	Review response fro Henvey Inlet	0.30		ST
	Prepare submissions for request to review of Director's decision	2.00		CL
Apr-25-17	Emails to/from Jeff Hull	0.70		ST
Apr-26-17	Emails from/to Jeff Hull; telephone call to Jeff Hull; research and draft submissions	2.00		ST
Apr-27-17	Email from Jeff Hull; telephone call to Jeff Hull; revise letter to OEB	1.00		ST
	Letter to Ms Walli and clients	0.30		$\operatorname{CL}$
May-03-17	Review letters from Ministry of the Enviroment and Climate Change to Emilio and to Kim Sachtelben; email to Hana; email to/from client	1.10		ST
May-04-17	Meeting with Hana to discuss Ministry of Enviroment and Climate Change letter; review submissions of Henvey IInlet of May04/17; email to client	1.00		ST

		AND A PROPERTY OF A PROPERTY O
7	,	a transition of the

May-05-17	Draft letter to Ministry of Environment; emails from/to client	2.00	ST
May-08-17	Emails from/to Thompson of Canacre; emails from/to Jeff Hull; telephone call with Jeff Hull	0.50	ST
May-09-17	Emails from/to Robert Thompson; emails to/from client	0.50	$\mathbf{ST}$
May-11-17	Telephone call to Brian Hull; meeting with Brian Hull, Jeff Hull, Kim Sachtleben, Colin Edwards with Sonja and Emilio; emails to client; telephone call to Jeff Hull	2.00	ST
May-13-17	Email from Brian Hull; emails to/from Emilio	0.50	ST
May-18-17	Email from OEB with decision	0.20	ST
May-19-17	Email to client; review decision of OEB; reporting email to client	1.00	ST

Totals



FEE SUMMARY:

Lawyer	Hours	Effective Rate	Amount
Emilio Bisceglia	1.10		
Sonja Turajlich	22.30	and the property	
Clerk	11.45		The second second second second

DISBURSEMENTS	Disbursements	Receipts
Paid to courier	10.00	
Totals	\$10.00	\$0.00

## Total Fees & Disbursements Image: Constraint of the second se