

Direct Dial:

416 862 4830

File: 7090

By Courier & RESS Filing

June 29, 2017

Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street 27th Floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Attention: Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary

Dear Ms. Walli:

Re: EB-2016-0246 - Updated DSM Measures

Please find enclosed the Ontario Sustainable Energy Association's Cost Claim for the above noted file.

Yours truly,

Joanna Vince

Encl.

Document #: 1221083



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

			nstructions		
- Required data inp	out is indicated by yellow-shac	ed fields. For	mulas are present in the docum	ent to assist with the	calculation of the
cost claim.					
- All claims must be	e in Canadian dollars. If appli		xchange rate and country of init		
		Rate:	III.	Country:	d a "Ctatament of
			"(comprising a "Statement of Fe		
			t or lawyer/articling student/par the party's cost claim should be		iy one
			signed by a representative of the		
			n consultant, a CV has been prov		another process
within the last 24 n		,	,		·
		ice Direction	on Cost Awards, itemized recei	pts must be provided	d.
File # EB- 2016	5-0246		Process: Updated DSM Me	easures	
Party: Onta	ario Sustainable Energy Ass	ociation	Affiant's Name: Joan	na Vince	
HST Number: 113627988RT0001			HST Rate	Ontario: 13.00%	6
	5 II De debuget		o Ouglifuing No	n Drofit	
	Full Registrant	$\overline{\checkmark}$	Qualifying No		
	Unregistered		ıax	Exempt	
	Other				
		2,000	Affidavit	No. 11 Page 1	
l,	Joanna Vince		, of the City/Town of	Oakvil	
in the Province,	/State ofC	ntario	, swe	ear or affirm that:	
2. I have examined Being Claimed", "S: 3. The attached "Si Disbursements Bei Ontario Energy Bos 4. This cost claim d described in sectio	all of the documentation in statement(s) of Fees Being Claiummary of Fees and Disburseing Claimed" include only cost and process referred to above loes not include any costs for ins 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board	upport of this med" and "St ments Being of s incurred an work done, o	') and as such have knowledge of cost claim, including the attach catement(s) of Disbursements Be Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees d time spent directly for the purport time spent, by a person that is rection on Cost Awards.	ed "Summary of Fees eing Claimed". Being Claimed" and " poses of the Party's p	and Disbursement Statement(s) of articipation in the
Signature of Af	nant				
Sworn or affirm	ned before me at the Cit	y/Town of	Toronto)	_,
in the Province,	/State of	Ontario	, on	June 23, 2017	121
	and to	1		(date)	

Page 1 of 2

Richard Butter, Notang



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Commissioner for taking Affidavits

File # EB- 2016-0246 Process: Updated DSM Measures

Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Association

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed					
Legal/consultant fees	\$5,577.00				
Disbursements	\$43.75				
HST	\$730.70				
Total Cost Claim	\$6,351.45				



File # EB-	2016-0246	Process:	Updated DSM Me	easures	
Party:	Ontario Sustainable Energy Association	Name:	Joanna Vince		
			Completed Ye Practising/Years of experience	relevant	
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal:		6		
	Consultant:				
	CV attached:	CV ı	not required:	V	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed							
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total		
Preparation	1.60	\$170.00	\$272.00	\$35.36	\$307.36		
Attendance - Technical Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Argument	3.10	\$170.00	\$527.00	\$68.51	\$595.51		
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
				Carrota Para	de la		
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES			\$799.00	\$103.87	\$902.87		

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies	\$43.75	\$5.69	\$49.44
Printing .		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$43.75	\$5.69	\$49.44



File # EB-	2016-0246	Process:	Updated DSM Measures		
Party:	Ontario Sustainable Energy Association	Name:	Robert Woon		
			Completed Years Practising/Years of relevant experience		
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal:		3		
	Consultant:				
	CV attached:	CV r	not required:		

Statement of Fees Being Claimed							
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total		
Preparation	7.10	\$170.00	\$1,207.00	\$156.91	\$1,363.91		
Attendance - Technical Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Argument	4.80	\$170.00	\$816.00	\$106.08	\$922.08		
Case Management	0.30	\$170.00	\$51.00	\$6.63	\$57.63		
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES			\$2,074.00	\$269.62	\$2,343.62		

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		included	\$0.00
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation	Si .	\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00



File # EB-	2016-0246	Process:	Updated DSM I	Measures	
Party:	Ontario Sustainable Energy Associatio	n Name	Victoria Chai	-	
			Completed Practising/Years experie	of relevant	
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal:		0 - Articling	Student	
	Consultant:		(
	CV attached:	CV	not required:	$ \sqrt{} $	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed							
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total		
Preparation	1.20	\$100.00	\$120.00	\$15.60	\$135.60		
Attendance - Technical Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Argument	6.80	\$100.00	\$680.00	\$88.40	\$768.40		
Case Management	0.20	\$170.00	\$34.00	\$4.42	\$38.42		
	nii Sydtab 🛱		K TELL BOLL	N.C.			
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES			\$834.00	\$108.42	\$942.42		

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed						
	Net Cost	HST	Total			
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00			
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00			
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00			
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00			
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00			
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00			
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00			
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00			
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00			
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00			
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00			
Parking		included	\$0.00			
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00			
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00			
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00			
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00			
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00			

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Fees Listing

 		_				
		AL	L	DAT	'ES	
Ta7 es	~ 7-	4-	~	T -11	=-0	,

Date Entry #	Fee / Time Explanation	Working Lawyer	Hours	Amount Inv#	Billing Status
1341	Ontario Sustainable Energy Association				
7090	Re: EB-2016-0246 Updated DSM Measures				
	Lawyer: 57 0.30 Hrs X 170.00	57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	0.30	51.00	Unbilled
1796093	revise draft intervenor request letter; ema				
Mar 8/2017		57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	0.40	68.00	Unbilled T
1802697	4		interrogat	ories;	P
Mar 13/2017	-	57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	1.20	204.00	Unbilled 🔿
1803617		atories and revise same;			P
Mar 14/2017	3 11	57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	3.40	578.00	Unbilled 🕤
	review joint submission; review and revise	draft interrogatories; email M.	Fraser an	d N. Risse for co	omments on c
Mar 15/2017		57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	0.60	102.00	Unbilled 7
1804587	emails with N. Risse re comments draft inte	rrogatories; finalize interrogat	cories;		
Mar 16/2017		74 - VICTORIA CHAI	0.20	20.00	Unbilled C
1804806	review timelines for DSM hearing;				011
Mar 20/2017		57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	0.30	51.00	Unbilled 🔨
1841204	review and prepare summary of utilities' re-	sponses to interrogatories;			P
Mar 28/2017		48 - JOANNA VINCE	0.50	85.00	Unbilled A
	consider key arguments and points for writte				
Mar 29/2017		57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	0.20	34.00	Unbilled p
	receive utilites responses to interrogatori				Fresh (113 e.g
	Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 100.00	74 - VICTORIA CHAI	0.40	40.00	Unbilled P
1810848	extract interrogatories responses from Unio				
	Lawyer: 57 1.00 Hrs X 170.00	57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	1.00	170.00	Unbilled A
	review utilities' responses to interrogator.	1es; telephone call with M. Fras 48 - JOANNA VINCE	1.00	170:00	Unbilled 77
Mar 30/2017	Lawyer: 48 1.00 Hrs X 170.00 review interrogatory responses; telephone co				
		57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	0.40	68.00	Unbilled A
	Lawyer: 57 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 discuss draft written submission;	57 - ROBERT WOON OUR DAW	0.10	00.00	A
	Lawyer: 74 1.60 Hrs X 100.00	74 - VICTORIA CHAI	1.60	160.00	Unbilled A
1841205	consider arguments and points for written s				A
Apr 8/2017		74 - VICTORIA CHAI	3.00	300.00	Unbilled A
	review evidence and application filed by Un.		put assump	tions table); dra	aft submissi A
	Lawyer: 57 0.20 Hrs X 170.00	57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	0,20	34.00	Unbilled 💍
	emails with M. Fraser re draft written subm.	issions;		,	P
Apr 10/2017		74 - VICTORIA CHAI	0.80	80.00	Unbilled C
1841245	review M. Fraser's argument and incorporate	into written submissions;			٢
Apr 11/2017	Lawyer: 74 1.40 Hrs X 100.00	74 - VICTORIA CHAI	1.40	140.00	Unbilled A
1841246	incorporate M. Fraser's argument into draft		missions to	submit to OEB;	
	Lawyer: 48 2.60 Hrs X 170.00	48 - JOANNA VINCE	2.60	442.00	Unbilled Δ
	review and revise draft submissions;				/* \
Apr 12/2017		57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	3.40	578.00	Unbilled A
	revise draft written submission;			00.00	77-1-111-1
Apr 12/2017		74 - VICTORIA CHAI	0.80	80.00	Unbilled A
	review interrogatory responses to other interpretation			100 00	Timbellion -
Apr 27/2017	Lawyer: 48 0.60 Hrs X 170.00	48 - JOANNA VINCE	0.60	102.00	Unbilled P
	review submission from Enbridge and Union r	esponding to submissions from US	0.80	er intervenors;	Unbilled O
	Lawyer: 57 0.80 Hrs X 170.00	57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW			OTIDITITED A
1821620	review utilities' joint reply submission; en	mairs with M. Fraser te utilitte	e JULIIC TE	bri annurgaron;	·
		Unbilled:	25.10	3693.00	
		Billed:	0.00	0.00	
		Total:	25.10	3693.00	
		Percent Billed:	0.00	0.00	

LEGEND					
P	Preparation				
TC	Attendance – Technical Conference				
SC Attendance – Settlement Conference					
ОН	Attendance – Oral Hearing				
A	Argument				
CM	Case Management				

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP
Client Costs Journal
To Jun/22/2017

			To Jun/	22/2017			
Date Entry#	Paid To Explanation	Sourc	e Matter	Client Name	Ref# G/L Acc	it	Amount
Mar/13/2017		CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
1806220	Photocopies						
Mar/13/2017	•	CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
1806367	Photocopies						
	Total for Mar/13/2017 :	0.50			(4)		
Mar/14/2017		CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RECOVERY	5.00
1806521	Photocopies						
Mar/14/2017	•	CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
1806541	Photocopies						
	Total for Mar/14/2017 :	5.25					
Mar/15/2017		CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
1806739	Photocopies						
Mar/15/2017		CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RECOVERY	2.50
1806740	Photocopies						
	Total for Mar/15/2017 :	2.75					(4)
Mar/16/2017		CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RĚCOVERY	5.00
1806783	Photocopies				20		
Mar/16/2017	2	CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RECOVERY	1.25
1806784	Photocopies						
Mar/16/2017		CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RECOVERY	0.75
1806785	Photocopies						
Mar/16/2017		CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RECOVERY	5.00
1806787	Photocopies				54.50		2.05
Mar/16/2017		CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RECOVERY	0.25
1806806	Photocopies				5170		0.50
Mar/16/2017		CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RECOVERY	0.50
1806807	Photocopies		7000	0 1 0 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1	5170	DEGGUERRY	0.25
Mar/16/2017		CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RECOVERY	0.45
1806811	Photocopies	4.0.00					
/20/0015	Total for Mar/16/2017	. 13.00	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RECOVERY	10.50
Mar/30/2017		CER	7090	Untario Sustainabi	3170	- RECOVERI	10.50
1812253	Photocopies (20/2017	10.50					
7/11/2017	Total for Mar/30/2017 :	10.50 CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RECOVERY	5.00
Apr/11/2017	Phohocoping	CER	7090	Unitario Sustainabi	3170	- KECOVEKI	3.00
1816612 Apr/11/2017	Photocopies	CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RECOVERY	4.00
	Dhataganiag	CER	1090	Ontario Sustainabi	3170	- KECOVEKI	4.00
1816615	Photocopies	9.00					
Apr/27/2017	Total for Apr/11/2017 :	CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170	- RECOVERY	2.75
1822021	Photocopies	CER	1030	Ontailo Sustainabi	2110	VECOARVI	2.15
1022021		2.75					20
	Total for Apr/27/2017 :	2.15					

*** Client Costs Journal - G/L Account Summary ***

G/L Ac	count	Debit	Credit
1210	- CLIENT DISBRECOV.	43.75	
5170	- RECOVERY - LASER/PH		43.75
	Total:	43 75	43.75



File # EB-	2016-0246	Process:	Updated DSM Measures	
Party:	Ontario Sustainable Energy Association		Marion Fraser	
			Completed Years Practising/Years of relevant experience	
Counse	el/Articling Student/Paralegal:		35	
	Consultant:			
	CV attached:	CV	not required:	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed							
	Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	нѕт	Total		
Preparation	11.00	\$330.00	\$3,630.00	\$0.00	\$3,630.00		
Attendance - Technical Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Attendance - Settlement Conference			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Attendance - Oral Hearing			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Argument			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Case Management		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT FEES			\$3,630.00	\$0.00	\$3,630.00		

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed							
×	Net Cost	HST	Total				
Photocopies		\$0.00	\$0.00				
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00				
Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00				
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00				
Telephone		\$0.00	\$0.00				
Postage		\$0.00	\$0.00				
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00				
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00				
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00				
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00				
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00				
Parking		included	\$0.00				
Taxi or Airport Limo		\$0.00	\$0.00				
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00				
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00				
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00				
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00				

Appendix B

DOCKET

EB-2016-0246 Enbridge Union TRM OSEA				OSEA					
Board File Nur	mber				Party Name				
				Fraser & Company					
Date	Explanation	Consultant	Preparation	Attendance TC	Attendance SC	Attendance OH	Argument		Total
08-Mar-17	Review of Application	MEF	4						4
10-Mar-17	Drafting Irs	MEF	≗ 2						2
28-Mar-17	Review of IRRs	MEF	1						1
10/04/2017	drafing argument	MEF	4						7
Total			11	0		0		0	11