

BY EMAIL and RESS

Jay Shepherd

jay@shepherdrubenstein.com Direct: 416-804-2767

June 30, 2017 Our File: EB20160246

Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street 27th Floor Toronto, Ontario M4P 1E4

Attn: Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary

Dear Ms. Walli:

Re: EB-2016-0246 - 2017 TRM Proceeding - SEC Cost Claim

We enclose the cost claim for the School Energy Coalition, on the Board's form and including docket details.

Jay Shepherd had carriage of this matter. The matter did not have an ADR, and was determined after written submissions.

All of which is respectfully submitted.

Yours very truly,

Shepherd Rubenstein

Jay Shepherd

cc: Wayne McNally, SEC (by email)

Interested parties (by email)



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

				lı	nstructions			
- All claims m - A separate bisbursemen However, on - The cost cla - A CV for each	"Detail ts Beir ly one im mu	in Canadian of Fees and ng Claimed") "Summary o st be suppor sultant/analy	Disbursements Being is required for each la f Fees and Disbursemented by a completed Austinust be attached to	, state ex Rate: Claimed' Iwyer, an ents" cov ffidavit si unless pro	mulas are embedded in the change rate and country of the country of the comprising a "Statement alyst/consultant and articlinering the whole of the particular by a representative of the Board as presented to the Board as presented on Cost Awards, in the country of the country	f initial currency. Country: of Fees Being Claing student/para ty's cost claim shof the party. scribed on the Co	aimed" and legal. ould be pro	a "Statement of vided.
File # EB-	2016	-0246			Process: 2017 TRM Pr	oceeding		
Party:	Scho	ol Energy C	oalition		Affiant's Name:	Jay Shepherd		
HST Numbe	er:	83673-546	64-RT0001		HST	Rate Ontario:	13.00%	
			ull Registrant Unregistered Other		Qualifyi	ng Non-Profit Tax Exempt		
					Affidavit			
		la	y Shanbard				Toronto	
I, in the Prov	ince/		y Shepherd Ontar		, of the City/Town of	, swear or affi		
1. I am a reproperties of the control of the contro	resenta mined d", "St ed "Su ts Beir gy Boa laim de	ative of the a all of the do atement(s) o immary of Fe ng Claimed" i ord process ro oes not inclu	bove-noted party (the cumentation in suppo of Fees Being Claimed" ees and Disbursements nclude only costs incu eferred to above. de any costs for work	e "Party") rt of this ' and "Sta s Being C Irred and done, or	and as such have knowled cost claim, including the at stement(s) of Disbursemen laimed", "Statement(s) of F time spent directly for the time spent, by a person th ection on Cost Awards.	dge of the matter ttached "Summa ts Being Claimed Fees Being Claime e purposes of the	rs attested to ry of Fees ar ". ed" and "Sta Party's part	nd Disbursements atement(s) of cicipation in the
Signature (of Aff	iant						
Sworn or a	ıffirm	ed before	me at the City/To	wn of	Tor	onto		,
in the Prov	ince/	State of	Onta	ario	, on	July 4, 2	017	

(date)



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Commissioner for taking Affidavits Process: 2017 TRM Proceeding File # EB- 2016-0246 **School Energy Coalition** Party: **Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed** \$ Legal/consultant/other fees 7,788.00 \$ Disbursements **HST** 1,012.44 \$ **Total Cost Claim** 8,800.44

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Shepherd Rubenstein Professional Corporation, in trust

Send payment to this address: 2200 Yonge Street

Suite 1302

Toronto, Ontario

M4S2C6

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements





Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File# EB-	2016-0246	Process:	Process: 2017 TRM Proceeding					
Party:	School Energy Coalition			Service Pr	Service Provider Name: Jay Shepherd			
				Year Called to		Completed Practising/Years		
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE		ck or	ne) Bar		Experie	nce	
	Legal Counsel		V	1980		37		
	Articling Student/Paralegal							
	Consultant					Hourly Rate:	\$330	
	Analyst					_		
	For Consultant/Analyst:		CV	attached	HST Rate Ch	narged (enter %):	13.0%	
			C۷	provided within previo	us 24 months			

or provided within provided 2 minutes										
Statement of Fees Being Claimed										
Hours			Hourly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total	
Pre-hearing Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Technical Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Interrogatories										
Preparation	7.8	\$	330.00	\$	2,574.00	\$	334.62	\$	2,908.62	
Responses	4.6	\$	330.00	\$	1,518.00	\$	197.34	\$	1,715.34	
Issues Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
ADR - Settlement Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Proposal Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Argument										
Preparation	11.2	\$	330.00	\$	3,696.00	\$	480.48	\$	4,176.48	
Oral Hearing										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Other Conferences										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	7,788.00	\$	1,012.44	\$	8,800.44	



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2016-0246	Process: 2017 TRM P	2017 TRM Proceeding		
Party:	School Energy Coalition	Service Provider Name:	Jay Shepherd		
raity.	School Energy Countion	Service Provider Ivallie.	Juy Shepheru		

	Net Cost	HST	Total	
Scanning/Photocopy			\$	-
Printing		\$ -	\$	-
Courier			\$	-
Telephone/Fax			\$	-
Transcripts			\$	-
Travel: Air			\$	-
Travel: Car			\$	-
Travel: Rail			\$	-
Travel (Other):			\$	-
Parking			\$	-
Тахі			\$	-
Accommodation			\$	-
Meals			\$	-
Other:			\$	-
Other:			\$	-
Other:			\$	-
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	- \$ -	\$	-



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

08-Feb-17		Review notice, Scheduling	0.1
09-Feb-17	JCS	Review filing	0.3
22-Feb-17		Revise and file notice of intervention, Many emails	0.4
23-Feb-17	JCS	Emails with CME re scope	0.4
28-Feb-17	JCS	Review PO #1 and scheduling	0.3
10-Mar-17	JCS	Review staff Irs, Review prefiled evidence	1.1
14-Mar-17	JCS	Many emails, Review EP and OEB materials	1.1
		Review evidence and draft interrogatories, Review interrogatories	
15-Mar-17	JCS	of others	3.0
16-Mar-17	JCS	Finalize and file interrogatories	1.1
29-Mar-17	JCS	Review interrogatory responses	0.6
08-Apr-17	JCS	Review evidence	2.0
10-Apr-17	JCS	Review evidence	2.0
11-Apr-17	JCS	Review application and interrogatories, Outline final argument	6.2
		Draft, revise and file final argument, Many emails, Review	
12-Apr-17		submissions of others	3.7
23-Jun-17	JCS	Review Decision	1.3

23.6 7788 1012.4 8800.4