

Direct Dial: 416 642 4871 File: 7090

By Courier & RESS Filing

July 11, 2017

Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street 27th Floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Attention: Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary

Dear Ms. Walli:

Re: EB-2016-0246 - Updated DSM Measures

We received Ms. Allman's letter dated July 6, 2017 identifying discrepancy in OSEA's Cost Claim submitted in the above-noted matter. We thank Enbridge for identifying the discrepancy in the total legal and consultant costs claimed.

We reviewed OSEA's Cost Claim and identified that there was an error in the excel sheet which did not calculate the total legal and consultant costs claim correctly.

Please see the attached revised OSEA Cost Claim reflecting the correct total of \$8,324.43. We made no changes to the number of hours claimed by OSEA's legal and consultant representatives.

Yours truly,

Robert Woon

Encl.

cc Stephanie Allman, Regulatory Coordinator, Enbridge Gas Distribution

Document #: 1228777



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

	Instructions					
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state Rat - A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" of The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavi - A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless	e: Country: ed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal. covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.					
File # EB- EB 2016-0246	Process: Updated DSM Measures					
Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Association	Affiant's Name: Robert Woon					
HST Number: 113627988RT0001	HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%					
Full Registrant Unregistered Other	Qualifying Non-Profit Tax Exempt					
	Affidavit					
I, Robert Woon	, of the City/Town of Toronto					
in the Province/State of Ontario	, swear or affirm that:					
2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of t Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and ' 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Bein Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred a Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.	g Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the , or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as					
Signature of Affiant						
Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of						
in the Province/State of Ontario	, on <u>Monday, July 10, 2017</u> , (date)					
Commissioner for taking Affidavits	Louie Vargas, a Commissioner, etc., Province of Ontario, for Willms & Shler, Environmental Lawyers LLP,					

Expires November 2, 2018.



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- EB 2016-0246		Process: Updated DSW Weasures
Party: Ontario Sustainab	e Energy Association	
	Summary of Fees a	and Disbursements Being Claimed
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	7,323.00
Disbursements	\$	43.75
HST	\$	957.68
Total Cost Claim	\$	8,324.43
*		

Make cheque payable to:	Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP
Send payment to this address:	4 King Street West, Suite 900
	Toronto, ON M5H 1B6

Payment Information



File # EB-	EB 2016-0246		Process: Updated DSM Measures						
Party:	Ontario Sustainable Energy Asso	ciation	Service Provi	der Name: Joanna Vince					
			Year Called to	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant					
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Bar	Experience					
	Legal Counsel	✓	2011	6					
	Articling Student/Paralegal								
	Consultant			Hourly Rate: \$170					
× .	Analyst								
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	ched	HST Rate Charged (enter %): 13.0%					
		☑ CV prov	vided within previous 2	4 months					

Statement of Fees Being Claimed											
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	S	ubtotal		HST		Total		
Pre-hearing Conference											
Preparation	1.60	\$	170.00	\$	272.00	\$	35,36	\$	307.36		
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$		\$	4	\$	(45		
Technical Conference											
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$		\$	120		
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$		\$	127	\$	2:		
Interrogatories											
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$		\$	<u> </u>		
Responses		\$	170.00	\$	*	\$	2,120	\$			
Issues Conference											
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$		\$	¥		
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$		\$		\$	*		
ADR - Settlement Conference											
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$	-	\$	2		
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	÷	\$	-	\$	*		
Proposal Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$		\$	-		
Argument											
Preparation	3.10	\$	170.00	\$	527.00	\$	68.51	\$	595.51		
Oral Hearing											
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$	721	\$			
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$		\$		\$			
Other Conferences											
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	121	\$	196	\$			
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	•	\$	· ·	\$			
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	572	\$	*	\$			
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	799.00	\$	103.87	\$	902.87		



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	EB 2016-0246	Process:	Updated DSM Measures

Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Assc Service Provider Name:

Joanna Vince

	Statement of	of Disbursements Be	ing Claimed				
		Net Cost			HST	Total	
Scanning/Photo	сору	\$	43.75	\$	5.69	\$	49.44
Printing				\$		\$	•
Courier	1000			\$	(%)	\$	#
Telephone/Fax	2			\$		\$	=
Transcripts				\$	₹.	\$	
Travel: Air				\$	240	\$	
Travel: Car				\$	•	\$	
Travel: Rail				\$	•	\$	-
Travel (Other):				\$	-	\$	
Parking				\$		\$	
Taxi	20			\$	Ģer	\$	4
Accommodation				\$:: + 1	\$	
Meals				\$	15:	\$	1
Other:				\$	141	\$	- 4
Other:				\$	9€	\$	
Other:				\$		\$	
TOTAL DISBURS	FMFNTS:	\$	43.75	\$	5.69	\$	49.44



File # EB-	EB 2016-0246		Process: Updated DSM Measures						
Party:	Ontario Sustainable Energy Asso	ciation	Service Prov	ider Name: Robert Woon	_				
	CERVICE BROWDER TYPE	(abook ona	Year Called to) Bar	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience					
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	(check one	2014	3	7				
	Articling Student/Paralegal			<u></u>					
	Consultant			Hourly Rate: \$170					
	Analyst				_				
	For Consultant/Analyst:	□ CV at	tached	HST Rate Charged (enter %): 13.0%					
		CV pr	ovided within previous 2	24 months					

Statement of Fees Being Claimed											
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total		
Pre-hearing Conference											
Preparation	7.10	\$	170.00	\$	1,207.00	\$	156.91	\$	1,363.91		
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	¥	\$	*	\$			
Technical Conference									The Charles		
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$		\$	-		
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	a i	\$	S-2	\$			
Interrogatories											
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$	复	\$	•		
Responses		\$	170.00	\$	\$	\$	949	\$	*		
Issues Conference											
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$		\$	*		
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	- AM	\$	(*	\$			
ADR - Settlement Conference											
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	•	\$	12	\$	5		
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	æş	\$		\$			
Proposal Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$		\$			
Argument											
Preparation	4.80	\$	170.00	\$	816.00	\$	106.08	\$	922.08		
Oral Hearing											
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	*	\$		\$			
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	(6)	\$		\$	-		
Other Conferences											
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	(4)	\$		\$			
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	2.5	\$		\$			
Case Management	0.30	\$	170.00	\$	51.00	\$	6.63	\$	57.63		
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	2,074.00	\$	269.62	\$	2,343.62		



File # EB-	EB 2016-0246	Process:	Updated DSM Measures			_
Darty	Ontario Sustainable Energy Asso	Service Pro	vider Name:	Rohert Woon		

\$ - \$ \$ - \$ \$ - \$ \$ - \$ \$ - \$ \$ - \$ \$ - \$
\$ - \$ \$ - \$ \$ - \$ \$ - \$ \$ - \$
\$ \$ \$ \$ - \$ \$ \$ \$ \$
\$ - \$ \$ - \$ \$ - \$
\$ \$ \$
\$ \$
\$ - \$
\$ = \$
\$ - \$
\$ - \$
\$ - \$
\$ - \$
\$ - \$
\$ - \$
\$ \$



File # EB-	EB 2016-0246		Process: Updated DSM Measures					
Party:	Ontario Sustainable Energy Asso	ciation	Service Provider N	ame: Victoria Chai	_			
			Year Called to	Completed Years				
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Bar	Practising/Years of Relevant Experience				
	Legal Counsel		2017]			
	Articling Student/Paralegal	[7]			_			
	Consultant			Hourly Rate: \$100				
	Analyst			20				
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	ched HST F	ate Charged (enter %): 13.0%				
		CV prov	rided within previous 24 montl	ns				

Statement of Fees Being Claimed											
	Hours	Н	ourly Rate	S	ubtotal		HST		Total		
Pre-hearing Conference		11									
Preparation	1.20	\$	100.00	\$	120.00	\$	15.60	\$	135.60		
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	*	\$		\$	•		
Technical Conference											
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	2	\$		\$	*		
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$		\$		\$	£		
Interrogatories											
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	2	\$	•	\$			
Responses		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	181	\$			
Issues Conference											
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	*	\$	30	\$			
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	iff	\$	J#I	\$			
ADR - Settlement Conference											
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$		\$	(4)	\$	*		
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$		\$	21	\$	÷		
Proposal Preparation		\$	100.00	\$		\$	- 198	\$	¥		
Argument											
Preparation	6.80	\$	100.00	\$	680.00	\$	88.40	\$	768.40		
Oral Hearing											
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	3	\$		\$			
Attendance	**************************************	\$	100.00	\$		\$		\$			
Other Conferences											
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$		\$:#:	\$			
CaseManagement XXXXX	0.20	_	100.00	\$	20.00	\$	2.60	\$	22.60		
Cexe/IM ane general		\$	OOXXXXXX	\$	•	\$	(a)	\$			
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	820.00	\$	106.60	\$	926.60		



File# EB-	EB 2016-0246	Process: Updated DS	M Measures	
Dartur	Ontario Sustainable Energy Asso	Service Provider Name:	Victoria Chai	

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed									
	Net Cost	HST	Total						
Scanning/Photocopy		\$	\$ -						
Printing		\$	\$ -						
Courier		\$ =	\$ -						
Telephone/Fax		\$ -	\$ -						
Transcripts		\$ -	\$ -						
Travel: Air		\$ -	\$ -						
Travel: Car		\$ -	\$ -						
Travel: Rail		\$ -	\$ -						
Travel (Other):		\$ =	\$ **						
Parking		\$ -	\$ -						
Taxi		\$ -	\$ =						
Accommodation		\$ **	\$ -						
Meals		\$ -	\$ -						
Other:		\$ -	\$ =						
Other:		\$ -	\$ -						
Other:		\$ -	\$ -						
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	- \$ -	\$ -						



File# EB-	EB 2016-0246		Process: Updated DSM Measures				
Party:	Ontario Sustainable Energy Associ	ation	Service Provi	der Name: Marion Fraser			
·	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience 35			
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant			Hourly Rate: \$330			
	Analyst For Consultant/Analyst:	CV atta	ched vided within previous 2	HST Rate Charged (enter %): 13.0% 4 months			

Statement of Fees Being Claimed										
	Hours		urly Rate	Subtotal			HST		Total	
Pre-hearing Conference								<u> </u>	4 101 00	
Preparation	11.00	\$	330.00	\$	3,630.00	\$	471.90	\$	4,101.90	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	•	\$	(20)	\$		
Technical Conference						_				
Preparation	15	\$	330.00	\$		\$	•	\$		
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$		\$		\$		
nterrogatories						_		\$	-	
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$	•	\$		
Responses		\$	330.00	\$		\$		-		
Issues Conference						\$		\$		
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$				\$		
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	7.	\$		٠		
ADR - Settlement Conference		-	222.00	ć		\$		\$	13.1	
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$		\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$		\$		\$.080	
Proposal Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		3		7		
Argument		-	330.00	\$		\$		\$		
Preparation		\$	330.00	->		1		<u> </u>		
Oral Hearing		+	330.00	\$	-n	\$	[a];	\$	*	
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$		\$		
Attendance		+ >	330.00	٦		+				
Other Conferences		\$	330.00	\$	12.1	\$		\$	4	
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$		\$		
Attendance			XXXXXXXXX			\$	-	\$	•	
Case Management		1,		_		=	474.00	\$	4,101.9	
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	3,630.00	\$	471.90	15	4,101.3	



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File# EB-	EB 2016-0246	Process:	Updated DSM Measures

Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Assc

Service Provider Name:

Marion Fraser

	ent of Disbursements Being Clair Net Cost		HST		otal
		\$		\$	2.
Scanning/Photocopy		\$		\$	22
Printing		\$		\$	-
Courier		\$		\$	
Telephone/Fax		\$		\$	
Transcripts				\$	
Travel: Air		\$			
Travel: Car		\$),••)	\$	
Travel: Rail		\$		\$	
Travel (Other):		\$		\$	
Parking		\$	•	\$	
Taxi		\$	1/52	\$	
Accommodation		\$	141	\$	
		\$		\$	
Meals		\$	-	\$	
Other:		\$	-	\$	
Other:		\$		\$	
Other:					
	le.	- \$	-	\$	
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$				

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Chieat Fees Listing ALL DATES Working Lawyer

		ALL DATES	Hours	Amount :	Inv# Billing
Date Entry #	Fee / Time Explanation	working Lawyer			Status
1341	Ontario Sustainable Energy Association				
7090	Re: EB-2016-0246 Updated DSM Measures				
Feb 15/2017		57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	0.30	51:00	Unbilled
1796993	revise draft intervenor request letter; em	sile with M. Fraser re confirmi	ng CSEA does	not requi	re oral hearing;
Mar 8/2017	Tataway 52 A 40 Ure V 170 00	57 - ROBERT WOOM SAA LAN	0 + 4 0	90.00	Unbilled 📆
1802697	review procedural order no 1; email with N.	. Risse and M. Fraser re writte	en interroyat	orlesi	
Mar 13/2017	Lauver, 52 1 20 Hrs X 170.00	57 - ROBERT WOOD SEE LAN	1.20	204,00	Unbilled 🕥
1803617	review joint application and draft interrog	gatories and cevise same;			
Mar 14/2017	and the state of t	THE RESIDENCE WERE ASSOCIATION OF THE PROPERTY	3,40	570.00	Unbilled D
1,3041,15	review joint submission; review and review	e draft interrogatories; email	M. Fraser an	d N. Riss≑	for comments on c
Max 15/2017	t manage, 62 0 60 Ure V 100 00	57 - ROBERT WOOM SER LAN	0.00	102.00	A 175 - T
1804587	emails with N. Risse re comments draft into	errogatories: finalize interro	gatories;		*
Mar 16/2017	Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 100.00	74 - VICTORIA CHAT	0.20	20,00	Unbilled C
1804806	review timelines for DSM hearing;				everyor of T the set
Mar 20/2017	Laurence 57 0 30 Hrs X 176.00	57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	0.30	51.00	Unbilled 7
1841,204	review and prepare summary of utilities' re	esponses to Interrogatories;	A = 0	02 00	Umbilled A
Mar 28/2017	Lawyer: 48 0 50 Hrs X 170.00	18 - JOANNA VINCE	0.50	85.00	uncarace A
1010476	consider key arguments and points for writ	ten submissions;	0.00	34,00	Unbilled 🥎
Mar 29/2017	Taures E2 5 20 Ura Y 170 50	SY - ROBERT WOON SEE GAW	0.20		0.1011100
1810845		ies and send same to N. Kisse	and m. Flase:	40.00	Unbilled (
4ar 29/2017					
1910840	extract interrogatories responses from Uni	on and Embridge and referenced	1.00	170.00	Unbilled A
Mar 30/2017	Lawver: 57 1.00 Hrs X 170.00	57 - ROBERT WOON SEN LAW	ragar and N	Misso re d	lismuss key points
1811027	review utilities' responses to interrogato	ries; relephone care with d. F.	1.00	170.00	Unbilled 77
Mar 30/2017	Lawyer: 48 1.00 Brs X 170.00 review interrogatory responses; telephone	48 - JOANNA VINCE	er to diacus	responses	to interrogatorie
1813092	review interrogatory responses; telephone	57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	0.40	68.00	Unbilled A
Apr 7/2017	Lawyer: 57 0.40 Hrs X 170.00	57 - ROBERT MOON OFK MAIN	00101762001	*********	A
1814353	discuss draft written submission;	74 - VICTORIA CHAI	160	3,60,00	Unbilled A
Apr 7/2017	Lawyer: 74 1.60 Brs X 100.00 consider arguments and points for written	submissions; draft written sub			A
				300.00	Unbilled A
Apr 8/2017	hawyer: 74 3.00 Krs X 100.00 review evidence and application filed by 0	mion and Embridge (TRM and DSM	input assum	otions tabl	Le); draft submissi 🦰
		57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	0.20	34.00	Unbilled 🔿
Apr 10/2017	Lawyer: 57 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 emails with M. Fraser re draft written sub			,	
1814682	2 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1	74 - VICTORIA CHAI	0.80	80.00	Unbilled ()
Apr 10/2017	The transfer of the second of	e into written submissions;			
.1841245			1.,40	140.00	Unbilled A
Apr 11/2017	incorporate M. Fraser's argument into draf	t submissions; draft written s	abmissions t	o submit to	o QEB;
1841246	Lawyer: 48 2.60 Hrs X 170.00	48 - JOANNA VINCE	2.60	442.00	Unbilled A
Apr 12/2017					
1816380	Lawyer: 57 3.40 Hrs X 170.00	57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	3,40	578,00	Unbilled A
Apr 12/2017 1816384	revise draft written submission;				m-1-332-43
	and the state of t	74 - VICTORIA CHAI	0.80	80.00	Umbilled A
Apr 12/2017 1841206		ntervenors; review and revise:	ubmissions;		Transact Court
Apr 27/2017				102.00	Umbilled P
1851803	review submission from Embridge and Union	responding to submissions from	GSEA and ot	ner interv	enors;
Apr 27/2017					
1821620		emails with M. Fraser re util	ities joint r	sbra smur	55.10H/
		Unbilled:	25.10	3693,00	
		Billed:	0,00	0.00	×
242 6	= =	Total:	25.10	3693.00	

	LEGEND						
P	Preparation						
TC	Attendance - Technical Conference						
SC	Attendance – Settlement Conference						
ОН	Attendance – Oral Hearing						
A	Argument						
CM	Case Management						

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Costs Journal

and the second second		" /8 ' "	To Jun/:	Client Name	Refi G/L Acct	Amount
ate	Paid To	Sourc	s marrer	CTERNE WAND	Mak niw 1000	(2)700047700
A CONTRACT OF THE PARTY OF THE	Explanation		70.0	Ontario Sustainabl	5170 - RECOVERY	0.2
Tar/13/2017		CER	7090	Queario Sustaleabi	OTIO - MICOLEMI	V • 4.
1806220	Photocopies	CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170 - RECOVERY	0.2
lar/13/2017	mb - b d	CER	1030	CHCGTTO DOWNSTHOMS	0.W.I.A. (1.000-1.000-1.000-1.000-1.000-1.000-1.000-1.000-1.000-1.000-1.000-1.000-1.000-1.000-1.000-1.000-1.00	
1806367	Photocopies Total for Mar/13/2017 :	0.50	*1			
lar/14/2017	TOTAL TOP MARY 13/201/ :	CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170 - RECOVERY	5.0
1806521	Photocopies					
far/14/2017		CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170 - RECOVERY	0.2
1806541	Photocopies					
	Total for Mar/14/2017 :	5,25	4000	Ontario Sustainabl	5170 - RECOVERY	0,2
dar/15/2017		CER	7090	OUTARIO SUSTAINADI	DITO - MENONAGET	012
1806739	Photocopies	CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170 - RECOVERY	2.5
dar/15/2017 1806740	Photocopies	CEIX	1024	P. (9.3) W TT TO (2 1 1 1 4 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1		
T000140	Total for Mar/15/2017 :	2,75	v.		**************************************	
4ar/16/2017	TOTAL TOL MALITO/2017	CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170 - RÉCOVERY	5.0
1806783	Photocopies				F 4 F A V	1,2
lar/16/2017		CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170 - RECOVERY	1.2
1006784	Photocopies		7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170 - RECOVERY	0.7
Mar/16/2017		CER	1050	Outfaire anacarment	J.K. / V	
1906785 dar/16/2017	Photocopies	CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170 - RECOVERY	5.0
1806787	Photocopies	GLIK	(4.2.5			
dax/16/2017	**************************************	CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170 = RECOVERY	0.2
1806806	Photocopies				# (M) PY4/3/1979735	0.5
4ar/16/2017		CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5179 - RECOVERY	4.5
1806807	Photocopies	000	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170 - RECOVERY	0,2
dar/15/2017	m)	CER	1030	OTTORIES OTTO COLUMN	W 4 - 4	
1806311	Photocopies Total for Mar/16/2017 :	13,00		-		
tar/30/2017	TOTAL TOP MALITOTEOIT	CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170 - RECOVERY	10.5
1012253	Photocopies					
	Total for Mar/30/2017 :	10.50			5170 - RECOVERY	5.0
Apr/11/2017		CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170 - RECOVERY	3,0
1816612	Photocopies	4 THE	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170 - RECOVERY	4.0
Apr/11/2017		CER	1090	Mittel Daggrumm	40.00	
1916615	Photocopies Total for Apr/11/2017:	9.00				
Apr/27/2017	TOTAL DOL WELLTIATION :	CER	7090	Ontario Sustainabl	5170 - RECOVERY	2,7
1822021	Photocopies					
a war what	Total for Apr/27/2017 :	2.75	25			

G/L Acc	count	Debit	Credit
1210	- CLIENT DISB RECOV.	43.75	43.75
5170	- RECOVERY - LASER/PH	49.75	43.75

Appendix B

DOCKET

Eti-2016-0246 Enbridge Union TRM OSEA						OSE	۸	
Board File Nur	THE RESERVE THE PARTY OF THE PA	Chart still Control			Party Namo			
				Fraser & Company				
10-Mar-17 28-Mar-17	Explanation Review of Application Drafting is Review of IRRs drafting argument	Consultant MEF MEF MEF MEF	Preparation 4 2 1 4	Attendance TC	Attendance SC	Attendance OH	Argument	Total 4 2 1 7 7
Total	dialitifi sifemont	(4121	11	0		0	0	- 11