

### E2 ENERGY INC.

104, 6711 Mississauga Road Mississauga, Ontario L5N 2W3 905-542-2250 x222 scott.walker@e2energyinc.com www.e2energyinc.com

August 14<sup>th</sup>, 2017

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board P.O. Box 2319 2300 Yonge Street, 27<sup>th</sup> Floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

# Re: EB-2016-0152, Ontario Power Generation Inc. (OPG) – Cost Award Documents of Ontario Association of Physical Plant Administrators (OAPPA)

Dear Ms. Walli:

As per the Board's Procedural Order No. 9 dated July 11, 2017, please find attached two copies of the supporting documents for Ontario Association of Physical Plant Administrators' (OAPPA)'s cost award request for its participating in the above noted hearing.

The cost award documents contain the following:

- Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements,
- Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed,
- E2 Energy Inc. invoice dated August 13<sup>th</sup>, 2017, and
- Photocopies of expenses.

The majority of the time dedicated to this Case was by E2's most senior staff, owing to commitments and personal schedule conflicts of other staff, including bereavement considerations. However, wherever possible, the rate and allocation of these hours has been deferred to the least costly personnel otherwise capable of having performed such functions.

Please contact the undersigned if the Board requires any further information in connection with this request.

Respectfully submitted, yours truly

C. Miller

Scott Walker, P.Eng., MBA President and CEO

cc. Regulatory Affairs, OPG (electronically only)



#### Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

|--|

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are embedded in the form to assist with calculations. - All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.

Canada Rate: 1 Country: - A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal.

However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.

- A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff.

#### Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

File # EB-	201	6-0152		Process: Ontario Power Generation 2016 - 2021 Application				
Party:	ОАРРА			Affiant's Name: Scott Walker of E2 Energy Inc				
HST Numbe	er:	869528513		HST Rate Ontario:	13.00%			
		Full Registrant	7	Qualifying Non-Profit				
		Unregistered		Tax Exempt				
		Other						

Affidavit

Ι,	Scott A. Walker	, of the City/Town of	Toronto
in the Province/State of	of Ontari	0	, swear or affirm that:

1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.

2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".

3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.

4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

Signature of Affiant	Ila P.1	Z. Ett	obicoke	Axess Law P.C. 165 North Queen Street Etobicoke, Ontario (416) 901-9638 www.axesslaw.com
Sworn or affirmed before me a	t the City/Town of	<u> </u>	ississauga	,
in the Province/State of	Ontario	, on	August, 1Th	- 2017.
4		a Commissioner,	Ionique Simon etc., Province of Ontari rofessional Corporation	0
<b>Commissioner for taking Affida</b>	vits		s June 2, 2020	

Commissioner for taking Affidavits

Page 1 of 2



### Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2016-0152

Process: Ontario Power Generation 2016 - 2021 Application

Party: ΟΑΡΡΑ

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed					
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	78,702.50			
Disbursements	\$	300.90			
HST	\$	10,270.43			
Total Cost Claim	\$	89,273.83			

Payment Information
E2 Energy Inc.
Suite 104, 6711 Mississauga Road
Mississauga, Ontario
L5N 2W3



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2016-0152		Pr	ocess:	Ont	ario Power	Gei	neration 20	016 -	2021 Application
Party: <u>OAPPA</u>		Se	ervice P	rovi	der Name:	Sco	ott Walker		
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one )	Year Ca Bi	alled to ar	1		Con	npleted Years of Relevant	Expe	
Legal Counsel							2	8	
Articling Student/Paralegal									
Consultant	4						Hourly Rate:		\$330
Analyst									
For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	hed			HST Rate Ch	narge	<b>ed</b> ( <i>enter %</i> ):		13.0%
	CV prov	ided with	nin previc	ous 24	4 months				
S	tatement c	of Fees	Being	Clai	imed				
	Hours		y Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total
Pre-hearing Conference									
Preparation	7.75	\$ 3	30.00	\$	2,557.50	\$	332.48	\$	2,889.98
Attendance	5.00	\$ 3	30.00	\$	1,650.00	\$	214.50	\$	1,864.50
Technical Conference									
Preparation	0.75	\$ 3	30.00	\$	247.50	\$	32.18	\$	279.68
Attendance	16.00	\$ 3	30.00	\$	5,280.00	\$	686.40	\$	5,966.40
Interrogatories									
Preparation	24.75	\$3	30.00	\$	8,167.50	\$	1,061.78	\$	9,229.28
Responses	0.00	\$ 3	30.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Issues Conference									
Preparation	1.25	\$3	30.00	\$	412.50	\$	53.63	\$	466.13
Attendance		\$ 3	30.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation	2.75	\$ 3	30.00	\$	907.50	\$	117.98	\$	1,025.48
Attendance	16.00	\$ 3	30.00	\$	5,280.00	\$	686.40	\$	5,966.40
Proposal Preparation	0.25	\$ 3	30.00	\$	82.50	\$	10.73	\$	93.23
Argument									
Preparation	14.00	\$ 3	30.00	\$	4,620.00	\$	600.60	\$	5,220.60
Oral Hearing									
Preparation	20.00		30.00	\$	6,600.00	\$	858.00	\$	7,458.00
Attendance	19.00	\$3	30.00	\$	6,270.00	\$	815.10	\$	7,085.10
Other Conferences									
Preparation		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	30.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance			30.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	
Case Management		\$ 1	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	42,075.00	\$	5,469.75	\$	47,544.75

### Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed



**File # EB-** 2016-0152

Process:

Ontario Power Generation 2016 - 2021 Application

Party: OAPPA

Service Provider Name: Scott Walker

State	ment of Disbursement	s Being Claimed			
	7	let Cost		HST	Total
Scanning/Photocopy					\$ -
Printing					\$ -
Courier					\$ -
Telephone/Fax					\$ -
Transcripts					\$ -
Travel: Air					\$ -
Travel: Car					\$ -
Travel: Rail					\$ -
Travel (Other):					\$ -
Parking	\$	300.90	\$	39.10	\$ 300.90
Тахі					\$ -
Accommodation					\$ -
Meals					\$ -
Other:					\$ -
Other:					\$ -
Other:			19-28		\$ -
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	300.90	\$	39.10	\$ 300.90

**************************************					
RECEL CAR PARK: Yonge DEVICE: PAID:	PT & Eglinton Ctr Paystation 3 24/03/17 04:13P				
SHORT TERM ENTRY: EXIT: PARKING DURATION CHARGED DURATION					
PAID: NET V.A.T. 13% ;	CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30				
CREDIT CARD	CAD20.00				
Credit (Ard Date:	24/03/17 04:13P ****88501770/****				
PRICE: TRANSACTION No: MERCHANT No: AUTH CODE:	11/17 CAD20.00 7483881467 0 066051				

RECEI	PT
DEVICE	& Eglinton Ctr Paystation 3 04/04/17 04:50P
	111022 04/04/17 08:24A 04/04/17 04:49P 000 08:25 000 02:20
PRID: NET V.A.T. 13% :	CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30
CREDIT CARD	CAD20,00
	4/04/17 04:50P **68501?70****
PRICE; TRANSACTION No; MERCHANT No; AUTH CODE;	11/17 CAD20.00 6841451333 0 053501

RFC	EIPT
	ge & Eglinton Ctr Paystation 3 02/03/17 04:50P
SHORT TERM ENTRY: EXIT: PARKING DURATIO CHARGED DURATIO	
PAID: NET V.A.T. 13% :	CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30
CREDIT CARD	CAD20.00
CREDIT CARD	
DATE:	02/03/17 04:50P ****88501770****
PRICE: TRANSACTION No: MERCHANT No: AUTH CODE:	11/17 CAD20.00 7621673746 071601

***********************	
	EIPT
	ge & Eglinton Ctr
	Paystation 3
PAID,	27/03/17 04,51P
SHORT TERM	
ENTRY,	108768 27/03/17 08:309
EXIT:	
PARKING DURATION: CHARGED DURATION:	000 08,21
	000 02:20
PAID, NET	CAD20,00
V.A.T. 13%	CAD17.70
	CAD2.30
CREDIT CARD	CAD20.00
CREDIT CARD	
DATE, 27	103/17 04:51P
***	*88501770****
PRICE	11/17
TRANSACTION N.	CAD20.00
MERCHANT No.	0212329480
AUTH CODE:	000001
	NAME AND ( )

*****	
RECE	IPT
CAR PARK: Yong DEVICE: PAID:	e & Eglinton Ctr Paystation 3 09/03/17 04:06P
SHORT TERM ENTRY: EXIT: PARKING DURATION CHARGED DURATION	
PAIDi NET V.A.T. 13% i	CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30
CREDIT CARD	CAD20.00
CREDIT CARD	
DATE	09/03/17 04:05P ****88501770****
PRICE: TRANSACTION No: MERCHANT No:	11/17 CAD20.00 2313981484
AUTH CODE:	<b>03322</b> Ĭ

	*****	
RECEIPT		
CAR PARK: Yong DEVICE: PAID:	& Eglinton Ctr Paystation 3 28/03/17 04:55P	
SKORT TERM ENTRY: EXIT: PARKING DURATION CHARGED DURATION		
PAID; NET V.A.T. 13% :	CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30	
CREDIT CARD	CAD20.00	
CREDIT CARD DATE:	28/03/17 04:55P ****88501770**** 11/17	
PRICE: TRANSACTION No: MERCHANT No: AUTH CODE:	CAD20.00 1327437858 0 020361	

	ELPT ge & Eglinton Ctr Paustation 4
PALD	19/08/15 04:36P
SHORT TERM ENTRY: CHARGED DURATIO	456116 19/08/15 08:516 19/08/15 04:32 19/08/15 04:32 19/08/02:45
PAID: TAX_FREE V.A.T. 13%; CREDIT_CARD	CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30 CAD20.00
OREDIT CARD DATE:	19/08/15 04:36P ****88500163**** 11/17
PRICE: TRANSACTION No: MERCHANT No: AUTH CODE:	CAD20.00 39868 0 050117

RECEIPT	~ "
	*****
	Eglinton Ctr Paystation 3 9/01/17 04:33P
SHORT TERM ENTRY: EXIT: PARKING DURATION: CHARGED DURATION:	085819 9/01/17 08;458 9/01/17 04:35P 000 07:47 000 02:20
PAIDI NET V.A.T. 13% I CREDIT CARD	CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30 CAD20.00
CREDIT CARD DATE:	09/01/17 04:33P ****88501770**** 11/17
PRICE: TRANSACTION No: MERCHANT No: AUTH CODE:	CAD20.00 5429858977 0 064260

	inger in the second s
	e & Eglinton Ctr Paystation 3
DEVICE: PAID:	24/03/17 04:13P
SHORT TERM ENTRY: EXIT: PARKING DURATION CHARGED DURATION	
PAID: NET V.A.T. 13% ;	CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30
CREDIT CARD	CAD20.00
CREDIT CARD DATE:	24/03/17 04:13P ****88501770****
PRICE: TRANSACTION No: MERCHANT No: AUTH CODE:	11/17 CAD20.00 7483881467 0 066051

**************************************	***************************************
REC	LIFI
CAR PARK: Yong	e & Eglinton Ctr
DEVICE	
PAID	Paystation 3
rniµi	04/04/17 04:50P
SHORT TERM	111022
ENTRY:	04/04/17 08:249
EXIT	04/04/17 04,49P
PARKING DURATION	
CHARGED DURATION	
CINNELD DOWNIN	
PAID:	CAD20,00
NET	CAD17.70
V.A.T. 13% :	CAD2.30
COCOLT CODD	
CREDIT CARD	CAD20.00
CREDIT CARD	
DATE	04/04/17 04,50P
	****88501770****
PRICE	11/17
TRANSACTION No.	CAD20.00
MERCHANT No:	6841491333
	C
AUTH CODE:	053501

REC	EIPT
CAR PARK: Yon DEVICE: PAID:	ge & Eglinton Ctr Paystation 3 02/03/17 04:50P
SHORT TERM ENTRY: EXIT: PARKING DURATION CHARGED DURATION	
PAID: NET V.A.T. 13% :	CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30
CREDIT CARD	CAD20.00
CREDIT CARD DATE:	02/03/17 04:50P ****88501770****
PRICE; TRANSACTION No: MERCHANT No: AUTH CODE;	11/17 CAD20.00 7621673746 0 071601

化动物溶液 机合体 雪子 化水子	
RECEIPT	×
CAR PARK; Yonge & Eglinton Ctr DEVICE:	8
PAID, Paystation 3	
27/03/17 04:51P	
SHORT TERM 100700	
ENTRY, 27/03/17 08:30A	
PARKING DURATION: 27/03/17 04:55P	
LAMPER NEATING SOUR SOUR	
100 02.20	
PAID:	
NET CAD20.00	
V.A.T. 13% , CAD17.70	
1.281 - 68	
CREDIT COON	
1 HUAR 182	
CREDIT CARD	
DATE, 27/03/17 04:51P	
****89501770****	
PRICE: 11/17	
TRANSACTION No: CAD20.00	
MERCHANT No. 0212329480	
AUTH CODE: 0	
MP731	

RECE	IPT
CAR PARK: Yong DEVICE: PAID:	e & Eglinton Ctr Paystation 3 09/03/17 04:05P
SHORT TERM ENTRY: EXIT: PARKING DURATION CHARGED DURATION	
PAID; NET V.A.T. 13% :	CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30
CREDIT CARD	CAD20.00
CREDIT CARD	
DATE	09/03/17 04:05P
	11/17
PRICE	CAD20.00
TRANSACTION No:	2313981484
MERCHANT No: RUTH CODE;	0 033221

	*************
RECE	PT
CAR PARK: Yong DEVICE: PAID:	<ul> <li>&amp; Eglinton Ctr Paystation 3</li> <li>28/03/17 04:55P</li> </ul>
SHORT TERM ENTRY: EXIT: PARKING DURATION CHARGED DURATION	
Paid; Net V.a.t. 13% :	CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30
CREDIT CARD	CAD20.00
CREDIT CARD DATE:	28/03/17 04:55P ****88501770****
PRICE: TRANSACTION No: MERCHANT No: AUTH CODE:	11/17 CAD20.00 1327437868 0 020361

RECEIPT	
CAR PARK: Yonge & Eglinton Ctr	
DEVICE: Paystation 4 PAID: 19/08/15/04:35P	
PAID: 19/08/15 04:35P	
SHORT TERM 456116	
ENTRY: 19/28/15 28:518	
13/08/15 08:519 13/08/15 04:32 13/08/15 04:35 13/08/15 04:35	
CHARGED BURGTION: SOU BZ: 45	
PAID, CAD20.00	
TRX FREE CAD17.70 V.A.T. 132	
TAX FREE CAD17.70 V.A.T. 132 CAD2.30 CREDIT CARD CAD20.00	
CRÉDIT CARD CAD20.00	
CREDIT CARD	
DATE: 19/08/15 04:36P ****88500163#### 11/17	
PRICE: CAD20.00	
TRANSACTION No: 39868	
MERCHANT No:	
AUTH CODE: 050117	
an a	

	****
RECEIPT	
	Eglinton Ctr Paystation 3 /01/17 04:33P
SHORT TERM ENTRY: EXIT: PARKING DURATION: CHARGED DURATION:	085819 3/01/17 08145A 3/01/17 04135P 000 07147 000 02120
PAID: NET V.A.T. 13% : CREDIT CARD	CAD20.00 CAD17.70 CAD2.30 CAD20.00
CREDIT CARD	09/01/17 04:33P ****\$8501770**** 11/17
PRICE; TRANSACTION No; MERCHANT No; AUTH CODE;	CAD20,00 5429858977 0 064260



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-       2016-0152       Process:       Ontario Power Generation 2016 - 2021 App					2021 Application				
Party: <u>OAPPA</u>			Service P	rovi	ider Name:	Mi	chael Gonc	Z	
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one )	Yea	ar Called to Bar	1		Con	npleted Years of Relevant		
Legal Counsel				J			L	.5	
Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst							Hourly Rate:		\$290
For Consultant/Analyst	CV attac					narg	<b>ed</b> ( <i>enter %</i> ):		13.0%
	CV prov	ided v	within previc	ous 2	4 months				
S	tatement o	of Fe	es Being	Cla	imed				
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total
Pre-hearing Conference									War war in the state of the sta
Preparation	18.00	\$	290.00	\$	5,220.00	\$	678.60	\$	5,898.60
Attendance	10.00	\$	290.00	\$	2,900.00	\$	377.00	\$	3,277.00
Technical Conference									
Preparation	2.00	\$	290.00	\$	580.00	\$	75.40	\$	655.40
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Interrogatories									
Preparation	6.00	\$	290.00	\$	1,740.00	\$	226.20	\$	1,966.20
Responses		\$	290.00	\$		\$	-	\$	-
Issues Conference					· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·				
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
ADR - Settlement Conference					·····				
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$		\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	
Proposal Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Argument								4	
Preparation	2.00	\$	290.00	\$	580.00	\$	75.40	\$	655.40
Oral Hearing			200.00	<u> </u>			226.20	~	1.055.20
Preparation	6.00		290.00	\$	1,740.00	\$	226.20	\$	1,966.20
Attendance Other Conferences	25.00	\$	290.00	\$	7,250.00	\$	942.50	\$	8,192.50
		<u>ج</u>	200.00			~		~	
Preparation Attendance		\$	290.00	\$ \$	-	\$	-	\$ \$	
Case Management		\$ \$	290.00 170.00	> \$	-	\$ \$	-	\$ \$	
		ې	170.00	la ve	- Concorder	>	-		-
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	20,010.00	\$	2,601.30	\$	22,611.30

Г



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

le # EB- 2016-0152 Process: Ontario Power Generation 2016 - 2021 Applic					2021 Application				
Party: <u>OAPPA</u>	OAPPA Service Provider Name: Anna Fitzpatrick								
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one )	Ye	ar Called to Bar	1		Cor	npleted Years of Relevant	Ехре	
Legal Counsel							1	0	
Articling Student/Paralegal									
Consultant							Hourly Rate:		\$230
Analyst	7								
For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	hed			HST Rate Ch	narg	<b>ed</b> (enter % ):		13.0%
	CV prov	ided	within previo	ous 2	4 months				
S	tatement o	of Fe	ees Being	Cla	imed				
	Hours	Но	ourly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total
Pre-hearing Conference									
Preparation	2.50	\$	230.00	\$	575.00	\$	74.75	\$	649.75
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Technical Conference									
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Interrogatories									
Preparation	5.00	\$	230.00	\$	1,150.00	\$	149.50	\$	1,299.50
Responses		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Issues Conference									
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Proposal Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Argument									
Preparation	1.00	\$	230.00	\$	230.00	\$	29.90	\$	259.90
Oral Hearing									
Preparation	5.50	\$	230.00	\$	1,265.00	\$	164.45	\$	1,429.45
Attendance	58.25	\$	230.00	\$	13,397.50	\$	1,741.68	\$	15,139.18
Other Conferences									
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES		5002		5	16,617.50	\$	2,160.28	\$	18,777.78
				L		, Y	_,_00.20		

👋 🛕 E2 Energy Inc.

# Invoice

ENERGY INC. Manulife Corporate Centre 104 - 6711 Mississauga Road Mississauga, Ontario L5N 2W3

Date	Invoice #
8/13/2017	OAPPA817

Invoice To	
OAPPA	
c/o University of Ottawa	1
Attn: Claudio Brun del	
203-141 Louis Pasteur	
Ottawa, ON K1N 6N5	

P.O. No.	Terms
	Due on receipt

Desc	cription	Qty	Amount
Walker - Representation of OAPPA for 0	OPG's 5-Year Rate Application to the OEB	127.5	42.075.00
	PG's 5-Year Rate Application to the OEB	69	20.010.00
	or OPG's 5-Year Rate Application to the	72.25	16,617.50
Disbursements (OEB Parking)		17	300.90
* Timesheets Attached			
* Majority of Hours were incurred by W to personnel schedules and personal con considerations, however, the cost of thes costly personnel otherwise capable of ha	e hours have been deferred to the least		
Sales Tax Summary		Total	
HST (4) On Sales@13.0%	10,270.44	TOLA	\$89,273.84
Total Tax	10,270.44	Payments/Credit	<b>:S</b> \$0.00

Client Project - OAPPA, OPG's 5 Year Rate Application 2016
Intervention Work (EB-2016-0152)

Personnel

Walker, S A

Louver Cost	Lower Cost
Lower Cost	Hours
Hours Deferral	Deferral
Capable	Capable
(Goncz)	(Fitzpatrick)

2

1 0

0

5

5

0

2.5

2.5 3

0

6

5 5

1

1

6

6

4

6.5

3.5

4.5

5.5

0 0

0

0

0

0

5.25

Net Hours Gross Hours Hours ltem Date Deferable Hours Deferable (Walker-Only) 1.25 **Review Application** 6/30/2016 1.25 7/12/2016 2 7/19/2016 1.25 1.25 **Request Letter** 7/21/2016 1 0.25 **OAPPA** (Client) Reviews 6/30/2016 0.25 7/19/2016 0.5 0.5 1.5 Intervenor - Division of Labour Mtg(s) 1.5 8/4/2016 **Other Conference** 5 **OPG Intervenor Presentation** 9/15/2016 5 9/23/2016 Technical Conference 4.5 Preparation of IRR 9/28/2016 4.5 5.75 5.75 9/29/2016 6.5 9/30/2016 6.5 10/3/2016 2.5 Review of IRR Responses 10/27/2016 2.5 3 10/28/2016 0.75 Tech Preparation 11/11/2016 0.75 Tech Conference 11/14/2016 6 11/15/2016 5 11/16/2016 5 1.75 Tech Conference Review 1.75 12/8/2016 OAPPA (Client) Reviews 12/12/2016 1 Settlement Prep 1/6/2017 1 Settlement Conf 1/9/2017 6 1/10/2017 6 1/11/2017 4 0.75 OAPPA (Client) Tel Review 1/12/2017 0.75 0.25 Settlement Review 1/26/2017 0.25 **Oral Hearing - Preparation** 3/22/2017 6.5 3/23/2017 3.5 3/29/2017 4.5 5.5 4/5/2017 6.25 **Oral Hearing - Attendance** 6.25 2/27/2017 2/28/2017 5.5 5.5 5 3/2/2017 5 3/3/2017 3 3 5.75 3/6/2017 5.75 6 3/7/2017 6

3/9/2017

5.25

		3/10/2017	1		1	0
Ŋ	lia Telecont	3/20/2017			3.5	0
V	la Teleconf	3/21/2012	4		4	0
	fia Telecont	3/23/2017	3.5		3.5	0
		3/24/2017	2.125		2.25	0
		3/27/2017	6		б	0
		3/28/2017	5.25	5.25		0
		3/30/2017	6			6
		3/31/2017	4.75		4.75	0
	Aa Telecont	4/3/2017	ŝ.,		5	0
		4/4/2017	6.25	6.25		0
	As Telecent	4/5/2017	2.5		2.5	0
		4/6/2017	6.75	0	0	6.75
		4/7/2017	4.75		4.75	0
		4/12/2017	3		3	0
		4/13/2017	1		1	0
Argument		5/5/2017	1			1
		5/19/2017	3.5			3.5
		5/21/2017	7.5			7.5
		5/29/2017	2			2
Total			216.25	25	58.25	133

\*Note - personal circumstances prevented lower cost resources from being deployed on this Case, requiring more expensive resources to be used instead. However, in fairness to the Client and respecting cost prudence principals, such hours and costs are being re-assigned to the lowest rate personnel category otherwise capable of having performed such tasks.

-

#### Client Project - OAPPA, OPG's 5 Year Rate Application 2016 Intervention Work (EB-2016-0152)

Personnel	Goncz, MW	
<u>Item</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Review Application	6/16/2017	6
	6/17/2017	4
	6/20/2017	6
Intervenor - Division of Labou	8/4/2017	2
Other Conference	9/15/2016	5
	9/23/2016	5
Preparation of IRR	9/30/2016	6
Tech Preparation	11/11/2016	2
<b>Oral Hearing - Preparation</b>	Various	6
Argument	5/21/2017	2
		44

#### From Original Timesheets

MG Application & Evidence review – June 16 <sup>th</sup> , 2016 (6 hours)
MG Application & Evidence review – June 17 <sup>th</sup> , 2016 (4 hours)
MG Application & Evidence review – June 20 <sup>th</sup> , 2016 (6 hours)
MG Application & Evidence review – August 19 <sup>th</sup> , 2016 (4 hours)
SW & MG Call with Intervenor's – August 4 <sup>th</sup> , 2016 10-12pm (2 hours)
SW & MG @ OEB Hearing - September 1 <sup>st</sup> , 2016 – 9am to 3pm (6 hours)
MG Rate Call-into OEB Hearing – September, 23th 2016 (5 hours)
MG Rate Calculation for OAPPA – September, 30th 2016 (6 hours)
MG Issue Prioritization review and preparation November 10 <sup>th</sup> (4 hours)
MG OAPPA Technical submission – November 11 <sup>th</sup> 2016 (2 hours)
* MG OAPPA presentation material briefing on Rate Case December 7 <sup>th</sup> (4 hours)
MG Revised Rate Calculation for OAPPA – March 23, 2017 (4 hours)
MG Reviewing notes from Case Hearing Days 1-16 April 3 <sup>rd</sup> , 2017 (6 hours)
MG Reviewing notes from Case Hearing Days 17-23 April 17th, 2017 (6 hours)
MG Preparing OAPPA submission May 18 <sup>th</sup> , 2017 (3 hours)

\* Considered normal client services, excluded from OEB costing.

#### Client Project - OAPPA, OPG's 5 Year Rate Application 2016 Intervention Work (EB-2016-0152)

Personnel	Fitzpatrick, A	
<u>Item</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Review Application	7/26/2016	2.5
Technical Conference		
Preparation of IRR	9/29/2016	3
	9/30/2016	2
Oral Hearing - Preparation	4/3/2017	3
	4/17/2017	2.5
Argument	5/21/2017	1
		14

#### From Original Timesheets

AF Reviewing Rate application and documents - July 26, 2016 (2.5 Hours) AF Collecting all consumption data for OAPPA group - September 29, 2016 (3.0 Hours) AF Reviewing rates and data, preform rate calculations - September 30, 2016 (2.0 Hours) \*AF Working on Presentation materials - December 7, 2016 (2.0 Hours) AF Reviewing notes from OPG Hearing Days 1-16 - April 3, 2017 (3.0 Hours) AF Reviewing notes from OPG Hearing Days 17-23 - April 17, 2017 (2.5 Hours) AF Reviewing Arguments - May 21, 2017 (1.0 Hour)